Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0137
Evniros: November 20, 200

•	WELL	COMPI	LETION (OR REC	OMPLE	ETION F	REPOR	T AND I	LOG			ase Serial N MSF07865		
1a. Type of			⊠ Gas			Other					6. If	Indian, Allo	ttee or T	ribe Name
b. Type of	f Completion	_	New Well er	□ Work	Over	Deepen		ug Back	□ Diff. R	Resvr.		it or CA Ag MNM9122		t Name and No.
2. Name of CONO	Operator COPHILLIP	S COMP	PANY		Contac	t: CHRIS E-Mail:			@conocopt	hillips.co		ase Name a ZTEC 2007		No.
3. Address	PO BOX HOUSTO				<u>-</u>	3a P	n. Phone l h: 832.4	No. (includ 86.2463	le area €ode	177870	9. Al	I Well No.	30-045	-32245-00-S1
,	Sec 8	T32N R1	tion clearly at 10W Mer N	nd in accord	dance with	Federal re	quiremen	ts)* / ()	100	- (3)	F	ield and Pod ASIN FRUI	ol, or Ex	ploratory COAL
At surfa	ce NESE rod interval		L 660FEL					13.		3.200g		ec., T., R., I Area Sec	M., or B 8 T32N	lock and Survey I R10W Mer NM
At total		reported	301011					(5)		. j	12. <u>C</u>	ounty or Pa AN JUAN		13. State NM
14. Date Sp 05/27/2		•		ate T.D. Re 5/17/2004	eached		rod.	•	levations (L	OF, KB, 6 GL	1			
18. Total D	epth:	MD TVD	3575	19	Plug B	ack T.D.:	MD TVD	-1 /2/			th Brid	lge Plug Set	: M T\	
21. Type El	lectric & Oth	ner Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Submi	copy of e	ach)	. =		22. Was v	well cored DST run?	? [No C	Yes (S	Submit analysis)
		and /Dam	ort all string	1	Λ.					tional Sur	vey?	No C	Yes (S	Submit analysis) Submit analysis)
	I		I	Top	Bott	om Stag	e Cemente	er No. c	of Sks. &	Slurry	Vol. I			
Hole Size	Size/G		Wt. (#/ft.)	(MD)	(MI	D)	Depth		of Cement	(BB)		Cement To		Amount Pulled
12.250 8.750		325 H-40 000 J-55	-		0 234 0 3235				150 525				0	
6.250	<u> </u>	500 J-55			3181 3575			0					0	
								ļ		 		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	_	
24. Tubing	Record		I					<u> </u>		I	!			<u> </u>
Size 1	Depth Set (N	MD) P 3559	acker Depth	(MD)	Size	Depth Set ((MD)	Packer De	pth (MD)	Size	Dep	oth Set (MD) Pa	cker Depth (MD)
25. Producir		3009				26. Perfo	ration Red	ord			<u> </u>		_l_	
Fo	rmation		Тор	E	Bottom		Perforated	l Interval	T	Size	N	o. Holes	l	Perf. Status
A) FR B)	UITLAND (COAL		3248	3498		3248 TO 3498			0.75	0	260	OPEN	
C)														
D)						<u> </u>			-		+			
			ment Squeeze	e, Etc.										
L	Depth Interva		575 UNDER	REAMED 6	25" HOLE	TO 9 5"	A	mount and	I Type of M	aterial				
			498 SURGE				2 DAYS							
									·····					
28. Production	on - Interval	A										· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	·	
	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL		ravity	Gas	F	roduction	n Method		····
	06/15/2004	24		0.0	1520.0		Corr.	API	Gravity			GAS P	UMPING	UNIT
	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:		Well Sta	itus				
	SI	600.0		0	1520	0			P	GW				
28a. Product			Terr	0.1	Io.	14:								
	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil G Corr.	ravity API	Gas Gravity	P	roduction	ACCEP	TED F	OR RECORI
ize	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:0 Ratio		Well Sta	itus		ΔΙ	IF 1	2 2004
See Instruction	one and enac	es for ad	ditional data	On rovers	side)							FARM	NGTUA	TIELD OFFICE
LECTRON	IC SUBMIS	SION #3 M REV	4398 VERI) /ISED ** I	FIED BY T	THE BLM VISED	WELL II	NFORMA REVIS	ATION SY ED ** B	STEM LM REV	ISED **	BLN	BY_	ED ***	В

28h Pro/	luction - Interv	701 C										
Date First		Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity	16	Gas	Production Method		
Produced Produced	Test Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr. API		Gravity			
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	V	Vell Status			
28c. Proc	luction - Interv	al D										
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API		Gas Gravity	Production Method		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	V	Vell Status	tatus		
29. Dispo	osition of Gas(Sold, used j	for fuel, veni	ed, etc.)	<u> </u>	.1						
30. Sumi	nary of Porous	Zones (Inc	lude Aquife	rs):					31. For	mation (Log) Markers		
tests,	all important including depe											
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Co						ons, Contents	, etc.		Name	Top Meas. Depth		
OJO ALA SAN JOS NACIMIE KIRTLAN 32. Addi Sing attac	SE NTO ID tional remarks le well produc	(include pl	0 571 1910 ugging procente Basin Fr	571 1910 edure): ruitland Co	al. Well sc	hematic ai	nd Daily sum	mary are	OJ KIF FR	CIMIENTO O ALAMO RTLAND UITLAND CTURED CLIFFS	13 1759 1809 3244 3499	
1. El 5. Su	e enclosed atta ectrical/Mecha indry Notice for eby certify that	nical Logs or plugging	and cement	verification		Geologi Core Ar plete and core	nalysis	mined fron	3. DST Rep 7 Other:	port 4. Dire	ctional Survey	
		Con	Electronmitted to A	ronic Subm For CON	ission #343 IOCOPHIL	98 Verifie LLIPS CO	d by the BLM MPANY, sen ENNE BRUM	I Well Info t to the Fa (LEY on 0	ormation System ermington 8/12/2004 (0	stem. 4AXB3142SE)	<i>r</i>	
INAIII	c(please print)	OF II ALO	COTARTIO					E AUTHO	MIZED KEP	PRESENTATIVE		
Signa	iture	(Electroni	c Submissi	on)			Dat	e <u>08/11/20</u>	004			
Title 191	ISC Section	1001 and 1	NAL 22 TT C	Õ. O. o. o. o. o.	212 1			·	1 31 7 1			

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

ConocoPhillips

Rods

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

Well Name:	Aztec 200A						Spud	: 27-M	lay-04
API#:	30-045-32245					Rele	ase Drl Rig	29-M	lay-04
Location:	1460' FSL & 660' FEL		this well is ed				In Cav Rig	· ————	un-04
	Sect 8 - T32N - R10W		- ¹ / ₁₆ " 3M x 2-	•			ase Cav Rig	ı <u>17-J</u>	un-04
	San Juan County, NM		1" 3M x 7-1/1		-				
	6766' GL (above MSL)	9-	5/8" 8 RD x	11" 3M C	asing Head				
•	13' above Ground Level				.	·			
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL	□		- 111	3	SurfaceCement	d:	27 May 0	
Conference Consisten	Date set: 27 May 04		lew Jsed			Lead : 150 sx Class			
Surface Casing Size) sed			+ 2% S001 Calciur			
Set at						+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 (
Wt.						1.16 cuft/sx, 174 cu			1
	12 1/4 in Conn STC			- 111	11		nent: 15.0		
Excess Cmt						Bumped Plu	ug at: 07:	35 hrs w/	395 psi
T.O.C.	SURFACE Csg S	Shoe234ft				Final Circ P	ress: 14	5 psi @ 0).5 bpm
	TD of 12-1/4"	hole <u>244</u> ft				Returns during		YES	
						CMT Returns to surf	ace:8	bbls (38	.7 sx)
		25-May-04		111	Ì		leld: <u> </u>		
Notified	NMOCD @ 20:52 hrs on _	25-May-04			1	V.O.C. for 6.40 V.O.C. for 9.40	•	•	
Intermediate Ca	sing Date set: 29-May-04	4[X]	lew			ntermediate Cemen	t		
Size			Jsed	-	_	Date cmt'd	-	29-May-0)4
Set at	3235 ft 0	pups				Lead: 425 sx Class	G Cemen	t	
Wt.				. []]	,	+ 3% D079 Extend			
Hole Size						+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 (Flakes	
Excess Cmt		Collar 3189 ft	4		-	+ 0.2% D046 Antifo		-1 11 7	
		Shoe 3235 ft Hole 3240 ft	}		1 1	2.61cuft/sx, 1109.3	cuit siurry	at 11.7 p	opg
բար @ Pup @		Hole 3240 II				Tail: 100 sx 50/5	0 POZ : CI	ass G cel	ment
		28-May-04	\		}	+ 2% D020 Benton		200 0 00.	
		28-May-04]			+ 2% BWOC S001	Calcium C	hloride	
					1 (+ 5 lb/sx D024 Gils	onite	-	
Production Line	Date set: 15-Jun-04		New		\	+ 0.25 lb/sx D029	Cellophane	Flakes	
Size		\Box	Jsed			+ 0.2% D046 Antife			
Nominal Wt		1.70	}			1.27 cuft/sx, 127 ci			
Grade # Jnts:		LIC	/		1	Displacer Bumped Plu		See Comr	
	6.25 / 9.5 inches		{	1 111	1 }	Final Circ P			
	ned 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3240' to	3575'			/	Returns during			
Top of Line		507.0)		1 /	CMT Returns to surf		bbls (43	
PBTC			((leld: X Y	es N	0
Bottom of Line	3575 ft		\		}				
This well was NOT	- consistent). Y	7	INCEMENTED LINE	R		
THE WOR WAS INO	ournated.					Schematic prepare	d by:		
						Steven O. Moore, I		ineer	
			TD	3,575	ft	20-June-2004		,	
COMMENTS:									
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran a	-			-	•			
	Displaced top wiper plug with water	-	nead and WC	OC before	e backing o	ut landing jt.	_		
7" Intermediate	CENTRALIZERS @ 224', 146', 103 DISPLACED W/20 BBLS FRESH V		S 9 4 DDC 9	SUCUTI	V OOL VMS	DIZED DOUL MATE	Tol	al:	4
/ Intermediate	CENTRALIZERS @ 3225', 3146', 3					INIZED DRILL WATE	To:	tal·	9
	TURBOLIZERS @ 1807' & 1767'.	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	, 2001, 212	, 02 , 00 .			To		2
5.5" Liner	Ran bladed shoe with float valve or	n bottom of liner.	Ran and set	the liner	w/ TIW H-L	atch Drop Off Tool (n			··· ·
Perforations	Perforated 5-1/2" liner with guns or								
}	Perf. Intervals: 3248'-3252', 326		3350', 3352	: '- 3360',	3362'-337	0', 3374'-3380', 338	34'-3389',	3466'-34	476 ' ,
Tubina	3480'-3487', 3495'-3498': Total		1-h4 1 0 0	E# ^P	1-4-1-1-1				
Tubing	2-7/8" Orange Peeled Mud Anchor	•	-		-	• •			
	2-7/8" x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd XO collar, : and 108 jts 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUE 8	,					K D		
Pump	12" long strainer attached below 2"								
						,			

141 each 3/4" rods, spaced out with 1 ea 8' pony rod & 1 ea 1-1/4" OD x 22' polished rod

Set pump in F-Nipple at 3528' MD RKB

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 200A Common Well Name: AZTEC 200A

Event Name:

Contractor Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/10/2004

Spud Date: 5/27/2004

Rig Release: 6/17/2004

End:

6/17/2004

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS KEY 27

Rig Number: 27

Group:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/11/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 11:00		DRILL DRILL	SFTY RURD	MIRU MIRU	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. MOVE RIG AND SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP.
						MOVED TO THE AZTEC 200A SEC 8 - T32N - R10W
			ĺ	ĺ		1460'FSL 660'FEL
						NEAREST HELI PAD IS 1/4 MILE SOUTHEAST OF THIS LOCATION.
						LEFT VOICE MESSAGE ON THE BLM HOTLINE PHONE FOR PRESSURE TEST @ 1215HRS.
						LEFT VOICE MESSAGE ON THE PHONE OF CHARLIE PERRIN WITH
						THE OCD @ 1220HRS.
	11:00 - 17:00	6.00	DRILL	RURD	MIRU	RIG UP EQUIPMENT, UNLOAD DRILL COLLARS FROM PIPE
						BASKET, INSPECT DRILL COLLARS AND ALL RELATED SUBS, ALL
	17.00 10.00		5511	E000	. upu	OK. NIPPLE UP BOPS.
6/42/2004	17:00 - 19:00	I	DRILL	EQRP	MIRU	WORK ON GENERATOR, AND UNIT.
6/12/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 09:00	I	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	09:00 - 10:00		DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	FINISH RIGGING UP, LAY BLOOIE LINES, LAY BLOW LINES. RIG INSPECTION AND REPAIR GIGS.
	10:00 - 13:30		WELCTL	1	COMPZN	PRESSURE TEST CASING AND BLIND RAMS 300# LOW AND 1800#
	10.00	0.00	11.20.2	0, 2	COMIT ZIV	HIGH FOR 30 MIN, STATE INTEGRITY TEST.
			-			PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS, HCR VALVES, AND
						ALL MANIFOLD VALVES. 300 # LOW FOR 3 MIN. AND 1800 # HIGH
						FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK
	13:30 - 15:00	1.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PU BHA 6 1/4" RERUN BIT, BIT SUB WITH DP FLOAT, 12 - 3
						1/2" DC'S, 1JT OF 2 7/8" DP, 1-2 7/8" FN
						W / 1.87 PROFILE.
						PULL DRILL PIPE OUT OF PIPE BASKET AND TALLY.
	15:00 - 16:30	1.50	RIGMNT	RGRP	COMPZN	REPLACE HYDRAULIC SEALS IN # 2 BOP
ļ	16:30 - 17:30	1.00	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	GIH WITH 89 JOINTS OF 2 7/8 AOH DRILL PIPE.
: !						TAG CEMENT @ 3173'
	17:30 - 18:30		DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP 2.5 POWER SWIVEL, CHANGE OUT STRIPPING RUBBER.
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	SECURE WELL, LOCK UP EQUIPMENT AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
6/13/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	CENTER BOPS AND CHAIN DOWN BLOOIE LINES.
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	PRESSURE TEST AIR LINE AND AIR MANIFOLD, 250PSI FOR 3 MIN AND 1200PSI FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK
	08:30 - 09:30	1.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	UNLOAD HOLE, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION, DRLG FLOAT COLLAR
						AND 46' OF CEMENT.
						TAG FLOAT @ 3189'
						CSG SHOE @ 3235'
						TOTAL DEPTH @ 3240'
	09:30 - 18:00	8.50	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRILLING FORMATION 3240' TO 3575'
						DRLG WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL
						CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF
						WATER.
						300PSI ON STANDPIPE.
						COMP DISCHARGE TEMP 220 DEGREES

BOOSTER DISCHARGE TEMP 275 DEGREES

BOOSTER RPM 1500

Page 2 of 6

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

AZTEC 200A

Common Well Name: AZTEC 200A

Start:

Spud Date: 5/27/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

6/10/2004

End: 6/17/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 6/17/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY 27

Rig Number: 27

rig Name.		NET 21				rig number. 21
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/13/2004	09:30 - 18:00	8.50	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	NO WATER TO SURFACE OR TSTM.
						3248' - 3250' 2' 515 UNITS OF GAS
						3263' - 3266' 3' 600 UNITS OF GAS
		ł				3268' - 3274' 6' 615 UNITS OF GAS
					Į	3347' - 3366' 19' 650 UNITS OF GAS
		1				3367' - 3371' 4' 650 UNITS OF GAS
			İ			
						3380' - 3384' 4' 635 UNITS OF GAS
						3386' - 3389' 3' 635 UNITS OF GAS
						3467' - 3477' 10' 664 UNITS OF GAS
						3480' - 3486' 6' 650 UNITS OF GAS
	1	1		1	1	3496' - 3498' 2' 650 UNITS OF GAS
					-	TOTAL COAL 64'
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH
	10.00 - 10.00	1.00	DIVILL	01110	COMIN ZIV	1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10
				-		BARRELS OF WATER.
						200PSI ON STANDPIPE.
						WELL WAS MAKING 1 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL, DOWN TO
						1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL
	19:00 - 19:30		DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND BLOW WELL DRY.
	19:30 - 20:15	0.75	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 13 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
						WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	20:15 - 21:30	1.25	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
						INITIAL PRESSURE 7# ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD
1	1	ł	}			15 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5,50 # 1454 MCFD
						30 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD
		1				45 MINUTES -22.5 # ON GAUGE 5.62 # 1505 MCFD
						60 MINUTES -22.5 # ON GAUGE 5.62 # 1505 MCFD
	21:30 - 23:00	1 50	FLOWT	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST
	21.00 20.00	1.00	1.20	0 5	OOM: ZIV	INSP 22 PSI
						15 MINUTES 103 PSI
•						30 MINUTES 105 PSI
		1				45 MINUTES 107 PSI
	•	1			1	60 MINUTES 107 PSI
	1	ŀ				RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
	23:00 - 00:30	1.50	DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO PICK UP SHOCK SUB AND UNDER
						REAMER.
	00:30 - 01:00	0.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP SHOCK SUB AND UNDER REAMER.
	01:00 - 02:30	1.50	DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP IN HOLE WITH UNDER REAMER TO CASING SHOE @ 3235'
	02:30 - 03:00	0.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP POWER SWIVEL AND RIG UP.
	03:00 - 06:00	3.00	DRILL	1	COMPZN	UNDER REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE FROM
				1	1	3240' TO 3359' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4
						GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS
						OF WATER.
	1			1	-	600PSI ON STAND PIPE
6/14/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	DRILL	UREM	COMPZN	
S, 1-1/2007	30.00 - 07.00	1.00	JANEE	ONEW	CONFZIN	UNDER REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE FROM
						3359' TO 3389' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4
				1		GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS
•			}			OF WATER.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 200A Common Well Name: AZTEC 200A

Spud Date: 5/27/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 6/10/2004 End: 6/17/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 6/17/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY 27

Rig Number: 27

Date '	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/14/2004	06:00 - 07:00 07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 12:00	0.50	DRILL DRILL DRILL	UREM SFTY UREM	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	600PSI ON STAND PIPE PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. UNDER REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE FROM 3389' TO 3575' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
	12:00 - 13:00	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	600PSI ON STAND PIPE BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 200PSI ON STANDPIPE. WELL WAS MAKING 1 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL, DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL
	13:00 - 13:30	0.50	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND BLOW WELL DRY.
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 12 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 8# ON GAUGE 2.00 # 869 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD
	15:00 - 16:30 16:30 - 17:00	1	DRILL FLOWT	TRIP SIPB	COMPZN COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH UNDER REAMER AND LAY DOWN SAME. LAY DOWN DRILL COLLAR. CHANGE RAMS IN # 1 BOP TO 3 1/2 RAMS, PICK UP SURGE JOINT.
	17:00 - 01:00	8.00	STIMOP	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST INSP 20 PSI 15 MINUTES 100 PSI 30 MINUTES 100 PSI 45 MINUTES 102 PSI 60 MINUTES 102 PSI RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE # 1, LET WELL BLOW DOWN. NATURAL SURGE # 2 105PSI NATURAL SURGE # 3 105PSI NATURAL SURGE # 4 105PSI NATURAL SURGE # 5 105PSI NATURAL SURGE # 6 105PSI NATURAL SURGE # 6 105PSI NATURAL SURGE # 6 105PSI NATURAL SURGE FROM SURFACE WITH SURGE JOINT.
	01:00 - 02:00	1.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	RIG DOWN SURGE JOINT, CHANGE RAMS IN # 1 BOP TO 2 7/8 AND TEST.
	02:00 - 03:30	1.50	STIMOP	TRIP	COMPZN	PICK UP BIT, BIT SUB W/ DP FLOAT AND TRIP IN HOLE WITH DRILL COLLARS AND DRILL PIPE TO CSG SHOE.
	03:30 - 04:00	0.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
	04:00 - 04:30	0.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	PICK UP 12 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3575'
	04:30 - 05:00 05:00 - 06:00		STIMOP STIMOP	l .	COMPZN COMPZN	ESTABLISH CIRCULATION AND CLEAN OUT TO 3575' CIRCULATE WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 300 PSI ON STAND PIPE.
6/15/2004	06:00 - 06:45	0.75	FLOWT	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 12 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.

Operations Summary Report

Start:

Legal Well Name:

19:30 - 21:00

21:00 - 21:30

21:30 - 03:00

03:00 - 04:00

04:00 - 05:30

05:30 - 06:00

06:00 - 07:00

07:00 - 07:30

07:30 - 08:00

08:00 - 11:30

6/16/2004

AZTEC 200A

Common Well Name: AZTEC 200A

Spud Date: 5/27/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

6/10/2004

End: 6/17/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

1.50 RIGMNT RGRP

0.50 STIMOP FCO

5.50 STIMOP CIRC

1.00 STIMOP PULD

1.50 STIMOP TRIP

0.50 STIMOP SFTY

1.00 CASING OTHR

0.50 CASING SFTY

0.50 CASING PULD

3.50 CASING PUTB

Rig Release: 6/17/2004

Rig Name:

KEY 27

Rig Number: 27

Group:

ING Name.		NL I ZI				rag ramber. 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/15/2004	06:45 - 08:00	1.25	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
				1		INITIAL PRESSURE 5# ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 20 # ON GAUGE 5.00 # 1374 MCFD
						30 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD
						45 MINUTES - 24 # ON GAUGE 6.00 # 1520 MCFD
						60 MINUTES - 24 # ON GAUGE 6.00 # 1520 MCFD
						75 MINUTES - 24 # ON GAUGE 6.00 # 1520 MCFD
	08:00 - 19:30	11.50	FLOWT	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST
				l		INSP 45 PSI

15 MINUTES 90 PSI 30 MINUTES 100 PSI

45 MINUTES 105 PSI 60 MINUTES 107 PSI

RELEASE SHUT IN AS NATURAL SURGE #1

NATURAL SURGE # 2 107PSI NATURAL SURGE #3 105PSI NATURAL SURGE #4 105PSI NATURAL SURGE # 5 105PSI NATURAL SURGE # 6 105PSI

LEFT #2 SURGE CLOSED IN FOR 2 HRS BECAUSE OF WIND

DIRECTION.

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

WAIT ON A DIFFERENT GENERATOR, OR FIX THE ONE ON LOCATION, GENERATOR WENT DOWN AT 0600HRS. GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3575' NO FILL

CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL

SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.

300PSI ON STAND PIPE COMPZN PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 13 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE

WITH POWER SWIVEL, RIG DOWN AND HANG SWIVEL IN DERRICK.

TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER.

PJSM AND JSA, RIG UP TO RUN CASING, CHANGE #1 PIPE RAMS TO 5 1/2 AND TEST.

RIG UP TO RUN CASING, CHANGE #1 PIPE RAMS TO 5 1/2 AND TEST.

PJSM AND JSA, FOR RUNNING CASING AND PICKING UP LINER

HANGER. 24 # ON GAUGE 6.00 # 1520 MCFD THROUGH 2" LINE WHILE RIGGING UP TO RUN

CASING. COMPZN

MAKE UP DROP OFF TOOL ON JOINT OF DRILL PIPE AND LAY DOWN, RIG UP CASING TONGS.

GIH W/ 5-1/2" 15.5 PPF J-55 LT&C CASING / LINER AS FOLLOWS:

6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/ FLOAT VALVE 1.00'

9- JTS 5-1/2" CASING

389.96'

6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR

2.40'

TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY

393 361

Printed: 8/10/2004 2:21:23 PM

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 200A Common Well Name: AZTEC 200A

Spud Date: 5/27/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

6/10/2004

6/17/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Start:

End:

Rig Name:

KEY 27

Rig Release: 6/17/2004

Group:

Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code		Description of Operations
6/16/2004	08:00 - 11:30	3.50	CASING	PUTB	COMPZN	GIH W/ TOTAL OF 90 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/3209'KB.
						RU POWER SWIVEL- GIH W/ 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/3209' & TAG UP @ 3575'KB,PBTD. SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 3181-3575'KB EOL- W/ PBTD @ 3574KB- RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 3181'KB.
	11:30 - 12:30	[CASING	1	COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND LOAD OUT POWER SWIVEL
	12:30 - 15:30	3.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, TIH WITH DRILL COLLARS AND LAY DOWN SAME.
	15:30 - 17:30	2.00	RIGMNT	RGRP	COMPZN	CHANGE MOTOR ON POWER SWIVEL, CHANGE AND TEST RAMS IN #1 & #2 BOPS, AND TEST.
	17:30 - 18:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
6/17/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	PERFOR	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM & JSA FOR PERFORATING WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 09:30	2.00	PERFOR	PERF	COMPZN	RIG UP BLUE JET AND TEST LUBRICATOR TO 112PSI. PERFORATE AT FOLLOWING INTERVALS. 3495' - 3498' = 3' 12 SHOTS 3480' - 3487' = 7' 28 SHOTS 3466' - 3476' = 10' 40 SHOTS 3384' - 3389' = 5' 20 SHOTS 3374' - 3380' = 6' 24 SHOTS 3362' - 3370' = 8' 32 SHOTS 3352' - 3360' = 8' 32 SHOTS 3346' - 3350' = 4' 16 SHOTS 3264' - 3274' = 10' 40 SHOTS 3248' - 3252' = 4' 16 SHOTS
	09:30 - 10:00 10:00 - 12:30		PERFOP STIMOP		COMPZN	4 SHOTS PER FOOT, 260 TOTAL SHOTS. 5 WIRELINE RUNS. BLOW WELL DOWN. GIH W/ 30.08' X 2-7/8" 8RD EUE BOX ORANGE PEELED MUD ANCHOR W/ 8-(1/4" X 8") SLOTS, 2-7/8" X 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X-O COLLAR (0.46'), W/ 0.85' x 2-3/8" OD X 1.78" ID "F" NIPPLE CONTAINING BLANKING PLUG (PT BP IN FN T/ 1000 PSIG 6-7-2004 @ B&R SERVICE'S SHOP), W/ 2-3/8" X 8' PUP JOINT- W/ 108 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING (3507.84')- LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A BPV EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3559'KB 1/4" X 8" SLOTS 3531'KB. 1.78" FN @ 3528'KB. PERF INTERVAL 3248-3498'KB. TOP OF LINER @ 3181'KB.
	12:30 - 14:30	2.00	TREBOP	NUND	COMPZN	RIG DOWN FLOOR AND NIPPLE DOWN BOPS. NIPPLE UP
	14:30 - 17:30	3.00	RIGMNT	SVRG	COMPZN	RADAGAN AND RIG UP TO RUN RODS. CHANGE OIL IN ALL MOTORS AND GEAR BOXES, TRANSMISSION, REAR ENDS, TONGS,SWIVEL, POWER UNIT, HYDRAULIC FILTERS.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 200A Common Well Name: AZTEC 200A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/10/2004

Spud Date: 5/27/2004

Rig Release: 6/17/2004

End: 6/17/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Number: 27

Group:

₹i	a	N	а	m	e	•

KEY 27

rig Ivanic.			(L Z				rig rumber. 27
Date	Fron	η - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/17/2004	1	- 17:30 - 18:00		RIGMNT STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	SECURE WELL LOCK UP EQUIPMENT AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE
6/18/2004	07:00	- 07:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	NIGHT. PJSM AND JSA FOR PULLING PLUG WITH ALL PERSONEL ON
	07:30 -	- 09:00	1.50	STIMOP	SLKL	COMPZN	LOCATION. SPOT AND RIG UP WIRELINE TRUCK, TEST LUBRICATOR TO 90PSI.
	09:00	- 11:30	2.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL BLANKING PLUG FROM F-NIPPLE. RU TO RUN RODS- FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)- GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/4" X 12' RHAC-Z INSERT PUMP SN: (CP128) W/ 4' PONY ROD AND 141 3/4" NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE OUT W/ 8' PONY ROD, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD.
							RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3528'KB,FN. LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER- PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 500 PSIG (OK)- STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK). HANG OFF PUMP.
	11:30 -	- 18:00	6.50	MOVE	RURD	COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND PREPARE TO MOVE . RIG RELEASED @ 1800HRS 6/17/04 TO THE FC DECKER PRIMO COM #2A.
	٠		:				