Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

# UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

WELL	COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LC	)G

	WELL (	COMPL	ETION O	R RECC	MPLET	ION R	EPOR <sup>-</sup>	T AND L	OG	7	5. Le N	ase Serial N MNM03402	o. 2	<u></u>
1a. Type of	Well 🔲	Oil Well	_			Other:	СВМ				6. If	Indian, Allo	ttee or	Tribe Name
b. Type o	f Completion	Othe		□ Work C	over 🗖	Deepen	□ Ph	ug Back	□ Diff. R	lesvr.		nit or CA Ag MNM7842		nt Name and No.
2. Name of CONO	Operator COPHILLIPS	S COMP	ANY		Contact:	JUANIT. E-Mail: j	A FARR juanita.r.	farrell@co	nocophilli	os:çom		ase Name a AN JUAN :		
3. Address	PO BOX 2 HOUSTO					3a. Ph	Phone 1: 505.5	No: (include 99.3419 -	area code		9. Al	PI Well No.	30-04	5-32331-00-S1
4. Location			on clearly an		ance with I	ederal red	quiremen	ts)t/	3200	, (,)		ield and Po		
At surfa	ice SWSE	760FSL	1530FEL 3		Lat, 107.	65849 W	Lon			4-5	11. S	ec., T., R.,	M., or 1	Block and Survey
	orod interval i	eported b	elow				1	, ,	6 - Jr	_(@ <i>)</i> }	12. (	County or Pa		13. State
At total	-		112 15	ite T.D. Rea	ahad		116 100	S Comfulate	a c	্ৰুস		AN JUAN Elevations (I	NE 1210	NM BT GL*
07/09/2				04/2004	acned		D D 8	te Complete & A (2004) 08/2004	Ready to P	rod.	17. [		2 GL	, KI, GL)
18. Total I	•	MD TVD	3445		. Plug Bac		MD TVD	34				dge Plug Se	T	MD TVD
21. Type E MUDL		ier Mecha	nical Logs Ri	un (Submit	copy of eac	:h)			Was	well cored DST run? tional Sur	ey?	K⊼No i	₹ Yes	(Submit analysis) (Submit analysis) (Submit analysis)
23. Casing a	nd Liner Rec	ord (Repo	ort all strings		·		_			T				
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.)	Top (MD)	Bottor (MD)		Cement Depth		f Sks. & f Cement	Slurry (BBI		Cement T	op*	Amount Pulled
12.250	<u> </u>	25 H-40	32.0			34			150				0	
8.750		000 J-55 500 J-55	20.0 16.0	308		24 45		<del></del>	510				0	
6.250	)  5.: 	000 1-00	10.0	308	3 34	45				<del>' </del>				
	<del>                                     </del>							<del> </del>			_		<del>-</del>	
24. Tubing	Depth Set (N	(D)   P	acker Depth	(MD) I	Size D	epth Set (	(MD)	Packer Der	oth (MD)	Size	De	pth Set (MI	<u> </u>	Packer Depth (MD)
2.375	<u> </u>	3430	acker Deptil	(NID)	3120 13	- cpui set (	(WID)	Tacker Dep	oui (IVID)	Size	<del> </del>	pui sei (ivii	<del>"   '</del>	acker Deput (WD)
25. Produc	ing Intervals	<u> </u>			<del>'</del>	26. Perfo	ration Re	ecord			<u> </u>			
	ormation		Тор	E	Bottom		Perforate	d Interval		Size	1	No. Holes		Perf. Status
	RUITLAND (	COAL		3138	3354	3138 TO 3354 0.					0	236	OPEN	<u> </u>
B) C)											+			
D)										<del></del>	╬			
_,	racture, Trea	tment, Ce	ment Squeeze	e, Etc.			·	<u>-</u>	<b>_</b>	<del></del>				
	Depth Interv	al						Amount and	l Type of N	/aterial				
				<del></del>			-	<del></del>						
												-		
	tion - Interval	Α												
Date First Produced 08/08/2004	Test Date 08/04/2004	Hours Tested 24	Test Production	Oil BBL 0.0	Gas MCF 869.0	Water BBL 0.0	Co	Gravity rr. API	Gas Gravit		Product	ion Method GAS I	PUMPII	NG UNIT
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	Water	Gas	s:Oil	Well S	tatus		<i>3.</i>	11	
Size 2" PITOT	Flwg. Sl	Press. 8.0	Rate	BBL 0	MCF 869	BBL 0	Rat	110		GSI				
28a. Produ	ction - Interva	al B		L	<u> </u>				1					
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL		Gravity rr. API	Gas Gravit		Product	ion Method		The second secon
								<del></del>			ACCEPTED FOR RE			D FOR RECORL
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas Rat	s:Oil tio	Well S	tatus				
(Can Inst	SI	200 600	ditional data		l aida)								AUG	2 6 2004

28b. Prod	uction - Inter	val C	<u></u>		*							
Date First	Test	Hours	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF		Oil Gravity	Gas Gravity		Production Method		
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	COIT. API	Gravity	,			
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF		Gas:Oil Ratio	Well Si	tatus	-		
28c. Prod	uction - Inter	/al D		<u></u>		1					***	
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF		Oil Gravity Согт. API	Gas Gravity	у	Production Method	<del>,</del>	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF		Gas: Oil Ratio	Well S	tatus	<u>.</u>		
29. Dispo	sition of Gas(	Sold, used	for fuel, veni	ed, etc.)	L.,,,,	11		<del></del>				
	nary of Porous	Zones (Inc	clude Aquife	rs):					I 31. For	rmation (Log) Mark	cers	
Show tests,	all important	zones of p	orosity and c	ontents ther		ntervals and all , flowing and sl		5				
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Descriptions	, Contents, etc.			Name		Top Meas. Depth
This	NTO MO	ile well pro	oducing from	n the Basir	n Fruitland	Coal. Attache	d is the		OJ KIF FR	CIMIENTO O ALAMO RTLAND RUITLAND CTURED CLIFFS		645 2177 2285 2940 3365
1. El 5. Su 34. I here	e enclosed atta ectrical/Mech andry Notice f by certify tha e(please print	anical Logs or plugging t the forego	g and cement bing and attac Elect	verification  ched informs  ronic Subm  For CON  AFMSS for	ation is com	987 Verified by LLIPS COMP	ct as determine y the BLM We ANY, sent to NE BRUMLE	7 ed from all ell Inform the Farmi Y on 08/26	ation Sy ington 5/2004 (0	e records (see attac	4. Direction	·
Signa	ture	(Electron	nic Submiss	ion)			Date 08	3/20/2004		<u>-</u>		

### ConocoPhillips <u>END OF WELL SCHEMATIC</u>

Well Name:	San Juan 32-8 # 236A					Spud:	9-Jul-04
API#:	30-045-32331				Release I	Orl Rig:	11-Jul-04
Location:	760' FSL & 1530' FEL		well is equipped				29-Jul-04
	Sec. 22 - T31N - R8W	7-'/16	" 3M x 2- <sup>3</sup> / <sub>8</sub> " EUE	E 8rd Bonn	et Release (	av Rig_	7-Aug-04
	San Juan County, NM		3M x 7-1/16" 3M T	-			
	6462' GL (above MSL)	9-5/8	" 8 RD x 11" 3M (	Casing He	ad		
_	13' above Ground Level						
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL				<u>SurfaceCement</u>		
		X New	'		Date cmt'd:	9-	Jul-04
Surface Casing	Date set: 9-Jul-04	Use	d		Lead : 150 sx Class G (	Cement	
Size	<u>9 5/8</u> in				+ 2% BWOC S001 Ca		
Set at					+ 0.25 lb/sx D130 Cello		
Wt.					1.16 cuft/sx, 174 cuft s		<del></del>
Hole Size					Displacement		
Excess Cmt			<b>4</b>		Bumped Plug at		
T.O.C.	<del></del>	Shoe <u>234</u> ft	1 111	\ \ \	Final Circ Press		
	TD of 12-1/4'	hole <u>245</u> ft			Returns during job	_	
		07.1.104			CMT Returns to surface		
	fied BLM @ 19:10 hrs on	07-Jul-04			Floats Held		
Notified	NMOCD @ 19:13 hrs on	07-Jul-04			W.O.C. for 6.00 hrs (		
					W.O.C. for <u>9.50</u> hrs (	plug bump t	o test csg)
		EJ.					
Intermediate Ca		XNev	1 111		Intermediate Cement		
Size	7 in 73	jtsUse	a		Date cmt'd:		<u>-Jul-04</u>
Set at		pups			Lead : 410 sx Class G	Jement	
Wt.		•	1 111	1	+ 3% D079 Extender		
Hole Size				11	+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Celle		akes
Excess Cmt		Collar 3083 ft	4	1	+ 0.2% D046 Antifoam		
	SURFACE Bottom of Casing		-		+ 0.05 gal/sx D047 An		43.7
		" Hole <u>3130</u> ft	1 111		2.61cuft/sx, 1070.1 cut		
	ft	40 1.4 04	1 1 11		Tail : 100 sx 50/50 PC	JZ : Class	3 G cement
	fied BLM @ 16:04 hrs on NMOCD @ 16:06 hrs on	10-Jul-04 10-Jul-04	)	$\perp$	+ 2% D020 Bentonite + 2% S001 Calcium C		
Nonnea	NMOCD @ 16:06 hrs on	10-301-04	- /      <del> </del>	1 /	+ 5 lb/sx D024 Gilsonit		
Production Line	Date set: 04-Aug-04	XNev	, /	(	+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cell		lakes
Size		Use	1 1 1 1	\	+ 0.1% D046 Antifoam		idico
Nominal Wt			~ \	1 /	1.27 cuft/sx, 127 cuft s		3.5 opg
Grade	··	LTC	)	1 (	Displacemen		125 bbls
# Jnts			- /		Bumped Plug a	_	
	6.25 / 9.5 inches		( ) )))	1 1	Final Circ Press		
	ned 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3128' to	3445'	)	1 /	Returns during job		
Top of Line	r 3085 ft		/	$\perp$	CMT Returns to surface	-	49 bbls
PBTC	3444 ft		/ I 🗔		Floats Held	: X Yes	No
Bottom of Line	3445 ft		\	1 1			_
	<del></del>		$\setminus$ $\mid$ $\vee$	}			
			)				
This well was NOT	cavitated.		( )		UNCEMENTED LINER		
					Schematic prepared b		
			TD3,445	5ft	Steven O. Moore, Drill	ing Engin	eer
COMMENTS:					16-Aug-2004		
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran	a guide shoe and an	aluminum baffle p	plate 1 jt al	bove the guide shoe @ 189	<del>)</del> '.	
	Displaced top wiper plug with wat	•	nd and WOC befo	ore backing	g out landing jt.		
	CENTRALIZERS @ 224', 146', 10					Total	: 4
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/20 BBLS. FRESH	I WATER & 104.9 BBI	.S. SLIGHTLY PO	OLYMERIZ	ZED 8.4 PPG DRILLING MI	JD.	
	CENTRALIZERS @ 3114', 3040',		701', 212', 82', &	39'.		Total	
	TURBOLIZERS @ 2277', 2234', 2					Total	: 4
5.5" Liner	Ran 6-1/16" OD bladed shoe w/ fl					anger).	
Perforations	Perforated 5-1/2" liner with guns of Perf. Intervals: 3138'-3142', 3150 TOTAL SHOTS 236.					30'-3343',	3352'-3354'.
Tubing	30.65' x 2-7/8" OD Orange Peeled	Mud Anchor with eig	ht each 0.25" x 8'	" slots just	below the upset,		
<b>j</b>	2-7/8" x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd crossove	•		•			
}	107 jts 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUE 8rd	•					
	Bottom of Mud Anchor at 3430'. I			-			
Pump	12" long strainer attached below		• •	-		ımp	
&	135 ea 3/4" OD rods & space out		טע pony rods & 1	ea 1-1/4"	OD x 22' polished rod		
Rods	Set pump in F-Nipple at 3399' MD	K KR					

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A

Event Name:

**COMPLETION** 

4/2/2004

Spud Date: 7/8/2004

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Start: Rig Release: 8/7/2004 End: 8/8/2004 Group:

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Number: 22

From - To	Hours	Code		Phase	Description of Operations
10:00 - 15:00	5.00	MOVE	мов	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- MIRU KEY 22 & SPOT AUXILARY EQUIPMENT-
15:00 - 17:30	2.50	WELCTL	NUND	COMPZN	SI 7" INTERMEDIATE CSG -0- PSIG-NU BOPE- NOTIFIED BLM @ 10:00, 7-29-2004 OF PENDING CSG INTEGRITY
17:30 - 18:00	0.50	WELLPR	OPNW	COMPZN	TEST. SDON.
07:00 - 15:00				COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- RIG UP BLOOIE LINES & AUXILARY EQUIPMENT-
15:00 - 16:15	1.25	WELLPR	SFTY	COMPZN	PERFORM RIG INSPECTION AND CORRECTIONS.
16:15 - 18:00	1.75	RPCOMF	PULD	COMPZN	SLIP, TALLY, & CALIPER 3-1/2" DRILL COLLARS- SLIP 2-7/8" DRILL PIPE.
18:00 - 18:30				COMPZN	SDON.
				COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- RIG SERVICE.
08:30 - 10:30	2.00	WELCTL	BOPE	PROD1	SI 7" INTERMEDIATE CSG -0- PSIG-
					PT BLIND RAMS & PERFORM CASING INTEGRITY TEST T/ 200
				1	PSIG-3MIN & 1800 PSIG-30 MIN (OK)
					NOTIFIED BLM @ 10:00, 7-29-2004 OF PENDING CSG INTEGRITY TEST.
10:30 - 13:00	2 50	RPCOME	PUID	PROD1	SI 7" INTERMEDIATE CSG PRESSURE -0- PSIG-
10.00	2.00	1 00	. 020	111051	MU 6-1/4" RR ETD-44 VAREL TRI-CONE INSERT BIT JETTED W/
					3-20'S W/ 3-1/2" REG BOX x 2-3/8"IF BOX BIT SUB BORED, TAPPED.
					AND CONTAINING A FLOAT VALVE, W/ 12-(3-1/2") DC'S-TBHA
					378.27', W/ 2-3/8"IF X 2-7/8" AOH X-O SUB, W/ 87- JOINTS 2-7/8" AOH
					DRILL PIPE T/3083'KB, TOC.
13:00 - 14:00	1.00	EVALWB	CIRC	PROD1	RÚ POWER SWIVEL & CIRCULATE 7" WELLBORE CLEAN W/ Kfc PRODUCED WATER.
14:00 - 16:30	2.50	WELCTL	BOPE	PROD1	PT #2 PIPE RAMS CHOKE MANIFOLD / 7" CASING T/200 PSIG -3 MIN
					& 1800 PSIG -15MIN (OK)
					PT #1 PIPE RAMS & HCR VALVES T/200 PSIG-3MIN & 1800
					PSIG-15MIN (OK)
					ISOLATE AND CHECK DRILL PIPE FLOAT VALVE (OK)-
					PT STANDPIPE / KELLY HOSE / POWER SWIVEL / & 2-7/8" TIW VALVE T/ 2000 PSIG-10 MIN (OK) .
					PT AIR LINES & MIST PUMP T/1400 PSIG (OK).
16:30 - 19:30	3.00	WELCTL	NUND	PROD1	LEVEL 7-1/16" TBG HEAD BOP STACK-
					PT SECONDARY SEAL T/1800 PSIG (OK).
19:30 - 06:00	10.50	DRILL	DRLG	PROD1	BREAK CIRCULATION W/ 1500 CFM AIR & 6 BPH MIST CONTAINING
					1 GAL F-450 FOAMER & 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR / 10 BBLS
					PRODUCED Kfc WATER@ 1050-500 PSIG-
					DRILLOUT CEMENT / FC @3083'KB / CEMENT / GS @ 3123'KB /
					CEMENT T/ 3130'KB, 8-3/4" TD.
					DRILLING 6-1/4" OPEN HOLE SECTION F/3130 - T/ 3445'KB,TD /
					PBTD-   W/ 6K WOB @ 70-80 RPM'S @ 1100-1400 FT-LBS OF TORQUE-
					COAL INTERVALS NET FEET OF COAL BGG MAX GAS UNITS
					3137-3139' (2') 75 150
1					3140-3141' (1') 150 150
-					3150-3152' (2') 150 165
		1	i	1	
		İ			3157-3158' (1') 155 155
				:	3164-3167' (3') 155 155
	10:00 - 15:00 15:00 - 17:30 17:30 - 18:00 07:00 - 15:00 15:00 - 16:15 16:15 - 18:00 18:00 - 18:30 07:00 - 08:30 08:30 - 10:30 10:30 - 13:00 14:00 - 16:30	10:00 - 15:00	10:00 - 15:00	10:00 - 15:00	10:00 - 15:00

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A

Event Name:

**COMPLETION** 

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Start: 4/2/2004

Spud Date: 7/8/2004 End:

Rig Release: 8/7/2004

8/8/2004

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Number: 22

Group:

	八百年 医精神性外部 计	Code	Code	Phase			of Operations	3 ·	Hout, It is all
9:30 - 06:00	10.50	DRILL	DRLG	PROD1	3210-3212'	<u>16-16-18-18-18-18-18-18-18-18-18-18-18-18-18-</u>		175	propriest fillig
					3236-3237'	(1')	175 1	180	
					3260-3261'	(1')	180 2	200	
					3262-3272'	(10')	200 2	200	
					3274-3278'	(4')			
						(1')			
					l	• •			
ì									
						• •			•
					3361-3362	(1')	410 4	110	
					TOTAL NET FEET	OF COAL 58'.			
				•				CTING	
	:				FACES-COALS AR	E PREDOMINAT	ELY THIN 1-3'.		
					MIDDLE COALS: 20	0-30% BRIGHT B	LACK, & 80-70%	6 DULL BLA	ACK-
					SUB-BLOCKY T/ SI	UB-PLATY, W/P	OOR CLEATING	3.	
					LOWER COALS: 60	)-70% HIGH END	INTERMEDIAT	E, & 40-309	%
					BRIGHT BLACK-			,	
					SILKY TO SATINY	BLACK W/ BRIGI	HT GLASSY LEI	NSES AND	
					BANDS-				
					CUTTINGS ARE SU	JB-BLOCKY TO (	CUBIC-GOOD C	LEAT	
					(				
								IAL FRACT	URING-
			ļ				LS-		
					GOOD QUALITY C	OAL.			
					PICTURED CLIFF	TOP @ 3364'KB.			
5:00 - 10:00	4.00	EVALWB	CIRC	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING	PRIOR TO STAF	RTING OPERAT	IONS-	
							M & 6 BBL / HR	MIST RATE	E W/
ļ									
			1	}					
						OF 1/4" CHUNKS	S DOWN TO CO	FFEE GRO	UNDS
n·nn - 12·nn	2.00	E\/A \A/D	CIBC	COMPAN		C W// 4500 CEM	AID		
J.UU - 12.UU	2.00	EVALWE	CIRC	COMPAN	1		AIK-		
2:00 - 12:30	0.50	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN					
2:30 - 14:00									
				20			PITOT #'S	MSCFD	1
					CONSISTENCY	020 # 0			,
Ì	'		]		1	6.0	1.50	752 /	DRY
					30MIN	6.0	1.50	752 /	DRY
					1	6.0	1.50	752 /	DRY
						6.0	1.50	752 /	DRY
4:00 - 16:30	2.50	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SIPBU				
ļ							<i>‡</i>		
				İ	NATURAL SURGE	#1 W/ 105 #'S-			
5	0:00 - 10:00 0:00 - 12:00 0:00 - 12:30 0:30 - 14:00	2:00 - 10:00 4.00 2:00 - 12:00 2.00 2:00 - 12:30 0.50 1:30 - 14:00 1.50	2:00 - 10:00 4.00 EVALWB 2:00 - 12:00 2.00 EVALWB 2:00 - 12:30 0.50 RPCOMF 1:30 - 14:00 1.50 EVALFM	2:00 - 10:00	2:00 - 10:00	3236-3237' 3260-3261' 3262-3272' 3274-3278' 3314-3315' 3316-3319' 3320-3326' 3330-3343' 3352-3354' 3361-3362'  TOTAL NET FEET ( UPPER COALS: W. INTERMEDIATE S/CUTTINGS-CLEAT FACES-COALS AR MIDDLE COALS: 2 SUB-BLOCKY T/ SI  LOWER COALS: 66 BRIGHT BLACK- SILKY TO SATINY BANDS- CUTTINGS ARE SI DEVELOPMENT W. TRACE CALCITE F. RATHER LARGE G. GOOD QUALITY C.  1:00 - 10:00  4.00 EVALWB CIRC COMPZN R&R @ 3445TD, P. ABOVE CHEMICAL RETURNS: 2+ DOW SAMPLIER VALVE SIZE OF COAL. DRY UP WELLBOF - 32 BWPD W/ PH. PULL UP INTO 7" ( E. COMPZN - 28 BWPD W/ PH. PULL UP INTO 7" ( E. CONSISTENCY 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN SIPBU SIPB COMPZN SIPBU SIPB SIPBU S	3236-3237' (1') 3260-3261' (1') 3262-3272' (10') 3274-3278' (4') 3314-3319' (3') 3320-3326' (6') 3330-3339' (13') 3320-3326' (6') 3330-3343' (13') 3352-3354' (2') 3361-3362' (1')  TOTAL NET FEET OF COAL 58'.  UPPER COALS: WERE 40-30% DUIL INTERMEDIATE SATIN LUSTER, SI CUTTINGS-CLEATING IS FAIR W: S FACES-COALS ARE PREDOMINAT  MIDDLE COALS: 20-30% BRIGHT B SUB-BLOCKY T/ SUB-PLATY, W/ P  LOWER COALS: 40-70% HIGH END BRIGHT BLACK- SILKY TO SATINY BLACK W/ BRIGH BANDS- CUTTINGS ARE SUB-BLOCKY TO 0 DEVELOPMENT W/ INTERSECTING TRACE CALCITE FILLED FRACTUP RATHER LARGE QUARTZ CRYSTA GOOD QUALITY COAL.  PICTURED CLIFF TOP @ 3364'KB. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STAF R&R @ 3445'TD, PBTD W/ 1500 CFI ABOVE CHEMICALS @ 450 PSIG-RETURNS: 2+ DOWN T/ 1/4 OF A B SAMPLIER VALVE OF 1/4" CHUNKS SIZE OF COAL.  DRY UP WELLBORE W/ 1500 CFM. ~ 32 BWPD W/ 1900 TFM. ~ 3093'KB. FLOW TEST THRU 2" TIME CHOKE MANIFOLD #'S CONSISTENCY 15MIN 6.0 30MIN 6.0 30MIN 6.0 45MIN 6.0 30MIN 6.0 30MIN 6.0 SIPBU ISIP 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60	3236-3237' (1') 175   175   3260-3261' (1') 180   2200   2274-3278' (4') 195   3267-3272' (10')   200   2274-3278' (4') 195   3316-3319' (3') 193   3320-3326' (6') 350   481   4352-3354' (2') 440   4352-3364' (2') 440   43561-3362' (1') 410   40   40   40   40   40   40   40	3236-3237

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A** 

Contractor Name:

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Start: 4/2/2004 Spud Date: 7/8/2004 8/8/2004 End:

Rig Release: 8/7/2004

Rig Number: 22

Group:

Rig Name: **KEY ENERGY** 图 (1995年) 1996年 1

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/2/2004	14:00 - 16:30	2.50	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	RETURNS: VERY LITTLE IF ANY RETURNS TO SURFACE AFTER SURGE.
	16:30 - 20:00	3.50	RPCOMF	TRIP	PROD1	SHORT TRIP F/ 3093 - T/3435'KB, 10' OF FILL AFTER SURGE #1- PULL UP INTO 7" @3093'KB- RD POWER SWIVEL- REVIEW DERRICK RESCUE AND FALL PROTECTION-
						COOH W/ 6-1/4" DRLG ASSEMBLY -
	20:00 - 22:00	2.00	WELLPR	WOCT		WAIT ON AND CHANGE OUT RIG CREW MEMBER THAT WAS UNFIT FOR WORK.
	22:00 - 00:00	2.00	RPCOMF	TRIP	PROD1	MU 5-7/8" X 9.5" BAKER OIL TOOLS UNDER-REAMER W/ (ROLLER CUTTERS), W/ 16/32" INCH JET W/ SHOCK SUB BORED, TAPPED, AND CONTAINING A FLOAT VALVE, W/ 12-(3-1/2") DC'S,-GIH W/ BHA W/ 2-7/8" AOH DRILL PIPE W/ 1.875". ID "F" NIPPLE RUN 1-JT ABOVE DRILL COLLARS T/3128"KB. RU POWER SWIVEL.
	00:00 - 06:00	6.00	DRILL	REAM	PROD1	BREAK CIRCULATION & UNLOADED A 15-20 BBL SLUG OF WATER- UNDER-REAM @ 725 PSIG W/ 1500 CFM AIR & 6-8 BPH MIST (CONTAINING 1-GAL F-450 / 10 BBLS AND 1/4 GAL CORR INHIBITOR / 10 BBLS Kfc PRODUCED WATER)- F/3128-3315'KB,PBTD W/ 1100-1500-FT-LBS OF TORQUE, W/ ~3-6K
8/3/2004	06:00 - 10:00	4.00	DRILL	REAM	PROD1	WOB @ 80+ RPM'S. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- UNDER-REAM @ 700 PSIG W/ 1500 CFM AIR & 6-8 BPH MIST (CONTAINING 1-GAL F-450 / 10 BBLS AND 1/4 GAL CORR INHIBITOR / 10 BBLS Kfc PRODUCED WATER)- F/3315-3445'KB,PBTD W/ 1100-1500-FT-LBS OF TORQUE, W/ ~3-6K WOB @ 80+ RPM'S.
	10:00 - 12:00	2.00	EVALWB	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE PRIOR TO PULLING UNDER-REAMER.
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	PULL UNDER-REAMER INTO 7" @ 3108'KB.
	12:30 - 13:30	1.00	EVALFM	PRDT	COMPZN	FLOW TEST THRU 2" TIME CHOKE MANIFOLD #'S PITOT #'S MSCFD / CONSISTENCY 15MIN 8.0 2.00 869 / DRY 30MIN 8.0 2.00 869 / DRY 45MIN 8.0 2.00 869 / DRY 60MIN 8.0 2.00 869 / DRY
	13:30 - 14:30	1.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SIPBU   ISIP 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN   18# 90# 100# 105# 110#   BLEED WELL DOWN TO PIT SLOWLY.
	14:30 - 19:00	4.50	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	REVIEW DERRICK RESCUE AND FALL PROTECTION- COOH & LAYDOWN UNDER-REAMER- GIH W/ 6-1/4" DRLG ASSEMBLY T/3093'KB- RU POWER SWIVEL- GIH & TAG @ 3441'KB, 4' OF FILL.
	19:00 - 02:15	7.25	EVALFM	CIRC	COMPZN	BREAK CIRCULATION W/ 1500 CFM AIR & 6 BPH MIST & UNLOAD A LARGE 20+ BBL SLUG OF WATER @ 560 PSIG-R&R @ 3441'TD, PBTD W/ 1500 CFM & 6 BBL / HR MIST RATE W/1-GAL F-450 FOAMER & 1/4 GAL CORRISION INHIBITOR / 10 BBLS PRODUCED Kfc WATER @ 500 PSIG-RETURNS: 2+ DOWN T/ 1/2 OF A BUCKET / HR OFF MUD LOGGER SAMPLIER VALVE OF MOSTLY 1/4" CHUNKS DOWN TO COFFEE

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A

Spud Date: 7/8/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 4/2/2004

8/8/2004 End:

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/7/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Number: 22

PSIG = 2.5 #'S S- 90MIN
PSIG = 2.5 #'S G- 90MIN
S- 90MIN
S- 90MIN
S- 90MIN
S- 90MIN
90MIN
90MIN
90MIN
90MIN
: <b>#</b>
: <b>#</b>
\ <b>#</b>
)#
,,,, 138 ~ 3' OF
& UNLOAD
IR MIST RATE
BITOR / 10
JD LOGGER
ZE OF COAL
LE OF OOAL
NOED /
SCFD /
3 / DRY
3 / DRY
9 / DRY
9 / DRY
OF FILL.
> = 11 . \
) FILL)
S-
-
FOLLOWS:

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

From - To

12:00 - 13:00

13:00 - 20:30

20:30 - 06:00

06:00 - 12:00

12:00 - 13:00

13:00 - 16:00

16:00 - 18:30

18:30 - 19:00

07:00 - 12:00

8/7/2004

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A

Sub

Code

1.00 CASING HOSO PROD1

PERF

Phase

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

Spud Date: 7/8/2004

**Event Name:** 

COMPLETION

4/2/2004

Contractor Name:

Start: Rig Release: 8/7/2004 End: 8/8/2004

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Code

7.50 RPCOMPPULD

9.50 WELLPR RURD

1.00 WELCTL BOPE

3.00 RPCOMPPULD

2.50 WELCTL NUND COMPZN

0.50 WELLPR OTHR

5.00 RPCOMPPULD

6.00 PERF

Group:

Rig Name:

Date

8/6/2004

**KEY ENERGY** 

Hours

Rig Number: 22

**Description of Operations** 

8/5/2004 08:30 - 12:00 3.50 CASING RUNC PROD1 2.40'

TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY

359.53

GIH W/ 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/3095'KB.

GIH & SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 3095-T/3445'KB EOL-

W/ PBTD @ 3444'KB-

RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 3085.47'KB.

COOH & LAYDOWN 2-7/8" DP AND SETTING TOOL-

TRIP IN & LAYDOWN DC'S. CHANGE OUT #1 PIPE RAMS T/ 2-3/8"-

RD POWER SWIVEL & MANUAL TONGS-

PREP & TALLY TBG

**RU TO PERFORATE** 

COMPZN SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-

SICP-115 PSIG.

**RU BLUE JET PERFORATORS-**

PT LUBRICATOR T/ 115 PSIG.

GIH & PERFORATE Kfc INTERVALS:

3352-3354

3330-3343

3314-3326'

3274-3278 3260-3272

3209-3212

3164-3171

3150-3152

3138-3142

TOTAL 236 (0.75") DIAMETER 120 DEGREE PHASED HOLES-

RD PERFORATORS.

PT 2-3/8" PIPE RAMS T/ 115 PSIG (OK)-

BLEED WELL DOWN TO PIT-(SLIGHT BLOW " LOGGING OFF") GIH W/ 30.65' X 2-7/8" 8RD EUE BOX ORANGE PEELED MUD ANCHOR W/ 8-(1/4" X 8") SLOTS, 2-7/8" X 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X-O COLLAR (0.46'), W/ 0.85' x 2-3/8" OD X 1.78" ID "F" NIPPLE

W/ 2-3/8" X 10' PUP JOINT-

W/ 107 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING

(3377.42')-

LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A

BPV

PBTD @ 3444'KB

EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3430.5'KB

1/4" X 8" SLOTS 3403'KB.

1.78" FN @ 3399'KB.

PERF INTERVAL 3138-3354KB.

TOP OF LINER @ 3085.5'KB.

RIG DOWN FLOOR & AUXLIARY EQUIPMENT-

ND BOPE & NU 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" 3M BONNET.

PULL BPV.

SECURE WELL-SDON.

SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-

SICP-115 PSIG.

BLEED CSG DOWN TO PIT-

Printed: 8/20/2004 3:13:31 PM

Page 6 of 6

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 236A

COMPLETION

Start:

Spud Date: 7/8/2004

Event Name: Contractor Name:

4/2/2004 Rig Release: 8/7/2004 End: 8/8/2004

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Group:

Rig Name:	From - To	KEY EN	ruma sa	Sub	Dhoos	Rig Number: 22
Date	FIOIN - 10	Hours	Code	Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/7/2004	07:00 - 12:00	5.00	RPCOMF	PULD	COMPZN	RU TO RUN RODS- FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)- GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/2" X 12' RWAC-Z INSERT PUMP SN: (CP149) W/ 4' PONY ROD AND 135 3/4" NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE W/ 2', 6', & 8' PONY RODS, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD. RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3399'KB,FN. LOAD TBG W/ 10 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER- PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 800 PSIG (OK)- STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK). HANG OFF PUMP.
8/8/2004	12:00 - 17:00 17:00 - 17:30 07:00 - 15:00	0.50	RIGMNT WELLPR WELLPR	OTHR	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	RIG REPAIR (HYDRAULIC LEAKS). SECURE WELL-SDON. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- RIG DOWN AUXILARY EQUIPMENT- RIG DOWN & RELEASE RIG @ 15:00, 8-07-2004- DROP FROM REPORT- TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION OPERATIONS- "JOB COMPLETE"