Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

# UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137

			BUREAU	J OF,L	AND.	MANA	GEME	TΓ					Expire	s: Noven	nber 30, 2000
	WELL C	OMPLI	ETION O	R RE	CON	MPLETI	ON R	EPORT	AND L	.OG			ease Serial IMSF079		
la. Type of	Well	Oil Well	☐ Gas V	Vell	ПD	rv 🔽	Other:	CBM	<del></del>			6. If	Indian, A	lottee o	r Tribe Name
* .	f Completion		w Well	□ Woi			Deepen	□ Plug	g Back	□ Diff.	Resvr.	7. 0	ŕ	Agreem	ent Name and No.
2. Name of CONO	Operator COPHILLIPS	S COMPA	NY					A FARRE juanita.r.fa		nocophil	lips.com	8. L	ease Name SAN JUAN	and Wo	ell No. UNIT 233A
3. Address	4001 PEN ODESSA,			5			3a Pl	. Phone N n: 505.59	o. (include 9.3419)	e area cod	e) (3.0)	9. A	PI Well N		45-32404-00-S1
	of Well (Rep Sec 30	) T32N R8	3W Mer NN	d in acc	cordan	ce with Fe	deral re	quirements		SEP	હુલ 20e -				Exploratory ND COAL
At surfa	orod interval r	790FSL									ZUU4	TE	Sec., T., R	., M., or ec 30 T	Block and Survey 32N R8W Mer NMP
At total		oportou oo							[22 [62]	T.	120%	12.54 \$	County or SAN JUAI	Parish V	13. State NM
14. Date Sp 07/28/2				te T.D. /08/200		hed		-D	Complete A	Ready to	Prod. C	17.7. 3.7		(DF, K 586 GL	B, RT, GL)*
18. Total D	Depth:	MD TVD	3565		19.	Plug Back	T.D.:	MD TVD	35	63 4 LA	120 D	pth Bri	idge Plug S	Set:	MD TVD
21. Type E	lectric & Oth		ical Logs R	un (Sub	mit co	nny of each	1)	1110		I 22. Was	well core	ed?	No No		s (Submit analysis)
MUDLO 23. Casing a	OG		J	`			-,			Was	DST run	? urvey?	No No	Ħ Yes	s (Submit analysis) s (Submit analysis)
23. Casing a	Ind Liner Reco	oru ( <i>kepoi</i>	rı aii sirings	Set in V	<u> </u>	Bottom	Stag	e Cementer	· No o	of Sks. &	Slurr	y Vol.	T		<u> </u>
Hole Size	Size/G		Wt. (#/ft.)	(MI	D)	(MD)		Depth		of Cement	(B	BL)	Cemen		Amount Pulled
12.250	<del></del>	25 H-40	32.0		0	23				15			ļ	0	
8.750 6.250	<del></del>	000 J-55 500 J-55	20.0 16.0		0 3080	311 356			ļ	51	0			0	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
0.230	, <u> </u>	00 0-00	10.0		3000	330	,5				1		<del> </del>		
							_				1				
24. Tubing					·										
-	Depth Set (N	1D) Pa 3539	cker Depth	(MD)	Siz	ze De	pth Set	(MD) 1	Packer De	pth (MD)	Size	D	epth Set (N	AD)	Packer Depth (MD)
2.375 25. Produci	ing Intervals	3539			<u></u>	<u></u>	6. Perfo	ration Rec	ord			_			
	ormation		Тор		Bot	ttom		Perforated	Interval	ı	Size		No. Holes	T	Perf. Status
A) FF	RUITLAND (	COAL		3151		3477		•				750	33	2 OPE	N
B)												1			
C)			4.												
D)	racture, Treat	mont Con	ant Causas	Eta											
	Depth Interva		icht Squeezi	e, Etc.				Δ	mount and	d Type of	Material				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
	Depuii iii.e. v	**	-						inount un	a Type of					
	tion - Interval		Im	To:				•				1_			
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL		Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil G Corr.	ravity API	Gas Grav	rity	Produc	tion Method		
08/31/2004	08/30/2004	1		0.0		2863.0	1.						GA:	S PUMP	ING UNIT
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL		Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas: Ratio		Well	Status				
2" PITOT	SI	80.0		0		68712	2.	4			GS1				
	ction - Interva		Tr	Lou			Tay :			16		15 :			
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL		Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil G Corr	ravity API	Gas Grav	rity	Produc	tion Method		
GL 1	n	<u> </u>			$ \bot $		<u> </u>					<u></u>	A	CCEP	<u>TED FOR RECO</u> P
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL		Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:0		Well	Status		1		
	SI	I			- 1		1	1		ĺ			1	(·:	D 9 0 200/

(See Instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #36639 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM
\*\* BLM REVISED \*\*

28b. Prod	uction - Inter	val C		<u></u>	<del></del>							
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity	Gas		Production Method		·
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr. API	Gravit	ıy			
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well S	Status			
28c. Prod	oduction - Interval D											
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravi				
Choke Size						Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well S	Status	<u> </u>		
29. Dispo SOLE	sition of Gas(	Sold, used	for fuel, ven	ted, etc.)								
	nary of Porous	Zones (Inc	lude Aquife	rs):					I 31. For	rmation (Log) Ma	rkers	
Show tests, i	all important	zones of po	orosity and c	ontents ther	eof: Cored ne tool open	intervals and , flowing an	l all drill-stem d shut-in pressur	res				
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Description	ons, Contents, etc	c.		Name		Top Meas. Depth
SAN JOS NACIMIEI OJO ALAI	NTO		0 725 2241	725 2241 2295					OJ KIF	ACIMIENTO IO ALAMO RTLAND RUITLAND		595 2104 2204 3031
This v	ional remarks well is a sing pore Schema	le well pro	ducing fror	n the Basir	ruitland	Coal. Attac	ched is the					
	enclosed atta			·	***************************************		***	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			•	
	ectrical/Mech indry Notice f	_	•	• •	ı	<ol> <li>Geologie</li> <li>Core An</li> </ol>	•		DST Re Other:	eport	4. Direction	nal Survey
	by certify tha	Cor	Elect	ronic Subm For CON AFMSS for	ission #36 OCOPHI	639 Verified LLIPS CON	d by the BLM W MPANY, sent to ENNE BRUMLE	Vell Inform the Farm EY on 09/2	nation Sy ington 8/2004 (0			ions):
Signa	ture	(Electron	ic Submiss	ion)			Date (	09/24/2004	4			
				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			_					

# ConocoPhillips END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

							ud: 28-Jul-04
	30-045-32404					Release Dri F	Rig: 1-Aug-04
Location	790' FSL & 1610' FEL	Note - this well is	s equippe	d with rods	& pump	Move In Cav I	Rig 5-Aug-04
	Sec. 30 - T32N - R8W	7- <sup>1</sup> / <sub>16</sub> " 3M :	x 2- <sup>3</sup> /8" EL	JE 8rd Boni	net	Release Cav	Rig 30-Aug-04
	San Juan County, NM	11" 3M x 7	-1/16" 3M	Tubing He	ead		
Elevation:	6586' GL (above MSL)	9-5/8" 8 RD		-			
	: 13' above Ground Level						
	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL				SurfaceCement		
Dataii.	Dirkig KKB - 15 above GE						
		l				cmt'd:	
Surface Casing		X New			Lead : 150 sx		ent
Size	<u>9 5/8</u> in	Used			+ 2% BWOC	S001 CaCl2	
Set at	ft # Jnts:5				+ 0.25 lb/sx D	029 Cellopha	ne Flakes
Wt.	32.3 _ ppf Grade _ H-40				1.16 cuft/sx, 1	74 cuft slurry	at 15.8 ppg
Hole Size	12 1/4 in Conn STC						4.8 bbls fresh wtr
Excess Cmt	125 %						did not bump plug
	<del></del>	Shoe 235 ft			-		150 psi @ 2 bpm
	TD of 12-1/4"	<del></del>					
	10 01 12 1/4	110le <u>243</u> It				uring job:	
<b>5</b> 1-41	rateuro acos				CMT Returns to		***************************************
	fied BLM @ 12:34 hrs on	<del></del>				ats Held:	
Notified	NMOCD @ 12:37 hrs on	25-Jul-04			W.O.C. for 6.0	00 hrs (befor	e starting NU BOP)
					W.O.C. for 12.	00 hrs (befor	re testing casing)
Intermediate Ca	sing Date set: 31-Jul-04	X New			Intermediate Ce	ment	
Size	7 in 73	jts Used				cmt'd:	31-Jul-04
Set at		pups			Lead : 410 sx (		
Wt.		r -r-=			+ 3% D079 Ex		
Hole Size			1 1 111				Claber
Excess Cmt		Callag 2074 #	]		+ 0.25 lb/sx D		ine Flakes
		Collar 3071 ft	<b>!</b>		+ 0.2% D046		
	SURFACE Bottom of Casing			}	+ 0.05 gal/sx l	D047 Antifoai	m
		'Hole 3125 ft		{	2.61cuft/sx, 10	070.1 cuft slu	rry at 11.7 ppg
Pup @	ft	1			Tail: 100 sx	50/50 POZ :	Class G cement
Noti	fied BLM @ 15:44 hrs on	30-Jul-04 \	·	}	+ 2% D020 Be	entonite	
	NMOCD @ 15:47 hrs on	30-Jul-04			+ 2% S001 Ca	alcium Chloric	de
	_				+ 5 lb/sx D024		
Production Line	Date set: 28-Aug-04	X New	- 1 111	(	+ 0.25 lb/sx D		ne Flakes
	<u> </u>						IIIC FIANCS
Size	. 5.1/2 in	heat		\			
Size		Used			+ 0.1% D046	Antifoam	-1405
Nominal Wt.					+ 0.1% D046 . 1.27 cuft/sx, 1	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry	
Nominal Wt. Grade	ppf ppf Connections:				+ 0.1% D046 . 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement:	124.4 bbls
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts:	15.5 ppf J-55 Connections:				+ 0.1% D046 . 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement:	
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size	15.5 ppf J-55 Connections: 11 6.25 / 9.5 inches	LTC			+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: 19	124.4 bbls
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size	15.5 ppf J-55 Connections:	LTC			+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: 19	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size	15.5 ppf  J-55 Connections:  11  6.25 / 9.5 inches  ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to	LTC			+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: 1! circ Press: 6 uring job:	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream	15.5 ppf  J-55 Connections:  11  6.25 / 9.5 inches  ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to  3080 ft	LTC	0		+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: irc Press: uring job:	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner	15.5 ppf	LTC	0		+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: irc Press: uring job:	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD	15.5 ppf	LTC	0		+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: irc Press: uring job:	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD	15.5 ppf	LTC	0		+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d	Antifoam 27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: irc Press: uring job:	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft	LTC	0		+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: circ Press: uring job: p surface: lats Held: X	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft	LTC	0		+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: circ Press: uring job: p surface: lats Held: X	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft	LTC	0		+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: d surface: dats Held: A	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft	3565'			+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: 19 circ Press: in uring job: p surface: eats Held: X  LINER	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls YesNo
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft	LTC	3,56	5 ft	+ 0.1% D046 .  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: 19 circ Press: in uring job: p surface: eats Held: X  LINER	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls YesNo
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner This well was cavit	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches led 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft  alted.	3565'	3,56		+ 0.1% D046 .  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: d Plug at	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls YesNo
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner	15.5	TD a guide shoe and an alumin	3,56	plate 1 jt al	+ 0.1% D046  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: d Plug at	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls YesNo
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner This well was cavit	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches led 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft  alted.	TD a guide shoe and an alumin	3,56	plate 1 jt al	+ 0.1% D046  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: d Plug at	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls YesNo
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner This well was cavit	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches led 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft  No float equipment was run. Ran a Displaced top wiper plug with wate CENTRALIZERS @ 225', 146', 103	TD a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'.	3,56 um baffle WOC befo	plate 1 jt al ore backing	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: o surface: ats Held: Epared by: ore, Drilling E	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner This well was cavit	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches led 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft  No float equipment was run. Ran a Displaced top wiper plug with wate CENTRALIZERS @ 225', 146', 103	TD a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'.	3,56 um baffle WOC befo	plate 1 jt al ore backing	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: o surface: ats Held: Epared by: ore, Drilling E	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:	ppf J-55 Connections:  11 6.25 / 9.5 inches ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3125' to 3080 ft 3563 ft 3565 ft  No float equipment was run. Ran a Displaced top wiper plug with wate CENTRALIZERS @ 225', 146', 103 DISPLACED W/ 20 BBLS. FRESH	TD a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS	3,560 um baffle WOC befo	plate 1 jt al ore backing Y POLYME	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: d Plug at	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:	Displaced top wiper plug with wate CENTRALIZERS @ 25', 146', 102 DISPLACED W/ 20 BBLS. FRESH CENTRALIZERS @ 3106', 3028', 2	TD a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2	3,560 um baffle WOC befo	plate 1 jt al ore backing Y POLYME	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: 1! circ Press: uring job: s surface: eats Held: X  LINER  Pared by: ore, Drilling E	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls YesNo  Engineer  Total: 4 0. Total: 9
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:	Displaced top wiper plug with wate CENTRALIZERS @ 2212', 2169', & TURBOLIZERS @ 2212', 2169', &	a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2	3,56 um baffle WOC befo SLIGHTL' 04', 80', &	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: o surface: lats Held: Epared by: ore, Drilling E	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate	15.5	a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/float on btm of liner. Rai	3,56 um baffle WOC befo SLIGHTL' 04', 80', &	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME a 37'.	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: o surface: lats Held: Epared by: ore, Drilling E	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:	Displaced top wiper plug with wate CENTRALIZERS @ 225', 146', 103 DISPLACED W/ 20 BBLS. FRESH CENTRALIZERS @ 2212', 2169', & Ran 6-1/4" bit & 3-1/2" OD bit sub Perforated 5-1/2" liner with guns or	a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/ float on btm of liner. Rai	3,560 um baffle WOC before SLIGHTL' 04', 80', &	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME 37'.  TIW H-Late	+ 0.1% D046  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004  bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DF	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: p surface: lats Held: X  LINER  RILLING MUD  Colliner hangel	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r).
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate	15.5	TD a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/ float on btm of liner. Rain E-line at 4 spf, 0.75" diams, 3189', 3258'-3269', 3288'-3	3,560 um baffle WOC before SLIGHTL' 04', 80', &	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME 37'.  TIW H-Late	+ 0.1% D046  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004  bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DF	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: p surface: lats Held: X  LINER  RILLING MUD  Colliner hangel	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r).
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate	15.5	TD a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', 8.59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/ float on btm of liner. Rain 3189', 3258'-3269', 3288'-3 SHOTS = 332.	3,560 um baffle WOC before SLIGHTL' 04', 80', & n liner w/ eter, 120 o 292', 3318	plate 1 jt al ore backing Y POLYME 37'. TIW H-Late degree pha 8'-3322', 33	+ 0.1% D046  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DF	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: p surface: lats Held: X  LINER  RILLING MUD  Colliner hangel	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r).
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate  5.5" Liner Perforations	15.5	a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/ float on btm of liner. Rain E-line at 4 spf, 0.75" diamw. 3189', 3258'-3269', 3288'-3 SHOTS = 332.	3,56 um baffle WOC befo SLIGHTL' 04', 80', & on liner w/ beter, 120 o 292', 3318 th 0.25" x	plate 1 jt al ore backing Y POLYME a 37'.  TIW H-Late degree pha 8'-3322', 33 8" slots jus	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DF	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: o surface: ats Held: Epared by: ore, Drilling E  RILLING MUD o liner hange	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r).
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate  5.5" Liner Perforations	15.5	a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/ float on btm of liner. Rain E-line at 4 spf, 0.75" diamw. 3189', 3258'-3269', 3288'-3 SHOTS = 332.	3,56 um baffle WOC before SLIGHTL' 04', 80', & n liner w/ eter, 120 o 292', 3318 th 0.25" x e check, 2	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME i 37'. TIW H-Late degree pha 8'-3322', 33 8" slots jus 2-3/8" OD (	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DF  ch Drop Off Tool (notes and the last of the last	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: p surface: lats Held: Epared by: ore, Drilling E  RILLING MUD  b liner hange	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r). 392', 3402'-3410',
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate  5.5" Liner Perforations	15.5	a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'.  WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'.  w/ float on btm of liner. Rain E-line at 4 spf, 0.75" diams, 3189', 3258'-3269', 3288'-3 SHOTS = 332.  d Mud Anchor with eight eac collar, 2-3/8" OD expendablibing and 1 ea 10', 1 ea 6' &	3,56 um baffle WOC before SLIGHTL' 04', 80', & n liner w/ eter, 120 o 292', 3318 th 0.25" x e check, 2	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME i 37'. TIW H-Late degree pha 8'-3322', 33 8" slots jus 2-3/8" OD (	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DF  ch Drop Off Tool (notes and the last of the last	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: dirc Press: uring job: p surface: lats Held: Epared by: ore, Drilling E  RILLING MUD  b liner hange	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r). 392', 3402'-3410',
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate  5.5" Liner Perforations	15.5	TD a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/ float on btm of liner. Rai n E-line at 4 spf, 0.75" diams 3189', 3258'-3269', 3288'-3 SHOTS = 332. If Mud Anchor with eight eac collar, 2-3/8" OD expendablibing and 1 ea 10', 1 ea 6' & Nipple at 3508' MD RKB.	3,560 um baffle WOC before SLIGHTL' 04', 80', & on liner w/ beter, 120 of 292', 3318 ch 0.25" x le check, 2 1 ea 4' x	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME 37'. TIW H-Late degree pha 8'-3322', 33 8" slots jus 2-3/8" OD ( 2-3/8" EUE	+ 0.1% D046 1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DR  ch Drop Off Tool (no. 1sed holes 134'-3346', 3371'-33' t below the upset, 1.78" ID) F-Nipple, 8rd subs under to	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: d Plug at: d ricr Press: uring job: p surface: lats Held:  A Papared by: ore, Drilling E  RILLING MUD  o liner hange: 378', 3380'-33	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Engineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r). 392', 3402'-3410',
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate  5.5" Liner Perforations	15.5	a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/ float on btm of liner. Rai n E-line at 4 spf, 0.75" diams, 3189', 3258'-3269', 3288'-3 SHOTS = 332. If Mud Anchor with eight eac collar, 2-3/8" OD expendablibing and 1 ea 10', 1 ea 6' & Nipple at 3508' MD RKB. 1/2" RWAC-Z insert pump of	3,560 um baffle WOC before SLIGHTL' 04', 80', & n liner w/ beter, 120 o 292', 3318 th 0.25" x le check, 2 1 ea 4' x with 1 ea 2	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME 37'.  TIW H-Late degree pha 8'-3322', 33 8" slots jus 2-3/8" OD ( 2-3/8" EUE	+ 0.1% D046  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DR  th Drop Off Tool (no. 1884 holes 134'-3346', 3371'-33' t below the upset, 1.78" ID) F-Nipple, 8rd subs under to	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: d Plug at: d rice Press: d uring job: d surface: lats Held: D surface: lats Held: A Separed by: ore, Drilling E  RILLING MUD  o liner hange: 378', 3380'-33	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Fingineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r). 392', 3402'-3410',
Nominal Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Underream Top of Liner PBTD Bottom of Liner  This well was cavit  COMMENTS: 9-5/8" Surf:  7" Intermediate  5.5" Liner Perforations  Tubing	15.5	TD a guide shoe and an alumin r. Shut in casing head and 3', & 59'. WATER AND 104.4 BBLS 2942', 2859', 2773', 2687', 2 2126'. w/ float on btm of liner. Rai n E-line at 4 spf, 0.75" diams, 3189', 3258'-3269', 3288'-3 SHOTS = 332. If Mud Anchor with eight eac collar, 2-3/8" OD expendablibing and 1 ea 10', 1 ea 6' & Nipple at 3508' MD RKB. 1/2" RWAC-Z insert pump with 1 ea 8', 1 ea 6' & 1 ea 2'	3,560 um baffle WOC before SLIGHTL' 04', 80', & n liner w/ beter, 120 o 292', 3318 th 0.25" x le check, 2 1 ea 4' x with 1 ea 2	plate 1 jt al fore backing Y POLYME 37'.  TIW H-Late degree pha 8'-3322', 33 8" slots jus 2-3/8" OD ( 2-3/8" EUE	+ 0.1% D046  1.27 cuft/sx, 1 Disp Bumpe Final C Returns d CMT Returns to Flo  UNCEMENTED I  Schematic pre Steven O. Mo 7-Sept-2004 bove the guide sho g out landing jt.  RIZED 8.4PPG DR  th Drop Off Tool (no. 1884 holes 134'-3346', 3371'-33' t below the upset, 1.78" ID) F-Nipple, 8rd subs under to	Antifoam  27 cuft slurry lacement: d Plug at: d Plug at: d rice Press: d uring job: d surface: lats Held: D surface: lats Held: A Separed by: ore, Drilling E  RILLING MUD  o liner hange: 378', 3380'-33	124.4 bbls 9:45 hrs w/ 1325 psi 850 psi @ 2.0 bpm YES 20 bbls Yes No  Fingineer  Total: 4 D. Total: 9 Total: 3 r). 392', 3402'-3410',

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

**Event Name:** 

Date

COMPLETION

Start:

8/5/2004

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Sub Code

Phase

Rig Release: 8/30/2004

End: Group: 8/30/2004

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY 18** 

From - To Hours Code

Rig Number: 18

Description of Operations

1 3 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	1 (64 de 2) de de	12/14/14 14/4	5/20 P. J. S.		1 866-861 万石	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
8/6/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	MOVE	SFTY	DEMOB	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	07:30 - 09:30	2.00	MOVE	DMOB	DEMOB	LOADING OUT EQUIPMENT ON FLOATS
	09:30 - 14:00	4.50	MOVE	мов	DEMOB	MOVING RIG & EQUIPMENT TO LOCATION
	14:00 - 18:30	4.50	MOVE	MOB	DEMOB	MIRU KEY RIG # 18 & EQUIPMENT
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	MOVE	OTHR	DEMOB	SECURED LOCATION & S.D.O.N.
8/7/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	MOVE	SFTY	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	07:30 - 15:30	8.00	MOVE	RURD	COMPZN	RU RIG & EQUIPMENT = NU BOP STACK, HCR VALVE'S, CHOKE
						MANIFOLD & LINES, BLOOIE LINES & MUFFLERS, RIG FLOOR &
						EQUIPMENT
	15:30 - 17:30	2.00	EVALFM	PRTS	COMPZN	STATE INTEGRITY TEST 7" CSG & BLIND RAMS = 300# 3 MINS &
						1780# FOR 30 MINS = GOOD TEST = TEST BOP STACK & CHOKE
				1		MANIFOLD 300# 3 MINS & 1780# 30 MINS = GOOD TEST
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	EVALFM	PULD	COMPZN	PU PIPE OUT OF BASKET & PUT ON PIPE RACK = TALLY PIPE
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
8/8/2004	07:00 - 07:15		EVALFM		COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	07:15 - 08:30	1	EVALFM	1	COMPZN	RIG & EQUIPMENT INSPECTION BY COPC SAFETY REP.
	08:30 - 11:30		EVALFM	1	COMPZN	GIH PU 6 1/4" BIT, HUGHE'S STX-20 RERUN S/N 5028164, BIT SUB.
						16-3 1/2" DC'S, 1-2 7/8" DP, 1-2 7/8" FN W / 1.81 PROFILE, 84 JT'S OF
						2 7/8" DP T/3050'
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50	EVALFM	RURD	COMPZN	PU & MU POWER SWIVEL
	12:00 - 12:30	1	EVALFM	1	COMPZN	CIRC & UNLOAD HOLE W / AIR ASSIST
	12:30 - 13:30	1.00	1		COMPZN	DRILL OUT CMT, 7" CSG FLOAT COLLAR, 7" CSG SHOE TO
						INTERMEDIATE TD @ 3125' W / AIR ASSIST
	13:30 - 01:30	12.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	DRILL AHEAD W / 6 1/4" BIT F/3125'-T/3565 TD W / 900 TO 1100
						SCFM AIR, 6 TO 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF
						CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 75 TO
						80 RPMS, 8 TO 12 POINTS ON BIT, 420# PRESSURE ON DP =
					·	RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL, SHALE & SANDSTONE W / 1
						BPH WATER GAIN
	01:30 - 02:00	0.50	EVALFM	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRC & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGERS = BASIN FRUITLAND
						COAL INTERVALS AS FOLLOWS
						3151'-55' = 4 FT = 82 GAS UNIT'S
	}				İ	3183'-86' = 3 FT = 114 GAS UNIT'S
						3188'-90' = 2 FT = 117 GAS UNIT'S
						3257'-59' = 2 FT = 129 GAS UNIT'S
			ĺ			3260'-61' = 1 FT = 129 GAS UNIT'S
						3262'-64' = 2 FT = 143 GAS UNIT'S
						3266'-69' = 3 FT = 134 GAS UNIT'S
	ŀ					3289'-91' = 2 FT = 128 GAS UNIT'S
						3320'-22' = 2 FT = 128 GAS UNIT'S
						3334'-45' = 11 FT = 180 GAS UNIT'S
						3371'-78' = 7 FT = 197 GAS UNIT'S
					1	3380'-91' = 11 FT = 208 GAS UNIT'S
						3402'-10' = 8 FT = 235 GAS UNIT'S
						3412'-15' = 3 FT = 224 GAS UNIT'S
						3419'-20' = 1 FT = 222 GAS UNIT'S
						3471'-77' = 6 FT = 235 GAS UNIT'S
						TOTAL NET COAL = 68 FT
	02:00 - 06:00	4.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	R&R C/O T/3565' TD W / 1000 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450
					COM ZIV	FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF
						FLUID PUMPED = 420# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 75 TO 65 RPMS, 1
						TO 3 POINTS ON BIT = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT
						COAL & FINES W / .5 TO 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1
						SOME STREET TO TO THE TWATER GAIN - 4 DOWN TO T

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 8/5/2004 End: 8/30/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/30/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY 18** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/8/2004 8/9/2004	02:00 - 06:00 06:00 - 08:00	1 1	EVALFM EVALFM	1	COMPZN COMPZN	BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O T/3565' W / 1000 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED = 420# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 65 RPM'S, 1 TO 2 POINTS ON BIT = RETURNS TO SURFACE, VERY LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 3/4 BPH WATER GAIN = 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA
	08:30 - 09:30		EVALFM	1	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE
						TIME = MANIFOLD = PITOT = MCFD = WATER 15 MINS = 6.0# = 1.50# = 752 = LIGHT MIST 30 MINS = 8.0# = 2.00# = 869 = LIGHT MIST 45 MINS = 10.0# = 2.50# = 970 = MED MIST 1 HR = 10.0# = 2.50# = 970 = MED MIST
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TO BUILD PRESSURE
						TIME = PRESSURE
						ISIP = 15#
						15 MINS = 200#
						30 MINS = 280# 45 MINS = 300#
						1 HR = 310#
	10:30 - 10:45	0.25	EVALFM	RURD	COMPZN	RD POWER SWIVEL & TIE BACK ON TWO LINES
	10:45 - 12:15		EVALFM		COMPZN	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA
	12:15 - 12:30		EVALFM		COMPZN	PU & MU BAKER ROLLER CONE 9 1/2" UNDER-REAMER
	12:30 - 14:00	1.50	<b>EVALFM</b>	TRIP	COMPZN	RIH W / UNDER-REAMER, DC'S & DP T/3100'
	14:00 - 14:30	0.50	EVALFM	PULD	COMPZN	TIE BACK ON ONE LINE & PU POWER SWIVEL = BREAK CIRC & OPEN ARMS ON UNDER-REAMER @ 3125'
	14:30 - 04:30	14.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = UNDERREAM F/3125'-T/3565' W / 1800 SCFM AIR, 10 TO 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 700# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 6 TO 8 POINTS ON BIT, 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL, SHALE, SANDSTONE W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 TO 5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
	04:30 - 05:30	1.00	EVALFM	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRC BOTTOMS UP TO CLEAN UP WELLBORE = NOT ABLE TO DRY UP WELLBORE
	05:30 - 06:00		<b>EVALFM</b>		COMPZN	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / UNDER-REAMER
8/10/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	EVALFM	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE  TIME = MANIFOLD = PITOT = MCFD = WATER  15 MINS = 8.0# = 2.0# = 869 = LIGHT MIST  30 MINS = 10.0# = 2.5# = 970 = MED MIST  45 MINS = 12.0# = 3.0# = 1065 = MED MIST  1 HR = 12.0# = 3.0# = 1065 = HEAVY MIST
	07:00 - 08:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	SHUT IN TO BUILD PRESSURE  TIME = PRESSURE  ISIP = 20#  15 MINS = 185#  30 MINS = 275#  45 MINS = 290#  1 HR = 300#
	08:00 - 08:30		EVALEM		COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	EVALFM	KUKD	COMPZN	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL & TIE BACK ON TWO LINES

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

**Event Name:** 

**COMPLETION** 

Start:

Spud Date: 7/28/2004 8/5/2004

End:

8/30/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/30/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY 18** 

rig name.		NET 10				Rig Number: 18
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/10/2004	09:00 - 11:00	2.00	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	COOH W / DP, DC'S & UNDER-REAMER
	11:00 - 11:30	0.50	EVALFM	RURD	COMPZN	LAID DOWN UNDER-REAMER = PU & MU BIT & SUB ON DC'S
	11:30 - 13:00	1.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	RIH W / 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB, DC'S & DP T/3100'
	13:00 - 13:30	0.50	EVALFM	RURD	COMPZN	TIE BACK ON ONE LINE & PU POWER SWIVEL
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	GIH PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL T/3480' = DID NOT TAG FILL OR BRIDGES
	14:00 - 14:30	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	PUH LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL & RU TO SURGE WELL
	14:30 - 17:30 17:30 - 18:00	0.50	EVALFM EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	SURGE # 1 HYDRAULIC W / 3 GAL'S OF FOAMER AHEAD, 1 BPM WATER, 1600 SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, CUTTING OFF AIR 3 TIME'S TO DROP DP PRESSURE = 1200# DP PRESSURE & 1050# CSG PRESSURE = BREAKOVER POINT @ 1050# = RELEASED SURGE, RETURNS TO SURFACE, CLEAR FOAM WATER, AIR & FORMATION GAS, NO COLORED WATER OR COAL = BRIDGED OFF SURGE # 2 HYDRAULIC SAME AS ABOVE BUT PRESSURE WAS 1500# ON DP & 1450# ON CSG W / NO BREAKOVER POINT = RELEASED SURGED, RETURNS TO SURFACE, SAME AS ABOVE W / NO COLORED WATER OR COAL RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG @ 3410'
	18:00 - 06:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	R&R C/O F/3410'-T/3471' W / 1500 SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 450# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 350# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 1 TO 4 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 6 TO 3 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
8/11/2004	06:00 - 13:00	7.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = R&R C/O T/3480' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FULID PUMPED, 450# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 350# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 1 TO 6 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
	13:00 - 13:30	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	PUH LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL & RU TO SURGE WELL
	13:30 - 19:00	5.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SURGE #3 - #4 - #5 HYDRAULIC W / 3 GALS OF FOAMER AHEAD, 1 BPM WATER, 1600 SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, CUTTING OFF AIR 3 TIMES TO DROP DP PRESSURE = 1400# DP PRESSURE & 1100# TO 1250# CSG PRESSURE = RELEASED SURGES = RETURNS TO SURFACE, SURGE # 3 CLEAR FOAM WATER, AIR & FORMATION GAS, NO COLORED WATER OR COAL = SURGE # 4 SAME AS SURGE # 3 W / TRACE OF COLORED FOAM WATER, NO COAL = SURGE # 5 BLACK COLORED FOAM WATER W / MED COAL
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 20:00 20:00 - 06:00	0.50	EVALFM EVALFM EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS RIH FROM 7" CSG PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3260' R&R C/O F/3260'-T/3349' W / 1500 SCFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 450# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS &

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

**KEY 18** 

8/5/2004

End: Group: 8/30/2004

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/30/2004

Rig Name.		VE 1 10				rig number. To
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/11/2004	20:00 - 06:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	350# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 6 TO 3 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
8/12/2004	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = R&R C/O T/3349'-T/3471' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FULID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 1 TO 6 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
8/13/2004	06:00 - 18:30	12.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O T/3480' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FULID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 4 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 3 BPH WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	PUH LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL & RU TO SURGE WELL
	19:00 - 00:00	5.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = SURGE #6-#7-#8 HYDRAULIC & PADS W / 3 GALS OF FOAMER AHEAD, 1 BPM WATER, 1600 SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, CUTTING OFF AIR 3 TIMES TO DROP DP PRESSURE = 1400# DP PRESSURE & 1250# CSG PRESSURE = RELEASED SURGES = RETURNS TO SURFACE, SURGE #6 CLEAR FOAM WATER, AIR & FORMATION GAS, NO COLORED WATER OR COAL = SURGE #7 SAME AS SURGE #6 W / TRACE OF COLORED FOAM WATER, NO COAL = SURGE #8 W / 4- 10 BBL PAD'S BLACK COLORED FOAM WATER W / MED COAL
	00:00 - 00:45		EVALFM		COMPZN	RIH FROM 7" CSG PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3320' = BOP DRILL DURING TRIP IN HOLE
	00:45 - 06:00	5.25	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	R&R C/O F/3320'-T/3349' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 6 TO 4 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
8/14/2004	06:00 - 15:00	9.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O T/3379' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FULID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 4 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 3 BPH WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
	15:00 - 15:30	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA, LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL
	15:30 - 17:00	1.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SERVICE RIG, AIR & ALL EQUIPMENT
į.	1	1	4	1	1	

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

**Event Name:** Contractor Name:

Rig Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

8/5/2004

End: 8/30/2004 Group:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** Rig Release: 8/30/2004 **KEY 18** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/14/2004	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	RIH FROM 7" CSG PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3370'
	17:30 - 06:00	12.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = R&R C/O F/3370'-T/3410' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL  OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S  OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON  GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S =  RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 2 BPH WATER  GAIN = 4 TO 7 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER =  95% COAL
8/15/2004	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O F/3379'-T/3410' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 2 TO 3 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 TO 5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
8/16/2004	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = R&R C/O F/3410'-T/3471' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL  OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S  OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON  GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S =  RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 2 TO 3 BPH  WATER GAIN = 4 TO 7 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE  CATCHER = 95% COAL
8/17/2004	06:00 - 18:30	12.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O T/3490' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 1 TO 4 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 3 TO 4 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 TO 1.5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA LAYING DOWN JTS OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	EVALFM	SFTY	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	19:30 - 20:30	1.00	EVALFM	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE  TIME = MANIFOLD = PITOT = MCFD = WATER  15 MINS = 20# = 5.0# = 1374 = MED MIST  30 MINS = 22# = 5.5# = 1454 = HEAVY MIST  45 MINS = 24# = 6.0# = 1520 = HEAVY MIST / 1/8"  STREAM OF WATER  1 HR = 24# = 6.0# = 1520 = HEAVY MIST W /  1/4" STREAM OF WATER
	20:30 - 21:30	1.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TO BUILD PRESSURE  TIME = PRESSURE  ISIP = 25#  15 MINS = 180#  30 MINS = 230#  45 MINS = 260#  1 HR = 275#  WELL LOGGING OFF W / FORMATION WATER

Page 6 of 12

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

8/5/2004

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

Rig Release: 8/30/2004

End:

8/30/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Number: 18

Group:

Rig	Name:
-----	-------

**KEY 18** 

Rig Name:	i	KEY 18				Rig Number: 18
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/17/2004	20:30 - 21:30 21:30 - 03:00	F .	EVALFM EVALFM	1	COMPZN COMPZN	3 SURGE'S # 9 - # 10 - # 11 W / 3 GALS OF FOAMER AHEAD & 1600 SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED & 3 TO 4 10 BBL WATER-FOAMER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, ON
	03:00 - 03:30 03:30 - 06:00		EVALFM EVALFM		COMPZN COMPZN	SURGE @ 11 BLACK FOAM WATER W / LIGHT COAL RIH FROM 7" CSG PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3310' R&R C/O T/3334' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART@ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 5 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL
8/18/2004	06:00 - 08:30	2.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = R&R C/O T/3490' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 1 TO 4 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 3 TO 4 BPH WATER GAIN = 1.5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER  = 95% COAL
	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL
	09:00 - 09:30 09:30 - 14:30		EVALFM EVALFM		COMPZN COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS SURGES # 12 - # 13 - # 14 W / 3 GAL'S OF FOAMER AHEAD & 1600 SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED & 3-10 BBL WATER-FOAMER PADS, 1050# TO 1300# DP PRESSURE & 1050# CSG PRESSURE = RETURNS TO SURFACE, ON SURGE @ 12 & 13 CLEAR FOAM & WATER W / NO COLOR, SURGE # 14 BLACK FOAM WATER W / LIGHT COAL & FINES
	14:30 - 15:00	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	RIH FROM 7" CSG, PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3240'
	15:00 - 06:00	15.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = R&R C/O T/3240'-T/3286' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL  OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S  OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART@ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON  GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S =  RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 1 BPH WATER  GAIN = 3 TO 6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER =  90% COAL
8/19/2004	06:00 - 17:30	11.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEW'S @ START OF ALL OPERATION'S = R&R C/O T/3334' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSIOR'S & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 to 6 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 TO 1.5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL = ATTENTION LOST ENGINE ON POWER SWIVEL POWER PACK, SWITCHED TO RIG HYDRAULIC'S, SENT ENGINE TO TOWN FOR REPAIR
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W /

#### Page 7 of 12

#### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

#### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

End:

8/30/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/30/2004

8/5/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY 18** 

Rig Number: 18

Sub Phase Date From - To Code Hours **Description of Operations** Code 8/19/2004 17:30 - 18:00 0.50 EVALFM TRIP COMPZN POWER SWIVEL 18:00 - 01:00 7.00 EVALFM OTHR COMPZN SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEW'S @ START OF ALL OPERATION'S = SURGE'S # 15 - # 16 - # 17 W / 3 GAL'S OF FOAMER AHEAD & 1600 SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED & 3-10 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S, 1000# TO 1150# DP PRESSURE & 750# TO 900# CSG PRESSURE = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, ON SURGE @ # 15 & # 16 CLEAR FOAM & WATER W / NO COLOR, SURGE # 17 BLACK FOAM WATER W / LIGHT COAL & FINE'S 01:00 - 01:30 0.50 EVALFM TRIP COMPZN RIH FROM 7" CSG, PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3250' 01:30 - 06:00 4.50 EVALFM OTHR COMPZN SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEW'S @ START OF ALL OPERATION'S = R&R C/O T/3250'-T/3286' W / 1400 SCFM AIR. 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART@ COMPRESSIOR'S & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 5 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 TO 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL 8/20/2004 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 EVALFM OTHR COMPZN SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEW'S @ START OF ALL OPERATION'S = R&R C/O F/3286'-T/3379' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART@ COMPRESSIOR'S & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1 TO 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 TO 7 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 60% TO 70% COAL W / 30% TO 40% SHALE 8/21/2004 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 EVALFM OTHR COMPZN SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O F/3379'-T/3440' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART@ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 1 TO 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 TO 6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 80% COAL W / 20% SHALE 8/22/2004 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 EVALFM OTHR COMPZN SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O F/3440'-T/3471' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART@ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 3 TO 4 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 TO 8 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 60% TO 70% COAL 8/23/2004 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 EVALEM OTHR COMPZN SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O F/3471'-T/3503' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART@ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 3 TO 4 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 TO 6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 60% COAL

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

8/5/2004 Rig Release: 8/30/2004 End: 8/30/2004

Contractor Name: **KEY ENERGY SVCS KEY 18** Rig Name:

Rig Number: 18

Group:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/24/2004	06:00 - 10:30	4.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O F/3503' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART@ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 4 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 4 TO 5 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 TO 1.5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHR = 60% COAL = ATTENTION NOT ABLE TO DRY UP WELL FOR TEST
	10:30 - 11:00	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	EVALFM	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE  TIME = MANIFOLD = PITOT = MCFD = WATER  15 MINS = 20# = 5.00# = 1374 = MED MIST  30 MINS = 35# = 8.75# = 1848 = HEAVY MIST  45 MINS = 32# = 8.00# = 1756 = 1/4" STREAM WATER & HEAVY MIST  1 HR = 32# = 8.00# = 1756 = 1/2" STREAM WATER  W / VERY HEAVY MIST
	12:00 - 14:00	2.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	ATTENTION BAD TEST WELL LOGGING OFF W / WATER SHUT IN TO BUILD PRESSURE  TIME = PRESSURE  ISIP = 40#  15 MINS = 110#  30 MINS = 170#  45 MINS = 210#  1 HR = 240#  1:15 MINS = 260#  1:30 MINS = 275#  2 HRS = 280#
l	14:00 - 14:30	0.50	EVALFM	SFTY	COMPZN	ATTENTION BAD TEST W / LOGGING OFF W / WATER SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = FIRE DRILL
	14:30 - 02:00	11.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = SURGES # 18 THRU # 25 FROM 240# TO 280# NATURAL FORMATION GAS PRESSURE = RETURNS TO SURFACE FROM WHITE FOAM WATER TO BLACK FOAM WATER W / LIGHT COAL & FINES
	02:00 - 02:30	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	RIH FROM 7" CSG PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL & TAG @ 3255'
	02:30 - 06:00	3.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER F/3255'-T/3286' W / 1400 SCFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST, 2 GAL OF FOAMER, 1 GAL OF POLYMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 5 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 60% COAL & 40% SHALE
8/25/2004	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER F/3286'-T/3440' W / 1000 SCFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER, 1 GAL OF POLYMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 5 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS =

### Page 9 of 12

#### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

8/5/2004

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

Rig Release: 8/30/2004

End:

8/30/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Group:

Rig Name:	1	KEY 18				Rig Number: 18
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/25/2004	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / 1TO 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 TO 6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 60% COAL & 40% SHALE
8/26/2004	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER F/3440'-T/3565' W / 1000 SCFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST, 3 GAL'S OF FOAMER, 2 GAL'S OF POLYMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 400# ON
8/27/2004	06:00 - 08:30	2.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 5 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPM'S = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 3 TO 5 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 TO 8 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 60% COAL & 40% SHALE SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEW'S @ START OF ALL OPERATION'S = R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER T/3565' W / 1000 SCFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST, 3 GAL'S OF FOAMER, 2 GAL'S OF POLYMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED, 500# ON CHART @ COMPRESSIOR'S & 400# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 POINT'S ON BIT, 65 RPM'S =
	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 3 TO 5 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 60% COAL & 40% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7' CSG W / BHA LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W /
						POWER SWIVEL
	09:00 - 10:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	FLOW WELL OUT BLOOIE LINE TO CHECK HOLE CONDITION'S
	10:00 - 10:30 10:30 - 06:00	1	EVALFM EVALFM	1	COMPZN	RIH FROM 7" CSG PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3270' SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER F/3270'-T/3565' TD W / TIGHT SPOT'S @ 3270', 3320', 3350', 3410' & 3478' RUNNING 1000
8/28/2004	06:00 - 09:00	3.00	EVALFM	OTUB	COMPZN	SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 3 GAL OF 450 FOAMER, 2.5 GAL'S OF POLYMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF FLUID PUMPED @ 550# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 450# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR, 2 TO 6 POINTS ON BIT, 65 TO 75 RPMS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 3 TO 5 BPH WATER GAIN = 7 TO 2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 65% COAL & 35% SHALE
0.20.2004	00.00 - 03.00	3.00	EVALFIVI	OTHR	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS  = R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER T/3565' TD W / 1000  SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 3 GALS OF 450 FOAMER, 2 GALS OF  POLYMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS OF  FLUID PUMPED, 65 TO 75 RPMS, 1 TO 3 POINTS ON BIT, 550# ON  CHART @ COMPRESSOR'S & 450# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR =  RETURN TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE W / 5 BPH WATER  GAIN = 1 TO 2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER =  60% TO 70% COAL
	09:00 - 09:30		EVALFM	1	COMPZN	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL
	09:30 - 10:00 10:00 - 11:00		EVALFM EVALFM		COMPZN COMPZN	BOP & FIRE DRILL FLOW WELL NATURAL OUT BLOOIE LINE'S TO CHECK HOLE CONDITIONS
	11:00 - 11:30 11:30 - 04:00		EVALFM EVALFM	l	COMPZN COMPZN	RIH FROM 7" CSG PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3389' SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS = R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER F/3389'-T/3565' TD W / 1000 SCFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 3 GALS OF 450 FOAMER, 2 GALS OF POLYMER, 1/4 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR PER 10 BBL'S OF

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A Spud Date: 7/28/2004 Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 8/5/2004 End: 8/30/2004

Contractor Name: KEY ENERGY SVCS Rig Release: 8/30/2004 Group:

Rig Name: KEY 18 Rig Number: 18

Rig Name:		KEY 18	. Ad dharrates			Rig Number: 18
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/28/2004	11:30 - 04:00	16.50	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	FLUID PUMPED, 65 TO 75 RPM'S, 1 TO 3 POINT'S ON BIT, 550# ON CHART @ COMPRESSORS & 450# ON GAGE @ RIG FLOOR = RETURN TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / 3 TO 5 BPH WATER GAIN = 5 TO 15 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE
	04:00 - 04:30	0.50	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	CATCHER = 60% TO 70% COAL PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL
	04:30 - 05:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL & TIE BACK ON TWO LINES
8/29/2004	05:00 - 06:00 06:00 - 07:00		EVALFM EVALFM		COMPZN	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA TO RUN 5 1/2" LINER COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA TO RUN 5 1/2" LINER
0/23/2004	07:00 - 07:30		EVALFM		COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	07:30 - 08:45		EVALFM		COMPZN	W / O TIW FOR 5 1/2" EQUIPMENT & LINER HANGER
	08:45 - 09:00		EVALEM		COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	09:00 - 09:45		EVALFM		COMPZN	RU 5 1/2" RAM'S & EQUIPMENT = PU & MU TIW 7" X 5 1/2"
	09.00 - 03.40	0.73	LVALIN	KOKD	CONT ZIV	H-LATCH COLLAR W / RUBBER ON JT OF DP & LAY DOWN IN
	09:45 - 10:00	0.25	EVALFM	PRTS	COMPZN	TEST 5 1/2" RAM'S TO 300# WELLBORE PRESSURE FOR 15 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	10:00 - 12:00	2.00	EVALFM	TRIP	COMPZN	RIH PU SAME RE-RUN 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB, 11 JT'S OF 5 1/2" CSG, 7" X 5 1/2" H-LATCH COLLAR, SETTING TOOL W / X/O & DP TO 3100'
	12:00 - 12:30		EVALFM		COMPZN	TIE BACK ON ONE LINE & PU POWER SWIVEL
	12:30 - 13:15	0.75	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	WORKING LINER TO TD @ 3565' W / AIR ASSIST = GOOD CLEAN
						WELLBORE HAD ONE BRIDGE @ 3503' IN RAT HOLE W / 6' OF FILL
	13:15 - 13:30	0.25	EVALFM	OTHR	COMPZN	RELEASED OFF H-LATCH COLLAR & PU 3' TO CIRC 7" CSG CLEAN
						= 5 1/2" LINER SET AS FOLLOWS
						6 1/4" BIT & BIT SUB SET @ 3565'
	ļ					5 1/2" LT&C 15.50# CSG SET @ 3563'
				ļ		BOTTOM OF H-LATCH COLLAR SET @ 3082'
						TOP OF TIW H-LATCH COLLAR SET @ 3080'
						OVERLAP OF 7" CSG SHOE = 36'.45"
						TOTAL OF 11 JT'S OF 5 1/2", 481'.05", 15.50# J-55 LT&C CSG IN WELL
	13:30 - 14:15	0.75	EVALFM	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRC OFF TOP OF H-LATCH COLLAR TO CLEAN UP 7" CSG W / AIR ASSIST
	14:15 - 14:45	1	EVALFM		COMPZN	RD POWER SWIVEL & TIE BACK ON TWO LINE'S
	14:45 - 15:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEW'S @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	15:00 - 18:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	
a 10 0 10 0 0 4	18:00 - 19:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	SERVICE RIG & EQUIPMENT = SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
8/30/2004	07:00 - 07:15	1	PERFOR	-	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING & JSA REVIEWS @ START OF ALL OPERATIONS
	07:15 - 07:30	}	PERFOR		COMPZN	12 HR SHUT IN PRESSURE 300# ON CSG = CHECK RIG & EQUIPMENT
	07:30 - 08:00 08:00 - 08:15		PERFOP PERFOP	1	COMPZN	TEST LUBICATOR TO 300# WELLBORE PRESSURE FOR 15 MIN'S =
	08:15 - 10:00	1.75	PERFOP	PERF	COMPZN	GOOD TEST RIH & PERFORATED 5 1/2" LINER W / 3 1/8" CSG GUN'S, 0.75" DIA HOLES, 4 SPF, 120 DEGREE PHASING AS FOLLOWS 3470'-77' = 7 FT = 28 HOLE'S
			1	1	1	3412'-19' = 7 FT = 28 HOLE'S
	Į.	]				3402'-10' = 8 FT = 32 HOLE'S
				1		3380'-92' = 12 FT = 48 HOLE'S
				1		3371'-78' = 7 FT = 28 HOLE'S
				-		,
		•——		·	<del> </del>	the state of the s

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

8/5/2004 Rig Release: 8/30/2004 End:

8/30/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY 18** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/30/2004	08:15 - 10:00	1.75	PERFOR	PERF	COMPZN	3318'-22' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S 3288'-92' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S 3258'-69' = 11 FT = 44 HOLE'S 3183'-89' = 6 FT = 24 HOLE'S 3151'-56' = 5 FT = 20 HOLE'S
	10:00 - 10:15 10:15 - 11:45	I	PERFOR RPCOM	1	COMPZN COMPZN	TOTAL = 83 FT = 332 HOLE'S  RD BLUE JET PERFORATING EQUIPMENT  RU 2 3/8" RAMS & EQUIPMENT  ATTENTION FINAL 2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE  1HR & 30 MIN'S STABILIZED FLOW TEST  TIME = MANIFOLD = PITOT = MCFD = WATER  1:30 MIN'S = 80# = 20# = 2863 = HEAVY MIST W  / 1/4 STREAM OF WATER
	11:45 - 12:30	0.75	RPCOM	PRTS	COMPZN	TEST 2 3/8" PIPE RAM'S = 250# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	12:30 - 12:45	0.25	RPCOM	SFTY	COMPZN	
	12:45 - 14:45	2.00	RPCOM	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PU PUMPING BHA & TUBING
	14:45 - 15:00	į.	RPCOMI	1	COMPZN	LAND TUBING HANGER W / PRODUCTION TUBING SET AS FOLLOWS  2 7/8" ORANGED PEELED MUD ANCHOR SET @ E.O.T. 3539'.52"  2 7/8" X 2 3/8" X-OVER SET @ 3508'.82"  2 3/8" EXP CHECK SET @ 3508'.36"  2 3/8" 1.78" FN SET @ 3507'.66"  2 3/8" 110 JT'S W / SUB'S SET @ 3506'.84" TO HANGER @ SURFACE TOTAL = 110 JT'S OF 2 3/8" EUE 8RD J-55 4.7# TUBING IN WELL PLUS 1-10', 1-6', 1-4' SUB'S UNDER TOP JT OF TUBING W / 1 JT OF 2 7/8" ORANGED PEELED MUD ANCHOR PLUS FN & CHECK
	15:00 - 18:30	3.50	EVALFM	NUND	COMPZN	RD RIG FLOOR, RD GROUND LINES = ND BOP'S, HCR VALVES, CHOKE LINES & VALVES = NU PUMPING WELLHEAD
	18:30 - 19:00		EVALFM		COMPZN	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
8/31/2004	07:00 - 07:30		RPCOM		COMPZN	
	07:30 - 07:45	0.25	RPCOM	SIPB	COMPZN	ATTENTION FINAL SHUT IN TEST  TIME = PRESSURE  12 HR'S = 300#
	07:45 - 08:15		RPCOME		COMPZN	BLOW DOWN WELL
	08:15 - 09:30		RPCOME		I	RU 3/4" ROD EQUIPMENT = SERVICE RIG & EQUIPMENT
	09:30 - 11:00 11:00 - 11:45		RPCOMF		COMPZN COMPZN	GIH PU PUMP & RODS HANG OFF & SPACE OUT RODS AS FOLLOWS = 2" X 1 1/2" X 12' - RWAC PUMP # COPC-155 1-4' 3/4" PLAIN PONY ROD ON TOP PUMP 139 3/4" PLAIN RODS 1-8' 1-6' 1-2' 3/4" PLAIN PONY RODS UNDER POLISH ROD 1-22' 1 1/4" POLISH ROD W / 6' NON-SPRAYED METAL 1-2' 3/4" PLAIN PONY ON TOP OF POLISH ROD
	11:45 - 13:00	1.25	RPCOME	PRDT	COMPZN	LOAD TUBING & TEST TO 500# HELD 15 MIN'S = GOOD TEST = BLED OFF PRESSURE = STROKED PUMP W / RIG BLOCK'S TO 500# HELD 15 MINS = GOOD TEST & GOOD PUMP ACTION
	13:00 - 18:30 18:30 - 19:00		MOVE MOVE	DMOB OTHR	COMPZN COMPZN	RD RIG & EQUIPMENT SECURED WELL & LOCATION = RELEASED RIG & EQUIPMENT

Page 12 of 12

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 233A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

8/5/2004

Spud Date: 7/28/2004

End:

8/30/2004

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

**KEY 18** 

Rig Release: 8/30/2004

Rig Number: 18

Group:

	_				
98	SEMAIN:	ċ	1.2		

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/31/2004	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	MOVE	OTHR	COMPZN	ON 08/30/2004 @ 19:00 PM = RELEASED WELL TO PRODUCTION DEPT. TO PRODUCE BASIN FRUITLAND COAL INTERVAL
						į
				:		
						:
						·