Form 3160-4 (August 1000)

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137

(August 1999)				J OF LAN							\	Expires: 1	Novem	ber 30, 2000
	WELL (COMPL	ETION O	R RECC	MPLE	TION R	PORT	AND L	.OG			ase Serial N MSF07934		
la. Type o	f Well 🔲	Oil Well	⊠ Gas \	Well	Dry [Other					6. If	Indian, Allo	tee or	Tribe Name
	f Completion			□ Work O		Deepen	□ Plug	g Back	□ Diff. I	Resvr.	7 7	nit on CA Ao		ent Name and No.
		Othe	r					*****	المسارات أسائه		/. UI	nit or CA Ag	reeme	ent Name and No.
2. Name of CONO	Operator	S COMP	ANY	_	Contac		eborah.n	narberry@	@conocot	• • • •		ase Name at J 32 FED 2		
3. Address	5525 HIG FARMING					3a. Ph	Phone No. 832.48	o. (include 6.2326	e area code	· · ·	9. Al	PI Well No.	30-04	15-31314-00-S1
A. Location	of Well (Re	port locati	on clearly an 9W Mer NM	d in accorda	nce with	Federal req	uirements	s)*		J	10. I	ield and Poo	ol, or I	Exploratory
At surfa			L 820FWL 3		Lat, 107	7.75440 W	Lon (p	11. 8	Sec., T., R., I	И., or	Block and Survey
At top p	orod interval i	reported b	elow							, .		r Area Sec		32N R9W Mer ŇMF
At total	-										S	AN JUAN		NM
14. Date S 03/03/2				ite T.D. Rea /05/2003	ched		16. Date D & 05/0	Complete A 5/2003	ed Ready to l	Prod.	17. E	Elevations (L 683)	OF, KE 6 GL	3, RT, GL)*
18. Total I	Depth:	MD TVD	3756	19.	Plug Ba	ck T.D.:	MD TVD	37	54	20. De	oth Bri	dge Plug Set		MD TVD
21. Type I	lectric & Oth		nical Logs R	un (Submit	copy of e	ach)			22. Was	well core	đ?	No □	Yes	(Submit analysis)
NÔNE									Was Dire	well core DST run? ctional Su	rvey?	No D	TYes Yes	(Submit analysis) (Submit analysis)
23. Casing a	nd Liner Rec	ord (Repo	rt all strings	set in well)						-				
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.)	Top (MD)	Botto (MI		Cementer Depth	1	of Sks. & of Cement	Slurry (BE		Cement T	ор*	Amount Pulled
12.250	9.6	25 H-40	32.0					-3,74.4	13				0	
8.750	7.0	000 J-55	20.0	.0 0 3369		369			48	0			0	
6.250	5.5	500 J-55	16.0	3300 3756		756				0			0	
	-				 		_			-				
			 	L	+						_			
24. Tubing	Record													
Size	Depth Set (N		acker Depth	(MD) S	lize	Depth Set (1	MD) I	Packer Dep	pth (MD)	Size	De	pth Set (MD))	Packer Depth (MD)
2.375	ing Intervals	3735				26. Perfor	ation Rec	ord			<u> </u>			-
	ormation		Тор		ottom		Perforated			Size		No. Holes		Perf. Status
	RUITLAND	COAL	ТОР	3378	3703	<u> </u>	criorated	3378 T	O 3703	0.7			OPEI	
B)			*****											
C)										•••		_		
D)														
	racture, Treat		ment Squeeze	e, Etc.					1.77					
			703 CAVITA	ŤE			A	mount and	d Type of l	viateriai				
														<u> </u>
28 Produc	tion - Interval													
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil G	ravity	Gas		Product	ion Method		
Produced	Date 05/01/2003	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Соп.		Gravi	ty			0 500	244451
05/15/2003 Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	O.O Oil	1644.0 Gas	0.0 Water	Gas:C	Sa	Well	Status	<u> </u>	FLOW	SFR	OM WELL
Size	Flwg.	Press.	Rate	BBL	MCF	BBL	Ratio							
PITOT 28a, Produc	ction - Interva	1360.0		0	1644	0				PGW				
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	loil G	ravity	Gas		Product	ion Method		
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr.		Gravi	ty	40	CEPTER	Pa-	x .
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas: C Ratio		Weil	Status	L	<u> </u>	.cuj	RAECUN

(See Instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)

ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #22266 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** BLM REVISED **

MAY 3

•										·			
	luction - Interv		Im .	lon.	10	Twee Comments	Toro :	16:	In the state of				
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Met	noa			
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well Status					
28c. Prod	luction - Interv	al D		·									
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method				
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well Status	Status				
29. Dispo	osition of Gas() D	Sold, used	for fuel, vent	ed, etc.)	<u> </u>		<u> </u>		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				
30. Sumi	nary of Porous	Zones (Inc	clude Aquife	rs):				31	. Formation (Log)	Markers			
tests,	all important including depter coveries.	zones of po th interval	prosity and contested, cushic	ontents there on used, tim	eof: Cored e tool ope	l intervals and a	all drill-stem shut-in pressure	s					
	Formation Top Bottom Des					Description	ns, Contents, etc.	Contents, etc. Name Top Meas. Dept					
This	NTO MO tional remarks well is a sing	le produci	ng Basin Fr	uitland Coa		Attached are the siliner informa			NACIMIENTO OJO ALAMO KIRTLAND FRUITLAND FRUITLAND C PICTURED CL		871 2151 2171 3271 3626 3636		
1. E 5. Su 34. I here	e enclosed atta ectrical/Mecha indry Notice for the certify that e(please print)	anical Logs or plugging the forego	and cement ing and attac Electi Committed	verification hed informationic Subm For CON to AFMSS	ation is co	2266 Verified ILLIPS COM	rect as determine by the BLM W PANY, sent to enne Garcia on	7 Other of the 7 Other of 7 Other	ilable records (see n System. on 03AXG1253SE)		onal Survey tions):		
							Date 05/23/2003						

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

ConocoPhillips

Well Name:	SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2A	Spud Date:	3-Mar-03	TD Date : 5-Mar-03
API # :	30-045-31314	Spud Time:	0100 hrs	Rig Release Date: 6-Mar-03
		-		
		7 1/16" 5M x 2	2 1/16" Tree Ad	apter/Cap
		11" 3M x 7	1/16" 5M Tubing	. Head
			x 11" 3M Casin	
		Γ	1	1
			1 1	SurfaceCement
Surface Casin	ng Date set: 3-Mar-03	X New		Date cmt'd: 3-Mar-03
Size	9 5/8 in	Used		Lead : 130sx 50/50/Poz w/2% Gel 5#/sx
Set at	216 ft # Jnts: 5		1 1	Gilsonite, 3% CaCl2, 1/2 #/sx Flocele
Wt.	32.3 ppf Grade H-40			& .2% CFR-3 @ 13.5ppg & 1.32 cuft/sx
Hole Size	12 1/4 in			Displacement vol. & fluid.: 13.8 BBIs. FW
Wash Out	100 %		1	Bumped Plug at: 1007 HRS
	SURFACE ft Csg Shoe	216 ft	1	Pressure Plug bumped: 460 PSI
L3t. 1.0.0.	TD of surface		1 1	Returns during job: YES
	TO OF SURFACE _	220 11		CMT Returns to surface: 11 BBLS.
Notif	fied BLM @ 0010 hrs			Floats Held: Yes No
NOan	on 3/3/2003			W.O.C. for 11 hrs (plug bump to drig cmt)
Notified	NMOCD @ 0012 hrs		1	113 (plug burilp to drig cirit)
Notified				
	on <u>3/3/2003</u>			
Intermediate (Casing Date set: 6-Mar-03	X New		Intermediate Cement
<u>intermediate (</u> Size		Used		Date cmt'd: 6-Mar-03
Set at				Lead: 385 sx Class B Cmt w/3%
Wt.			ļ	
Hole Size	20 ppf Grade <u>J-55</u> 8 3/4 in			Econolite, 10 pps Gilsonite & 1/2 pps Flocele @ 11.4 ppg & 2.90 cu/ft/sx.
Wash Out		2260 #	HH	Tail: 95 sx 50/50/B/Poz Cmt w/2%
	SURFACE ft TD of intermediate		7 ¬	Gel, 2% CaCl2, 5 pps Gilsonite & 1/4
ESI. 1.U.U.	SORFACE II ID of Intermediate	<u>3373</u> II	, , , , ,	
Notic	5od DIM	2002	} 1	pps Flocele @ 13.5 ppg & 1.33 cuft/sx
	——————————————————————————————————————	2003 2003	\	Displacement vol. & fluid.: SEE BELOW
Notified	NMOCD @ <u>1837</u> hrs on <u>3/5/2</u>	2003) .	Bumped Plug at: 1200 HRS
		1	(Pressure Plug bumped: 2000 PSI
Dundantina I i	Data anti: 2 Mari 02	[V]N=	{	Returns during job: YES
Production Li		X New	'	CMT Returns to surface: 21 BBLS.
Size		Used \		Floats Held: X Yes No
Blank Wt.	··	')	
Grade		,	' '	1
# Jnts:	Control of the contro	1		
Hole Size	<u>6 1/4</u> in	(.	1
		/		
		('	\
		(
		'	\	Liner Cement
			/	UNCEMENTED LINER
		PBTD 3754'		
	<u>Line</u>	<u>r Shoe</u> 3756'\		ı
		Τι	O3,756ft	
COMMENTS:				
Surface:	NO FLOAT EQUIPMENT RAN. WELL SI	HUT-IN WITH 85 P	SI.	
Intermediate:	DISPLACEMENT: 20 BBLS. FRESH WA			,
	LEFT APPROXIMATELY 25' CEMENT C			<u>0').</u>
Production:	6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB & FLOAT RUN ON E		LINER	
	TOP OF LINER @ 3300'. 69' OF 7" CAS	ING OVERLAP		
OFNTD 4: :==	5 0.			
CENTRALIZE Surface:		OVED CASING CO	IIADS	
Guilace.	206' OVER STOP RING, 137', 97' & 55' (JVER CASING CO	LLANO.	Total: 4
Intermediate:	CENTRALIZERS @ 3359', 3284', 3243',	3161', 3079', 3038'	& 200'. TURBOI	
				Total: 10

Operations Summary Report

SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

Spud Date: 03/03/2003

04/14/2003 Rig Release: 05/05/2003 End: 05/05/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Group:

KEY ENERGY Rig Name:

From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07:00 - 07:30	0.50	MV	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING WIALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION.
07:30 - 12:00			1	80CMPL	MOVE KEY #29 TO SJ 32 FED 23 #2A LOCATION.
12:00 - 18:30	6.50	СМ	6	80CMPL	RU RIG. NU BOP STACK & RU BLOOIE LINES. SWIFN.
07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CM	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
07:30 - 10:30	3.00	СМ	6	80CMPL	FINISH RIGGING UP. PU DCS & DP OUT OF BSKTS & PUT ON RACKS. STRAP ALL.
10:30 - 12:00	1.50	СМ	8	80CMPL	PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS INDIVIDUALLY TO 250PSI- 5MIN & THEN 2500PS- 10MINI. HELD OK. TEST AIR LINES TO 1750PSI. HELD OK. TEST & CHART CSG & BLIND RAMS TO 250PSI- 5MIN, 600PSI- 30MIN & 1800PSI- 10MIN.
12:00 - 15:15	3.25	СМ	2	80CMPL	MU 6 1/4" RR BIT ON BIT SUB W/FLOAT. PU 9- 3 1/2" DCS FOLLOWED BY 99-JTS OF 2 7/8" DP(3295').
15:15 - 16:30	1.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	CONDUCT RIG INSPECTION W/CONOCO- PHILLIPS SAFETY PERSONNEL.
07:00 - 07:30	0.50	DR	c	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING WALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION.
07:30 - 08:00	1			50PRDR	TIH & TAG UP @ 3300'.
	1	l		50PRDR	PU SWIVEL & UNLOAD CSG W/AIR.
09:00 - 10:00			1	50PRDR	DRILL OUT 30' OF SOFT CEMENT, FC & SHOE JT TO 3369' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR.
10:00 - 18:45	8.75	DR	1	50PRDR	DRILL 6 1/4" OPEN HOLE FR 3370'- 3684' . WOB : 4-5K, 70 RPMS. CIRCULATING PRESSURE: 425PSI - 475PSI. RETURNS OF COAL, SAND & SHALE.
18:45 - 19:15	0.50	DR	2	50PRDR	LOST AIR BOOSTER. PULL UP INSIDE 7" CSG LAYING DN 13-JTS OF DP.
19:15 - 00:00	4.75	DR	z	50PRDR	TEAR DN AIR BOOSTER, SDFN.
06:30 - 10:00	3.50	СМ	c	50PRDR	CONOCO- PHILLIPS SAFETY STAND DOWN.
10:00 - 12:30	2.50	СМ	4	50PRDR	RT DP TO PU 2- ADDITIONAL 3 1/2" DCS. TOTAL DCS IN DRILL STRING- 11.
12:30 - 15:00	2.50	wo	7	50PRDR	SWAP OUT AIR BOOSTER.
15:00 - 17:00	2.00	СМ	1	50PRDR	TIH FR INSIDE CSG SHOE & UNLOAD CSG & CIRCULATE EVERY 3-JTS BACK TO BOTTOM. CLEANED OUT FILL FR 3625'- 84'.
17:00 - 19:00	2.00	СМ	1	50PRDR	RESUMED DRILLING W/6 1/4" BIT W/4K & 70- RPMS. DRILLED FR 3684'- 3756'(TD).
19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ		80CMPL	R&R ON BOTTOM FR 3730'- 3756' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE - 450PSI. RETURNS OF COAL & SHALE CAVINGS FR DRILL OUT. CORRELATE COAL SHOWS ON MUD LOG. 3378'-80': DULL FLAT BLACK SATIN TO SEMI GLASSY COAL. 229 UNITS OF GAS. 3414'-16' & 3418'- 22': DULL FLAT BLACK TO SEMI BRIGHT SATIN COAL, POORLY CLEATED COAL. 265 UNITS OF GAS. 3438'- 46' SEMI BRIGHT SILKY BLACK COAL W/FAIR- GOOD CLEATING. 455 UNITS OF GAS. 3449'- 52', 3453'-55', 3457'-61', 3462'- 64' & 3466'- 68': BRIGHT TO DULL SILKY SATIN BLOCKY BLACK COAL INTERBEDDED W/ DRK BRN CARBONACEOUS SHALE. FAIR- GOOD CLEATING. 396 UNITS OF GAS. 3476'- 81' & 3483'- 85': SEMI BRIGHT BLACK SATIN LUSTER COAL W/FAIR CLEATING. 362 UNITS OF GAS. 3496'- 97' & 3520'-21': DULL BLACK TO SEMI BRT SATIN COAL W/POOR CLEATING. NOT OVER 300 UNITS OF GAS.3562'- 63' & 3564'- 66': SEMI BRT BLACK SATIN COAL W/FAIR CLEATING. 340 UNITS OF GAS. 3600'- 04': BRT BLACK GLASSY COAL W/GOOD CLEATING. 388 UNITS OF GAS. 3631'-37', 3638'-42' & 3648'-49': SEMI BRT BLACK SILKY TO SATIN LUSTER COAL W/FAIR CLEATING. 433 UNITS OF GAS. 3698'-3701': SEMI BRT
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 12:00 12:00 - 18:30 07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 10:30 10:30 - 12:00 12:00 - 15:15 15:15 - 16:30 07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:00 08:00 - 09:00 09:00 - 10:00 10:00 - 18:45 18:45 - 19:15 19:15 - 00:00 06:30 - 10:00 10:00 - 12:30 12:30 - 15:00 15:00 - 17:00 17:00 - 19:00	07:00 - 07:30	07:00 - 07:30	07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MV c 07:30 - 12:00 4.50 MV 1 12:00 - 18:30 6.50 CM 6 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 CM c 07:30 - 10:30 3.00 CM 6 10:30 - 12:00 1.50 CM 8 12:00 - 15:15 3.25 CM 2 15:15 - 16:30 1.25 CM 1 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 DR c 07:30 - 08:00 0.50 DR 2 08:00 - 09:00 1.00 DR 5 09:00 - 10:00 1.00 DR 1 10:00 - 18:45 8.75 DR 1 18:45 - 19:15 0.50 DR 2 19:15 - 00:00 4.75 DR z 06:30 - 10:00 3.50 CM c 10:00 - 12:30 2.50 CM 1 12:30 - 15:00 2.50 CM 1 17:00 - 19:00 2.00 CM 1 19:00 - 19:15 0.25 CM	07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MV c 80CMPL 07:30 - 12:00 4.50 MV 1 80CMPL 12:00 - 18:30 6.50 CM 6 80CMPL 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 CM c 80CMPL 07:30 - 10:30 3.00 CM 6 80CMPL 10:30 - 12:00 1.50 CM 8 80CMPL 10:30 - 15:15 3.25 CM 2 80CMPL 15:15 - 16:30 1.25 CM 1 80CMPL 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 DR 2 50PRDR 07:30 - 08:00 0.50 DR 2 50PRDR 07:30 - 08:00 0.50 DR 2 50PRDR 08:00 - 09:00 1.00 DR 5 50PRDR 09:00 - 10:00 1.00 DR 1 50PRDR 10:00 - 18:45 8.75 DR 1 50PRDR 19:15 - 00:00 4.75 DR 2 50PRDR 19:15 - 00:00 4.75 DR 2 50PRDR 10:00 - 12:30 2.50 CM 4 50PRDR 15:00 - 17:00

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

End:

Event Name:

Start: 04/14/2003 Spud Date: 03/03/2003 05/05/2003

Contractor Name:

Original Completion KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
04/18/2003	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	BLACK TO GLASSY COAL W/FAIR CLEATING. 562 UNITS OF GAS.
04/19/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	TOTAL COAL- 59'. R & R CO COAL FR 3730'-56' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/MOD COAL, SHALE & SAND FINES. 2 1/2 BKTS PR/HR FR
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER. 70% COAL, 15% SHALE & 15% SAND. SAFETY MEETING W/ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION. RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 09:00	1.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3730'- 56' W/1800CFM AIR & 10BPH MIST W/ 1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. RETURNS OF MOD COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/MOD COAL,SHALE & SAND FINES. 2 1/2 DN TO 1BKT PR/ HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 75% COAL, 15% SHALE & 10% SAND.
	09:00 - 09:30	0.50	СМ	2	80CMPL	PULL UP INSIDE 7"(3325') LAYING DN 13-JTS OF 2 7/8" DP.
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	СМ	u	80CMPL	CONDUCT 60MIN FLOW TEST OUT 2" W/PITOT. 15MIN- 440MCFD, 30MIN- 490MCFD, 45MIN- 490MCFD & 60MIN- 490MCFD.
	10:30 - 11:30	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPL	SI FOR 60MIN BUILD UP. 15MIN- 125PSI, 30MIN- 275PSI, 45MIN- 350PSI & 60MIN- 430PSI.
	11:30 - 16:30	5.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	PERFORM AIR ASSIST SURGES #1,#2,#3,#4 , PRESSURING UP TO 1100PSI ON EACH SURGE. PUMPED 2GAL OF FOAMER AHEAD OF 1ST SURGE &1GAL ON EACH THEREAFTER FOLLOWED BY 3-5BBL H2O PADS SPACED OUT DURING EACH BUILD UP. RETURNS OF HVY MIST, H2O & A SML AMT OF COAL CHIPS ON LAST SURGE.
	16:30 - 19:00	2.50	СМ	2	80CMPL	TIH & TAG UP @ 3560'.
	19:00 - 19:15		CM	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 22:00	I .	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3560'- 72' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF COAL & SHALE CHIPS & COAL FINES. 2 1/2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 75% COAL, 15% SHALE & 5% SAND.
	22:00 - 00:00	2.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3602'- 32' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/MOD COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 75% COAL, 15% SHALE, 5% SAND.
	00:00 - 06:00	6.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3680'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS W/MOD COAL FINES. 3DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 85% COAL,10% SHALE, 5% SAND.
04/20/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3680'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & LT COAL & SHALE FINES. 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 85% COAL, 10% SHALE, 5%SAND.
	07:00 - 07:30	1	CM	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 08:15	0.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3680'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & LT COAL FINES. 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 80% COAL 10% SHALE, 5% SAND.
	08:15 - 08:45 08:45 - 15:30	1	CM CM	2	80CMPL 80CMPL	PULL UP INSIDE 7" CSG LAYING DN 10-JTS OF DP. PERFORM AIR ASSIST SURGES #6,#7,#8,#9 & #10 PRESSURING UP TO 1100PSI ON EACH SURGE. PUMPED 2GAL OF SOAP AHEAD OF 1ST SURGE FOLLOWED BY 1GAL AHEAD OF EACH SURGE THEREAFTER FOLLOWED BY 3-5BBL H2O SPACERS THROUGH OUT THE BUILD UP. RETURNS OF HVY MIST, FOAM & DIRTY H2O W/ MINIMAL COAL & SHALE CHIPS TO SURFACE.
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50	СМ	2	80CMPL	TIH PICKING UP DP & TAG FILL @ 3525'.

Operations Summary Report

Start:

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

Spud Date: 03/03/2003 End:

Event Name:

04/14/2003

05/05/2003

Contractor Name:

Original Completion KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 29

Group:

/20/2003	16:00 - 17:30	1.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3525'- 42' W/1800CFM AIR, 1
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operation

04/20/2003	16:00 - 17:30	1.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3525'- 42' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST & 1GAL OF FOAMER+INHIBITOR. RETURNS OF MOD- LT COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/MOD FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER.
	17:30 - 19:00	1.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	75%COAL, 15%SHALE, 5% SAND. R&R CO COAL FR 3542'- 3575' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. RETURNS OF MOD- LT COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/MOD COAL FINES. 2 1/2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 75% COAL, 15% SHALE, 5% SAND.
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 23:00		СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FILL FR 3575'- 3605' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS &MOD COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL. 10% SAND & SHALE.
	23:00 - 01:00	2.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3605'- 36' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. LT COAL CHIPS W/MOD COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE.
	01:00 - 06:00	5.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3636'- 50' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/ MOD-HVY FINES. 5 DN TO 3BKTS PR/HR. 85% COAL, 10%SHALE, 5% SAND.
04/21/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3635'-60' W/1800CFM AIR,10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/MOD COAL FINES. 3BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 85% COAL, 15% SAND & SHALE.
}	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W/ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION, RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL & SHALE CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 3BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 85% COAL, 15% SAND & SHALE.
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25		С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST & 1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE-450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD- COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 85% COAL, 15% SAND & SHALE.
	-		СМ		80CMPL	,
04/22/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR- 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 425PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL & SHALE CHIPS & MOD- HVY COAL FINES. 3BKTS PR/HR. 90%COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50		1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE. R&R CO COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 425PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL & SHALE CHIPS &
	19:00 - 19:15 19:15 - 20:30	0.25 1.25		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	MOD- LT COAL FINES. 3 DN TO 2 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE. SAFETY MEETING. R&R CO COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE: 425PSI. RETURNS OF MOD-LT COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

Original Completion Event Name:

Start: 04/14/2003 Spud Date: 03/03/2003

Contractor Name:

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

End: 05/05/2003

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Group:

Rig Name:	
-----------	--

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
04/22/2003	20:30 - 06:00	9.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE: 425PSI- 700PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 4 DN TO 2 BKTS PR/HR
04/23/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE. R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL & SHALE CHIPS W/ LT COAL FINES. 1/2 BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90%COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 08:45	1.25	СМ	2	80CMPL	PULL UP INSIDE 7" CSG TO 3325' LAYING DN 11-JTS OF DP. CIRCULATED 1ST FOUR OUT.
	08:45 - 09:45	1.00	СМ	u	80CMPL	FLOW TEST OUT 2" W/PITOT. 15MIN- 610MCFD, 30MIN- 869MCFD, 45MIN- 869MCFD, 60MIN- 869MCFD.
	09:45 - 10:45	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPL	SI FOR 60MIN BUILD UP. 15MIN- 160PSI, 30MIN- 260PSI, 45MIN- 350PSI & 60MIN- 460PSI.
	10:45 - 16:15	5.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	PERFORM AIR ASSIST SURGES #11,#12,#13 & #14 PRESSURING UP TO 1100PSI ON EACH SURGE. PUMPED 2GALS OF FOAMER AHEAD OF 1ST SURGE & 1GAL AHEAD OF EACH SURGE THEREAFTER. SPACED OUT 3-5BBL H2O PADS IN EACH ONE. RETURNS OF COAL DUST, FOAM & H2O. LAST 2 SURGES BROUGHT BACK SOME COAL CHIPS & FINES.
	16:15 - 16:45 16:45 - 19:00	0.50 2.25	CM CM	2	80CMPL 80CMPL	TIH PICKING UP DP. TAG UP @ 3490'. R&R CO COAL FR 3490'- 3512' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL OF FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 450PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL & SHALE CHIPS & MED-LT COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1 BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL,
	19:00 - 20:30	1.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	10%SHALE & SAND. R&R CO COAL FR 3512'- 42' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE 425PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & MOD- LT COAL FINES. 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE.
!	20:30 - 21:30	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3542'- 73' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 425PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS W/LT COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL,
	21:30 - 00:00	2.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	10% SAND & SHALE. R&R CO COAL FR 3573'- 3604' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 425PSI. RETURNS OF MOD-LT COAL CHIPS W/ HVY- MOD COAL FINES. 2 1/2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR
	00:00 - 04:00	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL,10% SAND & SHALE. R&R CO COAL FR 3604'- 35' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE-450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD-LT COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE.
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3635'- 3650' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 850PSI-450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3 TO 3 1/2BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 90% COAL, 10% SAND & SHALE.
04/24/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3635'- 50' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE-450PSI. RETURNS OF MOD-LT COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3 DN TO 2 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

Spud Date: 03/03/2003 End:

Event Name:

Original Completion

04/14/2003 Start:

05/05/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Name.	 			11 22222222222222	Capagaga Januara	Rig Number: 29
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
04/24/2003	07:00 - 08:00 08:00 - 19:00	1.00 11.00	1	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W/ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION. R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3635'- 58' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 425PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 3 TO 5 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE. SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 5 DN TO 2 1/2BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
04/25/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 425PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & HVY- MOD COAL FINES. 2 1/2 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50		C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 15:00	7.50	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 425PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & MOD COAL FINES. 2 1/2 DN TO 1BKT PR HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	15:00 - 19:00	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL OF FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE-425PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 3 TO 4 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD- LT COAL CHIPS & HVY- MOD COAL FINES. 3 DN TO 3/4 BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
04/26/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPŁ	R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS W/LT COAL FINES. 1/2 BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50		С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50		2	80CMPL	PULL UP INSIDE 7" CSG LAYING DN 11-JTS OF 2 7/8" DP.
	08:00 - 09:00	1.00	СМ	u	80CMPL	CONDUCT FLOW TEST OUT 2" W/PITOT. 15MIN- 1,06MMCFD, 30MIN- 1.23MMCFD, 45MIN- 1.23MMCFD & 60MIN- 1.23MMCFD.
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPŁ	SI FOR BUILD UP. 15MIN- 180PSI, 30MIN- 260PSI, 45MIN- 350PSI & 60MIN- 460PSI.
	10:00 - 16:00	6.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	PERFORM AIR ASSIST SURGES #15,#16, #17 & #18 PRESSURING UP TO 1100PSI ON EACH SURGE. PUMPED 2GAL OF FOAMER AHEAD OF 1ST SURGE & 1GAL ON EACH OF THE FOLLOWING. SPACED OUT 3-5BBL H2O PADS ON EACH ONE. RETURNS OF HVY COAL DUST, H2O & DIRTY FOAM FOLLOWED BY RUNNING COAL.
	16:00 - 16:45	0.75		2	80CMPL	TIH PICKING UP DP. TAG UP @ 3542'.
	16:45 - 18:00	1.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3512'-42' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & MOD COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5%SAND & SHALE.
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3542'- 75' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & HVY- MOD COAL FINES. 2BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5%

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

04/14/2003

Spud Date: 03/03/2003

Event Name:

Start:

05/05/2003 End:

Contractor Name:

Original Completion KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 29

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
04/26/2003	18:00 - 19:00 19:00 - 19:15 19:15 - 20:00	1.00 0.25 0.75	СМ	1 c	80CMPL 80CMPL 80CMPL	SAND & SHALE. SAFETY MEETING. R&R CO COAL FR 3542'- 73' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING
	20:00 - 21:45	1.75		1	80CMPL	PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & MOD COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR/ HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE. R&R CO COAL FR 3573'- 3603' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST.
	21:45 - 02:00	4.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & MOD COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1BKT PR HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE. R&R CO COAL FR 3603'- 34' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL
:	·	4.00	O. A.			FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	02:00 - 06:00	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3634'- 50' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 4 DN TO 3BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
04/27/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3634'- 50' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD- LT COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50		C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3634'- 55' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE-400PSI TO 800PSI BACK DN TO 400PSI. RETURNS OF HVY COAL CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 5 TO 6BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25		1	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75		1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3634'- 60' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 5 DN TO 3 1/2BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER.
04/28/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3634'- 3660' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF LT TO MOD COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	_	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3634'- 60' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL OF FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE-400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD- LT COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3 TO 4BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	19:00 - 19:15 19:15 - 06:00	0.25 10.75		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3634'- 60' W/1800CFM AIR-MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI UP TO 550PSI THEN BACK DN TO 375PSI. RETURNS OF MOD TO LT COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 4 DN TO 2 1/2BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95%
04/29/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE. R&R CO COAL FR 3635'- 60' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & HVY FINES. 3 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.

Printed: 05/14/2003 1:22:15 PM

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

Spud Date: 03/03/2003 End:

Group:

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start: 04/14/2003 05/05/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
04/29/2003	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE. R&R CO RUNNING COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI UP TO 700PSI & BACK DN TO 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD - LT COAL CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 3BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 04:00	8.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3635'- 66' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 375PSI. RETURNS OF LT- COAL CHIPS & MOD COAL FINES. 3 DN TO 1BKT PR HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 80' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 3 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
04/30/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 3680' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS W/HVY COAL FINES. 3 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING. RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD- LT COAL CHIPS W/HVY- MOD COAL FINES. 3 DN TO 1BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3666'- 3700' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR+ 1/2GAL POLYMER. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 375PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & LT COAL FINES. 1 DN TO 1/2BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
05/01/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O AT 3700' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = LIGHT COAL & FINES. 1 DN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER.
						95% COAL, 5% SAND & SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 10:00	0.50 2.50	1	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONNEL R&R C/O AT 3700' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = LIGHT COAL & FINES. 1 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL, 5% SHALE
	10:00 - 10:30	0.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	CIRCULATE WITH 1800 CFM AIR TO DRY UP HOLE FOR FLOW
	10:30 - 11:00	0.50		4	80CMPL	POOH TO 7" CASING SHOE AT 3354' FOR FLOW TEST
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00		u	80CMPL	FLOW TEST WELL THROUGH OPEN 2" LINE AND PITOT TUBE AS FOLLOWS: 15 MIN = 1340 MMCFD 30 MIN = 1644 MMCFD 45 MIN = 1644 MMCFD 1 HR = 1644 MMCFD
	12:00 - 13:00	1.00	l	1	80CMPL	FLOW WELL TO PIT THROUGH BLOOIE LINE NATURAL
	13:00 - 13:30 13:30 - 19:00	0.50 5.50		1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CASING SHOE, TAG FILL AT 3660' R&R C/O F/ 3660' - T/3680' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

Event Name:

Start: 04/14/2003 Spud Date: 03/03/2003 End:

05/05/2003

Original Completion KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

Group:

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 29

nag Name.				C., L.	DE	Destruction in
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	SUDCO	Phase	Description of Operations
05/01/2003	13:30 - 19:00	5.50	CM	1	80CMPL	FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES. 3 - 4 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL, 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONNEL R&R C/O F/ 3680' - T/3695' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES. 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
05/02/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	95% COAL, 5% SHALE R&R C/O F/ 3680' - T/3695' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = MED COAL & FINES. 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL, 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:00	0.50 0.50		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONNEL R&R C/O AT 3700' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = MED COAL & FINES. DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
	08:00 - 08:30 08:30 - 09:00	0.50 0.50	ı	1	80CMPL	95% COAL, 5% SHALE CIRCULATE WITH 1800 CFM AIR TO DRY UP HOLE POOH TO 7" CASING SHOE AT 3354'
	09:00 - 11:00	2.00		1	80CMPL	FLOW WELL TO PTI THROUGH BLOOIE LINES TWO HRS
	11:00 - 11:30	0.50		4	80CMPL	RIH FROM SHOE, TAG FILL AT 3667'
	11:30 - 19:00	7.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3667' - T/3728' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = MED COAL & FINES.
						1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL, 5% SHALE, VERY HARD C/O F/3700' - T/3728' (RAT HOLE) NO TIGHT HOLE, JUST PACKED FILL
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONNEL
	19:30 - 22:30	3.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3728' - T/3755' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = MED COAL & FINES. 2 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
	22:30 - 23:00	0.50	CM	1	80CMPL	95% COAL, 5% SHALE CIRCULATE WITH 1800 CFM AIR TO DRY UP HOLE
	23:00 - 23:30	0.50		4	80CMPL	POOH TO 7" CASING SHOE AT 3354'
	23:30 - 01:30	2.00	1 -	1	80CMPL	FLOW WELL TO PTI THROUGH BLOOIE LINES TWO HRS
	01:30 - 02:00	0.50	l	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM SHOE, TAG FILL AT 3660'
	02:00 - 06:00	4.00	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3660' - T/3755' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = MED COAL & FINES. 2 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
05/03/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	95% COAL, 5% SHALE, WELL BORE APPEARS TO BE STABLE R&R C/O AT 3755' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER, INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO SURFACE = LIGHT COAL & FINES.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CM		OOCA4D!	DOWN TO 1/2 - 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL, 5% SHALE
	07:30 - 07:30	0.50 2.50	ı	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONNEL R&R C/O AT 3755' W/1800CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER,
	07.00 - 10.00	2.50	Civi	<u> </u>	OUCIVIFL	MAIN OF AT 3755 W/TOUGEN AIR, TO BET MIST W/TGAL FOAMER,

Printed: 05/14/2003 1:22:15 PM

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

Spud Date: 03/03/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

04/14/2003 Start:

End: 05/05/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 29

Group:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
05/03/2003	07:30 - 10:00	2.50	СМ	1		INHIBITOR & 1/2 GAL POLYMER/ 10 BBLS. RETURNS TO = LIGHT COAL & FINES. 1/2 OR LESS BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHE

O SURFACE ER 10:00 - 11:30 1.50 CM 80CMPL POOH WITH BIT 80CMPL 11:30 - 12:00 0.50 CS CHANGE OUT PIPE RAMS FOR CASING RAMS 12:00 - 13:00 1.00 CS 80CMPL PICK UP 10 JOINTS OF 5-1/2", 15.5#, J-55, LT&C CASING AND LINER 1 HANGER RIH WITH LINER AND DRILL PIPE 13:00 - 15:00 2.00 CS 80CMPL 15:00 - 15:30 0.50 CS 80CMPL SET LINER HANGER AS FOLLOWS: SETTING SLEEVE = 3298.61' - 3299.61' LINER HANGER = 3299.61' - 3303.41' 10 JTS CSG = 3303.41' - 3754.05' BIT SUT W/FLOAT = 3754.05' - 3755.40' 6-1/4" BIT = 3755.40' - 3756.00' 3.00 CM 80CMPL 15:30 - 18:30 TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE, LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE AND DRILL COLLARS 18:30 - 19:00 0.50 CM 80CMPL SECURE WELL, SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 CM 05/04/2003 80CMPL HOLD SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONNEL С 07:30 - 08:00 0.50 CM 1 80CMPL SHUT IN CASING PRESSURE = 930 PSI **BLOW WELL DOWN TO PIT** 08:00 - 11:00 3.00 CM 80CMPL RIG UP BLUE JET WIRE LINE q PERFORATE FRUITLAND COAL INTERVAL AS FOLLOWS: 3-1/8" HOLLOW CARRIER GUNS, 4 JSPF 3378' - 3380' - 2' - 8 HOLES 3414' - 3416' - 2' - 8 HOLES 3418' - 3422' - 4' - 16 HOLES 3438' - 3446' - 8' - 32 HOLES 3450' - 3452' - 2' - 8 HOLES 3454' - 3456' - 2' - 8 HOLES 3458' - 3460' - 2' - 8 HOLES 3462' - 3464' - 2' - 8 HOLES 3466' - 3468' - 2' - 8 HOLES 3477' - 3481' - 4' - 16 HOLES 3482' - 3486' - 4' - 16 HOLES 3561' - 3565' - 4' - 16 HOLES

3600' - 3604' - 4' - 16 HOLES 3632' - 3636' - 4' - 16 HOLES 3638' - 3642' - 4' - 16 HOLES 3697' - 3703' - 6' - 24 HOLES TOTAL OFF 56' AND 224 HOLES 2.50 CM 80CMPL 11:00 - 13:30 2 PICK UP 2-3/8", 4.7#, J-55, EUE 8RD TUBING RIH AND LAND TUBING AS FOLLOWS: 12.00 @ KB = 118 JTS TBG = 3687.04' @ 3699.04' 1.78" ID F-NIPPLE = 0.80' @ 3699.84' 2-3/8" PERF SUB = 6.10' @ 3705.94' 29.85' @ 3735.79' 2-3/8" ORANGE PEEL = 13:30 - 15:00 1.50 CM 80CMPL NIPPLE DOWN BOP, NIPPLE UP WELL HEAD le 15:00 - 17:00 2.00 CM 80CMPL RUN RODS AND PUMP AS FOLLOWS:

1 = POLISH ROD 1 = 3/4" STD PONY ROD 147 = 3/4" STD SUCKER ROD

Page 10 of 10

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2 000002A

Common Well Name:

From - To

15:00 - 17:00

17:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 19:00

07:00 - 07:30

07:30 - 15:00

SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 # 2A FRUITLAND

Code Subco Phase

С

80CMPL

80CMPL

80CMPL

80CMPL

80CMPL

1/2003 End:

Spud Date: 03/03/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start: 04/14/2003

05/05/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 05/05/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

Date

05/04/2003

05/05/2003

KEY ENERGY

2.00 CM

1.00 CM

1.00 CM

0.50 CM

7.50 MV

Hours

Rig Number: 29

1 = INSERT PUMP = 2" X 1-1/4" X 8' X 8'3" X 12'3" RHAC-Z 83" STROKE, HEXPLUG T.V., VERTICAL

DISCHARGE

GUIDE, 4-PIECE INSERT GUIDED CAGES,

6" STRAINER NIPPLE

Description of Operations

LOAD TUBING WITH 15 BBLS PRODUCED WATER PRESSURE TEST PUMP TO 500 PSI - TEST GOOD

STROKE PUMP - PRESSURE UP TO 500 PSI - TEST GOOD

SECURE WELL, SHUT IN FOR THE NIGHT

HOLD SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONNEL

RIG DOWN SERVICE UNIT AND RELATED EQUIPMENT

PLAN TO MOVE TO THE SAN JUAN 32-7 #208A ON 05/50/2003

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC



Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 23 #2A API #: 30-045-31314		3-Mar-03 0100 hrs	TD Date : 5-Mar-03 Rig Release Date: 6-Mar-03					
Surface Casing Date set: 3-Mar-03 Size 9 5/8 in Set at 216 ft # Jnts: 5 Wt. 32.3 ppf Grade H-40 Hole Size 12 1/4 in Wash Out 100 % Est. T.O.C. SURFACE ft Csg S TD of suit Notified BLM @ 0010 hrs on 3/3/2003 hrs on 3/3/2003 hrs	11" 3M x 7 1 9-5/8" 8 RD 2 X New Used	1/16" Tree Adap /16" 5M Tubing I x 11" 3M Casing	Head					
Set at 3369 ft 2 Wt. 20 ppf Grade J-55 Hole Size 8 3/4 in Wash Out 150 % Csg s	X New Used Dups		Intermediate Cement Date cmt'd: 6-Mar-03 Lead: 385 sx Class B Cmt w/3% Econolite, 10 pps Gilsonite & 1/2 pps Flocele @ 11.4 ppg & 2.90 cu/ft/sx. Tail: 95 sx 50/50/B/Poz Cmt w/2% Gel, 2% CaCl2, 5 pps Gilsonite & 1/4 pps Flocele @ 13.5 ppg & 1.33 cuft/sx Displacement vol. & fluid.: SEE BELOW Bumped Plug at: 1200 HRS Pressure Plug bumped: 2000 PSI Returns during job: YES CMT Returns to surface: 21 BBLS. Floats Held: X Yes No					
	TD	3,756ft						
COMMENTS: Surface: NO FLOAT EQUIPMENT RAN. W	ELL SHUT-IN WITH 85 PS	l						
Production: LEFT APPROXIMATELY 25' CEM 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB & FLOAT RU	DISPLACEMENT: 20 BBLS. FRESH WATER & 114.7 BBLS. SLIGHTLY POLYMERIZED DRILL WATER (8.4 PPG). LEFT APPROXIMATELY 25' CEMENT ON TOP OF WIPER PLUG (PB: 3300'). 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB & FLOAT RUN ON BOTTOM JOINT OF LINER TOP OF LINER @ 3300', 69' OF 7" CASING OVERLAP							
CENTRALIZERS: Surface: 206' OVER STOP RING, 137', 97'	& 55' OVER CASING COL	LARS.						
Intermediate: CENTRALIZERS @ 3359', 3284',	3243', 3161', 3079', 3038' 8	200'. TURBOLI	Total: 4 ZERS @ 2180', 2140' & 2098' Total: 10					