Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM	APPROVED
OMB	NO. 1004-0137
xpires: ì	NO. 1004-0137 November 30, 2000

,	WEL	L C	OMPI	LET	ION (OR RI	ECOMPL	ETIO	N REPO	RT	AND L	OG		EIVE			e Serial N 079381			
la. Type	of Well of Completi				Gas W ew Well		Dry Work Over	Other	epen 🛘	Płu	ig Back		Diff.	Resvr.M			dian, Allo	ttee or	Tribe Na	me
			0	ther .												7. Unit	or CA Ag	greeme	nt Name	and no.
	of Operator		PS CC)							U/t) la	amı	ngton	, N	8. Leas	e Name a	nd We	ll No.	
3. Addre				<u></u>					3.a I	Phone	No. (Inc	lude	area/	ode)	٦	<u>SAN J</u>	<u>UAN 32</u>			19A
		97 V	VL3 40	061	HOUS	TON	TX 7725	2	((832)486-23						Well No. 5-31653			
4. Locati	ion of Well	(Repo	ort locai	tion o	clearly a	nd in a	ccordance 1	with Fede	eral require	emeni	ts)* SE	ر در	200 3						ploratory	
At Su	rface NEN	W	660' F	NL	& 173	5' FW	L		1		f ^{ee} .		.vu j	م کفرینا کفرینا	34				ID COA	
At top	prod. inter	val re	ported b	elow	,				ر ماریک ماریک		و يا د د		ે ગા ઉ	1. N G	<i>1</i>	Surv	T., R., M	^a C 3	5 32N 8	
At tot	al depth									Y.	→,					2. Cou SAN J	nty or Par. UAN	ish	13. State	e MEXIC(
14. Date 3	Spudded			15.	Date T.I). Reac	hed		16. Da	te Co	ompleted	5 E	نور ا					OF, RK	B, RT, G	
07/01	/2003				07/04/	2003				D (& A ~\ x 2003	E&R	eady to	Prod.		6726 (GL			
18. Total	Depth: M					19. P	lug Back T.	D.: MD	3633		<u> </u>	20.	Depti	n Bridge	Plug Se		(D			
21 Tyme .		D 36		anic	al Logs	Pun (S	ıbmit copy		D 3633			22	Was		10 127		VD Yes (
NONE		c Oui	el Micci	ianic	ai Logs	Kun (S	юши сору	or cacir)			į	22.	Was	well core DST run? tional Su	X	No [Yes (S	Submit	t analysis) analysis) omit copy	
23. Casin	g and Liner	Reco	rd(<i>Repo</i>	ort al	l strings	set in 1	vell)							_						<u></u>
Hole Size	Size/Grad	ie	Wt. (#/	ft.)	Тор (MD)	Bottom (1	MD) S	tage Cemer Depth	nter	No. of Type of	Sks. f Cen	& nent	Slurry (BB		Ceme	ent Top*		Amount F	Pulled
12.25	9.625 H	40 3	32.3		0		221				135			``		0		1		
8.75	7 J55		20	\rightarrow	0	-	3315				520					0				
6.25	5.5 J55		15.5	I	<u>0 32</u>	29	3635				0			-		NA				
		-		-	. <u> </u>													 		
24. Tubin	g Record Depth	Set (MD) I	Dooks	r Depth	(MD)	Size		epth Set (N	4D)	Packer D	anth	(MD)	T 6	ize	T Dec	pth Set (M	(ID)	Dank - D	1 (1.55)
2.375	3579	361 (1	(VID) I	acke	а рерш	(MD)	3126		epin sei (iv	(10)	Packer D	epui	(MD)		ize	De	pui sei (iv	ן (עוו	Packer De	epth (MD)
25. Produc	ing Interval	s							26. Perfor	ation	Record			L	-					
	Formation				Тор		Bottom		Perfora	ted I	nterval			Size		Holes		Peri	Status	
	N FRUIT	LAN	ID .	333	32		3633	B	ASIN FI	KUI	ILANL	·	.75		228		OPEN			·
B) C)																				
D)																				
	Fracture, Tre Depth Inter		nt, Cem	ent S	Sqeeze, I	Etc.				Λ.	nount and	1 T	a of N	fatarial						
3332 -				C	AVITA	TED							JC OI IV					······		
							····													
								·										·		
	ction - Inter	val A																		
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested		est roduc	tion Oil BE	L	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Cor	Gravi T. AP	ty [Ga	s avity	Pro	duction	Method				
	07/23/03		-		<u>0</u>		2250	0							OWI	NG				
Choice Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press	s. 24 R	4 Hr. ate	Oil BB	L	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas Rat	s : Oil io		We	ell Stan	ıs					-	
	si 0	750		\equiv								PI	ROD	UCING	1	ACCE	PTED F	OR I	RECOR	D_
Produ Date First	ction - Inter	val B Hours		est	Oil		Gas	Water	l Oa	Grani	tv	C-		Īn.	1					+
Produced	Date	Teste	d P	roduc	tion BE	L	Gas MCF	BBL	Cor	Gravi r. AP	Ĭ	Ga	avity	Pro	uucuon	MERIOR	FP 2	3 20	03	
Choke	Tbg. Press	Cea		1 He	Oil		Gas	Water	Gen	: Oil		117.	ell Stati			FARM	ing tun			T
Size	Flwg. SI	Csg. Press	s. R	4 Hr. ate	BE	L	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Ra	itio		"	un otati	10		BY	dy			
(See Instruc	tions and spa	ces for	r additior	nal do	ita on rev	erse side	?)		N.	M	CD	_L								

		1.6								
28b. Produc			17	0:1	Con	Water	Oil Consider	T Con	Production Method	•
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas : Oil Ratio	Well Status		
28c. Produc		val D	- 					··		
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas : Oil Ratio	Well Status		
29. Dispo		as (Sold, u	sed for fuel,	vented, etc	.)	1		J		
30. Summ	ary of Poro	us Zones (Include Aqu	ifers):	,			31. Format	ion (Log) Markers	
Show tests, i	all importa	nt zones or	porsity and	contents the			nd all drill-stem and shut-in pressures			
		_	-							Тор
Forma	tion	Тор	Bottom		Descri	ptions, Conte	ents, etc.		Name	Meas. Depth
		ļ						NACIAM	ENTO	1099
	-							OJO ALA	MO	2394
	}							KIRTLAN	D	2459
								FRUITLA	ND	3239
								PICTURE		3659
								TICTORE	CLITTS	3039
	ŀ	[1						
										<u> </u>
				1				İ		
		,								
										
			plugging pro		Fruitland	Coal. At	tached is a curren	t wellbore s	chematic and daily summ	maries.
33. Circle	enclosed att	achments:								
			gs (1 full set ng and ceme	-		eological Rep ore Analysis	oort 3. DST Rep 7. Other	ort 4. D	rirectional Survey	
34. I hereb	y certify tha	t the foreg	oing and att	ached infor	mation is co	omplete and o	correct as determined	from all availa	ble records (see attached instr	uctions)*
Name (please frit	t) DEBO	RAH MA	RBERR	Υ .		Title <u>REGU</u>	LATORY A	NALYST	
Signatu	ire <u></u>	2lo	reh	Ma	less	<u>'</u>	Date09/1	6/2003		
Title 18 U. States and	S.C. Section	n 101 and ous or frad	Title 43 U.S ulent statem	.C. Section ents or repr	1212, make	it a crime fo	or any person knowing tter within its jurisdic	gly and willful	ly to make to any department of	or agency of the United
			·							

L

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Start:

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

07/15/2003

End:

08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 08/08/2003 Rig Number: 18

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Lié	J L	NUII	ibei	.	10

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/16/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	MV	С	70DMOB	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 09:00	1.50		1	70DMOB	LOADING OUT EQUIPMENT ON FLOAT'S
	09:00 - 14:00	5.00		t	00MMIR	MOVING RIG & EQUIPMENT TO LOCATION
:	14:00 - 19:00	5.00		6	00MMIR	MIRU KEY FOUR CORNER'S RIG # 18 & EQUIPMENT = S.D.O.N.
:07/17/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50		c	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
01/11/2003	07:30 - 10:00	2.50		6	50PRDR	RU GROUND LINE'S
	10:00 - 12:00	2.00	i	e	50PRDR	NU BOP'S & HCR VALVE'S
	12:00 - 14:00	2.00	1	6	50PRDR	CHOKE MANIFOLD & BLOOIE LINE'S
† •	14:00 - 15:30	1.50	1	1	50PRDR	RIG & EQUIPMENT INSPECTION BY CONOCOPHILLIPS REP. DAVID
•	14.00 - 15.30	1.50	CIVI	•	SUFRDR	GREEN
	15:30 - 16:15	0.75	СМ	9	50PRDR	TEST 7" CSG & BLIND RAM'S = 200# 3 MIN'S & 650# 30 MIN'S FOR STATE INTEGRITY TEST = CHARTED GOOD TEST
	16:15 - 18:00	1.75	СМ	8	50PRDR	TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR VALVE'S & CHOKE
						MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = CHARTED GOOD TEST
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	СМ	2	50PRDR	PU PIPE OUT OF PIPE BASKET & PUT ON PIPE RACK'S = TALLY
07/40/0000		0.50	٥		50555	PIPE = SECURED LOCATION & S.D.O.N.
07/18/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50		C	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 10:30	3.00	1	7	50PRDR	WELDING ON RIG FLOOR & STAIR'S
	10:30 - 13:30	3.00	CM	2	50PRDR	GIH PU RE-RUN 6 1/4" ETD 517 # 251184 BIT, BIT SUB, 14-3 1/2"
1						DC'S, 1-2 7/8" DP, 1-FN 1.81 PROFILE & 2 7/8" DP TAG CMT @ 3250'
1	13:30 - 13:45	l .	CM	6	50PRDR	PU POWER SWIVEL
	13:45 - 15:00	1.25	СМ	h	50PRDR	DRILL OUT CMT, 7" FLOAT COLLAR @ 3271', CMT & 7" SHOE @
					ļ	3315', C/O TO INTERMEDIATE TD @ 3319' W / AIR ASSIST =
			l			CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGER
	15:00 - 19:00	4.00	СМ	1	50PRDR	DRILL BASIN FRUITLAND COAL INTERVAL F/3319-T/3460'
					1	W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 15 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 6000# ON BIT,
						75 RPM'S
•	19:00 - 19:30	1	СМ	C	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 01:30	6.00	СМ	1	50PRDR	DRILL COAL INTERVAL F/3460' - T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 15
						BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR, 6000# ON BIT & 75
	01:30 - 02:00	0.50	CM	5	80CMPL	RPM'S
•	01.30 - 02.00	0.50	CIVI	3	OUCIVIPL	CIRC & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGER = NET COAL INTERVAL'S AS FOLLOW'S
						f control of the cont
						3338'-42' = 4 FT = 380 GAS UNIT'S
1				İ		3345'-49' = 4 FT = 580 GAS UNIT'S
						3352'-56' = 4 FT = 580 GAS UNIT'S
					ŀ	3383'-86' = 3 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
						3389'-91' = 2 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
						3439'-40' = 1 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
						3444'-45' = 1 FT = 550 GAS UNIT'S
						3449'-56' = 7 FT = 727 GAS UNIT'S
						3458'-65' = 7 FT = 650 GAS UNIT'S
						3488'-91' = 3 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
						3512'-14' = 2 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
						3519'-20' = 1 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
				1		3592'-94' = 2 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
		-	1	1		3606'-07' = 1 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
						3610'-12' = 2 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
					1	3613'-15' = 2 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
					ļ	3626'-27' = 1 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
						3629'-33' = 4 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
	ļ					TOTAL NET COAL 51 FT
		Į.]	1	1	

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

07/15/2003

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

Contractor Name:

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

End: 08/08/2003

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Group:

Rig Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Number: 18

rig name.			ENGI			rig number. 10
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/18/2003	02:00 - 06:00	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
07/19/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 2 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
ļ	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO TEST WELL
	08:00 - 09:00	1.00	CM	u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE
						15 MIN'S = 1200 MCFD
					·	30 MIN'S = 1300 MCFD
						45 MIN'S = 1350 MCFD
:						1 HR = 1400 MCFD
· :	09:00 - 10:00	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPL	SHUT IN TEST
:						ISIP = 50# 15 MINS' = 280#
				1		30 MIN'S = 370#
! !						45 MIN'S = 465#
						1 HR = 540#
	10:00 - 16:00	6.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 1 - # 2 - # 3 - # 4 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = BREAKOVER @ 1075# = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT
ı		1				TO MED COAL & FINE'S
:	16:00 - 16:30		СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3490'
	16:30 - 19:00	2.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3499' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER
		=				& INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	J	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3653' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER
07/20/2002	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
07/20/2003	06.00 - 07.00	1.00	CIVI		OUCWIFE	R&R C/O T/3653' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 DOWN'TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
i	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
i	07:30 - 08:00		CM	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG & RU TO SURGE WELL
	08:00 - 15:00	1	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 5 - # 6 - # 7 - # 8 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD
			ļ	1		AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER
			}			PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
	15:00 - 15:30	1	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3460'
:	15:30 - 19:00	3.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3500' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	1	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3653' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER
:						& INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER
i						

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

07/15/2003 Rig Release: 08/08/2003 End: 08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS Y

Rig Number: 18

Group:

Rig Name:	KEY	ENERG
,		

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/20/2003 07/21/2003	19:30 - 06:00 06:00 - 07:00	10.50 1.00		1	80CMPL 80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE R&R C/O T/3653' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
!	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	l	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG & RU TO SURGE WELL
	08:00 - 14:00	6.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 9 - # 10 - # 11 - # 12 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
) (14:00 - 14:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3450'
	14:30 - 19:00	4.50	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3530' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3637' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER
						& INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
07/22/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3637' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 3 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
i	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL
i	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	BOP & FIRE DRILL
:	08:30 - 15:00	6.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 13 - # 14 - # 15 - # 16 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
	15:00 - 15:30 15:30 - 19:00	1	CM CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3450' R&R C/O T/3479' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
:	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50		1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/ 3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
07/23/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 11:00	3.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
1	11:00 - 11:30 11:30 - 12:30	1	CM CM	4 u	80CMPL 80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO TEST WELL 2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE 15 MIN'S-2150 MCFD
4	. 1	.l	l	L	1	

Operations Summary Report

Start:

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

07/15/2003

End: 08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

Group:

KEY ENERGY Rig Name:

Rig Name:	į	KEY EN	ERGY			Rig Number: 18
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/23/2003	11:30 - 12:30	1.00	СМ	u	80CMPL	30 MIN'S- 2200 MCFD 45 MIN'S- 2250 MCFD 細胞保養2250 MCFD
:	12:30 - 13:30	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPL	SHUT IN TEST ISIP - 65# 15 MIN'S - 280#
						30 MIN'S - 350# 45 MIN'S - 440#
:	13:30 - 19:00	5.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 17 - # 18 - # 19 - # 20 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO
r r	10:00 10:20	0.50	CNA		80CMPL	MED COAL & FINE'S SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 20:00	0.50	1	C 4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3450'
; ;	20:00 - 06:00	10.00		1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3519' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 8 BUCKET'S PER
07/24/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE R&R C/O T/3519' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 8 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CM	С	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50		1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3582' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50		C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S
07/25/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE R&R C/O T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 3 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:00	;	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL
	08:00 - 16:00	8.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 21 - # 22 - # 23 - # 24 - # 25 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
	16:00 - 16:30	1	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3430'
	16:30 - 19:00	2.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3440' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30		СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3483' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 14 DOWN TO 8 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Event Name:

07/15/2003

End:

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

Original Completion

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Group:

Di~	Nama:
NIG	Name:

KEY ENERGY

rig	INU	HIL	ei.	10

Rig Name:		VET EIN	ERGI			rig number. To
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/26/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3483' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 8 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	ŧ	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3575' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 03:00	0.50 7.50	1	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
	19.30 - 03.00	7.50	Civi		OCCIVIF E	FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	03:00 - 03:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH = HOLE GETTING TIGHT = WORKING BHA UP HOLE TO 3555'
	03:30 - 06:00	2.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3575' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 15 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
07/27/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3575' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 12 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	CM CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S PER
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER LOUB OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 200% COAL & 400% SUM F
07/28/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE R&R C/O T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 09:30		CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER
	09:30 - 10:00 10:00 - 17:30	1	CM CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL SURGE'S # 26 - # 27 - # 28 - # 29 - # 30 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
	17:30 - 18:00 18:00 - 19:00	ľ	CM CM	4	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3430' R&R C/O T/3455' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

07:00 - 07:30

07:30 - 19:00

19:00 - 19:30

19:30 - 06:00

06:00 - 07:00

07:00 - 07:30

07:30 - 16:30

16:30 - 17:00

17:00 - 19:00

19:00 - 19:30

07/31/2003

0.50 CM

11.50 CM

0.50 CM

10.50 CM

1.00 CM

0.50 CM

9.00 CM

0.50 CM

2.00 CM

0.50 CM

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

07/15/2003

End: 08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

Group:

Rig Name:		KEY EN	ERGY			Rig Number: 18
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/28/2003	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50	Į.	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3485' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 13 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S
07/29/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE R&R C/O T/3485' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 UP TO 10 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
: ! :	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	l	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3485' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50	l	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3515' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
07/30/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3515' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / T.S.T.M. WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE

SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / T.S.T.M. WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE

80CMPL

SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / T.S.T.M. WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH

MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1/2 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE

SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST. 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 UP TO12 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10%

SHALE PUH T/3585', WELL SLOUGHING HEAVY COAL & FINE'S R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3585' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 12 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

07/15/2003

Spud Date: 07/01/2003 End: 08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Trig Mairie.						rag ramber. 10
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/31/2003	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
08/01/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	1	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION FOR LINER T/3636' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50	1	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 8 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
08/02/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:30	L	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3684' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
· : :	08:30 - 09:00 09:00 - 11:00		CM CM	4 9	80CMPL 80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA FLOW WELL NATURAL OUT BLOOIE LINE'S TO CHECK HOLE CONDITION'S
	11:00 - 11:30 11:30 - 19:00		CM CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG TAG TIGHT SPOT @ 3450' R&R C/O T/3585' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER =
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 03:00	1	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	90% COAL & 10% SHALE = TIGHT SPOT'S @ 3450' & 3515' SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	03:00 - 03:30 03:30 - 03:45 03:45 - 06:00	0.25	CM CM	4 6 4	80CMPL 80CMPL 80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA = BIT IN BAD SHAPE, OUT OF GAGE &
08/03/2003	06:00 - 07:00		CM	7	80CMPL	CONE'S LOOSE WAITING ON NEW BIT & BIT SUB
	1	1	1	l .	1	

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

07/15/2003

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

End:

08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

Group:

KEY ENERGY Rig Name:

Ny Name.			LINGT			rag radinosi. 10
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/03/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 09:30	2.00		7	80CMPL	WAITING ON NEW BIT & BIT SUB
1	09:30 - 10:00	0.50		2	80CMPL	PU & MU BIT & BIT SUB ON DC
Ì	10:00 - 11:30	1.50		4	80CMPL	RIH W / 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB, DC'S, FN & DP TO 3315'
				6		
	11:30 - 11:45	0.25			80CMPL	PU POWER SWIVEL
	11:45 - 12:00	0.25		2	80CMPL	PU JT'S OF DP W / POWER SWIVEL TAG TIGHT SPOT @ 3450'
	12:00 - 19:00	7.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3485' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
						FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO
		1				SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN =
•					i	12 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER =
						90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50		С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
		1				FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO
		1				SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 7
		1			ļ	BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10%
		1				SHALE
08/04/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH
:						MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
1		1				RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / NO WATER GAIN
		1	1			= 7 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL &
						10% SHALE
;	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
:	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	i .	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12
	07.50 - 15.00	11.50	Civi	['	COOM E	BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
		ļ				RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / NO WATER GAIN
					}	= 5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL &
		l				10% SHAL
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	CM		80CMPL	
	1	1		C 1		SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 21:30	2.00	CIVI	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
						FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO
		1			,	SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 BUCKETS
						PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE =
						ATTENTION NOTICED BAD SPOT IN DRILLING LINE
	21:30 - 22:00	0.50		4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA
!	22:00 - 06:00	8.00	СМ	7	80CMPL	FLOW WELL NATURAL OUT BLOOIE LINES = WAITING TILL
						DAYLIGHT & NEW DRILLING LINE FOR RIG
08/05/2003	06:00 - 07:00		CM	7	80CMPL	W/O NEW DRILLING LINE
1	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CM	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
!	07:30 - 09:00	1.50	CM	7	80CMPL	W/O NEW DRILLING LINE
	09:00 - 11:30	2.50	СМ	6	80CMPL	INSTALL NEW DRILLING LINE
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG @ 3450'
	12:00 - 19:00	7.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3530' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH
•		\	1	1		MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO
		1				WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
			İ			SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	CM	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 23:00	3.50		1	80CMPL	
	15.30 - 23.00	3.50	CIVI	'	OUCIVIPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3605' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH
						MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
	}	1	}			RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER
			ĺ			GAIN = 10 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90%
						COAL & 10% SHALE = WELL SLOUGHING HEAVY COAL GETTING
	1	1				i de la companya de la companya de la companya de la companya de la companya de la companya de la companya de

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

07/15/2003

Spud Date: 07/01/2003 End:

08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/05/2003	19:30 - 23:00		СМ	1	80CMPL	тіднт
	23:00 - 03:00	4.00	1	4	80CMPL	PUH WORKING TIGHT PIPE TO 3450'
İ	03:00 - 06:00	3.00	CIVI	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE F/3468'-T/3499' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
					RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / T.S.T.M.	
					WATER GAIN = 15 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER	
				1		= 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
08/06/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3499' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH
1		ł	1			MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / T.S.T.M
						WATER GAIN = 12 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
i						= 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3561' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH
				1		MIST, 3 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 1/2 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / T.S.T.M. WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 7 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
	·					SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3621' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH
:						MIST, 3 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 1/2 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
Ì						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W /
						T.S.T.M. WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
08/07/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3621' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH
1	00.00	1.00	O.V.	1	OOOWN E	MIST, 3 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 1/2 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
4						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1/2 BPH WATER
						GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85%
			l			COAL & 15% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 13:00		CM CM	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07.30 - 13.00	3.50	CIVI	1	OUCIVIPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 4 GAL'S FOAMER, 2 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
•			1	1		RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 1/2
						BPH WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
1						SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
1	13:00 - 13:30		CM	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA
	13:30 - 15:00	1.50	СМ	9	80CMPL	FLOW WELL NATURAL OUT BLOOIE LINE'S TO CHECK HOLE
	15:00 - 19:00	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	CONDITION'S R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE F/3480'-99' & F/3520'-30' W / 1.5
	10.00		0]	0001111	MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 4 GAL'S FOAMER, 2 GAL'S POLYMER &
						INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W /
						1/2 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE
						CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
1	19:00 - 19:30	1	CM CM	C 1	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
*	19:30 - 01:30	0.00	CIVI	'	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3684' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 4 GAL'S FOAMER, 2 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR =
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 1/2 BPH
	1		1		}	WATER GAIN = 3 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
						SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
	01:30 - 01:45	1	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH T/3450' W / BHA
	01:45 - 03:15	1	CM	1	80CMPL	WORKING TIGHT SPOT'S F/3480'-99' & 3520'-30'
	03:15 - 03:30 03:30 - 04:00		CM CM	6	80CMPL 80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL & RU TO COOH
	00.00 - 04.00	0.50	CIVI		OUCIVIEL.	TIANG BACK FOWER SWIVEL & RU TO COOM
	<u>_L</u>	1	l	L:	J	

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

07/15/2003

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

End: 08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Group:

Rig Name:	
-----------	--

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/07/2003	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	СМ	4	80CMPL	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA
08/08/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	6	80CMPL	RU 5 1/2" EQUIPMENT
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 07:45	0.25	СМ	8	80CMPL	TEST 5 1/2" RAM'S TO WELLBORE PRESSURE 510# = GOOD TEST
	07:45 - 08:00	0.25	СМ	u	80CMPL	SHUT IN CSG PRESSURE 510# = LAST FLOW GAGE ON PITOT TUBE = 3000 MCFD W / LIGHT MIST
:	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	СМ	2	80CMPL	PU & MU T.I.W. 7" X 5 1/2" JGS MECH HANGER W/ STEEL SLEEVE ON JT OF DP
:	08:30 - 09:30	1.00	СМ	2	80CMPL	PU & MU 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB, 11 JT'S OF 5 1/2" J-55 15.50# ST&L FLUSH JT CSG W / T.I.W. HANGER ST&L THREAD'S
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH SLOWLY W / BHA & DP T/3315'
1	10:30 - 10:45	l .	СМ	6	80CMPL	PU POWER SWIVEL
	10:45 - 13:30	l .	СМ	1	80CMPL	WORKING LINER DOWNHOLE T/3635' = ATTENTION HOLE CLEAN BUT TIGHT SPOT'S @ 3475'-99' & 3515'-25' = SHALE SLIDE INTO LINER UNABLE TO PULL UP OR ROTATE BUT WORKED LINER DOWNHOLE F/3525' TO BOTTLE NECK OF RAT HOLE @ 3635'
!	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	RELEASED OFF HANGER & SET TOP HOLD DOWN SLIP'S LINER SET AS FOLLOW'S 6 1/4" BIT SET @ 3635' PBTD @ BIT SUB @ 3633'
		1				BOTTOM OF HANGER SET @ 3233'
						TOP OF HANGER SET @ 3228'.96"
						OVERLAP OF 7" CSG SHOE 86'
:						LINER & HANGER = ST&L FLUSH JT THREAD'S
	14:00 - 14:15		СМ	6	80CMPL	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
	14:15 - 16:30		СМ	2	80CMPL	COOH LAYING DOWN DP, DC'S & SETTING TOOL
	16:30 - 16:45		СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	16:45 - 17:00	0.25	CM	6	80CMPL	RU BLUE JET PERFORATING EQUIPMENT
	17:00 - 17:15	0.25	СМ	8	80CMPL	TEST LUBICATOR TO 510# WELLBORE PRESSURE = GOOD TEST
i	17:15 - 18:45		СМ	q	80CMPL	BLUE JET PERFORATED 5 1/2" LINER W / 3 1/8" CSG GUN'S 075" DIA HOLE'S, 4 SPF, 90 DEGREE PHASING AS FOLLOW'S
					ļ	3332 34 = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
						3338'-42' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S
						3346'-50' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S
						3354'-56' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
		1				3384'-86' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
		İ		1		3390'-92' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
		1			I	3443'-46' = 3 FT = 12 HOLE'S
						3450'-54' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S
			Ì			
		ŀ	ļ			3456'-62' = 6 FT = 24 HOLE'S
						3464'-67' = 3 FT = 12 HOLE'S
						3488'-90' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
						3512'-15' = 3 FT = 12 HOLE'S
						3518'-20' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
						3591'-94' = 3 FT = 12 HOLE'S
				1		3606'-08' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
					1	3610'-16' = 6 FT = 24 HOLE'S
			,		1	3625'-28' = 3 FT ≈ 12 HOLE'S
					1	3629 33' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S
						TOTAL 57 FT & 228 HOLE'S
	18:45 - 19:15	0.50	СМ	6	80CMPL	RD BLUE JET PERFORATING EQUIPMENT

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000219A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #219A UNIT

Spud Date: 07/01/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

07/15/2003

End:

08/08/2003

Contractor Name:

Rig Release: 08/08/2003

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/08/2003 08/09/2003	19:15 - 19:30 07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:30		CM CM	1 c 6	80CMPL 80CMPL 80CMPL	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N. SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION RU 2 7/8" RAM'S & EQUIPMENT
	08:30 - 09:15 09:15 - 11:30 11:30 - 11:45	0.75 2.25 0.25	СМ	8 2 1	80CMPL 80CMPL 80CMPL	TEST PIPE RAM'S = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST PU & MU BHA = GIH PU 2 7/8" EUE 8RD TUBING OFF PIPE RACK LAND TUBING HANGER W / 2 7/8" EUE 8RD TUBING SET AS
						FOLLOW'S 2 7/8" EXP CHECK SET @ 3612'.40" 2 7/8" BOTTOM JT TUBING SET @ 3611'.60" 2 7/8" 2.250" FN SET @ 3579'.98" 2 7/8" 113 JT S TUBING SET @ 3578'.98" TO TUBING HANGER @ SURFACE
	11:45 - 13:30	1.75	СМ	е	80CMPL	TOTAL JT'S IN WELL = 114 JT'S 2 7/8" EUE 8RD J-55 6.5# TUBING ND BOP'S & NU WELLHEAD = TEST WELLHEAD SEAL TO 3000# = GOOD TEST
	13:30 - 14:30	1.00	СМ	5	80CMPL	PUMP-OFF EXP CHECK & FLOW BACK WELL NATURAL TO PURGE
	14:30 - 17:00	2.50	MV	6	70DMOB	AIR OUT OF TUBING & WELLBORE RD & RELEASED RIG & EQUIPMENT ON 08/08/2003 @ 17:00 PM = SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N. = RELEASED WELL TO PRODUCTION DEPT.
	; 					
			•			
		ļ	Į.	1	1	

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC ConocoPhillips 1-Jul-03 Well Name: San Juan 32-8 # 219A API#: 30-045-31653 TD 8-3/4" Hole: 4-Jul-03 Release Drl Rig: 5-Jul-03 Trash Cap 7-1/16" 3M x 2-9/16" 5M Adapter Flange Move in Cav. Rig 15-Jul-03 11" 3M x 7 1/16" 3M Tubing Head TD 6-1/4" Hole: 18-Jul-03 9-5/8" 8 RD x 11" 3M Casing Head Release Cav. Rig: 8-Aug-03 **SurfaceCement** XNew Date cmt'd: 2-Jul-03 Date set: 2-Jul-03 Surface Casing Lead: 135 sx Class G Cement Used Size 9 5/8 in + 2% S001 Calcium Chloride ft # Jnts: 5 + 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes Wt. Grade H-40 32.3 ppf 1.16 cuft/sx, 156.6 cuft slurry at 15.8 ppg Hole Size 12 1/4 in Wash Out 100 Displacement: 14.4 bbls fresh wtr Csg Shoe 221 ft Est. T.O.C. SURFACE Bumped Plug at: 05:47 hrs w/ 525 psi TD of 12-1/4" hole 231 ft Final Circ Press: 75 psi @ 0.5 bpm Returns during job: Notified BLM @ _ CMT Returns to surface: 14 bbls 00:15 hrs on 01-Jul-03 Floats Held: No floats used W.O.C. for 8.0 hrs (plug bump to drlg cmt) Notified NMOCD @ 00:17 on 01-Jul-03 **Intermediate Cement** Date cmt'd: 4-Jul-03 Lead: 420 sx Class G Cement Intermediate Casing Date set: X New in 80 Used + 3% D079 Extender + 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes Set at 3315 ft Wt. 20 + 0.2% D046 Antifoam ppf Grade Hole Size _ + 0.05 gal/sx D047 Antifoam 8 3/4 in Csg Shoe 3315 ft 2.61cuft/sx, 1096.2 cuft slurry at 11.7 ppg Wash Out 150 % Est. T.O.C. SURFACE TD of 8-3/4" Hole 3319 ft Tail: 100 sx 50/50 POZ: Class G cement + 2% D020 Bentonite 20:10 hrs on _ Notified BLM @ 03-Jul-03 + 2% S001 Calcium Chloride + 5 lb/sx D024 Gilsonite Notified NMOCD @ 20:10 hrs on 03-Jul-03 + 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes + 0.2% D046 Antifoam 1.27 cuft/sx, 127 cuft slurry at 13.5 ppg Date set: 7-Aug-03 X New **Production Liner** Size 5 1/2 Connections: lised Displacement: 132 bbls Fresh Wtr Blank Wt. 15.5 Bumped Plug at: 20:07 hrs w/ 1450 psi Final Circ Press: 760 psi @ 2 bpm Grade J-55 # Jnts: 11 Returns during job: CMT Returns to surface: __ Hole Size 6 1/4 Btm of Liner Floats Held: X Yes No Top of Liner 3229 PBTD / Top of Bit Sub 3633 Bottom of Liner / Bottom of 6-1/4" Bit: UNCEMENTED LINER 3684 **COMMENTS:** Surface: No float equipment was run. Ran a guide shoe and an aluminum baffle plate 1 jt above the guide shoe. Displaced top wiper plug with water. Shut in casing head and WOC before backing out landing it. Intermediate: Production: 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB & FLOAT RUN ON BOTTOM JOINT OF LINER Unable to get liner to bottom due to drag / fill. Unable to pull liner. Bottom of liner is 49 ft off bottom Perforated 5-1/2" liner. Ran 2-7/8", 6.5#, J-55 EUE 8rd, tubing (EOT at 3612' RKB) - Flowing gas well configuration. **CENTRALIZERS:**

Total:

Total:

Total:

Surface:

CENTRALIZERS @ 211', 138', 97' & 56'.

TURBOLIZERS @ 2486', 2444', 2403'

Intermediate: CENTRALIZERS @ 3305', 3230', 3147', 3065', 2981', 2898', & 202'.