

NMNM94452

U.S. Department of the Interior BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Well Name: ROARING SPRINGS 14 Well Location: T21S / R23E / SEC 14 / County or Parish/State: EDDY / FED COM

NWNE /

Well Number: 2 Type of Well: OIL WELL **Allottee or Tribe Name:**

Lease Number: NMNM80628 Unit or CA Name: ROARING SPRINGS **Unit or CA Number:**

'14' COM

US Well Number: 3001528185 Well Status: Abandoned Operator: OXY USA WTP LP

Accepted for record – NMOCD gc 6/7/2022

Subsequent Report

Sundry ID: 2674667

Type of Action: Plug and Abandonment Type of Submission: Subsequent Report

Date Sundry Submitted: 06/02/2022 Time Sundry Submitted: 01:58

Date Operation Actually Began: 04/21/2022

Actual Procedure: SEE ATTACHED FINAL WELLBORE AND PA JOB SUMMARY NOTES.

SR Attachments

Actual Procedure

FINAL_PA_SUBMISSION_PACKET_20220602135827.pdf

Page 1 of 2

eived by OCD: 6/6/2022 7:50:54 AM Well Name: ROARING SPRINGS 14

FED COM

Well Location: T21S / R23E / SEC 14 /

NWNE /

County or Parish/State: EDD 1/2

Well Number: 2

Type of Well: OIL WELL

Allottee or Tribe Name:

Lease Number: NMNM80628

Unit or CA Name: ROARING SPRINGS

'14' COM

Unit or CA Number:

NMNM94452

US Well Number: 3001528185

Well Status: Abandoned

Operator: OXY USA WTP LP

Operator

I certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. Electronic submission of Sundry Notices through this system satisfies regulations requiring a

Operator Electronic Signature: STEPHEN JANACEK Signed on: JUN 02, 2022 01:58 PM

Name: OXY USA WTP LP Title: Regulatory Engineer

Street Address: 5 Greenway Plaza, Suite 110

State: TX City: Houston

Phone: (713) 497-2417

Email address: stephen_janacek@oxy.com

Field

Representative Name:

Street Address:

City:

State:

Zip:

Phone:

Email address:

BLM Point of Contact

BLM POC Name: JAMES A AMOS BLM POC Title: Acting Assistant Field Manager

BLM POC Phone: 5752345927 BLM POC Email Address: jamos@blm.gov

Disposition: Accepted Disposition Date: 06/03/2022

Signature: James A. Amos

Page 2 of 2

OXY USA WTP LP FINAL WELLBORE DIAGRAM ROARING SPRINGS 14 FED COM #2 30-015-28185 STEPHEN JANACEK 6/2/2022

SPOT 65 SX CL C CMT 380' TO SURFACE.

CIRCULATE 700 SX CL C CMT 2195' (CASING DAMAGE HOLES) TO SURFACE. TAG @ 380'.

17-1/2" hole @ 498' 13-3/8" csg @498' w/ 500sx-TOC-Surf-Circ 12-1/4" hole @ 1990' 9-5/8" csg @ 1990' w/ 1100sx-TOC-Surf-Circ SPOT 280 SX CL C CMT 4701'- 4314' (TAG). **SPOT 70 SX CL C CMT 5460'-5062' (TAG)** TOP OF FISH 5460' (TAGGED) TUBING AND RODS LEFT IN THE HOLE. 8-3/4" hole @ 8050" 7" csg @ 8035' w/ 425sx-TOC-5216'-Calc Kickoff @ 7745' 6-1/4" OH @ 7753-10641' TMD-10641' TVD-7739'

Whipstock @ 7745-7753' Perfs @ 7804-7852'

PB-8002'

TD-8050

						OXY	USAWTPLP
					Opera	ation	Summary Report
Well		G SPRINGS 14 F	ED 2		Event Name:		NDONMENT
Proje Site:		BASIN (EDDY) G SPRINGS 14 F	EDEDAL		Prim. Reason Sec. Reason:	: PLU	G & ABANDON
SILC.	ROAKIN	0 3FKIN03 14 F	LULKAL		Dates of Even	nt: 04/2	1/2022 - Rig Name: BRIGADE 80
#	Date	Time	Hrs	Op	Op Sub	Op	Op Details
		Start-End 08:00 - 08:15	0.25	Code Tubing	Check	Туре	WELLBORE 0 PSI
		00.00 - 00.10	0.20	rubing	Pressure		TELEBONE OF ST
		08:15 - 09:15	1.00	-	Run		RIH W 42 JTS 2 7/8 PH6 TBG
		09:15 - 15:15	6.00	Safety	Incident		WHILE RUNNING IN THE HOLE, DERRICK HAND LATCHED ON TBG STAND FH WAS REMOVING THREAD PROTECTOR, WHEN 2 7/8 TBG MYT ELEVEVATOR OPEN UP CAUSING TBG STAND IMPACT FH LEFT KNEE, NOTIFIED AXIOM AND MANAGEMENT.
		15:15 - 15:45	0.50	n Overni	-		SION.
		15:45 - 18:45	3.00	ght Rig Crew	Travel Time		DROVE CREW BACK TO BRIGADE YARD.
18	05/23/2022	06:30 - 09:30	3.00		Travel Time		DROVE CREW FROM YARD TO LOCATION.
		09:30 - 10:00		Safety	Meeting/JSA		TGSM W CREW MEMBERS
		10:00 - 11:30 11:30 - 17:00	1.50 5.50		Run Pull		RIH W 118 JTS 2 7/8 PH6 TBG FROM DERRICK LD 160 JTS 2 7/8 PH6 TBG ON RACKS/ RIH W 4 JTS 4.5 WP, LD WASH
		11.30 - 17.00	5.50	rubing	Pull		PIPE / RIH 6 3.5 DC'S , LD DC'S AND AUX FISHING TOOLS
		17:00 - 20:00	3.00	Tubing	Run		RIH W 7" CIBP , FOLLOWED BY 168 JTS 2 7/8 L-80 TBG , TRIED TO SET CIBP @ 5460' COULDN¿T SET , KEPT TRYING UP TO 5200' , COULDN¿T SET CIBP.
		20:00 - 20:30	0.50	Shut-i n Overni ght	-		SECURED WELL, SION.
		20:30 - 21:30	1.00		Travel Time		DROVE CREW TO CARLSBAD.
19	05/24/2022	06:30 - 07:30	1.00	Rig Crew	Travel Time		DROVE CREW TO LOCATION.
		07:30 - 08:00	0.50	-	Meeting/JSA		TGSM W CREW MEMBERS
		08:00 - 08:08	0.14	Tubing	Check Pressure		TBG 0 PSI
		08:08 - 08:15	0.13	Casin g	Check Pressure		CSG 0 PSI
	<u> </u>	08:15 - 10:15	2.00	Tubing	Pull		STOOD BACK 164 JTS 2 7/8 L-80 TBG / 7" CIBP
		10:15 - 11:45	1.50	Tubing	Run		RIH W 168 JTS 2 7/8 L-80 TBG FROM DERRICK.
		11:45 - 13:15	1.50	Ceme nt	Spot		SPOT 70 SXS CLASS 'C' CMT , 14.8#, 1.32 YIELD, 10.5 MIX, 16.4 SLURRY, 29.1 DISP.
		13:15 - 17:15		Waitin g on	Cement		woc
		17:15 - 17:45		Tubing	Run		TBG 0 PSI / CSG 0 PSI / RIH W 20 JTS 2 7/8 TBG FROM DERRICK TO TAG TOC
		17:45 - 18:15	0.50	Shut-i n Overni ght	-		SECURED WELL/ SION DUE TO BAD WEATHER CONDITIONS.
		18:15 - 19:15	1.00	Rig Crew	Travel Time		DROVE CREW TO CARLSBAD.
21	05/25/2022	06:30 - 07:30	1.00	Rig Crew	Travel Time		DROVE CREW TO LOCATION.
_		07:30 - 07:45		Safety	Meeting/JSA Check		TGSM W CREW MEMBERS.
		07:45 - 07:53		Tubing	Check Pressure		TBG 0 PSI
		07:53 - 08:00	0.13	Casin g	Check Pressure		CSG 0 PSI.
		08:00 - 09:00	1.00	Tubing	Run		RIH W 31 JTS 2 7/8 L-80 TBG TO TAG TOC @ 5062'
		09:00 - 12:00	3.00	Ceme nt	Spot		SPOT 280 SXS CLASS 'C' CMT @ 4701' 14.8#, 1.32 YIELD, 42 MIX, 65.8 SLURRY 21.5 DISPLACEMENT TO 3724', POOH W 80 JTS 2 7/8 L-80 TBG
		12:00 - 16:00	4.00	Waitin g on	Cement		WOC
		16:00 - 17:00	1.00	Tubing	Run		RIH W 50 JTS 2 7/8 L-80 TO TAG TOC @ 4314'
		7.00	7.00				

6/2/2022 2:13:45PM

						OVV	/ HOA WITH I D		
						OXY	'USA WTP LP		
	Operation Summary Report								
Well:	Well: ROARING SPRINGS 14 FED 2 Event Name: ABANDONMENT								
Proje	ct: INDIAN B	ASIN (EDDY)			Prim. Reason	: PLU	JG & ABANDON		
Site: ROARING SPRINGS 14 FEDERAL					Sec. Reason:				
					Dates of Event: 04/2		1/2022 - Rig Name: BRIGADE 80		
#	Date	Time Start-End	Hrs	Op Code	Op Sub	Op Type	Op Details		
		17:00 - 19:00	2.00	Tubing	Pull		LD A TOTAL OF 144 JTS 2 7/8 L-80 TBG		
		19:00 - 19:30	0.50	Shut-i	-		SECURED WELL / SION.		
				n Overni					
				ght					
		19:30 - 20:30	1.00	Rig Crew	Travel Time		DROVE CREW TO CARLSBAD		
1	05/26/2022	06:30 - 07:30	1.00	Rig Crew	Travel Time	Р	Drove crew to location		
		07:30 - 08:00	0.50	Safety	Meeting/JSA	Р	TGSM w/crew. Wellbore 0psi.		
		08:00 - 09:30	1.50	Equip ment	Load/Unload	Р	RD rig work floor, TBG handling equipment, AUX safety equipment.		
		09:30 - 10:30	1.00	BOPE	Nipple Down	Р	ND 7 1/16 5K HYD BOP equipment, load on trailer		
		10:30 - 11:00	0.50	Equip ment	Load/Unload	Р	NU 7 1/16 5K P&A Flange		
		11:00 - 17:00	6.00	Ceme nt	Spot	Р	Pumped 700 sxs class 'C' CMT @ 2195', 14.8#, 1.2 yield, 105 mix, 164.5 slurry, circ from 7" to 9 5/8, sqz additional 150 sxs mix 22.5, slurry 35.2, ISIP 0psi.		
		17:00 - 17:30	0.50		-	Р	SION		
				n Overni ght					
		17:30 - 18:30	1.00	Rig Crew	Travel Time	Р	Drove crew to Carlsbad		
27	05/27/2022	06:30 - 07:30	1.00	Rig Crew	Travel Time	Р	Drove Crew to location		
		07:30 - 08:00	0.50	Safety	Meeting/JSA	Р	TGSM w/ crew. Wellbore 0psi		
		08:00 - 09:00	1.00	Tubing	Run	Р	RIH w/ 12 Jts 2 7/8 TBG, tag TOC @ 380'		
		09:00 - 10:30	1.50	Ceme nt	Spot	Р	Top off w/ 65 SXS class 'C' CMT 14.8#, 1.32 yield, 9.75 mix, 15.2 slurry.		
		10:30 - 14:30	4.00	Pulling Unit	Rig Down	Р	RD BRIGADE 80 / WASHOVER TANKS / RD CMT PUMP EQUIP / RD FLOWBACK LINES / CO.		
		14:30 - 17:30	3.00	Rig Crew	Travel Time	Р	Drove crew back to Brigade yard.		

District I
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240
Phone: (575) 393-6161 Fax: (575) 393-0720

District II 811 S. First St., Artesia, NM 88210 Phone:(575) 748-1283 Fax:(575) 748-9720

District III 1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 Phone:(505) 334-6178 Fax:(505) 334-6170

1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505 Phone:(505) 476-3470 Fax:(505) 476-3462

State of New Mexico Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources Oil Conservation Division 1220 S. St Francis Dr. **Santa Fe, NM 87505**

CONDITIONS

Action 113710

CONDITIONS

Operator:	OGRID:
OXY USA WTP LIMITED PARTNERSHIP	192463
P.O. Box 4294	Action Number:
Houston, TX 772104294	113710
	Action Type:
	[C-103] Sub. Plugging (C-103P)

CONDITIONS

Created By	Condition	Condition Date
gcordero	None	6/7/2022