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Project No. 50795A Date: 4-1-2012 Report No.: 16 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 3440 Ft. Cut: 340 Formation: Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Drilling RKB: 15 

Time Log 
From To 

Elapsed 
Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 11:00 5.0 Drill from 3100' to 3186', (86') avg rop: 17 fph 
11:00 11:30 .50 Wireline survey @3151' (.6 degree) 
11:30 06:00 18.5 Drill from 3186' to 3440', (254') avg rop: 13 fph 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 2 Wt 10.7 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 16.5 Size 12 lA Vis 30 Bit 1.5 152 .50 

SPM 80 80 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 - Bit sub 2.15 • 322 .30 

GPM 230 230 Tripping 4 Type MK316 Gels 1/2/3 Shock sub 11.93 570 .50 

Press 1100 1100 Survey Out Oil (2) 8" DC 57.37 860 .70 

Logging In 3035 Solid 1.4 12 % stab 1413 .10 

Cem/WoC Ftg 405 pH 9.3 8" DC 30.52 1607 0.2 
Misc 3.5 Hrs 31 Chi 189k 12 % stab 2021 1.5 

Fishing Bit Wt 15 (3) 8" DC 87.62 

Run Csg RPM 100 (9) 6.5 DC 273.88 

FOR RECORD ON 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-2-2012 Report No.: 17 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 

Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 3620 Ft. Cut: 180 Formation: Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Drilling RKB: 15 

Time Log 

From To 

Elapsed 
Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 08:00 2.0 Drill from 3450' to 3471', (21') avg rop: 10 fph 

08:00 08:30 .50 Wireline survey @3436', (.60) 

08:30 11:30 3.0 Drill from 3471' to 3502', (31') avg rop: 10 fph. 

11:30 12:00 .50 Service rig 

12:00 18:30 Drill from 3502' to 3576', (74') avg rop: 11 fph 

18:30 19:00 .50 Circulate bottoms up 
19:00 21:30 2.5 Pull out of hole, no excess drag. Outside cutter on bit chipped and damaged. 
21:30 24:00 2.5 Pick up new bit and trip in hole to 3576' 

24:00 06:00 6.0 Drill from 3576' to 3620', (44') avg rop: 7 fph 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 2 Wt 10.7 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 17.5 Size 12 'A Vis 30 Bit 1.5 152 .50 

SPM 80 80 Cond/Circ .5 Mfg Smith WL 100 Bit sub 2.15 322 .30 
GPM 230 230 Tripping 5 Type MIG16 Gels 1/2/3 Shock sub 11.93 570 .50 
Press 1100 1100 Survey Out 3576 Oil (2) 8" DC 57.37 860 .70 

Logging In 3035 Solid 1.4 12 'A stab 1413 .10 

Cem/WoC Ftg 405 pH 9.3 8" DC 30.52 1607 0.2 
Misc ; Hrs 43 Chi 169k 12 lA stab 3436 0.6 
Fishing BitWt 15 (3) 8" DC 87.62 

Run Csg RPM 100 (9) 6.5 DC 273.88 

\ 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-3-2012 Report No.: 18 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 3930 Ft. Cut: 310 Formation: Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Drilling RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 18:30 12.5 Drill from 3620' to 3787', (167') avg rop: 13 fph 
18:30 19:00 .50 Wireline survey @3752' (.50 degree) 
19:00 06:00 11.0 Drill from 3787' to 3930', (143') avg rop: 13 fph 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 2 Wt 10.6 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 23.5 Size 12 'A Vis 30 Bit 1.5 152 .50 

SPM 80 80 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 Bit sub 2.15 322 .30 

GPM 230 230 Tripping Type GF371 Gels 1/2/3 Shock sub 11.93 570 .50 

Press 1100 1100 Survey .50 Out Oil (2) 8" DC 57.37 860 .70 

Logging In 3576 Solid 5.7 1.2 lA stab 1413 .10 

Cem/WoC Ftg 354 pH 10 8" DC 30.52 1607 0.2 
Misc Hrs 30 Chi 180k 12 !/4 stab 2021 1.5 

Fishing Bit Wt 40 (3) 8" DC 87.62 3436 .60 

Run Csg RPM 80 (9) 6.5 DC 273.88 3752 .50 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-4-2012 Report No.: 19 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 4215 Ft. Cut: 285 Formation: Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Circulating RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 10:00 4.0 Drill from 3930' to 3976', (46') avg rop: 11 fph 
10:00 10:30 .50 Service rig 
10:30 13:30 3.0 Drill from 3976' to 4008', (32') avg rop: 10 fph 
13:30 14:00 .50 Wireline survey @3973' (.50 degree) 
14:00 01:30 11.5 Drill from 4008' to 4215', (207') avg rop: 18 fph 
01:30 03:00 1.5 Circulate and condition mud 
03:00 05:00 2.0 Short trip 20 stands, no excess drag. 
05:00 06:00 1.0 Pump hi-vis sweep and circulate hole clean. 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 2 Wt 10.6 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 23.5 Size 12 % Vis 30 Bit 1.5 152 .50 

SPM 80 80 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 - Bit sub 2.15 322 .30 
GPM 230 230 Tripping Type GF371 Gels 1/2/3 Shock sub 11.93 570 .50 
Press 1100 1100 Survey .50 Out 4215 Oil (2) 8" DC 57.37 860 .70 

Logging In 3576 Solid 5.7 12 'A stab 1413 .10 
CemAVoC Ftg 639 pH 10 8" DC 30.52 1607 0.2 
Misc Hrs 48.5 Chi 180k 12 '/4Stab 2021 1.5 
Fishing Bit Wt 40 (3) 8" DC 87.62 3436 .60 
Run Csg RPM 80 (9) 6.5 DC 273.88 3752 .50 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-5-2012 Report No.: 20 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 
Contractor : United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 4250 Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Circulating RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 07:30 1.5 Circulate and condition mud. 
07:30 11:30 4.0 Pull out of hole, lay down 2 stab. 
11:30 24:00 12.5 Rig up Baker Atlas and run e-logs, dual laterolog, microlaterolog, dual spectrum density, xmac-e 

optimized delta monopole, compensated neutron, digital spectralog and temp, tension fluid 
resistivity log to 4250' 

24:00 02:30 2.5 Run segmented bon log in 13 3/8" casing from 890' to surface. 
02:30 04:30 2.0 Trip in hole, tag ledge @3976', ream thru ledge and trip in hole to 4190'. 
04:30 05:30 1.0 Ream from 4190' to 4250' 

05:30 06:00 .50 Pump 50 bbls hi-vis sweep and circulate hole clean. 
1 

-

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 2 Wt 10.6 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 23.5 Size 12 % Vis 30 Bit 1.5 152 .50 

SPM 80 , 80 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 Bit sub 2.15 322 .30 
GPM 230 230 Tripping Type GF371 Gels 1/2/3 Shock sub 11.93 570 .50 
Press 1100 1100 Survey .50 Out 4215 Oil (2) 8" DC 57.37 860 .70 

Logging In 3576 Solid 5.7 12 'A stab 1413 .10 
CemAVoC Ftg 639 pH 10 8" DC 30.52 - 1607 0.2 
Misc Hrs 48.5 Chi 180k 12 lA stab 2021 1.5 
Fishing Bit Wt 40 (3) 8" DC 87.62 3436 .60 
Run Csg RPM 80 (9) 6.5 DC 273.88 3752 .50 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-6-2012 Report No.: 1 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 4250 Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Cementing RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 08:30 2.5 Circulate and condition mud. 
08:30 12:00 3.5 Pull out of hole, lay down bit, shock sub, (6) 8" drill collars. 
12:00 13:30 1.5 Rig up lay down machine and casing equipment. Held safety meeting. 
13:30 20:00 6.5 Pick up and run (108 jts) 8 5/8" J-55 - 32# casing to 4230'. 
20:00 02:30 6.5 Break circulation and circulate until cement arrives. 
02:30 03:00 .50 Held safety meeting with rig and Halliburton personal. 
03:00 06:00 3.0 Rig up Halliburton, test lines to 2500 psi, mix and pump 10 bbls water, 20 bbls gel spacer, 705 bbls 

(1650 sks) lead cement, weight 12.05 ppg, yield 2.4, mix water 14.06 gal/ sk. 

pump 55.6 bbls (235 sks) tail cement weight 14.8 ppf, yield 1.33, mix water 6.34 gal/sk and displace 
with 255Bbls'brine water. 

-' 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# Wt 10.6 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 23.5 Size Vis 30 Bit 152 .50 

SPM Cond/Circ Mfg WL 100 Bit sub 322 .30 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 1/2/3 Shock sub 570 .50 
Press Survey .50 Out Oil 860 .70 

Logging In Solid 5.7 7 5/8 stab 1413 .10 
Cem/WoC Ftg pH 10 6.5" DC 1607 0.2 
Misc Hrs Chi 180k 7 5/8 stab 2021 1.5 
Fishing Bit Wt 3436 .60 
Run Csg RPM (9) 6.5 DC 273.88 3752 .50 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-7-2012 Report No.: 22 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 

Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 4250 Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Nippling up bop's RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 07:00 1.0 Displace cement with 255 bbls brine and bump plug with 500 psi over pump pressure. Hold for 15 
minutes. Release pressure, floats holding. 

07:00 07:30 .50 Rig down Halliburton 

07:30 18:00 10.5 Pick up bop's, attempt to set slips, failed. Pull slips and try to adjust slips, Wood Group thinks 

there is defect in slips and will switch out with C-21 style slips. 

18:00 24:00 6.0 Wait on new casing slips. 
24:00 03:00 3.0 Install new slips, Seat new slips , nipple down bop's and install section "B" test to 2000 psi. 
03:00 06:00 3.0 Nipple up ll"!5k bop's. 

! 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 • No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# Wt 9.0 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis Bit 152 .50 

SPM Cond/Circ Mfg WL Bit sub 322 .30 

GPM Tripping Type Gels Shock sub 570 .50 

Press Survey Out Oil 860 .70 

Logging In Solid 7 5/8 stab 1413 .10 

Cem/WoC 1 Ftg pH 6.5" DC 1607 0.2 
Misc 23 Hrs Chi 7 5/8 stab 2021 1.5 

Fishing 

•\ 
BitWt 3436 .60 

Run Csg RPM (9) 6.5 DC 273.88 3752 .50 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-8-20i2 Report No.: 23 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 4250 Ft. Cut: Formation: Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Tripping in hole RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation 
From To Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 17:30 11.5 Nipple up bop's 
17:30 20:00 2.5 Rig up Green's testers and test annular to 250 psi low and 1500 psi hi, test pipe rams to 2000 psi 

test failed. Test blind rams and choke manifold valves to 250 psi low and 2000 psi hi. 
20:00 24:00 4.0 Wait on new pipe rams for bop's. 
24:00 02:00 2.0 Install new pipe rams and test to 250 psi low and 2000 psi hi, test good. 

02:00 03:00 1.0 Pick up new bit, stab and (15) 6 Vi' drill collars. 
03:00 06:00 3.0 Trip in hole and lay down excess drill pipe. 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# Wt 9.0 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis 29 Bit 152 .50 
SPM Cond/Circ Mfg WL 100 Bit sub 322 .30 
GPM Tripping 4' Type Gels Shock sub 570 .50 
Press Survey \ Out Oil 860 .70 

Logging In Solid 7 5/8 stab 1413 .10 
Cem/WoC Ftg pH 8.0 6.5" DC 1607 0.2 
Misc 20 J Hrs Chi 73000 7 5/8 stab 2021 1.5 
Fishing i BitWt 3436 .60 
Run Csg RPM (9) 6.5 DC 273.88 3752 .50 

\ 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-9-2012 Report No.: 24 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 4875 Ft. Cut: 645 Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Drilling RKB: 15 

Time Log 
From To 

Elapsed 
Time 

Details of Operation 

Lay down 24 joints "E" drill pipe and pick up 24 joints "G" drill pipe. 06:00 09:00 3.0 
09:00 10:00 1.0 Circulate and cut brine to 9.0 ppg 
10:00 12:30 2.5 Test casing on chart to 840 psi for 30 minutes. 
12:30 14:00 1.5 Drill float collar, shoe track and shoe to 4230' 
14:00 22:30 Drill from 4230' to 4576', (346') avg rop: 40.7 fph 
22:30 23:00 .50 Wire line survey @4541' (.80 degree) 
23:00 05:00 6.0 Drill from 4576' to 4861', (285') avg rop: 47.5 fph 
05:00 05:30 .50 Wireline survey @4826' (.90 degree) 
05:30 06:00 .50 Drill from 4861' to 4875', (14) avg rop: 28 fph, back ground gas 42 units, max gas 171 units @4300' 

Called Patricia Hutchings with BLM on casing and bop test 04/09/2012 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 5 Wt 9.1 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 16.5 Size 7 5/8 Vis 29 Bit 1.0 4541 .80 
SPM 72 72 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 4826 .90 
GPM 200 200 Tripping Type MI616 Gels Shock sub 12.01 
Press 1400 1400 Survey 1.0 Out Oil (2) DC 6.5 61.32 

Logging In 4250 Solid 7 5/8 stab 5.20 
Cem/WoC Ftg pH 10 6.5" DC 30.38 
Misc 6.5 Hrs Chi 73000 7 5/8 stab 6.11 
Fishing < Bit Wt 20 (19)6.5" DC 547.76 
Run Csg RPM 80 663.76 

\ 

\ 



PB Energy 
§§ ==== Storage 
= " Services, Inc. 

Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-10-2012 Report No.: 25 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 

Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5202 Ft. Cut: 327 Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Drilling RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 13:00 7.0 Drill from 4875' to 5115', (240') avg rop: 34 fph 
13:00 13:30 .50 Service rig 
13:30 21:30 8.0 Drill from 5115' to 5178', (63') avg rop: 8 fph 

21:30 22:00 .50 Wireline survey @ 5143' (1.3 degree) 

22:00 03:00 5.0 Drill from 5178' to 5202', (24') avg rop: 4.8 fph 

03:00 04:00 1.0 Rig repair, work on mud pumps. 
04:00 06:00 2.0 Pump pressure increased from 1450 psi to 2100 psi, check surface equipment, pull out of hole. 

Back ground gas 41 units @5202' 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 5 Wt 9.2 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 20 Size 7 5/8 Vis 29 Bit 1.0 4541 .80 

SPM 72 72 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 4826 .90 
GPM 200 200 Tripping 2.0 Type MI616 Gels Shock sub 12.01 5143 1.3 

Press 1450 1450 Survey .50 Out Oil (2) DC 6.5 61.32 
Logging In 4250 Solid 7 5/8 stab 5.20 
Cem/WoC Ftg 972 pH 10 6.5" DC 30.38 
Misc 1-5, Hrs 35.5 Chi 86000 7 5/8 stab 6.11 
Fishing BitWt 30 (19)6.5" DC 547.76 

Run Csg RPM 100 663.76 

\ 

\ 
I 
t 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-11-2012 Report No.: 26 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 5510 Ft. Cut: 308 Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Drilling RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation 
From To Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 07:00 1.0 Finish pulling out of hole 
07:00 11:30 4.5 Pick up bit #6 and trip in hole to 5202'. 
11:30 21:00 11.5 Drill from 5202' to 5368' (166') avg rop: 14.5 fph 
21:00 21:30 .50 Wireline survey @5333' (1.5 degree) 
21:30 05:00 7.5 Drill from 5368' to 5495', (127') avg rop: 17 fph 
05:00 05:30 .50 Wireline survey @5460' (1.2 degree) 
05:30 06:00 .50 Drill from 5495' to 5510', (15') avg rop: 30 fph 

• 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 5 Wt 9.1 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling 17.5 Size 7 5/8 Vis 29 Bit 1.0 4541 .80 
SPM 72 72 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 4826 .90 
GPM 200 200 Tripping 5.5 Type FH43 Gels Shock sub 12.01 5143 1.3 
Press 1750 1750 Survey 1.0 Out Oil (2) DC 6.5 61.32 5333 1.5 

Logging In 5202 Solid 7 5/8 stab 5.20 5460 1.2 
Cem/WoC Ftg 308 pH 10 6.5" DC 30.38 
Misc Hrs 20 Chi 75000 7 5/8 stab 6.11 
Fishing Bit Wt 30 (19)6.5" DC 547.76 
Run Csg RPM 100 663.76 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-12-2012 Report No.: 27 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 5843 Ft. Cut: 333 Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Working stuck pipe RKB: 15 

Time Log 
From To 

Elapsed 
Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 11:00 5.0 Drill from 5510' to 5622', 112') avg rop: 22.4 fph 
11:00 11:30 .50 Wireline survey @5587' (.90 degree) 
11:30 13:00 1.5 Drill from 5622' to 5653', (21') avg rop: 14 fph 
13:00 13:30 .50 Service rig 
13:30 18:30 5.0 Drill from 5653' to 5812;, (159') avg rop: 31.8 fph increased weight on bit from 25 to 30k 

18:30 19:00 .50 Wireline survey @5777' (.80 degree) 
19:00 20:00 1.0 Drill from 5812' to 5843'. (31') avg rop: 31 fph 
20:00 01:00 3.0 Picked up and made connection, after making connection pipe would not go down. Work pipe up 

and down @5802', no progress made. Good returns and circulation. Lost 300 psi off original pump 
pressure. 

01:00 03:00 2.0 Pick up surface jars and jar down on stuck pipe, surface jars went out and could not find another set. 
03:00 06:00 3.0 Circulate at neutral weight while waiting on wireline truck to arrive for free point. 

Fishing tools on location 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Firs RU Bit# 5 Wt 9.1 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size 7 5/8 Vis 29 Bit 1.0 4541 .80 
SPM 72 72 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 4826 .90 
GPM 200 200 Tripping Type FH43 Gels 1/2/3 Shock sub 12.01 5143 1.3 
Press 1750 1750 Survey Out Oil (2) DC 6.5 61.32 5333 1.5 

Logging In 5202 Solid 1.7 7 5/8 stab 5.20 5460 1.2 
Cem/WoC |Ftg 308 pH 10.5 6.5" DC 30.38 5567 .90 
Misc Prs 20 Chi 71000 7 5/8 stab 6.11 5777 .80 
Fishing Bit Wt 30 (19)6.5" DC 547.76 
Run Csg flPM 100 663.76 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-13-2012 Report No.: 28 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Trip in hole with fishing assembly RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 08:00 2.0 Work stuck pipe and circulate while waiting on wireline truck. 
08:00 11:30 3.5 Rig up E&P Waireline and run free point, 100% stuck @5457, 5425' and free pipe @5361' 
11:30 14:00 2.5 Shut down rig due to H2S Gas , circulate gas out of hole. 
14:00 18:00 4.0 Found washout under structure, pick up front of rig and put gravel in washout. Rig level. 
18:00 22:00 4.0 Mix and pump 70 bbls EZ-Spot diesel mix around fish. 
22:00 23:00 1.0 Run in hole with free point and back off fish @5361' 
23:00 01:30 2.5 Pull out of hole and lay down 1 drill collar. 
01:30 02:30 1.0 Pick up fishing assembly, bumper jars, accelerator jars and screw in sub 
02:30 06:00 3.5 Trip in hole 

1 

Total 24 ; 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 5 Wt 9.1 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size 7 5/8 Vis 29 Bit 1.0 4541 .80 
SPM Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type FH43 Gels 1/2/3 Shock sub 12.01 5143 1.3 
Press Survey Out Oil (2) DC 6.5 61.32 5333 1.5 

Logging In 5202 Solid 1.7 7 5/8 stab 5.20 5460 1.2 
CemAVoC Ftg 308 pH 10.5 6.5" DC 30.38 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs 20 Chi 71000 7 5/8 stab 6.11 5777 .80 
Fishing 24, Bit Wt 30 (19)6.5" DC 547.76 
Run Csg I RPM 100 663.76 

/ 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-14-2012 Report No.: 29 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 

Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Trip in hole with fishing assembly RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 07:00 1.0 Trip in hole with screw in sub to 5361' 
07:00 09:00 2.0 Break circulation and screw into fish @5361', pull up to 150k and set jars. Pull up and jar on fish. 

Lost weight after jaring, attempt to screw back in to fish failed. 

09:00 13:00 4.0 Pull out of hole, recovered (2) drill collars. 

13:00 16:00 3.0 Rig repair, change clutch on rotary. 

16:00 20:00 4.0 Pick up over shot assembly, 7 3/8" over shot with 6 1/8" grapples, trip in hole. 
20:00 24:00 4.0 Break circulation, latch fish @ 5409', pick up to 185k allow jars to release and pull up to 200k. 

Jar on fish for 2.5 hours. Lost weight grapple disengaged from fish. Attempt to relatch fish, failed. 
24:00 03:00 3.0 Pull out of hole, grapple and over shot damaged. Grapple looked stretched and broke on bottom 
03:00 06:00 3.0 Wait on new overshot, will run 6 1/4" grapples on next run 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 5 Wt 9.1 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size 7 5/8 Vis 29 1 Overshot 3.90 4541 .80 

SPM 90 Cond/Circ ' vlfg Smith WL 100 1 Bumper sub 7.0 4826 .90 

GPM Tripping Type FH43 Gels 1/2/3 Jars 11.30 5143 1.3 

Press 850 Survey Dut Oil 6 (6.5") dc 181.81 5333 1.5 

Logging n 5202 Solid 1.7 XO 2.51 5460 1.2 

Cem/WoC f Ftg 308 pH 10.5 Accelerator 12.98 5567 .90 
Misc ; Hrs 20 Chi 71000 XO 3.0 5777 .80 

Fishing 24\ Bit Wt 30 (3)6.5 DC 91.77 

Run Csg RPM 100 Total BHA 316.91 

I 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-15-2012 Report No.: 30 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Jarring on fish RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation From To Time Details of Operation 

06:00 09:30 3.5 Trip in hole with 7 3/8" overshot with 6 V" grapples to 5419' 
09:30 12:30 3.0 Jar on fish, pick up weight 200k slack off weight 115k. 
12:30 24:00 11.5 Weight indicator broke, wait on tech to swap out weight indicator. 

Spot 80 bbls EZ-Spot around fish leaving 5 bbls in drill pipe. 
24:00 06:00 6.0 Jar on fish, made roughly 6 inches. No free movement. 

250' - 7 3/8" wash pipe on location 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 5 Wt 9.3 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size 7 5/8 Vis 31 1 Overshot 3.90 4541 .80 
SPM 90 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 100 1 Bumper sub 7.0 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type FH43 Gels 2/3/4 Jars 11.30 5143 1.3 
Press 850 Survey \ Out Oil 6 (6.5") dc 181.81 5333 1.5 

Logging 1 In 5202 Solid 1.7 XO 2.51 5460 1.2 
CemAVoC Ftg 308 pH 11 Accelerator 12.98 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs 20 Chi 82000 XO 3.0 5777 .80 
Fishing 24! Bit Wt 30 (3) 6.5 DC 91.77 
Run Csg RPM 100 Total BHA 316.91 

i 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-16-2012 Report No.: 31 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 ; 

Contractor: United ; Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: / 
/ 

Formation: Do! 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Pulling out of hole eith wash pipe RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation 
From To Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 12:00 6.0 Release from fish and pull out of hole. 
12:00 15:00 3.0 Pick up wash pipe assembly 
15:00 19:30 4.5 Trip in hole to 5419', top offish. 

19:30 03:30 8.0 Pick up Kelly, break circulation and wash over fish from 5419' to 5606', (187') from 5419' to 5486' 
Took l-2k to drill and from 5486' to 5510' took 3-5k to drill, from 5510' to 5606' took l-3k to drill. 

Pump pressure on top of fish 319 psi @90 spm, once over fish pump pressure 390 psi (2}90 spm 
while washing over. No drag on pick up or slack off. 

03:30 05:30 .50 Pump 40 bbls hi-vis sweep and circulate hole clean. 
05:30 06:00 .50 Pull out of hole with wash pipe, no excess drag. 

i 

i 
i 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Firs RU 1 Bit# Wt 9.3 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling ( Size Vis 31 1 Shoe 6 11/16 4.95 4541 .80 

SPM 90 Cond/Circ Mfg WL 100 1 Wash pipe 183.67 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping I type Gels 2/3/4 Top sub 2.15 5143 1.3 
Press 319 Survey 1 Out Oil Blanking sub 1.89 5333 1.5 

Logging In Solid 1.7 Jars 11.62 5460 1.2 
Cem/WoC Ftg pH 11 XO 2.65 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs Chi 82000 (6) 6.5 DC 181.81 5777 .80 
Fishing 241 Bit Wt 

Run Csg t RPM Total BHA 388.47 

I 

i 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-17-2012 Report No.: 32 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United / Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: ) Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Tripping in hole RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation 
From To Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 07:00 1.0 Pull out of hole 
07:00 13:00 6.0 Pick up new jars and over shot and trip in hole to 5419'. 
13:00 15:00 2.0 Latch onto fish and jar, set off jars at 240k and pull up 275k, max pick up on fish 275k, over pull on 

string 135k 

15:00 21:00 6.0 Rig up wire line and make dummy run to verify pipe not plugged. Run in hole with free point, 

Pipe free @5632 WLM 
21:00 03:00 6.0 Pull out of hole, recovered 7 joints drill collars , remaining fish in hole 175'. 1/d 7 jts drill collars. 
03:00 04:30 1.5 Slip and cut 250' drill line and adjust brakes. 
04:30 06:00 1.5 Pick up 6 drill collars and trip in hole with screw in sub. 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit* Wt 9.1 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis 31 1 SIS 2.61 4541 .80 

SPM 90 Cond/Circ Mfg WL 100 1 B/SUB 7.0 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 2/3/4 JARS 11.62 5143 1.3 

Press 319 Survey Out Oil 10 XO 2.64 5333 1.5 
Logging In Solid 1.7 (6) 6.5" DC 180.39 5460 1.2 

Cem/WoC \ Ftg pH 9.8 XO 2.51 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs Chi 101k JARS 12.98 5777 .80 
Fishing 24'. Bit Wt XO 3.0 

Run Csg i RPM (3) 6.5" DC 91.77 

\ 
J 

\ 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-18-2012 Report No.: 33 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 ' 

Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Tripping in hole RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 09:00 3.0 Trip in hole to 5632', top offish. 
09:00 10:00 1.0 Break circulation and screw into fish. Jar on fish, weight iindicator not working. 
10:00 20:00 10.0 Wait on tech and new weight indicator. 

20:00 22:30 2.5 Jar on fish, set off jars @215k and over pull to 225k. no movement. 

22:30 02:30 4.0 Rig up wire line and run free point, pipe free to 5698', back off 2 drill collars and one stab. 

02:30 06:00 3.5 Pull out of hole with fish and lay down (2) 6.5" drill collars and one stab. 

Fish left in hole: dc,dc,stab,dc,shock sub, bit (TOP OF FREE PIPE 5729') 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# Wt 9.3 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis 31 1 SIS 2.61 4541 .80 

SPM 68 Cond/Circ Mfg WL 100 1 B/SUB 7.0 4826 .90 

GPM Tripping Type Gels 2/3/4 JARS 11.62 5143 1.3 

Press 680 Survey Out Oil 10 XO 2.64 5333 1.5 
Logging In Solid 1.7 (6) 6.5" DC 180.39 5460 1.2 

CemAVoC Ftg pH 8.5 XO 2.51 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs Chi 105k JARS 12.98 5777 .80 
Fishing 24 Bit Wt XO 3.0 

Run Csg RPM (3) 6.5" DC 91.77 



PB Energy 
s ^= Storage 
= Services, Inc. 

Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-19-2012 Report No.: 34 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 ! 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Tripping out of hole RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 10:00 4.0 Trip in hole to top of fish 5698'. 
10:00 14:00 4.0 Break circulation, latch and jar on fish, no movement. 
14:00 17:00 3.0 Pull out of hole. 
17:00 22:00 5.0 Pick up wash pipe, burning shoe and trip in hole to 5698'. 
22:00 04:30 6.5 Burn over bottom stab from 5732' to 5733'. 
04:30 06:00 1.5 Pump 40 bbls hi-vis sweep and circulate bottoms up. 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# Wt 9.4 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis 31 1 Shoe 4.29 4541 .80 
SPM 51 Cond/Circ Mfg WL 100 1 (4) JTS WP 112.77 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 2/3/4 Top Sub 2.15 5143 1.3 
Press 455 Survey Out Oil 10 Blank Sub 1.89 5333 1.5 

Logging In Solid 1.7 Jars 11.62 5460 1.2 
CemAVoC Ftg pH 10.0 XO 2.64 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs Chi 120k (6) 6.5 DC 181.81 5777 .80 
Fishing 24 Bit Wt 
Run Csg RPM Total BHA 317.17 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-20-2012 Report No.: 35 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 

Contractor : United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Tripping out1 of hole RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation 
From To Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 06:30 .50 Circulate bottoms up. 
06:30 11:30 5.0 Pull out of hole and lay down burning shoe. 
11:30 12:30 1.0 Dress burning shoe with more cutrite for more cutting surface. 

12:30 17:00 4.5 Trip in hole with wash pipe assembly to 5733' 

17:00 02:00 9.0 Wash over fish from 5733'to 5763' 

02:00 04:00 2.0 Pump 40 bbls sweep and circulate hole clean. 
04:00 06:00 2.0 Pull out of hole with wash pipe assembly. 

! 
1 

i 
] 

! 
Total 24 

Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU ; Bit* Wt 9.4 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis 30 1 Shoe 4.29 4541 .80 

SPM 51 Cond/Circ i vlfg WL 100 1 (4) JTS WP 112.77 4826 .90 

GPM Tripping rype Gels 1/2/3 Top Sub 2.15 5143 1.3 

Press 455 Survey s Dut Oil Blank Sub 1.89 5333 1.5 

Logging i [n Solid 0.7 Jars 11.62 5460 1.2 

Cem/WoC ; Ftg pH 10.0 XO 2.64 5567 .90 
Misc ; Hrs Chi 124k (6) 6.5 DC 181.81 5777 .80 

Fishing 24 BitWt 

Run Csg RPM Total BHA 317.17 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-22-2012 Report No.: 37 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 

Contractor: United / Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: POOH with fish RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 14:00 8.0 Wash over fish from 5733' to 5807' 
14:00 17:00 3.0 Pump 40 bbls sweep and circulate hole clean. 
17:00 22:00 5.0 Pull out of hole with wash pipe assembly. 

22:00 02:30 4.5 Pick up new screw in sub, jars and trip in hole to top of fish. 

02:30 06:00 3.5 Screw into fish and pick up to 2235k, jars released and fish is free. Pull out of hole slow with fish. 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# Wt 9.4 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis 30 1 Shoe 5.1 4541 .80 

SPM 51 Cond/Circ Mfg WL 49 1 (3) JTS WP 86.26 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 1/2/3 Top Sub 2.15 5143 1.3 
Press 455 Survey Out Oil Blank Sub 1.89 5333 1.5 

Logging In Solid . 0.7 Jars 11.62 5460 1.2 
Cem/WoC Ftg pH 10.8 XO 2.64 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs Chi 125k (9) 6.5 DC 273.58 5777 .80 
Fishing 24, Bit Wt 

Run Csg \ flPM Total BHA 383.24 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-23-2012 Report No.: 38 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5853 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Trip in hole with over shot assembly RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 10:00 4.0 Pull out of hole with fish, recovered 2 drill collars and upper sub on shock sub. Left 10' of fish in 
hole. 

10:00 15:30 5.5 Wait on fishing tools. 
15:30 19:00 3.5 Trip in hole with buning shoe assembly. 

19:00 24:00 5.0 Mill over remaing fish (6') total from 6 V" od to 6 V" od. 

24:00 02:00 2.0 Pump hi-vis sweep and circulate hole clean. 

02:00 05:30 3.5 Pull out of hole with burn shoe assembly. 
05:30 06:00 .50 Lay down burning shoe and wash pipe. 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# Wt 9.35 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis 33 1 4541 .80 

SPM 51 Cond/Circ Mfg WL 49 1 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 3/6/7 5143 1.3 
Press 455 Survey Out Oil 5333 1.5 

Logging In Solid 0.3 5460 1.2 
CemAVoC Ftg pH 10.3 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs Chi 120k 5777 .80 
Fishing 24 Bit Wt 

Run Csg RPM 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-24-2012 Report No.: 39 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 5843 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Waiting on cement RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 10:00 4.0 Trip in hole with 7 3/8" over shot with 6 grapplels to top of fish 5797'. 
10:00 12:00 2.0 Latch onto fish and attempt to jar fish loose. Max pull on fish 275k, 150k over string weight. Lost 

contact with fish while jarring. 
12:00 16:00 4.0 Pull out of hole, no fish recovered, over shot damaged and grapples left in hole. 
16:00 17:30 1.5 Lay down all fishing tools. 
17:30 18:30 1.0 Lay down all 6 V" drill collars from derrick. 
18:30 01:30 7.0 Slip and cut 150' of drill line and install Kelly spinner. 
01:30 06:00 4.5 Pick up 15 joints drill pipe and trip in hole with 40 stds drill pipe. 

Note: A typo in the depth on 4/14/12 (Report 25) has inadvertently been carried forward until today. 
The total depth reached to date is 5843 ft. 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# Wt 9.35 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size Vis 33 1 4541 .80 

SPM 51 Cond/Circ vlfg WL 49 1 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 3/6/7 5143 1.3 
Press 455 Survey 3ut Oil 5333 1.5 

Logging In Solid 0.3 5460 1.2 
Cem/WoC Ftg pH 10.3 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs Chi 120k 5777 .80 
Fishing 24 \ Bit Wt 
Run Csg \ RPM 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-25-2012 Report No.: 40 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI#1 

Contractor: United Rig No. 41 1 County/Parish: Lea State: N M 

Depth: 5843 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Waiting on cement RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 17:00 11.0 Trip in hole with drill pipe to 5800', circulate while waiting on BLM approval of side track 
procedure. Approval from BLM (2) 17:00 

17:00 20:00 3.0 Circulate @5800' while waiting on cement to arrive from Halliburton. 
20:00 21:00 1.0 Rig up Halliburton, test lines to 5000 psi, pump 26 bbls spacer, mix and pump 36.3 bbls (200 sks) 

16.8 ppg cement .yield 1.02 and gal/sk 3.95. Displace drill pipe 63 bbls mud and 10 bbls fresh water. 
Cement spotted in hole from 5800' to 5157' dpm , (643') 

21:00 21:30 .50 Pull 10 stands drill pipe. 

21:30 22:00 .50 Circulate while rigging down Halliburton. 

22:00 00:30 2.5 Pull out of hole with drill pipe. 
00:30 03:00 2.5 Trip in hole with bit, bit sub, 12 drill collars and 5 stds drill pipe. 
03:00 06:00 3.0 Wait on cement 

Total. 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 7 Wt 9.35 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size 7 5/8 Vis 32 1 Bit] 1.0 4541 .80 

SPM 51 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 52 1 Bit sub 3.45 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 3/6/7 (12)6 Vide 359.35 5143 1.3 

Press 455 Survey 
1 

Out Oil 5333 1.5 
Logging \ In 5843 Solid 0.3 5460 1.2 
CemAVoC Ftg pH 10.5 5567 .90 
Misc \ Hrs Chi 120k 5777 .80 
Fishing \ Bit Wt 

Run Csg RPM 363.80 

/ 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-26-2012 Report No.: 41 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 1 

Contractor: United i Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5843 Ft. Cut: Formation: Dol 100% Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Waiting on cement RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 14:30 8.5 Wait on cement 
14:30 19:00 4.5 Trip in hole to 5100' 
19:00 21:00 2.0 Circulate bottoms up. 

21:00 22:00 1.0 Wash from 5100' to 5250', cement still green. 

22:00 06:00 8.0 Wait on cement and circulate. 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 7 Wt 9.35 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size 7 5/8 Vis 32 1 Bit] 1.0 4541 .80 

SPM 51 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 52 1 Bit sub 3.45 4826 .90 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 3/6/7 (12)6 Vz dc 359.35 5143 1.3 
Press 455 Survey Out Oil 5333 1.5 

Logging In 5843 Solid 0.3 5460 1.2 
Cem/WoC Ftg pH 10.5 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs Chi 120k 5777 .80 
Fishing Bit Wt 

Run Csg RPM 363.80 
\ 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-27-2012 Report No.: 42 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 1 

Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County /Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5468 Ft. Cut: 1 Formation: 50/50 dolimite Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Slide drilling with directional assembly RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 07:00 1.0 Circulate and condition mud. 
07:00 08:30 1.5 Tag top of cement at 5400', drill cement from 5400' to 5462', rpm 40, wob 15k, spm 100, gpm 256. 

Cement firm enough to kick off (2J5662. 
08:30 11:00 2.5 Circulate bottoms up, good firm cement on bottoms up. 

11:00 14:00 3.0 Clear excess drill pipe in derrick. 
14:00 16:00 2.0 Pull out of hole. 

16:00 19:00 3.0 Pick up directional equipment and orientate tools. 
19:00 22:00 3.0 Trip in hole with directional assembly to 5660'. 
22:00 06:00 8.0 Slide drill from 5462' to 5468', lithogly 50% cement and 50% dolomite. 

i 

i 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit* 7 Wt 9.35 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling Size 7 5/8 Vis 33 1 BIT 1.0 4541 .80 

SPM 103 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 90 1 Motor 2.12 
deg 

26.89 4826 .90 

GPM 269 Tripping Type Gels 3/6/9 NMDC 30.85 5143 1.3 
Press 1100 Survey ] Out Oil Pulser sub 5.57 5333 1.5 

Logging | In 5843 Solid 0.3 total 64.31 5460 1.2 
Cem/WoC i Ftg pH 12.5 5567 .90 
Misc 1 Hrs Chi 100k 5777 .80 
Fishing ! Bit Wt 

Run Csg i RPM 

I 
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Project No. 50795A Date: 4-28-2012 Report No.: 43 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 
Contractor: United Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 5600 Ft. Cut: Formation: 50/50 dolimite Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Slide drilling with directional assembly RKB: 15 

Time Log 
From To 

Elapsed 
Time 

Details of Operation 

06:00 14:00 8.0 Slide drill from 5468' to 5480', formation 100 % dolimite 
14:00 18:00 4.0 Pull out of hole to change motor 
18:00 23:00 5.0 Pick up new motor, orientate tool and trip in hole to 5480'. 
23:00 00:30 1.5 Slide drill from 5480' to 5490' 
00:30 04:00 3.5 Rotary drill from 5490' to 5558' 
04:00 04:30 .50 Slide drill from 5558'to 5563' 
04:30 06:00 1.5 Rotary drill from 5563' to 5600' 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 7 Wt 9.25 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 9 9 Drilling i Size 7 5/8 Vis 30 1 BIT 1.0 4541 .80 

SPM 70 70 Cond/Circ Mfg Smith WL 96 1 Motor 2.12 
deg 

26.76 4826 .90 

GPM 400 400 Tripping j Type FM43 Gels 2/4/5 NMDC 30.85 5143 1.3 

Press 1950 Survey ! Out Oil Pulser sub 5.57 5333 1.5 

Logging ! In 5461 Solid 0.3 PONY DC 10.84 5460 1.2 

CemAVoC i Ftg 132 pH 12.5 (12)6.5 DC 359.33 5567 .90 
Misc \ Hrs 23 Chi 88k 5777 .80 
Fishing Bit Wt 20K 

Run Csg \ RPM TOTAL 434.77 



PB Energy 
= Storage 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-29-2012 Report No.: 44 Reported By: Gerald Ardoin 
Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 \ 
Contractor: United j Rig No. 41 County/Parish: Lea State: NM 
Depth: 5720 Ft. Cut: l Formation: 100% Dolimite Tops New Form: 
Activity at Report Time: Rigging uo Dialog free point RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

06:00 12:00 6.0 Rotary drill from 5600' to 5720' 
12:00 23:00 11:00 Work stuck pipe, after making connection Scientific orientated tool for slide. Before making slide lost 

100 psi, driller picked up and was stuck. Worked stuck pipe up to 100k over string weight with no 
movement. ', . 

23:00 23:30 .50 Displace 100 bbls fresh water in hole in attempt to pop fish off wall, failed. 
23:30 04:30 5.0 Transfer 80 bbls diesel from rig diesel tank and mix 2 drums e-z spot. Pump e-z mud and displace 

drill pipe with mud. Total e-z spot pumped 82 bbls. Covered all open hole with e-z spot 
04:30 06:00 1.5 Attempt to remove goose neck from swivel, u-tubing. Tighten goose neck and displace all drill pipe 

with mud.. | 
1. 
! 
\ 

1 

i 

; 
1 

i 

\ 
i 
l 

1 

! 
Total 24 

Pump Record Our Record ; Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 
Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit* 7 Wt 8.9 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 9 9 Drilling \ Size 7 5/8 Vis 31 1 BIT 1.0 4541 .80 
SPM 70 70 Cond/Circ 

\ 
i 

Mfg Smith WL 100 1 Motor 2.12 
deg 

26.76 4826 .90 

GPM 400 400 Tripping t Type FM43 Gels 3/5/6 NMDC 30.85 5143 1.3 
Press 1730 Survey Out Oil Pulser sub 5.57 5333 1.5 

Logging In 5461 Solid 0.3 PONY DC 10.84 5460 1.2 
Cem/WoC Ftg 211 pH 11 (12)6.5 DC 359.33 5567 .90 
Misc Hrs 35 Chi 59k 5777 .80 
Fishing Bit Wt 20K 
Run Csg RPM TOTAL 434.77 
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Project No.: 50795A Date: 4-30-20 ll2 Report No.: 45 Reported By : Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: Maljamar AGI #1 1 

Contractor: United / Rig No. 41 County /Parish: Lea State: NM 

Depth: 5720 Ft. Cut: ( Formation: 100% Dolimite Tops New Form: 

Activity at Report Time: Rigging uo Dialog free point RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 1 

| Details of Operation From To Time 

1 

| Details of Operation 
0600 0800 2 Tighten up gooseneck on Kelly swivel 
0800 0900 1 RAJ wireline, [cannot pass thru pipe for pipe screen 
0900 1100 2 Break kelly off and retrieve pipe screen 

1100 1500 4 Run wireline.jfree point @ 5578', stuck @ 5610' 

1500 2200 7 Circulate 1 

2200 0030 2.5 R/U nitrogen truck 

0030 0200 1.5 Pump Nitrogen, work stuck pipe 
0200 0400 2 Reciprocate pipe, pipe free 
0400 0600 2 Pooh / 

\ 
\ 
\ i 

i 
i 

\ 
Total 24 j 

Pump Record Our Record | Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2. Hrs RU ! 3it# 7 Wt 8.8 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 9 9 Drilling i Size 7 5/8 Vis 30 1 BIT 1.0 4541 .80 

SPM 70 70 Cond/Circ 
\ 

vlfg Smith WL 100 1 Motor 2.12 
deg 

26.76 4826 .90 

GPM 400 400 Tripping Type FM43 Gels 2/3/5 NMDC 30.85 5143 1.3 

Press 1730 Survey j Dut Oil Pulser sub 5.57 5333 1.5 

Logging i [n 5461 Solid 0.7 PONY DC 10.84 5460 1.2 

CemAVoC i Ftg 211 pH 11 (12)6.5 DC 359.33 5567 .90 
Misc \ Hrs 35 Chi 53k 5777 .80 

Fishing \ BitWt 20K 

Run Csg \ RPM TOTAL 434.77 


