	MOXY USAINC
Mollis PRAVO DOME HANT 1992 0740	Operation Summary Report
Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 1833 071G Project: BRAVO DOME	Event Name: DEV DRILLING Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT
Site: BRAVO DOME CO2 UNIT	Start Date: 6/28/2011
	End Date: 7/4/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216
# Date Time Hrs Start-End	Op Details
1 06/28/2011 18:00 - 00:00 6.00	DRIGGING DOWN TO MOVE TO BDU 1833-071G
2 06/29/2011 00:00 - 06:00 6:00	SAFETY BREAK: BUFFER ZONES WAITING ON TRUCKS AND DAYLIGHT TO MOVE RIG
	그렇게 하고 어떤 물자의 그러는 뭐 뭐든데 그리고 살아가게 하고 있는 그림의
06:00 - 10:00 4.00	TRUCKS WILL BE ON LOCATION AT 07:00 D SAFETY MEETING WITHTRUCKING CO. AND RIG CREW
4.00	OSALETT MEETING WITHTROCKING CO. AND RIG CREW
40.00	STARTED MOVING RIG TO NEXT LOCATION
10:00 - 14:00 4.00	O CONTINUED MOVING RIG TO LOCATION 30% MOVED OVER
	SAFETY BREAK: WORKING IN HOT CONDITIONS / STAYING HYDRATED
14:00 - 18:00 4.00	O CONTINUED MOVING RIG TO LOCATION 80% MOVED OVER
	SAFETY BREAK: WORKING IN HOT CONDITIONS / STAYING HYDRATED
18:00 - 23:00 5:00	D CONTINUED MOVING RIG TO LOCATION 100% MOVED OVER
	FINISHED RIGGING ÚP
	MIXING MUD & CUT OUT TIN HORN FOR FLOW
3 06/30/2011 00:00 - 00:30 0.50	D FINISHED MIXING MUD INSPECTED AND ACCEPTED RIG ON DAY WORK AT 12:30 AM PRE SPUD SAFETY MEETING PICK-UP BHA AS FOLLOWS
	- 12 1/4 TRI CONE BIT, 3-14 JETS - 1-8" DC - XO
	-18 - 6.25" DC'S
00:30 - 05:30 5.00	O SPUDDED WELL AT 12:30 AM
·	DRILLED 12 1/4" SURFACE HOLE FROM 0 TO 600" 600' FT, AVG. ROP = 120'/HR
·	- PUMP RATE= 400 GPM - PUMP PRESSURE = 750 PSI
	- ROTARY = 130 - WOB = 8-15
	- WOB = 8-15 - TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 1500 - TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 1100
	MUD WT = 9.0 PPG VIS 48 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200" OR AS NEEDED
	CAFETY DDEAW, DDILLING AND MAKING CONNECTIONS COURDED WITH AT 40:20 AM
05:30 - 06:00 0.5	SAFETY BREAK: DRILLING AND MAKING CONNECTIONS SPUDDED WELL AT 12:30 AM D WIRELINE SURVEY @ 497" = 500 DEGREE
1	
]	
L	

Operation Summary Report,

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 1833 071G

Project: BRAVO DOME

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site:	BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT	Start Date:	6/28/2011	
		End Date:	7/4/2011	Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216
#	Date Time Start-End	Hrs Op Details		
	06:00 - 08:00	2.00 DRILLED 12:1/4" SURFAC	E HOLE FROM 60	D' TO 682'
		82' FT, AVG. ROP = 41'/HF	₹ ' '	경기 이 문제의 나는 요한 사람들은 살 보다를 가는 하셨습니다.
		- PUMP RATE= 400 GPM		스타 크리아의 교회의 교육은 경우를 되고 하고를 받아냈다.
		- PUMP PRESSURE = 850	PSI	
		- ROTARY = 130 - WOB = 10-18		
		- TORQUE ON BOTTOM =	2500	하시는 아이들은 바로 보다를 모든 목표를 받는데 하는 일을 보다 되었다.
3.3		- TORQUE OFF BOTTOM	= 850	
		BACK REAMER EACH JTS	3	
1 23				
100		MUD WT = 8.6PPG VIS 35 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS		S NEEDED
			. (
	08:00 - 09:00			TIONS / STAYING HYDRATED
	09:00 - 11:30	1.00 REPACK SWIVEL ON TOP 2.50 DRILLED 12 1/4" SURFAC		
		126' FT, AVG. ROP = 50'/H		
		- PUMP RATE= 400 GPM		
		- PUMP PRESSURE = 900	PSI	
		- ROTARY = 130		그리는 열차님이 그 그렇지만 소설 요즘했다.
		- WOB = 10-18 - TORQUE ON BOTTOM =	2500	
		- TORQUE OFF BOTTOM		
		MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 36	3	
		PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS		SNEEDED
		SAFETY BREAK: BUFFER	ZONE	
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50 CONDITION & CIRCULATI		5/8 SURFACE CASING
	12:00 - 14:00	2.00 DROP TOTCO TOOL FOR		
	14:00 - 16:00	PJSM- TOH TO RUN 8 5/8 2.00 PJSM - RIG UP & RUN 18		
				ss, or a s, solurrez aranto
		1 - 8 5/8 TEXAS PATTEN S 1 - SHOE JOINT	SHOE	
	*	1 - INSERT FLOAT		
	16.00 - 16:30	0.50 RIG DOWN CASING EQUI	PMENT	원래 이번 등이 참가는 그를 하다고요요!
		CIRCULATE		
		PARTY METING WITH	LALLÍBURTON	도 되는 것이 모든 물리에 가지 않는 말을 하고 있는 물질 위치를 되지 않는데, 모든 목표를 되었다.
		SAFETY MEETING WITH I		
	16:30 - 17:30	1.00 PUMED 144 BBLS(600 SA	CKS) OF 14.8 PPG	PREMIUM PLUS CEMENT.
		DROP PLUG, DISPLACE 5 @ 295 PSI PRESSURE UF		•
		-2% CaCl2		
		-0.25 lbm/sk Poly-E-Fla -YIELD: 1.35 CUFT/SA		
		FULL RETURNS THROUG		
	47:00 100:00	GOT CEMENT BACK TO T		
	17:30 - 22:00 22:00 - 00:00	4.50 WAIT ON CEMENT TO CU	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	HEAD INSTALL FLANGE, VALVE, AND LINES TO CIRCULATE
	22.00 - 00.00	TO PIT OFF OF WELL HE		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
4	07/01/2011	5.00 - R/U BOP		
		- R/U MANDREL LANDING - R/U RISER AND FLOWLI		BOP TO 1,000#,FOR 30 MIN
	05:00 - 06:00	1.00 SAFETY MEETING WITH I		
		TILL AND DICK BUA		
		TIH , AND PICK BHA - 7 7/8 TRI-CONE BIT VAR	VEL	
		- FLOAT AND CROW FOO	T	
		- 6 1/2 DRILL COLLARS -	19 (589)	

10/1/2012 5:48:15PM 2

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 1833 071G

Project: BRAVO DOME

Site:

BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Event Name:

DEV DRILLING Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Start Date: 6/28/2011

		End Date: 7/4/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216
Date	Time Start-End	Hrs Op Details
	06:00 - 06:30	O FO THE TAX COMPANY AND ADDRESS OF THE TAX COMPANY AND ADDRES
		0.50 TIH TAG CEMENT @ 720'
<u> </u>	06:30 - 07:00	
•	07:00 - 07:30	0.50 TEST CASING TO 1000# PSI 30 MINUTES
		TEST GOOD
	07:30 - 09:00	1.50 DRILL OUT CEMENT AND PLUG
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00 DRILLED 7 7/8' PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 808' TO 923'
		115 FT, AVG. ROP = 115 FT/HR
		- PUMP RATE= 400 GPM
		- PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI
		- ROTARY = 100 - 120
		- WOB = 18- 22
		- TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500
		- TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2200
		MUD WT = 8.8 PPG VIS 29
		PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200' OR AS NEEDED
		FUNIF TO BBLS SWEEPS EVERT 200 OR AS NEEDED
		SAFETY BREAK: FORKLIFT SAFETY
	10:00 - 14:30	4.50 DRILLED 7.7/8' PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 923' TO 1293'
	10.00 - J4.00 C	370 FT, AVG. ROP = 82 FT/HR
		- PUMP RATE = 400 GPM
		- PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI
2000		ROTARY,= 100 = 120
*		WOB = 18- 22
		- TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500
16		TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2200
		MUD WT = 8.7 PPG-VIS 29
		PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200' OR AS NEEDED
		A COMPLETE CONTROL OF THE CONTROL OF
		SAFETY BREAK, BUFFER ZONE
	14:30 - 15:00	0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1272' = 2.000 DEGREE
	15:00 - 20:30	5.50 DRILLED 7.7/8 PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 1293' TO 1614"
* *,	13.00 - 20.30	321 FT, AVG. ROP = 58 FT/HR
and the second		420 V21 U1 (AV 91 KO) - 300 U1 (K)
100		보는데 <u>하는데 10년 1월 4일 11일</u> 에 대한 1일에 되는 것이 되는 사람이 되는 것이다. 그 사람이 되는 것이 되는 것이다. 하는
1		- PUMP RATE= 360 GPM
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI - ROTARY = 100 - 120
		PÜMP PRESSÜRE = 1000 PSI - RÖTARY = 100 - 120 - WOB = 20 - 25
		√PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI - RÖTARY = 100 - 120 - WOB = 20 - 25 - TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500
		√PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI - RÖTARY = 100 - 120 - WOB = 20 - 25 - TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 - TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2200
		√PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI - RÖTARY = 100 - 120 - WOB = 20 - 25 - TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI - ROTARY = 100 - 120 - WOB = 20 - 25 - TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 - TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 - #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8 7 PRG VIS 29
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2200 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200 OR AS NEEDED
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200 OR AS NEEDED. SAFETY BREAK BUFFER ZONE
	20:30 - 21:00	PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200 OR AS NEEDED. SAFETY BREAK BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE
	20:30 - 21:00 21:00 : 00:00	PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200 OR AS NEEDED. SAFETY BREAK BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY CIRCULATES HIVE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. WORKED PIPE
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7, PRG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200 OR AS NEEDED. SAFETY BREAK: BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY!= 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7.PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200! OR AS NEEDED SAFETY BREAK: BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR: MAX PULL 90 OVER.
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY!= 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200! OR AS NEEDED SAFETY BREAK: BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY. CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR: MAX PULL 90 OVER! SPOTTED HI-VIS PILL WITH NUT PLUG.
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY!= 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7.PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200! OR AS NEEDED SAFETY BREAK: BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR: MAX PULL 90 OVER.
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 2001 OR AS NEEDED SAFETY BREAK BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3,000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY (CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES, WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR: MAX PULL 90 OVER SPOTTED HI-VIS PILL WITH NUT PLUG. PULL 50 OVER AND SET 70 ON BIT WHILE APPLYING 1 WRAP OF TORQUE.
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200! OR AS NEEDED. SAFETY BREAK: BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY. CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR: MAX PULL 90 OVER. SPOTTED HI-VIS PILL WITH NUT PLUG. PULL 50 OVER AND SET 70 ON BIT WHILE APPLYING 1 WRAP OF TORQUE. DISPLACE HOLE WITH FRESH WATER
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200 OR AS NEEDED. SAFETY BREAK BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY. CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR: MAX PULL 90 OVER SPOTTED HI-VIS PILL WITH NUT PLUG. PULL 50 OVER AND SET 70 ON BIT WHILE APPLYING 1 WRAP OF TORQUE. DISPLACE HOLE WITH FRESH WATER WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR WHILE PULLING 50 OVER AND SETTING 70 ON BIT WITH 1 - 1 1/2 WRAPS
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSI ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2200 #1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200! OR AS NEEDED. SAFETY BREAK: BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY. CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR: MAX PULL 90 OVER. SPOTTED HI-VIS PILL WITH NUT PLUG. PULL 50 OVER AND SET 70 ON BIT WHILE APPLYING 1 WRAP OF TORQUE. DISPLACE HOLE WITH FRESH WATER
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSi ROTARY = 100 - 120 ROTARY = 100 ROTARY = 1
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSi ROTARY = 100 - 120 WOB = 20 - 25 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500 TORQUE OF BOTTOM = 2500 "#1 PUMP DOWN SWITCH #2 PUMP MUD WT = 8.7 PPG VIS 29 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 200 OR AS NEEDED SAFETY BREAK BUFFER ZONE 0.50 PJSM - RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1584' = 3.000 DEGREE 3.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR MAX PULL 90 OVER SPOTTED HI-VIS PILL WITH NUT PLUG PULL 50 OVER AND SET 70 ON BIT WHILE APPLYING 1 WRAP OF TORQUE. DISPLACE HOLE WITH FRESH WATER WORKED PIPE FOR 1 HOUR WHILE PULLING 50 OVER AND SETTING 70 ON BIT WITH 1 - 1 1/2 WRAPS OF TORQUE. PULL 50 OVER AND LET SET 5 MINUTES WITH TORQUE IN PIPE. SET AT STRING WEIGHT AND
		PUMP PRESSURE = 1000 PSi ROTARY = 100 - 120 ROTARY = 100 R

10/1/2012 5:48:15PM

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 1833 071G

200

10:30 - 11:00

22:30 - 23:30

DEV DRILLING

Project: **BRAVO DOME** Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

BRAVO DOME CO2 UNIT Site

#

Start Date: 6/28/2011

	End Date:	7/4/2011	Rig Name:	TRINIDAD 216
Hrs Op Details				

	Start-End		
્5	07/02/2011 00:00 - 06:00	6.00 STUCK AFTER SURVEY, CIRCULATES FINE WITH NO LOSSES OR PRESSURE SPIKES. SPOTTED	2
		DIFFERENT RILLS AROUND COLLARS, NO SOLUTION	. :

CALL FOR WIRLINE TRUCK & FISHERMAN, WORKING PIPE, KICK IN PUMP EVERY 15 MIN. TO CIRC.

PUMP

SAFETY BREAK: STAY OFF FLOOR WHILE WORKING PIPE

06:00 - 10:30 4.50 WORK PIPE, KICK END EVERY 15 MIN TO CIRC. PUMP WAIT ON WIRELINE TRUCK & FISHERMAN

	SAFETY BREAK: WEAR PROPER PPE
0.50	UNLOADED AND SPOT PILL

	11.00 - 11.30	0.50 WORK PIPE FREE, CIRCULATED, BOTTOMS UP
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50 WORK ON MUD PUMP, AIR PUMP OUT
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50 CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP
	12:30 - 22:00	9.50 DRILLED 7 7/8' PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 1614' TO 2079"
٠.	and the second	- 1915年 465.FT, AVG.,ROP:= 49.FT/HR (月) (「) 1915年 (日)

- PUMP RATE= 360 GPM
- PUMP PRESSURE = 850 PSI
- ROTARY = 100 120
- WOB = 25 28
- TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500.
- TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2200

MUD WT = 8.7 PRG VIS 29

PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 90' OR AS NEEDED

SAFETY BREAK: FORKLIFT SAFETY

22:00 - 22:30	0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY 30' OFF BOTTOM
---------------	-------------------------------------

1.00 STUCK PIPE AT 2049 SPOT 25 BBL FRESH WATER, WORK PIPE, GOT UNSTUCK 23:30 - 00:00 0.50 WORK PIPE, 5 TO 10k OVER DRAG, PULL 100 BBL MUD TO PREMIX PIT, ADD 5 DRISPAC AND BLEED

INTO SYSTEM.

6 07/03/2011 00:00 - 01:00 1.00 BACK REAM HOLE UNTIL DRAG DISSIPATES

01:00 - 06:00 5.00 DRILLED 7 7/8' PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 2079' TO 2270'

191 FT, AVG. ROP = 38 FT/HR

- PUMP RATE= 360 GPM
- PUMP PRESSURE = 875 PSI
- ROTARY = 100 120
- WOB = 30 35
- TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2500
- TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2200

MUD WT = 9.4 PPG VIS 34

PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 90' OR AS NEEDED

SAFETY STAND DOWN: FROM ROB LOVELADY

- HAMMER SLIPPED
- MOVING EQUIPMENT
- NIPPLING UP
- DISCUSS PINCH POINT BUFFER ZONES

OXY USA INC Operation Summary Report Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 1833 071G Event Name: **DEV DRILLING** Project: **BRAVO DOME** Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT Site: BRAVO DOME C02 LINIT Start Date: 6/28/2011 End Date: 7/4/2011 TRINIDAD 216 Rig Name: Time Hrs Date # Op Details Start-End 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 DRILLED 7 7/8' PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 2270' TO 2420' 150 FT, AVG. ROP = 38 FT/HR - PUMP RATE= 360 GPM - PUMP PRESSURE = 890 PSI - ROTARY = 100 - 120 - WOB = 30 - TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2700 - TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2500 MUD WT = 9.4 PPG VIS 34 PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 90' OR AS NEEDED SAFETY BREAK: PINCH POINT, STAY FOCUS 10:00 - 14:00 4:00 DRILLED 7:7/8' PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 2420' TO 2523' 103 FT, AVG. ROP = 26 FT/HR ENCOUNTERED THE TOP OF THE CIMARRON AT 2430. THE TOP OF THE TUBB WAS AT 2453'. PUMP RATE= 360 GPM PUMP PRESSURE = 900 PSI - ROTARY = 100 - WOB = 30 TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2800 TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2500 PRIOR TO ENTER CIMARRON MUD CHECK - MUD WT = 9.3 PPG IN, 9.4 OUT, VIS 28 , 10 PH KCL 7.% - TOP OF CIMARRON 2430' - TOP OF TUBB 2453' PUMP 10 BBLS SWEEPS EVERY 90 OR AS NEEDED SAFETY BREAK: WORKING IN HOT CONDITIONS / STAYING HYDRATED 1.50 DRILLED 7 7/8' PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 2523' TO 2593' TD 14:00 - 15:30 70 FT, AVG. ROP = 47 FT/HR - PUMP RATE= 360 GPM - PUMP PRESSURE = 900 PSI - ROTARY = 100 - WOB = 30 - 35 - TORQUE ON BOTTOM = 2800 - TORQUE OFF BOTTOM = 2500 - SAFETY STAND DOWN: FROM ROB LOVELADY - TRUCK DRIVER STEP OFF TRAILER FELL 3' TO 10' NO JSA STOP JOB AUTHORITY 15:30 - 16:00 0.50 PUMP 30 BBLS SWEEPS CONDITION HOLE FOR TOOH 16:00 - 19:00 3.00 SAFETY MEETING WITH WITH CREW ABOUT TOH, DROP SURVEY AND TOH. TOH, FROM 2593' 19:00 - 20:00 1.00 PULL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER, R/U-TOP DRIVE, BALES AND ELEVATORS TO RUN PROD. CASING 20:00 - 23:00 3.00 RUN GUIDE SHOE, SHOE JT, FLOAT INSERT, 67 JTS 5.5" PROD. CASING 23:00 - 00:00 1.00 INSTALLED MANDREL FOR LANDING, TRIED TO GO TO BOTTOM TO LAND. ACTED LIKE FILL, PICKED, UP CIRCULATING SUB FOR TOP DRIVE AND DISCOVERED STUCK PIPE AT 2570. WORKED PIPE UP... AND DOWN, 50K OVER AND 50K OVER GOING DOWN, WORKED PIPE 30 MINUTES. SPOTTED 50 BBL. FRESH WATER IN ANNULAR NO POSITIVE RESULTS: KEEP WORKING PIPE. 7 07/04/2011 00:00 - 06:00 6.00 WORKING STUCK 5.5" PROD CASING. SPOTTED PIPE LAX PILL. PULLING 100K OVER AND WORKING DOWN 50K.

10/1/2012 5:48:15PM

Operation Summary Report

Well:	BRAVO DOME UNIT 1833 07	IG Eve	nt Name:	DEV DRILLING			
Proiect:	BRAVO DOME			ORIG DRILL VERT			
Site:	BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT		t Date:	6/28/2011			
			Date:	7/4/2011	Rig Nan	ne: TRINIDAD 216	
#	Date Time H	Irs Op Details				And the second second	
	Start-End						
	06:00 - 10:30			OD CASING, KICK IN OM DEPTH AT 2570'	PUMP EVERY 15 MIN. , G	OOD CIRCULATION, STUCK 5	
	•			ROM ROB LOVELAD	Y		
		- HAMMER SLIP - MOVING EQUI					
		- NIPPLING UP	I WILLIAM				
			CH POINT I	BUFFER ZONES			
	10:30 - 11:00	0.50 PJSM RIG-UP H	ALLIBURT	ON			
		CIDCI II ATE AN	D CONDIT	ION HOLE FOR CEME	NT IOP		
		DROP BALL	D COMBIT	ION FOLE FOR CEIVE	INT JOB.		
		and the second s	NG WITH A	ALL PERSONEL ON LO	CATION		
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00 CEMENT 5 1/2"	CASING A	S FOLLOWS:			
		PRESSURE TES	ST LINES T	O 2500 PSI			
		PUMPED 20 BB	L FRESH V	WATER SPACER			
		LEAD CEMENT:					
				S WITH 2% CACL 300	SACKS		
		- 0.25 LBM/SAC					
		- YIELD: 3.25 CI					
		- SLURRY VOL	JME: 1/3 B	BRIZ			
		TAIL CEMENT:					
					CC I-FLAKE, 150 SACKS		
		- SLURRY VOLU					
		- 0.25 LBM/SAC - YIELD: 1.85 CI					
		11223. 1.03 (1	<i>>1 1707</i> 1011				
		DISPLACE WITI	1 55 BBL C	F FRESH WATER			
		- PUMPED AT 8					
		- BUMP PLUG @ - FLOAT HELD .		// 400 PSI, 600 OVER I	FOR 5 MIN		
				5 BBLS OF CEMENT 1	O PIT		
		- CIP @ 11:51	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	0 2 2 2 0 0 0 0 2 1 1 2 1 1 1			
	12:00:- 13:00	1:00 POST - JOB SA	FETY MEE	TING			
		RIG DOWN HAL	LIBURTON	N .			
	13:00 - 14:30	·····		ET CASING SLIP IN W	ÆLL HEAD	**************************************	
	14:30 - 20:00	5.50 RIGGING DOW	٧				
		CLEAN PITS	NEVT	ATION & SOCIETA			
1		KELEASED TO	INEXT LOC	ATION @ 20:00 HRS			

PREPARING TO MOVE TO NEXT LOCATION

10/1/2012 5:48:15PM