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McMillan, Michael, EMNRD

From: Richard Hill <rhill@wellconsultant.com>
Sent: Saturday, July 27, 2019 1:43 PM
To: McMillan, Michael, EMNRD; hill.richie@gmail.com; Goetze, Phillip, EMNRD; Lowe, Leonard, EMNRD; 

Jones, William V, EMNRD; Murphy, Kathleen A, EMNRD
Subject: RE: [EXT] FW: OCD Receipt of Fee Application Payment
Attachments: C-108_WJD7.pdf

Please see the attachment with the requested data, I also fixed the date on the signature line due to the last two digits 
getting cut off.  Have a good weekend!!! 
 
 
 

BC&D Operating, Inc 
Richard Hill 
SVP Engineering 
(405)837‐8147 
rhill@wellconsultant.com 
 

From: McMillan, Michael, EMNRD <Michael.McMillan@state.nm.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2019 11:47 AM 
To: hill.richie@gmail.com; Goetze, Phillip, EMNRD <Phillip.Goetze@state.nm.us>; Lowe, Leonard, EMNRD 
<Leonard.Lowe@state.nm.us>; Jones, William V, EMNRD <WilliamV.Jones@state.nm.us>; Murphy, Kathleen A, EMNRD 
<KathleenA.Murphy@state.nm.us> 
Cc: Richard Hill <rhill@wellconsultant.com> 
Subject: RE: [EXT] FW: OCD Receipt of Fee Application Payment 
 
Richard: 
Your application is suspended until you provide the OCD with the following information: 
Who is the lessor of the NE/4 NW/4 of Section 30? 
 
Mike 
 
Michael McMillan 
1220  South St. Francis 
Santa Fe, New Mexico 
505‐476‐3448 
Michael.mcmillan@state.nm.us 
 

From: hill.richie@gmail.com <hill.richie@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2019 9:25 AM 
To: McMillan, Michael, EMNRD <Michael.McMillan@state.nm.us>; Goetze, Phillip, EMNRD 
<Phillip.Goetze@state.nm.us>; Lowe, Leonard, EMNRD <Leonard.Lowe@state.nm.us>; Jones, William V, EMNRD 
<WilliamV.Jones@state.nm.us>; Murphy, Kathleen A, EMNRD <KathleenA.Murphy@state.nm.us> 
Cc: Richard Hill <rhill@wellconsultant.com> 
Subject: [EXT] FW: OCD Receipt of Fee Application Payment 
 
Good Morning, 
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I wanted to bring it your attention that the payment portal is not linked or has a corrupt link.  In the Fee application page 
when “upload document” is selected, it will allow you to upload the document but does not send you to the payment 
portal only an error message.  The end result has a PO number assigned to a application attachment with a pending 
payment and no options are given on how to make payment.  I selected the “mail or hand deliver option” and the 
payment portal is available…  I went through the process of making payment with my Visa and it worked; but there is no 
option to attach the application at this point.  I spoke with Daniel Sanchez about the issue and informed him we had the 
same result on other computers and user names.  I apologize in advance for any in confusion into this matter but, I do 
think the new system will work great and streamline the process once all the bugs are worked out. 
 
 
I attached the receipt for payment as well as the application for the West Jal Deep SWD #7 for reference when looking 
into this matter.  A hard copy of the application was received last week; attached is a conformation email that was sent 
to me a few days ago. 
 
Thank You 
 
Richard Hill 
(405) 837‐8147 
 
 
 
 

From: OCDOnline@state.nm.us <OCDOnline@state.nm.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2019 9:20 AM 
To: hill.richie@gmail.com 
Subject: OCD Receipt of Fee Application Payment 
 

Thank you for your fee application payment! Your receipt is attached.  
 

PO Number:   NWTIV‐190725‐C‐1080 

Payment Date:   7/25/2019  

Payment Amount: $500.00  

Payment Type:   Credit Card  

Application Type:   Application for a fluid injection well permit. 

Fee Amount:   $500.00  

Application Status: Pending Document Delivery  

OGRID:   25670  

First Name: Richard  

Last Name:  Hill  

Email:   hill.richie@gmail.com 

IMPORTANT: If you are mailing or delivering your application, you must print and 
include your receipt of payment as the first page on your application. All mailed and 
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delivered applications must be sent to the following address: 1220 S. St. Francis Dr., 
Santa Fe, NM 87505. For inquiries, reference the PO Number listed above. 
 
 
Oil Conservation Division * 1220 South St. Francis Drive * Santa Fe, New Mexico 87505  
(505) 476‐3441 * ocd.fees@state.nm.us * 
https://clicktime.symantec.com/3GVATDhY1KumcHsxp2D1pft7Vc?u=www.emnrd.state.nm.us%2FOCD  
 
 
This is an automated email please do not reply.  
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