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NOTICES 
NEW MEXICO ENERGY, 

MINERALS AND NATURAL 
RESOURCES DEPARTMENT 

OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION 
P.O.BoX 2088 

Santa Fe, New Mexico 87504 

The State of New Mexico by its Oil Conser­
vation Commission hereby gives notice pur­
suant to law and Rules and Regulations of 
said Commission promulgated thereunder 
of the following public hearing to be held at 
9:00 A.M. on THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 
1994 and THURSDAY, MARCH 10,1994, in 
Morgan Hall, State Land Office Building, 
Santa Fe, New Mexico. If you are an indi­
vidual with a disability who is in need of a 
reader, amplifier, qualified sign language 
interpreter, or any other form of auxiliary 
aid or service to attend or participate in the 
hearing, please contact Florene Davidson at 
505 827-5802 or through the New Mexico 
Relay Network 1-800-659-1779 by January 
31, 1994. Public documents, including the 
agenda and minutes, can be provided in 
various accessible forms. Please contact 
Floren Davidson if a summary or other type 
of accessible form is needed. 

STATE OF NEW MEXICO TO: 
All named parties and persons 
having any right, title, interest 
or claim in the following case 

and notice to the public. 

CASE 10907: 

In the matter of the hearing called by 
the Oil Conservation Division to amend 

Rules 1111, 1112, and 1115 of its General 
Rules and Regulations. The Oil Conserva­
tion Division seeks to amend its General 
Rules and Regulations to provide for the 
riling of Forms C - l l l , C-112, and C-115, 
respectively, on the last business day of the 
month following the month of production 
and to provide for the imposition of penal­
ties for failure to file timely and accurate 
reports. 

Given under the Seal of the State of 
New Mexico Oil Conservation Commission 
at Santa Fe, New Mexico, on this 19th day of 
January, 1994. 

STATE OF NEW MEXICO 
OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION 

WILLIAM J. LEMAY, Director 

S E A L 

NEW MEXICO 
ENVIRONMENTAL 

IMPROVEMENT BOARD 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING TO 
CONSIDER THE AMENDMENTS TO 
THE SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT 

REGULATIONS 

The New Mexico Environmental Improve­
ment Board will hold a public hearing on 

April 5,6, and 7,1994 beginning at 9:00 a.m. 
at the Harold Runnels Building Auditorium, 
1190 St. Francis Drive, Santa Fe, New Mexico, 
to consider the amendments to the Solid 
Waste Management Regulations. 

The proponent of the amendments is the 
New Mexico Environment Department The 
Proposed plan may be reviewedduring regu­
lar business hours at the office of the Envi­
ronmental Improvement Board, Harold Run­
nels Building Rm. S4310, 1190 St Francis 
Drive, Santa Fe, New Mexico and copies 
may be obtained by contacting F'^/icis 
Martinez, Clerk Specialist, Solid Waste Bu­
reau Rm. S2050, P.O. Box 26110, Santa Fe, 
New Mexico, 87502, telephone number 827-
0186. 

The hearing will be held in accordance with 
the Environmental Improvement Act, NMSA 
1978 Section 74-1-9 (Repl. Pamp. 1993) and 
the Board's Guidelines Governing Hearings. 

All interested persons will be given a rea­
sonable opportunity at the hearing to sub­
mit relevant evidence, data, views, and ar­
guments, orally or in writing, to introduce 
exhibits and to examine witnesses. Persons 
desiring to present technical testimony shall 
submit to the Board a written statement of 
intent to do so. Any person who will para­
phrase, summarize or read from a prepared 
statement must submit the written testimony 
together with the statement of intent. The 
notice of intent shall include: 

name and qualification of each technical 
witness; 

the name of the person proffering the 
witness; 
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