From: Smith, Cory, EMNRD

To: jdeal@hilcorp.com
Cc: Devin Hencmann; Ashley Ager; "Josh Adams"
Subject: RE: OCD Receipt of Fee Application Payment
Date: Tuesday, August 4, 2020 2:30:00 PM
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Jennifer,

OCD is requesting additional information for the remediation and work plan for the FRPC 4-1
incident# nCS1929541151

Please provide the following information via email in an a pdf that can be attached to the original
report.

Siting criteria

Depth to water determination

Sampling map/results of the 42 samples that HEC collected prior to utilizing LTE to drill BH 1-
8.

o Only need the deepest/widest samples so for example if there was a sample at 2 feet
and it was removed please don’t include it. However if in the same area there was a
sample at 8ft and it was not removed please include it.

Include any additional photos HEC may have of areas near BH-6 that may assisnt in

Please provide the requesting information as the siting and depth to water information are required,
and the additional sampling results and any photos will assist OCD in making an educated
determination of delineation.

Please provide the additional information no later than August 28, 2020.
Thank you,

Cory Smith

Environmental Specialist

Oil Conservation Division

Energy, Minerals, & Natural Resources
1000 Rio Brazos, Aztec, NM 87410
(505)334-6178 ext 115

cory.smith@state.nm.us

From: Josh Adams <jadams@Itenv.com>

Sent: Friday, May 1, 2020 10:24 AM

To: Smith, Cory, EMNRD <Cory.Smith@state.nm.us>; jdeal@hilcorp.com

Cc: Devin Hencmann <dhencmann@ltenv.com>; Ashley Ager <aager@Itenv.com>
Subject: [EXT] FW: OCD Receipt of Fee Application Payment
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All,

The Remediation Work Plan for the FRPC 4-1 (NCS$192954115) has been submitted through the
NMOCD portal. Below is the confirmation email and attached is the receipt. Please let me know if
you have questions. Thank you.

Joshua G. Adams, G.I.T.
= , Staff Geologist
970.456.5750 cell
q 970.385.1096 direct

848 East Second Avenue Durango, CO 81301

www.ltenv.com
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disclosure.

From: OCDOnline@state.nm.us <OCDOnline@state.nm.us>
Sent: Friday, May 1, 2020 10:17 AM

To: Josh Adams <jadams@Itenv.com>

Subject: OCD Receipt of Fee Application Payment

Thank you for your fee application payment! Your receipt is attached.

PO Number: 0547T-200501-C-1410
Payment Date:  5/1/2020

Payment Amount: $150.00

Payment Type: Credit Card

L Application for administrative approval of a release notification and corrective
Application Type:

action.
Fee Amount: $150.00
Application
pplicat Under OCD Review
Status:

OGRID: 372171
First Name: Josh

Last Name: Adams

Email: jadams@I|tenv.com

IMPORTANT: If you are mailing or delivering your application, you must
print and include your receipt of payment as the first page on your
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application. All mailed and delivered applications must be sent to the
following address: 1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505. For
inquiries, reference the PO Number listed above.

Oil Conservation Division * 1220 South St. Francis Drive * Santa Fe, New Mexico 87505
(505) 476-3441 * ocd.fees@state.nm.us * www.emnrd.state.nm.us/OCD

This is an automated email please do not reply.
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