New Mexico

Energy Minerals and Natural Resources Department

Form C-140

Revised 06/99

<u>District 1</u> - (505) 393-6161 1625 N. French Dr, Hobbs, NM 88240 <u>District II</u> - (505) 748-1283 1301 W. Grand Avenue, Artesia, NM 88210 District III - (505) 334-6178 1000 Rio Brazos Road, Aztec, NM 87410 District IV - (505) 476-3440 1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505

VII.

Oil Conservation Division 1220 South St. Francis Dr. Santa Fe, New Mexico 87505 (505) 476-3440

SUBMIT ORIGINAL **PLUS 2 COPIES TO APPROPRIATE** DISTRICT OFFICE

APPLICATION FOR WELL WORKOVER PROJE

I.	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1										
Operate	r name addre	Burlingto		ces Oil and Gas gton, NM 8749			, ,	OGRID Numbe	014538		
Contac	Party .	Leslie D	. White					Phone 5	505/326-9700		
Prope	ty Name				Well Number			API Number			
(CANYON L	ARGO UNIT			254			3003920807			
UL	Section	Township	Range	Feet From The	Fe	et From The		Count	County		
Α	13	25 N	6 W	1150	1150 FNL 850 FEL			RIO ARRIBA			
II.	Workov	er	1					<u>.</u>			
Date W	orkover Comm	ence	6/12/2003			ior to Workove	r):				
Date W	orkover Compl	6/12/2003 BASIN DAKOTA Attach a description of the Workover Procedures performed to increase production.									
		County of Leslie 1. I a 2. I h ava 3. To cur	of <u>San Juan</u> of <u>San Juan</u> of <u>Note</u> of the Operat ave made, or allable for this the best of m we and/or tab	being first of the core of the	epresentative of e, a diligent sea application and	the Opera	tor, of the ab- production re	cords reasonably	/eli.		
		iture <i>His</i>	Well Number 254 3003920807 Range Feet From The Feet From The County 6 W 1150 FNL 850 FEL RIO ARRIBA Previous Producting Pool(s) (Prior to Workover): BASIN DAKOTA dition of the Workover Procedures performed to increase production. tion decline curve or table showing at least twelve months of production prior to the workover and on this of production following the workover reflecting a positive production increase. of New Mexico) ss. ty of San Juan sale D. White 1 am the Operator, or authorized representative of the Operator, of the above-referenced Well. I have made, or caused to be made, a diligent search of the production records reasonably available for this Well. To the best of my knowledge, this application and the data used to prepare the production curve and/or table for this Well are complete and accurate. LLL L. White Title St. Accountant Date Holl AND SWORN TO before me this Let day of Language. Notary Public Supplementary Publi								
	My Commission expires:									Phone 505/326-9700 Weil Number	
FC IV	R OIL CO CEI This Div Sec	NSERVATION SERVATION SERVATION IS Application hereby	ONDIVISION OF APPR is hereby ap verifies the d Taxation and	N USE ONLY: OVAL: proved and the abata shows a positive Revenue Department	ove-referenced	ncrease. B	y copy herec	of, the Division n	otifies the		
S	ignature Di	strict Supervi	sor }	5.7	OCD Distri	ict .	3		4/2/04 Date	<u> </u>	

DATE OF NOTIFICATION TO THE SECRETARY OF THE TAXATION AND REVENUE DEPARTMENT:

BASIN DAKOTA

REG_DTL_D		
6/1/2002	1612	
7/1/2002	1600	
8/1/2002	1524	
9/1/2002	1683	
10/1/2002	1299	
11/1/2002	1543	
12/1/2002	1561	
1/1/2003	1394	
2/1/2003	1592	
3/1/2003	1941	
4/1/2003	1500	
5/1/2003	1977	
6/1/2003	1857	
7/1/2003	2487	
8/1/2003	2277	
9/1/2003	2119	

BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS

Page 1 of 1

Operations Summary Report

Contractor Name:

Legal Well Name: CANYON LARGO UNIT #254
Common Well Name: CANYON LARGO UNIT #254

Event Name:

FACILITIES

TJR WELL SERVICE

Start:

06/12/2003

Spud Date: 04/20/1974 End: 06/14/2003

Rig Release: 06/14/2003 Group:

Rig Name:	•	TJR				Rig Number: 4
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
06/13/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	22	b	OBJECT	ROAD CREW LOC. SERVICE & START RIG
	07:00 - 07:15	0.25		а	OBJECT	15 MIN SAFETY MEETING
	07:15 - 11:00	3.75		b	OBJECT	MOVE RIG & EQUIPMENT TO LOC.
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	01	а	OBJECT	RIG UP ON WELL TBG 350 PSI CASING 360 PSI
	12:00 - 13:30	1.50		b	OBJECT	BLEED CASING DOWN TO RIG PIT
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	1	b	OBJECT	PUMP 15 BBL DOWN TBG
	14:00 - 15:30	1.50	01	а	OBJECT	ND WELL HEAD NU BOP & RIG EQUIPMENT CHANG OVER TO 1 1/2" EQUIPMENT
	15:30 - 16:30	1.00		b	OBJECT	PULL UP ON TBG STRING COULD NOT GO DOWN W/ TBG
	16:30 - 19:00	2.50	22	b	OBJECT	TOOH LAY DOWN 1 1/2" TBG STAING 242 JTS CLOSED IN SHUT DOWN
06/14/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	22	b	OBJECT	ROAD CREW TO LOC. SERVICE & START RIG
	07:00 - 07:15	0.25	22	a	OBJECT	15 MIN SAFETY MEETING
	07:15 - 11:30	4.25		b	OBJECT	PICK UP 3 7/8" MILL & 2 3/8" TBG TIH TAG FILL @ 7174' 6' OF BOTTOM PERFS COVERED
	11:30 - 14:30	3.00		b	OBJECT	CLEAN OUT W/ AIR & 12 BPH MIST FROM 7174' TO 7250' PBTD PUMP 2= 5 BBL SWEEPS TO CLEAN UP WELL
	14:30 - 15:30	1.00		b	OBJECT	PULL UP TO 6907' FLOW WELL NATURALLLY TO FLOW BACK TANK UP TBG WELL WOULD NOT FLOW UP TBG
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50		b	OBJECT	TIH TAG NO FILL
	16:00 - 18:00	2.00		a	OBJECT	TOOH LAY DOWN MILL
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00		b	OBJECT	TIH W/ 50 STANDS PROD TBG CLOSED IN SHUT DOWN
06/15/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00		b	OBJECT	ROAD CREW TO LOC. SERVICE & START RIG
	07:00 - 07:15	0.25		a	OBJECT	15 MIN SAFETY MEETING
	07:15 - 09:00	1.75		b	OBJECT	BROACH 50 STANDS TBG TIH BROACH TBG OK
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00		b	OBJECT	LAND TBG ON HANGER @ 7132' ND BOP NU WELL HEAD
	10:00 - 10:30	0.50		b	OBJECT	PUMP OUT CHECK @ 750 PSI BLOW WELL 15 MIN
	10:30 - 12:00	1.50	01	b	OBJECT	RIG DOWN NIPPLE DOWN PUMP LINES AIR EQUIP SHUT DOWN.
						WELL SUMMARY
						MOVE IN RIG UP BLOW DOWN ND NU LAY DOWN 242 JTS 1 1/2"
				1		TBG PICKED UP 2 3/8" TBG CLEAN OUT 76' OF FILL FLOW WELL
						TO TANK TIH TAG NO FILL TOOH TIH W/ BHA & 2 3/8" TBG LAND
						ON HANGER @ 7132' ND NU PUMP CHECK OFF RIG DOWN
						SENT 242 JTS 1 1/2" TBG TO BR YARD 5 JTS FROM CANYON LARGO 254 TO JOHNSTON A COM #5
			!			

Printed: 03/29/2004 10:10:45 AM