New Mexico Energy Minerals and Natural Resources Department

Form C-140 Revised 06/99

<u>District I</u> - (505) 393-6161 1625 N. French Dr, Hobbs, NM 88240 <u>District II</u> - (505) 748-1283 1301 W. Grand Avenue, Artesia, NM 88210 <u>District III</u> - (505) 334-6178 1000 Rio Brazos Road, Aztec, NM 87410 <u>District IV</u> - (505) 476-3440 1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505 Oil Conservation Division 1220 South St. Francis Dr. Santa Fe, New Mexico 87505 (505) 476-3440

SUBMIT ORIGINAL PLUS 2 COPIES TO APPROPRIATE DISTRICT OFFICE

APPLICATION FOR WELL WORKOVER PROJECT

					VVLLL V	CINICI	EIV I IVOOLO				
i .	Operator	and Well						- XI ş.	Serve to the Server		
Operat	or name addre	Buriingt	on Resourc		OGRID Number 014538 Phone 505/326-9700 API Number 3004508779						
Contac	t Party	Leslie l	D. White								
	rty Name										
	GRENIER I	B 		T	1						
UL	Section	Township	Range	Feet From The	1	et From The	·	Coun			
G	04	29 N	10 W	1650	FNL	1700	FEL	SA	N JUAN		
II.	Workov	ver									
Date V	Vorkover Comm	nence	7/10/2003	:							
					AZTEC PICTURED CLIFFS (GAS)						
Date V	Vorkover Comp	leted:	7/21/2003								
	SŬB	Les 1. I 2. I av 3. To cu for	of San Juan lie D. White am the Opera have made, o vailable for this of the best of murve and/or tal or this Well are ND SWORN Texpires:), being first tor, or authorized r r caused to be made s Well. ny knowledge, this	de, a diligent sea application and to curate. Title <u>Sr. Acco</u> day of _	the Operator rch of the phe data use	or, of the above- roduction recorded to prepare the Date 4/1/04	is reasonabl	y		
F	'. CE Thi	RTIFICATI is Application	IONDIVISIO ON OF APPR on is hereby ap	N USE ONLY:	oove-referenced	well is desi	gnated a Well V	Vorkover Pro	oject and the		

Ν

	AZTEC PICTURED CLIFF	S
REG_DTL_D	(GAS)	
7/1/2002	537	
8/1/2002	473	
9/1/2002	396	•
10/1/2002	414	•
11/1/2002	470	
12/1/2002	25	
1/1/2003	386	
2/1/2003	447	
3/1/2003	449	
4/1/2003	295	
5/1/2003	193	
6/1/2003	303	
7/1/2003	117	
8/1/2003	1628	
9/1/2003	2785	
10/1/2003	2528	

Monday, March 29, 2004 QUALIFY: Y JUL 2003

Page 1 of 4

BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

Contractor Name:

GRENIER B #1 Common Well Name: GRENIER B #1

Event Name:

CAP WORKOVER

Start:

07/10/2003

Spud Date: 03/30/1956

07/21/2003

End:

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

Rig Release: 07/21/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

AZTEC

Rig Number: 449

Sub Date From - To Hours Code Phase **Description of Operations** Code 07/11/2003 13:00 - 15:00 2.00 RRSR MIRU WELD ON RIG . 15:00 - 15:30 0.50 MIMO MIRU ROAD RIG FROM HARE # 12 TO GRENIER B # 1. 15:30 - 16:30 1.00 RURD MIRU a SPOT IN RIG & STAND UP DERRICK. 16:30 - 18:30 RURD 2.00 MIRU SPOT IN & RU REST OF EQUIP, LAY FLOWLINE, CSG HAD 150 PSI , TBG HAD 150 PSI . SDFD . 07/12/2003 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 SAFE OBJECT TRAV TO LOC, START RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON WEARING PPE, RIG CREW, AIR HAND, PKR HAND, CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT. 07:00 - 08:00 1.00 NUND OBJECT UNSCREW CAP, MU DRILLING FLANGE, NU BOP. 08:00 - 09:30 1.50 TRIP OBJECT POOH W/ 1" TBG. 09:30 - 11:00 1.50 TRIP OBJECT RIH W/ 5 1/2" RBP & SET @ 2330". 11:00 - 12:00 1.00 **PRES** OBJECT LOAD & CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN, PRESS TEST TO 1000 PSI, TEST FAILED, UNSET RBP & RESET @ 2300', RETEST CSG, TEST FAILED. 0.50 TRIP 12:00 - 12:30 OBJECT TOOH W/RH. 12:30 - 13:00 0.50 PRBU **OBJECT** PU & MU 5 1/2" FULLBORE PKR, SET PKR @ 60' & TEST WELLHEAD, TESTED GGOD. 13:00 - 13:30 0.50 TRIP OBJECT TIH W/ 5 1/2" FULLBORE PKR TO 1200'. 13:00 - 18:30 5.50 PRES **OBJECT** SET PKR @ 1200', TEST DOWN TBG FAILED , GOOD TEST ON ANNULUS, TIH TO TOP OF RBP, SET PKR, TEST RBP & PKR. TESTED GOOD , PULL PKR UP HOLE 2 STANDS @ A TIME , FOUND HOLE IN CSG FROM 1420 TO 1390'. 18:30 - 19:00 0.50 SHDN **OBJECT** PULL 2 JOINTS , SHUT & LOCK PIPE RAMS , MU & SHUT TIW VALVE, PU TOOLS & LOC, FUEL UP RIG, SDFD. 07/15/2003 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 SAFE **OBJECT** TRAV TO LOC , START RIG , HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PINCH POINTS, RIG CREW, AIR HAND, PKR HAND, CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT. 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 TRIP **OBJECT** TOOH W/ PKR. TRIP 07:30 - 08:00 0.50 **OBJECT** TIH & LATCH & UNSET RBP @ 2300'. 08:00 - 08:30 0.50 TRIP **OBJECT** TOOH W/ RBP а 08:30 - 09:00 0.50 TRIP а **OBJECT** TIH W/ 5 1/2" CIBP & SET @ 2300'. 09:00 - 09:30 0.50 TRIP OBJECT TOOH W/ SETTING TOOL . а 09:30 - 10:00 0.50 TRIP **OBJECT** TIH W/ 5 1/2" FULLBORE PKR & SET @ 1450'. 10:00 - 10:15 **PRES** 0.25 **OBJECT** а PRESS TEST CIBP TO 1500 PSI, TESTED GOOD. 10:15 - 10:30 0.25 TRIP **OBJECT** TOH TO 1233' & SET PKR, LOAD ANNULUS & PUT 500 PSI. а 10:30 - 12:00 1.50 WAIT OBJECT WAIT ON CEMENT CREW FROM TOWN. 12:00 - 13:30 1.50 RURD **OBJECT** SPOT IN & RU CEMENT LINE. a 0.25 PRES 13:30 - 13:45 **OBJECT** HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON SQUEEZING CSG, RIG CREW, PKR HAND , CEMENT CREW , CONSULTANT , BR RIG SUPER WERE PRESENT, PRESS TEST LINES TO 2500 PSI, TESTED GOOD. 13:45 - 15:00 1.25 CEMT **OBJECT** GET INJECTION RATE OF 2 BPM @ 745 PSI , PUMP 35 BLLS OF 14.5# TYPE 3 CEMENT W/ 2% CACL @ 2 BPM @ 950 PSI , SHUT DOWN, WASH PUMP & LINES, DISPLACE W/ 6 BLLS OF FRESH WTR @ 1.4 BPM @ 500 PSI, WOC FOR 30 MIN, UNSET PKR, PULL PKR TO 960', RESET PKR, PUMP 1/2 BBL PRESS UP TO 465, SHUT DOWN, WATCH PRESS, PRESS STAYING @ 450 PSI, SHUT IN VALVE 15:00 - 16:00 1.00 SHDN OBJECT RD PUMP LINE, LOCK PIPE RAMS, PU TOOLS & LOC, FUEL UP RIG , SDFD . 07/16/2003 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 SAFE **OBJECT** TRAV TO LOC , START RIG , HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON DO CEMENT, RIG CREW, PKR HAND, CONSULTANT WERE **PRESENT** 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 TRIP OBJECT BLEED OFF 250 PSI, UNSET PKR, TOOH W/ PKR.

Printed: 03/29/2004 4:03:00 PM

Page 2 of 4

BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: GRENIER B #1
Common Well Name: GRENIER B #1

Event Name:

CAP WORKOVER

07/10/2003

Spud Date: 03/30/1956

Contractor Name:

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

Start: Rig Release: 07/21/2003 End: 07/21/2003 Group:

Rig Name:

AZTEC

Rig Number: 449

rig name.		ALIEU		9 -		Rig Number: 449
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
07/16/2003	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	TRIP	а	OBJECT	TIH W/ 4 3/4" BIT , TAG TOP OF CEMENT @ 1230'.
	08:00 - 14:30	6.50	DRLG	а	OBJECT	DO CEMENT FROM 1230' TO 1465', CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN,
						PRESS TEST CSG TO 1000 PSI , TESTED GOOD .
	14:30 - 15:00	· F	TRIP	а	OBJECT	HANG SWIVEL BACK, TIH TO 2300' TOP OF CIBP.
	15:00 - 18:30	3.50	DRLG	а	OBJECT	UNLOAD W/ AIR MIST , DO CIBP @ 2300', CHASE JUNK & CO TO
	10:00 10:00		TOID	1_	00 1505	PBTD @ 2447', HANG SWIVEL BACK .
	18:30 - 19:00 19:00 - 19:30		TRIP	a	OBJECT	TOOH W/ BIT .
07/17/2003	06:00 - 07:00		SAFE	a a	OBJECT	SHUT & LOCK BLINDS , PU TOOLS & LOC , FUEL UP RIG SDFD . TRAV TO LOC , START RIG , HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PU TBG .
0171772000	00.00 - 07.00	1.00	OAI L	a	OBSECT	RIG CREW, PKR HAND, CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT.
	07:00 - 08:30	1.50	TRIP	a	OBJECT	RIH W/ 5 1/2" FULLBORE PKR, PU 2 7/8" FRAC STRING SET PKR @
	000			-	ODULO.	1610'.
	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	NUND	а	ОВЈЕСТ	ND STRIPPING HEAD , NU FRAC MANDREL & FRAC VALVE .
	09:00 - 09:30	1	SAFE	a	OBJECT	HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON FRACING PC , FRAC CREW RIG
ļ		l	İ			CREW, PKR HAND, FRAC CONSULTANT, CONSULTANT WERE
					İ	PRESENT . PRESS TEST LINES TO 6000 PSI , TESTED GOOD .
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	FRAC	а	OBJECT	BREAK DOWN W/ 20# LINEAR GEL @ 383 PSI @ 3 BPM PUMPED
						3100 GAL 70 QUALITY FOAM PAD @ 40 BPM @ 2450 PSI , PUMPED
						APPROX 100,000# 20/40 BRADY SAND @ 1 TO 4 PPG SAND CONC
						@ 40 BPM @ 70 QUALITY FOAM , 20# LINEAR GEL @ 2505 TO 3490
						PSI DISPLACED W/ 8 FLUID BBLS & 1900 SCF N2, TOTAL FLUID TO
				1		RECOVER 266 BBLS , TOTAL N2 239,900 SCF , AVG PRESS 3150 ,
						MAX 3490 , MIN 2455 , AVG RATE 40 BPM , MAX 42 , MIN 39 , ISIP
	10:30 - 11:30	1.00	RURD	а	OBJECT	RD PUMP LINE , RU FLOWLINE & PRESS TEST W/ WELL PRESS ,
	10.00 - 11.00	1.00	TOILD	4	OBJECT	TESTED GOOD.
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50	FLOW	a	CLEAN	FLOW FRAC BACK THRU CHOKE MANIFOLD ON 8/64" CHOKE,
						MAKING HEAVY MIST , LIGHT SAND @ 900 PSI .
	12:00 - 15:00	3.00	FLOW	a	CLEAN	10/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , LIGHT SAND @ 700 PSI .
	15:00 - 22:00	7.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	12/64" CHOKE, MAKING HEAVY MIST, LIGHT FOAM, LIGHT SAND
	1					@ 450 PSI .
	22:00 - 00:00	2.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	14/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , LIGHT FOAM , LIGHT SAND
						@ 350 PSI .
	00:00 - 04:00	4.00	FLOW	a	CLEAN	20/64" CHOKE , MAKING MODERATE TO LIGHT MIST , NO SAND
				-		SAND @100 PSI .
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	32/64" CHOKE , MAKING MODERATE TO LIGHT MIST , NO SAND @
						25 PSI .
07/18/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	SAFE	а	OBJECT	TRAV TO LOC , START RIG , HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING
						DOWN TBG , RIG CREW , AIR HAND , PKR HAND WERE PRESENT .
	07:00 - 08:00	1.00	TRIP	а	OBJECT	ND FRAC VALVE & FRAC MANDERAL , UNSET PKR , POOH LAYING
						DOWN 2 7/8" FRAC STRING.
	08:00 - 08:30		RURD	а	OBJECT	CHANGE SLIPS, ELEV, RAMS OVER TO 2 3/8".
	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	TRIP	а	OBJECT	TIH W/ EXC , 1.78" ID SEAT NIPPLE , 1 JT , 2' PUP JT REST OF 2 3/8"
	09:00 - 13:00	4.00	DI OM		CLEAN	TBG , TAGGED UP @ 2416', PBTD @ 2447', HAD 31' OF FILL .
	08.00 - 13.00	4.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	CO TO PBTD W/ AIR MIST , MAKING 8 TO 12 BPH OF H2O & FOAM ,
ļ	13:00 - 02:00	13.00	BLOW	a	CLEAN	1/2 TO 3 CUPS OF SAND . BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 4 TO 8 BPH OF H2O & FOAM ,
	3.00 02.00	. 0.00		_	OFF-VIA	1/2 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND.
	02:00 - 04:00	2.00	FLOW	a	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL.
I	04:00 - 06:00			a	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O & LIGHT
ľ	ĺ	1				FOAM, 1/2 TO 1 1/2 CUP OF SAND.
07/19/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	SAFE	а	OBJECT	TRAV TO LOC , START RIG , HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON
İ		}	Ì			,

Page 3 of 4

BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS

Operations Summary Report

Legal Weil Name: GRENIER B #1
Common Well Name: GRENIER B #1

GRENIER B #1

Spud Date: 03/30/1956

Event Name:

CAP WORKOVER

Start: 07/10/2003 Rig Release: 07/21/2003 07/21/2003

Contractor Name:

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

End: Group:

Rig Name: Rig Number: 449 **AZTEC**

Rig Name:		AZIEU				Rig Number: 449
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
07/19/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	SAFE	а	OBJECT	WEARING PPE , RIG CREW , AIR HAND , CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT .
	07:00 - 07:15	0.25	TRIP	а	OBJECT	SHORT TIH , TAG UP @ 2416', PBTD @ 2447', HAD 31' OF FILL .
	07:15 - 10:00	2.75	BLOW	а	CLEAN	CO TO PBTD W/ AIR MIST, MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O, FOAM,
						1/2 TO 3 CUPS OF SAND.
	10:00 - 14:00	4.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	PULL UP , FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT
	14:00 - 16:00	200	BLOW	_	CLEAN	FOAM, TRACE OF SAND.
	14.00 - 10.00	2.00	BLOVV	а	CLEAN	SHORT TIH, TAG UP @ 2437', HAD 10' OF FILL, CO TO PBTD W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST, MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O, LIGHT FOAM, 1/2 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND.
	16:00 - 20:00	4.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	PULL UP , FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , TRACE OF SAND .
	20:00 - 22:00	2.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , 1/2 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND .
	22:00 - 02:00	4.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O, LIGHT FOAM, TRACE OF SAND.
	02:00 - 04:00		BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH H2O , LIGHT FOAM , 1/2 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND .
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	FLOW	a	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O, LIGHT FOAM, TRACE OF SAND.
07/20/2003	06:00 - 08:00	2.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , TRACE OF SAND
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , 1/2 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND .
	10:00 - 14:00	4.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O, TRACE OF SAND
	14:00 - 16:00	2.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , 1/2 TO 1 CUP OF SAND .
	16:00 - 20:00	4.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , TRACE OF SAND
	20:00 - 22:00	2.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , 1/2 TO 1 CUP OF SAND .
	22:00 - 02:00	4.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , TRACE OF SAND
	02:00 - 04:00	2.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , 1/2 TO 1 CUP OF SAND .
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O, TRACE OF SAND
07/21/2003	06:00 - 08:00	2.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , TRACE OF SAND .
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , 1/2 TO 1 CUP OF SAND .
	10:00 - 14:00	4.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , LIGHT FOAM , TRACE OF SAND .
	14:00 - 16:00	2.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 2 TO 4 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 CUP OF SAND .
	16:00 - 20:00	4.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , TRACE OF SAND
	20:00 - 22:00		BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 2 TO 3 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 CUP OF SAND .
	22:00 - 02:00	4.00	FLOW	a	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 1 BPH OF H2O , TRACE OF SAND .
	02:00 - 06:00	4.00	BLOW	a	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 2 TO 3 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 CUP
	L			l		

Page 4 of 4

BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: GRENIER B #1
Common Well Name: GRENIER B #1

Start:

End:

Spud Date: 03/30/1956

Event Name:

CAP WORKOVER AZTEC WELL SERVICE

07/10/2003 Rig Release: 07/21/2003 07/21/2003

Contractor Name:

AZTEC:

Rig Number: 449

Group:

Rig Name:	,	AZTEC				Rig Number: 449
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
07/21/2003	02:00 - 06:00	4.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	OF SAND, STARTED SURGING SAND, SURGING UP TO 1/2 TO 1 GALLON OF SAND.
07/22/2003	06:00 - 07:00		SAFE	а	OBJECT	TRAV TO LOC, START RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RD RIG & EQUIP, RIG CREW, AIR HAND, CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT.
	07:00 - 07:15		TRIP	а	OBJECT	SHORT TIH , TAG UP @ 2417', HAD 30' OF FILL .
	07:15 - 15:00	7.75	BLOW	а	CLEAN	CO TO PBTD W/ AIR MIST , BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 1 TO 3 BPH OF H2O , SURGING UP TO 1/2 GALLON OF SAND , CLEANED UP TO TRACE OF SAND.
	15:00 - 15:30	0.50	BRCH	а	OBJECT	BROACH TBG TO SEAT NIPPLE.
	15:30 - 16:30	1.00	NUND	а	OBJECT	LAND TBG @ 2406 W/ 76 JTS OF 2.375", J-55, 4.7#, EUE, 8 RD TBG W/ 1.78" ID SEAT NIPPLE, W/ KB INCLUDED, ND BOP, CHANGE OUT TBG HEAD, NU NEW TBG HEAD.
	16:30 - 17:30	1.00	PRES	а	OBJECT	PRESS TEST TBG TO 500 PSI , TESTED GOOD , PUMP OFF EXC @ 650 PSI , REV UP TBG .
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	RURD		OBJECT	TAKE PITOT READING OF 283 MCF ON 2" LINE, RD RIG & EQUIP. SUMMARY, MOL, RU RIG & EQUIP, POOH W/ 1", TIH W/ RBP, TEST CSG, NO TEST, TOOH, TIH W/ PKR, HUNT HOLE, SQUEEZE CSG, TOOH W/ PKR, TIH W/ BIT, DO CEMENT & TEST CSG TESTED GOOD, TOOH, RIH W/ PKR & FRAC STRING, FOAM FRAC PC, FLOW FRAC BACK, POOH W/ FRAC STRING, TIH W/ EXC, CO TO PBTD, BROACH TBG, LAND TBG, PUMP OFF EXC, REV UP TBG, RD RIG & EQUIP. NOTE SENT 108 JTS OF 1" TBG FROM GRENIER B # 1, SENT 94 JTS OF 1" TBG FROM HARE # 12 TO BR ON M&R TRUCKING.
	,					
		į				