Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137

(Magazi 1997)	•				AND MAI						Expires: November 30, 2000			
	WELL	COMPL	ETION C	R RE	COMPL	ETION	REPOR	RT AND I	LOG ~	/		ease Serial N MSF07904		
la. Type o	f Well	Oil Well	☐ Gas`			⊠ Other	: СВМ				6. If	Indian, Allot	tee or	Tribe Name
b. Type o	of Completion		ew Well er	□ Worl		Deepe	n 🗆 P	lug Back	lesvr.	7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No. NMNM78424B				
2. Name o					Conta	ct: JUAN	ITA FARI	RELL			1	ease Name ar		il No.
	COPHILLIP					E-Ma	il: juanita.	r.farrell@c	onocophilli			SAN JUAN 3	2-8 2	245A
(PO BOX HOUSTO	N, TX 77	252				Ph: 505.	599.3419	le area/code <	() [5-32292-00-\$1
	n of Well (Re Sec 1	4 T31N R	8W Mer NN	/IP			\s\chi_{\chi_1}	nts)*	AUG 2004	7 A	10.	Field and Poo BASIN FRUI	I, or I	Exploratory ID COAL
At surf	ace SENV	V 1830FN	L 1630FWL	_ 36.899	934 N Lat,	107.647	8 W Lon	O _C	~~~?00g	, o	1 11.	Sec., T., R., N	1., or	Block and Survey 31N R8W Mer NMF
At top 1	prod interval	reported b	elow				100	On.		/ α	צו	County or Par		[13. State
At total	•						المراجعة المراجعة	٣ ي	7. 3 Og.	O)	/ 5	SAN JUAN		NM
14. Date S 06/02/2				ate T.D. /07/2004			16. D	ate Comple & A /19/2004	ted" Ready to P / C+ b-\ S\	rod	17.	Elevations (D 6638		3, RT, GL)*
18. Total I	Depth:	MD TVD	3606		19. Plug B	ack T.D.	MD TVI	~430	مرية <u>605 م</u>	20. Dep	th Br	dge Plug Set		MD IVD
21. Type I	electric & Otl OG	ner Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Subr	nit copy of	each)				well cored OST run? tional Sur	1? -vev2	No D	Yes	(Submit analysis) (Submit analysis) (Submit analysis)
23. Casing a	nd Liner Rec	ord (Repo	rt all strings	set in w	ell)					tional Sul	· vcy:	□ No 🗵	103	(Guotini analysis)
Hole Size	Size/C		Wt. (#/ft.)	Top (MD	Bot		age Cemen Depth	1	of Sks. & of Cement	Slurry (BB		Cement To	p*	Amount Pulled
12.250	9.6	325 H-40	32.0		0	236			150	G			0	
6 8.750		000 J-55	20.0			3274		_	530				0	
16 6.250	5.	500 J-55	16.0	3.	247	3606		-		 				
				-		_							-	
				L						 				
24. Tubing	g Record			L								·		
Size	Depth Set (N		acker Depth	(MD)	Size	Depth Se	et (MD)	Packer De	pth (MD)	Size	De	epth Set (MD) [Packer Depth (MD)
2.375 25. Produc	ing Intervals	3586		L		1 26. Pe	foration R	ecord					Щ.	
	ormation		Top		Bottom			ed Interval		Size	Т	No. Holes		Perf. Status
	RUITLAND	COAL		3302	3526	3	······································				750 248 OPEN			
B)											· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
C)														
D)	racture, Trea	terroret Cor	want Causan	Eta							Ш.	<u> </u>		
	Depth Interv		nent Squeeze	e, Ew.	****			A mount on	d Type of M	Interial				
			526 CAVITA	TÉD				Amount an	d Type of iv	iaici iai				
														
20 Disability	tion - Interva													
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	. Ioi	Gravity	Gas		Product	ion Method		
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Co	π. API	Gravity		Troduct		.	
07/19/2004 Choke	07/17/2004 Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	O.O Oil	1848 Gas	Water	0.0	s:Oil	Well S	atus		GAS P	UMPI	NG UNIT
Size	Flwg.	Press.	Rate	BBL	MCF	BBL	Ra							
2" PITOT	SI ction - Interv	35.0 a B		0	1848		0			GSI				
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water		Gravity	Gas	Т	Product	ion Method		
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL		rr. API	Gravity			THE POLYMENT PROPERTY.	7 P	
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	Water		s:Oil	Well St	atus		TUCEFIE) tl	RECORU
Size	Flwg. SI	Press.	Rate	BBL	MCF	BBL	Ra	tio				1111	o -	2004
	L.			L					l			<u>, HJL</u>	z_9	2004

(See Instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)

ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #33219 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** BLM REVISED ** BLM REVISED

28h Prod	luction - Inter-	val C					_ -				
Date First	iTest	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity		Gas	Production Method	
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr. API		Gravity	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio		Well Status	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
28c. Prod	uction - Interv	/al D	_			·					·
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API		Gas Gravity	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio		Well Status	<u> </u>	
29. Dispo	sition of Gas	Sold, used f	or fuel, ven	ted, etc.)	1	<u> </u>					
	nary of Porous	Zones (Inc	lude Aquife	re).					31 For	mation (Log) Markers	
Show tests,	all important including dep ecoveries.	zones of po	rosity and c	ontents ther					31.10	manon (20g) Markoto	
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Description	ons, Contents,	etc.		Name	Top Meas. Depth
SAN JOS NACIMIEI OJO ALA	NTO		0 953 2315	953 2315 2445					OJ: KiF	CIMIENTO O ALAMO RTLAND CTURED CLIFFS	848 2356 2463 3534
32. Addit	ional remarks	(include pl	ugging proc	edure):							
THIS ATTA	WELL IS A ACHED IS TH	SINGLE W	/ELL PROI	DUCING F	ROM THE D	BASIN FR AILY SUM	RUITLAND C	OAL.			
	enclosed atta		/1 C 11 .				.		4 Bomb		
	ectrical/Mecha ndry Notice fo	-	•	• .		 Geologie Core An 	-		3. DST Rep 7 Other:	port 4. Dire	ectional Survey
	by certify that	Con	Elect	ronic Subm For CON AFMSS for	ission #332 IOCOPHIL	19 Verifie LLIPS CON	d by the BLM MPANY, sen ENNE BRUM	I Well Int t to the F LEY on (formation Sys armington 07/29/2004 (0	e records (see attached inst stem. 4AXB3000SE)	ructions):
Signa			c Submiss				Dat	e 07/28/2	2004		• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •
5		,		,	1					*************************************	
Title 18 U	J.S.C. Section ited States any	1001 and 7 false, fiction	Title 43 U.S.	C. Section 1 ulent statem	212, make nents or repr	it a crime for	or any person as to any mat	knowingly ter within	y and willfully its jurisdiction	to make to any departmen	it or agency

Conoco hillips END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

Well Name:	San Juan 32-8 # 245A					Spud:	: 2-Jun-04
	30-045-32292					Release Drl Rig	
Location:	1830' FNL & 1630' FWL	Note - this we				Move In Cav Rig	
	Sect 14 - T31N - R8W	· ·	_	EUE 8rd B		Release Cav Rig	18-Jul-04
-1	San Juan County, NM			3M Tubing			
	6638' GL (above MSL)	9-5/8" 8	RD x 11"	3M Casing	Head 7		
-	13' above Ground Level				Surface Comer	-4	
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL	[√] v			SurfaceCemen		2 tun 04
Surface Continu	Onto not: 3 km 04	X New Used			1	e cmt'd:	
Surface Casing Size	Date set: 3-Jun-04 9 5/8 in	oseu				x Class G Cement C S001 Calcium C	
Set at	***************************************					D029 Cellophane	
Wt.						174 cuft slurry at	
	12 1/4 in Conn STC					placement: 15.0	
Excess Cmt		4			1	ped Plug at: 17:	_
		hoe 236 ft	•			Circ Press: 3	
		nole 245 ft			Returns	during job:	YES
				11 1	CMT Returns	to surface:	0.67
Noti	fied BLM @hrs on _	02-Jun-04				loats Held: N	
Notified	NMOCD @hrs on	02-Jun-04			W.O.C. for 6	6.00 hrs (plug bum	np to start NU BOP)
					W.O.C. for1	4.00 hrs (plug bum	np to test csg)
Intermediate Ca	sing Date set: 6-Jun-04	X New			Intermediate C	ement	
Size	<u>7</u> in <u>76</u> j	ts Used			Dat	ie cmt'd:	6-Jun-04
Set at		oups			Lead : 430 sx	x Class G Cemen	t
	ppf Grade				+ 3% D079 I		
Hole Size	<u>8 3/4</u> in Conn <u>STC</u>				+ 0.25 lb/sx	D029 Cellophane	Flakes
	······································	Collar 3228 ft	4		+ 0.2% D046		
	SURFACE Bottom of Casing				2.61cuft/sx,	1122.3 cuft slurry	at 11.7 ppg
. –		Hole 3280 ft		'	\ 		
	ft	05.4 - 04	\			x 50/50 POZ : Cla	ass G cement
	fied BLM @hrs on _)		+ 2% D020 I		
Notified	NMOCD @hrs on	05-Jun-04	7 1 1		+ 5 lb/sx D02	Calcium Chloride	
Production Line	Data set: 16 Jul 04	XNew	1 '	(D029 Cellophane	Flakes
Size		Used			+ 0.2% D046		: I lakes
	15.5 ppf		1			, 127 cuft slurry at	13.5 ppg
Grade		TC) [splacement:	
	8		7		1	•	55 hrs w/ 1500 psi
	6.25 / 9.5 inches		(1	Circ Press: 79	
Underream	ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3280' to	3606')		Returns	during job:	YES
Top of Liner	<u>3247</u> ft		/ []			to surface:	
PBTD	3605 ft	i	(, F	loats Held: X Ye	esNo
Bottom of Lines	ft	İ	\		1		
				Y)		
)	ŀ	1		
This well was cavit	ated.				UNCEMENTED) LINER	
							<u> </u>
		_			Schematic p	orepared by: floore, Drilling Eng	rineer
			TD <u>3</u>	,606 ft	26-July-2004		Jiriooi
9-5/8" Surf:	No float an incompany and Day	and the sheet and an also		ffla alaba d			
9-5/6" Sun:	No float equipment was run. Ran a	-,		-		noe.	
	Displaced top wiper plug with wate Only got 0.67 bbls cmt returns to so				ang out landing jt.		
	While WOC pump 5 bbls of 15.9 pp		weighed	io.s ppg.			
	CENTRALIZERS: 234', 147', 104' 8	•				Tol	tal: 4
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/20 BBLS. FRESH		8.4 PPG S	SLIGHTLY	POLYMERIZED DRI		
	CENTRALIZERS @ 3272', 3228', 3					Tot	tal: 9
	TURBOLIZERS @ 2319', 2275', 22	r		•		Tot	
5.5" Liner	Ran a bladed shoe with float valve		er w/ TIW	H-Latch Dr	op Off Tool (no liner		
Perforations	Perforated 5-1/2" liner with guns or					, V . (
	Perf. Intervals: 3302'-3305', 3306'-			376'-3380'	, 3384'-3388', 3389'-	-3392', 3424'-3432	2', 3434'-3438',
	3453'-3458', 3493'-3500', 3512'-35						····
Tubing	2-7/8" Orange Peeled Mud Anchor		-		upset,		
	2-7/8" x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd crossover of 113 jts 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUE 8rd tu				in it nin 1 it below th	e tuhing hanger	
	Bottom of Mud Anchor at 3586'. F-	Ψ,		и кор	p julian i judelow th	e tubing nanger.	
Pump	12" long strainer attached below 1-			' x 3/4" OD	pony rod on top of c	oump,	
&	141 each 3/4" OD rods, spaced out	•				• •	
Rods	& 1 ea 1-1/4" OD x 22' polished roo						

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

12:00 - 12:30

12:30 - 14:00

14:00 - 16:30

16:30 - 17:00

17:00 - 07:00

06:00 - 07:00

07:00 - 07:30

07:30 - 08:00

08:00 - 09:15

09:15 - 16:00

6/30/2004

0.50 DRILL

1.50 DRILL

2.50 DRILL

0.50 DRILL

14.00 DRILL

1.00 DRILL

0.50 DRILL

0.50 DRILL

1.25 DRILL

6.75 DRILL

PULD

PULD

PULD

OTHR

OTHR

OTHR

SFTY

SFEQ

OTHR

DRLG

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004

End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 27

Sub From - To Phase Date Hours Code Description of Operations Code 6/28/2004 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 MOVE **SFTY** COMPZN PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. 4.50 MOVE 07:30 - 12:00 MOB COMPZN MOVE RIG, SPOT EQUIPMENT. MOVED TO THE SAN JUAN 32-8 # 245A SEC 14 - T31N - R8W 1830'FNL 1630'FWL NEAREST HELI PAD IS ON THE NORTH SIDE OF THIS LOCATION ON THE ADJOINING ROAD. LEFT MESSAGE ON THE BLM HOTLINE PHONE FOR PRESSURE TEST @ 1205HRS. LEFT MESSAGE ON THE VOICE MAIL OF CHARLIE PERRIN WITH THE OCD @ 1200HRS ABOUT PRESSURE TEST. 7.00 MOVE RURD COMPZN NIPPLE UP BOPS, LAY BLOOIE LINES AND FLOW LINES, RIG UP 12:00 - 19:00 SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT. WE WILL HAVE TO USE DRYWATCH MEN ON THIS WELL DUE TO 19:00 - 06:00 11.00 STIMOP Wond COMPZN IT BEING RIGHT BESIDE THE HIGHWAY. 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 DRILL SFTY COMPZN PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. 6/29/2004 07:30 - 08:30 1.00 DRILL RURD COMPZN FINISH RIGGING UP. 08:30 - 09:00 0.50 DRILL COMPZN RIG INSPECTION AND REPAIR GIGS. SFTY 09:00 - 11:30 2.50 WELCTL SFEQ COMPZN PRESSURE TEST CASING AND BLIND RAMS 300# LOW AND 1800# HIGH FOR 30 MIN. STATE INTEGRITY TEST. PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS, HCR VALVES, AND ALL MANIFOLD VALVES, 300 # LOW FOR 3 MIN, AND 1800 # HIGH FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK COMPZN 11:30 - 12:00 0.50 DRILL OTHR

INSPECT DRILL COLLARS AND ALL SUBS, ALL OK COMPZN

GIH PU BHA 6 1/4" RERUN BIT, BIT SUB WITH DP FLOAT, 12 - 3 1/2" DC'S, 1JT OF 2 7/8" DP, 1-2 7/8" FN

W / 1.87 PROFILE.

PICK UP DRILL PIPE OUT OF PIPE BASKET AND TALLY.

GIH PICKING UP 90 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE. SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT

DRY \WATCH RIG FOR THE NIGHT.

DRY WATCH RIG.

PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.

PRESSURE TEST AIR LINES AND AIR MANIFOLD, 1200PSI HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES AND 200PSI LOW FOR 3 MINUTES.

UNLOAD HOLE, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION, DRLG FLOAT COLLAR

AND 46' OF CEMENT. TAG FLOAT @ 3228'

CSG SHOE @ 3273'

TD 8 3/4 HOLE @ 3280'

DRILLING FORMATION 3280' TO 3606'

DRLG WITH 750 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF

WATER.

200PSI ON STANDPIPE.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

End: Group:

7/18/2004

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/30/2004	09:15 - 16:00	6.75	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	NO WATER TO SURFACE OR TSTM. 3295' - 3296' 1' 111 UNITS OF GAS 3302' - 3304' 2' 120 UNITS OF GAS 3306' - 3309' 3' 160 UNITS OF GAS 3314' - 3317' 3' 145 UNITS OF GAS 3342' - 3344' 2' 60 UNITS OF GAS 3352' - 3353' 1' 60 UNITS OF GAS 3376' - 3379' 3' 188 UNITS OF GAS 3387' - 3390' 3' 317 UNITS OF GAS 3390' - 3391' 1' 310 UNITS OF GAS 3424' - 3444' 20' 380 UNITS OF GAS 3454' - 3458' 4' 390 UNITS OF GAS 3494' - 3499' 5' 424 UNITS OF GAS 3512' - 3522' 10' 398 UNITS OF GAS 3524' - 3526' 2' 401 UNITS OF GAS
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 750 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 200PSI ON STANDPIPE. WELL WAS MAKING 1 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL, DOWN TO
	17:00 - 17:30 17:30 - 18:00	1	DRILL DRILL	CIRC PULD	COMPZN	1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND BLOW WELL DRY. PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 13 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	WITH POWER SWIVEL. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 2# ON GAUGE 1.00 # 615 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 6 # ON GAUGE 1.50 # 752 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 6 # ON GAUGE 1.50 # 752 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 6 # ON GAUGE 1.50 # 752 MCFD
	19:00 - 21:30	2.50	FLOWT	SIPB	COMPZN	WELL STARTED MISTING AFTER 30 MINUTE READING. SHUT IN TEST INSP 10 PSI 15 MINUTES 100 PSI 30 MINUTES 145 PSI 45 MINUTES 190 PSI 60 MINUTES 235 PSI 75 MINUTES 270 PSI 90 MINUTES 305 PSI 105 MINUTES 340 PSI 120 MINUTES 370 PSI
	21:30 - 23:30 23:30 - 02:15 02:15 - 06:00	2.75	DRILL DRILL DRILL	TRIP TRIP UREM	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN. TRIP OUT OF HOLE, JSA AND SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONEL. PICK UP UNDER REAMER AND SHOCK SUB. TRIP IN HOLE, PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL. UNDER REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE FROM 3280' TO 3510' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004

Contractor Name:

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

End: 7/18/2004

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Name:	KEY ENERGY	Rig Number:	27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/30/2004	02:15 - 06:00	3.75	DRILL	UREM	COMPZN	GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
7/1/2004	06:00 - 07:15	1.25	DRILL	UREM	COMPZN	600PSI ON STAND PIPE UNDER REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE FROM 3510' TO 3606' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
	07:15 - 08:15	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	600PSI ON STAND PIPE BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 200PSI ON STANDPIPE.
	08:15 - 09:00	0.75	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY HOLE UP.
	09:00 - 09:30	1	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 13 JOINTS WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	09:30 - 11:00	1.50	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 1 # ON GAUGE 0.25 # 309 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 3 # ON GAUGE .75 # 539 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 6 # ON GAUGE 1.50 # 752 MCFD WELL MISTING AFTER FIRST READING.
	11:00 - 12:30	1.50	DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO LAY DOWN AND LOAD OUT UNDER REAMER AND SHOCK SUB
	12:30 - 14:00	1.50	STIMOP	TRIP	COMPZN	PICK UP BIT, FLOAT, AND BIT SUB AND TRIP IN HOLE TO 3252'.
	14:00 - 16:30		FLOWT	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST INSP 20PSI 15 MINUTES 100 PSI 30 MINUTES 160 PSI 45 MINUTES 270 PSI 60 MINUTES 300 PSI 75 MINUTES 325 PSI 90 MINUTES 345 PSI 105 MINUTES 345 PSI 120 MINUTES 345 PSI RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
	16:30 - 05:00	12.50	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	HYDRAULIC SURGE AS FOLLOWS PUMP 1 GALLON FOAMER PUMP AIR MIST AT 5 BBL PER HOUR TO 500 PSI. PUMP 10 BBL WATER PAD. PUMP AIR MIST AT 5 BBL PER HOUR TO 1100 PSI. PUMP 10 BBL WATER PAD. PUMP AIR MIST AT 5 BBL PER HOUR TO 1200 PSI. PUMP 10 BBL WATER PAD. PUMP AIR MIST AT 5 BBL PER HOUR TO 1300 PSI. PUMP 20 BBL WATER PAD. PUMP AIR MIST AT 5 BBL PER HOUR TO 1350 PSI. PUMP 20 BBL WATER PAD. PUMP AIR MIST AT 5 BBL PER HOUR TO 1400 PSI. PUMP 20 BBL WATER PAD. PUMP AIR MIST AT 5 BBL PER HOUR TO 1300 PSI. SURGE #1 DP 1375PSI CSG 1325PSI SURGE #2 DP 1400PSI CSG 1300PSI

Operations Summary Report

Legai Weil Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004 End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Rig Name:	KEY ENERGY	Rig Number:	27
I KIO NAMe:	KEY ENERGY	Rid Wilmber	~ / /
ing manio.	THE ENGLISH	rag rannoon.	

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/1/2004	16:30 - 05:00	12.50	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	SURGE #3 DP 1400PSI CSG 1350PSI SURGE #4 DP 1300PSI CSG 1200PSI SURGE #5 DP 1400PSI CSG 1300PSI NO BREAK DOWN.
	05:00 - 05:30 05:30 - 06:00		STIMOP STIMOP	ì	COMPZN COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3409' R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3409' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 2 TO 4 BPH OF COAL.
7/2/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN R&R CLEAN OUT 3409' TO 3440' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 2 TO 4 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 09:00		STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	WATER GAIN PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3440' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 2 TO 4 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO
	09:00 - 10:30	1.50	RIGMNT	SVRG	COMPZN	WATER GAIN PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 6 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	10:30 - 11:00	0.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	CHANGE OIL IN RIG MOTOR AND GENERATOR MOTOR. GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG UP @ 3435
	11:00 - 19:00	8.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	M&R CLEAN OUT 3435' TO 3502' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	1	STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT 3502' TO 3540' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO
7/3/2004	06:00 - 06:30	0.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	WATER GAIN R&R CLEAN OUT 3502' TO 3540' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO
	06:30 - 07:00	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	WATER GAIN PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 10 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	STIMOP	ŞFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
		<u> </u>	L	<u> </u>		Printed: 7/28/2004 9:59:37 AM

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004 7/18/2004

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

End:

Contractor Name:

Group:

	ig Name:	KEY ENERGY	Rig Number: 27
--	----------	------------	----------------

Rig Name:		KEYEN	EKGY			Rig Number: 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/3/2004	07:30 - 10:00	2.50	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	SURGE #6, AS FOLLOWS 1 GALLON OF SOAP DOWN DRILL PIPE, PUMP 10 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 400PSI WITH AIR MIST PUMP 10 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 800PSI WITH AIR MIST PUMP 10 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 1200PSI WITH AIR MIST PRESSURE UP TO 1200PSI WITH AIR MIST RELEASE SURGE WHILE PUMPING AIR MIST AT 900CFM AND 5 BBL PER HOUR MIST.
	10:00 - 11:00 11:00 - 19:00	L .	RIGMNT STIMOP	1	COMPZN COMPZN	SURGE # 6 DP 1100PSI CSG 1000PSI REPLACE HYDRAULIC HOSE ON #1 AIR COMPRESSOR SURGE #7, #8 AS FOLLOWS 1 GALLON OF SOAP DOWN DRILL PIPE, RELEASE SURGE WHILE PUMPING AIR MIST AT 1100CFM AND 5 BBL PER HOUR MIST. SURGE # 7 DP 1300PSI CSG 1750PSI SURGE # 8 DP 1250PSI CSG 1100PSI
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 02:00		STIMOP STIMOP	ŀ	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3394' TRY TO BREAK CIRCULATION, HOLE PRESSURED UP. WORK PIPE OUT OF HOLE TO 3347' POWER SWIVEL BROKE DOWN, HOOK UP POWER SWIVEL TO RIG HYDRAULIC SYSTEM. EQUALIZE BACKSIDE WITH 1200PSI RELEASE AS SURGE, CONTINUE WORKING PIPE.
	02:00 - 02:30	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 3 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	02:30 - 06:00	3.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3280' TO 3347' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 5 TO 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 8 TO 10 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN.
7/4/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	RETURNS TO SURFACE GOLF BALL SIZE. R&R CLEAN OUT 3280' TO 3347' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 5 TO 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 8 TO 10 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	11.50	STIMOP STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT 3347' TO 3388' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 8 TO 10 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00		STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3388' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 8 TO 10 BPH OF COAL DOWN TO 4BPH.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Number: 27

Group:

_							
0	ia	N	2	m	^	•	
$\overline{}$	u	IV	a		•		

KEY ENERGY

Rig Name.	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	VE I EIN	EKGI			Rig Number: 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations.
7/4/2004	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN
7/5/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3388' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST WITH
					İ	1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WELL MAKING 8 TO 10 BPH OF COAL DOWN TO 4BPH.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER
				l		GAIN
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00		STIMOP	1	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT 3388' TO 3409' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 12 BPH MIST
	07.30 - 19.00	11.30	STIMOF	100	COMPZIN	WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						2 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WELL MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF COAL.
		1				RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MEDIUM COAL & FINE'S W /
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	SETY	COMPZN	NO WATER GAIN PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	19:30 - 06:00	1	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3409' TO 3440' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 12 BPH MIST
			:			WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						2 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WELL MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF COAL DOWN TO 2 BPH. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MEDIUM COAL & FINE'S W /
	i					NO WATER GAIN.
7/6/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3409' TO 3440' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST
						WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						2 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WELL MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF COAL DOWN TO 2 BPH. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MEDIUM COAL & FINE'S W /
						NO WATER GAIN.
	07:00 - 07:30		STIMOP		COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 08:15	0.75	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3440' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 12 BPH MIST WITH
		İ				1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 2 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
					İ	WELL MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF COAL DOWN TO 2 BPH.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MEDIUM COAL & FINE'S W /
						NO WATER GAIN.
	08:15 - 08:30	0.25	RIGMNT	SVRG	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 7 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
	08:30 - 12:15	3.75	RIGMNT	SVRG	COMPZN	WITH POWER SWIVEL. CHANGE OIL IN AIR COMPRESSORS, CHANGE OIL IN POWER
						SWIVEL UNIT, CHANGE OUT HYDRAULIC MOTOR ON POWER
						SWIVEL.
	12:15 - 12:30	0.25	STIMOP	BUILD	COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL. TAG @ 3435'
	12.15 - 12.50	0.23	STIMOF	FULD	COMEZIN	CHANGE STRIPPING RUBBER.
	12:30 - 19:00	6.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3435' TO 3502' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST
						WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						1 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MEDIUM TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO
						WATER GAIN.
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	19:30 -		STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3502' TO 3533' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						1 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
	1					The second secon

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

End:

Spud Date: 6/2/2004 7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS KEY ENERGY

Ria Number: 27

Rig Name:	l	KEY EN	ERGY			Rig Number: 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/6/2004	19:30 -		STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	WELL IS MAKING 4 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MEDIUM TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BBL PER HOUR WATER GAIN.
7/7/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3502' TO 3533' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 4 BPH OF COAL.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	STIMOP	ECO	COMPZN	RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MEDIUM TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BBL PER HOUR WATER GAIN. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 10:00		STIMOP	1	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3502' TO 3533' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 1/2 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 4 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MEDIUM TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 3
	10:00 - 10:15	0.25	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	BBL PER HOUR WATER GAIN. PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	10:15 - 12:00	1.75	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	CHANGE PIPE RAM RUBBERS IN #1 BOP. PRESSURE TEST PIPE RAMS IN #1 BOP 300PSI LOW AND 1800PSI HIGH.
	12:00 - 19:00	7.00	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	SURGE #9, #10, #11, AS FOLLOWS. 2 GALLONS OF SOAP DOWN DRILL PIPE, PUMP 5 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 500PSI WITH AIR MIST PUMP 5 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 750PSI WITH AIR MIST PUMP 5 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 900PSI WITH AIR MIST PRESSURE UP TO 900PSI WITH AIR MIST RELEASE SURGE WHILE PUMPING AIR MIST AT 1500CFM AND 5 BBL PER HOUR MIST. SURGE #9 DP 750PSI CSG 600 PSI SURGE #10 DP 900PSI CSG 800 PSI SURGE #11 DP 1000PSI CSG 900 PSI
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 21:30	2.00	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. SURGE #12, AS FOLLOWS. 2 GALLONS OF SOAP DOWN DRILL PIPE, PUMP 5 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 500PSI WITH AIR MIST PUMP 5 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 750PSI WITH AIR MIST PUMP 5 BBLS OF WATER PRESSURE UP TO 900PSI WITH AIR MIST RELEASE SURGE WHILE PUMPING AIR MIST AT 1500CFM AND 5 BBL PER HOUR MIST. SURGE #12 DP 1000PSI CSG 850 PSI
	21:30 - 22:00 22:00 - 06:00		STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3394' R&R CLEAN OUT 3394' TO 3410' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 4 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / 3 BBL PER

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004 End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 27

Date of the state of the sub-

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Code		Description of Operations
7/7/2004 7/8/2004	22:00 - 06:00 06:00 - 07:00	1	STIMOP		COMPZN	
170/2004	00.00 - 07.00	1.00	STINOF	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3394' TO 3410' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WELL IS MAKING 4 BPH OF COAL.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER
	07:00 07:00	0.50	0711400	0577	00110711	GAIN.
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	l .	STIMOP		COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT 3410' TO 3530' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST
	07.30 - 19.00	17.50	STRIVIOR	100	COMEZIA	WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR.
		ļ				1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL.
				1		RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	SETY	COMPZN	GAIN. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	19:30 - 06:00	ľ	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3530' TO 3564' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST
						WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / 3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN.
7/9/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3530' TO 3564' WITH 750 CFM AIR, 5 BPH MIST
						WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / 3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN.
						ONE AIR COMPRESSOR DOWN.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 08:00		FLOWT	1	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY HOLE UP.
	08:00 - 08:15	0.25	FLOWT	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 10 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
	08:15 - 09:15	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	WITH POWER SWIVEL. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST
	00.10 - 05.15	1.00	LOWI	1001	COMPZI	INITIAL PRESSURE 9 # ON GAUGE 2.25 # 913 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 20 # ON GAUGE 5.00 # 1374 MCFD
						30 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD
						45 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD
						60 MINUTES - 22 # ON GAUGE 5.50 # 1454 MCFD WELL MISTING AFTER FIRST READING.
	09:15 - 12:00	2.75	FLOWT	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST
						INSP 30PSI
						15 MINUTES 90 PSI
				Í		30 MINUTES 160 PSI
						45 MINUTES 200 PSI
						75 MINUTES 270 PSI
						90 MINUTES 285 PSI
						105 MINUTES 300 PSI
ļ						120 MINUTES 315 PSI
						135 MINUTES 330 PSI RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
	12:00 - 19:00	7.00	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	SURGE #13, #14,
		ļ				PUMP 2 GALLON FOAMER
		1			1	

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

End:

7/18/2004

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Number: 27

Rig Name.		'	VE I EIN				Rig Number. 27
Date	Fror	n - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/9/2004	12:00	- 19:00	7.00	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	PUMP 3, 5BBL WATER PADS ON EACH SURGE. SURGE #13 DP 850PSI CSG 750 PSI SURGE #14 DP 800PSI CSG 700 PSI
	19:00	- 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	ı	- 06:00	I .	STIMOP	I.	COMPZN	SURGE #15, #16, #17, #18,
							PUMP 2 GALLON FOAMER
]	PUMP 3, 5BBL WATER PADS ON EACH SURGE.
			İ				SURGE #15 DP 750PSI CSG 600 PSI
	ł		1	1	İ		SURGE #16 DP 750PSI CSG 600 PSI
							SURGE #17 DP 850PSI CSG 750 PSI
	1						SURGE #18 STILL BUILDING.
7/10/2004	06:00	- 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	SURGE #18,
	1						PUMP 2 GALLON FOAMER
							PUMP 3, 5BBL WATER PADS ON EACH SURGE.
							SURGE #18 DP 750PSI CSG 600 PSI
	1	- 07:30		STIMOP		COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30	- 13:00	5.50	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	SURGE #19,
							PUMP 2 GALLON FOAMER
	ĺ			[[PUMP 3, 5BBL WATER PADS ON EACH SURGE.
	42.00	42.20	0.50	CTIMOD	DILLD	COMPAN	SURGE #19 DP 1075PSI CSG 900 PSI
	1	- 13:30	1	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3394'
	13:30	- 19:00	5.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3394' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH
						i	1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
							WELL IS MAKING 3 TO 5 BPH OF COAL.
							RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
							WITH NO WATER GAIN.
	19:00	- 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	F .	- 06:00	1	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3394' TO 3414' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST
							WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
							1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER
							WELL IS MAKING 3 TO 5 BPH OF COAL.
							RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
							WITH NO WATER GAIN.
7/11/2004	06:00	- 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3394' TO 3414' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST
						ļ	WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
			1				1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
							WELL IS MAKING 3 TO 5 BPH OF COAL.
				}	1		RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
	07:00	- 07:30	0.50	STIMOP	CETY	COMPAN	WITH NO WATER GAIN.
	!	- 19:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07.30	- 19.00	11.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZIN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3414' TO 3470' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST
							WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER,
							WELL IS MAKING 3 TO 5 BPH OF COAL.
					1		RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
					1		WITH NO WATER GAIN.
							PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3
							BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP.
	19:00	- 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	19:30	- 06:00	l'	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3470' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH
							1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
							1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.

Page 10 of 16

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004 End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code		Description of Operations
7/11/2004	19:30 - 06:00	10.50 S	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S WITH NO WATER GAIN.
7/12/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00 S	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3 BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP. R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3470' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL.
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 09:15		STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S WITH NO WATER GAIN. PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3 BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3470' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
	09:15 - 11:45	2.50 S	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	WITH NO WATER GAIN. PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3 BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP. R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3470' WITH 750 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
	11:45 - 19:00	7.25 S	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	WITH NO WATER GAIN. PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3 BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP. 1 COMPRESSOR DOWN. R&R CLEAN OUT 3470' TO 3502' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	I I	STIMOP STIMOP	l .	COMPZN COMPZN	WITH NO WATER GAIN. PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3 BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT 3502' TO 3562' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 2 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S 3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN.
7/13/2004	06:00 - 06:30 06:30 - 07:00 07:00 - 08:00	0.50 S	STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3 BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP. TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY UP HOLE. PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 11 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST
						INITIAL PRESSURE 9 # ON GAUGE 2.25 # 913 MCFD

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004

End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Rig Name:	KEY ENERGY	Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/13/2004	07:00 - 08:00	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	15 MINUTES - 24 # ON GAUGE 6.00 # 1520 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 25 # ON GAUGE 6.25 # 1578 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 25 # ON GAUGE 6.25 # 1578 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 25 # ON GAUGE 6.25 # 1578 MCFD WELL MISTING AFTER FIRST READING.
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00	STIMOP	PRDT	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST INSP
	10:00 - 19:00	9.00	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	120 MINUTES 279 PSI 120 MINUTES 299 PSI RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE #1, LET WELL BLOW DOWN. NATURAL SURGE #1 290PSI 2HRS #2 310PSI 3HRS WIND DIRECTION #3 330PSI 4HRS WIND DIRECTION #4 START SURGE #4
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 20:30	3	STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. NATURAL SURGE #4 2 1/2HRS 330PSI
	20:30 - 21:00 21:00 - 22:00		STIMOP STIMOP	1	COMPZN COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3545' PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 10 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	22:00 - 03:00	5.00	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	#5 2 1/2HRS 300PSI #6 2 1/2HRS 310PSI
	03:00 - 03:30 03:30 - 06:00		STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3523' R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3523' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S 3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN. PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3 BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP.
7/14/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3523' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL IS MAKING 3 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S 3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN. PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3 BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP.
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:15		STIMOP FLOWT		COMPZN COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY HOLE UP. PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 10 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	08:15 - 09:15	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 20# ON GAUGE 5.00# 1374 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 30 # ON GAUGE 7.50 # 1702 MCFD

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Sub Code

PRDT

Phase

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004

Contractor Name:

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

End:

7/18/2004

Date

7/14/2004

KEY ENERGY SVCS

1.00 FLOWT

Code

2.00 FLOWT SIPB

2.75 STIMOP CAV

0.50 STIMOP PULD

4.50 STIMOP FCO

0.50 STIMOP SFTY

2.50 STIMOP FCO

8.00 STIMOP FCO

1.00 STIMOP FCO

Group:

Description of Operations

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

From - To Hours

08:15 - 09:15

09:15 - 11:15

11:15 - 14:00

14:00 - 14:30

14:30 - 19:00

19:00 - 19:30

19:30 - 22:00

22:00 - 06:00

06:00 - 07:00

7/15/2004

Rig Number: 27

30 MINUTES - 30 # ON GAUGE 7.50 # 1702 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 30 # ON GAUGE 7.50 # 1702 MCFD

60 MINUTES - 30 # ON GAUGE 7.50 # 1702 MCFD

WELL MISTING AFTER FIRST READING.

COMPZN SHUT IN TEST

> INSP 50PSI

MINUTES 130 PSI 15

MINUTES 180 PSI 30

MINUTES 210 PSI 45 60

MINUTES 240 PSI

90 MINUTES 285 PSI 120 MINUTES 300 PSI

RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE #1, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.

NATURAL SURGE

#7 300PSI 2

#8 310PSI 21/2 HRS

GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3527' COMPZN COMPZN ESTABLISH CIRCULATION, R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3527' WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,

1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER

WELL IS MAKING 4 BPH OF COAL.

RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S

3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN.

PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3

BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP.

PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.

R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3527' WITH 1100 CFM AIR. 6 BPH MIST WITH

1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR.

1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF

WATER.

WELL IS MAKING 4 BPH OF COAL.

RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S

3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN.

PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3

BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP.

R&R CLEAN OUT 3527' TO 3576' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST

WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,

1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 4 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF

WATER.

WELL IS MAKING 2 BPH OF COAL DOWN FROM 4 BPH.

RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S

3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN.

PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3

BBLS WATER WITH RIG PUMP.

R&R CLEAN OUT 3527' TO 3576' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST

WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR.

1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 4 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF

WATER. WELL IS MAKING 2 BPH OF COAL DOWN FROM 4 BPH.

RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S

3 BBLS PER HOUR WATER GAIN.

PUMPING FLUSHES EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER AND 3

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004 End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 27

A LA CARLO DEL CARLO DE LA CARLO DE LA CARLO DEL CARLO DE LA CARLO DEL CARLO DE LA CARLO DE LA CARLO DE LA CARLO DE LA CARLO DEL CARLO DE LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DE LA CARLO DE LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DEL LA CARLO DE

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/15/2004	06:00 - 07:00 07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 10:00	0.50 2.50	STIMOP STIMOP STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	
						DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL. WAIT FOR ONE HOUR. GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL. TAG @ 3527'
	12:00 - 19:00	7.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3527' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 TO 16 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 4 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL WILL NOT CIRCULATE WITH LOWER VOLUMES OF MIST. WELL IS MAKING 2 BPH OF COAL DOWN FROM 4 BPH.
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 22:30	1	STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT @ 3527' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 TO 16 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 4 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL WILL NOT CIRCULATE WITH LOWER VOLUMES OF MIST.
	22:30 - 23:00 23:00 - 06:00	1	STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	
7/16/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	WELL WILL NOT CIRCULATE WITH LOWER VOLUMES OF MIST. WELL IS MAKING 2 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, COAL FINE'S. PUMPING SWEEP WITH RIG PUMP EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER WITH 4BBLS WATER. R&R CLEAN OUT 3527' TO 3580' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 TO 12 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 2 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. WELL WILL NOT CIRCULATE WITH LOWER VOLUMES OF MIST.
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 13:00	1	STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	WELL IS MAKING 2 BPH OF COAL. RETURN'S TO SURFACE, COAL FINE'S. PUMPING SWEEP WITH RIG PUMP EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS FOAMER WITH 4BBLS WATER. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. R&R CLEAN OUT 3580' TO 3606' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 TO 12 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 2 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
I .	1	1	1	1	1	1

Page 14 of 16

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004 End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 27

Rig Name:		KEY EN	ERGY			Rig Number: 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/16/2004	07:30 - 13:00	5.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	WELL WILL NOT CIRCULATE WITH LOWER VOLUMES OF MIST. WELL IS MAKING 2 BPH OF COAL.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL AND FINE'S.
				1		PUMPING SWEEP WITH RIG PUMP EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS
						FOAMER WITH 10BBLS WATER.
	13:00 - 13:30	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	SHORT TRIP 4 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TIH, TAG @ 3564'
	13:30 - 19:00	5.50	STIMOP	FCO	COMPZN	R&R CLEAN OUT 3564' TO 3606' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 TO 12 BPH
		0.00				MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						2 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF
						WATER.
						WELL WILL NOT CIRCULATE WITH LOWER VOLUMES OF MIST. WELL IS MAKING 2 BPH OF COAL.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL AND FINE'S.
						PUMPING SWEEP WITH RIG PUMP EVERY 2 HOURS, 2 GALLONS
	40.00 40.00		0711400			FOAMER WITH 5 BBLS WATER.
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 01:30		STIMOP		COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. CONDITION HOLE TO RUN LINER. R&R CLEAN OUT 3580' TO 3606'
	15.50 - 01.50	0.00	31 IIVIOI	1.00	COMPZIN	WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 TO 12 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL
						CORROSION INHIBITOR,
						2 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF
						WATER.
İ						WELL WILL NOT CIRCULATE WITH LOWER VOLUMES OF MIST. WELL IS MAKING 1/4 BPH OF COAL.
						RETURN'S TO SURFACE, COAL FINE'S.
	01:30 - 02:00		FLOWT			TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY HOLE UP.
	02:00 - 02:45	0.75	FLOWT	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 12 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
	02:45 - 04:00	1.25	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	WITH POWER SWIVEL. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST
					JOIN ZIL	INITIAL PRESSURE 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 16 # ON GAUGE 4.00 # 1236 MCFD
						30 MINUTES - 16 # ON GAUGE 4.00 # 1236 MCFD
				İ		45 MINUTES - 38 # ON GAUGE
						WELL MISTING AFTER FIRST READING.
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	CASING	TRIP		TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER.
7/17/2004	06:00 - 07:00	,	CASING		COMPZN	RIG UP TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER, CHANGE AND TEST 5 1/2 RAMS.
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:00		CASING		COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER AND TRIP IN HOLE. FINISH RIGGING UP TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER.
	08:00 - 12:00		CASING		COMPZN	
						and the state of t
						6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/ FLOAT VALVE -
						1.00'
						8- JTS 5-1/2" CASING - 356.06'
						6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR
			!			2.40'
	<u> </u>					TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY -
						359.46' GIH W/ TOTAL OF 92 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/3247'KB.
						RU POWER SWIVEL-
						GIH W/ 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/3273' & TAG UP @ 3606'KB,PBTD.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004 End: 7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 27

Date	Fron	n - To	Hours	Code	Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/17/2004	08:00	- 12:00	4.00	CASING	PUTB	COMPZN	SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 3247'-3606'KB EOL- W/ PBTD @ 3605'KB- RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 3247'KB.
		- 12:30 - 15:30		CASING CASING		COMPZN COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND LOAD OUT POWER SWIVEL. LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, TIH WITH DRILL COLLARS AND LAY DOWN
	15:30	- 16:30	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	SAME. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 20 # ON GAUGE 5.00 # 1374 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 30 # ON GAUGE 7.50 # 1702 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 34 # ON GAUGE 8.50 # 1808 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 35 # ON GAUGE 8.75 # 1848 MCFD WELL MISTING AFTER FIRST READING.
	16:30	- 19:00	2.50	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	WAIT ON DRY WATCH MEN, SECURE WELL AND DRY WATCH RIG FOR THE NIGHT.
7/18/2004	06:00	- 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	DRY WATCH RIG.
	1	- 08:00	1	PERFOR	1	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	l .	- 11:00	l	STIMOP	I	COMPZN	RIG UP BLUE JET AND TEST LUBRICATOR TO 380PSI.
					ł		PERFORATE AT FOLLOWING INTERVALS.
			ļ				3453' - 3458' = 5' 20 SHOTS
							3512' - 3526' = 14' 56 SHOTS
	ŀ						3493' - 3500' = 7' 28 SHOTS
					İ		3424' - 3432' = 8' 32 SHOTS
							3389' - 3392' = 3' 12 SHOTS
							3384' - 3388' = 4' 16 SHOTS
							3434' - 3438' = 4' 16 SHOTS
							3376' - 3380' = 4' 16 SHOTS
							3341' - 3344' = 3' 12 SHOTS
							3313' - 3318' = 5' 20 SHOTS
							3306' - 3308' = 2' 8 SHOTS
							3302' - 3305' = 3' 12 SHOTS
							4 SHOTS PER FOOT, 248 TOTAL SHOTS. 5 WIRELINE RUNS. ONE MISS RUN.
	11:00	- 12:30	1.50	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	BLOW WELL DOWN AND FLOW TEST.
	155	12.00	1.00	1.20		John Zit	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
							30 MINUTES - 35 # ON GAUGE 8.75 # 1848 MCFD
	12:30	- 14:30	2.00	STIMOP	RCST	COMPZN	GIH W/ 30.10' X 2-7/8" 8RD EUE BOX ORANGE PEELED MUD
							ANCHOR W/ 8-(1/4" X 8") SLOTS, 2-7/8" X 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X-O
							COLLAR (0.46'), W/ 0.85' x 2-3/8" OD X 1.78" ID "F" NIPPLE
							CONTAINING BLANKING PLUG
							W/ 2-3/8" X 4' & 8' PUP JOINTS-
							W/ 113JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING
							(3531.29')-
							LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A
							BPV
							EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3586'KB
							1.78" FN @ 3556'KB.
	14:30	- 17:00	2.50	STIMOP	NUND	COMPZN	RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN AND LOAD OUT BOPS.
	17:00	- 06:00	13.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	NIPPLE UP RADAGAN AND RIG UP TO RUN RODS. 2 MEN DRY WATCHING RIG.
			.5.66	J	1		

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 245A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

6/7/2004

Spud Date: 6/2/2004

End:

7/18/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 7/18/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 27

Sub Code Phase Date From - To Hours Code **Description of Operations** 7/19/2004 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 STIMOP OTHR COMPZN 2 MEN DRY WATCHING RIG. 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 STIMOP SFTY COMPZN PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. 07:30 - 09:30 2.00 STIMOP SLKL COMPZN PULL BLANKING PLUG FROM F-NIPPLE WITH SLICKLINE. 0.50 STIMOP OTHR COMPZN 09:30 - 10:00 RIG UP FLOOR TO RUN RODS. 10:00 - 12:00 2.00 STIMOP ALFT COMPZN RU TO RUN RODS-FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)-GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/2" X 12' RWAC-Z INSERT PUMP SN: (CP138) W/ 4' PONY ROD AND 141 3/4" NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE OUT W/8', 6', 4', PONY RODS, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD. RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3556'KB,FN. LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER-PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/500 PSIG (OK)-STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK). HANG OFF PUMP. 5.00 STIMOP RURD COMPZN RIG DOWN, INSPECT BOPS. 12:00 - 17:00 RIG RELEASED @ 1700 HRS TO THE SAN JUAN 32-8 #237A NO TRUCKS AVAILABLE TO MOVE RIG MONDAY 7/10/04. WE WILL GET ALL OUR INSPECTIONS DONE, BOPS, BLOOIE LINES, DRILL PIPE & DRILL COLLARS. WE WILL MOVE RIG TUESDAY 7/11/04. 17:00 - 06:00 13.00 STIMOP OTHR COMPZN 2 MEN DRY WATCHING RIG.