Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

#### UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0137
Expires: November 30, 2000

WELL COM	PLETION OF	RECOMPL	FTION REPORT	AND I OG

	WELL (	JOIVIPL	ETION C	IN NEC	OMIFE	ETION F	KEFOR	I AND L	-00	Ì		SF0786		
la. Type of	_	Oil Well			Dry	Other:					6. If In	dian, Allo	ottee or	Tribe Name
b. Type of	Completion		lew Well er	□ Work (	Over ————	Deepen	□ Plu	ig Back	□ Diff. I	Resvr.	7. Unit	or CA A	greeme	nt Name and No.
2. Name of CONOC	Operator OPHILLIPS	S COMP	ANY		Conta	ct: CHRIS E-Mail:			@conocor	hillips.com		e Name a		l No.
3. Address	PO BOX 2 HOUSTO					3: P	a. Phone h h: 832.48	No. (includ 36,2463	e area code	19203	9. API	Well No.	30-04	5-32179-00-S1
Location At surface	Sec 17	7 T32N R	ion clearly and 10W Mer N 1455FEL 3	IMP			f.		Allı.		3∫ BAS	SIN FRU	ITLAN	
	od interval r			0.90042 N	v Lai, Tu	77.90054 V			ં <sup>પાઉ</sup> ટા	04	H Sec	c., T., R., Area Sec	M., or 1 2 17 T3	Block and Survey 2N R10W Mer N
At total d		.,					ţ <sub>e</sub>	o 4	167. <b>.</b> (	W.		unty or Pa N JUAN	arish	13. State NM
4. Date Sp 05/23/20				ate T.D. Re /09/2004	ached		16. Da	Complet 2 A 10/2004	ed Ready to I	rod.	7. Ele	vations (1 635	DF, KB 2 GL	, kT, GL)*
8. Total De	epth:	MD TVD	3215	19	). Plug E	Back T.D.:	MD TVD	32	Was Z.	20. Dept	h Bridg	e Plug Se		ИD VD
21. Type Ele MUDLO			nical Logs R	un (Submit	copy of	each)			Was	well cored? DST run? ctional Surv	vev?	No No No	¬ Yes	(Submit analysis) (Submit analysis) (Submit analysis)
. Casing an	d Liner Reco	ord (Repo	ort all strings	set in well	<u> </u>						· / LS			(Submit ununjuna)
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.)	Top (MD)		tom Stag (D)	ge Cemente Depth		of Sks. & of Cement	Slurry V (BBL		Cement T	op*	Amount Pulled
12.250		25 H-40	32.0		0	234		150				0		
8.750 6.250		000 J-55 500 J-55	20.0 16.0		0 '8	2810 3215		1	46			<del></del>	0	
24. Tubing	Record													
Size I	Depth Set (M	ID) P	acker Depth	(MD)	Size	Depth Set	(MD)	Packer De	pth (MD)	Size	Dept	h Set (MI	D) F	acker Depth (MD
2.375 5. Producin		3195				26. Perfe	oration Rec	cord						
	mation		Тор		Bottom		Perforated			Size		. Holes		Perf. Status
4) FRI 3)	UITLAND (	COAL		2860	3136	6		2860 T	O 3136	0.75	0	344	OPEN	
C)							·							
D) 27. Acid, Fra	cture, Treat	ment, Cer	nent Squeeze	e, Etc.	<del></del>			··· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		***	<u> </u>			
D	Depth Interva		DAE LINDED	DEAMERA	05#1101	F TO 0 F!	F	Amount and	d Type of N	Material				
			215 UNDER 136 SURGE						_			=		
8. Production	on - Interval	A								<u></u>				
oduced 1	Test Date 06/07/2004	Hours Tested 24	Test Production	Oil BBL 0.0	Gas MCF 1344	Water BBL	Согт	ravity . API	Gas Gravit		roduction		OI IMDIA	IG UNIT
oke I	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas: Ratio		Well S				OWN IN	
	ion - Interva	480.0 I B		0	1344	4 (	)			PGW				
	l'est Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL		Gravity . API	Gas Gravit		roducț <del>ion</del>		ED F	OR RECORD
te I	Гbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas: Ratio		Well S	tatus		AU	5 1 6	3 2004
ee Instruction	IC SURMIS	SSÍON #1	ditional data 34492 VERI /ISED **	FIED RV 1	PHE RI	M WELL	INFORM.	ATION SY	YSTEM	/ISED **	BI M	ARMING	TUN I	IELD OFFICE

20h Drodi	iction - Interv	al C									
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity		Gas	Production Method	
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr. API		Gravity	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio		Well Status		
28c. Produ	ction - Interv	al D		1			1	1			
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API		Gas Gravity	Production Method	ter and
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio		Well Status		
29. Dispos SOLD	ition of Gas(S	Sold, used f	or fuel, veni	ted, etc.)	<u> </u>		L	<u> </u>		4	
30. Summa	ary of Porous	Zones (Inc	lude Aquife	rs):					31. For	mation (Log) Markers	
tests, ii	all important : neluding dept coveries.	zones of por h interval to	rosity and coested, cushion	ontents there on used, tim	eof: Cored in e tool open,	ntervals and a flowing and	ll drill-stem shut-in press	sures			
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Description	s, Contents,	etc.		Name	Top Meas. Depth
OJO ALAN SAN JOSE NACIMIEN KIRTLAND	E ITO	0 293 293 1337 1337						OJ( KIR FRI	CIMIENTO O ALAMO RTLAND UITLAND CTURED CLIFFS	13 1405 1455 2710 3135	
32. Additio	onal remarks well produc	(include plu	igging proc	edure):	al Well set	nematic and	Daily sumn	many are			
attach		ing nom a	io Baomi i	diadia oo	ar. ***Cir GGr	iomado ana		nary are			
	enclosed atta										
	ctrical/Mecha dry Notice fo	-				2. Geologic F  6. Core Anal	•		<ol> <li>DST Rep</li> <li>Other:</li> </ol>	port 4. Dire	ectional Survey
3/ 1 hansl	v cortifi, the	the forces!	ng and atta	had info	tion is com-	nlete and sa-	ent on determine	nined E	m oll ovoilett	e records (see attached inst	ruotions):
34. I licieo	y certify that	•	Elect	ronic Subm For CON	ission #344 OCOPHIL	92 Verified b LIPS COMI	y the BLM PANY, sent	Well Inf	ormation Sys	stem.	ructions):
Name	(please print)				processing	by ADRIEN			,	4AXB3167SE) PRESENTATIVE	
Signati	ure	(Electronic	c Submissi	ion)			Date	08/12/2	2004		
Title 18 U. of the Unit	S.C. Section ted States any	1001 and T false, fictit	itle 43 U.S. ious or frad	C. Section 1 ulent statem	212, make i ents or repre	t a crime for esentations as	any person k to any matte	mowingly er within	and willfully its jurisdiction	to make to any departmen	t or agency

### ConocoPhillips

#### END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

Well Name:	Aztec 201A			<b>Spud</b> : 23-May-04
AP! #:	30-045-32179			Release Drl Rig: 26-May-04
Location:	890' FSL & 1455' FEL	Note - this w	ell is equipped with	rods & pump Move In Cav Rig 2-Jun-04
	Sect 17 - T32N - R10W	7- <sup>1</sup> / <sub>16</sub> " :	3M x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd	Bonnet Release Cav Rig 9-Jun-04
	San Juan County, NM	11" 3M	x 7-1/16" 3M Tubin	g Head
Elevation:	6352' GL (above MSL)	9-5/8" 8	RD x 11" 3M Casin	g Head
Drl Rig RKB:	13' above Ground Level			
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL			<u>SurfaceCement</u>
		X New		Date cmt'd: 23-May-04
Surface Casing	Date set: 23-May-04	Used		Lead : 150 sx Class G Cement
Size	9 5/8 in			+ 2% S001 Calcium Chloride
Set at	ft # Jnts:5			+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes
Wt.	32.3 ppf Grade H-40		11 111 1	1.16 cuft/sx, 174 cuft slurry at 15.8 ppg
Hole Size	12 1/4 in Conn STC		]	Displacement: 15.7 bbls fresh wtr
Excess Cmt	125%	4	4	Bumped Plug at: 21:35 hrs w/ 245 psi
T.O.C.	SURFACE Csg	Shoe <u>234</u> ft		Final Circ Press: 75 psi @ 0.5 bpm
	TD of 12-1/4"	hole 244 ft		Returns during job: YES
				CMT Returns to surface: 5 bbls (24.2 sx)
Noti	fied BLM @ 16:02 hrs on	21-May-04		Floats Held: No floats used
Notified	NMOCD @ 16:05 hrs on	21-May-04		W.O.C. for 6.40 hrs (plug bump to start NU BOP)
			1 111 1	W.O.C. for10.40 hrs (plug bump to test csg)
Intermediate Ca	Date set: 26-May-04	X New		Intermediate Cement
Size	7in65	jtsUsed		Date cmt'd: 26-May-04
Set at		pups		Lead : 365 sx Class G Cement
Wt.	ppf Grade		_   ,     ,	+ 3% D079 Extender
Hole Size	<del></del>			+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes
Excess Cmt	160 % Top of Float	Collar <u>2764</u> ft	4	+ 0.2% D046 Antifoam
T.O.C.	SURFACE Float	Shoe <u>2810</u> ft	}   ]	2.61cuft/sx, 952.7 cuft slurry at 11.7 ppg
Pup @	ft TD of 8-3/4	" Hole <u>2820</u> ft	(	
Pup @	ft		\	Tail: 100 sx 50/50 POZ : Class G cement
Noti	fied BLM @ 21:15 hrs on	24-May-04	\	+ 2% D020 Bentonite
Notified	NMOCD @ 21:17 hrs on	24-May-04	/	+ 2% BWOC S001 Calcium Chloride
			-	+ 5 lb/sx D024 Gilsonite
Production Line		X New		+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes
Size		Used	1 1111	+ 0.2% D046 Antifoam
Nominal Wt.	<del></del> ''		\	1.27 cuft/sx, 127 cuft slurry at 13.5 ppg
Grade	·	LTC	/	Displacement: See Comments
# Jnts:			/	Bumped Plug at: 05:40 hrs w/ 1500 psi
	6.25 / 9.5 inches	0045	\	Final Circ Press: 850 psi at 2 bpm
	ned 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 2810' to	3215	)   🔟	Returns during job: YES
Top of Lines				CMT Returns to surface: 25 bbls (53.8 sx )
PBTD				Floats Held: X Yes No
Bottom of Line	r <u>3215</u> ft			
			)   '	LINCEMENTED LINED
This NOT	F 14-4-d		/	UNCEMENTED LINER
This well was NOT	Cavitated.			
				Schematic prepared by:
			TD 3,215	Steven O. Moore, Drilling Engineer ft 19-June-2004
COMMENTS:			0,210	10 0010 001
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran	a guide shoe and an alı	uminum baffle nlate	1 it above the guide shoe.
	Displaced top wiper plug with water	•	· ·	•
	CENTRALIZERS @ 224', 146', 10	-		Total: 4
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/20 BBLS FRESH		.4 PPG SLIGHTLY I	
	CENTRALIZERS @ 2800', 2721',	2634', 2547', 2461', 237	'5', 213', 83', 40'.	Total: 9
	TURBOLIZERS @ 1467' & 1423'.			Total: 2
5.5" Liner	Ran bladed shoe with float valve of	on bottom of liner. Ran	and set the liner w/ 1	TW H-Latch Drop Off Tool (no liner hanger).
Perforations	Perforated 5-1/2" liner with guns of			
		•	-	06'-2909', 2958'-2960', 2962'-2968', 2970'-2978',
	2979'-2982', 3026'-3035', 3039	'-3044', 3046'-3062', 3	3102'-3106', 3108'-	3121', 3132'-3136': Total 344 holes
Tubing	2-7/8" Orange Peeled Mud Ancho	r 30.04' long with eight e	each 0.25" x 8" slots	just below the upset,
	2-7/8" x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd XO collar,	2-3/8" OD (1.78" ID) F-	Nipple, 1 ea 4.00' ρι	p jt, and 97 jts 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUE 8rd tubing
	Bottom of Mud Anchor at 3195'.	op of F-Nipple at 3165	MD RKB.	-
Pump	12" long strainer attached below 2	" x 1-1/4" x 12' RHAC-Z	insert pump, 1 ea 4	x 3/4" pony rod on top of pump,
&	126 each 3/4" rods, spaced out w	th 1 ea 8' pony rod & 1	ea 1-1/4" OD x 22' p	olished rod
Rods	Set pump in F-Nipple at 3165' MD	RKR		

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 201A Common Well Name: AZTEC 201A

6/2/2004

Spud Date: 5/23/2004 End: 6/9/2004

**Event Name:** 

COMPLETION

Start:

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 6/9/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY 27** 

Rig Number: 27

rig ivalle.	The second of th		Maria de Santa Carro de Carro de Carro	1 1923 11 202 200 200 200	# 5 2 7000 00000 TO 1 1 4 4 5 1 4 - 1 1 1 1	FIGURE 1 - PROMOTO COMMENTS STREET AND AND THE PROMOTO COMMENT OF TH
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/3/2004	07:00 - 17:00	10.00	MOVE	RURD	COMPZN	MOVE RIG AND SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP.
				l		MOVED TO THE AZTEC 201A
						SEC 17 - T32N - R10W
						890'FSL 1455'FEL
	•				i	NEAREST HELI PAD IS 1/4 MILE SOUTH OF THIS LOCATION.
						LEFT VOICE MESSAGE ON THE BLM HOTLINE PHONE FOR
						PRESSURE TEST @ 2010HRS.
						LEFT VOICE MESSAGE ON THE PHONE OF CHARLIE PERRIN WITH
						THE OCD @ 2015HRS.
6/4/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 08:30		DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	LAY BLOOIE LINES AND BLEED OFF LINES.
	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	RIG INSPECTION AND REPAIR GIGS.
	09:00 - 11:30	2.50	DRILL	SFEQ	COMPZN	PRESSURE TEST CASING AND BLIND RAMS 250# LOW AND 1800#
						HIGH FOR 30 MIN. STATE INTEGRITY TEST.
						PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS, HCR VALVES, AND
						ALL MANIFOLD VALVES. 250 # LOW FOR 3 MIN. AND 1800 # HIGH FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK
	11:30 - 12:30	1.00	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PULL DRILL PIPE AND DRILL COLLARS OUT OF BASKET.
	12:30 - 14:30		DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	TRIP IN HOLE WITH DRILL PIPE PICKING UP DRILL PIPE.
	14:30 - 16:00		DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH DRILL PIPE.
						SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
6/5/2004	07:00 - 07:30		DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 10:00		DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	INSPECT DRILL COLLARS AND ALL SUBS. ALL OK
	10:00 - 11:30	1.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PU BHA 6 1/4" RERUN BIT, BIT SUB WITH DP FLOAT, 12 - 3
				ì		1/2" DC'S, 1JT OF 2 7/8" DP, 1-2 7/8" FN W / 1.87 PROFILE.
						TRIP IN HOLE WITH DRILL PIPE TO 2762' TAGGED CEMENT.
	11:30 - 12:30	1.00	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
	12:30 - 12:45		DRILL	SFEQ	COMPZN	PRESSURE TEST AIR LINE AND AIR MANIFOLD, 250PSI FOR 3 MIN
						AND 1200PSI FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK
	12:45 - 14:00	1.25	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	UNLOAD HOLE, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION, DRLG FLOAT COLLAR
						AND 46' OF CEMENT.
						TAG FLOAT @ 2764'
						CSG SHOE @ 2810' TOTAL DEPTH @ 2820'
Ì						TOTAL DEPTH @ 2020
	14:00 - 19:00	5.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRILLING FORMATION 2820' TO 3004'
1		0.00				DRLG WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL
						CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF
						WATER.
	<u> </u>					300PSI ON STANDPIPE.
	,					COMP DISCHARGE TEMP 220 DEGREES
]				]		BOOSTER DISCHARGE TEMP 275 DEGREES BOOSTER RPM 1500
	Ì			i		NO WATER TO SURFACE OR TSTM.
}						
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	19:30 - 01:00	5.50	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRILLING FORMATION 3004' TO 3215'
}						DRLG WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL
						CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF
]	į	İ				WATER. 300PSI ON STANDPIPE.
	Ì					SUUI DI DIA STANDEIFE.
					L	

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 201A Common Well Name: AZTEC 201A

Spud Date: 5/23/2004

Event Name: **COMPLETION** 

Start: 6/2/2004 End: 6/9/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 6/9/2004

Group:

Rig Name: **KEY 27** Rig Number: 27

ing maile.	'	\L   \Z				rag rambor. Zi
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/5/2004	19:30 - 01:00	5.50	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	COMP DISCHARGE TEMP 220 DEGREES BOOSTER PISCHARGE TEMP 275 DEGREES BOOSTER RPM 1500 NO WATER TO SURFACE OR TSTM. COAL INTERVALS 2861' - 2863' 2' 338 UNITS OF GAS 2891' - 2892' 1' 350 UNITS OF GAS 2897' - 2900' 3' 313 UNITS OF GAS 2902' - 2904' 2' 350 UNITS OF GAS 2902' - 2908' 1' 348 UNITS OF GAS 2907' - 2908' 1' 340 UNITS OF GAS 2959' - 2960' 1' 340 UNITS OF GAS 2959' - 2960' 1' 340 UNITS OF GAS 3026' - 3035' 9' 516 UNITS OF GAS 3026' - 3035' 9' 516 UNITS OF GAS 3039' - 3044' 5' 448 UNITS OF GAS 3046' - 3082' 16' 542 UNITS OF GAS 3102' - 3105' 3' 576 UNITS OF GAS 3102' - 3110' 3' 516 UNITS OF GAS 3111' - 3120' 9' 506 UNITS OF GAS 3111' - 3120' 9' 506 UNITS OF GAS
	01:00 - 02:00	1.00	FLOWT	CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 200PSI ON STANDPIPE. WELL WAS MAKING 1 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL, DOWN TO
	02:00 - 02:30 02:30 - 03:30	1	DRILL DRILL	CIRC PULD	COMPZN COMPZN	1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY HOLE UP. PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 14 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
	03:30 - 04:30	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	WITH POWER SWIVEL.  2" OPEN FLOW TEST  INITIAL PRESSURE 5# ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD  15 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD  30 MINUTES - 18.5 # ON GAUGE 4.62 # 1340 MCFD  45 MINUTES - 18 # ON GAUGE 4.50 # 1304 MCFD  60 MINUTES - 18 # ON GAUGE 4.50 # 1304 MCFD
	04:30 - 06:00	1.50	FLOWT	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST INSP 18 PSI 15 MINUTES 30 PSI 30 MINUTES 75 PSI 45 MINUTES 85 PSI 60 MINUTES 90 PSI 75 MINUTES 90 PSI 90 MINUTES 90 PSI
6/6/2004	06:00 - 08:00 08:00 - 08:30 08:30 - 10:00	0.50	DRILL DRILL DRILL	TRIP TRIP UREM	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN. FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE. JSA AND PJSM, PICK UP UNDER REAMER AND SHOCK SUB. TRIP IN HOLE WITH 9.5 UNDER REAMER, SHOCK SUB WITH DP FLOAT, 12 - 3 1/2 DRILL COLLARS, 38 STDS DRILL PIPE, PICK UP POWER SWIVEL, CHANGE OUT STRIPPING RUBBER.

Printed: 8/10/2004 2:24:13 PM

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 201A Common Well Name: AZTEC 201A

6/2/2004

Spud Date: 5/23/2004

**Event Name:** 

**COMPLETION** 

Start: Rig Release: 6/9/2004

6/9/2004 End:

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Group:

Rig Name: **KEY 27** Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/6/2004	10:00 - 19:00	9.00	DRILL	UREM	COMPZN	ESTABLISH CIRCULATION WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. UNDER REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE FROM 2810' TO 2970' 600PSI ON STAND PIPE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00		DRILL DRILL	SFTY UREM	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. UNDER REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE FROM 2970' TO 3215' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 600PSI ON STAND PIPE
6/7/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 600PSI ON STAND PIPE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 08:00	1	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND BLOW WELL DRY.
	08:00 - 09:00		FLOWT	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 14 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 4# ON GAUGE 1.00 # 615 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 16 # ON GAUGE 4.00 # 1236 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 16 # ON GAUGE 4.00 # 1236 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 16 # ON GAUGE 4.00 # 1236 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 16 # ON GAUGE 4.00 # 1236 MCFD
	10:00 - 12:00	2.00	DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH UNDER REAMER AND LAY DOWN SAME. LAY DOWN DRILL COLLAR. CHANGE RAMS IN # 1 BOP TO 3 1/2 RAMS, PICK UP SURGE JOINT.
	12:00 - 19:00	7.00	STIMOP	CAV	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST INSP 30 PSI 15 MINUTES 73 PSI 30 MINUTES 78 PSI 45 MINUTES 80 PSI 60 MINUTES 80 PSI RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE # 1, LET WELL BLOW DOWN. NATURAL SURGE # 2 80PSI NATURAL SURGE # 3 80PSI NATURAL SURGE # 4 80PSI NATURAL SURGE # 5 80PSI
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	19:30 - 20:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	LAY DOWN SURGE JOINT, CHANGE RAMS IN #1 BOP TO 2 7/8 RAMS AND TEST.
	20:00 - 21:30		STIMOP		COMPZN	PICK UP BIT AND BIT SUB AND TRIP IN HOLE TO CASING SHOE.
	21:30 - 22:00 22:00 - 22:30		STIMOP STIMOP	1	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.  GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL. TAG @ 3213'
	22:30 - 23:45	i i	FLOWT	i	COMPZN	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 600PSI ON STAND PIPE
	23:45 - 00:45	1.00	FLOWT	PULD	COMPZN	POH LAYING DOWN 14 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 201A Common Well Name: AZTEC 201A

Spud Date: 5/23/2004

Event Name:

**COMPLETION** 

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Start: 6/2/2004 End: 6/9/2004

Rig Name:

**KEY 27** 

Rig Release: 6/9/2004 Rig Number: 27

Group:

Rig Name:		NET 21				Rig Number. 21
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/7/2004	23:45 - 00:45	1	FLOWT	PULD	COMPZN	SWIVEL.
	00:45 - 01:45	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
	1					INITIAL PRESSURE 7# ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 19 # ON GAUGE 4.75 # 1340 MCFD
	İ					30 MINUTES - 19.5 # ON GAUGE 4.80 # 1344 MCFD
						45 MINUTES - 19.5 # ON GAUGE 4.80 # 1344 MCFD
	04.45 00.45	0.50	FLOWT	D. II D	COMPAN	60 MINUTES - 19.5 # ON GAUGE 4.80 # 1344 MCFD
	01:45 - 02:15 02:15 - 06:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL. CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST
	02.10 - 00.00	3.73	J T I WICT	Oiito	001111 211	WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GAL
	,					SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
	1					600PSI ON STAND PIPE
6/8/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 15 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
						WITH POWER SWIVEL.
						RIG DOWN AND HANG SWIVEL IN DERRICK.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 09:00	1.50	STIMOP	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER.
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00	CASING	RURD	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA, RIG UP TO RUN CASING, CHANGE #1 PIPE RAMS
				1		TO 5 1/2 AND TEST.
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	CASING	RNCS	COMPZN	GIH W/ 5-1/2" 15.5 PPF J-55 LT&C CASING / LINER AS FOLLOWS:
						6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/ FLOAT VALVE
						1.07'
						10- JTS 5-1/2" CASING 433.22'
						6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR -
				Ì		2.40'
						TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY -
			ļ			436.69'
						GIH W/ TOTAL OF 89 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/2812'KB.
						RU POWER SWIVEL-
						GIH W/ 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/2812' & TAG UP @ 3215'KB,PBTD.
						SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 2778-3215'KB EOL-
		<u> </u>		1		W/ PBTD @ 3214KB-  RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 2778'KB.
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	STIMOP	TRIP	COMPZN	PICK UP DROP OFF TOOL AND TRIP IN HOLE WITH 38 STANDS OF DRILL PIPE.
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL, PICK UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	12:30 - 13:00	0.50	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 6 BPH MIST WITH
	10.00					1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER, 2 GALLONS
						SS-1200 POLYMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
						WASH 2 FT OF FILL.
				1		600PSI ON STAND PIPE
	13:00 - 14:00	i .	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND LOAD OUT POWER SWIVEL.
	14:00 - 17:00	3.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, TIH WITH DRILL COLLARS AND LAY DOWN
	17:00 10.00	4.00	0711407	07:15	001/27:	SAME.
6/9/2004	17:00 - 18:00 06:00 - 08:30		STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN	SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
0/8/2004	08:30 - 08:30		STIMOP		COMPZN	KEY SAFETY MEETING AT KEY YARD, TRAVEL TO LOCATION. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	09:00 - 14:00	!	PERFOR		COMPZN	RIG UP BLUE JET AND TEST LUBRICATOR TO 90PSI.
						200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200
	I	I	İ	i	1	

#### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

AZTEC 201A

Common Well Name: AZTEC 201A

6/2/2004

Spud Date: 5/23/2004

**Event Name:** 

COMPLETION

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Start: Rig Release: 6/9/2004 End: 6/9/2004

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY 27** 

Group:

Rig Number: 27

Sub **Description of Operations** From - To Hours Code Phase Date Code COMPZN 6/9/2004 PERFOP PERF PERFORATE AS FOLLOWS. 09:00 - 14:00 5.00 PERFORATE AT FOLLOWING INTERVALS. 3132' - 3136' = 4' 16 SHOTS 13' 52 SHOTS 3108' - 3121' = 3102' - 3106' = 4' 16 SHOTS 16' 64 SHOTS 3046' - 3062' = 3039' - 3044' = 5' 20 SHOTS 3026' - 3035' = 9' 36 SHOTS 2979' - 2982' = 3' 12 SHOTS 2970' - 2978' = 7' 32 SHOTS 2962' - 2968' = 6' 24 SHOTS 2958' - 2960' = 2' 8 SHOTS 2906' - 2909' = 3' 12 SHOTS 2' 8 SHOTS 2902' - 2904' = 2896' - 2900' = 4' 16 SHOTS 2891' - 2894' = 3' 12 SHOTS 2860' - 2864' = 4' 16 SHOTS 4 SHOTS PER FOOT, 344 TOTAL SHOTS. 5 WIRELINE RUNS. 0.50 PERFOP OTHR COMPZN BLOW WELL DOWN. 14:00 - 14:30 RPEQPT PULD 14:30 - 16:30 2.00 COMPZN GIH W/ 30.04' X 2-7/8" 8RD EUE BOX ORANGE PEELED MUD ANCHOR W/ 8-(1/4" X 8") SLOTS, 2-7/8" X 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X-O COLLAR (0.45'), W/ 0.85' x 2-3/8" OD X 1.78" ID "F" NIPPLE CONTAINING BLANKING PLUG (PT BP IN FN T/ 1000 PSIG 5-4-2004 @ B&R SERVICE'S SHOP), W/ 2-3/8" X 4' PUP JOINTS-W/ 97 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING (3148.33')-LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3195'KB 1/4" X 8" SLOTS 3169'KB. 1.78" FN @ 3165'KB. PERF INTERVAL 2860-3136'KB. 2.00 STIMOP NUND COMPZN 16:30 - 18:30 NIPPLE DOWN AND LOAD OUT BOPS, RIG DOWN FLOOR, RIG UP TO RUN RODS. 18:30 - 19:30 1.00 STIMOP OTHR COMPZN SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT. 6/10/2004 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 STIMOP SLKL COMPZN PJSM WITH ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION, JSA WITH WIRELINE HAND. 07:30 - 09:00 1.50 STIMOP SLKL COMPZN SPOT AND RIG UP WIRELINE TRUCK, TEST LUBRICATOR TO 90PSI. PULL BLANKING PLUG FROM F-NIPPLE. 09:00 - 12:00 3.00 STIMOP OTHR COMPZN RU TO RUN RODS-FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)-GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/4" X 12' RHAC-Z INSERT PUMP SN: (CP126) W/ 4' PONY ROD AND 126 3/4" NORRIS. TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE OUT W/8' PONY ROD,

RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD.

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: AZTEC 201A Common Well Name: AZTEC 201A

6/2/2004

Spud Date: 5/23/2004 End:

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: Rig Release: 6/9/2004 6/9/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Group:

Rig Name:	1	KEY 27				Rig Number: 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
6/10/2004	09:00 - 12:00 12:00 - 16:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3165'KB,FN. LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER- PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 500 PSIG (OK)- STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK). HANG OFF PUMP. 36" POLISH ROD STICK UP ABOVE STUFFING BOX WITH LITE TAG. RIG DOWN AND PREPARE TO MOVE TO THE
	12.00 - 10.00	4.00	STIMOP	KOKD	COMPZIA	AZTEC 200A RIG RELEASED @ 1800HRS 6/9/04