Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

# UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BURFALLOF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

			BUREAU	J OF LA	AND MA	NAGEN	<b>IENT</b>						Expires:	Novem	iber 30, 2000	
	WEĽL (	COMPL	ETION O	R RE	COMPL	ETION	REPO	RT	AND L	OG			ease Serial NMSF0790		· · · · · ·	
la. Type of	Well _	Oil Well	☐ Gas V	Vell	Dry	Othe	r: CBM			====		6. I	f Indian, Allo	ottee or	Tribe Name	=
b. Type of	f Completion		lew Well	□ Worl		Deep			Back	□ Diff.	Resvr.	7. (	Unit or CA A	greem	ent Name and No.	
2. Name of	Operator				Cont	act: JUA	NITA FAR	RRE	H-15 11	15 7000		8. I	ease Name a	and We	ell No.	
CONO	COPHILLIP					E-Ma	ail: juanita	a,r,fa	į̇̀̇̀̇̀(ell@co	nocophil		1	SAN JUAN		JNIT 225A	
	PO BOX HOUSTO	N, TX 77	7252				Ph: 505	5.599	o. (include 0.3419\$\&	area cod	<u>[ET</u>		API Well No.	30-04	15-32398-00-81	
	Sec 1	5 T31N R	on clearly an 8W Mer NM	1P	ordance w	ith Federa	ıl requireñ S	nents	)	<00g			Field and Po BASIN FRU			
At surfa	At surface NENW 1025FNL 1545FWL  At top prod interval reported below												Sec., T., R., or Area Se	M., or	Block and Survey 31N R8W Mer NI	MP
• •	F. C.												County or P	arish	13. State	
	At total depth  14. Date Spudded   15. Date T.D. Reached   16. Date Completed   17. Elevation   17. Elevation   18. Date Completed   18												Elevations (	DE KI	NM BRTGD*	
08/05/2				/22/2004			\ \int_{\text{0}}	D & 08/28	A 3/2004	Ready to	Prod.	1		39 GL	5, 111, 02,	
18. Total D	•	MD TVD	3557	i	19. Plug		i.: M TV	D VD	35	56	20. De	pth B	ridge Plug So		MD TVD	
21. Type E MUDLO		ner Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Subr	nit copy o	feach)				Was	well core DST run ectional Si	?	₹ No	ਜ Yes	s (Submit analysis) s (Submit analysis) s (Submit analysis)	
23. Casing a	nd Liner Rec	ord (Repo	ort all strings	set in w	ell)					-						
Hole Size	Size/C	irade	Wt. (#/ft.)	Top (MD		ottom S MD)	tage Ceme Depth		ter No. of Sks. Type of Cen			y Vol. BL)	Cement Top*		* Amount Pulled	
12.250	9.6	625 H-40	32.0	234		150				0						
8.750		000 J-55	20.0		0	3207				52						
6.250	5.	500 J-55	16.0	3	197	3557					9		<del>-</del>			
														_		
24 7 1																
24. Tubing	Depth Set (I	MD) I P	acker Depth	(MD) I	Size	Denth !	Set (MD)	Тр	acker De	oth (MD)	Size	Тг	Depth Set (M	D)	Packer Depth (MI	<u></u>
2.375	Deptil Set (1	3538	acker Depth	(IVID)	Size	Бериг	Set (MD)	+÷	acker Dep	our (IVID)	5120	+	Depth Set (MD)   Tacker Depth (MD)			
25. Produci	ng Intervals					26. P	erforation	Reco	ord						<del></del>	
	ormation		Тор		Bottom		Perfor	ated	Interval		Size	$\Box$	No. Holes		Perf. Status	
	RUITLAND	COAL		3268	346	58		3268 TO 3468				0.750 120 OPEN				
B) C)		— <u>├</u>				┿						$\dashv$			<del></del>	
D)	<del> </del>			-+								十		$\vdash$		
	racture, Trea	tment, Cer	ment Squeeze	e, Etc.												
	Depth Interv	al						Aı	mount and	l Type of	Material					_
		<del></del>														
	<del></del>		<del></del>		<del></del>								<del></del>		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
28. Product	ion - Interva	l A									- <u>-</u>		<del></del>		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	_
Date First Produced 08/28/2004	Test Date 08/27/2004	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL 0.0	Gas MCF 752	Wa BB		Oil Gr Corr.		Gas Grav	ity	Produ	ction Method GAS	PUMP	ING UNIT	
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	Wa		Gas:0	il	Well	Štatus	ــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــ				
Size 1.5 PITO	Flwg. SI	Press. 6.0	Rate	BBL 0	MCF 180	148 BB	0	Ratio			GSI					
	ction - Interv	al B											LACOPO	CC IN	COD DECODE	a i
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	War BB		Oil Gr Corr.		Gas Grav	ity	Produ	cidACCEP	IED 1	run necuni	
Choke	Tbg. Press	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	Wa		Gas:O	ril	Well	Status	Ь_	SĒ	P 1	4 2004	+
Size	Flwg. SI	Press.	Rate	BBL	MCF	BB	L 	Ratio					FARMI	- 10101	LELD OFFICE	
(See Instruct	ions and spe	ices for ad	ditional data	on reve	rse side) V THE P	MUNET	LINEO	Q IM A	TION CY	STEM			BY		18	T
CX	** B	LM RE	VISED **	BĽM F	REVISE	D ** B	LM RE	VISI	ED ** B	LMRE	VISED	** B	LM REVI	SED	**	200

28b. Prod	luction - Interv	al C								<del></del>		
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravi	ity	Production Method		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas: Oil Ratio	Well	Status		— ··· —	
28c. Prod	luction - Interv	al D		<u></u>		<u> </u>		·				
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravi	ity	Production Method		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well	Status			
29. Dispo	osition of Gas	Sold, used j	for fuel, ven	ted, etc.)	1						, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	
	nary of Porous	Zones (Inc	lude Aquife	rs):					1 31. For	mation (Log) Markers		
Show tests,	all important	zones of po	rosity and c	ontents there	e tool open,	ntervals and flowing and	all drill-stem l shut-in pressure	es				
Formation Top Bottom						Descriptio	ons, Contents, etc	ç.		Name	Top Meas. Depth	
SAN JOSE NACIMIENTO OJO ALAMO  32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure): This well is a single well producing from the Basin Fruitland Coal. Attached is Wellbore Schematic and the Daily Summaries.						hed is the	SAN JOSE NACIMIENTO 702 OJO ALAMO 2252 KIRTLAND FRUITLAND COAL 3049					
1. El 5. Su 34. I here	e enclosed atta lectrical/Mechandry Notice for leby certify that e (please print)	anical Logs or plugging the forego	and cementing and attac Elect	verification  ched information  ronic Subm  For CON  AFMSS for	ation is com hission #360 NOCOPHII	24 Verified LLIPS COM	orrect as determing by the BLM WIPANY, sent to NNE BRUMLE	ned from all vell Inform the Farm	nation Sy iington 4/2004 (0	e records (see attached in stem.	structions):	
Signa	iture	(Electron	ic Submiss	ion)		Date (	Date 09/13/2004					

### ConocoPhillips END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

1	,									
Well Name:	San Juan 32-8 #225A							Spud:	5-Au	g-04
API#:	30-045-32398						Release Dr	l Rig:	9-Au	g-04
Location:	1025' FNL & 1545' FWL	Note - t	this well is	equippe	d with rods	& pump	Move in Ca	v Rig_	18-Aı	ig-04
	Sec. 15 - T31N - R8W	7-	- <sup>1</sup> / <sub>16</sub> " 3M x	2-3/8" EU	JE 8rd Boni	net	Release Ca	v Rig	27-Au	ıg-04
	San Juan County, NM	1.	1" 3M x 7-1	1/16" 3M	Tubing He	ad				
Elevation:	6589' GL (above MSL)	9-	5/8" 8 RD	x 11" 3M	I Casing He	ead				
	13' above Ground Level	•	П		רֿד					
_	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL	•	1 1	- 111	1 1	SurfaceCemen	t			
50	<u> </u>	•		- []]			e cmt'd:	6-	Αμα-04	
Cumface Cooling	Data act: 6 Aug 04	[X]	Jour			Lead: 150 sx			rug or	
Surface Casing		. $\vdash$	Jsed	111	1 1	+ 2% BWOC				
Size	9 5/8 in		JSed	111					lakas	
Set at	ft # Jnts:5	•		- [[[		+ 0.25 lb/sx I				
Wt.						1.16 cuft/sx,				
Hole Size						•	placement:			
Excess Cmt			4	111		•	ed Plug at:			
T.O.C.	SURFACE Csg	Shoe <u>234</u> ft					Circ Press:			5 bpm
	TD of 12-1/4	' hole <u>245</u> ft		- 111		Returns	during job: _		YES	
			Ì	111	1 1	CMT Returns	to surface:		16 bbls	<u> </u>
Noti	fied BLM @ 20:43 hrs on	04-Aug-04		111		F	loats Held:	No	floats u	ised
Notified	NMOCD @ 20:46 hrs on	04-Aug-04	-	- 111		W.O.C. for 6	.00 hrs (pli	ıg bump t	o start N	U BOP)
	<u> </u>					W.O.C. for 14	1.25 hrs (pli	ig bump t	o test cs	g)
			-		-			•	`	,
Intermediate Ca	sing Date set: 9-Aug-04		New	- { } }		Intermediate C	ement			
Size		-	Jsed				e cmt'd:	Q_	Δυα-Ω4	
Set at		.,	Jaeu			Lead : 420 sx			Aug-u-	
		pups	Ì	111	] ]			HIJEHL		
Wt.		=		ı		+ 3% D079 E			lation	
Hole Size			ļ	- [		+ 0.25 lb/sx l		nane F	akes	
Excess Cmt		Collar 3167 ft	4			+ 0.2% D046				
	SURFACE Bottom of Casing		1			+ 0.05 gal/sx				
Pup @		" Hole 3212 ft	1	1 11	111	2.61cuft/sx,				
Pup @	ft		Į.			Tail : 100 s	x 50/50 POZ	: Class	G cen	nent
Noti	fied BLM @ 12:46 hrs on	08-Aug-04	1		[	+ 2% D020 E	Bentonite			
Notified	NMOCD @ 12:48 hrs on	08-Aug-04	- 1			+ 2% S001 0	Calcium Chlo	oride		
	***		- 1		1 1 I	+ 5 lb/sx D02	24 Gilsonite			
<b>Production Line</b>	Date set: 25-Aug-04	X	Vew	-	\	+ 0.25 lb/sx	D029 Cellop	hane F	lakes	
Size	5 1/2 in		Jsed	- 1 11		+ 0.1% D046	3 Antifoam			
Nominal Wt.	. 15.5 ppf		/	1 11	$  \cdot  $	1.27 cuft/sx,	127 cuft slu	rrv at 1	3.5 ppa	
Grade	<del></del> ''	LTC	ì	1 11	111		placement:			
# Jnts:			/		\		ed Plug at:			
	6.25 / 9.5 inches		(	- 1 11		•	Circ Press:			
	ned 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3212' to	3557'	\ \ \	111	1   /		during job:			.o bpin
Top of Liner		7 3337	- 1		/	CMT Returns			20 bbls	
PBTD			/		1 1					
			(	0	\	г	loats Held:		— "	J
Bottom of Liner	ft		- /	-1	, , ,					
			)	Y						
			/		_					
This well was NOT	cavitated.		{ .	4		UNCEMENTED	LINER			
						Schematic p				
			TD _	3,55	<u>57                                    </u>	Steven O. M		g Engin	eer	)
COMMENTS:						8-Sept-2004				
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran	a guide shoe and a	an aluminu	ım baffle	plate 1 jt a	bove the guide sh	noe @ 189'.			
]	Displaced top wiper plug with wat	er. Shut in casing I	head and \	WOC bet	fore backin	g out landing jt.				
	CENTRALIZERS @ 224', 146', 10	02', & 59'.						Total	:	4
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/ 20 BBLS. FRES	H WATER AND 108	8.3 BBLS 9	SLIGHTL	Y POLYME	RIZED 8.4PPG	RILLING M	UD.		
1	CENTRALIZERS @ 3197', 3123',	3037', 2950', 2864	', <b>2778'</b> , 21	10', 83', 8	§ 40'.			Total	:	9
[	TURBOLIZERS @ 2349', 2312, 8	2272'.						Total	:	3
5.5" Liner	Ran 6-1/16" OD bladed shoe with		om of liner	. Ran lin	er w/ TIW i	H-Latch Drop Off	Tool (no line			
Perforations	Perforated 5-1/2" liner with guns						1	91		
	garage	= +	U Gianile	,	9,00 pile					
	Perf. Intervals: 3268'-3273', 3276							AL SHO	<u> </u>	244.
Tubing	31.00' x 2-7/8" OD Orange Peele	d Mud Anchor with	eight each	0.25" x	8" slots just	below the upset,				
	2-7/8" x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd crossove		` ,							
	110 jts 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUE 8rd	•		1', & 10.1	3' pup joint	s				
ļ	Bottom of Mud Anchor at 3538'.									
Pump	12" long strainer attached below					•	•			
&	139 ea 25' x 3/4" OD rods, space	out with 1 ea 2', 1 e	ea 4', & 1 e	ea 8' rod	subs & 1 e	a 1-1/4" OD x 22'	polished roo	1		
Rods	Set pump in F-Nipple at 3506' MD	RKB					<u> </u>			

#### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A** 

15:00 - 16:30

16:30 - 17:00

07:00 - 12:00

12:00 - 13:00

13:00 - 17:00

17:00 - 17:30

07:00 - 12:00

12:00 - 16:00

16:00 - 17:00

17:00 - 19:30

19:30 - 06:00

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A

**Event Name:** 

8/20/2004

8/21/2004

COMPLETION

Start:

8/18/2004

Spud Date: 8/5/2004

Rig Release: 8/27/2004

End:

8/27/2004

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS KEY ENERGY 22** 

Ria Number: 22

Group:

1.50 WELCTL NUND

5.00 WELLPR RURD

1.00 WELLPR SFTY

4.00 WELCTL BOPE

5.00 WELCTL NUND

4.00 RPCOMPPULD

1.00 EVALWB CIRC

2.50 WELCTL BOPE

DRLG

10.50 DRILL

0.50 WELLPR OPNW COMPZN

SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-MIRU KEY 22 & SPOT AUXILARY EQUIPMENT-SI 7" INTERMEDIATE CSG -0- PSIG-NU BOPE-NOTIFIED BLM @ 19:00, 8-17-2004 OF PENDING CSG INTEGRITY

TEST.

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

PROD1

PROD1

PROD1

PROD1

0.50 WELLPR OPNW COMPZN SDON COMPZN

SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-

RIG UP AUXILARY EQUIPMENT-RIG INSPECTION & CORRECTIONS. SI 7" INTERMEDIATE CSG -0- PSIG-

ACCUMULATOR ISOLATION AND ACTUATION- (OK)

PT BLIND RAMS & PERFORM CASING INTEGRITY TEST T/ 250 PSIG -5MIN & 1800 PSIG-30MIN-

NOTIFIED BLM @ 19:00, 8-17-2004 OF PENDING CSG INTEGRITY

TEST "2- BLM INSPECTORS ON LOCATION DURING BOP TEST"

SDON.

SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-X-O 2-1/16" VALVE ON EQUALIZING LINE-

REPLACE O'RING'S IN #1 SINGLE GATE BOP.

PRESSURE TEST KILL VALVE T/ 300 PSI-3MIN & 1800 PSIG-10 MIN (OK)-

SI 7" INTERMEDIATE CSG PRESSURE -0- PSIG-

MU 6-1/4" RR XK-20T TRI-CONE INSERT BIT JETTED W/ 3-20'S W/ 3-1/2" REG BOX x 2-3/8"IF BOX BIT SUB BORED, TAPPED, AND CONTAINING A FLOAT VALVE, W/ 12-(3-1/2") DC'S-TBHA 377.06', W/ 2-3/8"IF X 2-7/8" AOH X-O SUB, W/ 88- JOINTS 2-7/8" AOH DRILL PIPE T/3143'KB, TOC.

RU POWER SWIVEL & CIRCULATE 7" WELLBORE CLEAN W/ Kfc PRODUCED WATER.

PT #2 PIPE RAMS CHOKE MANIFOLD / 7" CASING T/350 PSIG -3 MIN & 1800 PSIG -15MIN (OK)

PT #1 PIPE RAMS & HCR VALVES T/350 PSIG-3MIN & 1800

PSIG-15MIN (OK)

ISOLATE AND CHECK DRILL PIPE FLOAT VALVE (OK)-PT STANDPIPE / KELLY HOSE / POWER SWIVEL / & 2-7/8" TIW

VALVE T/ 2000 PSIG-10 MIN (OK) .

PT AIR LINES & MIST PUMP T/1525 PSIG (OK).

"BLM INSPECTOR DURING TEST"

BREAK CIRCULATION W/ 1500 CFM AIR & 6 BPH MIST CONTAINING 1 GAL F-450 FOAMER & 1/4 GAL CORRISION INHIBITOR / 10 BBLS

PRODUCED Kfc WATER@ 1300-525 PSIG-

DRILLOUT CEMENT / FC @3167'KB / CEMENT / GS @ 3207'KB / CEMENT T/ 3212'KB, 8-3/4" TD.

DRILLING 6-1/4" OPEN HOLE SECTION F/3213 - T/ 3557'KB-W/ 6K WOB @ 70-80 RPM'S @ 1100-1400 FT-LBS OF TORQUE-

COAL INTERVALS NET FEET OF COAL MAX GAS UNITS 3270-3273' (3')196 3276-3272 (6')196 3303-3304 (1')150 3306-3312' 115

(6')3385-3405 (20')3437-3451' (14')

Printed: 9/13/2004 2:57:51 PM

185

672

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A

**Event Name:** 

**COMPLETION** 

Start:

8/18/2004

Spud Date: 8/5/2004

End:

8/27/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/27/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY 22** 

Rig Number: 22

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Fig. 1.	De	escription	of Operation	าร		
8/21/2004	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	DRILL	DRLG	PROD1	3453-3468'		(15')	67	2		
						TOTAL NET	FEET OF C	OAL 65'.				
						PICTURED		_				
3/22/2004	06:00 - 08:00	2.00	EVALWB	CIRC	COMPZN	1			RTING OPERA		A T.	14//
				}		1	•		M & 6 BBL / HI C-316 CORRIS			
				ĺ		BBLS PROD				,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,		5117 10
			RETURNS: 1-1/2+ DOWN T/ 1/2 OF A BUCKET / HR OFF MU									
	LOGGER SAMPLIER VALVE OF 1/4" CHUNKS DO											FEE
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00	EVALWB	CIBC	COMPZN	GROUNDS DRY UP WE			A I D			
	08.00 - 10.00	2.00	EVALVE	CIRC	COMPZIN	~ 32 BWPD		/ 1500 CFW	AIK-			
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	PULL UP IN		83'KB.				
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	EVALFM	PRDT	COMPZN	FLOW TEST						
		i				CONSISTER	HOKE MAN	FOLD #'S	PITOT #'S	MSC	FD	1
						15MIN	8.0		2.00	869	1	DRY
						30MIN	7.5		1.87	837	•	DRY
				•		45MIN	7.5		1.87	837	1	DRY
	10.00 11.00	0.00	EVALENA	OLDD	COMPAN	60MIN	7.5		1.87	837	1	DRY
	12:00 - 14:00	2.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SIPBU ISIP 15MI	N 30MIN	45MIN 60	MIN			
				i		16# 140#		150# 150#				
						NATURAL S						
			<u> </u>				VERY LITTL	E IF ANY R	ETURNS TO S	URFACE	: AF	ER
	14:00 - 18:45	4 75	RPCOME	TRIP	PROD1	SURGE.	P F/ 3183 - 1	T/3550'KB 7	OF FILL AFT	FR SUR	3F #	1_
						PULL UP IN			0. 1.2270 11		<i>,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,</i>	•
						RD POWER						
						1			ALL PROTEC	TION-		
						ì		ASSEMBLY	- S UNDER-REA	MER W	/ (RC	LLER
						1			SHOCK SUB		•	
									E, W/ 12-(3-1/2			
		İ							PIPE W/ 1.875	" ID "F" N	IPPL	.E
			ĺ			RUN 1-JT A RU POWER		L CULLARS	1/3211KB.			
	18:45 - 03:00	8.25	DRILL	REAM	PROD1			& UNLOADE	D A 5 BBL SL	UG OF W	/ATE	R-
		1							0 CFM AIR & 8			
						1 '			LS AND 1/4 G/	AL CORF	INH	IBITOR
						/ 10 BBLS K		<u>.</u>	- D-FT-LBS OF 1	OROUE	W/	-3-6K
						WOB @ 804		1100 1000		JINGOL		J-UIV
	03:00 - 05:00	2.00	EVALWB	CIRC	PROD1	1		ON WELLBO	ORE PRIOR T	O PULLIN	١G	
						UNDER-RE		T/ 1/2 OF A	BUCKET / UP	OE EINE	CAL	וח די
		]				1/4" COAL C		11 112 OF A	BUCKET / HR	OF FINE	SAN	ון טו
						DRY UP W/	1500 CFM					
0/00/0004	05:00 - 06:00	1	RPCOME	1	PROD1	PULL UNDE						
8/23/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	EVALFM	PRDT	COMPZN	SAFETY ME		OR TO STAF	RTING OPERA	TIONS-		
				]		I FOM IESI	INNUZ					

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A

Spud Date: 8/5/2004 End:

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 8/18/2004 8/27/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/27/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY 22** 

Rig Number: 22

Date	From - To.	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations							
8/23/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	EVALFM	PRDT	COMPZN	TIME CHOKE MANIFOLD #'S PITOT #'S MSCFD / CONSISTENCY							
						15MIN 10.0 2.50 970 / DRY							
						30MIN 10.0 2.50 970 / DRY							
•						45MIN 10.0 2.50 970 / DRY							
						60MIN 10.0 2.50 970 / DRY							
	07:00 - 09:30	2.50	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SIPBU							
				1		ISIP 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN 75MIN 90MIN 2HR							
		1	1	1		19# 114# 156# 168# 170# 170# 173# 175#							
	00:00 40:00	4.00	DDCCN	TOID	COMPAN	BLEED WELL SLOWLY DOWN TO PIT.							
	09:30 - 13:30	4.00	RPCOM	TIRIP	COMPZN	REVIEW DERRICK RESCUE AND FALL PROTECTION- COOH & LAYDOWN UNDER-REAMER-							
						GIH W/ 6-1/4" DRLG ASSEMBLY T/3183'KB.							
	13:30 - 14:45	1 25	EVALFM	SIDB	COMPZN	SIPBU							
-	10.00 - 14.40	1.23	LVALIV	On D	OOMI ZIV	ISIP 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN							
						20# 135# 180# 210# 210#							
						NATURAL SURGE #2 W/ 210 #S-							
						RETURNS: VERY LITTLE IF ANY RETURNS TO SURFACE AFTER							
ļ		ļ	ļ	ļ		SURGE.							
	14:45 - 15:15	0.50	RPCOM	TRIP	COMPZN	SHORT TRIP F/3183 & TAG 5' OF NEW FILL @ 3545'KB, PULL UP T/							
						3530'KB							
	15:15 - 23:30	8.25	EVALWE	CIRC	COMPZN	BREAK CIRCULATION / R&R W/ 1500 CFM AIR & 6 BPH MIST							
						CONTAINING 1 GAL F-450 FOAMER & 1/4 GAL CORRISION							
						INHIBITOR / 10 BBLS PRODUCED Kfc WATER @ 500 PSIG-							
						UNLOADED A ~10 BBL SLUG OF WATER-							
						RETURNS:2 DOWN T/1/4 OF A BUCKET / HR OFF MUD LOGGER							
						SAMLIER VALVE OF 1" CHUNKS DOWN TO COFFEE GROUND SIZE							
						60% COAL / 40% SHALE.							
	23:30 - 00:30	1.00	RPCOM	тою	COMPZN	DRY UP W/ 1500 CFM AIR PRIOR TO PULLING UP INTO 7". PULL UP INTO 7".							
	00:30 - 06:00		EVALEM		COMPZN	SIPBU FOR NATURAL SURGES							
	00.00 - 00.00	3.50	L VALI W	011 5	COWII ZIV	SURGE # ISIP 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN							
						#3 20# 130# 155# 165# 165#							
						#4 20# 132# 154# 165# 165#							
						#5 18# 128# 162# 182# 216# CON'T SIPBU							
				-		PERFORM NATURAL SURGES #3-#4 W/ 165#'S							
				İ		RETURNS: VERY LITTLE IF ANY RETURNS TO SURFACE AFTER							
			l			SURGE.							
8/24/2004	06:00 - 13:30	7.50	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-							
			ļ			SIPBU FOR NATURAL SURGES							
						SURGE # ISIP 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN 75MIN 90MIN							
						2HR							
						#6 20# 140# 185# 235# 255# 267# 267# #7 20# 145# 190# 225# 256# 252# 245#							
						#7 20# 145# 190# 225# 256# 252# 245# #8 20# 145# 190# 225# 245# LOGGING OFF							
1	1					#5 20# 145# 150# 225# 245# LUGUING OFF							
						PERFORM NATURAL SURGES #6-#8 W/ 245-267#'S							
				1		RETURNS: VERY LITTLE IF ANY RETURNS TO SURFACE AFTER							
{	1	1	1	1		SURGE.							
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	RPCOM	TRIP	COMPZN								
	14:00 - 03:00	13.00	EVALWE	CIRC	COMPZN	BREAK CIRCULATION UNLOADED A ~5 BBL SLUG OF Kfc							
		}				PRODUCED WATER-							
1				1									

Printed: 9/13/2004 2:57:51 PM

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

8/18/2004

Spud Date: 8/5/2004 8/27/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/27/2004

End: Group:

Rig Name: **KEY ENERGY 22** Rig Number: 22 第5、12 等的是《生物》。 大學和歌歌歌舞和歌歌《中华神·尼州歌歌歌歌》。 大小小田海歌歌歌,从一里看着黑雾飘光,在一个大声的眼睛眼里,不是不是黑雾歌歌歌歌

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase		erile Geber	De	scriptio	on of O	perati	ons		
8/24/2004	14:00 - 03:00	13.00	EVALW	CIRC	COMPZN	CLEANOI		RU BRID	GE @ 34	150' & 7'	BRIDG	E @ 349	98'-CO	esterit, etg. (st. 1927).
						R&R @ 3		W/ 150	0 CEM	AIR & 6 F	SPH MIS	ST CON	ΑΙΝΙΑΤ	IG 1
						GAL F-45								
						PRODUC	ED Kfc	WATER	@ 500	PSIG-				
						RETURN:	S:1-1/2	DOWN.	T/1/4 OF	A BUCK	CET / HE	R OFF M	IUD LO	OGGER
						SAMLIER				KS DOW	N TO F	ACE PO	WDEF	SIZE
						80% COA								
	03:00 - 04:00	1.00	RPCOM	DTDID	COMPAN	DRY UP \			IR PRIO	R TO PU	ILLING	UP INTO	O 7".	
	04:00 - 06:00		EVALF		COMPZN	PULL UP								
	04.00 00.00	2.00	LVALI IV	יוייייייייייייייייייייייייייייייייייייי	COMPZIN	TIME			OLD #'S	DIT(	OT #'S	MC	CED	,
						CONSIST			OLD#3	, rii	JI #3	IVIO	CFD	′
						15MIN		6.5		1.63		763	1	DRY
						30MIN		6.5		1.63		763		DRY
						45MIN		7.0		1.75		782		DRY
						60MIN		7.0		1.75		782	1	DRY
						75MIN		7.5		1.88		837	1	DRY
						90MIN		7.5		1.88		837		DRY
8/25/2004	06:00 - 21:00	15.00	EVALFM	SIDB	COMPZN	105MIN	WEETIN	7.5	D TO 61	1.88		837		DRY
0,20,2004	00.00 - 21.00	15.00	LVALIN	SIFB	COMPZIN	SAFETY I				IARTING	OPER	ATIONS	j <b>-</b>	
						SURGE #				45MIN	60MI	IN 751	MIN 9	OMIN
Ì						2HR	1011	1011111	JOININ	TOWNIN	OUIVII	111 731	VIIIN S	OWIN
						#9	15#	50#	180#	185#	185#			
				1		#10	12#	135#	168#	175#	185#	185#	186#	186#
	ì		Ì			#11	20#	120#	170#	195#	200#	200#		
				1		#12	18#	125#	174#	190#	205#	205#		
						#13	10#	105#	160#	210#	223#	225#	230#	
						#14	11#	107#	168#	205#	235#	240#	240#	:
						PERFORM	ANATI	IDAL CI	IDOEC 4	D #44 14		40440		
						RETURNS	S VERY	/ I ITTI F	FIF ANY	PETUR	/ 100-24 NG TO	40# 5 SLIDEA	~E ^E	rep
				ŀ		SURGE.			/	112.011		0011171	JL / 1	
Ì	21:00 - 21:30	0.50	RPCOM	TRIP	COMPZN	GIH W/ 6-	1/4" DR	LG ASS	EMBLY	F/3183 8	TAG B	RIDGE	@ 345	0'KB.
	21:30 - 02:00	4.50	EVALWE	CIRC	COMPZN	BREAK C	IRCULA	U NOITA	NLOADE	ED A ~10	BBL S	LUG OF	Kfc	
							BREAK CIRCULATION UNLOADED A ~10 BBL SLUG OF Kfc PRODUCED WATER-							
						CLEANOL	JT THR	U BRIDO	GE @ 34	50' & CC	T/3557	7'KB,PB	TD	
						R&R @ 3	557'KB,	, W/ 150	0 CFM A	IR & 6 B	PH MIS	T CONT	<b>FAININ</b>	G 1
	,					GAL F-450	POAM	1ER & 1/	4 GAL C	ORRISI	HNI NC	BITOR.	/ 10 BE	BLS
						PRODUCI RETURNS	ED NIC I	VVA I ER VVI T/4/4	(C) 500 F	'SIG-	/ LID OF			<b>-</b>
						SAMLIER	VALVE	OF COL	FEEE GE		DOWN	TOEA	CE	ER
						POWDER	SIZE 8	0% COA	1 / 20%	SHALF	DOWN	IOFA	CE	
	02:00 - 05:00	3.00	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	PULL UP				O. 17 (EE.				
						SHORT TO	RIP F/ 3	3183 T/ 3	3557'KB,	PBTD-				
						REVIEW D	DERRIC	K RESC	UE AND	FALL P	ROTEC	TION-		
	05:00 - 06:00	4.00	CACINIC	D1122	DDOS:	COOH W/				.Y.				
8/26/2004	10:30 - 11:30		CASING WELLPR	1	PROD1	RU TO RU								
5. 20, 200 1	10.00 - 11.00	1.00	VVELLER	KOKD	PROD1	SAFETY N	NEE IIN BIT GD	ADED:	K IOST	ARTING	OPER/	ATIONS	-	1
		ĺ				6-1/4" RR MU "H" LA	TCH LI	NES HA	NGER A	SSEMP	7-1D)-	EIDET 1	OINT 4	)
	ļ					DRILL PIP			OLK P	COLIND	LI ON I	ורטו ל	OIM1 (	7
						,,								1

Printed: 9/13/2004 2:57:51 PM

#### Page 5 of 6

#### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A

Event Name: Contractor Name: COMPLETION

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Start:

8/18/2004

Spud Date: 8/5/2004 End:

8/27/2004

Rig Release: 8/27/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY 22** 

Rig Number: 22 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/26/2004	10:30 - 11:30	1.00	WELLPR	RURD	PROD1	MU 6-1/16" TIW BLADED SHOE ON 1ST JOINT OF CASING FCP 7 PSIG 1.75 PSIG PITOT = 782 MSCFD DRY WHILE ATTENDING
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50	WELCTL	BODE	PROD1	MONTHLY SAFETY MEETING-  X-O & PT PIPE RAMS T/ 180 PSIG- (OK)
	12:00 - 14:30		CASING		PROD1	GIH W/ 5-1/2" 15.5 PPF J-55 LT&C CASING / LINER AS FOLLOWS:
	12.00	2.00	O/ toll to	110110	I KODI	1011 W 5-1/2 15.5 PPP 5-55 ET&C CASING / LINER AS POLLOWS.
						6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/ FLOAT VALVE - 1.00'
						8- JTS 5-1/2" CASING -
						356.26'
						6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR -
				Į.		2.40'
	*					TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY - 359.66'
	14.20 45.20	4 00	040000		55654	GIH W/ 90 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/3180'KB.
	14:30 - 15:30	1.00	CASING	HOSO	PROD1	GIH & SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 3180-T/3557'KB EOL-
			ŀ			W/ PBTD @ 3556'KB-
						RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 3197.3'KB. 7" SHOE @ 3207'KB.
	15:30 - 17:00	1.50	RIGMNT	SVRG	COMPZN	RIG SERVICE-
						OIL CHANGE & LUBRICATION-
	17:00 - 21:00	4.00	RPCOME	PULD	COMPZN	COOH & LAYDOWN 2-7/8" DP AND SETTING TOOL-
						TRIP IN & LAYDOWN DC'S.
						"BREEZY AFTERNOON"
	21:00 - 06:00	9.00	WELLPR	RURD	COMPZN	CHANGE OUT #1 PIPE RAMS T/ 2-3/8"-
		1				RD POWER SWIVEL & MANUAL TONGS-
						PREP & TALLY TBG
						RU TO PERFORATE.
8/27/2004	06:00 - 11:30	5 50	PERF	PERF	COMPZN	SICP 215 PSIG. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-
G. Z Z. G	00.00 11.00	0.50		CIN	COMPZIN	SICP-210 PSIG.
				1		RU BLUE JET PERFORATORS-
						PT LUBRICATOR T/ 210 PSIG.
					}	GIH & PERFORATE Kfc INTERVALS:
						3453-3468'
						3437-3449'
						3399-3406'
						3386-3396'
						3307-3313'
						3276-3282' 3268-3273'
						0200-0270
						TOTAL 244 (0.75") DIAMETER 120 DEGREE PHASED HOLES-
						RD PERFORATORS-
	44.00 40.55					SIP AFTER PERFORATING 267 PSIG.
	11:30 - 13:00	1.50	WELCTL	BOPE	COMPZN	PT 2-3/8" PIPE RAMS T/ 267 PSIG (OK)-
						BLEED WELL DOWN TO PIT.
	13:00 - 15:15	2 25	RPCOMF	PULD	COMPZN	FLOW TEST THRU 2" @ 6 PSIG = 1.5# PITOT = 752 MSCFD / DRY GIH W/ 31.00' X 2-7/8" 8RD EUE BOX ORANGE PEELED MUD
		2.20	501411	. 525	JOHN ZIN	ANCHOR W/ 8-(1/4" X 8") SLOTS, 2-7/8" X 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X-O
						COLLAR (0.46'), W/ 0.85' x 2-3/8" OD X 1.78" ID "F" NIPPLE
i						CONTAINING BLANKING PLUG
						(PT BP IN FN T/ 1000 PSIG 8-24-2004 @ B&R SERVICE'S SHOP),
					ĺ	

#### Page 6 of 6

#### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT 225A

8/18/2004

Spud Date: 8/5/2004

Event Name:

**COMPLETION** 

Start:

End:

8/27/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 8/27/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY 22** 

Rig Number: 22

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
8/27/2004	13:00 - 15:15	2.25	RPCOMI	PULD	COMPZN	W/ 2-3/8" X 6.13, 8.21, & 10.13' PUP JOINTS- W/ 110 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING (3470.11')- LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A BPV PBTD @ 3556'KB EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3537.9'KB 1/4" X 8" SLOTS 3509'KB. 1.78" FN @ 3506'KB. PERF INTERVAL 3268-3468'KB. TOP OF LINER @ 3197'KB.
	15:15 - 17:00	1.75	WELCTL	NUND	COMPZN	RIG DOWN FLOOR & AUXLIARY EQUIPMENT- ND BOPE & NU 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" 3M BONNET. PULL BPV.
	17:00 - 18:00	1.00	RPEQPT	SLKL	COMPZN	SICP 235 PSIG- RU B&R SERVICE- PT LUBRICATOR T/ 235 PSIG (OK)- GIH W/ EQUALIZING PROBE & RUPTURE DISC IN "FWE" PLUG IN FN @ 3506'KB- TRIP AND RETRIEVE BP IN FN- FL @ 3410'GL- RD SLICKLINE.
8/28/2004	18:00 - 19:00 07:00 - 11:30	I .	WELLPR RPCOMI	l .	COMPZN COMPZN	SDON. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-SICP-265 PSIG. BLEED CSG DOWN TO PIT-RU TO RUN RODS-FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)-GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/2" X 12' RWAC-Z INSERT PUMP SN: (CP156) W/ 4' PONY ROD AND 139 3/4" NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE W/ 2', 4', & 8' PONY RODS, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD. RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3506'KB,FN. LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER-PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 500 PSIG (OK)-STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK).
	11:30 - 16:00	4.50	WELLPR	RURD	COMPZN	RIG DOWN & RELEASE RIG @ 16:00, 8-27-2004- DROP FROM REPORT- TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION OPERATIONS- "JOB COMPLETE"