Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

AMEL I	COMPI	ETION O	R RECOMPI	ETION	DEDODT	AND	ING
	· · CIMPI	FIGNU	RREGUNIE		REFURI	AND	LUG

	FAAETT #	OWIFL	ETION	K KECO	IAILFEI	ON KI	_F OK I		.00		NN	/ISF07874	io.		
la. Type of	Well Completion		Gas Vew Well	Well		Other: Deepen	CBM Plug	Back	□ Diff. Re		6. If I	idian, Allo	ttee or	Tribe Name	
b. Type of	Completion	_		_	Vei	——	∐ r iug				7. Uni NA	t or CA Ap INM7841	greemer 9D	nt Name and No).
2. Name of	Operator						FARREI					se Name a			
	POBOX:							_	nocophillip area code).	1		Well No.		INIT 208A	
	HOUSTON	N, TX 77	252	,		Ph	: 505.599	.3419	7	3 7 8 t	32		30-039	9-27854-00-S1	:
4. Location		T30N R	5W Mer NM	d in accorda 1P	ince with F	ederal rec	[uirements]	r *	(^) ` .		10;7Н1 В /	eld and Po SIN FRU	OI, OF E	xploratory ID COAL	
At surfa	ce SESE	270FSL 7	10FEL						V D	150 30 2	11. Se	c.,T., R.,	M., or 1	Block and Surve	y NMD
At top p	rod interval r	eported be	low						02	\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\	7 12. C	ounty or Pa	arish	13. State	- VIVII
At total	-								O ARRIBA		NM				
14. Date Sp 10/24/2	004			ate T.D. Rea /12/2004	cnea		16. Date D & 2 11/16	Complete A 1/2004	ed Salaria Ready to Pr	od.	17. EI		0F, KB 14 GL	s, RT, GL)*	
18. Total D	epth:	MD TVD	3132 3132	19.	Plug Back	T.D.:	MD TVD	31 31	34 2/2	20. Dept	h Brid	ge Plug Se	t: N	MD TVD	
	lectric & Oth		-	un (Submit o	copy of eac	h)			22. Was v	vell cored?	15	a No r	¬ Yes	(Submit analysis	<u>s)</u>
MUDLO)G									OST run? ional Surv	ey?	ו טעווק	了 Yes Yes	(Submit analysi (Submit analysi	s) s)
23. Casing ar	nd Liner Reco	ord (Repo	rt all strings	set in well)					<u>.</u>						
Hole Size	Size/Gi	rade	Wt. (#/ft.)	Top (MD)	•		Cementer Depth		f Sks. & of Cement	Slurry V (BBL		Cement T	Op*	Amount Pulle	ed
12.250	9.6	25 H-40	32.3	(MD)	<u> </u>	29	- Jopan	1900	150	(DDE	"		0		8
8.750	7.0	00 J-55	20.0		28	72			470				0		50
6.250	5.5	00 J-55	15.5	2817	31	32			0				\Box		
	 				 						_		\longrightarrow		
						+					-		\longrightarrow		
24. Tubing	Record		_	L					···						
	Depth Set (M		cker Depth	(MD) S	ize De	pth Set (MD) P	acker Dep	oth (MD)	Size	Dep	th Set (MI)) F	Packer Depth (M	ID)
2.375 25. Producii		3110				6. Perfor	ation Reco	rd							
	ormation		Тор	В	ottom			erforated Interval Size				No. Holes Perf. Status			
A) FR	RUITLAND C	OAL		2929	3046			2929 T	O 3046	0.75	0	208 OPEN			
B)															
C)	- ,												 		
	racture, Treat	ment, Cen	nent Squeeze	e, Etc.				-	<u>l</u>	_			Ĺ		
	Depth Interva	ıl					Ar	nount and	l Type of M	aterial					-
															
			+	· · ·											
					,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,								***		
	ion - Interval			lo:		Torr	laye		- 12						
Date First Produced 11/16/2004	Test Date 11/15/2004	Hours Tested 1	Test Production	Oil BBL 0.0	Gas MCF 1030.0	Water BBL 0.0	Oil Gra Corr. A		Gas Gravity	ľ	roductio	n Method GAS I	PUMPII	NG UNIT	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:O Ratio	1	Well St	atus					
2" PITOT	SI	2.8		0	24720	0				GSI					Paramento.
28a. Produc	tion - Interva	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gr	avity	Gas	Ī	roductio	ACCEF Method	<u>'TED</u>	FOR RECO	RD
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr.		Gravity	ľ		Ì	_	. W 0	Ì
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	Water	Gas:O	1 -	Well St	atus		l UI	<u> </u>	7 2004	-
Size	Flwg. SI	Press.	Rate	BBL	MCF	BBL	Ratio					FARM	NGIU	m riflu UFFI	CE
(See Instruct.	ions and space	es for ada	ditional data	on reverse	side)							- PI		20	1

28b. Prod	uction - Inter	val C										
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas	_	Production Method		
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	COIT. API	Gravity				
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	Water	Gas:Oil	Well Stat	tus	<u>L</u>		
Size	Flwg. SI	Press.	Rate	BBL	MCF	BBL	Ratio					
28c. Prod	uction - Inter	val D	1		1							
Date First Produced	Test	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity		Production Method		
rroduced	Date	rested	Floduction	BBL	MCF	BBL	Coll. AFT	Clavity				
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well Sta	tus		•	
Size	Flwg. SI	Press.	Rate	BDL	MCF	DBL	Ratio					
	sition of Gas	Sold, used	for fuel, veni	ed, etc.)	<u> </u>	<u> </u>						
SOLI	nary of Porous	7ones (Ir	olude Aquife	nc).					31 For	mation (Log) Marker	c	
	-	-			of: Cored	intervals and	all drill-stem	-	51. FOI	mation (Log) Marker	5	
tests,							d shut-in pressure	es				
	Formation		Ton	Pottom		Description	ons Contents etc	, 		Nome		Тор
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Description	ons, Contents, etc			Name		Meas. Depth
SAN JOS NACIMIE			0 1078	1078 2216						CIMIENTO O ALAMO		958 2325
OJO ALA			2216	2399					KIR	RTLAND		2460
										UITLAND CTURED CLIFFS		2797 3147
									•			
		1										
										•		
		Ì			Ì							
	•											
32. Addit	ional remarks	(include	olugging proc	edure):				L				
This	well is a sing oore Schema	gle well pr	oducing fron	n the Basir	Fruitland	Coal. Attac	hed is the					
*****	5010 001101110	200 2 110 0	io Daily Gail	manos.								
			•									
33. Circle	e enclosed att	achments:					·				-	
1. El	ectrical/Mech	anical Log	gs (1 full set re	eq'd.)		2. Geologic	Report	3. I	OST Re	port 4	. Direction	al Survey
5. Su	indry Notice f	or pluggin	g and cement	verification		6. Core An	alysis	7 O	ther:			
34. I here	by certify tha	t the foreg								e records (see attache	d instructio	ons):
				For CON	ЮСОРНІ	LLIPS CON	l by the BLM W APANY, sent to	the Farmin	gton			
					processing	g by ADRIE	NNE BRUMLE		•	,		
Name	(please print) JUANIT	A FARRELL				Title A	AUTHORIZE	D REP	PRESENTATIVE		
a:	ture	(Flectro	nic Submiss	ion)			Doto 4	12/06/2004				
Sions		(-15000					Date	2/00/2004				
Signa		~										

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

Conocormul	os.										
Well Name:	San Juan 30-5 # 208A								Spud: _	24-0	oct-04
API#:	30-039-27854							Release D	rl Rig: _	27-0	ct-04
Location:	270' FSL & 710' FEL		Note - this	well is equip	ped with I	rods & p	ump	Move In Ca	v Rig: _	7-No	ov-04
	Sec. 19 - T30N - R5W		7- ¹ / ₁₆ '	' 3M x 2- ³ / ₈ "	EUE 8rd	Bonnet		Date TD Rea	ched:	11-N	ov-04
	Rio Arriba County, NM		11" 3	M x 7-1/16" 3	3M Tubing	g Head		Release Ca	v Rig:	15-N	ov-04
Elevation:	6234' GL (above MSL)		9-5/8"	8 RD x 11"	3M Casin	g Head			_		
	13' above Ground Level				$\Pi\Pi$						
_	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL					700 646	SurfaceCem	ent			
				Halas		Harris,		ate cmt'd:	24	I-Oct-04	4
Surface Casing	Date set: 24-Oct-04		X New					sx Class G C			
Size	9 5/8 in		Used		111	111		OC S001 CaC			
Set at								x D130 Cellor		lakes	
Wt.				No.				ex, 174.0 cuft s			na -
Hole Size						lands.		isplacement:			
Excess Cmt								mped Plug at:			
		Shoe 229	ft					al Circ Press:			
1.0.0.	TD of 12-1/4'		— "	957		ELL		ns during job:		YES	<u> </u>
	.50.12	10.0	_"		111			ns to surface:		ols (44.9	9 cuft)
Notic	fied BLM @ 00:20 hrs on	23-Oct-04		Чi			OWN HELD	Floats Held:		floats	
	NMOCD @ 00:20 hrs on	23-Oct-04					W O C for	6.00 hrs (p			
Notified	10000 @ IIIs dil	23-001-04	`								
				771.1		ja j	VV.O.C. 101 _	10.50 hrs (p	.ug bump	io iesi cs	sg)
	Data anti 07 Ont 04		Valoud								
Intermediate Ca			X New			ili ar	Intermediate		٥.	7 0 - 4 0	
Size	7 in 67	jts	Used		111			ate cmt'd:		7-Oct-0	4
Set at		pups		No.		τ_{i+1}		sx Class G C	ement		
Wt.				HA I		144		9 Extender			
Hole Size								sx D029 Cello	phane F	lakes	
Excess Cmt				, 4	11111			046 Antifoam			
	SURFACE Bottom of Casing					- }	2.61cuft/s	x, 965.7 cuft s	lurry at	11.7 pp	og
Pup @		" Hole _287	<u>7_</u> ft	{		1					
Pup @				1 1	111	1		0 sx 50/50 PO	Z : Clas	s G cer	ment
	fied BLM @ 09:00 hrs on	26-Oct-04	_	\	1111	- 1		20 Bentonite			
Notified	NMOCD @ hrs on	26-Oct-04	<u>-</u>	/	1111	- /		11 Calcium Ch			
					1111	- (D024 Gilsonite			
Production Line		=	X New	1 1	1111	\		sx D029 Cello	ohane F	lakes	
Size			Used	1 1	1111)		046 Antifoam			
Nominal Wt.				\	1111	- 1		sx, 127.0 cuft :			
Grade		LTC	_	1	1111	(Displacement:			
# Jnts:						}		mped Plug at:			
	6.25 / 9.5 inches				ші	- 1		nal Circ Press:	`		2.0 bpm
Underream	ned 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 2877' to	3132'				- [ns during job:		Yes	
Top of Line	r <u>2817</u> ft					- [CMT Retur	ns to surface:	50 bt	ols (280).7 cuft)
PBTD	03131ft			/ l				Floats Held:	X Yes	N	o
Bottom of Liner	r3132ft			\) F [- 1					
_•					12.1	}					
)	· .	- /					
This well was NOT	cavitated			7		- 1	UNCEMENT	ED LINER			
						ر	<u> </u>				
							Schemati	c prepared by	-		
				TD	3,132	ft		. Moore, Drillin		neer	
COMMENTS:				'' —	0,102	—"	30-Nov-2				
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran	a quide ebo	e and an alu	minum haffle	e plate 1 i	it abovo	the quido sh	ne @ 18/°			
3 3/0 3dil.	Displaced top wiper plug with wat	-			•	•	•	∪e @ 104.			
			asing nead a	and vvoc be	eiole baci	King out	ianumy ji.		Tota	1.	4
7" Intermediate	CENTRALIZERS @ 219', 141', 98 DISPLACED W/ 115 BBLS. FRES								Tota	!	4
, mierineulale	CENTRALIZERS @ 2862', 2784',		' 2525' 246'	R' 211' 01'	30'				T-4-	ı.	•
1	- · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	-		u, ZII, Öİ',	JO .				Tota		9
5 5" Lipor	TURBOLIZERS @ 2395', 2352', 2			htm of line -	Don II	r 141/ The	/ U I otala Da	n O# T! /	Tota		5
5.5" Liner Perforations	13-Nov-04: Ran 6-1/16" OD blade								iner na	anger).	
renorations	14-Nov-04: Perforated 5-1/2" line: Perfs: 2929'-2933', 2936'-2942', 2								3'-3046'	,	
	TOTAL SHOTS = 208.	2001,		_000-20/2	., 2017-2	, <u>-</u>	JE 2007, 30	o. 0070,004	J 0040	•	
Tubing	14-Nov-04: Ran 2-1/16" mule sho	e, 2-1/16" O	D x 1.50" ID	Seating Nipi	ple, 2-1/1	6" x 2-3	/8" crossover	,			
	31.39' x 2-3/8" OD mud anchor jo	int with 1/2"	hole drilled ju	ist below the	e upset, 2	-3/8" OI					
	1 ea 10' and 1 ea 8' x 2-3/8" OD p						•				
<u> </u>	EOT / 2-1/16" OD x 1.5" ID Seatin										
Pump & Rods	15-Nov-04: Ran 12" long strainer			-							
	119 ea 3/4" OD rods, spaced out						22' polished	rod			
i	and with 2' nany rad on tan of nali	oh rad Cat	numn in E N	inale et 2074	CLAID DIV	n					

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

11/7/2004

Spud Date: 10/24/2004 11/15/2004

KEY

Rig Release: 11/15/2004

End: Group:

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
11/8/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00		DRILL MOVE	SFTY RURD	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. MOVE RIG AND SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP, NIPPLE UP BOPS, PUT UP BLOOIE LINES AND BLOW LINES, RIG UP TIOGA. MOVED TO THE SAN JUAN 30-5 #208A SEC 19 - T30N - R5W 270'FSL 710'FEL NEAREST HELI PAD IS THE ROAD COMING ONTO LOCATION. CALLED THE BLM HOTLINE PHONE FOR PRESSURE TEST @
						1145HRS, 11/7/2004 LEFT VOICE MAIL ON THE PHONE OF CHARLIE PERRIN WITH THE
						OCD @ 1150HRS ABOUT PRESSURE TEST. 11/7/2004
11/9/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 17:00	1	STIMOP STIMOP	1	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. RIG REPAIR, REPLACE HYDROMATIC, REPLACE DRUM CLUTCH AND REPAIR OIL LEAKS ON CHAIN GAURD, REPLACE VALVES ON AIR MANIFOLD.
11/10/2004	06:00 - 08:00	1	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	MONTHLY SAFETY MEETING AT KEY YARD
	08:00 - 10:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
	10:00 - 10:30 10:30 - 17:00	1	STIMOP STIMOP	1	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. RIG REPAIR, REPLACE HYDROMATIC, REPLACE DRUM CLUTCH AND REPAIR OIL LEAKS ON CHAIN GAURD, REPLACE VALVES ON AIR MANIFOLD.
11/11/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 08:00 08:00 - 12:00		DRILL TREBOP	SFTY	COMPZN	RIG INSPECTION AND REPAIR GIGS. PRESSURE TEST CASING AND BLIND RAMS 300# LOW FOR 10 MIN AND 1800# HIGH FOR 30 MIN. STATE INTEGRITY TEST. INSTALL TEST PLUG AND PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS, HCR VALVES, AND ALL MANIFOLD VALVES. 300 # LOW
	12:00 - 13:30	1.50	STIMOP	EQRP	COMPZN	FOR 10 MIN. AND 1800 # HIGH FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK INSTALL HYDROMATIC AND TEST.
	13:30 - 16:00	ŀ	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PU BHA 6 1/4" RERUN BIT, BIT SUB WITH DP FLOAT, 10 - 3 1/2" DC'S, 1JT OF 2 7/8" DP, 1-2 7/8" FN W / 1.87 PROFILE. GIH PICKING UP 2 7/8 DP TO 2828'
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	REPLACE STIFF ARMS ON POWER SWIVEL. PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
	15:00 - 16:00	1.00	STIMOP	SFEQ	COMPZN	PRESSURE TEST STAND PIPE, AIR MANIFOLD, TIW VALVE AND KELLY HOSE TO 1800PSI FOR 10 MIN AND 300PSI FOR 10 MIN.
	16:00 - 17:00		DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	SECURE WELL, DRAIN UP AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
11/12/2004	07:00 - 08:30	1.50	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. SERVICE AND WARM UP ALL EQUIPMENT. PREPARE TO UNLOAD HOLE.
	08:30 - 10:30	2.00	DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	UNLOAD HOLE, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION, DRLG FLOAT COLLAR AND 45' OF CEMENT WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. TAG FLOAT @ 2827' CSG SHOE @ 2872' TD 8 3/4 HOLE @ 2877'
	10:30 - 14:30	4.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRILLING FORMATION 2877' TO 3132'

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

End:

Spud Date: 10/24/2004 11/15/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Start: 11/7/2004 Rig Release: 11/15/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
11/12/2004	10:30 - 14:30	4.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRLG WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 330PSI ON STANDPIPE. 2877' - 2879' 2' 0 UNITS OF GAS 2894' - 2895' 1' 54 UNITS OF GAS 2929' - 2942' 13' 122 UNITS OF GAS 2944' - 2951' 7' 141 UNITS OF GAS 2957' - 2960' 3' 200 UNITS OF GAS 2961' - 2964' 3' 200 UNITS OF GAS 2965' - 2972' 7' 337 UNITS OF GAS 2965' - 2972' 7' 337 UNITS OF GAS 2974' - 2980' 6' 407 UNITS OF GAS 2982' - 2986' 4' 407 UNITS OF GAS 3033' - 3039' 6' 558 UNITS OF GAS 3043' - 3045' 2' 650 UNITS OF GAS TOTAL COAL 54'
	14:30 - 15:30	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 330PSI ON STANDPIPE. WELL WAS MAKING 1 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL, DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL.
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND BLOW WELL DRY. LIGHT MIST TO SURFACE WHEN BLOWING WELL DRY.
	16:00 - 16:30	0.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	16:30 - 17:30	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 3 # ON GAUGE 0.75 # 539 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 8 # ON GAUGE 2.00 # 869 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD NO WATER TO SURFACE ON FLOW TEST.
,	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	FLOWT	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST INSP 45 PSI 15 MINUTES 85 PSI 30 MINUTES 100 PSI 45 MINUTES 115 PSI 60 MINUTES 115 PSI RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE.
	19:00 - 19:30		DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 21:30		DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	FINISH TRIP OUT OF HOLE.
	21:30 - 22:00		DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP SHOCK SUB AND UNDER REAMER AND TRIP IN HOLE. PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
	22:00 - 05:15	7.25	DRILL	UREM	COMPZN	ESTABLISH CIRCULATION. UNDER REAM 6 1/4 HOLE TO 9 1/2 HOLE FROM 2877' TO 3132' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 TO 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 610PSI ON STANDPIPE.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A

Spud Date: 10/24/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 11/7/2004 End:

11/15/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 11/15/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
11/12/2004	05:15 - 06:00	0.75	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 610PSI ON STANDPIPE.
11/13/2004	06:00 - 06:15	0.25	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 610PSI ON STANDPIPE.
	06:15 - 06:45		STIMOP		COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY UP HOLE.
	06:45 - 07:30	0.75	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	07:30 - 08:30	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 3 # ON GAUGE 0.75 # 539 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD NO WATER TO SURFACE ON FLOW TEST.
	08:30 - 10:00	1.50	DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH UNDER REAMER. LAY DOWN SHOCK SUB AND UNDER REAMER.
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	STIMOP	TRIP	COMPZN	PICK UP BIT AND BIT SUB, TRIP IN HOLE TO 2872'.
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL, GIH PICKING UP 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3132' ESTABLISH CIRCULATION AND CIRCULATE. LAY DOWN 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	12:00 - 13:30	1.50	STIMOP	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST INSP 30 PSI 15 MINUTES 70 PSI 30 MINUTES 75 PSI 45 MINUTES 85 PSI 60 MINUTES 85 PSI
	13:30 - 18:00	4.50	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE #2, LET WELL BLOW DOWN. NATURAL SURGE, #3 85PSI 60MIN #4 85PSI 60MIN #5 85PSI 60MIN
	18:00 - 20:00	2.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	ESTABLISH CIRCULATION IN CASING. GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3132'. TRIP OUT OF HOLE LAYING DOWN 8 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	20:00 - 03:00	7.00	FLOWT	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
	03:00 - 03:30	0.50	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY UP WELL.
	03:30 - 04:00	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	WELL MAKING APPROXIMATELY 1/2 BBL OF WATER PER HOUR. PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 8 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
	04:00 - 05:00	1.00	STIMOP	PRDT	COMPZN	WITH POWER SWIVEL. 2" OPEN FLÓW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 11 # ON GAUGE 2.75 # 1030 MCFD

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A

Common Weil Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 11/7/2004 Spud Date: 10/24/2004

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 11/15/2004

End: 11/15/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY

Group:

Rig Name:

Rig Name.		NE I				Rig Number: 27
Date	From:-To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
11/13/2004	04:00 - 05:00	1.00	STIMOP	PRDT	COMPZN	30 MINUTES - 11 # ON GAUGE 2.75 # 1030 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 11 # ON GAUGE 2.75 # 1030 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 11 # ON GAUGE 2.75 # 1030 MCFD
11/14/2004	05:00 - 06:00 06:00 - 07:00	I	STIMOP STIMOP	1	COMPZN COMPZN	NO WATER TO SURFACE ON FLOW TEST. TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER. RIG UP FLOOR TO RUN LINER. CHANGE #1 RAMS TO 5 1/2 AND TEST.
	07:00 - 08:00	1.00	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA FOR RUNNING LINER AND TRIPPING IN THE HOLE WITH DRILL PIPE WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	08:00 - 10:30	2.50	CASING	PUTB	COMPZN	GIH W/ 5-1/2" 15.5 PPF J-55 LT&C CASING / LINER AS FOLLOWS:
						6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/ FLOAT VALVE - 1.00'
						7- JTS 5-1/2" CASING - 311.44'
						6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR - 2.40'
						TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY 315.14' GIH W/ TOTAL OF 82 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/2568'KB.
						PICK UP SINGLE JOINTS OF DP-
						GIH W/5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/2568' & TAG UP @ 3132'KB,3121'PBTD.
					<u> </u> 	SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 2817 - 3132'KB EOL- W/ PBTD @ 3131'KB-
						RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 2817'KB.
	10:30 - 14:00	3.50	CASING	PULD	COMPZN	LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, TRIP IN HOLE WITH DRILL COLLARS AND LAY DOWN SAME.
	14:00 - 16:00	2.00	STIMOP	SFEQ	COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND LOAD OUT POWER SWIVEL CHANGE RAMS FROM 5 1/2" TO 2 3/8" IN #1 BOP, AND TEST. RIG DOWN AND LOAD OUT POWER SWIVEL.
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	TALLY AND PREP TUBING TO RUN. SECURE WELL LOCK UP EQUIPMENT, SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
11/15/2004	07:00 - 07:30		PERFOR		COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 10:00	2.50	STIMOP	PERF	COMPZN	RIG UP BLUE JET AND TEST LUBRICATOR TO 85PSI. PERFORATE AT FOLLOWING INTERVALS.
						3043' - 3046' = 3' 12 SHOTS 3032' - 3040' = 8' 32 SHOTS
		Ì				2982' - 2987' = 5' 20 SHOTS
						2974' - 2980' = 6' 24 SHOTS 2966' - 2972' = 6' 24 SHOTS
						2957' - 2964' = 7' 28 SHOTS
						2944' - 2951' = 7' 28 SHOTS 2936' - 2942' = 6' 24 SHOTS
						2929' - 2933' = 4' 16 SHOTS
						4 SHOTS PER FOOT, 208 TOTAL SHOTS.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 208A

Spud Date: 10/24/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 11/7/2004 End: 11/15/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 11/15/2004

Group:

Rig Name: **KEY**

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
11/15/2004	07:30 - 10:00 10:00 - 11:30	•	STIMOP FLOWT	PERF PRDT	COMPZN COMPZN	4 WIRELINE RUNS. BLOW WELL DOWN AND FLOW TEST. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST SIBU 85PSI
	11:30 - 14:30	3.00	STIMOP	RCST	COMPZN	60 MINUTES - 11 # ON GAUGE 2.75 # 1030 MCFD GIH W/ 2-1/16" x 0.32" MULE SHOE. W/ 2-1/16"OD x 1.50" ID x 0.42 SEATING NIPPLE. W/ 2-1/16" x 1.12" CHANGE ÖVER. W/ 2-3/8" x 31.34" MUD ANCHOR. W/ 2-3/8"OD x 1.78"ID x 0.80" F-NIPPLE. W/ 2-3/8" X 10', 8', PUP JOINTS- W/ 97 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING (3045.03')- LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A BPV EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3110'KB
						1.78" FN @ 3076'KB.
	14:30 - 17:00	2.50	STIMOP	NUND	COMPZN	RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN AND LOAD OUT BOPS. NIPPLE UP WELL HEAD AND RIG UP TO RUN RODS. SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
11/16/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 09:00		STIMOP STIMOP	SFTY SLKL	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION. TEST LUBRICATOR TO 85PSI, PULL BLANKING PLUG FROM F-NIPPLE WITH SLICKLINE.
	09:00 - 10:00 10:00 - 12:00		STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	BLOW WELL DOWN. SPOT ROD TRAILER. RU TO RUN RODS- FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)- GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/4" X 12' RHAC-ZDV INSERT PUMP SN: (CP200) W/ 3 SINKER BARS AND 119 3/4" NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE OUT W/ 2', 6', 8', PONY RODS, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD W/ 2' PONY ROD ON TOP. RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3076'KB,FN. LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER- PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 500 PSIG (OK)- STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK). HANG OFF PUMP.
	12:00 - 18:00	6.00	STIMOP	RURD	COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND PREPARE TO MOVE RIG. RIG RELEASED @ 1800 HRS TO THE SAN JUAN 30-5 #240A