Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

# UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137

			BUREAU	J OF L	AND	MAN	GEME	NT						Expire	s: Nover	mber 30, 2000	
	WELL (	COMPL	ETION C	R RE	CON	APLE	TION R	EPOF	₹T	AND LO	og /			ease Serial IMSF078			
1a. Type o	f Well	Oil Well	☐ Gas \	Well		гу Б	Other:	CBM					6. If	Indian, Al	lottee o	r Tribe Name	
b. Type o	of Completion	⊠ <sup>N</sup> Othe		□ Wor	_		Deepen		Plug	Back	□ Diff.	Resvr.				nent Name and N	No.
		Ouic				<u> </u>		A FAD		1	17750			IMNM784	19D		
2. Name o	Operator OCOPHILLIP	S COMP	ANY		,	Contact	E-Mail:	iuanita.	∡fà	tiell@cou	ocophil	ips.com		ease Name SAN JUAN			
	POBOX HOUSTO	N, TX 77	252				3a Pi	. Phone n: 505.	599	. (include .3419	area cod		9. A	PI Well No		39-27805-00-5	S1
4. Locatio At surf		5 T30N R	on clearly an 5W Mer NN 2008FEL	id in acc NP	ordano	ce with	Federal re	ြတ	nts)	)*\	~ <i>004</i>	,242;	E	BASIN FR	UITLA	Exploratory ND COAL	
	prod interval i							[a)	-		: 0 <sub>%</sub>	3	11. c	Sec., T., R or Area So	., M., o ec 15 T	r Block and Sur F30N R5W Me	vey r NMP
At tota	•	сропса о	Clow					الخرد	S KS	٠.	à a			County or RIO ARRI		13. State	
14. Date S 09/04/				ate T.D. /17/200		ned			8	Completed A 2/2004	teady to	Prod.	17.	Elevations 65	(DF, K 590 GL	B, RT, GL)*	
18. Total	Depth:	MD TVD	3410 3410		19. I	Plug Bac	k T.D.:	MD TVI	,	340 340		20. De	pth Br	dge Plug S	Set:	MD TVD	
21. Type I MUDL	Electric & Oth OG	er Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Sub	mit co	py of ea	ch)				Was	well core DST run' ctional Su	d? rvey?	No No No	⊢ Ye	s (Submit analy s (Submit analy s (Submit analy	sis)
23. Casing a	and Liner Rec	ord (Repo	rt all strings		<del></del>						•					· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.)	Top (MI		Botto (MD	_	e Cemer Depth	nter	No. of Type of		Slurry (BE		Cement	Top*	Amount Pu	lled
12.25		25 H-40	32.3		0		229				15				0		15
8.75 6.25		000 J-55 500 J-55	20.0 15.5		0		190 410		_		47	0  0		ļ	0	)	30
4 0.23	0 3.0	JUU J-05	15.5		3140 <sub>1</sub>	3	*10					<u> </u>	٠.			<u> </u>	
				<u> </u>	- +									<u> </u>			
24. Tubin	g Record											,					
Size	Depth Set (N	(D) P	acker Depth	(MD)	Siz	e I	epth Set	(MD)	P	acker Dept	h (MD)	Size	De	epth Set (N	(ID)	Packer Depth (	MD)
2.375		3374														-	
	ing Intervals			<del> </del>			26. Perfo					~:					
	Formation RUITLAND (	COAL	Тор	3274	Bott	3312		Perfora	ted .	Interval 3274 TC	3312	Size 0.7		No. Holes	0 OPE	Perf. Status	
B)	TOTI BAILD (	JOAL		0214		0012				3274 10	7 33 12	0.1	30	12	0 01 2	-14	
C)	•											· · ·					
D)	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		. 0														
27. Acid, i	racture, Treat		ment Squeeze	e, Etc.					A =	nount and	Type of	Material					
	Deput interv		_							nount and	Type of	VIAICI IAI					
											-						
28. Produc	tion - Interval	Α	I				<del></del>										·····
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL		as ACF	Water BBL		il Gra		Gas Grav	itv	Produc	tion Method		·	
10/22/2004	10/21/2004	1		0.0		1340.0	0.	0						GAS	S PUMP	PING UNIT	
Choke Size 2" PITOT	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press. 19.0	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL 0		as 4CF 32160	Water BBL 0	R.	as:Oi atio	u	Well	Status GSI		**			
28a. Produ	ction - Interva	al B										·			-		
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL		ias ACF	Water BBL		il Gra		Gas Grav	ity	14400	tion Method	D FO	DR RECORI	) i
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL		ias ICF	Water BBL		as:Oi atio	il	Well	Status				2004	

(See Instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #50907 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM
\*\* BLM REVISED \*\* BLM REVISED \*\* BLM REVISED \*\* BLM REVISED \*\*

BEM REVISED \*\*

28b. Prod	uction - Interv	al C			1						
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravit	У	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well S	tatus		
28c. Prod	uction - Interv	al D		L.,				<u>l</u>			
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravit	у	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well S	Status		
29. Dispo	sition of Gas(S	old, used j	for fuel, veni	ed, etc.)	<del></del>						
30. Sumn Show tests,	nary of Porous	ones of po	rosity and c	ontents there			l all drill-stem d shut-in pressure	es	31. For	mation (Log) Markers	
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Description	ons, Contents, etc	).		Name	Top Meas. Dept
NACIMIE	SAN JOSE 0 1549 IACIMIENTO 1549 2659 DJO ALAMO 2659 2869							OJO ALAMO 2633 KIRTLAND 2833 FRUITLAND COAL 3118			
22											
This wellt	cional remarks well is a singl pore Schemar  e enclosed atta	e well pro tic and the	ducing fron	n the Basin	Fruitland	Coal. Attac	ched is the				- 11 min
1. Ele	ectrical/Mecha	nical Logs			ı	Geologi     Core Ar	-		DST Re	eport 4. D	irectional Survey
	by certify that  c(please print)	Cor	Elect	ronic Subn For CON AFMSS for	nission #509 NOCOPHII	007 Verifie LLIPS CO	d by the BLM W MPANY, sent to ENNE BRUMLE	Vell Inform the Farmi EY on 11/1	ation Sy ington 7/2004 ((		structions):
	ture	(Electron						1/12/2004			

#### ConocoPhillips

#### END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

Well Name:	San Juan 30-5 # 243A					s	pud:	4-Sep-0	04	
API#:	30-039-27805					Release Drt	Rig:	9-Sep-(	04	
Location:	738' FSL & 2008' FEL									
	Sec. 15 - T30N - R5W		$7^{-1}/_{16}$ " 3M x	2- <sup>3</sup> / <sub>8</sub> " E	UE 8rd I	Bonnet Date TD Read	hed:	16-Oct-	04	
	Rio Arriba County, NM		11" 3M x 7-	1/16" 3	M Tubing	g Head Release Cav	Rig:	21-Oct-	04	
	6590' GL (above MSL)		9-5/8" 8 RD	x 11" 3	M Casin	g Head				
Drl Rig RKB:	13' above Ground Level									
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL					<u>SurfaceCement</u>				
		·	_	ŀ		Date cmt'd:	5-S	ep-04		
Surface Casing	Date set:5-Sep-04	x	New		1	Lead : 150 sx Class A Cer	nent			
Size	9 5/8 in		Used			+ 3% Calcium Chloride				
Set at	ft # Jnts:5		) )		11 1	+ 0.25 lb/sx Flocele				
Wt.	32.3 _ppf Grade H-40					1.21 cuft/sx, 181 cuft slur	ry at 15.4	6 ppg		
Hole Size	12 1/4 in Conn STC					Displacement: _	15.0 bbl	s fresh v	wtr	
Excess Cmt	125%		4			Bumped Plug at:_	06:00 h	rs w/ 20	0 psi	
T.O.C.	SURFACE Csg	Shoe <u>229</u> ft				Final Circ Press:_		@ 2.0 b	pm	
	TD of 12-1/4"	hole <u>239</u> ft				Returns during job:		YES		
						CMT Returns to surface: _	1	5 bbls		
Noti	fied BLM @ 12:50 hrs on	03-Sep-04				Floats Held: _	No fl	oats use	ed	
Notified	NMOCD @ 12:50 hrs on	03-Sep-04				W.O.C. for 6.00 hrs (plu	g bump to	start NU B	BOP)	
			l	1		W.O.C. for 8.00 hrs (plu	g bump to	test csg)		
			_	1						
Intermediate Ca Size		its	New Used			Intermediate Cement Date cmt'd:	8-8	ep-04		
Set at	<del></del>	pups	70000		ll i	Lead : 370sx Class A Cen		<u> </u>		
Wt.		F-4-4				+ 3% Econolite				
Hole Size					$H \cap H$	+ 10.00 lb/sx Gilsonite				
Excess Cmt		Collar 3145 ft				+ 0.25 lb/sx Flocele	<del></del>			
	SURFACE Bottom of Casing		7	'	││ │ <sup>■</sup>	2.91cuft/sx, 1076.7 cuft s	lurry at 1	1.5 ppg	1	
		Hole 3190 ft	- 1				icity at .	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
•	ft	<u>-0.155_</u>	1		$\Pi$	Tail: 100 sx 50/50 POZ	: Class	A cemer	nt	
, -	fied BLM @ 20:40 hrs on	06-Sep-04	\			+ 2% Bentonite				
	NMOCD@ 20:40 hrs on		1			+ 5 lb/sx Gilsonite				
			- 1			+ 0.25 lb/sx Flocele				
Production Line	Date set: 19-Oct-04	[x	New	11		+ 2% Calcium Chloride				
Size		-	Used			1.33 cuft/sx, 133 cuft slur	ry at 13.	5 ppg		
Nominal Wt.	. 15.5 ppf		_ /							
Grade	J-55 Connections:	LTC				Displacement:	127.6 b	bls Fres	h Wtr	
# Jnts:	:6	_	- (	11		Bumped Plug at:	16:30 hr	rs w/ 115	50 psi	
Hole Size	6.25 / 9.5 inches		(			Final Circ Press:	650 p	si @ 2 b	pm	
	ned 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3200' to	3410'	)		∐ ·	Returns during job: _		YES		
Top of Liner	3140 ft		- 1			CMT Returns to surface: _	3	30 bbls		
PBTD	3409ft		(	- 1 1	이	Floats Held: _	X Yes	No		
Bottom of Liner	1 3410 ft		\	[	]	1				
			\	\	✓	)				
			)			1				
This well was NOT	cavitated.		- (			UNCEMENTED LINER				
			(	4		/				
						Schematic prepared by:			ĺ	
			TD	3,4	410	ft Steven O. Moore, Drilling 09-Nov-2004	Engine	er		
COMMENTS:										
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran	-			•					
	Displaced top wiper plug with water		g head and	WOC P	efore ba	cking out landing jt.				
	CENTRALIZERS @ 219', 142', 10						Total:	4		
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/ 127.6 BBLS FRE							_		
	CENTRALIZERS @ 3176', 3099',			10', 80'	, 37'.		Total:	9		
	TURBOLIZERS @ 2716', 2673', 2			···-		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Total:	6	i	
5.5" Liner	Ran 6-1/16" bladed shoe w/ float v						<u>.                                    </u>			
Perforations	Perforated 5-1/2" liner with guns o	n ∟-line at 4 spf,	, U./5" diam	eter, 12	u degree	pnased holes				
	Perf. intervals: 3274'-3280', 3282'	-3292'. 3296'-33	03', 3305'-9	312' T	OTAL SI	HOTS = 120.				
Tubing	30.65' x 2-7/8" EUE 8rd box Orang									
	2-7/8" x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd crossover			-						
	2' x 2-3/8" OD pup jt and 106 jts 2-									
	Bottom of Mud Anchor at 3374'. F									
Pump	12" long strainer attached below in					The state of the s				
&	130 ea 3/4" OD rods, spaced out v					,				
Rods	and with 2' pony rod on top of poli-	sh rod. Set pum	p in F-Nippl	e at 334	12' MD R	KB				

### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

10/14/2004

Spud Date: 9/4/2004

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 10/21/2004

End:

10/21/2004

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY** 

Rig Number: 27

Group:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/15/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00		DRILL MOVE	SFTY RURD	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. MOVE RIG AND SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP, NIPPLE UP BOPS. MOVED TO THE SAN JUAN 30-5 #243A SEC 15 - T30N - R5W 738'FSL 2008'FEL NEAREST HELI PAD IS THE ROAD COMING INTO LOCATION.
						CALLED THE BLM HOTLINE PHONE FOR PRESSURE TEST @ 1030HRS, 10/14/2004
	-					LEFT VOICE MAIL ON THE PHONE OF CHARLIE PERRIN WITH THE OCD @ 1035HRS ABOUT PRESSURE TEST. 10/14/2004
10/16/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 10:00 10:00 - 10:30 10:30 - 13:00	2.50 0.50	DRILL DRILL DRILL TREBOP	SFTY RURD SFTY SFEQ	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. FINISH RIGGING UP BLOOIE LINES AND BLOW LINES. RIG INSPECTION AND REPAIR GIGS. PRESSURE TEST CASING AND BLIND RAMS 300# LOW FOR 10 MIN AND 1800# HIGH FOR 30 MIN. STATE INTEGRITY TEST. INSTALL TEST PLUG AND PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS, HCR VALVES, AND ALL MANIFOLD VALVES. 300 # LOW
	13:00 - 13:30	0.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	FOR 10 MIN. AND 1800 # HIGH FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK GIH PU BHA 6 1/4" RERUN BIT, BIT SUB WITH DP FLOAT, 10 - 3 1/2" DC'S, 1JT OF 2 7/8" DP, 1-2 7/8" FN W / 1.87 PROFILE.
	13:30 - 14:30 14:30 - 16:30	l l	DRILL DRILL	PULD PULD	COMPZN COMPZN	PULL DRILL PIPE OUT OF PIPE BASKET AND TALLY. GIH PICKING UP 2 7/8 DP TO 3130'
	16:30 - 18:00	1.50	STIMOP	SFEQ	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL. PRESSURE TEST STAND PIPE, AIR MANIFOLD, TIW VALVE AND
10/17/2004	18:00 - 19:00 07:00 - 08:00		DRILL DRILL	PULD SFTY	COMPZN COMPZN	KELLY HOSE TO 1800PSI FOR 10 MIN AND 300PSI FOR 10 MIN. SECURE WELL, DRAIN UP AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. SERVICE AND WARM UP ALL EQUIPMENT.
	08:00 - 11:00	3.00	DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	UNLOAD HOLE, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION, DRLG CEMENT FROM 3040' TO 3147' DRLG FLOAT COLLAR AND 46' OF CEMENT WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. TAG FLOAT @ 3147' CSG SHOE @ 3190' TD 8 3/4 HOLE @ 3190'
	11:00 - 15:00	4.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRILLING FORMATION 3190' TO 3410' DRLG WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 330PSI ON STANDPIPE. 3275' - 3281' 6' 810 UNITS OF GAS 3282' - 3292' 10' 810 UNITS OF GAS 3296' - 3303' 7' 850 UNITS OF GAS 3304' - 3311' 7' 850 UNITS OF GAS TOTAL COAL 30'

### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A

10/14/2004

Spud Date: 9/4/2004

**Event Name:** 

COMPLETION

Start:

End: 10/21/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 10/21/2004

Group:

Rig Name: **KEY** 

Rig Number:	27
-------------	----

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/17/2004	15:00 - 16:00	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 330PSI ON STANDPIPE. WELL WAS MAKING 1 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL, DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL.
	16:00 - 16:30	0.50	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	WELL IS MAKING APPROXIMATELY 1/2 BBL OF WATER PER HOUR. TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND BLOW WELL DRY.
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	WELL IS MAKING APPROXIMATELY 1/2 BBL OF WATER PER HOUR. PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	17:00 - 18:00	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
	18:00 - 20:00	2.00	FLOWT	SIPB	COMPZN	INITIAL PRESSURE 2 # ON GAUGE 0.50 # 434 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 4 # ON GAUGE 1.00 # 615 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 6 # ON GAUGE 1.50 # 752 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 6 # ON GAUGE 1.50 # 752 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 6 # ON GAUGE 1.50 # 752 MCFD SHUT IN TEST INSP 20 PSI 15 MINUTES 150 PSI
						30 MINUTES 225 PSI 45 MINUTES 245 PSI 60 MINUTES 250 PSI 75 MINUTES 250 PSI RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
	20:00 - 21:15 21:15 - 21:30		DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	l'
	21:30 - 23:00		DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	PICK UP SHOCK SUB AND UNDER REAMER AND TRIP IN HOLE.
	23:00 - 23:15	1	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
	23:15 - 03:15	4.00	DRILL	UREM	COMPZN	UNDER REAM 6 1/4 HOLE TO 9 1/2 HOLE FROM 3200' TO 3410' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 610PSI ON STANDPIPE.
	03:15 - 04:15	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 620PSI ON STANDPIPE.
	04:15 - 04:45	0.50	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY UP HOLE. WELL IS MAKING APPROXIMATELY 1/2 BBL OF WATER PER HOUR.
	04:45 - 05:30	0.75	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 8 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	05:30 - 06:00	0.50	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 4 # ON GAUGE 1.00 # 615 MCFD
						115 MINUTES - 8 # ON GAUGE 2.00 # 869 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 9 # ON GAUGE 2.25 # 913 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 9 # ON GAUGE 2.25 # 913 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 9 # ON GAUGE 2.25 # 913 MCFD
10/18/2004	06:00 - 06:30	0.50	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	

### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A

Spud Date: 9/4/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 10/14/2004 End: 10/21/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 10/21/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY** 

Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/18/2004	06:00 - 06:30	0.50	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	60 MINUTES - 9 # ON GAUGE 2.25 # 913 MCFD
	06:30 - 08:00	1.50	STIMOP	TRIP	COMPZN	MIST TO SURFACE ON 45MIN AND 60MIN READINGS.
	08.30 - 08.00	1.50	STIMOP	IKIF	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE, LAY DOWN UNDER REAMER AND SHOCK SUB.
	08:00 - 09:00	1.00	STIMOP	TRIP	COMPZN	PICK UP BIT AND BIT SUB AND TRIP IN HOLE TO 3162'.
	09:00 - 09:30	1	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
	09:30 - 12:00	2.50	STIMOP	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST
						INSP 10 PSI
						15 MINUTES 205 PSI
						30 MINUTES 230 PSI
						60 MINUTES 240 PSI
						75 MINUTES 245 PSI
						90 MINUTES 245 PSI
						RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE #2, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
	12:00 - 19:00	7.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	NATURAL SURGE,
				i		#3 245PSI 60MIN
						#4 245PSI 60MIN
						#5 245PSI 60MIN #6 245PSI 60MIN
						#6 245PSI 60MIN SOME COAL TO SURFACE ON NATURAL SURGES
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	
	19:30 - 20:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3400'
	20:00 - 20:30	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 8 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
						WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	20:30 - 21:30	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
						INITIAL PRESSURE 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 12 # ON GAUGE 3.00 # 1065MCFD 30 MINUTES - 12 # ON GAUGE 3.00 # 1065MCFD
						45 MINUTES - 12 # ON GAUGE 3.00 # 1065MCFD
		1				60 MINUTES - 12 # ON GAUGE 3.00 # 1065MCFD
	21:30 - 06:00	8.50	STIMOP	STIM	COMPZN	NATURAL SURGE, .
						#7 240PSI 120MIN
						#8 240PSI 60MIN
						#9 260PSI 60MIN
						#10 CLOSED IN. SOME COAL TO SURFACE ON NATURAL SURGES
10/19/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	STIMOP	STIM	COMPZN	NATURAL SURGE,
						#10 245PSI 120MIN
						SOME COAL TO SURFACE ON NATURAL SURGES.
	07:00 - 07:30		STIMOP	1 -	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
•	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	STIMOP	STIM	COMPZN	NATURAL SURGE,
						#11 240PSI 60MIN #12 240PSI 60MIN
						#12 240PSI 60MIN #13 240PSI 60MIN
						#14 240PSI 60MIN
						#15 240PSI 60MIN
				1		#16 240PSI 60MIN
	10:00 10:00	0.50	CTIMOS	CETY	COMPAN	SOME COAL TO SURFACE ON NATURAL SURGES.
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 20:30	i	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST
	15.50 - 20.50	1.00	LOVVI	וטאון	CONFIN	INITIAL PRESSURE 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 17 # ON GAUGE 4.25 # 1294 MCFD
					-	

#### Page 4 of 5

#### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

10/14/2004

Spud Date: 9/4/2004

10/21/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 10/21/2004

End:

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY** 

Rig Number: 27

那好学心想翻腾之中自然健康以及通知和关系。由于2011年的代表的基础的发展,并不是一个企业的企业,并不是一个企业的企业,并不是一个企业的企业,并不是一个企业的企业。

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/19/2004	19:30 - 20:30	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	30 MINUTES - 17 # ON GAUGE 4.25 # 1294 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 16 # ON GAUGE 4.00 # 1236 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 16 # ON GAUGE 4.00 # 1236 MCFD
	20:30 - 21:30	1.00	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	
	21:30 - 22:00	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3400'
	22:00 - 04:00	6.00	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
	04:00 - 04:30	0.50	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY UP HOLE. WELL IS MAKING APPROXIMATELY 1/2 BBL OF WATER PER HOUR.
	04:30 - 05:00	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 8 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	05:00 - 05:30	l .	STIMOP	l .	COMPZN	· ·
	05:30 - 06:00	ř.	STIMOP		COMPZN	
10/20/2004	06:00 - 07:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER.
	06:00 - 07:30	1.50	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	RIG UP FLOOR TO RUN LINER. CHANGE #1 RAMS TO 5 1/2 AND TEST.
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA FOR RUNNING LINER AND TRIPPING IN THE HOLE WITH DRILL PIPE WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00	CASING	Weos	COMPZN	WAIT ON A SET OF 5 1/2 DOUBLE LATCH ELEVATORS, THE SET OF ELEVATORS THAT WERE BROUGHT TO LOCATION WERE SINGLE LATCH ELEVATORS WITH A SAFETY CHAIN WELDED ON LATCH.
	10:00 - 13:00	3.00	CASING	PUTB	COMPZN	GIH W/ 5-1/2" 15.5 PPF J-55 LT&C CASING / LINER AS FOLLOWS:
						6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/ FLOAT VALVE - 1.00'
						6- JTS 5-1/2" CASING - 267.23'
			,			6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR - 2.40'
						TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY -
			-			270.63' GIH W/ TOTAL OF 93 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/2912'KB.
						PICK UP SINGLE JOINTS OF DP- GIH W/ 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/2912' & TAG UP @
						3410'KB,3409'PBTD. SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 3410-3140'KB EOL- W/ PBTD @ 3409'KB-
						RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 3140'KB.
	13:00 - 16:00	3.00	CASING	PULD	COMPZN	LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, TRIP IN HOLE WITH DRILL COLLARS AND LAY DOWN SAME.
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND LOAD OUT POWER SWIVEL CHANGE AND TEST #1 PIPE RAMS TO 2 3/8.
	17:00 - 18:00	1.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	SECURE WELL LOCK UP EQUIPMENT, SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
10/21/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:00		STIMOP PERFOR		COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM START AND WARM UP ALL EQUIPMENT. PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.

Printed: 11/11/2004 4:22:24 PM

#### Page 5 of 5

### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 243A

Spud Date: 9/4/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 10/14/2004

10/21/2004 End:

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 10/21/2004

Rig Name:

**KEY** 

Rig Number: 27

Group:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/21/2004	08:00 - 09:30	1.50	STIMOP	PERF	COMPZN	RIG UP BLUE JET AND TEST LUBRICATOR TO 245PSI.  PERFORATE AT FOLLOWING INTERVALS.  3305' - 3312' = 7' 28 SHOTS  3296' - 3303' = 7' 40 SHOTS  3282' - 3292' = 10' 24 SHOTS  3274' - 3280' = 6' 28 SHOTS
	09:30 - 11:00	1 50	FLOWT	DDDT	COMPZN	4 SHOTS PER FOOT, 120 TOTAL SHOTS. 2 WIRELINE RUNS. 1 MISS RUN. BLOW WELL DOWN AND FLOW TEST.
	09.30 - 11.00	1.50	1 2000		COMI ZIV	2" OPEN FLOW TEST SIBU 245PSI 60 MINUTES - 19 # ON GAUGE 4.75 # 1340 MCFD
	11:00 - 14:00	3.00	STIMOP	RCST	COMPZN	GIH W/ 30.65' X 2-7/8" 8RD EUE BOX ORANGE PEELED MUD ANCHOR W/ 8-(1/4" X 8") SLOTS, 2-7/8" X 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X-O COLLAR (0.46") , W/ 0.72" x 2-3/8" EXPENDABLE CHECK W/ 0.84" x 2-3/8" OD X 1.78" ID "F" NIPPLE. W/ 2-3/8" X 2', PUP JOINT-
						W/ 106 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING (3326.44')- LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A BPV EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3374'KB
						1.78" FN @ 3342'KB.
	14:00 - 17:00	3.00	STIMOP	NUND	COMPZN	RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN AND LOAD OUT BOPS. NIPPLE UP RADAGAN AND RIG UP TO RUN RODS. SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
10/22/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:00 08:00 - 09:00	0.50	STIMOP STIMOP STIMOP	SLKL	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. DROP BALL AND PUMP OUT EXPENDABLE PLUG. RIG UP FLOOR TO RUN RODS.
	09:00 - 11:00	ľ	STIMOP	ľ	COMPZN	RU TO RUN RODS- FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)- GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/4" X 12' RHAC-ZDV INSERT PUMP SN: (CP191) W/ 3 SINKER BARS AND 130 3/4" NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE OUT W/ 4', PONY ROD, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD W/ 2' PONY ROD ON
						TOP. RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3342'KB,FN.
						LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER- PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 500 PSIG (OK)- STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK). HANG OFF PUMP.
	11:00 - 19:00	8.00	STIMOP	RURD	COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND PREPARE TO MOVE RIG. CHANGE OILS IN RIG AND EQUIPMENT. RIG RELEASED @ 1900 HRS TO THE SAN JUAN 30-5 #216A