Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

# UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

	WELL C	OMPL	ETION O	R RECO	OMPLI	ETION F	REPOR	TAND	LOG	.   -		ase Serial N MSF0781				
la. Type of	Well  Completion	Oil Well		Vell 🔲 Work C	Dry Over	Other:		ug Back	□ Diff. R	- 1	6. If I	Indian, Allo	ottee or	r Tribe Nam	e	
o. 2,pc o.	рин	Othe										7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.				
2. Name of CONO	Operator COPHILLIPS	S COMP	ANY		Conta	ct: JUANI E-Mail			on@cophilin	s.com		ase Name a				
3. Address	P O BOX :					3 F	a. Phone Ph: 505.5	99.3419	le area code)	' / W	9. AF	PI Well No.		45-32506-0	0-S1	
4. Location	of Well (Ret	ort locati		d in accord	ance wit	h Federal r	equiremen	its)*	DEC 2004	- Col	10. F	ield and Po	ol, or	Exploratory		
At surfa	ce NWSE	1360FS	L 1720FEL	. • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •					6.50		11. S	ec., T., R.,	M., or	Block and	Survey	
At top p	rod interval r	eported b	elow				in the				,	County or Pa		32N R11W		
At total	•	_	118 15	to T.D. Bo	aabad		116 10	<u>~</u>		O~#€		AN JUAN	חב צו	NM B, RT, GL)*		
14. Date S <sub>1</sub> 10/08/2				ite T.D. Re /07/2004	acneu		D D	ate Comple & A // ( <b>5</b> /12/2004	Ready to P			644	I3 GL	B, K1, GL)		
18. Total D	epth:	MD TVD	3137 3137	19	. Plug E	Back T.D.:	MD TVD	3	136 136	20. Dept	h Brio	ige Plug Se	t:	MD TVD		
21. Type E MUDLO	lectric & Oth DG	er Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Submit	copy of	each)			Was I	well cored? DST run? tional Surv	ey?	No No No	Ħ Yes	s (Submit ans s (Submit ans s (Submit ans	alvsis)	
23. Casing a	nd Liner Reco	ord (Repo	ort all strings							T						
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.)	Top (MD)		tom Sta	ge Cemen Depth		of Sks. & of Cement	Slurry V (BBL		Cement 7	Гор*	Amount	Pulled	
12.250		25 H-40	32.3		0	227			150 470				0	<u> </u>	15	
8.750 6.250		000 J-55 500 J-55	20.0 15.5	286	0 8	2887 3137				<del></del>			0		55	
0.230	,	700 0-00	10.0	200	1	0107					$\neg$					
24. Tubing	Record									<u> </u>				<u> </u>		
	Depth Set (M	,	acker Depth	(MD)	Size	Depth Se	t (MD)	Packer D	epth (MD)	Size	De	pth Set (M)	D)	Packer Dep	th (MD)	
2.375 25. Produci		3129			L	26. Peri	foration R	ecord		-	<u></u>					
	ormation		Тор		Bottom		Perforat	ed Interval		Size		lo. Holes		Perf. Stat	us	
A) FF B)	RUITLAND (	COAL		2904	312	7		2904	TO 3127	0.75	0	272	OPE	N		
C)														<del></del>	* **	
D)	racture, Treat	ment. Cei	ment Squeeze	Etc	,											
	Depth Interva			., 2.0.				Amount a	nd Type of M	faterial						
		_	_	<del></del>												
28 Product	tion - Interval	Δ			_											
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water		Gravity	Gas		roducti	on Method				
Produced 12/12/2004	Date 12/11/2004	Tested 1	Production	BBL 0.0	MCF 1236	BBL 3.0 (	0.0 Co	пт. АРІ	Gravity	'		GAS	PUMP	ING UNIT		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL		s:Oil tio	Well S	tatus			•			
2" PITOT	SI ction - Interva	4.0		0	2966	64	0			GSI		,				
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water		Gravity	Gas	An	RED	ΨED∘F0	RR	ECORD		
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Co	rr. API	Gravity					Tid		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL		s:Oil tio	Well S			cu 2.8			····	
(See Instruct	tions and spa	ces for ad	Iditional data	on reverse	side)								-	OFFICE		
ELECTRO	NIC SUBMI	SSÍON #	52146 VERI <b>VISED **</b>	FIED BY	THE BL	M WELL D ** BLI	, INFORM <b>M REV</b> I	MATION S SED **	SYSTEM BLM RE\		Y_ * BL	M REVI		**		

30L Dead	uction - Interv	ol C				_	<del></del>						
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity	Gas		Production Method			
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr. API	Gravity	, 	A TOURISM MOUNTAIN			
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well S	tatus			<del></del> -	
28c. Produ	uction - Interv	al D											
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	,	Production Method			
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well S	tatus				
29. Dispo	sition of Gas(	Sold, used	for fuel, vent	ed, etc.)		<u> </u>	1		_		<del></del>	····	
	nary of Porous	Zones (In	clude Aquife	rs):					31 For	rmation (Log) Mar	kers		
Show tests, i	all important	zones of p	orosity and c	ontents there	eof: Cored in tool open,	ntervals and flowing and	all drill-stem shut-in pressur	res		ν υ	·		
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Description	ns, Contents, etc	c.		Name		Top Meas. Depth	
OJO ALAI SAN JOS NACIMIEI KIRTLANI	E NTO		0 171 1395	171 1395					OJ KII FR	ACIMIENTO IO ALAMO RTLAND RUITLAND CTURED CLIFFS	<b>S</b>	254 1506 1536 2736 3176	
This	ional remarks well is a sing pore Schema	e well pro	oducing fron	n the Basin	Fruitland	Coal. Attach	ned is the		<u>.</u>			1	
22 Cirolo	enclosed atta	oh-monta.											
1. Ele	ectrical/Mecha ndry Notice fo	nical Log				<ol> <li>Geologic</li> <li>Core Ana</li> </ol>	-		DST Re Other:	eport	4. Direction	onal Survey	
34. I here	by certify that		Elect	ronic Subm For CON	nission #521 NOCOPHII	146 Verified LLIPS COM	by the BLM V IPANY, sent to	Vell Inform o the Farmi	ation Sy ngton	le records (see atta- /stem. 05AXB0571SE)	ched instruct	ions):	
Name	(please print)				L. account				`	PRESENTATIVE			
Signature (Electronic Submission)								Date 12/21/2004					

#### ConocoPhillips

#### END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

Well Name:	FC Federal # 2A							Spud:	8-Oct-04	
	30-045-32506						Release D	rl Rig: _	12-Oct-04	_
Location:	1360' FSL & 1720' FEL	1		ll is equipped			Move In Ca	۰	3-Dec-04	
	Sec. 12 - T32N - R11W		· -	M x 2-3/8" EUE			Date TD Rea	ched:_	6-Dec-04	
	San Juan County, NM			x 7-1/16" 3M 1	-		Release Ca	v Rig:_	11-Dec-04	
	6443 GL (above MSL)		9-5/8" 8	RD x 11" 3M	Casing Hea	id .				
	13' above Ground Level					Surdana Com				
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL	-	i i			<u>SurfaceCem</u>	ate cmt'd:	۵.	Oct-04	
Surface Cooling	Date set: 9-Oct-04		X New	A M		in .	sx Class G C		Oct-04	—
Surface Casing Size	9 5/8 in	-	Used			m <del></del>	OC S001 CaC			
Set at						66 <del></del>	x D130 Cellop		akes	
Wt.		-				(i) <del>-</del>	x, 174.0 cuft s			_
Hole Size						D	isplacement:	14.7 b	bls fresh wtr	
Excess Cmt	125 %	-				Bur	nped Plug at:	08:19	hrs w/ 500 p	si_
T.O.C.	SURFACE Csg	Shoe <u>227</u>	ft				al Circ Press:			<u>1</u>
	TD of 12-1/4'	'hole <u>237</u>	_ft				s during job:		YES	
						CMT Return	s to surface:		15 bbls	
	fied BLM @ 18:39 hrs on	07-Oct-04	-	MATERIAL DE	100	W O C 4	Floats Held:			
Notified	NMOCD @ 18:41 hrs on	07-Oct-04	-			_	6.00 hrs (pl	-		,
					10	W.O.O. 101 _	11.50 Ins (p	ug bump i	o test csg)	
Intermediate Ca	sing Date set: 11-Oct-04		X New			Intermediate	Cement			
Size		its	Used		3190		ate cmt'd:	11	-Oct-04	
Set at	2887 ft 0	pups				Lead : 370	sx Class G C	ement		_
Wt.	20 ppf Grade J-55	_				+ 3% D07	9 Extender			
Hole Size	8 3/4 in Conn STC	=				+ 0.25 lb/s	x D029 Cello	ohane F	akes	
Excess Cmt	160 % Top of Float	Collar <u>2841</u>	_ft	,			46 Antifoam			
	SURFACE Bottom of Casing		-	1	}	2.61cuft/s	x, 965.7 cuft s	lurry at	11.7 ppg	
Pup@		" Hole <u>2892</u>	_ft	1 11	1   • \	T-11 - 100	F0/F0 DO	7 . Class		
Pup @		10 Oct 04		\			0 sx 50/50 PO 0 Bentonite	Z : Class	s G cement	
	ified BLM @ 09:30 hrs on NMOCD @ 09:33 hrs on	10-Oct-04 10-Oct-04	=	)	1 + I		1 Calcium Chi	oride		
Notinea	113 011	10-001-04	-	/	/		0024 Gilsonite			
Production Line	er Date set: 09-Dec-04		X New				x D029 Cello		lakes	
Size		-	Used		)		046 Antifoam			_
Nominal Wt	. 15.5 ppf			\		1.27 cuft/s	x, 127.0 cuft	slurry at	13.5 ppg	
Grade	J-55 Connections:	LTC	_	<i>)</i>   L	]	ı	Displacement:		15.0 bbls	
# Jnts			(		(   )		mped Plug at:			
	6.25 / 9.5 inches		(	\   (a :	a)   /		al Circ Press:			n
	ned 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 2895' to	3137		)			ns during job: ns to surface:		Yes 55 bbls	
Top of Line PBTD			/		"	CIVIT NELUTI	Floats Held:			_
Bottom of Line			(		/		r iouis ricia.		_''	
	·		/	.						
				)	-   /					
This well was NOT	Cavitated.		1	´ L		UNCEMENT	ED LINER			
			'							_
						<b>I</b>	c prepared by . Moore, Drillir		1005	
COMMENTS.				TD3,1:	37ft	15-Dec-20		g ⊏ngm	eer	
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran	a quide choe	and an alumi	inum haffle ol	ate 1 it abou					=
3-5/0 5011.	Displaced top wiper plug with wat	•		•	•	•	Je @ 104.			
	CENTRALIZERS @ 217', 142', 99							Total	: 4	
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/ 20 BBLS. FRESI	H WATER AN	D 95 BBLS S	LIGHTLY POL	LYMERIZE	8.4 PPG DRIL	L WATER.			
l	CENTRALIZERS @ 2877', 2798',	2712', 2626',	2540', 2453',	204', 82', 39'.	•			Total		
<del></del>	TURBOLIZERS @ 1554', 1511'.					<del></del> -		Total		
5.5" Liner	9-Dec-04: Ran 6-1/16" bladed she							er hange	∍r).	
Perforations	10-Dec-04: Perforated 5-1/2" line: Perfs: 2904'-2908', 2913'-2918', 2	-				• .		1-20051	2122'-2127'	
1	TOTAL SHOTS = 272.	.020 -2002, 00		/20 -3034 , 304	du-304 <del>4</del> , d	040 -3030 , 300	( -3003 , 3030	,-3033 ,	3122-3121	•
Tubing	10-Dec-04: Ran 2-7/8" EUE x Ora	_			1/4" slots c	ut @ 2' and 14'	below the ups	et,		
	2-7/8" EUE x 2-3/8" EUE crossov					_				
}	1 ea 8' x 2-3/8" OD pup jt + 97 jts FOT / 8tm of Mud Anchor at 3129					D pup jt + 1 jt 2	-3/8" 4.7# J-5	5 EUE 8	rd tbg	
Pump & Rods	EOT / Btm of Mud Anchor at 3129 11-Dec-04: Ran 1" OD x 10 ft long			_		x 1-1/4" OD sinl	cer bars on to	o of num		
2	120 ea 3/4" OD rods, spaced out			• •				s or pull	٠,٢	
	Set pump in F-Nipple at 3097' MD				^	F=::0::00				

#### Page 1 of 5

### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

FC FEDERAL 002A

Common Well Name: FC FEDERAL 002A

Spud Date: 10/8/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 12/3/2004 End: 12/11/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 12/11/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY 22

Rig Name:	ŀ	KEY 22				Rig Number: 22
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
12/4/2004	13:00 - 17:00	4.00	MOVE	МОВ	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- MIRU KEY 22 & SPOT AUXILARY EQUIPMENT- "LONG MOVE & SHORT DAYS"
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	WELLPR	OPNW	COMPZN	SDON.
12/5/2004	07:30 - 13:30	6.00	MOVE	мов	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- SPOT AIR EQUIPMENT-RU AUXILARY EQUIPMENT- "RIG CREW ATTENDED COMPANY MEETING IN AM"
	13:30 - 16:00	2.50	WELCT	NUND	COMPZN	NIPPLE UP BOPE / BLOOIE LINES.
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	WELLPR	OPNW	COMPZN	SDON.
12/6/2004	07:00 - 10:15		WELLPR		COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- RIG UP AUXILARY EQUIPMENT-
	10:15 - 11:00	0.75	WELCTL	BOPE	COMPZN	PT BLIND RAMS / 7" CASING T/ 200 PSIG -10MIN. PERFORM CASING INTEGRITY TEST T/ 1800 PSIG-30 MIN (OK) NOTIFY BLM/OCD 12-04-2004 OF PENDING TEST.
	11:00 - 12:15	1.25	WELLPR	SFTY	COMPZN	RIG INSPECTION & CORRECTIONS-
	12:15 - 17:00		RPCOM		COMPZN	SLIP, TALLY, & CALIPER DC'S-
						SLIP & TALLY 2-7/8" AOH DRILL PIPE-
						MU 6-1/4" RR STX-30 TRI-CONE INSERT BIT (SN 5022878), JETTED
						W/ 3-20'S W/ 3-1/2" REG BOX x 2-3/8"IF BOX BIT SUB BORED,
						TAPPED, AND CONTAINING A FLOAT VALVE, W/ 14-(3-1/2") DC'S-TBHA 433.54.', W/ 2-3/8"IF X 2-7/8" AOH X-O SUB, W/ 1- JOINT
						2-7/8" AOH DRILL PIPE, W/ 2-7/8" AOH X 1.875" ID F NIPPLE, W/
			li			TOTAL OF 75 JTS 2-7/8" DRILL PIPE T/ T/2772'KB, TOC-
						PULL UP T/ 2600'KB.
	17:00 - 18:00		WELLPR		COMPZN	DRAIN UP & SDON.
12/7/2004	08:00 - 08:30	-	WELLPR		COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- SI 7" CP -0- PSIG.
	08:30 - 10:00		RPCOM	-	COMPZN	GIH W/ 6-1/4" DRLG ASSEMBLY F/ 2600 & TAG TOC @ 2772'KB RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	WELLPR	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRCULATE 7" CLEAN W/ Kfc PRODUCED WATER.
	11:00 - 13:30	2.50	WELCTL	BOPE	COMPZN	PT #2 PIPE RAMS CHOKE MANIFOLD / 7" CASING T/200 PSIG -10 MIN & 1800 PSIG -30MIN (OK)
					•	PT #1 PIPE RAMS & HCR VALVES T/200 PSIG-10MIN & 1800 PSIG-20MIN (OK)
						ISOLATE AND CHECK DRILL PIPE FLOAT VALVE (OK)-
						PT STANDPIPE / KELLY HOSE / POWER SWIVEL / & 2-7/8" TIW VALVE T/ 2000 PSIG-10 MIN (OK) .
						PT AIR LINES & MIST PUMP T/1250 PSIG (OK).
•	13:30 - 20:45	7.25	DRILL	DRLG	PROD1	BREAK CIRCULATION W/ 1500 CFM AIR & 10-6 BPH MIST
						CONTAINING 1 GAL F-450 FOAMER & 1/4 GAL CORRISION
						INHIBITOR / 10 BBLS PRODUCED Kfc WATER@ ~500 PSIG-
						DRILLOUT CMT/FC @ 2841'KB/CMT/FS @2887'KB/8-3/4" OH
						T/2892'KB- DRILLING 6-1/4" OPEN HOLE SECTION F/2892 - T/ 3137'KB.PBTD-
						W/ 6K WOB @ 70-80 RPM'S @ 1100-1400 FT-LBS OF TORQUE-
						COAL INTERVALS NET FEET OF COAL MAX GAS UNITS
•						2908-2910' (2') 15
						2913-2918' (5') 15
						2925-2931' (6') 400
		]				3012-3055'
						3081-3084' (3')   350   3091-3094' (3')   200
						3124-3127' (3')

## **CONOCOPHILLIPS CO**

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: FC FEDERAL 002A Common Well Name: FC FEDERAL 002A

Spud Date: 10/8/2004

Event Name:

**COMPLETION** 

Start: 12/3/2004 End: 12/11/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 12/11/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY 22** 

	10.00 00.15							7 1 4 72 . 15	*			
12/7/2004	13:30 - 20:45	7.25	DRILL	DRLG	PROD1	TOTAL	NET EE	T OF C	DAL GET			
						Į.			DAL 65'. CTIVE IN THIS AREA.			
						NOFC	106,60	FRODU	CTIVE IN THIS AREA.			
	20:45 - 01:00	4.25	EVALWB	CIRC	PROD1	R&R @	3137'TD	. PBTD V	V/ 1500 CFM & 6 BBL	HR MIS	TRA	ATF W/
		0		0					500 PSIG-			
									NT/ 1/4 OF A BUCKET	HR OF	F MI	UD
						LOGGE	R SAMP	LIER VA	LVE OF COFFEE GRO	DUNDS I	OW	N TO FINI
						COAL.						
	01:00 - 03:00	2.00	EVALFM	CIRC	PROD1	1			1500 -750 CFM AIR-			
	00.00 04.00	4.00	5500115		22024	_			LS/HR =17 BWPD			
	03:00 - 04:00		RPCOMP		PROD1	PULL U	_					
	04:00 - 05:00	1.00	EVALFM	PRUI	PROD1	FLOW T			FOLD #'S PITOT #'S	MCC	FD	,
							STENCY		OLD#3 PIIO1#3	MSC	טרט	′
						15MIN		12	3.0	1065	1	DRY
						30MIN		12	3.0	1065	,	DRY
						45MIN		12	3.0	1065	1	DRY
						60MIN		12	3.0	1065	1	DRY
	05:00 - 06:00	1.00	EVALFM	SIPB	PROD1	SIPBU						
	i					1	15MIN		45MIN 60MIN			
2/0/0004	00.00 07.00	4.00	-> / A L -> A	OLDD	00110711	19#	84#	84#	84# 84#			
2/8/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN				R TO STARTING OPE	RATION	IS-	
	NATURAL SURGE #1 W/ 84 PSIG- RETURNS: VERY LITE AMOUNT OF COAL DU											
	07:00 - 11:00	4.00	RPCOME	PULD	COMPZN	1			/3135'KB, 2' OF FILL A		IRGI	⊏ #1 <u>-</u>
		PULL UP INTO 7" @2867'KB-										
						1	VER SW	_				
						REVIEW	V DERRI	CK RES	CUE AND FALL PROT	ECTION	-	
						COOH V	N/ 6-1/4"	DRLG A	SSEMBLY -			
									OIL TOOLS UNDER-F			
							RS), W/	16/32" IN	CH JET W/ SHOCK SU	JB, W/ 1	4 <b>-</b> (3-	1/2")
						DC'S,-	D114.141		O			
									OH DRILL PIPE W/ 1.8			
							VER SW		COLLARS T/2895'KB,	7" SHO	E @ .	2887 KB.
	11:00 - 15:45	4.75	DRILL	REAM	COMPZN				UNDER-REAM @ 65	n+ PSIG	W// 1	500 CEM
									2895-3137'KB,PBTD V			
									@ 80+ RPM'S.			
	15:45 - 17:30	1.75	EVALWB	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRCUL	ATE WE	LLBORE	CLEAN W/ 1500 CFM	I AIR & F	/6 - [	OWN T/0
						BPH MIS	ST-					
	47.00 40.00								DRY UP.			
	17:30 - 18:00		RPCOMP		COMPZN	PULL UI	NDER-R	EAMER	UP INTO 7" CASING @	) 2882'K	B.	
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	EVALFM	PKUI	COMPZN	FLOW T			OLD #'S PITOT #'S		·	,
						CONSIS			OLD#3 PHO1#\$	MSC	'nυ	1
						15MIN	LINGT	10	2.5	970	1	DRY
						30MIN		10	2.5	970	1	DRY
						45MIN		10	2.5	970	1	DRY
	]					60MIN		10	2.5	970	7	DRY
	19:00 - 20:30	1.50	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SIPBU						
						l .	15MIN		45MIN 60MIN			
	1					18#	83#	86#	94# 94#			

### CONOCORHILLIPS CO

Page 3 of 5

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: FC FEDERAL 002A Common Well Name: FC FEDERAL 002A

Start:

Spud Date: 10/8/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

12/3/2004

End: 12/11/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 12/11/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY 22** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Rig Number: 22  Description of Operations
12/8/2004	19:00 - 20:30 20:30 - 01:00	1.50	EVALFM RPCOMF	SIPB	COMPZN COMPZN	BLEED WELL SLOWLY DOWN TO PIT. RD POWER SWIVEL- REVIEW DERRICK RESCUE AND FALL PROTECTION- COOH W. & LAYDOWN UNDER-REAMER -
	01:00 - 03:00	2.00	EVALFM	CIRC	COMPZN	GIH W/ 6-1/4" BHA W/ 2-7/8" AOH DRILL PIPE W/ 1.875" ID "F" NIPPLE RUN 1-JT ABOVE DRILL COLLARS T/3134'KB, TOP OF FILL. RU POWER SWIVEL. BREAK CIRCULATION W/ AIR & UNLOAD HEAVY DOWN TO LIGHT MIST-
	03:00 - 04:00	1.00	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	DRY UP WELLBORE < 5BWPD. PULL UP INTO 7".
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SIPBU SURGE # ISIP 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN 2 19# 80# 82# 88# 90# RELEASE NATURAL SURGE W/ 90#'S- BLOW AROUND W/ AIR MIST-
12/9/2004	06:00 - 15:00	9.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	RETURNS: VERY LITTLE IF ANY COAL. DRY UP W/ AIR- VENT TO ATMOSPHERE. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-
						SIPBU SURGE # ISIP 15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN 3 19# 80# 86# 88# 90# 4 20# 86# 86# 88# 90# 5 21# 87# 87# 88# 90# 6 22# 86# 88# 88# 88# RELEASE NATURAL SURGES W/ 88-90#'S- BLOW AROUND W/ AIR MIST- RETURNS: VERY LITTLE IF ANY COAL. DRY UP W/ AIR-
	15:00 - 15:45	0.75	RPCOMP	PULD	COMPZN	VENT TO ATMOSPHERE PRIOR TO SIPBU.  GIH W/ 6-1/4" DRLG ASSEMBLY F/2867 & TAG UP 3' OF FILL @
	15:45 - 04:00	12.25	EVALWB	CIRC	COMPZN	3134'KB- CO 3' OF FILL F/ 3134-T/3137'KB- R&R @ 3137'KB, PBTD W/ 1500 DOWN TO 750 CFM AIR W/ 6 BPH MIST CONTAINING 1 GAL/HR F-450 FOAMER & 1/4 GAL CORRISION INHIBITOR @ 400-250 PSIG- RETURNS: 1+ DOWN TO 1/8TH OF A BUCKET OF COFFEE GROUNDS DOWN TO FACE POWDER SIZE OF COAL, (99.9% COAL).
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	RPCOMP	TRIP	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO 7" @ 2867'KB- SHORT TRIP F/ 2867-T/3137'KB, PBTD (NO FILL OR BRIDGES)- COOH FOR LINER.
12/10/2004	06:00 - 10:00	4.00	RPCOMP	TRIP	PROD1	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- COOH W/ 6-1/4" DRLG ASSEMBLY- BIT GRADED:-( 1-1-NO-A-E-I-NO-TD)- MU "H" LATCH LINER HANGER ASSEMBLY ON FIRST JOINT OF DRILL PIPE. RU TO RUN 5-1/2" CASING MU 6-1/16" TIW BLADED SHOE ON 1ST JOINT OF CASING.
	10:00 - 10:30 10:30 - 12:30		WELCTL CASING		PROD1 PROD1	X-O & PT 5-1/2" PIPE RAMS T/ 84 PSIG- (OK) GIH W/ 5-1/2" 15.5 PPF J-55 LT&C CASING / LINER AS FOLLOWS:

# CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Page 4 of 5

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: FC FEDERAL 002A Common Well Name: FC FEDERAL 002A

Start:

12/3/2004

Spud Date: 10/8/2004

Event Name: Contractor Name: COMPLETION

Rig Release: 12/11/2004

End:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Group:

12/11/2004

Rig Name:

**KEY 22** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
12/10/2004	10:30 - 12:30	2.00	CASING	RUNC	PROD1	6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/FLOAT VALVE 1.00' 6- JTS 5-1/2" CASING 264.92' 6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR 2.40' TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY 268.32'
•	12:30 - 13:30	1.00	CASING	ноѕо	PROD1	GIH W/ 84 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/ 2886'KB. GIH & SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/2886-T/3137'KB EOL- W/ PBTD @ 3136'KB- RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 2868.7KB. 7" SHOE @ 2887'KB.
	13:30 - 19:00	5.50	RPCOME	PULD	COMPZN	RD POWER SWIVEL- BRAKE OUT SAVER SUB COOH & LAYDOWN 2-7/8" DP AND SETTING TOOL. TRIP IN & LD 3-1/2" DC'S.
	19:00 - 06:00	11.00	WELLPR	RURD	COMPZN	RU TO PERF- PREP & TALLY TBG-
12/11/2004	06:00 - 12:00	6.00	PERF	PERF	COMPZN	RD AUXILARY EQUIPMENT. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- SICP -85 PSIG- RU BLUE JET PERFORATORS- PT LUBRICATOR T/ 85 PSIG (OK)- PERFORATE Kfc INTERVALS 3122-3127' 3090-3095' 3081-3085' 3046-3056' 3036-3044' 3026-3034' 3012-3022' 2923-2932' 2913-2918' 2904-2908'
	12:00 - 13:15	1.25	WELCTL	BOPE	COMPZN	@ 4SPF TOTAL 272 (120 DEGREE PHASED HOLES) 3-MISFIRES RIG DOWN PERFORATORS. PT PIPE 2-3/8" RAMS T/ 85 PSIG- (OK) BLEED WELL SLOWLY DOWN TO PIT. FLOW TEST THRU 2" TIME CHOKE MANIFOLD #'S PITOT #'S MSCFD / CONSISTENCY
	13:15 - 16:00	2.75	RPCOMF	PULD	COMPZN	15MIN 16 4.0 1236 / DRY 30MIN 16 4.0 1236 / DRY 45MIN 16 4.0 1236 / DRY 60MIN 16 4.0 1236 / DRY 60MIN 16 4.0 1236 / DRY GIH W/ 2-7/8" ORANGE PEELED BOTTOM MUD ANCHOR ASSEMBLY W/ 8" X 1/4" SLOTS @ 2' & 14' DOWN ON ANCHOR (31.08' ), W/ 2-7/8" EUE 8RD X 2-3/8" EUE X-O COLLAR (0.46'), W/ 2-3/8" X 1.78" ID F NIPPLE (0.85'), W/ BLANKING PLUG IN FN (TESTED T/1000 PSIG BY B&R SERVICE) -W/ 2-3/8" X 8.00' PUP

#### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

FC FEDERAL 002A

Common Well Name: FC FEDERAL 002A

Spud Date: 10/8/2004

**Event Name:** 

COMPLETION

12/3/2004

Contractor Name:

End:

12/11/2004

Group:

KEY 22

JOINT-W/ 97 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING (3040.34') W/ 6' PUP JOINT BURIED BELOW JT #98 (31.40')-TAG BOTTOM @ 3136+/-'KB (NO FILL) PULL UP & LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR

**Description of Operations** 

**CONTAINING A BPV** 

PBTD @ 3136'KB EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3129 'KB 1/4" X 8" SLOTS @ 3102 & 3114'KB.

1.78" FN @ 3097.56'KB. PERF INTERVAL 2904-3127'KB. TOP OF LINER @ 2868.7'KB. ND BOPE & NU 2-3/8" X 7-1/16" BONNET.

DRAIN UP PUMPS & LINES, PICK-UP TOOLS, & SDON. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-

SICP -78 PSIG-RU B&R SLICKLINE-

PT LUBRICATOR T/78 PSIG (OK)-EQUALIZE & PULL BP IN FN @ 3097'KB-

RIG DOWN SLICKLINE. BLEED WELL DOWN TO PIT. FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)-

GIH W/ 10' DIP TUBE W/ STRAINER BOTTOM ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/2" X 12' RWAC-Z INSERT PUMP SN: (CP206) W/ 3 (1-1/4" x 25') SINKER BARS, AND 120-( 3/4") NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE W/ 2' PONY ROD, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD.

RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX.

PUMP SEATED @ 3097'KB,FN.

LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER-PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 500 PSIG (OK)-STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK). HANG OFF PUMP.

RIG DOWN & RELEASE RIG @ 18:00, 12-11-2004 TO TOWN-DROP FROM REPORT-

TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION OPERATIONS-

"JOB COMPLETE".

Printed: 12/13/2004 9:45:33 AM

KEY ENERGY SVCS

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

COMPZN

Start:

Rig Release: 12/11/2004

Rig Number: 22

Sub Hours Code Code RPCOMPPULD 2.75

2.00 WELCTL NUND

1.00 WELLPR OTHR

3.00 RPCOMPSLKL

4.00 RPCOMPPULD

4.00 WELLPR RURD COMPZN

Phase 13:15 - 16:00 COMPZN

12/11/2004

From - To Date

16:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 19:00

07:00 - 10:00

10:00 - 14:00

14:00 - 18:00

Rig Name:

12/12/2004