Form 3160-4 (August 1999).

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137

	<i></i>		BUKEAU	OF L	AND	MAN.	AGEM	IENI						Expires.	MOVEIII	DEI 30, 2000
	WELL (OMPL	ETION O	R RE	COM	IPLE	TION	REPO	RT	AND L	OG			ease Serial N		· ·
la. Type of	Well 🗖	Oil Well	☐ Gas V	Vell	□ Dr	v •	Othe	r: CBM					6. If	Indian, Allo	ttee or	Tribe Name
• •	Completion			□ Woi			Deepe		Plug	Back	□ Diff.	Resvr.		-		
,,	•	Othe									_		١	MNM7841	9D	ent Name and No.
2. Name of CONO	Operator COPHILLIP	S COMP	ANY		(Contact	t: JUAI E-Ma	NITA FAR ail: juanita	.r.fa	rrell@co				ease Name a SAN JUAN :		
3. Address	P O BOX HOUSTO							3a. Phon- Ph: 505	e No (599	(include).3419	area coo		9. A	PI Well No.		39-27868-00-S1
4. Location	of Well (Re	port locati	ion clearly an	d in acc	cordano	e with	Federa	requirem	ents)* _ 0	S A	[3	10.	Field and Po BASIN FRU	ol, or I	Exploratory
At surfa			85W Mer NM 1980FWL	ir .				8	€.		~~~ ~~~~	fra	11.	Sec., T., R.,	M., or	Block and Survey
At top p	rod interval i	reported b	elow								08	55	1	or Area Sec		30N R5W Mer NMP
At total	-							122	`	1	499.		F	RIO ARRIBA	4	NM
14. Date Sp 09/28/2				te T.D. '03/200		ed		🛶	3.8.	Complete A 7/2004	Ready to	Prod	17.	Elevations (I 628	DF, KE 17 GL	3, RT, GL)*
18. Total D	epth:	MD TVD	3180 3180		19. P	lug Ba	ck T.D	.: MĪ TV)	31 31	19:00	20. De	pth Br	idge Plug Se		MD TVD
		er Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Sub	mit co	py of e	ach)					well core	d?	No [Yes	(Submit analysis) (Submit analysis)
MUDLO)G											ectional Su	rvey?		Yes	(Submit analysis)
23. Casing ar	nd Liner Rec	ord (Repo	ort all strings	set in v	vell)											
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.)	To (MI		Botto (ME		tage Ceme Depth	nter		f Sks. & f Cement	Slurry (BI		Cement T	op*	Amount Pulled
12.250		25 H-40	32.3		0		228			150					0	11
8.750		000 J-55	20.0		0	2	2954			485		35			0	50
6.250	5.5	500 J-55	15.5	- :	2910	3	3180					0				
		_								 				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
24. Tubing	Record									<u> </u>				<u> </u>		
	Depth Set (N	(ID) P	acker Depth	(MD)	Size	e I	Depth S	Set (MD)	P	acker Der	oth (MD)	Size	D	epth Set (MI	5) T	Packer Depth (MD)
2.375	`	3161							1			***				
25. Produci	ng Intervals						26. Pe	rforation l	Reco	ord		•				
	ormation		Тор		Bott	om		Perfora	ated	Interval		Size		No. Holes		Perf. Status
	RUITLAND (COAL		2983		3099	2983 TO 3099 0.7					0.750 204 OPEN				
B)			•												<u> </u>	
C)																
D) 27. Acid. Fr	racture, Treat	tment. Ce	ment Squeeze	Etc.												
	Depth Interv	al							Aı	mount and	1 Type of	Material				
	•		\nearrow				$\overline{/}$									
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		7									•				
70 D 1	Interior															
Date First	ion - Interval	Hours	Test	Oil	16	as	Wat	ar 17	Oil Gr		Ica		I Dun dun	dan Makad		
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL		iCF	BBL		Corr.		Gas Gra	rity	Produc	tion Method		
11/07/2004	11/06/2004	1		0.0	i_	309.0		0.0						GAS I	PUMPI	ING UNIT
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL		as ICF	Wat BBI		Gas:O Ratio	il	Wel	Status				
2" PITOT	SI	0.3		0		7416		0				GSI				
	tion - Interva		I.e.	0"									Jac	CEPTEN	COD	Drago
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL		as ICF	Wat BBL		Oil Gr Corr.		Gas Gra	rity	Produc	tion Method	1 FA 19 G	: DEFORMED
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	G	as	Wat	er (Gas:O	il	Wel	Status	1	FOV 2	7	2004
Size	Flwg. SI	Press.	Rate	BBL		ICF	ВВІ		Ratio				1 30	ditents as		
	J.,	<u> </u>	حات										I FE	minika te.	188	Lutrice !

S. F		al C										
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Cort. API	Gas Gravity	-	Production Method		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well St	atus	•		
28c. Produc	tion - Interva	al D	1 -	L	J.,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,		L					
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	,	Production Method		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well St	atus	•		
29. Disposit SOLD	tion of Gas(S	old, used j	for fuel, veni	ed, etc.)		1	1	L				
30. Summar Show all	l important z cluding depti	ones of po	rosity and c	ontents there		ntervals and a	all drill-stem shut-in pressure	· ·	31. For	rmation (Log) Markers		
Fo	ormation		Тор	Bottom		Description	s, Contents, etc.		_	Name	Top Meas. Depth	
	nal remarks ell is a singl re Schemat	e well pro	ducing fron	n the Basin	Fruitland	Coal. Attach	ed is the		OJ KII FR	ACIMIENTO IO ALAMO RTLAND RUITLAND CTURED CLIFFS	1061 2405 2515 2913 3280	
1. Elect 5. Sund 34. I hereby	nclosed attac trical/Mecha dry Notice for certify that	nical Logs r plugging the foregoi	and cement ing and attac Elect	verification thed informationic Subm For CON	ation is com nission #512 NOCOPHII	258 Verified LLIPS COM	rect as determin by the BLM W PANY, sent to INE BRUMLE	ed from all ell Informa the Farmi Y on 11/29	ation Sy ngton /2004 (6	e records (see attached inst	ectional Survey	
Signatu	•		ic Submiss	on)				Date 11/25/2004				

ConocoPhillips

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

Well Name:	San Juan 30-5 # 210A							Spud:	28-Sep	
API#:	30-039-27868						Release I)rl Rig:	2-Oct	-04
Location:	715' FNL & 1980' FWL			well is equi					29-Oc	
	Sec. 30 - T30N - R5W		7-1/ ₁₆	' 3M x 2- ³ / ₈ '	" EUE 8rd	d Bonnet	Date TD Re	ached:	2-Nov	-04
	Rio Arriba County, NM		11" 3	M x 7-1/16"	3M Tubi	ng Head	Release C	av Rig:	6-Nov	·-04
-	6287' GL (above MSL)		9-5/8"	8 RD x 11'	3M Cas	ing Head	1			
Drl Rig RKB:	13' above Ground Level					nto Ho				
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL				-	90 40	<u>SurfaceCement</u>			
•				Maria Para		11 44 8	Date cmt'd:	29-	Sep-04	
Surface Casing	Date set: 29-Sep-04		X New	140 10			Lead: 150 sx Class G C	ement		
Size	9 5/8 in		Used	930 320	-		+ 2% BWOC S001 Ca0	212		
Set at	228 ft # Jnts: 5			1,00			+ 0.25 lb/sx D130 Cello	phane Fla	ikes	
Wt.	32.3 ppf Grade H-40	•		12462			1.16 cuft/sx, 174 cuft sl	urry at 15	.8 ppg	
Hole Size							Displacement:	14.5 bb	ls fresh	wtr
Excess Cmt	125 %			Date Hall			Bumped Plug at			
T.O.C.	SURFACE Csg	Shoe 228	ft	1			Final Circ Press	: 150 ps	si @ 2.0	bpm
	TD of 12-1/4"		- ft			la i	Returns during job:		YES	
			= '				CMT Returns to surface:		11 bbls	
Noti	fied BLM @ 11:30 hrs on	27-Sep-04					Floats Held:		-	sed
	NMOCD @ 11:30 hrs on	27-Sep-04	- ,	2510			W.O.C. for 6.00 hrs (
·	111000 @ 1130 1115 011	27-3ep-04					W.O.C. for 8.00 hrs (
	•						W.O.C. IOIIIIS (and onub to	iesi csg	,
l	D-t 1 O-t 0.4		₩	91717	- 111	151/19 Cana	Internalists Communi			
Intermediate Ca			X New				Intermediate Cement		24.24	
Size		jts	Used				Date cmt'd:		Oct-04	
Set at		pups				13-14	Lead: 385 sx Class G (ement		
Wt.	 ''	-			- ,	18.4	+ 3% D079 Extender			
Hole Size		·	_				+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cello	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	akes	
Excess Cmt	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Collar 2906	_	, 4			+ 0.2% D046 Antifoam			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
T.O.C.	SURFACE Bottom of Casing		_			}	2.61cuft/sx, 1004.9 cuf	t slurry at	11.7 pp	g
Pup @	ft TD of 8-3/4	" Hole <u>2960</u>	_ft	()	-	\	 			
Pup @	ft			1		1	Tail: 100 sx 50/50 PC)Z : Class	G cem	ent
Noti	fied BLM @ 15:00 hrs on	30-Sep-04	_	\)	+ 2% D020 Bentonite			
Notified	NMOCD @ <u>15:00</u> hrs on	30-Sep-04	_	/			+ 2% S001 Calcium Ch	ıloride		
			_			- (+ 5 lb/sx D024 Gilsonit	e		
Production Line	er Date set: 04-Nov-04	_	X New	1 1		\	+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cello	phane Fla	akes	
Size	e <u>5 1/2</u> in		Used	\	-)	+ 0.2% D046 Antifoam			
Nominal Wt	. <u>15.5</u> ppf			\			1.27 cuft/sx, 127 cuft s	lurry at 13	.5 ppg	
Grade	J-55 Connections:	LTC		- / -			Displacement	: 118 bl	ols Fres	h Wtr
# Jnts	: 6	•				l 1	Bumped Plug at	: 15:07 h	irs w/ 12	246 psi
Hole Size	6.25 / 9.5 inches]	Final Circ Press	: 683 p	si @ 2.0) bpm
Underream	ned 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 2960' to	3180')		/	Returns during job:		YES	
Top of Line	r 2910 ft			/			CMT Returns to surface:		50 bbls	
PBTC				/			Floats Held		No	
Bottom of Line				1)			_	
					\sim	j				
)						
This well was NOT	cavitated.			7			UNCEMENTED LINER			
						=/	Schematic prepared by	<i></i>		
				TD	3,180	ft	Steven O. Moore, Drilli		er	1
COMMENTS:							19-Nov-2004			
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran	a guide shoe	and an alu	ıminum baf	fle plate	1 it above	e the guide shoe @ 184'.			
	Displaced top wiper plug with water	-			•	•	-			
	CENTRALIZERS @ 218', 140', 10							Total:		4
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/ 118 BBLS. FRES									
	CENTRALIZERS @ 2943', 2866',		2610', 252	5'. 213'. 85'	'. 43'.			Total:		9
1	TURBOLIZERS @ 2482', 2438', 2			-,,	,			Total:		4
5.5" Liner	4-Nov-04: Ran 6-1/16" OD bladed		t valve on b	otm of liner.	Ban line	er w/ TIW	/ H-Latch Drop Off Tool (no			•
Perforations	5-Nov-04: Perforated 5-1/2" liner							milot man	90.7.	
- Choramono	Perf. Intervals: 2983'-2989', 2992	'-2995', 2996	'-3002', 300	4'-3008', 3	020'-303	2', 3034'-	-3044', 3085'-3090', 3094'-	3099'. TO	TAL SH	10TS =
<u></u>	204.		,							
Tubing	5-Nov-04: Ran 30.60' x 2-7/8" EU		-			-	•	the upse	t,	
	2-7/8" x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd crossover				-3/8" OD	(1.78" ID) F-Nipple,			ſ
	1 e 2-3/8" x 4' pup jt + 99 jts 2-3/8			•						
L	Bottom of Mud Anchor at 3161'. F									
Pump & Rods	6-Nov-04: Ran 12" long strainer a		-	-						
J	121 ea 3/4" OD rods, spaced out	with 4' - 6' - 8	x 3/4" OD	pony rods	& 1 ea 1-	1/4" OD	x 22' polished rod			

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A

Spud Date: 9/28/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

10/29/2004

End:

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Start: Rig Release: 11/6/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY

Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/30/2004 10/31/2004	07:00 - 19:00 07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50	DRILL DRILL MOVE	WOW SFTY RURD	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	SHUT DOWN DUE TO WEATHER AND MUD. PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. MOVE RIG AND SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP. MOVED TO THE SAN JUAN 30-5 #210A SEC 30 - T30N - R5W 715'FNL 1980'FWL NEAREST HELI PAD IS THE LOCATION 1/4 MILE SOUTHEAST OF THIS ONE.
						CALLED THE BLM HOTLINE PHONE FOR PRESSURE TEST @ 1040HRS, 10/30/2004
			·			LEFT VOICE MAIL ON THE PHONE OF CHARLIE PERRIN WITH THE OCD @ 1045HRS ABOUT PRESSURE TEST. 10/30/2004 INSPECTED BOPS, DRILL PIPE, DRILL COLLARS AND ALL SUBS. FORKLIFT WAS NOT OPERATING PROPERLY RED TAGGED IT UNTIL IT CAN BE SERVICED TOMORROW. COULD NOT NIPPLE UP OR LAY BLOOIE LINES.
11/1/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00		STIMOP STIMOP	I	COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. NIPPLE UP BOPS, RIG UP FLOOR, CHANGE OUT DRILLING LINE, PUT UP BLOOIE LINES AND BLOW LINES, PULL DRILL PIPE OUT OF BASKET. STRAP AND CALIPER DC & DP. RIG TIOGA AND WINDWALLS.
11/2/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:30 08:30 - 13:00	1.00	DRILL DRILL TREBOP	SFTY SFTY SFEQ	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	SECURE LOCATION AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. RIG INSPECTION AND REPAIR GIGS. PRESSURE TEST CASING AND BLIND RAMS 300# LOW FOR 10 MIN AND 1800# HIGH FOR 30 MIN. STATE INTEGRITY TEST. INSTALL TEST PLUG AND PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS, HCR VALVES, AND ALL MANIFOLD VALVES. 300 # LOW
	13:00 - 14:00		DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	FOR 10 MIN. AND 1800 # HIGH FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK GIH PU BHA 6 1/4" RERUN BIT, BIT SUB WITH DP FLOAT, 10 - 3 1/2" DC'S, 1JT OF 2 7/8" DP, 1-2 7/8" FN W / 1.87 PROFILE.
	14:00 - 15:00		DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP 2 7/8 DP TO 2887'
	15:00 - 16:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL. PRESSURE TEST STAND PIPE, AIR MANIFOLD, TIW VALVE AND KELLY HOSE TO 1800PSI FOR 10 MIN AND 300PSI FOR 10 MIN.
11/3/2004	16:00 - 17:00 07:00 - 08:00		DRILL DRILL	PULD SFTY	COMPZN	SECURE WELL, DRAIN UP AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	08:00 - 09:00	1.00	DRILL	SFEQ	COMPZN	SERVICE AND WARM UP ALL EQUIPMENT. PRESSURE TEST AIR LINES AND MANIFOLD TO 300PSI FOR 10
	09:00 - 11:00	2.00	DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	MINUTES AND 1200PSI FOR 10 MINUTES, ALL OK. UNLOAD HOLE, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION, DRLG CEMENT FROM 2887' TO 2896' DRLG FLOAT COLLAR AND 46' OF CEMENT WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. TAG FLOAT @ 2896' CSG SHOE @ 2942' TD 8 3/4 HOLE @ 2960'

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A

Event Name: Contractor Name: COMPLETION

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Start:

Spud Date: 9/28/2004

10/29/2004 Rig Release: 11/6/2004

End: Group:

Rig Name: **KEY** Rig Number: 27

Sub From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations Date Code 11/3/2004 3.00 DRILL DRLG COMPZN DRILLING FORMATION 2960' TO 3180' 11:00 - 14:00 DRLG WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 330PSI ON STANDPIPE. 2984' - 2990' 6' 97 UNITS OF GAS 2996' - 3000' 4' 96 UNITS OF GAS 3004' - 3008' 4' 94 UNITS OF GAS 3020' - 3038' 18' 105 UNITS OF GAS 3039' - 3043' 185 UNITS OF GAS 4' 3086' - 3091' 5' 137 UNITS OF GAS 3095' - 3098' 3' 131 UNITS OF GAS TOTAL COAL 46' 14:00 - 15:00 1.00 DRILL CIRC COMPZN BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 330PSI ON STANDPIPE. WELL WAS MAKING 1 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL, DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL. 15:00 - 15:30 0.50 DRILL CIRC COMPZN TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND BLOW WELL DRY. LIGHT MIST TO SURFACE WHEN BLOWING WELL DRY. PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE 15:30 - 16:00 0.50 DRILL **PULD** COMPZN WITH POWER SWIVEL. COMPZN 16:00 - 17:00 1.00 FLOWT PRDT 2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL PRESSURE 0 # ON GAUGE 0.00 # 000 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 1 # ON GAUGE 0.25 # 309 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 1 # ON GAUGE 0.25 # 309 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 1 # ON GAUGE 0.25 # 309 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 1 # ON GAUGE 0.25 # 309 MCFD NO WATER ON FLOW TEST. 17:00 - 18:00 1.00 FLOWT SIPB COMPZN SHUT IN TEST INSP 5 PSI MINUTES 45 PSI 15 30 MINUTES 73 PSI 45 MINUTES 85 PSI MINUTES 85 PSI 60 RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN. 18:00 - 19:00 COMPZN 1.00 DRILL TRIP TRIP OUT OF HOLE. 19:00 - 19:30 0.50 DRILL **SFTY** COMPZN PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION 19:30 - 21:30 DRILL 2.00 TRIP COMPZN PICK UP SHOCK SUB AND UNDER REAMER AND TRIP IN HOLE. 21:30 - 22:00 0.50 DRILL PULD COMPZN PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL. ESTABLISH CIRCULATION. 22:00 - 03:00 DRILL **UREM** COMPZN 5.00 UNDER REAM 6 1/4 HOLE TO 9 1/2 HOLE FROM 2960' TO 3180' WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 610PSI ON STANDPIPE. 03:00 - 04:00 1.00 DRILL CIRC COMPZN BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 8 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 620PSI ON STANDPIPE.

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A

Start: 10/29/2004 Spud Date: 9/28/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

End:

Contractor Name:

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 11/6/2004

Group:

Rig Name:	I	KEY				Rig Number: 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
11/3/2004	03:00 - 04:00	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	
	04:00 - 05:00	1.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY UP HOLE.
						WELL IS MAKING APPROXIMATELY 1 BBL OF WATER PER HOUR.
	05:00 - 06:00	1.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
11/4/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
						INITIAL PRESSURE 1 # ON GAUGE 0.25 # 309 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 2 # ON GAUGE 0.50 # 434 MCFD
						30 MINUTES - 2 # ON GAUGE 0.50 # 434 MCFD
						45 MINUTES - 2 # ON GAUGE
						NO WATER ON FLOW TEST.
Í	07:00 - 08:30	1.50	DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH UNDER REAMER.
						LAY DOWN SHOCK SUB AND UNDER REAMER.
	08:30 - 09:30		STIMOP	1	COMPZN	PICK UP BIT AND BIT SUB, TRIP IN HOLE TO 2940'.
	09:30 - 11:00	1.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL, GIH PICKING UP 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3177' ESTABLISH
						CIRCULATION AND CIRCULATE.
						LAY DOWN 9 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL.
						·
	11:00 - 13:00	2.00	STIMOP	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST
-						INSP 10 PSI 15 MINUTES 25 PSI
						30 MINUTES 35 PSI
						45 MINUTES 75 PSI
						60 MINUTES 85 PSI
						75 MINUTES 85 PSI 90 MINUTES 87 PSI
						105 MINUTES 87 PSI
						RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE #2, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
ĺ	13:00 - 17:30	4.50	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	NATURAL SURGE,
						#3 85PSI 60MIN #4 85PSI 60MIN
						#4 85PSI 60MIN #5 85PSI 60MIN
						#6 85PSI 60MIN
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3180'.
						TRIP OUT OF HOLE LAYING DOWN DRILL PIPE WITH POWER
	18:30 - 19:30	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	SWIVEL. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST
	10.00	1.50			30.m. 2.14	INITIAL PRESSURE 1 # ON GAUGE 0.25 # 309 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 2 # ON GAUGE 0.50 # 434 MCFD
1						30 MINUTES - 2 # ON GAUGE 0.50 # 434 MCFD
						45 MINUTES - 2 # ON GAUGE 0.50 # 434 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 2 # ON GAUGE 0.50 # 434 MCFD
						NO WATER ON FLOW TEST.
	19:30 - 20:30	1.00	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	ESTABLISH CIRCULATION AT CASING SHOE.
	20:30 - 21:00	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL, TAG @ 3177'.
	21:00 - 03:30	6 50	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	Clean out 3' of fill!!!!! CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6
	1.00 - 03.50	0.30	STINIOF	O.I.(C	CONFLIN	BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450
						FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
	03:30 - 04:00		STIMOP	I .	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY UP WELL.
	04:00 - 05:00	1.00	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN DRILL PIPE WITH POWER
1	l .	1	1	1	1	

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A

Event Name: COMPLETION Contractor Name:

Start: 10/29/2004 Spud Date: 9/28/2004

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Rig Release: 11/6/2004

End: Group:

Rig Name:

KEY

Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub	Phase	Description of Operations
11/4/2004	04:00 - 05:00	1 00	STIMOP	Coue	COMPZN	· 展示生物理解析(1)100000000000000000000000000000000000
111412004	05:00 - 06:00	1	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER.
11/5/2004	06:00 - 07:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	RIG UP FLOOR TO RUN LINER. CHANGE #1 RAMS TO 5 1/2 AND TEST.
	07:00 - 08:00	1.00	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA FOR RUNNING LINER AND TRIPPING IN THE HOLE WITH DRILL PIPE WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	08:00 - 12:00	4.00	CASING	PUTB	COMPZN	GIH W/ 5-1/2" 15.5 PPF J-55 LT&C CASING / LINER AS FOLLOWS:
						6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/ FLOAT VALVE - 1.00'
						6- JTS 5-1/2" CASING - 267.05'
						6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR - 2.40'
						TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY - 270.45'
				-		GIH W/ TOTAL OF 84 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/2900'KB.
						PICK UP SINGLE JOINTS OF DP- GIH W/ 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/2900' & TAG UP @
						3180'KB,3179'PBTD.
						SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 2910 - 3180'KB EOL- W/ PBTD @ 3179'KB-
						RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 2910'KB. WAIT ON CHANGE OVER SUB FROM HANGER TO DP.
	12:00 - 15:30	3.50	CASING	PULD	COMPZN	LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, TRIP IN HOLE WITH DRILL COLLARS AND LAY DOWN SAME.
						RIG DOWN AND LOAD OUT POWER SWIVEL
	15:30 - 16:00	1	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	CHANGE RAMS FROM 5 1/2" TO 2 3/8" IN #1 BOP, AND TEST.
	16:00 - 17:00 17:00 - 18:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	UNLOAD TUBING FROM TRAILER, TALLY AND PREP TO RUN. SECURE WELL LOCK UP EQUIPMENT, SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
11/6/2004	07:00 - 07:30		PERFOR		COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 09:30	2.00	STIMOP	PERF	COMPZN	RIG UP BLUE JET AND TEST LUBRICATOR TO 85PSI. PERFORATE AT FOLLOWING INTERVALS.
						3094' - 3099' = 5' 20 SHOTS
						3085' - 3090' = 5' 20 SHOTS
						3004' - 3008' = 4' 16 SHOTS
						3034' - 3044' = 10' 40 SHOTS 2996' - 3002' = 6' 24 SHOTS
]			2992' - 2995' = 3' 12 SHOTS
						3020' - 3032' = 12' 48 SHOTS
						2983' - 2989' = 6' 24 SHOTS
						4 SHOTS PER FOOT, 204 TOTAL SHOTS. 3 WIRELINE RUNS.
	09:30 - 11:00	1.50	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	BLOW WELL DOWN AND FLOW TEST. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST SIBU 85PSI
	11:00 . 12:00	2.00	STIMOP	DOST	COMPAN	60 MINUTES - 2 # ON GAUGE 0.25 # 309 MCFD
	11:00 - 13:00	2.00	STINIOP	1607	COMPZN	GIH W/ 30.60' X 2-7/8" 8RD EUE BOX ORANGE PEELED MUD

Page 5 of 5

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 210A

Event Name: Contractor Name: COMPLETION

KEY ENERGY SVCS

Start:

10/29/2004

Spud Date: 9/28/2004 End:

Rig Release: 11/6/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY

Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
11/6/2004	11:00 - 13:00	2.00	STIMOP	RCST	COMPZN	ANCHOR W/ 8-(1/4" X 8") SLOTS, 2-7/8" X 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X-O COLLAR (0.45"), W/ 0.73" x 2-3/8" EXPENDABLE CHECK W/ 0.85" x 2-3/8" OD X 1.78" ID "F" NIPPLE. W/ 2-3/8" X 4', PUP JOINT- W/ 99 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING (3111.74')- LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A BPV EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3161'KB 1.78" FN @ 3129'KB.
	13:00 - 17:00	4.00	STIMOP	NUND	COMPZN	RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN AND LOAD OUT BOPS. NIPPLE UP RADAGAN AND RIG UP TO RUN RODS. SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
11/7/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	STIMOP	SETY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 08:00	1	STIMOP	1	COMPZN	WARM UP EQUIPMENT, BLOW WELL DOWN, 85PSI
	08:00 - 09:00	1.00	STIMOP	SLKL	COMPZN	DROP BALL AND PUMP OUT EXPENDABLE CHECK.
	09:00 - 12:00	3.00	STIMOP	ALFT	COMPZN	RU TO RUN RODS-
	12:00 - 18:00	6.00	STIMOP	RURD	COMPZN	FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)- GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/4" X 12' RHAC-ZDV INSERT PUMP SN: (CP196) W/ 3 SINKER BARS AND 121 3/4" NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE OUT W/ 4', 6', 8', PONY RODS, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD W/ 2' PONY ROD ON TOP. RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3129'KB,FN. LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER- PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 500 PSIG (OK)- STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK). HANG OFF PUMP. RIG DOWN AND PREPARE TO MOVE RIG.
						RIG RELEASED @ 1800 HRS TO THE SAN JUAN 30-5 #208A