Form 31	60-4
(August	1999)

# **UNITED STATES**

FORM APPROVED OMB NO. 1004-0137 Expires: November 39, 2000 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG - V-5. Lease Serial No. NMSF/078996 Oil Well A Gas Well Dry 6. Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name Other New Well Work Over Deepen Plug Back Diff. Resvr,. Type of Completion 7. Unit or A Agreement Name and no. 070 Farmington NA Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No. CONOCOPHILLIPS CO. SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT 218A 3.a Phone No. (Include area code) Address 9. API Well No. P.O. BOX 2197 WL3 4061 HOUSTON TX 77252 (832)486=2326 30-045-31318 Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements). 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory At Surface NWNE 960' FNL & 1855' FEL **BASIN FRUITLAND COAL** Sec., T., R., M., on Block and Survey or Area B 7 31N 7W At top prod. interval reported below 12. County or Parish 13. State At total depth SAN JUAN NEW MEXIC 16. Date Completed 14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)\* 04/02/2003 04/07/2003 06/04/2063 22 12 12 6652 GL MD 3125 18. Total Depth: MD 3600 19. Plug Back T.D.: Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD TVD 3600 TVD 3125 TVD 21. Type of Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) Was well cored? X No ☐ Yes (Submit analysis) Was DST run? 🛛 No 🗆 Yes (Submit analysis) Directional Survey? No Yes (Submit copy) 23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well) No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol. (BBL) Stage Cementer Cement Top\* Amount Pulled Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Bottom (MD) Hole Size Top (MD) Depth Type of Cement 32.3 230 13.75 9.625 200 8.75 20 3194 505 0 24. Tubing Record Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) 2.375 3324 25. Producing Intervals Perforation Record Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status A)BASIN FRUITLAND 3194 **OPEN HOLE** 3600 B)COAL C) D) Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeze, Etc. Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material 3194 - 3600 **OPEN HOLE** 28. Production - Interval A
Date First | Test | Hours
Produced | Date | Tester Oil Gravity Corr. API Production Method Test Production Oil BBL Gas MCF Water BBL Gas Gravity 06/16/03/06/03/0324 0 1304 24 **FLOWING** Choice Size Tbg. Press. 24 Hr. Oil BBL Gas MCF Water BBL Gas : Oil Ratio Well Status ACCEPTED FOR RECORD Flwg. **PITOT** 0 SI PRODUCING GAS WELL Production - Interval B AUG 0 5 2003 Date First Hours Tested Test Production Gas MCF Water BBL Oil Gravity Corr. API Gas Gravity Production Method Produced FARMINGTUN FIELD OFFICE

Gas : Oil Ratio

Well Status

24 Hr

Oil BBL

Gas MCF

Choke

Tbg. Press

Flwg. SI

28b. Produ	ction - Inter	val C										
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method	,		
Choke Size	Choke Size Tbg. Press. Press. Flwg. SI Csg. SI Csg. SI Csg. SI Csg. Press. SI Csg											
			Test	Oit	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity	Gas	Production Method			
Date First Produced	Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity											
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Oil Gas Water BBL Gas: Oil Well Status  MCF BBL Ratio							
29. Disp	osition of G	as (Sold,	used for fuel	, vented, e	etc.)							
30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers):  31. Formation (Log) Markers										· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
Show tests,	all importa	nt zones o	r porsity and	contents			and all drill-stem and shut-in pressures					
Form	ation	Тор	Bottom		Desc	riptions, Con	tents, etc.		Name	Тор		
			<del> </del> -	<del> </del>	<del></del>			<del> </del>		Meas. Depth		
	ļ							NACIAM	ENTO	1237		
								OJO ALA	MO	2392		
								KIRTLAI	ND	2492		
	ļ							FRUITLA	AND	3127		
								PICTURI	ED CLIFFS	3537		
			}									
			ļ									
	ĺ											
	1											
			<u> </u>				··-					
This wel	l is a singl	le produ	e plugging pr scing from ematic and	the Fru	itland Coa ily summa	ıl. It is also ries.	o currently an ope	enhole comp	oletion. We will return to	o cavitate and perf.		
32 Cirole	enclosed at	tachmente		<u>-</u>	<del></del>		T ====			<u> </u>		
			ogs (1 full se	t reald )	2	Geological Re	eport 3. DST Re	mort 4.	Directional Survey			
			ging and cem			Core Analysis	=					
34. I herel	oy certify the	at the fore	going and at	tached in	formation is	complete and	l correct as determine	d from all avai	llable records (see attached inst	tructions)*		
Name	(please p	t) <u>DEB</u>	ORAH M	ARBER	RY .		Title <u>REGI</u>	ULATORY	ANALYST			
Signa	ture	lo	rali	M	arlie	My	Date <u>07/</u>	29/2003				
Title 18 U	J.S.C. Section	on 101 and	d Title 43 U.	S.C. Secti	on 1212, ma	ake it a crime	for any person know	ingly and willf	ully to make to any department	t or agency of the United		
States all	1 14185, 110111	ious of its	adulent state	ments of I	epresentatio	ris as to any r	natter within its juriso	aiction.				

## ¹ ConocoPhillips

#### END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

## ConocoPhillips

Total:

				,
Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT # 218A	Spud Date:	2-Apr-03	TD Date :	7-Apr-03
API #: 30-045-31318	Spud Time:	2130 hrs	Rig Release Date:	8-Apr-03
Surface Casing       Date set:	Spud Time:		<b>Rig Release Date</b> : eter/Cap Head	3-Apr-03 /2% S001 and opg & 1.16  15.0 FW 1450 HRS 365 PSI YES 14 BBLS es No mp to drig cmt)  7-Apr-03 ops D029,
Wt. <u>20</u> ppr Grade <u>J-55</u> Hole Size <u>8 3/4</u> in			Mixed @ 11.7 ppg & 2.61 cuf	
Wash Out 150 % Csg Shoe 31		<b>4</b>	Tail: 105 sx 50/50/G/POZ w	//5 pps D024,
Est. T.O.C. SURFACE ft TD of intermediate 31	<u>198</u> ft	1	1/4 pps D029, 2% D020, 2%	
Notified BLM @ 2234 hrs on 4/6/200	13	1	Displacement vol. & fluid.: 1	
Notified NMOCD @ 2237 hrs on 4/6/200		<b>\</b>	Bumped Plug at:	
<u> </u>	<del></del>	1 [	Pressure Plug bumped:	2000 PSI
	ı	(	Returns during job:	
Production Hole Date TD'd: 29-May-03 Hole Size 6 1/4 in	(	/	CMT Returns to surface: Floats Held: X Y	
Reamed to 9 1/2 in			, idao 11512. <u>- 12</u> 1	
	(			
•				
	ΤI	O 3,600 ft		
COMMENTS: Surface: NO FLOAT EQUIPMENT RAN. WELL SHU	T-IN WITH 80 P	SI.		
Intermediate: LEFT APPROXIMATELY 25' CEMENT ON	TOP OF WIPER	PLUG (PB: 3125')	)	
Production:				
				<del></del>
CENTRALIZERS: Surface: CENTRALIZERS @ 220', 144', 101' & 57'.			Tr	otal: 4
Intermediate: CENTRALIZERS @ 31841 31001 30261 20	42' 2064' 2770'	8 2041 TUDDOLL		······ <del></del>

#### ConocoPhillips

Page 1 of 3

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT FRUITLA 000218A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 FRUITLAND #218A UNIT

03/28/2003

Event Name:

**Original Completion** 

Start:

Spud Date: 04/02/2003 End:

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Number: 22

Date   From - To   Hours   Code   Subco   Phase   Description of Operations	
05/24/2003	
07:30 - 09:00	
09:00 - 10:00	
10:00 - 13:30	
13:30 - 16:30	
16:30 - 18:45	
200# 3 MIN'S & 625# FOR 30 MIN'S, NO BLED OFF ON 7" GOOD TEST = TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST = TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST = TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST = TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST = TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 625# FOR 30 MIN'S, NO BLED OFF ON 7" GOOD TEST = TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S & 625# FOR 30 MIN'S, NO BLED OFF ON 7" GOOD TEST = TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 M	LOOIE
18:45 - 19:00	CSG = VALVE'S &
05/28/2003	IDAY
07:30 - 10:00	
10:00 - 12:00	KEV
10:00 - 12:00	I I I
12:00 - 15:30	CK = TALLY
15:30 - 17:00	8 JT'S OF
05/29/2003   17:00 - 17:30   0.50 CM   1   50PRDR   SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.   50PRDR   SAFETY MEETING IN TOWN W / ALL RIG CREW'S, CONTINUE   CONOCOPHILLIPS REP'S   TRAVEL TIME	
05/29/2003   06:00 - 08:30   2.50   CM   c   50PRDR   SAFETY MEETING IN TOWN W / ALL RIG CREW'S, CONT	
08:30 - 10:00   1.50 CM   1   50PRDR   TRAVEL TIME	RACTOR'S
10:30 - 11:15   0.75 CM   5   50PRDR   CIRC & UNLOAD HOLE W / AIR ASSIST	
13:15 - 13:30 0.25 CM h 50PRDR DRILL OUT 7" FLOAT COLLAR @ 3150' & 7" SHOE @ 3194	t' = TO 8
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 CM 5 50PRDR CIRC & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGER	
14:00 - 18:00   4.00 CM   1   50PRDR   DRILL FRUITLAND COAL T/3339'	
18:00 - 18:30 0.50 CM 5 50PRDR CIRC TO CLEAN UP WELLBORE	
18:30 - 18:45 0.25 CM 4 50PRDR PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA	
18:45 - 19:00 0.25 CM 1 50PRDR SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.	
05/30/2003   07:00 - 07:30   0.50 CM   c   50PRDR   SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION	
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 CM 4 50PRDR RIH FROM 7" CSG TO 3339"	
08:00 - 18:00   10.00 CM   1   50PRDR   DRILLING 6 /4" HOLE F/3339' - T/3600' TD W / AIR ASSIST	
18:00 - 18:30 0.50 CM 5 50PRDR CIRC & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGER = COAL INTERVA	
3251'-53' = 2 FT = 50 GAS UNIT'S	
3258'-62' = 4 FT = 449 GAS UNIT'S	
3264'-68' = 4 FT = 449 GAS UNIT'S	
3291'-92' = 1 FT = 400 GAS UNIT'S	
3293'-95' = 2 FT = 400 GAS UNIT'S	
3302'-07' = 5 FT = 430 GAS UNIT'S	
3316'-18' = 2 FT = 450 GAS UNIT'S	
3319'-24' = 5 FT = 450 GAS UNIT'S	•
3326'-28' = 2 FT = 450 GAS UNIT'S	
3340'-46' = 6 FT = 470 TO 570 GAS UNIT'S	
3406'-07' = 1 FT = 550 GAS UNIT'S	
3420'-22' = 2 FT = 560 GAS UNIT'S	
3510'-12' = 2 FT = 560 GAS UNIT'S	
3530'-32' = 2 FT = 560 GAS UNIT'S	
3535'-39' = 4 FT = 570 GAS UNIT'S	

#### Page 2 of 3

#### ConocoPhillips

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT FRUITLA 000218A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 FRUITLAND #218A UNIT

Event Name:

**Original Completion** 

Start:

03/28/2003

Spud Date: 04/02/2003 End:

Contractor Name:

Rig Release:

Group:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Number: 22

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Name:	r	(EX FM	=RGY			Rig Number: 22
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
05/30/2003	18:00 - 18:30	0.50	CM	5	50PRDR	3540'-41' = 1 FT = 570 GAS UNIT'S
	į				Į.	3542'-44' = 2 FT = 570 GAS UNIT'S
				i		TOTAL NET COAL 47 FT = TOP GAS UNIT'S 570 = COAL OVERALL
				ŀ		SILKY TO SATINY BLACK INTERMEDIATE GRADE MATRIX TO 50%
					1	TO 60% TO FLAT BLACK GREASY GRADE, FAIR CLEATING,
					1	ABUNDANT CALCITE FRACTURE FILL & SUB BLOCKY TO
				ļ		IRREGULAR CUTTING'S
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50		4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA = SECURED WELL & S.D.O.N.
05/31/2003	07:00 - 07:15	0.25		С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:15 - 07:30	0.25		9	80CMPL	BLOW DOWN WELL = HAD 540# ON CSG
	07:30 - 08:30	1.00	CM	u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE = 15 MIN'S-1300 MCFD = 30
	00:00 00:00	4.00	014	\ <u>.</u>	80CMPL	MIN'S-1400 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-1500 MCFD = 1 HR-1500 MCFD
	08:30 - 09:30	1.00	CM	t	BUCMPL	SHUT IN TEST = ISIP-15# = 15 MIN'S-180# = 30 MIN'S-255# = 45   MIN'S-330# = 1 HR-420#
	09:30 - 11:30	2.00	CM	4	80CMPL	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA
	11:30 - 11:45	0.25		2	80CMPL	PU & MU BAKER FISHING TOOL BEAR CLAW 9 1/2" LOCKOMATIC
	11.50 - 11.45	0.23	CIVI	2	GOCIVII E	UNDER-REAMER
	11:45 - 13:00	1.25	CM	4	80CMPL	RIH W / BHA & DP TO 7" SHOE @ 3194'
	13:00 - 13:30	0.50		5	80CMPL	BREAK CIRC & OPEN UNDER-REAMER ARM'S SLOWLY W / AIR
	10.00	0.00		,		ASSIST
	13:30 - 18:15	4.75	СМ	z	80CMPL	UNDER-REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE F/3198'-T/3279' W / AIR
						ASSIST
	18:15 - 18:30	0.25	СМ	5	80CMPL	CIRC BOTTOM'S UP W / AIR ASSIST
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA, LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W /
}	1		}	1	ì	POWER SWIVEL
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50		1	80CMPL	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
06/01/2003	07:00 - 07:15	0.25	1	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:15 - 07:30	1	CM	g	80CMPL	BLOW DOWN WELL = HAD 560# ON CSG
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50		4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG @ 3279'
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	СМ	5	80CMPL	BREAK CIRC W / AIR ASSIST & OPEN UNDER-REAMER ARM'S SLOWLY
	08:30 - 18:00	9.50	СМ	z	80CMPL	UNDER-REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" W / BAKER BEAR CLAW
	00.30 - 10.00	3.50	Civi	1	COOM!	UNDER-REAMER F/3279' - T/3466' W / AIR ASSIST
ļ	18:00 - 18:15	0.25	CM	5	80CMPL	CIRC BOTTOM'S UP TO CLEAN WELLBORE
	18:15 - 18:45	1	CM	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA LAYING DOWN JT'S W / POWER
			1	-		SWIVEL
	18:45 - 19:00	0.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
06/02/2003	07:00 - 07:30		СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
1	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	CM	9	80CMPL	BLOW DOWN WELL = 570# ON CSG
1	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG PU JT'S OF DP OUT OF V-DOOR W / POWER
		į				SWIVEL TAG @ 3456'
	08:30 - 13:00	4.50	CM	1	80CMPL	C/O TO 3466' = UNDER-REAM 6 1/4" HOLE TO 9 1/2" HOLE
						F/3466'-T/3559' W / AIR ASSIST = LAST COAL @ 3544' = TD @ 3600'
1	13:00 - 13:30		СМ	5	80CMPL	CIRC & CLEAN UP WELLBORE W / AIR ASSIST
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	CM	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W / POWER
			l		1	SWIVEL
	14:00 - 14:15		CM	6	80CMPL	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
	14:15 - 16:00		CM	4	80CMPL	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA
	16:00 - 16:30	1	CM	2	80CMPL	RD BAKER UNDER-REAMER & MU 6 1/4" BIT & BIT SUB
	16:30 - 17:15		CM	Z	80CMPL	SHUT DOWN = WAITING ON ELECTRICAL & RAIN STORM PASS OVERHEAD
	17:15 - 18:30	1	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH W / 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB, DC'S & DP TO 7" SHOE @ 3193'
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	CM	1	80CMPL	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
				1		
L						

Printed: 06/06/2003 2:59:53 PM

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT FRUITLA 000218A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 FRUITLAND #218A UNIT

Event Name:

**Original Completion** 

03/28/2003

Spud Date: 04/02/2003 End:

Contractor Name:

**KEY FOUR CORNERS** 

Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Number: 22

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
06/03/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	СМ	g	80CMPL	SICP 450 PSIG & SIDPP-0- PSIG-BLEED WELL DOWN TO PIT.
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	GIH FROM 7" CSG F/ 3193' -T/3552'KB ~ 48' FILL.
	08:30 - 10:30	2.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	BREAK CIRCULATION W/ AIR MIST & CO 48' FILL (1" DOWN TO
				'		FACE POWDER TYPE COAL, SHALE, SILTSTONE) F/3552 - T/
			}			3600'KB, PBTD-UNLOADED A SLUG OF WATER WHILE CLEANING
	1				1	OUT.
	10:30 - 10:45	0.25	СМ	5	80CMPL	CIRC & DRY UP WELLBORE W / AIR ASSIST PRIOR TO FLOW TEST.
	10:45 - 11:15	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG T/3193'KB-LAYING DOWN JT'S OF DP W /
						POWER SWIVEL.
	11:15 - 12:15	1.00	СМ	u	80CMPL	FLOW TEST THRU 2"
		,				TIME CHOKE MANIFOLD #S PITOT #S MSCFD / CONSISTENCY
						15MIN 21.0 4.5 1304 / DRY
						30MIN 21.0 4.5 1304 / DRY
						45MIN 21.0 4.5 1304 / DRY
				l		60MIN 21.0 4.5 1304 / DRY
						RECORD ISIP @ 50 PSIG.
	12:15 - 13:45	1.50	СМ	t	80CMPL	RECORD 1-HR SIPBU
	1	'''		1	000 2	15MIN 30MIN 45MIN 60MIN
					ļ.	240 370 420 460
						BLEED WELL SLOWLY DOWN TO PIT.
	13:45 - 17:30	3.75	СМ	4	80CMPL	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA-
				'		WELL PRODUCING: FLOWING OUT BLOOIE LINE F/ ~ 3/4 -T/ 1 BBL
						/ HR OF WATER DURING TRIP OUT.
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	wc	6	80CMPL	RIG UP TO RUN 2-3/8" TBG-X-O PIPE RAMS.
]	18:30 - 19:00		СМ	z	80CMPL	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
06/04/2003	07:00 - 07:30		СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:15	1	СМ	8	80CMPL	TEST 2 3/8" RAM'S = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	08:15 - 08:45	l .	СМ	2	80CMPL	PU & MU BHA
	08:45 - 11:15		CM	2	80CMPL	GIH PU 2 3/8" FL4S BHA & 2 3/8" EUE 8RD TUBING
İ	11:15 - 11:45	1	СМ	1	80CMPL	LAND HANGER W / TUBING SET AS FOLLOW'S
		0.00		'		FL4S 2 3/8" EXP CHECK SET @ 3324'.37"
					İ	FL4S 2 3/8" JT OF TUBING SET @ 3323'.59"
					i	FL4S 2 3/8" FN W / 1.780 PROFILE SET @ 3293'.59"
						FL4S 2 3/8" 4 JT'S OF TUBING SET @ 3292'.70"
	•		}			FL4S X EUE 8RD 2 3/8" J-55 4.7# X-OVER SET @ 3172'.53"
				ļ	1	101 JT'S 2 3/8" EUE 8RD J-55 4.7# TUBING SET @ 3172'.00" TO
						HANGER @ SURFACE = TOTAL OF 101 JT'S OF 2 3/8" EUE 8RD
			}			TUBING & 5 JT'S OF 2 3/8" FL4S TUBING IN WELL PLUS 2 3/8" FN &
						CHECK BOTH FLAS IN WELL
	11:45 - 14:30	2.75	СМ	e .	80CMPL	ND BOP'S & NU WELLHEAD = TEST WELLHEAD SEAL TO 300# =
				-		GOOD TEST
}	14:30 - 15:30	1.00	СМ	5	80CMPL	PUMP-OFF EXP CHECK & FLOW BACK WELL TO PURGE AIR OUT
						OF WELLBORE
	15:30 - 18:30	3.00	MV	6	70DMOB	RD & RELEASED RIG & EQUIPMENT ON 06/03/2003 @ 18:30 PM =
			]			JOB COMPLETE RELEASED WELL TO PRODUCTION DEPT TO
						PRODUCE FRUITLAND COAL OPENED HOLED W/TUBING
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	MV	1	70DMOB	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
		1				•
		!		1		