Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

# UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

RECEIVED

FORM APPROVED OMB NO. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

	WEL	L COI	MPLE1	ΓΙΟΝ	OR RE	ECOMPLI	ETIO	N REPO	ORT	AND L	OĞ	P -	5 AM	10 0	55 Leas NMSF	Serial No 079341	o. A	
la. Type b. Type	of Well of Complet					Dry O Work Over		eepen [	) Plu	07() ig Back (	Fa	arm) Diff.	ngton Resvr,	, NN	. If Inc	lian, Allot	tee or Tribe Na	ıme
	····	Other													7. Unit	or CA Ag	reement Name	and no.
	of Operato		CO												B. Leas		d Well No.	
3. Addr		ILLII O						3.a	Phone	No Horo	tite	area c	:ode)	<del> </del>	SAN J	<u>UAN 32</u>	-8 UNIT	231A
						TX 77252				)486-23	26	117g		1		Well No. -31628		
4. Locat	tion of Well	(Report	location (	clearly	and in a	ccordance wi	ith Fed	leral requir	reineni	š)* SE	رة الم		733A				or Explorator	<u>-</u>
At Su	rrface NWI	VW, 68	5' FNL	& 545	5' FWL	•		Į.			2	003	<u>્</u> રિં!	\	BASIN	FRUIT	LAND CO	AL
At to	p prod. inter	val repor	ted belov	v				, }	X) *	ME .					<ol> <li>Sec., Surv</li> </ol>	T., R., M. ey or Area	, on Block and D 28 32N 8	 
<b>A + +</b> = -	tal danth							ļ.	ÇÇ)	de bas					2. Cour	ity or Paris	sh   13. Stat	te
14. Date	tal depth		15	Date T	D. Reac	hed		16.0	Jara C.	mpleted					SAN J		NEW   F, RKB, RT, G	MEXIC
	•		ı			iicu		IΓ	לם ר	ú. A∵ ⊠l	(Ri	eadyte	Prod.				r, KKB, K1, U	L)*
	7/2003 Depth: M	D 3689		06/11/		lug Back T.D	· MI	0.3686	112312	2003	20.		Bridge	<del></del>	6705 C			
	TV	/D 3689	1				TV	D 3686		<del></del>		Бери				VD		
21. Type NONI	of Electric & E	& Other N	<b>Aechanic</b>	al Logs	Run (Su	abmit copy of	f each)				22.		well core				ubmit analysis bmit analysis)	)
													tional Su		□ No		s (Submit copy	
23. Casin	g and Liner	Record(	Report al	ll string.	s set in v	vell)												
Hole Size	Size/Grad	de Wt	. (#/ft.)	Тор	(MD)	Bottom (M	(D)	Stage Ceme Depth	enter	No. of Type of			Slurry (BB		Ceme	nt Top*	Amount	Pulled
12.25	9.625 H		-	0		219				135					0			
$\frac{8.75}{6.25}$	7 J55 5.5 J55	15.		0 3230		3278 3688				515 0		-			$\frac{0}{NA}$			
0.23	3.3 333			3230		3000				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·					11/11			
	+																	
24. Tubir	ng Record					L		<del></del>						I				·
Size		Set (MD	) Packe	er Depth	(MD)	Size	I	Depth Set (	MD)	Packer De	pth	(MD)	S	ize	Dep	th Set (MI	D) Packer D	epth (MD)
2.375 25. Produc	3679 cing Interval	ls			L		-	26 D		Dd			L		J			
	Formation	1		Тор		Bottom		26. Perfor	rated Ir			5	Size	No. I	loles		Perf. Status	
A)FRUI	TLAND (	COAL	33	16	3	3634	3	3316 - 36	534			.75		240		OPEN		
B) C)	<del></del>						+		·									
D)																		
	Fracture, Tro Depth Inter		Cement S	Sqeeze,	Etc.			<del></del>	Δ	nount and	Typ	e of M	laterial					
	- 3688		C	AVITA	ATE						ТУР	C OI IV	iateriai					
														····				
28. Produ	iction - Inter	rval A																
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Product	tion B	il BL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oi Co	l Gravit orr. API	у	Gas Gra	s ivity	Pro	duction l	Aethod			
07/23/03	<del></del>											FLOWING FROM WELL						
Choice Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oi Bi	il BL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	r Ga Ra	as : Oil atio		We	II Statu	s	A	CCEP'	red fo	R RECORL	<u></u>
PITOT	SI ()	470									PF	RODI	JCING			5 4 6	0000	
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	0	il Di	Gas	Water		il Gravit		Gas		Pro	duction N		P 1 2	2003	ļ
Produced	Date	Tested	Produc		BL	MCF	BBL		orr. API			vity			FARMI	H NUI EN	LLU OFFICE	; ]
Choke Size	Thg. Press	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	O B	il BL	Gas MCF	Water BBL			rn.	We	11 Statu	S				inhumanere en e grant e	

										,			
28b. Produ	ction - Inter	val C								•			
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method				
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas : Oil Ratio	Well Status					
28c. Produ	ction - Inter	val D							<del></del>				
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Cort. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method				
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	ster Gas : Oil Well Status						
29. Disp	osition of G	as (Sold,	used for fuel	, vented,	etc.)		_						
30. Sumr	nary of Porc	us Zones	(Include Aqu	iifers):				31. Forma	ition (Log) Markers				
Show tests,	all importa	nt zones o	r porsity and	contents			and all drill-stem gand shut-in pressure		( 19, 1111111				
Form	ation	Тор	Bottom		Desc	criptions, Con	tents, etc.		Name	Top Meas. Depth			
								NACIAM	ENTO	860			
								OJO ALA	MO	2335			
								KIRTLAI	ND	2380			
								FRUITLA	AND	3185			
	İ								AND COAL	3300			
								İ					
				1				PICTURE	ECLIFFS	3610			
	ĺ		ĺ										
	İ												
32. Additi	onal remark	s (include	plugging pro	ocedure):									
This well	is a singl	e produ	cing from	the Bas	in Fruitlar	nd Coal. A	ttached is the we	ellbore schem	natic and daily summa	ries.			
33. Circle	enclosed att	achments	<del> </del>				•						
			gs (1 full set ing and ceme	•		Geological Re Core Analysis	-	eport 4. 1	Directional Survey				
34. I hereb	y certify tha	it the fores	going and att	ached inf	ormation is	complete and	correct as determine	ed from all avail	able records (see attached	instructions)*			
	(please pfin	DEBO	ORAH MA	ARBER	RY Nach	ell,		ULATORY A	ANALYST				
Signat	uie	טעע	-U W			X	Date <u>08/</u>	/20/2003					
Title 18 U States and	.S.C. Section false, fictiti	n 101 and ous or frac	Title 43 U.S dulent staten	.C. Section	on 1212, ma epresentation	ke it a crime I	for any person know latter within its juriso	ingly and willfu	lly to make to any departm	ent or agency of the United			

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A

Common Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT

**Event Name:** 

Start: 06/19/2003 Spud Date: 06/07/2003 End:

Original Completion KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 07/14/2003

07/15/2003 Group:

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
06/20/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	MV	С	70DMOB	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
1	07:30 - 10:00		MV	w	70DMOB	LOADING OUT EQUIPMENT ON FLOAT'S
1	10:00 - 14:00	4.00	MV	n	70DMOB	MOVING RIG & EQUIPMENT TO LOCATION
	14:00 - 18:30	4.50	MV	6	00MMIR	MIRU KEY RIG # 18 & EQUIPMENT
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	MV	1	00MMIR	SECURED LOCATION & S.D.O.N. = KEY TRUCKING HAD INCIDENT
		1				OF 3 RD LOCATION 32-8 # 50 M.V. = BACKED INTO GAS RISER &
		Ì				BENT RISER = HAD 200# GAS ON LINER = NO CRACK'S OR LEAK'S
					ļ	= HAD WILLIAM'S LOTO & BLOW DOWN LINER = NOTIFIED COPC &
06/21/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	MV		OOMMIR	WILLIAM'S PERSONNEL
00/21/2003	07:30 - 09:30		MV	6	00MMIR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION RU RIG FLOOR & GROUND LINE'S
	09:30 - 12:00		CM	e	50PRDR	NU BOP'S, HCR VALVE'S, CHOKE MANIFOLD & LINE'S
1	12:00 - 12:45		СМ	9	50PRDR	STATE INTEGRITY TEST ON 7" CSG = TEST BLIND RAM'S & 7" CSG
		00				= 200# 3 MIN'S & 665# 30 MIN'S = GOOD TEST CHARTED FOR
	İ					STATE
	12:45 - 14:00	1.25	СМ	8	50PRDR	TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR VALVE'S & CHOKE
			Ì			MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 30 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	14:00 - 16:30	2.50	СМ	С	50PRDR	COMPLETE INSPECTION OF RIG & SUPPORT EQUIPMENT =
						GOOD INSPECTION BY COPC SAFETY REP.
	16:30 - 17:45	l .	СМ	6	50PRDR	RU BLOOIE LINE'S & PAD'S
	17:45 - 18:45	1.00	СМ	2	50PRDR	PU PIPE OUT OF PIPE BASKET & PUT ON PIPE RACK = TALLY
	40:45 40:00	0.05		١,	500000	PIPE
06/22/2003	18:45 - 19:00 07:00 - 07:30		CM	1	50PRDR	SECURED LOCATION & S.D.O.N.
00/22/2003	07:30 - 10:00	,	CM CM	c 2	50PRDR 50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION GIH PU 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB, 16-3/12" DC'S, 1-2 7/8" DP, 1-FN W / 1.81
	07.30 - 10.00	2.50	Civi	-	JUFKUK	PROFILE, 2 7/8" DP TAG @ CMT @ 3225"
	10:00 - 10:30	0.50	СМ	6	50PRDR	PU & MU POWER SWIVEL
	10:30 - 11:00		СМ	5	50PRDR	CIRC & UNLOAD HOLE W / AIR ASSIST
	11:00 - 12:15		СМ	1	50PRDR	DRILLED OUT CMT, 7" FLOAT COLLAR @ 3234', DRILL OUT CMT &
			l			7" SHOE @ 3278', DRILL OUT OPEN HOLE TO 8 3/4" TD @ 3280'
	12:15 - 19:00	6.75	СМ	1	50PRDR	DRILL 6 1/4" HOLE F/3280'-T/3550' W / AIR ASSIST = HAD GAS
			ļ			SHOW OF 25 GAS UNIT'S OUT FROM UNDER 7" SHOE
	19:00 - 19:30	1	СМ	C	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 22:30		СМ	1	50PRDR	DRILL 6 1/4" HOLE F/3550' TO TD @ 3689' W / AIR ASSIST
	22:30 - 23:30	1.00	СМ	5	50PRDR	CIRC & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGER = FRUITLAND COAL
	Į.	-		Į	[	INTERVAL AS FOLLOW'S
						3280'-83' = 3 FT = 25 GAS UNIT'S
						3310'-11' = 1 FT = 75 GAS UNIT'S   3316'-18' = 2 FT = 75 GAS UNIT'S
				ĺ		3320'-23' = 3 FT = 120 GAS UNIT'S
			ļ	1		3330'-31' = 1 FT = 124 GAS UNIT'S
						3335'-38' = 3 FT = 111 GAS UNIT'S
		1		1	į	3342'-51' = 9 FT = 600 GAS UNIT'S
				ł		3425'-26' = 1 FT = 250 GAS UNIT'S
		1				3427'-28' = 1 FT = 250 GAS UNIT'S
				}		3431'-34' = 3 FT = 300 GAS UNIT'S
						3437'-57' = 20 FT = 605 GAS UNIT'S
						3501'-02' = 1 FT = 500 GAS UNIT'S
		1				3518'-31' = 13 FT = 537 GAS UNIT'S
						3532'-35' = 3 FT = 553 GAS UNIT'S
						3536'-38' = 2 FT = 553 GAS UNIT'S
						3543'-45' = 2 FT = 577 GAS UNIT'S
		1				3597'-3603' = 6 FT = 656 GAS UNIT'S
1		1	1	1	1	

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start: 06/19/2003 Spud Date: 06/07/2003 End: 07/15/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 07/14/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
06/22/2003	22:30 - 23:30	1.00	СМ	5	50PRDR	3615'-20' = 5 FT = 641 GAS UNIT'S 3622'-29' = 7 FT = 700 GAS UNIT'S 3631'-34' = 3 FT = 695 GAS UNIT'S TOTAL NET COAL 89 FT P.C. SPIKE @ 3675' = DID NOT HOLE BACK GROUND GAS
	23:30 - 02:30	3.00	СМ	1	50PRDR	R&R C/O T/3689' TD W / AIR ASSIST
	02:30 - 02:45	ţ	СМ	4	50PRDR	PUH TO 3620' TO GET OUT OF RAT HOLE
	02:45 - 06:00	3.25	СМ	1	50PRDR	R&R C/O F/3620' - T/3651' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
06/23/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3651' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50		1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3651' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	1	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3651' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
06/24/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3651' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:30	0.50 1.00	CM CM	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3651' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE
	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO TEST WELL
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00		u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE = 15 MIN'S-500 MCFD = 30 MIN'S-600 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-600 MCFD = 1 HR-600 MCFD
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00		t	80CMPL	SHUT IN TEST = ISIP-15# = 15 MIN'S-80# = 30 MIN'S-240# = 45 MIN'S-320# = 1 HR-380#
	11:00 - 17:00	6.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 1 & # 2 @ 400# NATURAL FORMATION GAS W / SURGE'S # 3 & # 4 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = BREAKOVER POINT @ 1100# = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
1	17:00 - 17:30	0.50		4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3438'
	17:30 - 19:00	1.50		1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3458' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 8 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50		С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT

Original Completion

Start: 06/19/2003 Spud Date: 06/07/2003 End:

Group:

**Event Name:** 

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release: 07/14/2003

07/15/2003

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Numbe	r:	18
-----------	----	----

Ng Name.	Portugues de la companyación de la companyación de la companyación de la companyación de la companyación de la			Logger, austron	19587764.00084.000-r00	rug rumbon. To
Date	From - To			Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
06/24/2003	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	CM	1	80CMPL	CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
06/25/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O TO 3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL &
				•		FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
						SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50		C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:30	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
					]	FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT
						COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 3 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S
	00.00 00.00	0.50	CN	4	80CMPL	PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG & RU TO SURGE WELL
	08:30 - 09:00 09:00 - 16:00	7.00		1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 5 - # 6 -# 7 & # 8 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD
	09:00 - 16:00	7.00	CIVI	'	BOCIVIFE	AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER
	1					PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
	16:00 - 18:30	2.50	СМ	z	80CMPL	C/O AIR BOOSTER & WELD ON SECONDARY BLOOIE LINER 70
	10.00		0	-	_	DEGREE TEE
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3435'
	19:00 - 19:30	3	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
	ļ			ļ		FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE HEAVY TO MED
				1		COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S
				İ		PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
06/26/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER
		<u> </u>		ļ		& INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W /
	1			<b>i</b>		NO WATER GAIN = 3 TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE
						CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30		CM	C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
1	07:30 - 12:30	5.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
	İ					FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S
						PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	12:30 - 13:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL
	13:00 - 19:00	1	CM	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 9 - # 10 - # 11 - # 12 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD
İ	10.00	0.00		1	000 2	AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 3 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER
						PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 20:00		СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3430'
	20:00 - 06:00	10.00		1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3480' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL &
	1					FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
						SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
06/27/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3480' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL &
			1			FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
						SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	Į.	CM	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3580' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
	,	1				FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL &
						FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S PER
	10:00 10:20	0.50	CM		80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	1	CM CM	C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION  R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	CIVI	'	OUCIVIPL	& INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL &
						A INTIDITOR - RETURNS TO SURFACE, FIENVE TO WED COAL &
		<u></u>	<u> </u>			

Printed: 07/23/2003 11:03:51 AM

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT

Event Name:

 SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT
 Spud Date: 06/07/2003

 Original Completion
 Start: 06/19/2003
 End: 07/15/2003

Contractor Name: KEY FOUR CORNERS Rig Release: 07/14/2003 Group:

Rig Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Number: 18

Date :	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
06/27/2003	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER
06/28/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1 100	СМ	1	80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
00/20/2003	00.00 - 07.00	1.00	Civi	] '	BOCIMIFE	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO
						LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 2
						BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5%
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CM	С	80CMPL	SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 10:00	1	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 1
			1			GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT
						COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 2 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S
	10:00 - 10:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL
ĺ	10:30 - 17:00		СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 13 - # 14 - # 15 - # 16 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5
	ļ					MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL
				1		WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	MED COAL & FINE'S RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3320'
	17:30 - 19:00		СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3380' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL &
						FINE'S W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
•	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	1	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3480' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL &
						FINE'S W / 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
06/29/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE R&R C/O T/3480' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL &
				i		FINE'S W / 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CM	c	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	1	1	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3560' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED
						COAL & FINE'S W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 6
						BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED
						COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 8 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
06/30/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL &
						FINE'S W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CM	С	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 09:00	1.50		1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3635' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL
						FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL &
						FINE'S W / 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER
	09:00 - 09:30	0.50	CM	4	80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO TEST WELL
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00		u .	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE = 15 MIN'S-1644 MCFD =
						- 10 Milit 0-1044 MOFD -
L	L		L	L		

Printed: 07/23/2003 11:03:51 AM

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT

**Event Name:** 

**Original Completion** 

Start: 06/19/2003 Spud Date: 06/07/2003 End: 07/15/2003

Contractor Name:

**KEY FOUR CORNERS** 

Rig Release: 07/14/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
06/30/2003	09:30 - 10:30 10:30 - 11:30		CM CM	u t	80CMPL 80CMPL	30 MIN'S-1808 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-1865 MCFD = 1 HR-1865 MCFD SHUT IN TEST = ISIP-70# = 15 MIN'S-225# = 30 MIN'S-360# = 45 MIN'S-420# = 1 HR-470# *
	11:30 - 18:00	6.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 17 - # 18 - # 19 - # 20 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO HEAVY COAL & FINE'S
	18:00 - 18:30 18:30 - 19:00	0.50 0.50	1	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3320' R&R C/O T/3335' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 9 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O F/3320' - T/3400' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
07/01/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3400' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3485' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL & FINE'S W / 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 8 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3542' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
07/02/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3542 W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3574' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3604' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR ASSIST, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & 15% SHALE
07/03/2003	06:00 - 07:00		CE	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3572'- 3604' W/1800CM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD- LT COAL CHIPS & MOD COAL FINES. 2 1/2BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SHALE.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CE	С	80CMPL	CREW CHANGE. SAFETY MEETING.

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT

**Event Name:** 

**Original Completion** 

Start: 06/19/2003 Spud Date: 06/07/2003 07/15/2003

Contractor Name:

**KEY FOUR CORNERS** 

Rig Release: 07/14/2003

End: Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/03/2003	07:30 - 15:00	7.50	CE	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3572'- 3604' W/1800CFM AIR- ASSIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & MOD- LT COAL FINES. 2 1/2 DN TO 1/2BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE
	15:00 - 19:00	4.00	CE	1	80CMPL	CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SHALE. R&R CO COAL FR 3605'- 34' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 400PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & HVY COAL FINES. 4 DN TO 3BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 15% SHALE.
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	CE	c	80CMPL	CREW CHANGE. SAFETY MEETING.
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	1	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3605'- 34' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 380PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & HVY- MOD COAL FINES. 3 DN TO 2 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SHALE.
07/04/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3605'- 3634' W/1800CFM AIR- MIST. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 380PSI. RETURNS OF MOD COAL CHIPS & MOD COAL FINES. 2 BKTS PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SHALE.
}	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	CREW CHANGE. SAFETY MEETING & RIG SERVICE.
	07:30 - 16:30	9.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL FR 3605'- 34' W/1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR. CIRCULATING PRESSURE- 380PSI. RETURNS OF LT COAL CHIPS & MOD- LT COAL FINES. 2 DN TO 1/2BKT PR/HR FR SAMPLE CATCHER. 95% COAL, 5% SHALE.
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	СМ	2	80CMPL	PULL UP INSIDE 7" CSG LAYING DN 7-JTS OF 2 7/8" DP.
	17:00 - 18:00	1.00	1	u	80CMPL	CONDUCT FLOW TEST THROUGH 2" W/PITOT GUAGE. INITIAL FLOW - 1.35MMCFD 15MIN FLOW - 1.64MMCFD 30MIN FLOW - 1.80MMCFD 45MIN FLOW - 1.80MMCFD 60MIN FLOW - 1.80MMCFD
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPL	SI FOR 60MIN BUILD UP INITIAL ISIP - 90PSI 15MIN SI - 240PSI 30MIN SI - 320PSI 45MIN SI - 380PSI 60MIN SI - 410PSI
07/08/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS-SICP 580 PSIG- BLEED WELL DOWN TO PIT.
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	GIH W/ 6-1/4" DRLG ASSEMBLY F/ 7" CASING @ 3278' & TAG BRIDGE @ 3430'KB.
	08:00 - 06:00	22.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R CO COAL F/3430 - T/3510' W /1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR @ 380 PSIG. RETURNS: 2 DN TO 1/2 BUCKET /HR PRIOR TO EACH
07/09/2003	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	CONNECTION OF VERY FINE COAL ~98% COAL & ~2% SHALE. SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS R&R CO COAL F/3500 - T/3542'- W /1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST W/1GAL FOAMER+INHIBITOR @ 500 PSIG. RETURNS: 2 UP TO 4 BUCKET (S) /HR PRIOR TO EACH CONNECTION OF VERY FINE COAL (FRAC SAND SIZE) ~98% COAL & ~2% SHALE. TIGHT SHALE SPOT FROM 3500-3510'KB.

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A

Common Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT

**Event Name:** 

**Original Completion** 

06/19/2003 Start:

Spud Date: 06/07/2003 End:

Group:

Rig Release: 07/14/2003

07/15/2003

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS **KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Number: 18

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subce	Phase	Description of Operations
07/10/2003	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING PRIOR TO STARTING OPERATIONS- REVIEW & APPLY FOREST SERVICE LEVEL "3" RESTRICTIONS- R&R CO COAL F/3542 - T/3634'- W /1800CFM AIR, 10BPH MIST CONTAINING 2 GAL FOAMER, W/ 1+ GALS OF POLYMER, & INHIBITOR @ 800-1000 PSIG. RETURNS: 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET (S) /HR PRIOR TO EACH CONNECTION OF FINE COAL (8/12 MESH FRAC SAND SIZE) ~98% COAL & ~2% SHALE. TIGHT SPOT SHALE INTERVAL F/3504-T/3510'KB.
07/11/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	RUNNING COAL F/3518-T/3531'.  R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE TO 3642' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH  MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR =  RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1/2  BPH WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 7 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF  SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	ı	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION  R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3642' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH  MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR =  RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / 1/2 BPH WATER  GAIN = 7 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE  CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50		1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3689' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 1/2 BPH WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
07/12/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3689' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER, 1 GAL POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:00	0.50 0.50	1	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3689' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50		4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA
	08:30 - 10:30 10:30 - 11:00	2.00 0.50	_	g 4	80CMPL 80CMPL	FLOW WELL OUT BLOOIE LINE'S TO CHECK HOLE CONDITION'S
	11:00 - 19:00	8.00	1	1	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG TIGHT SPOT @ 3455'  R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3603' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH  MIST, 2 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE,  MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 7 DOWN TO 3  BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10%  SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 03:00	0.50 7.50		C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3689' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	03:00 - 03:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA

Printed: 07/23/2003 11:03:51 AM

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT Spud Date: 06/07/2003 Event Name: Original Completion Start: 06/19/2003 End: 07/15/2003

Contractor Name: KEY FOUR CORNERS Rig Release: 07/14/2003 Group:

Rig Name: KEY ENERGY Rig Number: 18

itig ivanie.	<b>155</b> 8(5).451.757.5685.446			<b>L</b> ambus cos	Maria di Parti da da	rug rumber. To
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/12/2003	03:30 - 04:00	0.50	СМ	6	80CMPL	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL & RU TO COOH W / PIPE
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	CM	4	80CMPL	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA
07/13/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1	СМ	6	80CMPL	RU 5 1/2" RAM'S & EQUIPMENT
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	1	C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 07:45	0.25		8	80CMPL	TEST 5 1/2" RAM'S TO WELLBORE PRESSURE 450# FOR 15 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	07:45 - 08:15	0.50		u	80CMPL	LAST FLOW TEST = 2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT, TUBE (√₹) 3200 MCFD ←
	08:15 - 09:30	1.25	СМ	2	80CMPL	GIH PU 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB, 10 JT'S OF 5 1/2" 15.50# J-55 LT&C CSG W / BAKER 7" X 5 1/2" SLP-R LINER HANGER W / STEEL SLEEVE
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00		4	80CMPL	RIH W / LINER & DP TAG TIGHT SPOT @ 3380'
	10:30 - 10:45	0.25		6	80CMPL	PU POWER SWIVEL
	10:45 - 11:45	1.00		1	80CMPL	WORKING LINER DOWN THROUGH TIGHT SPOT TO TD @ 3689' W / AIR ASSIST
	11:45 - 12:15	0.50	СМ	Z	80CMPL	PICK UP BIT 1 FT OFF BOTTOM & SET BAKER SLP-R LINER HANGER = RELEASED OFF HANGER = 5.1/2" LINER SET AS FOLLOW'S = 6.1/4" BIT SET @ 3688'.00" = 5.1/2" BIT SUB SET @ 3687'.35" = 10 UT'S OF 5.1/2" 15.50# J-55 LT&C CSG SET @ 3685'.90" = BOTTOM OF BAKER 7" X 5.1/2" SLP-R LINER HANGER SET @ 3234'.70" = TOP OF LINER HANGER SET @ 3230'.62" = OVERLAP
						OF 7" CSG SHOE 47'.38"
	12:15 - 12:30	0.25		6	80CMPL	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
	12:30 - 15:30	3.00		2	80CMPL	COOH LAYING DOWN DP, DC'S & SETTING TOOL
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50		C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	16:00 - 16:15	0.25		6	80CMPL	RU BLUE JET PERFORATING EQUIPMENT
	16:15 - 16:30	0.25		8	80CMPL	TEST LUBICATOR TO WELLBORE PRESSURE OF 450# = GOOD TEST
	16:30 - 18:00	1.50	СМ	q	80CMPL	RIH & PERFORATED 5 1/2" LINER W 63 1/8" CSG GUNS, 0.75" DIA HOLE'S, 4 SPF, 90 DEGREE PHASING, 60 FT & 240 HOLE'S AS FOLLOW'S 3632'-34' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3623'-28' = 5 FT = 20 HOLE'S 3615'-17' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3597'-3602' = 5 FT = 20 HOLE'S 3537'-3602' = 5 FT = 20 HOLE'S 3533'-39' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3533'-39' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3529'-31' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3529'-31' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3524'-28' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S 3518'-22' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S 3445'-50' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S 3438'-44' = 6 FT = 24 HOLE'S 3425'-27' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3342'-34' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3342'-44' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3342'-44' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3342'-44' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3342'-44' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3316'-18' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S 3316'-18' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S TOTAL OF 60 FT & 240 HOLE'S
	18:00 - 18:30 18:30 - 19:00		CM CM	6	80CMPL 80CMPL	RD BLUE JET PERFORATING EQUIPMENT SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
			<u> </u>			District Officerons of the Control

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000231A

Common Well Name:

SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #231A UNIT

**Event Name:** 

**Original Completion** 

Start: 06/19/2003 Spud Date: 06/07/2003

KEY FOUR CORNERS Contractor Name:

Rig Release: 07/14/2003

End: Group:

07/15/2003

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/14/2003	07:00 - 07:30		СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:30	1	CM	6	80CMPL	RU 2 3/8" RAM'S & EQUIPMENT
	08:30 - 09:00	1	СМ	g	80CMPL	BLOW DOWN WELL HAD 540# ON CSG
	09:00 - 09:30	1	СМ	8	80CMPL	TEST 2 3/8" RAM'S = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	09:30 - 11:30		СМ	2	80CMPL	GIH PU BHA & 2 3/8" PRODUCTION TUBING TAG FILL IN LINER @ 3683'.65" = PBTD @ 3686'
	11:30 - 11:45	0.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	LAND HANGER W / 8P PLUG IN FN & BPV IN HANGER = 2 3/8" PRODUCTION TUBING SET AS FOLLOW'S
				ı		2 3/8" ORANGED PEELED BOTTOM JT. TUBING SET @ 3679; 13" 2 3/8" 4 FT PERF SUB SET @ 3650'.13"
		]				2 3/8" FN W / 1.78 PROFILE SET @ 3646'.13"
		1	]			2 3/8" 115 JT'S TUBING SET @ 3645'.28"
		1				2 3/8" SUB'S UNDER TOP JT OF TUBING 1-10', 1-8', 1-4'
						2 3/8" TOP JT TUBING
					,	TOTAL OF 116 JT'S OF 2 3/8" J-55 4.7# TUBING IN WELL PLUS BHA
		1	}			= TOTAL OF 117 JT'S COUNTING 2 3/8" MUD ANCHOR
	11:45 - 12:45		СМ	е	80CMPL	ND BOP'S & NU B-1 ADAPTER & VALVE
	12:45 - 13:00		СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	13:00 - 13:15	1	СМ	9	80CMPL	TEST 2 3/8" TUBING TO 1000# FOR 15 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	13:15 - 13:30	1	СМ	6	80CMPL	RU B&R WIRELINE EQUIPMENT
	13:30 - 14:00	1	CM	k	80CMPL	PULLING BP PLUG OUT OF FN @ 3645'
	14:00 - 14:15	i	CM	6	80CMPL	RD B&R WIRELINE EQUIPMENT
	14:15 - 15:00	ľ	CM	6	80CMPL	RU 3/4" ROD EQUIPMENT & SPOTTING ROD FLOAT
	15:00 - 15:15 15:15 - 17:15		CM CM	C I	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	15.15 - 17.15	2.00	CM	1	BUCMPL	GIH PU H.F. ROD PUMP TOP HOLD DOWN 2" X 1 1/4" X 8' X 8'3" X 12'3" RHAC-Z = PUMP NO CPO14 = 4'-3/4" PONY ON TOP OF PUMP
		1				= 145-3/4" PLAIN ROD'S = 1 1/4" POLISH ROD 22'
	17:15 - 18:00	1	СМ	n	80CMPL	SPACE OUT & HANG OFF POLISH ROD
07/45/0000	18:00 - 18:30	,	CM	1	80CMPL	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N.
07/15/2003	07:00 - 07:30	I .	CM	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:00	1	CM	9	80CMPL	BLOW DOWN WELL = HAD 510# ON CSG
	08:00 - 09:00	1.00	СМ	9	80CMPL	LOAD & TEST TUBING TO 500# FOR 15 MIN'S = GOOD TEST =
Į				1		BLED OFF PRESSURE = STROKED PUMP W/RIG BLOCK'S &
				ŧ		PUMPED UP TO 500# = HELD 15 MIN'S = GOOD TEST & PUMP ACTION
	09:00 - 14:30	5 50	MV	6	70DMOB	RD RIG & EQUIPMENT
	14:30 - 15:00		MV	1	70DMOB	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = RELEASED RIG & EQUIPMENT
	14.00	0.00	"""	•	1 OBWIOD	ON 07/14/2003 @ 15:00 PM = JOB COMPLETE - DROP FROM
		1				REPORT = RELEASED WELL TO PRODUCTION DEPT.
						THE ON - NELEAGED WELL TO PRODUCTION DEPT.
					•	
					1	
					l	
ļ						
					Ì	
				1		
				1		
				1		
				i		
		]				
			1	1		

#### END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

## ConocoPhillips

Well Name: San Juan 32-8 # 231A			Spud:	7-Jun-03
<b>API #</b> : 30-045-31628			TD 8-3/4" Hole:	10-Jun-03
	Note - this well is equip		Release Drl Rig:	11-Jun-03
·			Move in Cav. Rig_	19-Jun-03
	11" 3M x 7 1/16"	•	TD 6-1/4" Hole:	21-Jun-03
	9-5/8" 8 RD x 11"	THE Casing Head	Release Cav. Rig:	14-Jul-03
	X New Used Used	Lead : <u>135</u> + 2% S00' + 0.25 lb/s 1.16 cuft/s  Bur Fina	ate cmt'd: 8- sx Class G Cement 1 Calcium Chloride ix D029 Cellophane Fl ix, 156.6 cuft slurry at isplacement: 15.5 bl inped Plug at: 06:0 al Circ Press: 60ps is during job:	15.8 ppg bls fresh wtr 00 w/ 300 psi
on <u>06-Jun-03</u>			Floats Held: No	floats used
Notified NMOCD @ 18:15 hrs		W.O.C. for _	5.5 hrs (plug bump t	o drig cmt)
on <u>06-Jun-03</u>		Intermediate		-Jun-03
Intermediate Casing Date set: 11-Jun-03	X New	Lead : 415	sx Class G Cement	
Size <u>7</u> in <u>79</u> jts	Used	111 1 —	9 Extender	
Set at 3278 ftpups			x D029 Cellophane Fl	akes
Wt. <u>20</u> ppf Grade <u>J-55</u> Hole Size 8 3/4 in	h		946 Antifoam /sx D047 Antifoam	
Wash Out 150 % Csg Shoe 32	78 ft	,,, ,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	k, 1083 cuft slurry at 1	1.7 ppg
Est. T.O.C. SURFACE TD of 8-3/4" Hole 32		<del>                                </del>	sx 50/50 POZ : Class	
			0 Bentonite	
Notified BLM @ 15:52 hrs on 09-Jun-0	)3	+ 2% S00	1 Calcium Chloride	
Notified NMOCD @ 15:52 hrs on 09-Jun-t	<u>)3                                    </u>	+ 5 lb/sx E	0024 Gilsonite	
	/ 1		x D029 Cellophane Fl	akes
Production Lines Data set: 12 Jul 02	XNew	111 I \ <del></del>	046 Antifoam	25
Production Liner Date set: 12-Jul-03 Size 5 1/2 in Connections: LTC	Used	111 I \ ——	ix, 127 cuft slurry at 13 Displacement: 131 b	
Blank Wt. 15.5 ppf	□0363 \	111 1 1	mped Plug at: 01:30 i	
Grade J-55 Final Circ Press:				
# Jnts: 10 Returns during job:				YES
Hole Size 6 1/4 in	(	CMT Return	ns to surface:	31 bbls
Btm of Liner 3688 ft	)	Ш	Floats Held: X Yes	No
Top of Liner 3230 ft PBTD / Top of Bit :	Sub 3686			
Bottom of Liner / Bottom of 6-1/4"	Bit: 3688			
		UNCEMENT	ED LINER	
	TD	3,689 ft		
COMMENTS:				
Surface: No float equipment was run. Ran a guide sh				
Displaced top wiper plug with water. Shut in	casing head with 160 p	osi and WOC 2.5 hrs before ba	acking out landing jt.	
Intermediate:			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
Production: 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB & FLOAT RUN ON BO	TOM JOINT OF LINED	}		<del></del>
Perforated 5-1/2" liner. Ran 2-3/8", 4.7#, J-5			and rods	
	, toomy (EO	sor o ranoj. Rum pump a		
CENTRALIZERS:				
Surface: CENTRALIZERS @ 209', 160', 131', & 43.			Total	:4
Intermediate: CENTRALIZERS @ 3268', 3193', 3110', 302	28', 2946' 2863' & 200'	**************************************	Total	: 7
TURBOLIZERS @ 2344', 2230', 2262'			Total	