Submit 1 Copy To Appropriate District Office	State of New Mexico	Form C-103
District 1 - (575) 393-6161	Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources	Revised August 1, 2011
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 <u>District II</u> - (575) 748-1283	* .	WELL API NO. 30-059-20526
811 S. First St., Artesia, NM 88210	OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION	5. Indicate Type of Lease
<u>District III</u> - (505) 334-6178 1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410	1220 South St. Francis Dr.	STATE FEE
District IV - (505) 476-3460	Santa Fe, NM 87505	6. State Oil & Gas Lease No.
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505		
	AND REPORTS ON WELLS	7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION"	TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A ON FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH	Beard Dome 2232
PROPOSALS.)		8. Well Number 22
1. Type of Well: Oil Well Gas 2. Name of Operator	Well Other CO 2	9. OGRID Number
Oxy U.S	ATNC.	16696
3. Address of Operator		10. Pool name or Wildcat
1. Well Location 2	, Houston 11.77210	Bravo Deme 640
/ *	on feet from the North line and	1714 feet from the EAST line
Section 33	Township 22 N Range 32 E	NMPM County NION
11.	Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, et	(C.)
	4841.0	
12 Check Appr	opriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice	Papart or Other Data
12. Check Appl	•	
NOTICE OF INTEN		BSEQUENT REPORT OF:
TT	UG AND ABANDON REMEDIAL WC	
	ANGE PLANS COMMENCE D	RILLING OPNS X PAND A
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE	STORY OF THE	y
		F-7
OTHER:	OTHER:	and give pertinent dates, including estimated date
	SEE RULE 19.15.7.14 NMAC. For Multiple C	
proposed completion or recomple	etion.	·
8-2-11- Wait on daylight rig to new locati	to move	Prilling 77/8" And hole 1 Circ + make 2 wiper trips;
Cia la neul sont	TO DIVINOST-331G 8-4-1	1 Circ + make 2 wiper trips
They to them the art	ori Blut west solitor	ToH for logs; was; then casing
8-3-11 W/o daylight;	move ria up; Soud	wash bridge
@ 16.30 TD (jurface; Circ; TOH 87-11	
0.00, 100	10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 1	landed casma @ 227a' Comant
84-11 TD Surface, Circ Casing, Cement BOD THE WIRIT	Li TOH; Run Surface.	Landed Casing @ 2279', Cement As brief, 47 Rous + 115.7 SKS to
casing; cement	WOC; MU BOP; TEST	
Ser I Little Act DELL &	2; TEST CASING; Drill	rig about landing JT, NID BOP
Out		rig down landing IT, N/D BOP installed well head, reliased rig
Spud Date:	Rig Release Date:	R 30
813111	Kilg Kerelius Bullet	<i>(1111)</i>
<u></u>	:	See Attach
I hereby certify that the information above	is true and complete to the best of my knowled	lge and belief.
SIGNATURE Z. FOCK	ett TITLE Reg. anal	VS+ DATE 3/30/12
		1
Type or print name L. K. K. LOC		PHTAINING COMPHUNE: 1137210-11043
roi state use univ	Kett E-mail address: Kiki-lock	
APPROVED BY:	•	ERVISOR DATE 7/16/2012

APPROVED BY: Martino Conditions of Approval (if any):

OCCIDENTAL PERMIAN LTD

Operation Summary Report

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2033 062G

BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Site:

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Sec. Reason:

Dates of Event: 08/09/2011 - 08/13/2011

Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208

					Dates of Ev	ent: 08/0	09/2011 - 08/13/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208
.#	Date	Time Start-End	Hrs	Op Code	Op Sub	Op Type	Op Details
1	08/09/2011	05:00 - 07:30		LOCM		P	PJSM: RIG CREW, TRINIDAD TRUCKING, DOUBLE T, RAY'S, STALLION, DOUBLE H, RM, NIGHT DSM, DAY DSM: DISCUSSED OUR MOVE TO THE 2033_062G. ALSO STAYING HYDRATED. RIG WAS 100% OFF LOCATION BY 10:00
		07:30 - 12:30	5.00	OV	MOVE	Р	LOWER DERRICK AND DISCONNECT LINES FROM HPU. RIG 100% ON LOCATION 11:00 HOURS. DERRICK IN THE AIR @ 11:30 RIG SPOTTED 12:15 HOURS.
		·					RU OXY OFFICE, RU BACK YARD, GENERAL RU, MAINT & HOUSEKEEPING
e in the second							SAFETY BREAK: DISCUSSED WORKING TOGEATHER AS A TEAM AT ALL TIMES AND WATCHING OUT FOR ONE ANOTHER.
- S - 148 - 1		6 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 -					NOTIFIED ED MARTIN WITH THE NMOCD OF INTENT TO SPUD AND RUN CASING/CEMENT
		12:30 - 15:00	2.50	OV	RU	P	CONDUCTED PRE SPUD MEATING WITH RIG CREW AND TOOL PUSHER. LAST TRUCK LEFT 12:30 HRS. MIX SPUD MUD, STRAP & CALIPER BHA, MU DC & BIT
							PERFORMED PRE-SPUD INSPECTION AND ACCEPTED THE RIG @ 13:30 HOURS.
بآه		15:00 - 19:00	4.00	DRILL	ROTVER	Р	SPUDDED 12 1/4" HOLE @ 15:00 HOURS
,							DRILLED 12 1/4" HOLE FROM 0 TO 302'; ROP = 75.5' FPH
**	· ·					5	DROP SOAP STICK EVERY CONNECTION AND 1 SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD CONNECTION
	•						CIRCULATE THROUGH STEEL PITS
						,	WOB = 15 KLBS ROTARY = 120 RPM PUMP RATE = 340 GPM (60 SPM)
	·				·	-	PUMP PRESSURE = 755 PSI MW = 8.8, VIS = 42
		19:00 - 00:00	5.00	DRILL	ROTVER	Р	DRILLED 12 1/4" HOLE FROM 302' TO 605'; ROP = 61' FPH
							DROP SOAP STICK EVERY CONNECTION AND 1 SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD CONNECTION
							CIRCULATE THROUGH RESERVES
							WOB = 20 KLBS ROTARY = 130 RPM
							PUMP RATE = 340 GPM (60 SPM)
							PUMP PRESSURE = 880 PSI MW = 8.8, VIS = 42
.2	08/10/2011	00:00 - 03:30	3.50	DRILL	ROTVER	P	DRILLED 12 1/4" HOLE FROM 605' TO 800'; ROP = 56' FPH
							DROP SOAP STICK EVERY CONNECTION AND 1 SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD CONNECTION
							CIRCULATE THROUGH RESERVES
;							WOB = 20 KLBS ROTARY = 130 RPM
						*	PUMP RATE = 340 GPM (60 SPM) PUMP PRESSURE = 880 PSI MW = 9.1, VIS = 30
	,	03:30 - 04:00	0.50	CIRC	CNDHOL	Р	CIRCULATE CONDITION HOLE FOR CASING RUN
		04:00 - 07:00		TRIP	DRILL	P,	DROP TOTCO AND TOOH TO RUN 8.625" CASING
		07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CSG	RIGUP	P	PJSM WITH RIG CREW, RIG UP CRT, AND MAKE UP TX. PATTERN SHOE,

7/6/2012 2:05:58PM

OCCIDENTAL PERMIAN LTD.

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2033 062G

BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Site:

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Sec. Reason:

Dates of Event: 08/09/2011 - 08/13/2011

Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208

							09/2011 - 08/13/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208
#	Date	Time Start-End	Hrs	Op Code	Op Sub	Op Type	Op Details
Ĩ		07:30 - 09:30	2.00	CSG	RUNCSG	P	RUN 18 JTS. 8 5/8", 24#, J-55, ST & C, SURFACE CASING:
					Ī		1 - 8 5/8" TEXAS PATTERN SHOE 1 - SHOE JOINT 1 - INSERT FLOAT 17- JOINTS
		09:30 - 10:00	0.50	CIRC	CNDHOL	Р	PJSM WITH HALLIBURTON AND RIG CREW. RIG CMT HEAD AND CIRCULATE 2X BOTTOMS UP
-34		10:00 - 11:00		СМТ	PRIM	Р	PUMP A 20 BBL FRESH WATER SPACER - PUMP RATE = 5 BBL/MIN
							PUMPED 120.2 BBLS (500 SACKS) OF 14.8 PPG PREMIUM PLUS CEMENT - 2% CaCl2 - 0.25 lbm/sk Poly-E-Flake - YIELD: 1.35 CUFT/SACK - PUMP RATE = 7 BBL/MIN - PRESSURE = 200 PSI
							DISPLACED WITH 47 BBLS OF FRESH WATER - PUMP RATE = 6 BBL/MIN - PRESSURE = 240 PSI - FINAL @ 2BPM = 240 PSI
							DID NOT BUMP PLUG. GOT BACK 1 BBL TO TRUCK FLOATS HELD. FULL RETURNS THROUGHOUT JOB
-,		11:00 - 15:00	4.00	СМТ	RIGUP	P	GOT BACK 60 BBL (249.5 SKS) TO SURFACE. HELD PJSM AND RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON. WOC, JET CELLAR, CLEAN PITS. MUD UP PREMIX FOR VISCOUS SWEEPS AFTER DRILLING OUR
-		15:00 - 16:00	1.00	WLHD	RWH	P	FLOAT COLLAR. LD LANDING JT. INSTALL WELL HEAD.
		16:00 - 17:30		BOP	RUBOP	P	NU BOPE, STRAP & CALIPER BHA #2.
		17:30 - 18:00		BOP	TSTBOP	P	PU 5.5" CASING LANDING JT, MU TEST PLUG. TEST BOPE TO 250 PSI LO 1000 PSI HIGH FOR 5 MINS.
		18:00 - 20:00	2.00	TRIP	PULD	Р	TIH W/7.875 BHA TO TOC @ 732'
		20:00 - 20:30		CSG	PIPE	Р	DRILL TO FLOAT AND PRESSURE TEST CASING TO 1000 PSI FOR 30 MINUTES. TEST GOOD. DRILL OUT FLOAT AND CEMENT
		20:30 - 00:00	3.50	DRILL	ROTVER	P	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 800' TO 1063' AVG 75' FPH 75 RPM, 30K WOB, 340 GPM, 1140 PUMP PRESS. CIRC OUTER RESERVE, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS. MW 8.7 PPG
							SAFETY BREAK: DISCUSSED MIXING MUD AND CHEMICALS; INCLIMENT WEATHER
3	08/11/2011	00:00 - 04:00	4.00	DRILL	ROTVER	Р	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 1063' TO 1366' AVG 76' FPH 75 RPM, 30K WOB, 340 GPM, 985 PUMP PRESS.
							SURVEY @ 1299 = 1.0 CIRC STEEL PITS, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS. MW 8. 7 PPG, VIS 43
		04:00 - 08:00	4.00	DRILL	ROTVER	Р	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 1366' TO 1692', CUT 326', AVG 82 FPH 75 RPM, 30K WOB, 340 GPM, 985 PUMP PRESS. CIRC STEEL PITS, SWITCH TO RESERVE AT 1600', BEGIN PIT CLEAN OUT, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE
j	l l						SWEEPS.

OCCIDENTAL PERMIAN LTD.

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2033 062G

Project: BRAVO DOME BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Sec. Reason:

Dates of Event: 08/09/2011 - 08/13/2011

Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208

#	Date:	Time Start-End	Hrs	Op Code	Op Sub	Op Type	Op Details
		08:00 - 12:00	4.00	DRILL	ROTVER	Р	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 1692' TO 1841', CUT 149', AVG 38 FPH 75 RPM, 38K WOB, 340 GPM, 1050 PUMP PRESS.
							CÎRC RESERVE, FINÎSH PIT CLEAN OUT, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY.
							DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS. MW 8. 9 PPG, VIS 32 SURVEY 2 DEG AT 1791'
							SAFETY BREAK: REVIEW GENERAL SAFETY GUIDELINES, MEET &
P AND		12:00 16:00	4.00	DDILL	DOT/FD		GREET, MUD SPILLS.
	·	12:00 - 16:00	4.00	DRILL	ROTVER	P	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 1841' TO 2016', CUT 175', AVG 44 FPH 75 RPM, 38K WOB, 340 GPM, 1050 PUMP PRESS. CIRC STEEL PITS, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS. MW 8. 9 PPG, VIS 32 SURVEY 2 DEG AT 1791' SAFETY BREAK: JSA MIXING CHEMICALS, KUDOS ON HOUSEKEEPING.
		46.00 47.00	4.00	DŘILL	DOT/ED		MUD SPILLS
-		16:00 - 17:00	1.00	DRILL	ROTVER	P	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 2016' TO 2064', CUT 48', AVG 48 FPH 75 RPM, 38K WOB, 340 GPM, 1050 PUMP PRESS. CIRC STEEL PITS, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE
					. •,		SWEEPS. MW 8. 9 PPG, VIS 32 SURVEY 2 DEG AT 1791'
		17:00 - 17:30	0.50	RIGM T	SRVRIG	Р	SERVICE RIG, GO THRU PUMP VALVES
		17:30 - 21:30	4.00	DRILL	ROTVER	Р	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 2064' TO 2302 ', CUT 238 ', AVG 59' FPH 75 RPM, 38K WOB, 340 GPM, 1050 PUMP PRESS. CIRC STEEL PITS, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE
							SWEEPS. MW 9.0 PPG, VIS 40.
					*		SAFETY BREAK: JSA DRILLING, MAKING CONNECTIONS, HAND PLACEMENT.
		21:30 - 00:00	2.50	DRILL	ROTVER	Р	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 2302' TO 2360', CUT 58', AVG 24 FPH 75 RPM, 38K WOB, 340 GPM, 1150 PUMP PRESS. CIRC STEEL PITS, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS.
	•						MW 9.2 PPG, VIS 42 SURVEY 0.25 DEG AT 2276' CIMARRON TOP - 2353'
4	08/12/2011	00:00 - 04:00	4.00	DRILL	ROTVER	Р	SAFETY BREAK: JSA_TRIPPING PIPE, MIXING CHEMICALS, DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 2360' TO 2551', CUT 191', AVG 48' FPH
				_		1 ' ' '	75 RPM, 38K WOB, 340 GPM, 1150 PUMP PRESS. CIRC STEEL PITS, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS. MW 9.4 PPG, VIS 42
							TUB TOP @ 2372'
		04:00 - 05:00	1.00	DRILL	ROTVER	P	DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTION HOLE F 2551' TO 2592', CUT 41', AVG 48' FPH 75 RPM, 38K WOB, 340 GPM, 1150 PUMP PRESS. CIRC STEEL PITS, PUMP HI VIS SWEEP EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY. DROP SWEEP STICKS EVERY 3RD JT ON CONNECTIONS BEFORE
		_					SWEEPS. MW 9.4 PPG, VIS 42

OCCIDENTAL PERMIAN LTD.

Operation Summary Report

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2033 062G

BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Project: BRAVO DOME

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Sec. Reason:

Dates of Event: 08/09/2011 - 08/13/2011

Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208

#	Date	Time Start-End	Hrs	Op Code	Op Sub	Op	Op Details
.1 .	F 8/21	05:00 - 06:00		CIRC	CNDHOL	Type	CIRCULATE TO CLEAN HOLE AND CONDITION MUD
- 7		06:00 - 10:30		TRIP	WIPER	P	WIPER TRIP. BACK REAM & PUMP OUT ALL THE WAY TO SHOE, HOLE
,							UNLOADING UNUSUAL LARGE AMTS OF CUTTINGS. HOLE PULLED
				3			TIGHT & PUMP PRESSURE FLUCTUATED. TIH WITH NO PROBS OR DRAG. BUILD 50 BBL HI VIS SWEEP.
		10:30 - 12:00		CIRC	CNDHOL	P	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN PUMP 50 BBL HI VIS SWEEP. HOLE CONT TO
							UNLOAD CUTTINGS. HOLE CLEAN AFTER 2X BU. SAFETY BREAK: WORKING HARD, SIMOP WORKING SMART.
		12:00 - 14:30	2.50	TRIP	DRILL	P	DROP TOTCO, TOH LAYING DOWN DRILL STRING. HOLE PULLED EASY
			,	1			FROM BOTTOM TO TOP. HOLE TOOK PROPER FILL SURVEY 1.25 DEG AT 2590'
		14:30 - 15:30	1.00	LOG	RIGUP	Р	RU WEATHERFORD LOGGING.
							SAFETY BREAK: JSA LOGGING OPS, RIG CREW JSA WORKING ON PUMP.
		15:30 - 22:00	6.50	LOG	OHLOG	P	LOGS WENT TO BOTTOM W NO PROBS. LOGGERS DEPTH 2589
							LOG RUN #1 LATEROLOG / SPECTRAL GR
							LOG RUN #2
							DENSITY / NEUTRON / GR / CCL SIMOP: CHANGE SWABS ON PUMP, MISC PREP FOR RIG MOVE
		22:00 - 22:30	0.50	LOG	RIGUP	P	RD LOGGERS
							SAFETY BREAK: JSA RUNNING CASING, EMPHASIZED DROPPED CASING PRECAUTIONS
		22:30 - 23:00		CSG	RIGUP	Р	RU CRT, REMOVE ROTATING RUBBER
		23:00 - 00:00	1.00	CSG	RUNCSG	P	RUN 5.5", 15.5#, J-55, LTC PROD CASING
							SET DEPTH SET DEPTH GUIDE SHOE2585' INSERT FLOAT2572.7'
							SHOE JT2584' 61 JTS CASING2572'
5	08/13/2011	00:00 - 01:00	1.00	CSG	RUNCSG	Р	CONT RUN 5.5", 15.5#, J-55, LTC PROD CASING
		,					SET DEPTH SET DEPTH GUIDE SHOE2585' INSERT FLOAT2572.7'
				-	,		SHOE JT2584' 61 JTS CASING 2572'
		01:00 - 01:30	0.50	CIRC	CNDHOL	P	DROP BALL, CIRC & COND HOLE.
							SIMOP: RU HALLIBURTON SAFETY BREAK: JSA CEMENTING.
		01:30 - 02:00	0.50	CMT	RIGUP	Р	FINISH RU HALLIBURTON
		02:00 - 03:00	1.00	CMT	PRIM	Р	PUMPED CEMENT JOB AS FOLLOWS
							20 BBL FRESH WATER SPACER AT 5.5 BBL/MIN @ 150 PSI
							460 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL, LEAD CEMENT - 11.1 PPG
							- YIELD = 3.25 CU FT/SACK
							25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL
							- 13.2 PPG
							- YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK
		1					25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 61 BBLS OF FRESH WATER
							S.O. D.O. WITHOU BEG OF TREGIT WATER
							BUMPED PLUG @ 03:00 HRS WITH 1100 PSI RETURNED 155 SACKS (91 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD"
		03:00 - 06:00	3,00	CMT	RIĞUP	P	R/D HALIBURTON BEGIN RD RIG, CLEAN PITS, LOAD EXCESS CASING, LOAD MUD & CHEMICALS,
			•				RELEASE RIG 06:00 HRS, 8/13/11"
							RIG 100% OFF LOCATION 13:00 HRS
				١	,		NOTIFIED NMOCD OF COMPLETION BDU 2033-062G

7/6/2012

2:05:58PM

State of New Mexico 'Energy, Minerals & Natural Resources

Form C-104 Revised August 1, 2011

Submit one copy to appropriate District Office

1000 Rio Brazo	s Rd., Azte	ec, NM 8741	0			ation Divisio St. Francis D		***				-nn
<u>District IV</u> 1220 S. St. Fran	cis Dr., Sa	inta Fe, NM	87505	. 12		NM [*] 87505	Λ,				AMENDED RI	EPORT
	1.		JEST FO	OR ALI		E AND AU				RANSF	PORT	
1 Operator r	ame and	Address	044	USI	1 Inc	•	, 00	RID Nu	mber	66	96	
			P. Ø.	BOX	4294	40010	3 Re	ason for	Filing Coo	le/ Effect	ive Date	
⁴ API Numb			ool Name 2	2+0V	K I K	<u> </u>	′ 0	-	"Pos	Code		
30 - 0 59-	· 205,		2avol	onel	allon	L Diorid	e Gos L	040	<u> </u>	4	6010	
Property C	lode [[]	3	operty Nat	ne DMP	Capho	N Dioraio	le Gas	223	2 'Well	l Numbe	31	
		ocation		*					,			
Ul or lot no.	Section 23	Townshi	Range 32E	Lot Idn	Feet from t	he North/Sout	h Line Feet	from the		est line	UNIO	
11 Bo	ttom H	ole Locat		l	11 100	INURT		117	CA	3	SIVIO	<u> </u>
UL or lot no.	Section	Townshi		Lot Idn	Feet from t	he North/Sout	h line Feet	from the	East/W	est line	County	
12 Lse Code	il Produ	reing Method	lt Car C	onnection	15 C 120 D	1.31	1 16 0 170	3.00		12 6 12	9 Expiration D	
rze Dode		Code E	LI B	nto.	C-129 P	ermit Number	16 C-129 I	tiective	Date	C-12	9 Expiration D	are
III. Oil a		Transpo		2 11								
^{IR.} Transpor OGRID	ter					porter Name					20 O/G/W	-
11010	10	Ova	USA	INC		Address				\dashv		
$\frac{1}{2}$	\mathcal{L}	P.O.C	ov 3	03,)						
	201	HMIS	ted,	NN	88410	<i>,</i>		 		1940		
	Table 10						•			27450H	Section 200	
			•		•							
										1		
and the second second	CACA AN									7526,9879		CATACON CONTRACT
IV. Well 21 Spud Dat		etion Dat		1	Dan	T Massaur	. 1 3		 			
8/3/11		8/1		22	8 8 C	່ລິຊາ	$\boldsymbol{\mathcal{O}}$	Perforat	1		" DHC, MC	
Hol	e Size		28 Casing	& Tubin	g Size	29 De	pth Set		ــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــ	30 Sacks	Cement	
12	Y4		8	5/8	-	75	50			40	205V	
ا ر	7/2		~	V2		0.001	0.00	01		4	2006	
1	18		<u> </u>	ط		2100'	<i>อ</i> ลา	٦.		<u> </u>	USK	
					ľ							
											,	
V. Well T	est Dat	12	 		·							
31 Date New (Gas Deliv	ery Date	11 T	est Date	M Test	Length	³⁵ Tb	g. Pressui	·e ·	M Csg. Pressur	·e
	_ []	11181	11	111/2	28/11	2	4	-			177	
2.50	e)	, as Oi	O	.99	Water	83					1 Test Method	J
I hereby certif	y that the	rules of th	e Oil Conse	rvation D	ivision have			ONSERV	ATION D	IVISION	6 m	
en complied vimplete to the	vith and t best o⊈m	hat the info y knowledg	rmation giv se and belie	en above _. I	is true and			,	_		1	
gnature:	L .	Ala.	cho.	4		Approved by:	10	49		u)	· ·	
inted name:	1 1	1 · V ·	1001	10.11	•	Title:	Mig	TPÍN	TCI	IĎEĬ	SVICAE)
tle:	7 0 - 1	~ <u> </u>	1001	1271 L		Approval Date:	MIN	IIII	, 91		MARIAN	
mail Address:	reg.	<u>un</u>	alip	<u> </u>				16/	20/	<u> </u>		
	KK.	- loc	Kette	DOKY	4.cm			•				
al2	مداه	Pho	one:	3,5	41.413							.

State of New Mexico Five Copies July 17, 2008 Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources District I 1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 1. WELL API NO. District IL 1301 W. Grand Avenue, Artesia, NM 88210 30-059-20526 OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION District III 2. Type Of Lease 1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 1220 South St. Francis Dr. X STATE ☐ FEE ☐ FED/INDIAN District IV. Santa Fe, NM 87505 1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505 State Oil & Gas Lease No. L05851 WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 1. Reason for filing: 5. Lease Name of Unit Agreement Name Bravo Dome Carbon Dioxide Gas 2232 X COMPLETION REPORT (Fill in boxes #1 through #31 for State and Fee wells only) 6. Well Number C-144 CLOSURE ATTACHMENT (Fill in boxes #1 through #9, #15 Date Rig Released and #32 and/or #33; attach this and the plat to the C-144 closure report in accordance with 19.15.17.13.K NMAC) 331 Type of Completion

New Well workover Deepening Plugback Different reservoir other 3. Name of Operator 9. OGRID Number OXY USA Inc 16696 10. Address of Operator 11. Pool name or Wildcat P.O. Box 4294 Houston, TX 77210-4294 Bravo Dome Carbon Dioxide Gas 640 County Range Feet from the E/W Line 12. Location Unit Letter Section Township N/S Line Lot Feet from the Surface: UNION 22 N 32 E 1700 1714' вн: 17. Elevations (DF & RKB, 13. Date Spudded 14. Date T.D. Reached 15. Date Rig Released 16. Date Completed (Ready to Produce) RT, GR, etc.) 4891.0 GR 8/3/11 8/6/18 8/7/11 8/8/11 Total Measured Depth of Well 21. Type Electric and Other Logs Run 19. Plug Back Measured Depth 20. Was Directional Survey Made 2288 No GR/CCL 22. Producing Interval(s), of this completion - Top, Bottom, Name 2150-2180' - Tubb CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well) CASING SIZE WEIGHT LB./FT CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED DEPTH SET HOLE SIZE 8-5/8" 24# 750' 12-1/4" 400 SX N/A 5 - 1/25.4# 15.5# 7-7/8" 500 SX N/A 4900' 6-1/8" LINER RECORD TUBING RECORD SIZE TOP SACKS CEMENT PACKER SET **BOTTOM** SCREEN SIZE DEPTH SET 26. Perforation record (interval, size, and number) 27. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT, SQEEZE, ETC. DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND KIND MATERIAL USED 2150-2180' @ 4 SPF (164 Total Holes) 2150-2180' 7930g CO2 57TON frac w/167 sx snd **PRODUCTION** Date First Production Production Method (Flowing, gas lift, pumping - Size and type pump) Well Status (Prod. or Shut-in) 11/1/11 Flowing Prod Date of Test Hours Tested Choke Size Prod'n For Oil - Bbl. Gas - MCF Water - Bbl. Gas - Oil Ratio Test Period 11/11/11 24 1.38-orf 138 Flow Tubing Oil Gravity - API -(Corr.) Calculated 24-Water - Bbl. Casing Pressure Oil - Bbl. Gas - MCF Hour Rate ress. 99 0 138 29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) 30. Test Witnessed By Sold Automation 31. List Attachments C-104, Deviation Svy, Log (1 set) 32. If a temporary pit was used at the well, attach a plat with the location of the temporary pit. 33. If an on-site burial was used at the well, report the exact location of the on-site burial: Longitude I hereby certify that the information shown on both sides of this form is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief d. Lockett Signature Printed 3/19/12 KIKI LOCKETT Reg Analyst KIKI LOCKETT@OXY.COM^{Name} Title Date

INSTRUCTIONS

This form is to be filed with the appropriate District Office of the Division not later than 20 days after the completion of any newly-drilled or deepened well and not later than 60 days after completion of closure. When submitted as a completion report, this shall be accompanied by one copy of all electrical and radio-activity logs run on the well and a summary of all special tests conducted, including drill stem tests. All depths reported shall be measured depths. In the case of directionally drilled wells, true vertical depths shall also be reported. For multiple completions, items 11, 12 and 26-31 shall be reported for each zone.

INDICATE FORMATION TOPS IN CONFORMANCE WITH GEOGRAPHICAL SECTION OF STATE

Sout	heastern]	New Mexico	Northwestern	New Mexico
. Anhy		T. Canyon	T. Ojo Alamo	T. Penn "A"
. Salt		T. Strawn	T. Kirtland	T. Penn. "B"
. Salt		T. Atoka	T. Fruitland	T. Penn. "C"
. Yates		T. Miss	T. Pictured Cliffs	T. Penn. "D"
7 Rivers		T. Devonjan	T. Cliff House	T. Leadville
. Oueen		T. Silurian	T. Menefee	T. Madison
. Grayburg		T. Montoya	T. Point Lookout	T. Elbert
San Andres	1382	T. Simpson	T. Mancos	T. McCracken
. Glorieta	1634	T. McKee	T. Gallup	T. Ignacio Otzte
Paddock		T. Ellenburger	Base Greenhorn	T. Granite
Blinebry		T. Gr. Wash	T. Dakota	
Tubb	2145	T. Delaware Sand	T. Morrison	
Drinkard		T. Bone Springs	T. Todilto	
Abo		T. Santa Rosa 953	T. Entrada	
Wolfcamp		T. Yeso 1735	T. Wingate	
Penn		T. Cimarron 2127	T. Chinle	
Cisco (Bough C)		Т.	T. Permain	
				OIL OR GAS

		SANDS OR ZONES
No. 1, from		No. 3, fromto
No. 2, from	to	No. 4, from to

IMPORTANT WATER SANDS

nclude data on rate of water inflow and elevation to	o which water rose in hole.	
No. 1, fromto	feet	
No. 2, fromto	feet	
No. 3 fromto	feet	•

LITHOLOGY RECORD (Attach additional sheet if necessary)

			EITHOLOGI RECORD					
rom	То	Thickness in Feet	Lithology	From	То	Thickness in Feet	· Lithology	
	745	745	redbed]				
5	2302	1557	sandstone/shale					
		i		 				
		ľ						
	1			 .				
							,	
	} .			11				
					ļ		,	
	}		:					
				. .		,	•	
			1.				•	
•								
	<u> </u>			} }	ļ .	1		