OXÝ USA BRAVO DOME

Operation Summary Report

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2233 181J

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Date	Time Start-End 06:00 - 07:00 07:00 - 07:30	1.00 C L F	OW CORNER OF PIT. NO		Table 1	Name: TRINIDAD 208
	Start-End 06:00 - 07:00	1.00 C L F	ONT RD, CONT CLEANI OW CORNER OF PIT. NO			
/13/2011	06:00 - 07:00	L F	OW CORNER OF PIT. NO			2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2
	07:00 - 07:30			OTIFIED ALL CONC		TANK, RESERVE OVERFLOWED ON L WAS LESS THAN 50 BBLS TOTAL
	07.00 - 07.30	0.50 5	LUID.	AD DIO ODENITO	NISTA TSUGUNO SO	
			AG LINES, COMMUNICA			UBLE T TRUCKING. TAILBOARDS,
		N	OTIFIED NMOCD: COM	the state of the s	062G PLANS BDU 2233-181.	
	07:30 - 12:00	4.50 F	INISH RD ON BDU 2033-	····		
		F	RD COMPLETE AT 10:0 H	OURS: RIG 100%	OFF LOCATION 13:00 H	IRS
	12:00 - 17:30	c	ASING SURFACE TO TO	D BE 775'. BUILD S		IOURS. TALLY & DRIFT SURFACE
	17:30 - 21:30	C	IRC STEEL PITS TO 175			
			ROP SOAP STICKS EVE	RY CONNECTION 8	PUMP SWEEP AND S	WEEP STICK EVERY THIRD
	21:30 - 00:00					
		R	ESERVE, 75 RPM, 25K V	VOB, 435 GPM. 800	PSI PUMP PRES. MW 8	3.8 VIS 42
			SAFETY BREAK: JSA W	ORKING ON RIG EC	UIPMENT, PROPER PI	PE 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1
		D	ROP SOAP STICKS EVE	RY CONNECTION 8	PUMP SWEEP AND S	WEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
		\	MRE LINE SURVEY @ 4	00' INC 0.75		
	04:00 - 06:30				or and the first term of the f	The state of the s
	걸속됐단	Ď	ROP SOAP STICKS EVE	RY CONNECTION 8	R PUMP SWEEP AND S	WEEP STICK EVERY THIRD
	06:30 - 07:30	1.00 P	UMP HI VIS SWEEP, CIF	RC HOLE CLEAN FO	R CASING RUN, DRIP	тотсо
<u> </u>		S	URVEY: 775' .75 DEG			
	09:00 - 09:30		•		JT.	
	00:20 40:20				3. 45. 4	
	09:30 - 10:30		SETTING DE	PTH	DEPTH	
		s	HOE JT764'	LANDING JT		
		i S N	IMOP: HALLIBURTON S OTIFIED NMOCD, OF IN	POTTING & RU TENTION		
in factor	10:30 - 11:00	0.50 R	D CRT, CIRC HOLE	**************************************		<u>er na artiker naden sebi sebas basik 1925 er bilik d</u>
	11:00 12:00					TINGENCIES
	11.00 - 12.00	F	2% CACL ULL RETURNS THRU JO	.25 LI	BM POLY-E-FLAKE.	URFACE- BUMPED PLUG AT 12:00
	12:00 - 16:00	4.00 V	VAIT 4 HRS ON CEMENT	, CLEAN RIG, CLEA	N & GRADE BIT, STRAI	P & CALIPER BHA. BUILD SWEEP
	/14/2011	17:30 - 21:30 21:30 - 00:00 /14/2011	17:30 - 21:30	CASING SURFACE TD TO ACCEPTED RIG AT 17:30	CASING SURFACE TO TO BE 775' BUILD SI ACCEPTED RIG AT 17:30 HRS. SAFETY BREAK: JSA MIXING CHEMICALS, M DRILL 12.25' SURFACE HOLE FROM GL TO CIRC STEEL PITS TO 175', RET TO RESERVE 8 8 VIS 42	CASING SURFACE TD TO BE 775' BUILD SPUD MUD: ACCEPTED RIG AT 17:30 HRS SAFETY BREAK: JSA MIXING CHEMICALS, MAKING CONNECTIONS 17:30 - 21:30

OXY USA BRAVO DOME

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2233 181J

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Start Date: 8/13/2011

End Date: 8/17/2011

Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208

	End Date:	8/17/2011	Rig Name:	TRINIDAD 208
# Date Time	Hrs Op Details			SAME OF MI
Start-End 16:00 - 18:30	2.50 RD CEMENTING HEAD, L	DIANDING IT INST	ALL WELL HEAD NILBORE	Control Control
18:30 - 19:00	0.50 MU TEST PLUG TO 5.5" (· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
	GOOD TEST			
19:00 - 20:00	1.00 TRIP IN HOLE WITH 7 7/8			
20:00 - 22:00	2.00 DRILL TO FLOAT AND PE OUT FLOAT AND CEMEN		ING TO 1000 PSI FOR 30 MINU	ITES: TEST GOOD. DRILL
			G, INSPECTING LIFTING EQU	PMENT
22:00 - 00:00	2.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTIO 70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343 G			
			PEVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECE	
	DROP SWEEP STICKS E' MW 8.6 PPG VIS 30	VERY 3RD JT ON CC	NNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEF	S.
.3 08/15/2011	SAFETY BREAK: JSA LOG 4.00 DRILL:7 7/8" PRODUCTION			
3 00/13/2011 ,00.00:- 04.00	70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343 G	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1		
			PEVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECE	
	MW 8.9 PPG VIS 34	VERY 3RD JT ON CC	NNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEF	
	RAN WIRE LINE SURVE	Y @ 1174 INC 0.5		
	SAFETY BREAK: MAKING	CONNECTIONS, RI	G SERVICE	
04:00 - 08:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTIO			
	70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343 G CIRC STEEL PITS, PUMP		:SS. RY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSAR	Υ.
	DROP SWEEP STICKS E		NNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEP	
08:00 - 12:00	MW 9.0 PPG VIS 34 4.00 DRILL 7.7/8" PRODUCTIO	N HOLE E 4548 TO	17001-CUT 100 LAVO: 401 EDU	
00.00 - 12.00	70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343.0			
			RY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSAR	
	MW 9.0 PPG VIS 34	2. Prof. 5 (4) 1.	NNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEF	
12:00 - 14:00	2.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTIO			
	70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343 G		ESS. VERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESS	ARY
			NNECTIONS BEFORE SWEET	
14:00 - 16:00	MW 9.0 PPG VIS 34	OCT EDOM HIDLI TO	TOD DDIVE	
14.00 - 10.00	2.00 REPAIR LEAKING HYD H	OST FROM HPU TO	TOP DRIVE	and the second of the second o
	SAFETY BREAK WITH RE		NDLING FIBERGLASS, PRECA	AUTIONS WITH CURRENT
16:00 - 20:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTIO			<u></u>
	70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343 G			
			RY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSAR INNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEF	
	MW 9.0 PPG VIS 34			
	SAFETY BREAK: JSA PR	OPER LIFTING TECH	INIQUES, USING TAGLINES	
20:00 - 00:00	4.00 DRILL 7.7/8" PRODUCTIO	the state of the s	The Company of the Co	
The second secon	70 RPM; 25K WOB; 343 G	the first of the second of the second	ISS RY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSAR	
	DROP SWEEP STICKS E		NNECTIONS BEFORE SWEET	
	MW 9.0 PPG VIS 34			·大克·特别的,如《原始》,《海塘·马达斯》 [4] ·安克·克尔·克尔·克克·克尔·克克·克尔·克尔·克尔·克尔·克尔·克尔·克尔·克尔
	RAN WIRE LINE SURVEY	(@ 2064 INC 0.75		

10/1/2012 6:10:52PM 2

OXY USA BRAVO DOME

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2233 181J

Project: BRAVO DOME

Event Name:

DEV DRILLING Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT Start Date: 8/13/2011

End Date: 8/17/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208

		End Date:	8/17/2011	Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208
# Date	Time	Hrs Op Details		A CONTRACTOR OF THE PARTY OF TH
4 08/16/2011	Start-End 00:00 - 04:00	4:00 DBILL 7.7/8" BBODUCTIO	ON HOLE E 2240	'TO 2388' CUT 178 ' AVG '44.5' FPH
	00.00.	70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343 C		
				EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY.
r 24			VERY 3RD JT O	N CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS.
		MW 9.5 PPG VIS 339		
		SAFETY BREAK: JSA TR	IDDING DIDE DI	C SEDVICE
1.1		ONIETT BIXEAR JOA IR	ir ring tire, ki	G SERVICE
,		CIMARRON TOP @ 2371	'TOP	
		TUBB TOP 2398	<u> 4, 43, 15, 15</u>	
	04:00 - 06:30			'TO 2508' CUT 120 ' AVG 48' FPH
		70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343 C		PRESS. EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY.
				N CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS.
		MW 9.4 PPG VIS 38	VERT ORDER O	N CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEETS.
	06:30 - 08:30	2.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PRODUCTIO	ON HOLE F 2508	' TO 2585' CUT 77 ' AVG 39' FPH
		70 RPM, 25K WOB, 343 C		
				EVERY 3RD JT OR AS NECESSARY.
		MW 9.4 PPG VIS 38	AEK L'SKD 11 O	N CONNECTIONS BEFORE SWEEPS.
	n vije	1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1		
		SAFETY BREAK: COMMU	JNICATIONS, LE	DP & BHA
	08:30 - 09:30	1.00 PUMP HI VIS SWEEP, CI	RCULATE HOLE	2X BU.
	09:30 - 11:30			450' TO 2100', PUMPED OUT & BACK REAMED. REST OF TRIP
<u> </u>	44.00 40.00			FILL & GIVING PROPER DISPLACEMENT.
	11:30 - 13:00 13:00 - 15:00	1.50 PUMP HI VIS SWEEP, CI		
				AN, TAKING PROPER FILL W, HANDLING BHA, ROLLING PIPE.
	15:00 - 16:00	1.00 REMOVE ROTATING RU		
1 E 1 T 1 T 1	16:00 - 21:30	5.50 LOGS WENT TO BOTTO	, 	ITTING BEST FOOT FWD WITH SAFETY COMPLIANCE
	10.00 - 21.30	LOG RUN #1	W W NO FROBS	COGGERO DEPTH 2000 FOR
		LATEROLOG / SPECTRA	L GR	등 이 하나를 맞아 하나 하는 일반이 하는 사람들은 살이 살아 있다면 하다.
		LOG RUN #2		방문 바람이 그 이 사람들이 가는 사람들이 하는 사람들이 되었다.
		DENSITY / NEUTRON / G		그리었다. 그 사람이 그렇지만 그렇다는 요리했다.
	21:30 - 22:30	SIMOP: MISC PREP FOR 1,00 RD LOGGERS	RIG MOVE.	
	21.00 - 22.00	SAFETY BREAK: JSA RU	JNNING CASING	S. PINCHPOINTS
	22:30 - 23:00	0.50 RU CRT, REMOVE ROTA		fig. 1, 1, 1, 1, 1, 1, 1, 1, 1, 1, 1, 1, 1,
	23:00 - 00:00	1.00 RUN 5.5", 15.5#, J-55, LT	C PROD CASING	- The control of the
		SET DEP		SET DEPTH
		GUIDE SHOE2565'		ERT FLOAT2554'
5 08/17/2011	. 00:00 - 03:30	SHOE JT2564' 3.50 FINISH RUNNING 5.5". 1		TS CASING2554'
3 30/1/12011	, 50.00 - 05.50	SET DEP		ROD CASING SET DEPTH
		GUIDE SHOE2565	and the first term to be a first to the	ERT/FLOAT2554
	4 (4) 4 (5)	SHOE JT2564'	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	TS CASING2554
	03:30 - 04:00	0.50 DROP BALL. CIRC & COI		
		SIMOP: RU HALLIBURTO SAFETY BREAK: JSA CE		
K. L. B. B. B.	04:00 - 04:30	0.50 FINISH RU HALLIBURTO		
<u> </u>	3 7.00 - 04.00	5.50 LIMOLINO LIVERIDONIO	<u> </u>	<u> 1980 ki Alija kwa ili Makabaji na mji kutiki 1986 ki kwa ili kutiki mji kata kata kwa mji kwa mji kwa mji kwa</u>

10/1/2012 6:10:52PM 3

OXY USA BRAVO DOME

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2233 181J

DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site:

BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Start Date: 8/13/2011

# Date Hrs Op Details		End Date:	8/17/2011	Rig Name:	TRINIDAD 208
04:30 - 05:30 1.00 PUMPED CEMENT JOB AS FOLLOWS. 20 BBL FRESH WATER SPACER AT 5.5 BBL/MIN @ 150 PSI 460 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL, LEAD CEMENT - 11.1 PPG - YIELD = 3:25 CU FT/SACK25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00 0.50 R/D HALLIBURTON BEGIN RD RIG, CLEAN PITS 06:00 - 09:30 3.00 FINISH RD, RD MUD PUMP & PITS FINISH CLEANING PITS. MISC WELDING PROJECTS & GENERAL RIG REPAIR FIRST TRUCKS ON LOCATION AT 12:30 HOURS.		Hrs Op Details		- Table	The second of the second
20 BBL FRESH WATER SPACER AT 5.5 BBL/MIN @ 150 PSI 460 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL, LEAD CEMENT - 11.1 PPG - YIELD = 3.25 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00 0.50 R/D HALLIBURTON BEGIN RD RIG, CLEAN PITS 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 WOC, 4 HRS TOTAL WAIT FROM PLUG DOWN, CONT RD, CONT CLEANING PITS, 09:30 - 12:30 3.00 FINISH RD, RD MUD PUMP & PITS FINISH CLEANING PITS. MISC WELDING PROJECTS & GENERAL RIG REPAIR FIRST TRUCKS ON LOCATION AT 12:30 HOURS.	Start-End				
460 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL, LEAD CEMENT - 11.1 PPG - 11.1 PPG - YIELD = 3.25 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00 0.50 R/D HALLIBURTON BEGIN RD RIG, CLEAN PITS 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 WOC, 4 HRS TOTAL WAIT FROM PLUG DOWN, CONT RD, CONT CLEANING PITS, 09:30 - 12:30 3.00 FINISH RD, RD MUD PUMP & PITS FINISH CLEANING PITS. MISC WELDING PROJECTS & GENERAL RIG REPAIR FIRST TRUCKS ON LOCATION AT 12:30 HOURS.	04:30 - 05:30	1.00 PUMPED CEMENT JOB A	S FOLLOWS		
11.1 PPG YIELD = 3.25 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00 0.50 R/D HALLIBURTON BEGIN RD RIG, CLEAN PITS 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 WOC, 4 HRS TOTAL WAIT FROM PLUG DOWN, CONT RD, CONT CLEANING PITS. 09:30 - 12:30 3.00 FINISH RD, RD MUD PUMP & PITS FINISH CLEANING PITS. MISC WELDING PROJECTS & GENERAL RIG REPAIR FIRST TRUCKS ON LOCATION AT 12:30 HOURS.		20 BBL FRESH WATER SI	PACER AT 5.5 BBL/MIN	N @ 150 PSI	
- YIELD = 3:25 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00	Jan Jan Jan Jan Jan Jan Jan	460 SACKS OF PREMIUM	W/2% CACL, LEAD C	EMENT	
25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00		- 11.1 PPG			
150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00		- YIELD = 3.25 CL	J FT/SACK		[고일회로 [] - 그렇고 나무는 바이 이는 버큐트
150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W2% CACL - 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00		25 LBM POLY-E	-FLAKE		[경시] (14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14. 14.
- 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK - 25 LIBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER - BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD - 05:30 - 06:00 - 09:30 - 06:00 - 09:30 - 3.50 WOC, 4 HRS TOTAL WAIT FROM PLUG DOWN, CONT RD, CONT CLEANING PITS, - 09:30 - 12:30 - 3.00 FINISH RD, RD MUD PUMP & PITS FINISH CLEANING PITS, MISC WELDING PROJECTS & GENERAL RIG - REPAIR FIRST TRUCKS ON LOCATION AT 12:30 HOURS.		150 SACKS OF PREMIUM	W/2% CACL		소설(영화 4일 그렇게 느 시 :) [편
25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00					
25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE - DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00		- YIELD = 1.85	CU FT/SACK		
- DISPLACE WITH 56 BBLS OF FRESH WATER BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00					원인물들이 나는 얼마를 하다고 있다는 것이 없다.
BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 HRS WITH 987 PSI RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00					
RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00				rii na jiya 100 ayye .	
RETURNED 254 SACKS (147 BBL) TO SURFACE, FLOAT HELD 05:30 - 06:00		BUMPED PLUG @ 5:35 H	RS WITH 987 PSI		
06:00 - 09:30 3.50 WOC, 4 HRS TOTAL WAIT FROM PLUG DOWN, CONT RD, CONT CLEANING PITS. 09:30 - 12:30 3.00 FINISH RD, RD MUD PUMP & PITS FINISH CLEANING PITS. MISC WELDING PROJECTS & GENERAL RIG REPAIR FIRST TRUCKS ON LOCATION AT 12:30 HOURS.	<u>, a la la la la compania de la comp</u>			FLOAT HELD	
09:30 - 12:30 3.00 FINISH RD, RD MUD PUMP & PITS FINISH CLEANING PITS. MISC WELDING PROJECTS & GENERAL RIG REPAIR FIRST TRUCKS ON LOCATION AT 12:30 HOURS.	05:30 - 06:00	0.50 R/D HALLIBURTON BEGIN	N RD RIG, CLEAN PITS	}	
REPAIR FIRST TRUCKS ON LOCATION AT 12:30 HOURS.	06:00 - 09:30	3.50 WOC, 4 HRS TOTAL WAIT	FROM PLUG DOWN.	CONT RD, CONT CLEANING	PITS.
	09:30 - 12:30	3.00 FINISH RD, RD MUD PUM	IP & PITS FINISH CLEA	NING PITS. MISC WELDING	PROJECTS & GENERAL RIG
RELEASED RIG AT 12:30 HRS, 7 HRS AFTER PLUG DOWN (4 HRS WOC / 3 HRS CLEAN PITS)					
		RELEASED RIG AT 12:30	HRS, 7 HRS AFTER PL	UG DOWN (4 HRS WOC / 3	HRS CLEAN PITS)
					•
NOTIFIED NMCOD OF COMPLETION AT 16:20 HRS, 8/17/2011		NOTIFIED NMCOD OF CO	MPLETION AT 16:20 F	IRS, 8/17/2011	