							OXY USA		
								mary Repo	nc.
Well:	BRAVO D		NIT 2333	311G		vent Name:	DEV DRILLI		
l '	BRAVO D						ORIG DRILI	L VERT	
Site:	BRAVO D	OME CO	D2 UNIT			Start Date:	8/30/2011		Dis Names - TDINIDAD 040
#	Date	Tim		Hrs	Op Details	nd Date:	9/2/2011		Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216
1 0	8/29/2011	Start- 19:30 -	***************************************	2 00	P.ISM - MIRU	ON NEW LO	CATION SUB	-STRUCTURE S	SET & DRAW-WORKS & UNIT PINNED & DERRICK
	3/23/23 1 1	10.00	21.00		RAISED @ 20 THE RIG BY 2	):00. FINISHE 21:30, AND W	ED SETTING II VERE OFF LO	N RIG & COMPO CATION, VERY	DNENTS BY 21:00, TRUCKS FINISHED SETTING IN GOOD RIG MOVE. CONTINUED RIGGING UP RIG.
							-	5:00 PM 8/28/2 DEBRIS IN THE	
		21:30 -	00:00	2.50	PERFORMED	RIG INSPEC	CTION & ACC	EPTED RIG ON	DAY-WORK CONTRACT @ 20:00 HOUR 8/29/2011
					CONTINUE R	IGGING LIP			
2 0	8/30/2011	00:00 -	00:30						KS, FILL PITS HALF FULL AND MIX SPUD MUD
		00:30 -	04:00		PJSM WITH C	F. 41. ( 20.1.)			
					SPUDDED 12 DRILL FROM	and the second second second second		S 08/29/2011	
					ROTARY - WT ON BIT - GPM - PUMP PRES.	5 - 10 K 357			
					O. FETTA DO	ALC DINOULO	NO. N.T.O.		
	<u>i ili kababasa</u>	04:00 -	06:00	2 00	SAFETY BRE			<u>8 € jastis s [*   4  </u> / HR	<ul> <li>Self-Equation (1992) After the control of the property of the control of the contro</li></ul>
İ		04.00	00.00		WIRELINE SU		_	/ Tux.	
1					ROTARY -				
					WT. ON BIT - GPM -	5 - 10 K 357			
					PUMP PRES.				
}					0455777.005		011514101410		
		. 06:00 -	10:00	4:00	DRILL FROM			/HR	
		00.00	10.00			. 100 10 00.	3, <b>2</b> , 1, @ 30		
					ROTARY -				
		19 No. 3 		militario de la compansión de la compans	WT ON BIT - GPM -				
		ing the same of th			PUMP PRES.	The state of the s			
			. 7						AYING HYDRATED
		10:00 -	- 13:30	3.50	DRILL FROM	: 696' TO 78'	1', 85', @ 25' /	HR.	
ļ					ROTARY -	140 RPM			
					WT. ON BIT -				
					GPM -	357			
					PUMP PRES.		FORMATION		
					NOF SLOW L	JOWN DAKD	OUMVION		
			<del></del>		SAFETY BRE				**
									ING JOB
		14:30	- 15:30	1.00	DROP TOTO	O AND TOH	TO RUN 8 5/8'	SURFACE CAS	SING
					SAFETY BRE	EAK: TRIPPIN	NG PIPE		
	1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1	15:30	- 16:00	0.50				A Property of the	
		16:00	- 17:00	1.00	PJSM - RUNI				
							SING AS FOL		
							IOE set @ 760 5, SHOE JOIN		T FLOAT SE @ 716"
					18 - JOINTS				<u>~</u>
1					0.4014.0.04.1	NI \ /ED\/ \A/E!		DIEMO CACINO	C SET AT 760'
<del></del>	स्ट <u>, सुक्रिय</u> , स्ट	17:00	18·00°	. 1 00				BLEMS ,CASING	G SET AT 760'  R CEMENTING 8 5/8" SURFACE CASING. RJSM:
<b>\</b> ::.		17.00	- 10.00	1.00				HON HOLE FOR	
1									
1									

## **Operation Summary Report**

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 311G

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Start Date: 8/30/2011

Site:	BRAVO D	DOME CO2 UNIT	Start Date: 8/30/2011
#	Date	Time	End Date: 9/2/2011   Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216   Hrs   Op Details
		Start-End	
		18:00 - 19:30	1.50 PJSM - TEST LINES TO 2,500 PSI CEMENT AS FOLLOWS: PUMP 20 BBL SPACER
			PUMP 500 SACKS OF LEAD, 120 BBLS, MIXED TO 14 8PPG; 1.35 YELD AT 6 BPM WITH 250 PSI
ı			DROPPED PLUG & DISPLACED CEMENT WITH 47 BBLS FRESH WATER USING HALLIBURTON PUMP
			TRUCK AT 6 BPM WITH 275 PSI FINAL DISPLACEMENT PRESSURE
			BUMP PLUG @ 19:20 PRESSURE TO 556 PSI. HELD PRESSURE FOR 10 MINUTES. FLOAT HELD.  CIRCULATE (190 SKS, 45 BBLS) TO PIT
		19:30 - 23:30	4.00 W O C 4 HOURS MANDATORY, CLEAN PITS FROM CEMENT, CLEAN LOCATION
			SAFETY BREAK: GENERAL HOUSE KEEPING
		23:30 - 00:00	0.50 PJSM- REMOVE LANDING JOINT, SCREW ON HEAD AND FLANGE, NIPPLE UP BOP, SECURE BOP
	00/21/2011	00:00 03:00	SAFETY BREAK: TALKED ABOUT HIGH PRESSURE LINES FOR TESTING PURPOSES.
	08/31/2011	00:00 - 03:00	3.00 PJSM- REMOVE LANDING JOINT. SCREW ON HEAD AND FLANGE. NIPPLE UP BOP. SECURE BOP,
		03:00 - 03:30	0.50 TEST BOP 250 PSI LOW: TEST GOOD, TEST BOP 1000 PSI HIGH: TEST GOOD.
i		03:30 - 05:00	1.50 CONTINUE NIPPLING UP: INSTALL BELL NIPPLE AND FLOWLINE.
			SAFETY BREAK: PROPER PLACEMENT OF BODY WHEN USING A HAMMER
	0.15	05:00 - 06:00	1.00 PJSM: MAKE UP 7 7/8 BIT AND TRIP IN HOLE WITH BHA
		06:00 - 07:00	1.00 TAG CEMENT @ 717'. TEST CASING TO 1000 PSI: TEST GOOD
	. 4,77		SAFETY BREAK: PICKING UP & HANDLING BHA & DRILL COLLARS
	<u> </u>	07:00 - 07:30	0.50 DRILL OUT CEMENT AND FLOAT EQUIPMENT F/ 717 TO 781'
1		07:30 - 11:00	3.50 DRILL FROM: 781' TO 1,101', 320', @ 91' / HR.
1			CIRCULATING RESERVE PITS  ROTARY - 100 RPM
l			WT. ON BIT - 10-15 K
Ì			GPM - 357
			PUMP PRES 1050 PSI
}			
		11.00 15.00	SAFETY BREAK: WORKING IN HOT CONDITIONS / STAYING HYDRATED
'		11:00 - 15:00	4:00 DRILL FROM: 1,101' TO 1,407', 626', @ 52' / HR. CIRCULATING RESERVE PIT TILL 1300' ,SWITCH TO STEEL PITS
· :			WIRELINE SURVEY @1272 = 750 DEGREE
			ROTARY 75 RPM
			WT. ON BIT15- 20 K
			PUMP PRES -1095 PSI
l .		The state of the s	SAFETY BREAK: SLIPPERY SURFACES
[	. 17 17 1	15:00 - 19:00	4.00 DRILL FROM: 1,407' TO 1,623', 216', @ 54' / HR.
1		10.00	CIRCULATING STEEL PITS
			ROTARY - 100 RPM
1			WT. ON BIT - 25-30 K
}			GPM - 357
			PUMP PRES 1050 PSI
			SAFETY BREAK: ELECTRICAL CONNECTIONS AROUND WATER
	100	19:00 - 23:00	4.00 DRILL FROM: 1,623 TO 1,763, 140', @ 35 / HR:
			CIRCULATING STEEL PITS
			ROTARY 100 RPM
1	\$ 100		WT. ON BIT- 25-30 K
1 .			PUMP PRES: - 1180 PSI
٠.,			
<u> </u>	1 2372 11		SAFETY BREAK: PINCH POINTS
İ		23:00 - 00:00	1.00 DRILL FROM: 1,763' TO 1,790', 27', @ 27' / HR.
			CIRCULATING STEEL PITS
			ROTARY - 100 RPM WT. ON BIT - 25-30K
Į			WI. ON BIT - 25-30K GPM - 357
1			PUMP PRES 1200 PSI
1			
			SAFETY BREAK: MIXING CHEMICALS
	•		
1			

10/1/2012 6:13:12PM 2

# **Operation Summary Report**

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 311G

Event Name:

DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Start Date: 8/30/2011

Site:	BRAVO DOME CO2 UNIT	Start Date: 8/30/2011
	_	End Date: 9/2/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216
#	Date Time	Hrs Op Details
4	Start-End 09/01/2011 00:00 - 04:00	4.00 DDIU EDOM: 4.700 TO 4.000 440 G 00 440
'	22,70 11,20 11, 20,30 04,00	4.00 DRILL FROM: 1,790' TO 1,902', 112', @ 28' / HR. CIRCULATING RESERVE PIT @1804'
		ROTARY 100 RPM
J		WT. ON BIT - 25-30K
		GPM - 357
		PUMP PRES 1180 PSI
ļ		SAFETY BREAK PRODER TECHNIQUE FOR DULLING AND CETTING OLDO
	04:00 - 06:00	SAFETY BREAK: PROPER TECHNIQUE FOR PULLING AND SETTING SLIPS  2.00 DRILL FROM: 1,902' TO 2,044', 142', @ 71'/ HR
		CIRCULATING RESERVE PIT
		ROTARY - 165 RPM
ł .		2篇:WT. ON BIT -25-30K
	그의 이번, 최고화인, 나랑이다.	GPM- 357
		PUMP PRES: -1174 PSI
		SAFETY BREAK: FORKLIFT OPERATIONS
	06:00 - 10:00	4.00 DRILL FROM: 2,044' TO 2175', 131', @ 33' / HR.
		CIRCULATING RESERVE PIT
1		ROTARY - 75 RPM
		WT. ON BIT - 25-30K
ļ		GPM - 357 · PUMP PRES 1174 PSI
		1 OWIF FRES (1/4 FS)
		SAFETY BREAK: MIXING MUD CHEMICALS
11.	10:00 - 14:00	4.00 DRILL FROM: 2,175' TO 2,329', 154', @ 39',/ HR
		CIRCULATING RESERVE PIT TILL 2200', SWITH TO STEEL PITS
		WIRELINE SURVEY @ 2267' = 1.000 DEGREE
		ROTARY - 75 RPM WT. ON BIT - 25-30K
		GPM
		PUMP PRES - 1174 PSI
		봤을다는 그를 냈다. 추근생활한 그는 사람들은 사람들을 하다는 생각이 받았다는 말로 있는 것이 없다.
		SAFETY BREAK SAFE OPERATION OF RUNNING WIRELINE SURVEY
	14:00 - 18:00	4.00 DRILL FROM: 2.329' TO 2,429', 100', @ 25' / HR.
ŀ		CIRCULATING STEEL PITS ROTARY - 75 RPM
		WT. ON BIT - 25-30K
		GPM - 357
		PUMP PRES 1174 PSI
		TOD OF CHARDON & A 270 MD
		TOP OF CIMARRON @ 2,378' MD CIMARRON DEPTH = 18'
		TOP OF TUBB @ = 2,396'
		DRILL TUBB FORM 190'
		DRILL RATHOLE - 20'
		TD WELLBORE @ 2,606'
		SAFETY BREAK: LAY DOWN BHA
200	18:00 - 22:00	4.00 DRILL FROM: 2,429' TO 2,581'; 152 , @ 38' / HR.
		CIRCULATING STEEL PITS
		ROTARY - 75 RPM
		WT. ON BIT - 25-30K
		GPM - 357 PUMP PRES 1174 PSI
	그는 사람들이 하지 않았다.	<u>;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;;</u>
· · ·		SAFETY BREAK: MIXING CHEMICALS
	22:00 - 22:30	0.50 DRILL FROM: 2,581' TO 2,606', 25 ', @ 50' / HR.
		TD WELL @ 22:30 HR
		CIRCULATING STEEL PITS
		ROTARY - 75 RPM WT. ON BIT - 25-30K
		GPM - 357
		PUMP PRES 1174 PSI
	22:30 - 23:30	1.00 PJSM- CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR OPEN HOLE LOGS
	23:30 - 00:00	0.50 PJSM - MADE WIPER TRIP TO 8 5/8" CASING SHOE @ 781' & BACK TO BOTTOM

10/1/2012

6:13:12PM

## **Operation Summary Report**

Vell: B

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 311G

Event Name:

DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT

Start Date:

8/30/2011

UZ ONTI

Side. Brown Boine 332 5/4/1	End Date:	9/2/2011	Rig Name	TRINIDAD 216
# Date Time H	irs Op Details		g	
Start-End				2 P. C.
5 09/02/2011 00:00 - 02:00	2.00 CONTINUE WIPER TRIP TRIP TRIP TRIP TRIP TRIP TRIP TRI		SHOE @ 781' & BACK TO BOTT	OM - TRIP WENT GOOD, NO
02:00 - 03:00	1.00 CIRC. & CONDITION HOL		ELOGS	
	SAFETY BREAK PINCH			
03:00 - 06:00	3.00 PJSM- DROP TOTCO AN		<del></del>	
06:00 11:30	5.50 PJSM- RIG UP LOGGERS	S AND LOG TO 260	6 'TD	
	RUN 1ST SET OF LOGS I	F/ 1800' TO 2.606'	TOOLS GR-LL-MRT	
	RUN 2 ND SET OF LOGS		and the first of the control of the	
	RIG DOWN LOGGERS			하늘 보고 됐는 것도 빨리 그렇게 그렇다.
11:20 12:00	SAFETY BREAK: WIRELII		CACINO	
11:30 - 12:00 12:00 - 12:30	0.50 PJSM RIG UP TO RUN 5 0.50 PJSM WITH CREW ON R			
12.00 - 12.30			G TOOLS HANGE OUT CASING TOOLS FO	OR FIBERGLASS TOOLS
12:30 - 15:30	3.00 PJSM WITH CREW ON TI		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
	RUN 5 1/2" PROD. CSG. /	AS FOLLOWS:		
	1 - FLOAT SHOE -		.50' - 2,588.30' - 2,587.8	0'
	1 - 5 1/2 ", 15.5# SHOE JT	Γ.	1084' - 2.587.80' - 2.576.9	
	4 - JTS. 5 1/2", 15.5# CSG		187.88' - 2,576.96' - 2,389.0	8'
	81 - JTS. FIBER GLASS 5		2,376.58'- 2,389.08' - 12.50'	
	1 - LANDING JT. 51/2", 15	0.5# -	12.50'	
	FIBERGLASS / STEEL TR	RANSITION @ 2,38	9.80' MD.	
	0.15571/195511/19/01/5			
15:30 - 16:00	SAFETY BREAK: PJSM R 0.50 RIG DOWN ECKEL TOOL	1 m 1 m	CEMENT	
16:00 - 17:00	1.00 PJSM RIG-UP HALLIBUR	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	CEWENIA SEA TIME	<u> turivadus, i i Bestis setta irrilaten i i ilias erita et Gara, ilita</u>
		ALL PERSONEL O		
	DOWN 5 1/2" CEMENTIN			
17:00 - 18:00	1.00 PRESSURE TEST LINES			
	PUMPED 20 BBL FRESH	WATER SPACER		
	LEAD CEMENT:			
	-11.1 PPG PREMIUM PL		, 460 SACKS	
	- 0.25 LBM/SACK POLY-1 - YIELD: 3.25 CUFT/SACK			
	- SLURRY VOLUME: 266.			
	- PUMP RATE: 6.0 BBL/M	The decide of the control of the con		근데 하지만 나는 사람들이 없었다.
	- CASING PRESSURE: 2	00 PSI		
	TAIL CEMENT:			
	- 13.2 PPG PREMIUM PL	US CEMENT WITH	2% CC, 150 SACKS	
[요. 6] 공기가 말했다는 경우 및 물론하	- SLURRY VOLUME: 49.4	The state of the s		
	- 0:25 LBM/SACK POLY - - YIELD: 1:85 CUFT/SAC			
	- PUMP RATE 5.0 BBL/M			
	- CASING PRESSURE: 1			
	DISDIACE MARTILES TOS	I OF EDECH WAT	ED.	
	DISPLACE WITH 56.7 BB - PUMP RATE: 8 BBL/MIN	and the state of t		
[[이 기업 이 값 변경활동 살다]	- CASING PRESSURE: 60			
	- BUMPED PLUG AT 2 BE	BL/MIN AT 600 PSI		
	- @ 18:07 PM 09/02/2011 - CIRCULATED 202 BBLS		SUBEACE (240 SVS)	
	- FLOAT HELD - RIGGED		TO BE TO SHOW THE SECOND TO SECOND THE SECOND TO SECOND THE SECOND	
18:00 - 22:00			PARE FOR RIG MOVE TO NEW	LOCATION. W O C
	MANDATORY 4 HRS.		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	

### **Operation Summary Report**

Well:

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 311G

Project: BRAVO DOME

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT Start Date: 8/30/2011 End Date: 9/2/2011

Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216

22:00 - 00:00

Date Time Hrs Op Details Start-End

2.00 RELEASED CHAINS ON CASING, RIGGED DOWN HALCO CEMENTING HEAD, BACKED OUT LANDING

JOINT, N/D BOP.

MADE UP WING NUT ON WELL-HEAD AND SECURED WELL HEAD PROPERLY.

RELEASED RIG 216 @ 00:00 09/02/2011 TO NEXT LOCATION

10/1/2012

6:13:12PM