#### OXY USA INC Operation Summary Report Well BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 031G Event Name: **DEV DRILLING** Project: BRAVO DOME Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT Site: **BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT** Start Date: 9/8/2011 End Date: 9/13/2011 TRINIDAD 216 Rig Name: Time Date Hrs Op Details Start-End 09/08/2011 12:00 - 16:00 4.00 NOTIFIED ED MARTIN @ NMOCD of RIG MOVE & INTENT TO SPUD @ 1:00 PM PJSM - MOVE & RIG UP, MIXED SPUD MUD, PERFORMED RIG INSPECTION & ACCEPTED RIG ON DAY-WORK @ 4:00 PM. HELD PRE-SPUD & SAFETY MEETING. & SPUDDED 12 1/4" HOLE @ 4:00 PM -9/8/2011 16:00 - 20:00 4:00 SPUDDED 12 1/4" HOLE @ 16:00 HOURS (4:00 PM) 9/8/2011. DRILLED FROM: 12' TO 250' @ 59.5' / HR. ROTARY -125 RPM WT. ON BIT -5 - 20 K GPM -400 PUMP PRES. - 900 PSI SAFETY BREAK: PICKING UP & HANDLING BHA & DRILL COLLARS 20:00 - 00:00 4.00 DRILLED FROM: 250' TO 400' @ 37.5' / HR. ROTARY -125 RPM WT. ON BIT -5 - 20 K GPM -400 PUMP PRES. -900 PSI SAFETY BREAK: GENERAL HOUSE KEEPING 2 09/09/2011 100:00 - 06:00 6.00 DRILLED FROM: 400' TO 750' @ 58.33' / HR ROTARY:-125 RPM WT. ON BIT -5 - 20 K GPM -400 PUMP PRES. -900 PSI SAFETY BREAK: MIXING CHEMICALS 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 DRILLED FROM: 750' TO 808' @ 58' / HR. TD SURFACE HOLE @ 7:00 AM 9/9/2011 ROTARY -125 RPM WT. ON BIT -5 - 20 K GPM -400 PLIMP PRES -900 PSI SURVEY -@ 808' = .75° SAFETY BREAK: 100%% TIE OFF 1.00 CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE TO RUN 8.5/8" CASING 07:00 - 08:00 08:00 - 10:00 2.00 PJSM - DROPPED TOTCO & T O H & LDDP & BHA SAFETY BREAK: TRIPPING PIPE & FALLING OBJECTS 10:00 - 11:00 1.00 PJSM - RUNNING SURFACE CASING RAN 8 5/8" SURFACE CASING AS FOLLOWS: 1 - TEXAS PATTERN SHOE 1 - 8.5/8", 24#, STC, J - 55, SHOE JOINT WITH INSERT FLOAT 17 - JOINTS OF 8 5/8", 24#, J-55, STC CASING RAN VERY WELL WINO PROBLEMS, CASING SET AT 789 11:00 - 12:00 1.00 CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE FOR CEMENTING 8 5/8" SURFACE CASING. PJSM: RIG UP HALCO 1.00 PJSM - TEST LINES TO 2,500 PSI CEMENT AS FOLLOWS: PUMP 500 SACKS OF LEAD, MIXED TO 12:00 - 13:00 14.8PPG, 1.35 YELD AT 6.5BPM WITH 200 PSI DROPPED PLUG & DISPLACEED CEMENT WITH 47.3 BBLS FRESH WATER USING HALLIBURTON PUMP TRUCK AT 6 BPM WITH 290 PSI FINAL DISPLACEMENT PRESSURE. BUMP PLUG @ 1:00 PM WITH 500 PSI. PSI UP TO 1000 PSI, HELD PRESSURE FOR 5 MINUTES: FLOAT HELD. CIRCULATE 47 BBLS (196 SX) TO PIT. 13:00 - 17:00 4.00 W O C - 4 HRS. SAFETY MEETING: NIPPLING UP & TESTING BOP & CASING 17:00 - 21:00 [4:00]PJSM - REMOVED HALLIBURTON CEMENT HEAD BACKED OUT LANDING JOINT ∷ SCREW ON 41™ x 2 M DRILLING FLANGE & N/U BOP & FLOWLINE TO BELL NIPPLE AND N/U WELL HEAD VALVES 21:00 - 21:30 0.50 TEST ANNULAR 250 LO / 1000 HI FOR 15 MINUTES.

# OXY USA INC

## Operation Summary Report

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 031G

Project: BRAVO DOME

Event Name: DEV DRILLING Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Project:	BRAVO DOME	Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT
Site:	BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT	Start Date: 9/8/2011
		End Date: 9/13/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216
#	Date Time	Hrs Op Details
	Start-End	是一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个一个
	21:30 - 22:00	0.50 FINISH N/U BOP RISER AND CIRCULATING HEAD. CHAIN OFF BOP.
	22:00 - 23:00	1.00 TIH WITH BIT #2 AND BHA #2. TAG CEMENT @ 743
	23:00 - 23:30	0.50 CLOSE ANNULAR & TEST CASING TO 1,000 PSI for 30 MIN. / GOOD TEST
	23:30 - 00:00	0.50 INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER
3 09	9/10/2011 00:00 - 00:30	0.50 DRILLED CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT FROM: 738 ' TO 808' @ 140' FT / HR.
		ROTARY - 60 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K
		GPM - 400
		PUMP PRES 1000 PSI
		SAFETY BREAK: PICKING UP & HANDLING BHA & DRILL COLLARS
	00:30 - 04:30	4.00 DRILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOLE FROM: 808 ' TO 1,200' @ 98 FT / HR.
		나는 선생님들이 화면 있는 것이 없는 사람들이 없는 사람들이 되었다. 그는 사람들은 사람들이 되었다.
1.19.		ROTARY - 80 RPM
		WT, ON BITH 1910 - 15 Kinggood 1910 - 15 Kinggood 1910 - 1
		PUMP PRES - 1000 PS
7.		그리아 교육화가 2010년 전 전 경우 경우 경우 경우 하지 않는데 가장 중요하는데 그는 그는 것이 되었다.
· :		SAFETY BREAK: HIGH PRESSURE LINES.
	04:30 - 06:00	1.50 DRILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOLE FROM: 1,200' TO 1,350' @ 98 FT / HR.
		DOTADY CO DOM
		ROTARY - 80 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K
		GPM - 400
		PUMP PRES, - 1000 PSI
		SURVEY @ 1304- 1.25°
		SAFETY BREAK: WORKING ON MUD PUMP
	06:00 - 10:00	4.00 DRILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOLE FROM: 1,350' TO 1,550' @ 50 FT / HR.
	33.33	
		TURNED TO STEEL PITS AT 1500FT. AFTER CIRCULATING RESERVE. BEGAN BLEEDING
		OVER DRISPAC PREMIX INTO SYSTEM AND LOWER FLUID LOSS TO LESS THAN 10.
		강마하, 하흑총살과 국가 남한 1강 대기가 이 시의 경상 대원인데 진진한 전략하기 이번 1가 상점한 관심이 있는데
		ROTARY: 80 RPM
	the second section is the second	WT. ON BIT- 10 - 15 K GPM - 400
	The state of the state of	GPM - 400 PUMP PRES - 1000 PSI
100		가 있는 사람들은 사람들은 사람들이 되었다. 그 사람들은 사람들은 사람들은 사람들은 사람들은 사람들이 되었다.
		SAFETY BREAK: WORKING WITH POWER TOOLS
	10:00 - 14:00	4.00 DRILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOLE FROM: 1,550' TO 1,750' @ 50 FT / HR.
		DOTABY AS DOM
		ROTARY - 80 RPM
		WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K
		WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400
		WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI SAFETY BREAK: WEARING SAET BELTS
	14:00:- 18:00	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI
	14:00: 18:00	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI  SAFETY BREAK: WEARING SAET BELTS  4.00 DRILLED:7 7/8" PROD. HOLE FROM: 1,750 TO 1800; @ 14.5 FT / HR.
	14:00:18:00	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI  SAFETY BREAK: WEARING SAET BELTS  4.00 DRILLED:7 7/8" PROD: HOLE FROM: 1,750', TO 1800', @ 14.5 FT / HR.  'ROTARY - 80 RPM
	14:00:= 18:00	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI  SAFETY BREAK: WEARING SAET BELTS  4.00 DRILLED: 7 7/8" PROD. HOLE FROM: 1,750 TO 1800; @ 14.5 FT / HR.  ROTARY - 80 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K
	14:00:=18:00	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI  SAFETY BREAK: WEARING SAET BELTS  4.00 DRILLED:7 7/8" PROD: HOLE FROM: 1,750', TO 1800', @ 14.5 FT / HR.  'ROTARY - 80 RPM
	14:00:18:00	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI  SAFETY BREAK: WEARING SAET BELTS  4.00 DRILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOLE FROM: 1,750 TO 1800; @ 14.5 FT / HR.  ROTARY - 80 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400
	14:00:18:00	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI  SAFETY BREAK: WEARING SAET BELTS  4.00 DRILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOLE FROM: 1,750 TO 1800; @ 14.5 FT / HR.  ROTARY - 80 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400 PUMP PRES: - 1000 PSI

10/1/2012 6:19:05PM 2

## **Operation Summary Report**

The second second second	- РУ	ion Summary Kep			
Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 031G	Event Name:	DEV DRILLING			
Project: BRAVO DOME		ORIG DRILL VERT			
Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT	Start Date:	9/8/2011			
# Date Time Hrs O	End Date: p Details	9/13/2011	Rig Name:	TRINIDAD 216	A \
Start-End				1000 1005 1170	200
18:00 - 22:00 4:00 D	RILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOL	E FROM: 1800' TO 1950	@ 37.5 FT / HR.		
		TING THROUGH RESERV		30 BBL SWEEPS	
F	VERY 3-5 CONECTIONS +	· 1 VIS CUP OF POLY-PLU	S DOWN DP EVERY (	CONNECTION.	
	ROTARY - 80 RPM				
	WT ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400				* **
	PUMP PRES 1000 PSI		발표한 개발경험을		14
	CUDVEY @ 4000 48				
	SURVEY @ 1800- 1°	***			7 + 27
_ :	SAFETY BREAK: STRAPP				
22:00 - 00:00 2.00 D	RILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOL	E FROM: 1950' TO 2050 '	@ 25 FT / HR.		
	ROTARY - 80 RPM				
	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400				
	PUMP PRES 1000 PSI				
:	SAFETY BREAK: WEARIN	G PPE WHILE MIXING CH	EMICALS		
		E FROM: 2050' TO 2150 '			- 19
					e, te
	ROTARY - 80 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K				
	GPM - 400				
	PUMP PRES 1000 PSI				
	SAFETY BREAK: WEARIN	G PPE ON RIG FLOOR			
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 D	RILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOL	E FROM: 2150 ' TO 2250	@ 25 FT / HR.		
J	ROTARY - 80 RPM				
	WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K				
	GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI				
	OAFETY DOEAL FORM	T OBERATION			
74	SAFETY BREAK: FORKLIF RILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOL	E FROM: 2250 ! TO 2352	" @ 25.5 FT / HR		ļ.,
		2230: 10 2332	. @ 23.3 / 1 / 1 jik.		
アー・ディー・ 色枝 しょうしょうじょう きゅうし さしゅんかんきんしん	OP OF CIMARRON -	2,332'			
サンド 4.1.1 (1.1.1 ) コード (2.1.1 ) アガル (2.1.1 ) ガリ (2.1.1 )	DIMARRON IS 20' THICK H	2,352 ERE			
	D OF THIS WELL BORE W	/ILL BE - 2,587			W.,
	ROTARY - 80 RPM				
	WT. ON BIT 10 - 15 K				
	GPM - 400 PUMP PRES 1000 PSI				
					W. J.
	SAFETY BREAK WORKIN		751 @ 00 75 CT / U.D.		
	RILLED 7.7/8" PROD. HOL				
10:00 - 14:00 4.00 D	RILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOL		5 @ 30.75 FT / HR.		
10:00 - 14:00 4.00 D	OP OF CIMARRON -	2,332'	5 @ 30.75 FT / HK.		
10:00 - 14:00 4.00 D To To		2,332' 2,352'	5 @ 30.75 FT / HR.		
10:00 - 14:00 4.00 D Ti Ti C	OP OF CIMARRON - OP OF TUBB -	2,332' 2,352' ERE	э ( <u>ш</u> 30./эг г / Нк.		
10:00 - 14:00 4.00 D Ti Ti C Ti	OP OF CIMARRON - OP OF TUBB - CIMARRON IS 20' THICK H	2,332' 2,352' ERE	5 @ 30.75 FT / HK.		
10:00 - 14:00 4.00 D Ti Ti C Ti	OP OF CIMARRON - OP OF TUBB - CIMARRON IS 20' THICK H D OF THIS WELL BORE W ROTARY - 80 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K	2,332' 2,352' ERE	5 @ 30.75 FT / HK.		
10:00 - 14:00 4.00 D Ti Ti C Ti	OP OF CIMARRON - OP OF TUBB - CIMARRON IS 20' THICK H D OF THIS WELL BORE W ROTARY - 80 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K GPM - 400	2,332' 2,352' ERE	5 (# 30.75 FT / HK.		
10:00 - 14:00 4.00 D TI TI C TI	OP OF CIMARRON - OP OF TUBB - CIMARRON IS 20' THICK H D OF THIS WELL BORE W ROTARY - 80 RPM WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K	2,332' 2,352' ERE /ILL BE - 2,587'	5 (# 30.75 FT / HK.		

10/1/2012 6:19:05PM

#### OXY USA INC

### Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 031G

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT Start Date: 9/8/2011

End Date: 9/13/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 216

		End Date: 9	9/13/2011	Rig Name:	TRINIDAD 216
# Date	Time	Hrs Op Details			
	Start-End		500M 0 (751 70 0 507)		Western Commission of the St.
	14:00 - 17:30	3.50 DRILLED 7 7/8" PROD. HOLE	FROM: 2,475 10 2,587 @	g 37.33 FT / HR.	
		TOP OF CIMARRON -	2.332'		
		TOP OF TUBB -	2,352'		
		CIMARRON IS 20' THICK HE	RE		
		TD OF THIS WELL BORE WIL	L BE - 2,587'		
		ROTARY - 80 RPM			
		WT. ON BIT - 10 - 15 K			
		GPM - 400			
		PUMP PRES 1000 PSI			
		SAFETY BREAK: WIRELINE	OPERATION		
<u> </u>	17:30 - 19:30	A STATE OF THE STA	·	<u> </u>	
	19:30 - 22:00	2.50 PJSM - MADE WIPER TRIP TO NO PROBLEMS, NO TIGHT S	_	05' & BACK TO BOT	TOM - TRIP WENT GOOD,
1.1.4.4.	22:00 - 00:00	2.00 CIRCULATE & CONDITION H	OLE FOR OPEN HOLE LOG	GGING & TO RUN 5	1/2" PROD. CSG.
5 09/12/2011	00:00 - 01:00	1.00 CIRCULATE & CONDITION H	OLE FOR OPEN HOLE LOG	GGING & TO RUN 5	1/2" PROD. CSG.
	01:00 - 03:00	2.00 PJSM - STRAP OUT OF HOLE	& LDDP & BHA TO RUN OF	PEN HOLE LOGS & I	RUN 5 1/2" CASING.
	03:00 - 05:00	2.00 PJSM - RIG UP WEATHERFO	RD WIRE-LINE & R I H w/1si	OPEN HOLE LOG.	(DUAL LATERAL) LOG
		TAGGED OBSTRUCTION @			UCCESS TO PASS 1,370'.
		PULL OUT OF HOLE WITH	LOGGING TOOLS TO RUN \	MIPER TRIP	
		RIG DOWN WEATHERFOR	D WIRELINE.		
	05:00 - 08:00				
		COND HOLE FOR 2nd LOGG			
		@ 1,370". SAW NO INDICATION			
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00 CIRCULATE & CONDITION H		·	
	<del></del>	2.00 PJSM - T O H & LDDP & BHA			PROD CSG.
	12:00 - 15:00	3.00 PJSM - RIG UP WEATHERFO			(DUAL LATERAL) LOG.
		TAGGED BOTTOM @ 2,590'	MIRE LINE MD. @ 12:30 PM	, LOGGED INTERVA	L FROM TD BACK TO 8 5/8"
		CSG. SHOE.		·····	
	15:00 - 18:00	3.00 RAN 2nd LOGGING RUN (CO			
<del> </del>		w/NO PROBLEMS / RIGGED			HOUSTON OFFICE.
	18:00 - 23:00	5.00 PJSM - RIG UP & RUN 5 1/2"	PROD. CSG. AS FOLLOWS:		
		1 - FLOAT SHOE -	0.50 - 2,577.80 - 2	2.577.30'	
		1 - 5 1/2 ", 15.5# SHOE JT.	·	•	•
		6 - JTS. 5 1/2", 15.5# CSG. JT	,	•	
		82 - JTS, FIBER GLASS 5 1/2	' - 2,344.29 - 2,344.29 -	17.00'	
		1 - LANDING JT. 51/2", 15.5#		- 5.00' - ( STICK L	IP)
•	•	FIBERGLASS / STEEL TRANS	SITION @ 2 344 29' MD		
		5 1/2" PROD. CSG. SET & CE			
		SAFETY BREAK: RUNNING	CASING		
		J J			
	23:00 - 00:00	1.00 CIRC. & CONDITION HOLE F	OR CEMENT JOB, RIG DOW	N CRT: & RIG UP H	ALCO, HOLD PJSM &

10/1/2012 6:19:05PM

## OXY USA INC

# **Operation Summary Report**

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 2333 031G

Project: BRAVO DOME

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

City BRANC BONE		ORIG DRILL VERT		
Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT	Start Date:	9/8/2011		
540	End Date:	9/13/2011	Rig Name:	TRINIDAD 216
	Op Details			Property and the second
Start-End 6 .09/13/2011 .00:00 - 01:30 1.50	0 D 10M		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	**************************************
6 09/13/2011 00:00 - 01:30 1.50	0 PJSM - PRESSURE TEST LINES T	O 2500 DOI		
	FRESOURE TEST EINES T	O 2300 PSI		
	PUMPED 20 BBL FRESH W	VATER SPACER		
	LEAD CEMENT:			
	- 11.1 PPG PREMIUM PLUS		SACKS	
	· - 0.25 LBM/SACK POLY- E · - YIELD: 3.25 CUFT/SACK	- FLAKE		
	- SLURRY VOLUME: 266.2	RRI S		
	- PUMP RATE: 6.0 BBL/MIN	The state of the s		
	- CASING PRESSURE: 350	0 PSI		
				원호등(1) 경기 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1) 1 (1)
	TAIL CEMENT:			
	- 13.2 PPG PREMIUM PLUS		C, 150 SACKS	
	- SLURRY VOLUME: 49.4 B - 0.25 LBM/SACK POLY - E			
	- YIELD: 1.85 CUFT/SACK	7.11.2		
	- PUMP RATE: 6 BBL/MIN			
	- CASING PRESSURE: 320	0 PSI		
	DISPLACE WITH 56.5 BBL PUMP RATE: 5 BBL/MIN	OF FRESH WATER		
	- CASING PRESSURE: 580	10 PSI		
	BUMPED PLUG AT 2 BBL	/MIN AT 1050 PSI @ 1:	00 AM 9/13/2011	
	- CIRCULATED 186 BBLS C	OF CEMENT TO SURF	ACE. (322 SKS)	
	FLOATUELD DIGGED DO			
01:30 - 05:30 4.00	FLOAT HELD RIGGED DO		FOR DIO MOVE TO NEW	OCATION
	0 W O C - CLEAN PITS, RIG			
05.50 - 06.00 0.50	0 RELEASED CHAINS ON CA JOINT, N/D BOP.	ASING, RIGGED DOW	HALCO CEMENTING HEA	D, BACKED OUT LANDING
	50.11, 140.00			
	MADE UP WING NUT ON V	WELL-HEAD AND SEC	URED WELL HEAD PROPE	RLY.
06:00 - 09:00 3.00				ES, TO THE BDU # 2034 - 182
	K. NOTIFIED ED MARTIN @	@ NMOCD OF RIG MO	/E & INTENT TO SPUD THE	BDU # 2034 182 K. 8:00 AM
1				
	9/13/2011			
09:00 - 12:00 3.00	9/13/2011 0 FINISHED RIGGING DOWN 12:00 NOON - RIG RELEAS			I & LOCATION CLEAN @

5 10/1/2012 6:19:05PM