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I, a legal clerk of the Carlsbad CurrentmArgus, 
a newspaper published daily at the City of 

Carlsbad, in said county of Eddy, state of New 
Mexico and of general paid circulation in said 

county; that the same is a duly qualified 
newspaper under the laws of the State wherein 

legal notices and advertisements may be 
published; that the printed notice attached 

hereto was published in the regular and entire 
edition of said newspaper and not in supplement 

thereof on the date as follows, to wit: 

04/16/19 

Subscribed and sworn before me this 
16th of April 2019. 

My Commission Expires 
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STATE OF NEW MEXICO 
ENERGY, MINERALS AND NATURAL 

RESOURCES DEPARTMENT 
OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION 

SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 

The State of New Mexico through its Oil Con­
servation Division hereby gives notice pursuant 
to law and the Rules and Regulations of the Di­
vision of the following public hearing to be held 
at 8:15 A.M. on May 2, 2019, in the Oil Conser­
vation Division Hearing Room at 1220 South St. 
Francis, Santa Fe, New Mexico, before an ex­
aminer duly appoint for the hearing. If you are 
an individual with a disability who is in need of 
a reader, amplifier, qualified sign language in­
terpreter, or any other form of auxiliary aid or 
service to attend or participate in the hearing, 
please contact: Florene Davidson at 505-476-
3458 or through the New Mexico Relay Net­
work, 1-800-659-1779 by April 22, 2019. Pub­
lic documents, including the agenda and mi­
nutes, can be provided in various accessible 
forms. Please contact Florene Davidson if a 
summary or other type of accessible form is 
needed. 

STATE OF NEW MEXICO TO: 
All named parties and persons 
having any right, title, interest 
or claim in the following case 

and notice to the public. 

(NOTE: All land descriptions herein refer to the 
New Mexico Principal Meridian whether or not 
so stated.) 

To:AII overriding royalty interest owners and 
pooled parties, including: Spindletop Oil & Gas 
Company; Marathon Oil Permian, LLC; Jasso 
Living Trust; Colgate Production, LLC; Oxy 
USA, Inc.; Devon Energy Production Company, 
LP; Desert States Energy, Inc.; Desert States 
Energy, Inc.; Primavera Resources, Inc.; Oxy 
USA WTP, Limited Partnership; Llano Natural 
Resources, LLC; J. R. Rowan, Inc.; FR Energy, 
LLC; David J. Sorenson and Bonnie J. Sorenson, 
their heirs and devisees; Williamson Enterpris­
es; Bebe S. Campbell Revocable Trust; DDDF, 
Inc.; Flare Oil Company; Alpha Permian Re­
sources, LLC; Nortex Corporation; James E. 
Kiehne, his heirs and devisees; Camp Colorado 
Investments, LP; Collins Permian, LP; R. C. 
Roberts, his heirs and devisees; Ruth D. Rob­
erts, her heirs and devisees; Prism Energy, 
LLC; Read & Stevens, Inc.; Crystal A. Howard, 
her heirs and devisees; Roy G. Barton Sr. and 
Opal Barton Revocable Trust UTA 1/28/1982; 
Roy G. Barton, Jr., his heirs and devisees; 
Roden Exploration Company; Roden Partici­
pants, Ltd.; Roden Associates, Ltd.; BTA Oil 
Producers, LLC; Black Stone Energy Company, 
LLC; Mourne Oil & Gas; Kathleen A. Phillips, 
her heirs and devisees; David R. Howard, Jr., 
his heirs and devisees; Gary L. Kiehne, his 
heirs and devisees; R. F. Fort, life estate, his 
heirs and devisees; R. F. Fort, Inc.; Norma J. 
Chanley, her heirs and devisees; Skyhouse, 
LLC; CHL Energy, Inc.; Promontory Explora­
tion, LP; Kyle E. Lanham, his heirs and 
devisees; Lisa McKee Lanham, her heirs and 
devisees; Debra H. Roland, her heirs and 
devisees; Southwest Petroleum Corporation; 
Sidney Barry Johnston, his heirs and devisees; 
Ricky D. Raindl, his heirs and devisees; C. Ray 
Allen and Jacqueline W. Allen, their heirs and 



devisees; Lawrence W. Robinette and Sally 
Robinette, their heirs and devisees; Bennett 
Oil & Gas Properties, Inc.; Davis & Harris En­
terprises, LLC; George G. Staley & Sandra H. 
Staley, their heirs and devisees; KMC Trust; 
Maddox Energy Corporation; RSG Trust; Ad­
venture Energy Corporation; Bill M. Burke Liv­
ing Trust, LLC; BK Exploration Corporation; 
Dick Blenden, his heirs and devisees; G. Mi­
chael Shook, his heirs and devisees; Gene A. 
Adams & Brenda L. Adams, their heirs and 
devisees; James B. Diamond, his heirs and 
devisees; Laura Mijangos Kirk, her heirs and 
devisees; Michael J. Levenson, his heirs and 
devisees; Phipps Living Trust; Stephen J. 
Shook, his heirs and devisees; Terry L. Shook, 
his heirs and devisees; W. Thomas McCrae 
and Billye S. McCrae, their heirs and devisees. 

Case No. 20332:Application of Chevron Pro­
duction Company for compulsory pooling, Ed­
dy County, New Mexico. Applicant in the 
above-styled cause seeks an order pooling all 
uncommitted interests in the Wolfcamp forma­
tion [Purple Sage; Wolfcamp (Gas)] in the 640-
acre horizontal spacing unit comprised of the 
E/2 of Section 15 and the E/2 of Section 22 of 
Township 23 South, Range 28 East, NMPM, Ed­
dy County, New Mexico. The above-referenced 
unit will be dedicated to the following proposed 
wells: 

•The CB NIE 15 22 002 No. lH, which will be 
horizontally drilled from a surface hole location 
in the NW/4 NE/4 (Unit B) of Section 15 to a 
bottom hole location in the SW/4 SE/4 (Unit 0) 
of Section 22; 
•The CB NE 15 22 002 No. 2H, which will be 
horizontally drilled from a surface hole location 
in the NW/ 4 NE/4 (Unit B) of Section 15 to a 
bottom hole location in the SE/4 SE/4 (Unit P) 
of Section 22; and 
•The CB NE 15 22 002 No. 3H, which will be 
horizontally drilled from a surface location in 
the NE/4 NE/4 (Unit A) of Section 15 to a bot­
tom hole location in the SE/ 4 SE/4 (Unit P) of 
Section 22. 

The completed interval for the proposed CB NE 
15 22 002H will be within 330' of the quarter­
quarter line separating the W/2 E/2 from the 
E/ 2 E/ 2 of Sections 15 and 22 to allow inclusion 
of this acreage into a standard 640-acre hori­
zontal spacing unit. Pursuant to the Special 
Rules for the Purple Sage; Wolfcamp, the com­
pleted intervals for these wells will comply 
with the 330-foot setback requirement. Since 
the proposed wells will be simultaneously dril ­
led and completed, Chevron requests an exten­
sion of the time period to drill and complete the 
initial well from 120 days to 365 days. Also, to 
be considered will be the cost of drilling and 
completing the wel ls, the allocation of the cost 
thereof, as well as actual operating costs and 
charges for supervision, designation of Chev­
ron Production Company as operator, and a 
200% charge for risk involved in drilling and 
completing the well. Said area is located ap­
proximately 3 miles northeast of Loving, New 
Mexico. 




