
Jones, William V., EMNRD 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Phillips, Dorothy, EMNRD 
Wednesday, July 18, 2012 11:41 AM 
Jones, William V., EMNRD 
RE: Apache 

No, they have not. They need two - Baseball Park No. 4 - 30-015-25584 - $9,600 and Merland No. 1 - 30-015-21036 - $9,518. Will let you know when and if I 
receive them. Have a great day! 

From: Jones, William V., EMNRD 
Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2012 11:37 AM 
To: Phillips, Dorothy, EMNRD 
Subject: RE: Apache 

But not Endurance? 
They also have two wells and said they would post ASAP. 

From: Phillips, Dorothy, EMNRD 
Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2012 10:49 AM 
To: Jones, William V., EMNRD 
Subject: Apache 

Apache has submitted and I have approved the two required bonds on their financial assurance report. The Ys should fall off tomorrow morning as everything 
batches overnight. Thanks 

l 


