
* f Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District 
' O'fljce 

Disnfctl 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District 11 
1301 W. Grand Ave, Artesia, NM 88210 
District 111 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 

State ofNew Mexico 
E^j^y, Minerals and Natural Resources 

OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION 
1220 South St Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe, NM 87505 

Form C-103 
June 19. 2008 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOS/iLS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [*3 Gas WeH • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOS/iLS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [*3 Gas WeH • Other 8. WeH Number 

205 
2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. WeH Location 
Unit Letter C : 1310 feetfromthe N line and 2630 feetfromthe W line 
Section 33 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

y 11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
' V v V : , - '-"--*. ' W 3707GR • 

M . L API NO. 
3002531023 
5. Indicate Type of Lease 

STATE FEE • 
6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E058410000 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: MAINTANANCE/ REPAIR £x] 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED W E L L REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. CHANGED OUT PUMP AND 
TESTED TUBING 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 10/30/90 Rig Release Date: 11/10/90 

I hereby certify that the infonnation above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGN ATU RE / t ^ l ^ ^ l ^ - / ' / / W A TITLE: Authorized Agent _.DATE OU' S.OZfi 
Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: 
Conditions nf Annrnval (if anvV 

^ E-mail address: wbo.vdfffimhak-err.nm r.nm D u r >NE: 307.763.0209 
BEFORE THE OIL CONSERVATION COMMISSION 

Santa Fe, New Mexico 
T I T L E CaseNo 14106 DeNovo Exhibit A £ 

Submitted by: 
Xeric Oil & Gas Corp. 

Hearing Date: February 24. 2009 



Ih 

OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

W E S T P E A R L Q U E E N U N I T 2 0 5 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

1 3 1 0 F N L , 2 6 3 0 F W L 3002531023 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

L e a , N e w M e x i c o 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE,IN FORM ATION 

REPORT DATE 

1 0 / 1 0 / 2 0 0 8 

DAYS SINCE RIG4JP 

2 

TOUR SHEET NO. 

16316 
TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 
RIG CO A NUMBER 

R E E C O W E L L S E R V I C E 

PBTD 

# V A L U E I 

P a g e 3 of 4 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Ace Armann 

Formation Top (II) Btm ( it) Csq Size Csg Type U-rm Top UHm Btm U-rmSiZB Perl Top Port Ban CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

M- • • i. • • . * !l 'I • OPERATION SUMMARY | • 

PRESENT OPERATION - RUN PRODUCTION EQUIPMENT CUMULATIVE COST 

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

$ •• , v . | | . |- , • , „> . ' . „, .DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY . . ; . . . . „ ^ 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS ( M M . M:00 hrs) 

5 :00 13:00 8.00 C R E W D R I V E T O L O C A T I O N F R O M H O B B S . N M 

0.00 N D B O P , S E T A N C H O R C A T H E R IN 28K T E N S I O N 

0.00 TIH W / P U M P A N D R O D S , H U N G W E L L O N . C H E C K P U M P A C T I O N . R D M O 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0 .00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0 .00 

0.00 

T O T A L H O U R S 8.00 



w v t / i w « *» J » | J f J» J/« U M V JU»IAU H i t 

Office*. 
District I 
1625 N. French Dr.. Hobbs, NM 88240 
District 11 
1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District 111 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

State ofNew Mexico 
Minerals and Natural Resources 

O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N DIVISION 
1220 South SL Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe,NM 87505 

Form C-103 
June 19. 2008 

•LL API NO. 
3002532256 

Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE FEE • 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081820002 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 

1. TypeofWell: Oil Well £3 Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

8. Well Number 
220 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

Well Location 
Unit Letter E 
Section 28 

1980 feet from the 
Township 19S 

N line and 440 
Range 35E 

feet from the _ 
NMPM LEA 

W line 
County 

11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
3736.7 GR 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER. • 

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
COMMENCE DRILLING OPNSXJ P AND A • 
CASING/CEMENT JOB • 

OTHER: MAINTANANCE/ REPAIR El 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED W E L L REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. CHANGED OUT PUMP 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 10/14/93 Rig Release Date: 11/3/93 

1 hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE tf.^TCZpe S - TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE QrJ, / £ 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd 1 E-mail address: wbovd@mbakercorD.com PHONE- 307 763 0209 
For State Use Only : : 

APPROVED BY. _TITLE D A T E 

Conditions of Approval (if any): " ~ 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

W E S T P E A R L Q U E E N UNIT 220 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

1980FNL, 440 FWL 3002532256 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico 

Daily Completion Report 

REPORT DATE 

10/11/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

2 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 
RIG CO *. NUMBER 

REECO WELL SERVICE 
PBTD 

#VALUEI 

Page 3 of 4 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Ace Armann 

' I; 1 , 1 - | 11 " I - , • • PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION . . . . . . . .•. j ., 

formation Top (ft) Btm trt) Csg Size Csg Type U-rmTop U-fmBtm U-rmSbe Pert Top Perf Bun CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

I , . - M. •< . : |L * " .OPERATION SUMMARY) » ,. . • 

PRESENT OPERATION - REPLACE VWNEW PUMP 

OLD PUMP IRREPARABLE 

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE & PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

CUMULATIVE COST AFE COSTS 

1; 1 -,- '.- - J,... , [ j r . . . .' DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY . ., -. •, 

FROM 
(his) 

TO 
(his) 

HOURS 
(his) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS | M : M - 08:00 hre) 

0.00 CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, INSPECTED WELL - NOT PUMPING 

0.00 UNHAND WELL, TOOH WI RODS AND PUMP, CHANGE OUT PUMP, TIH WI RODS AND PUMP 
0.00 HUNG WELL BACK ON, FILL TUBING W/15 BBLS OF WATER AND PRESSURE TESTED TO 500 PSI 
0.00 HOT OILED CASING WITH 35 BBLS OF PRODUCED WATER. 
0.00 RDMC 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
TOTAL HOURS 0.00 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District 
Office 
Distrioel 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District 11 
1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District III 
1000 Rio Brazos RA, Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. SL Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

State ofNew Mexico 
Etjspy, Minerals and Natural Resources 

O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N DIVISION 
1220 South S t Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe, N M 87505 

Form C-103 
June 19. 2008 

iLL API NO. 
3002531020 

Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE FEE • 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E015870000 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSAI-S TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT* (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [3 Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

8. Well Number 
190 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE I7S4 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter 
Section 

1440 feet from the 
29 Township 19S 

line and 
Range 35E 

feet from the E line 
NMPM LEA County 

I I . Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
3737 GR 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • 

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
CASING/CEMENT JOB • 

OTHER: MAI NTANANCE/ REPAIR 13 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MvUNTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. CHANGED OUT PUMP. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 10/02/90 Rig Release Date: 10/11/90 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE '//^^^T^y^ J ^ j . ^ - ^ TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE f)r£ , Z#. 

Type or print name: Whitnfê E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd@mbakercoro.com PHONE" 307 763 0209 
For State Use Only : : 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

W E S T P E A R L Q U E E N UNIT 190 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

1440FSL, 90 F E L 3002531020 

County. Stata AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico 

Top ffl Btm {ft) Csg tea 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

Csq Type U-miTop U-tmBtm U-tmSaa Pert Top 

REPORT DATE 

10/9/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

2 

TOUR SHEET NO. 

16314 

TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

RIG CO & NUMBER 

R E E C O W E L L S E R V I C E 

PBTD 

#VALUEI 

Page 3 of 4 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Ace A r m a n n 

OPERATION SUMMARY I 

PRESENT OPERATION - RUN PRODUCTION EQUIPMENT CUMULATIVE COST AFE COSTS 

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS • 

PURPOSE «. PLAN OF THB OPERATION -

l: -I: . • i - • ; f l . - ,}!• \ \ J. ,r • - DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY . i . . - , i , •• . .,<_.• • : jf •• ,» -

FROM 
(Ms) 

TO 
(Ms) 

HOURS 
(hn) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 08:00 hrs) 

5:00 10:00 5.00 CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION 

0.00 RAN F'UMP. HANG PUMP ON. TURN PUMP ON. RETURN WELL TO PRODUCTION 

0.00 RDMCI 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 5.00 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District 
Office. 
District I 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District II 

_ State ofNew Mexico 
%^pgy, Minerals and Natural Resources 

O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N DIVISION 
1220 South S t Francis Dr. 

Form C-103 
June 19. 2008 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District 
Office. 
District I 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District II 

_ State ofNew Mexico 
%^pgy, Minerals and Natural Resources 

O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N DIVISION 
1220 South S t Francis Dr. 

WELL API NO. 
3002531123 

1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District III 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. SL Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

_ State ofNew Mexico 
%^pgy, Minerals and Natural Resources 

O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N DIVISION 
1220 South S t Francis Dr. 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE L3 FEE • 

1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District III 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. SL Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

Santa Fe, N M 87505 6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E074180002 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOS/ILS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT* (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well E l Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOS/ILS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT* (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well E l Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 

182 
2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter I 2563 feet from the S line and 90 feet from the E line 
Section 29 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
3737 GR • 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: MAINTANANCE/ REPAIR | 3 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work)- SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /M AINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. CHANGED OUT PUMP AND 
TESTED TUBING. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 1/26/91 Rig Release Date: 2/5/91 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGN ATUREj^^b^^V Z> y^<^ TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE Q/4 , J f f i 20' 

Type or print name: Whimey E. Boyd ._ E-mail address: wbovd@mbakercoro.com PHONE- 307 763 0209 
For State Use Only 1 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
C o n d i t i o n s n f A n n r r w a l Cif anvV 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

W E S T P E A R L Q U E E N UNIT 182 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

2563FSL, 900 F E L 3002531123 

County, Stato AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico 

'•Vis*9* - t ^ T ^ 

0 I i A - * t T ^ v ' ^ r f 

Top («) Btm (It) Csg Sba 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION .OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

Csg Type LMm Top U-rm Btm U-rm Sim Pert Top 

REPORT DATE 

10/80008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

TOUR SHEET NO. 

16312 

TOTAL OEPTH 

N/A 
RIG CO & NUMBER 

R E E C O W E L L S E R V I C E 
PBTD 

N/A 

Page 1 of 2 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Ace Armann 

OPERATION SUMMARY . 

PRESENT OPERATION - PUMP CHANGE CUMULATIVE COST 

OPERATION NEXT 24HOURS-

PURPOSE » PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (M:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

6:00 14:00 8.00 MOVE IN RIG UP. PRESSURE TEST TBG TO 500 PSI. TESTED OK. UNHUNG WELL. TOOH W/ RODS 

0.00 RODS WERE PARTED AT 100\ COUPLING PARTED ON 4TH ROD, FISHED ROD. CHANGE OUT ROD AND COUPLING, TIH W/ ROD 

0.00 RESEATED PUMP, HANG WELL ON. PUMPED IT UP 

0.00 RDMO 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

o.oo 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
TOTAL HOURS 8.00 



. — . u , m c uisinci State of New Mexico 
p 1 ^^, E n £ ^ , Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District 11 / - V I I rTYMCTTDA/ A T i r i X T TYn/TQIfYrJ 

Form C-103 
/>% June 19. 2008 

wfeCL API NO. 
3002503341 

1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 ° 1 L C O N b b K V A 1 I O N D 1 V 1 M O N 
District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos R<L, Aztec, NM 87410 c . c „ XTAA o n r n r 
District IV S a n t a F e > ^ 8 7 5 0 5 

1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE • FEE • 

1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 ° 1 L C O N b b K V A 1 I O N D 1 V 1 M O N 
District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos R<L, Aztec, NM 87410 c . c „ XTAA o n r n r 
District IV S a n t a F e > ^ 8 7 5 0 5 

1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSA LS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well EJ Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
SOUTH PEARL QUEEN UN!IT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSA LS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well EJ Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 22 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754, HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pooi name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter A : 330 feet from the F line and 660 teet from the E line 
Section 9 Township 20S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

- . " • -' I I . Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc) » • : ''• «V"7"7 'TC^l ' V&V- - • 

12. Check Ap propriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO. SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNSTJ P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTENANCE t3 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. HOT OILED WELL AND 
PERFORMED A SWAB TEST 

SWAB RESULTS - TOTAL RECOV ERED 55.86 BBLS OF FLUID AS FOLLOWS: 4837 BBLS WATER AND 7.19 BBLS OF 
OIL 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOV ER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 3/8/61 R i g R e l e a s e ^ 3 f 2 m , 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

/ ; / / 7 ' 
SIGNATURE?2^^^^v.//^ / f r ^ y l TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE f ) d ' . J f t JZfYjfi 

Type or print name: Wlritaey E. Boyd E-mail address: wbovd(a).mbakercorp.com PHONE" 307 763 0209 
For State Use Only : : '-

APPROVED BY: TITLE D A T E 

Conditions of Approval (if any): ' 



(1 

OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil And Gas 
WELL NAME 

S o u t h P e a r l Q u e e n # 2 2 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

s e c . 9 ; T 2 0 S ; R 3 5 E 30-02543341 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

L e a , N e w M e x i c o 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

REPORT DATE 

10/24/2008 
DAYS SINCE RtG-UP 

3 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5050" 
RIG CO & NUMBER 

REECO 
PBTD 

5,004 

P a g e S o f S WELLSTTE SUPERVBOR 

M i c h a e l L . W i r e d 

Formation Top (tl) Btm (ft) Csg Size Csg Type U-rm Top It-fm Btm U r m Size Perl Top Perl Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4868 4870 

4962 4957 

4962 4970 

OPERATION SUMMARY 

PRESENT OPERATION -

OPERATION NEXT 14 HOURS -

PURPOSE I PLAN OF THB OPERATION -

CUMULATIVE COST 

DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

8 :00 8:30 0.50 Ar r ive late to rig, acc ident o n hwy. w a r m up, prepare to S w a b 

8:30 10:00 1.50 T a g fluid in tbg (9) 900 ' : m a k e 6 swab runs, recovered 13bbl of f lu id , 10:00 

10:00 10:30 0.50 Let sit for 30 min 

10:30 11:00 0.50 T a g fluid in tbg @ 16CW; m a k e 3 swab runs, recovered 2bbl of f lu id . To ta l recovered= 55 .86 bbl fluid, 48.57 H 2 0 : 7 . 1 9 B O 

11:00 12:00 1.00 secure we l l ; R D M O 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

O.OO 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0 .00 

0 .00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0 .00 

0.00 

0 .00 

T O T A L H O U R S 4 .00 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District State o f N e w M e x i c o 

Jj^j^t j l(ijpgy» Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District 11 r"tTl / • V \ M < S I 7 J D V A T T # " I T J T i r V / l Q I ^ T J 

Form C-103 
(T ^ June 19, 2008 
WELL API NO. 
3002531106 

1301 W Grand Ave, Artesia, NM 88210 U l L C O N b L K V A 1 1 U N D I V I M O N 
District ffl 1220 South St Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd. Aztec, NM 87410 c c XT\A* o - jcnc 
District rv S a n t a F e - NM 8 7 5 0 5 

1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE • FEE ^ 

1301 W Grand Ave, Artesia, NM 88210 U l L C O N b L K V A 1 1 U N D I V I M O N 
District ffl 1220 South St Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd. Aztec, NM 87410 c c XT\A* o - jcnc 
District rv S a n t a F e - NM 8 7 5 0 5 

1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil WeH 13 Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
EAST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil WeH 13 Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 77 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter I : 2563 feet Irom the S line and 40 feet trom the E line 
Section 28 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

T .'J. f . J \ ' '„• - r V , I 11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) ~"< '• i r - " J , 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTENANCE 13 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /M AINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. HOT OILED WELL AND 
PERFORMED A SWAB TEST 

SWAB RESULTS: RECOVERED TOTAL OF 66.1 BBLS WATER AND TRACE OF OIL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 12/22/90 Rig Release Date: 1/5/91 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE A 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: 

TITLE: Authorized Agent 

E-mail address: wbovd@mbakercorp.coiT. 

Conditions of Approval (if any): 
TITLE 

. PHONE: 307.763.0209 

DATE 



< 

OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas 
WELL NAME 

East Pearl Queen #77 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

sec.28;T19S; R35E 3002531106 
County, State AFE NUMBER 

L e a , New Mex ico 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

REPORT DATE 

10/23/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

4 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5025' 

RIG CO *. NUMBER 

Reeco#116 

PBTD 

4934" 

Page 1 of 6 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Michael L. A l l red 

Formation Top (ft) Btm (ft) Csg Size Csg Type U r m Top U-im Btm U^mSize Pert Top Perf Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4867 4869 

4855 4857 

4800 4807 

4S88 4698 

OPERATION SUMMARY '• ' 

PRESENT OPERATION- RDMO CUMULATIVE COST 

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE t PLAN OF THS OPERATION -

DAILY, COMPLETION SUMMARY 

FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

7:00 9:00 2.00 RDMO 

0.00 Poustjouts move rod and tubing to yard 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 2.00 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

District! E^H^y, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr , Hobbs, NM 88240 
District II ^ / - > X I Q T 7 1 T > \ / A TTTiTrvi r i T \ / T Q I / ^ i M 

Form C-103 
June 19, 2008 

WELL API NO. 
3002530869 

1301 W. Grand Ave, Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C U N b L K V A 1 I O N U I V l b l U N 
District in 1220 South St Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd . Aztec, NM 87410 0 . r x i t . * o i c n c 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE H FEE • 

1301 W. Grand Ave, Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C U N b L K V A 1 I O N U I V l b l U N 
District in 1220 South St Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd . Aztec, NM 87410 0 . r x i t . * o i c n c 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081840G03 

SUNDRY NOTICIiS AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSAI ̂ S TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPUCAIilON FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well S Gis Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
EAST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICIiS AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSAI ̂ S TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPUCAIilON FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well S Gis Well • Other 8. Well Number 84 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter M : 265 feet from the S line and 10 feet from the W line 
Section 27 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM County LEA 

~ j-*. ,~» ' ' ~ f' ' 11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
« *' * . 7 3713GR i : ^ - ^ - ^ ^ : : - ^ ' 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE/SWAB L3 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed wort:). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. ALSO PERFORMED A SWAB TEST, 
REPLACED 3 BAD TUBING JOINTS 

SWAB RESULTS: RECOVERED TOTAL OF 139 BBLS FLUID. OF WHICH 135 BBLS WATER AND 4.5 BBLS OIL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 5/28/1990 Rig Release Date: 6/10/1990 

I hereby certify that the information atwve is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE^^^'^/^ TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE Qrk 1 g, Xt'M 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Bovd! . E-mail address: wbovd@.mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



v.-; 

OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

E A S T P E A R L Q U E E N UNIT 084 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

265 F S L , 10 FWL 3002530869 

County, Stole AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico 

Top (It) 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

Csg Size Csg Type U-miTop U-rni Btm U-rm Size Part Top 

REPORT DATE 

10/17/2008 
DAYS SINCE WGMJP 

TOUR SHEET NO. 

16451 
TOTAL DEPTH 

RIG CO & NUMBER PBTD 

Page 1 of 4 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Ace Armann 

OPERATION SUMMARY 

PRESENT OPERATION - MIRU. PULL RODS AND TUBING CUMULATIVE COST 

OPERATION NEXT M HOURS-

PURPOSES PLAN OF THB OPERATION-

. DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(his) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

10:00 18:00 8.00 CREW AND RIG TRAVEL TO LOCATION. RU AND SETUP. BLEED OFF WELL 

0.00 PULLED POLISHED ROD; PUT 3 GAL OF CORROSION INHIBITOR. MIXED WI 5 GAL DIESEL DOWN TUBING 

0.00 ROOH LD SUCKER RODS. RODS PARTED 

0.00 

0.00 NU BOP ON CASING. PRESSURE TEST TUBING, NO TEST. TOOH STAND 42 JTS OF 2-7/8" TUBING. INSPECTED TUBING LOOKED 

0.00 FOR HOLES IN THE TUBING. CLOSED WELL AND SDFN 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 CREW TRAVELED BACK TO TOWN 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 8.00 



ouuuiH J v_opics i o Appropriate District 
Office -

District 1 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District n 
1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District 111 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

State ofNew Mexico 
Minerals and Natural Resources 

O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N DIVISION 
1220 South S t Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe, NM 87505 

Form C-103 
June 19. 2008 

API NO. 
3002531121 
5. Indicate Type of Lease 

STATE FEE • 
6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E058380005 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR P R O P O S / L L S TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreerr ent Name 
EAST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

8. Well Number 82 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter_K 
Section 27 

1500 feet from the S 
Township 19S 

line and 1410 

Range 35E 

feetfromthe W line 
NMPM 

|" 11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc) 
3721 GL 

County LEA 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • 

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
CASING/CEMENT JOB • 

OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTENANCE IS 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dales, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAIN A NCR WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. REPLACED 2 BAD TUBING 
JOINTS, CIRCULATED W/ HOT OIL, REPLACED THE PUMP, RETURNED TO PRODUCTION. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 1/16/1991 Rig Release Date: 1/27/1991 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 

TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE C'A., 2-5* Z(Tf> 

E-mail address: wboyd@mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 

TITLE DATE 



OPERATOR e 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

^.".57 PEARL QUEEN UNIT 082 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

1500 FSL, 1410 FWL 3002531121 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico 

W M ! 
V ^ f T O U R SHEET NO. 

16324 

[REPORT DATE 

10/16/2008 

Daily Completion Report 

RIG CO & NUMBER 

REECO WELL SERVICE 

Page 3 of 6 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

2 
TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

#VALUE! 

WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Ace Armann 

j\*^v'-^>?v:^OPERATION SUMMARY^;^?s^j;^^$^*^m~*&9'*>«W 

PRESENT OPERATION - PULL RODS, TUBING, CIRCULATE HOT OIL, REPLACE BAD JOINT, CUMULATIVE COST 

OPERATION NEXT I t HOURS- RERUN PUMP 

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THB OPERATION-

| K''k V.'-**:. ' «'>PAILy.ePMPLETIPN-S.UMN!ARJtt.^ A V y - * ' " ^ A ; * ! ' • ' '- ••V-tv ' ' • 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 his) 

5:00 18:00 13.00 RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION FROM HOBBS, NM 

0.00 UNHANG WELL, UNSEAT PUMP. PULLED SUCKER RODS. RODS AND PUMP. RU HOT OILER AND CIRCULATE WELL W/ 75 BBLS OF WATER 

0.00 W/ CHEMICAL SURFACTOR. CIRULCATED TO FLOWLINE. DROP STANDING VALVE. PRESSURE TESTED TUBING - NO TEST. 

0.00 

0.00 NU BOP, TOOH W/ TBG, PERFORATED SUB AND MUD ANCHOR. TALLY AND INSPECT TUBING, FIND HOLE IN THE TUBING IN JT #119 FROM S 
0.00 REPLACED 2 BAD JOINTS. GO BACK IN THE HOLE. TRIPPED BACK IN HOLE W/ MUD ANCHOR. PERF SUB, SEATING NIPPLE. AND 128 JOINTS 
0.00 2 -7* " TUBING. - MUD ANCHOR IS 2 JOINTS ABOVE SEATING NIPPLE . SET TAC (S 24,000 # TENSION. ND WELL, ND BOP. 
0.00 NU WELLHEAD. CLOSED WELL AND SHUT DOWN. 
0.00 

0.00 SEATING NIPPLE AT SSOaSff 

0.00 

0.00 TAC m 3937' 

0.00 

0.00 BTM MUD ANCHOR @-3943' 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 NOTE!: 
0.00 SEE PAGE DAY 2P1 FOR PULL/ RUN REPORT 

0.00 

0.00 
TOTAL HOURS 13.00 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District 
Office " 
District 1 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District II 
1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District HI 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

t State o f N e w Mexico 
gy, Minerals and Natural Resources 

O I L CONSERVATION DIVISION 
1220 South St. Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe, N M 87505 

Form C-103 
June 19. 2008 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 167 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter O 1215 feetfromthe S line and 1325 feetfromthe E line 
Section 29 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
3753 GR 

WELL API NO. 
3002523313 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE Eg FEE • 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E058400008 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • 

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
CASING/CEMENT JOB • 

OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE 0 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. SWAB TESTED WELL. 

RESULTS OF SWAB TEST: 8 BBLS OIL, 87 BBLS WATER 
INITIAL FLUID LEVEL: 400' 
FINAL FLUID LEVEL: 4460' 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 12/22/90 Rig Release Date: 1/5/91 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE ^ f ^ r Z ^ r - t f -/SL*>*£- TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE iWqv , ~| , 1CY^> 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd@inbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



m 

OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 167 

LEOAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

sec. 29;T19S; R35E 30425-23313 
County, State AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mex ico 

•• .* 1 < VS"- * i " j i 5" J1 i * 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

REPORT DATE 

10/24/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

1 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5050' 

RIG CO & NUMBER 

R e e c o # 1 1 6 

PBTD 

5013' 

Page 1 of 4 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Michae l L, Al ined 

Formation Top (tt) Btm ( It) Csq Size Csg Type U-rm Top U-rm Btm U-rm Size Port Top Perl Brm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4757 4758 

4887 4888 

4958 4960 

OPERATION SUMMARY ! 

PRESENT OPERATION - Lay down rods and tubinc i DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

OPERATION NEXT 2* HOURS-

PURPOSE «. PLAN OF THB OPERATION -

• I ; , .* <?./: J / | - L , - ; -H DAILY .COMPLETION SUMMARY, : ;•.••».".. . ; • 
FROM 
(hra) 

TO 
(hra) 

HOURS 
(hra) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 00:00 hrs) 

12:00 13:00 1.00 MIRU, 

13:00 14:00 1.00 open well, 50psi on tubing, ND wellhead, LD 8" polish rod 

14:00 16:30 2.50 LD 62 its 1" fiberglass rods w 7/8- pin: LD 81 7/8" steel rods (class D), LD 1 10' pony rod; and 2.5"x 2" X 16' rod pump w 6' 1 1/4" gas anchor 

16:30 17:00 0.50 NUB0P 

17:00 18:30 1.50 Stand hack 149 jts J-55 2 7/8* tubing , 2 IKS seating nipple, 4" perforated sub and bull plug 

18:30 19:00 0.50 secure wellhead, SDFN 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 7.00 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
10/24/2008 P. 2 Of 4 

.'• 
3 fc#v ; t>^ - PULL REPORT ;, W v.,-. . {••p - • ;•,-'( 

PULLED FROM DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH | QTY 

$ 8.00 1 1-1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4'X7/8" ROD SUB 

37.2 62 1" FG RODS 
25 81 7/8" STEEL RODS 
10 1 1" RODS ON BOTTOM 

1-3/4" X 4' PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

31.5 149 2-7/8" , J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 

16 1 
1 

1- 3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4' PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 

o
o

o
o

 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oi l and Gas Corp 

WEU. NAME 

W e s t Peart Queen # 167 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

sec . 29 ;T19S; R35E 30-025-23313 

County. Stato AFE NUMBER 

Lea , New Mex ico 

Daily Completion Report 

. PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION , 

REPORT DATE 

10/25/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG4JP 

2 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5050' 

RIG CO A NUMBER 

R e e c o # 1 1 6 

PBTD 

5013' 

Page 3 of 4 WELLSTTE SUPERVISOR 

M ichae l L. A l l r ed 

Fofntation Top (11) Btm (tt) Csg Size CsflType U-fm Top U-rmBtm IMmSize Port Top Perf Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4757 4758 

4897 4898 

4959 4980 

f . OPERATION SUMMARYl 

• • -\ 
PRESENT OPERATION - Swab DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE 8V PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

h i f . . ^ s , . ' : . | ' |»>r-«. • -'j DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY- . . f * ••• ,% . ... 

FROM 
(hr.) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (00:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

7:00 9:30 2.50 Warm up, TIH w 148 jts 2 7/8" J-55 tbg and 2 7/8' SN 

9:30 10:30 1.00 rig to run swab 

10:30 15:00 4.50 Swab well with 2 7/8" swab cups, recover 87bbl H20 and 8bbl Oil, Total fluid recovered 95bbl 

0.00 Initial fluid depth @ 400'; final fluid depth @ 4460' 

16:00 17:30 1.50 TOOH 60 its 2 7/8" tbg. ND BOP; 80 JTS 2 7/8" tbg and 2 7/8" seating nipple set @: landed rn wellhead 

17:30 18:30 1.00 secure location: RD SDFN 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 10.50 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
10/25/2008 P. 4 Of 4 

• • [pi. 4 f t ^ r ^ « C v i ; RUN - P U L L R E P O R T ; j { . . : ; ; ^ » : ; . / ^ ; \ ^ . ^ : .id, '.}' J»,v • « : . ; 

PULLED FROM 
WELL 

DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL 

LENGTH | QTY LENGTH | QTY 

$ 8.00 1 

37.2 62 
25 81 
10 1 

31.5 149 

16 1 
1 

1- 1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4 ,X7/8" ROD SUB 
1" FG RODS 
7/8" STEEL RODS 
1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4" PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

2- 7/8", J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 
1- 3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4' PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 

0 
0 
0 
0 

$ 31.50 $ 80.00 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District (^J> S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office " 

D j s t r i c t , Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w l r a n d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District ui 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 o * rr \ i u o i c n c 

District iv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

y j Form C-103 
June 19, 2008 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District (^J> S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office " 

D j s t r i c t , Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w l r a n d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District ui 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 o * rr \ i u o i c n c 

District iv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

WELL API NO. 
3002525365 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District (^J> S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office " 

D j s t r i c t , Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w l r a n d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District ui 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 o * rr \ i u o i c n c 

District iv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE S FEE • 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District (^J> S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office " 

D j s t r i c t , Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w l r a n d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District ui 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 o * rr \ i u o i c n c 

District iv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081830004 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 169 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter N 1305 feetfromthe S line and 2565 feetfromthe W line 
Section 28 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

Wi " ' ' 11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) ' ^ f f ^ S ^ & ^ ^ ^ H ^ 

M -ttU¥V'^ * 3707 GR mfmS^mmmm 
12. Check A ppropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE S 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. SWAB TESTED WELL. 

RESULTS OF SWAB TEST: 0 BBLS OIL, 58 BBLS WATER 
INITIAL FLUID LEVEL: 200' 
FINAL FLUID LEVEL: 2200' 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 12/22/90 Rig Release Date: 1/5/91 

I hereby certify that the infonnation above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE / 7 S J £ Z s ^ S j £ ~ ' - / J ^ < - ^ C ~ TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE 1\\, M . "1 2 ( W s 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd(a)mbakercorp.corn PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric O i l and Gas Corp 

WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen #169 

LEGAL LOCATION I API NUMBER 

sec.28; T19S; R35E 30-025-25365 

County, SUto AFE NUMBER 

Lea, NewMexico WPQ-169 

I: • -. <!•]•; •• • 4. . .•; 1 : P R O D U C T I O N O B J E C T I V E I N F O R M A T I O N • ., , l . •,. • '.{. •' I ' 
Formation TOP (ni Ban (ft) Csg Stz* CsflType U-rm Top u-fmBtm IMmSbo Port Top Port Btm CHARGE PHASINO SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4721 4727 

4846 4650 

4910 4913 

4922 4926 

i '. r. ' , O P E R A T I O N S U M M A R Y , . 5 ,, - ; 4 ;*:* ' ;'. ...... ,•'.»-!• :t -;• PRESENT OPERATION- Pull rods and tubing DAILY COST [CUMULATIVE COST AFE COSTS 

i * 
OPERATION NEXT 14 HOURS - S W A B 

Daily Completion Report 

REPORT OATE 

10/27/2008 

Page 1 of 6 

DAYS SINCE RKS4IP 

1 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL OEPTH 

5000' 

RIG CO & NUMBER 

Reeco #116 

PBTD 

5000" 

WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Michael L. Allred 

PURPOSES. PLAN OF THIS OPERATION-

»' • • ; f- . , 
' * ? ; - " ' ' • ' i > i . , - -v'DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY . • * v - • ' , 

FROM 
(hra) 

TO 
|hn>) 

HOURS 
(hfS) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (06:00 hr»| 

7:00 7:30 0.50 Move tn Reeco #116, one anchor missing 

7:30 12:30 5.00 Find broken anchor, wait on anchor truck 

12:30 13:00 0.50 RU. ND wellhead. 

13:00 14:00 1.00 LD 88 7/8" X 25' class D rods; UD 39 3/4" X 25 class D rods; rods are parted and very corroded. 

14:00 18:00 4.00 NU BOP. LD 79 its 2 7/8" J-55 tbg; retrieved 2408'; tbg parted @ collar: ND BOP 

18:00 18:30 0.50 secure: well; SDFN 

O.OO 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 11-S0 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
10/27/2008 P. 2 Of 6 

ff|!^^w^--RUN - PULL REPORT-:A '^C^.. -s^-^^my 

PULLED FROM 
WELL 

DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH | QTY 

$ 12.00 1 

39 
88 

79 

1- 1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4'X7/8" ROD SUB 
3/4"X 25' RODS 
7/8" STEEL RODS 
1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4' PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

2- 7/8" , J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 
1- 3/4"X16" PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4' PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 
2 7/8" seating nipple 0 

0 
0 
0 

$ 31.50 $ 76.00 

$ 1.25 $ 1.00 



OPERATOR 

Xeric O i l and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

West Pea r l Queen #169 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

s e c . 2 8 ; T19S; R35E 30-025-25365 

County, Stato AFE NUMBER 

L e a , New Mex ico WPQ-169 

Daily Completion Report 

'«*. : . PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

REPORT DATE 

10/28/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

2 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5000' 
RIG CO & NUMBER 

Reeco #116 
PBTD 

5000' 

Page 3 of 6 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

M i c h a e l L A l l r ed 

Formation Top f t ) Btm(R) Csg Size CsflType O-fmTop U-rm Btm U-fmSbo Pott Top Pert Btm CHARGE PHASMG SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4721 4727 

4846 4850 

4910 4913 

4922 4920 

li,.4.,... -,-.v. .OPERATION SUMMARY} " 

PRESENT OPERATION -

OPERATION NEXT 1 * HOURS -

Swab DAILY COST CUMULATIVE COST AFE COSTS 

$ 

PURPOSE* PLAN OF THB OPERATION-

-i f . . . » ' f . •-•Iif"-' v.- 4' |^b. , . - "A •....<.. . ' w D A I L Y COMPLETION SUMMARY '• t, • :> , v - , • 
FROM 
(t"S) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (04:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

7:00 8:30 1.50 Warm up rig. PU 16 jts picked through 2 7/8" J-55 tbg and 2 7/8" standard seating nipple 

8:30 11:00 2.50 Transfer 60 its 2 I I S j-55 tbg to location ; TIH, Total 78JTS + seating nipple 

11:00 12:00 1.00 Rig up to SWAB 

12:00 14:00 2.00 Swab well wit 2 7/78" swab cups, recover 55bbl, Initial fluid depth+200'; last swab dry 

14:00 14:30 0.50 let well sit 1/2 hour 

14:30 15:15 0.75 swab well, recover 3 bbl, total 58bbl H20. no OIL: last swab pulled dry: final fluid depth 2200' 

15:15 15:30 0.25 RD swab equipment 

15:30 16:00 0.50 RDMO, rig broke axel leaving location. 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
TOTAL HOURS 9.00 



(.1 0 

COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
10/28/2008 P. 4 of 6 

t S " c 
? * • R U N - PULL REPORT^ V ^ . ^ .yt ' iV z 1 ^ * I f f •• 

• .. • "si PULLED FROM DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH | QTY 

$ 12.00 1 1-1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4'X7/8" ROD SUB 

39 3/4"X 25' RODS 
88 7/8" STEEL RODS 

1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4" PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

79 2-7/8", J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBI NG SUB 
1- 3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4" PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 

$ 31.50 $ 76.00 

2 7/8" seating nipple 

o
o

o
o

 

$ 1.25 $ 1.00 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen #169 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

sec.28; T19S; R35E 30-025-25365 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico WPQ-169 
Daily Completion Report 

REPORT DATE 

10/29/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

3 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5000' 
RIG COS NUMBER 

Pate 
PBTD 

5000" 

Page 5 of 6 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Michael L. Allied 

I- i'-v •• '• "-• °*%f'\"i ' • * ' !.( ,. ' ; > -PRODUCTION, OBJECTIVE INFORMATION, - - i . -° " 
Forrrkation Top (tt) Btni ffl) Csg Size CsflType U-rm Top U-im Btm U-cmStzo Port Top Pert Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4721 4727 

4846 4BS0 

4910 4913 

4922 4926 

OPERATION SUMMARY |, „ % 

PRESENT OPERATION - Rot] conosion inhibitor ard broode [nio casing DAILY COST J CUMULATIVE COST I AFE COSTS 

$ * 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

».V«DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY ' ; 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (MOO - M M his) 

7:00 9:00 2.00 Reeco rig broke down in location access, kill truck tries to pull out. gets stuck in sft spot, wait for winch truck 
9:00 10:00 1.00 Pud rig back onto location, repair road. Ml Pate Trucking Kit truck 

10:00 11:00 1.00 RU Pale kill truck to casing, tubing to frac tank, roll in 50bbl inhibitor and biocide ffl 3 bbl / min: circulate 1 bbl to tank: 
11:00 12:00 1.00 SI tubing, bullhead fluid into casing, pressure to 600PSI, unable to establish injection rate, open tbg and circulate 5 (total 55bbl)bbl. 
12:00 12:30 0.50 RDMO Pate Trucking 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 Note! junk left in well, Top of parted tubing 2409" 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
TOTAL HOURS 5.50 



m 

COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
10/29/2008 P. 6 Of 6 

^#v1s^4I^Tfe^^^%RUN - PULL.REP0RT.%s<^^ '4fa&j&&'f 

PULLED FROM 
WELL 

DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH | QTY 

$ 12.00 1 

39 
88 

79 

1- 1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4'X7/8" ROD SUB 
3/4"X 25' RODS 
7/8" STEEL RODS 
1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4' PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

2- 7/8" , J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 
1- 3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4' PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 
2 7/8" seating nipple 0 

0 
0 
0 

$ 31.50 $ 76.00 

$ 1.25 $ 1.00 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District Q p S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office 
District I Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w n G r a n d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District m 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ „ x n / o i c n c 

D i s l r i c t , v Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

Q Form C-103 
June 19,2008 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District Q p S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office 
District I Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w n G r a n d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District m 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ „ x n / o i c n c 

D i s l r i c t , v Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

WELL API NO. 
3002521772 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District Q p S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office 
District I Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w n G r a n d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District m 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ „ x n / o i c n c 

D i s l r i c t , v Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE • FEE [ 3 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District Q p S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office 
District I Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w n G r a n d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District m 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ „ x n / o i c n c 

D i s l r i c t , v Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [X] Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
SOUTH PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [X] Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 003 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter D : 1000 feetfromthe N line and 990 feetfromthe W line 
Section 3 Township 20S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

- t # • • 11 Elevation <Show whether DR- K™- RT>GR- etc> WM^M&MMW§ 
3685 GR ^ # i ! r ^ ^ » 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNSO P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE [g] 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. SWAB TESTED WELL. 

RESULTS OF SWAB TEST: 0 BBLS OIL, 44 BBLS WATER 
INITIAL FLUD3 LEVEL: 500' 
FINAL FLUID LEVEL: 3300' 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 12/22/90 Rig Release Date: 1/5/91 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

?/ 

SIGNATURE ^ ( • / m r r ^ - ^ - f / ^ . ' / ) c ^ ^ ^ TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE Hr?v."l , 7 r A f 3 > 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd , E-mail address: wboydtfljmbakercorp.com PHONE. 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

Sou th Pear l Queen # 3 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

s e c . 3 ; T20S; R35E 30-025-21772 

County, Stato AFE NUMBER 

Lea , New Mex ico S P Q 0 0 3 

' W « i f 

ED 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE.INFORMATION 

REPORT DATE 

11/1/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

1 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5,040 

RIG C O S NUMBER 

Reeco #116 

PBTD 

5,026 

Page 1 of 8 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

M ichae l L A l l i e d 

Formation Top (ft) Btmirt) Csg 8iz* CsoTypo l i -an Top U-rm Btm U-rmStzo Port Top Port Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4.5 4747 4748 

4935 4936 

4969 4970 

4981 4982 

li' <•- '••?<>•<•, •.•{•,'..•- yA:'-j- . . . O P E R A T I O N S U M M A R Y } .;• , '•! JK" *• '„,:y 

OPERATION NEXT « HOURS -

PRESENT OPERATION - MIRU, Pull rods DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST | AFE COSTS 

PURPOSE t PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

1; I « ^ * . > DA ILY C O M P L E T I O N S U M M A R V • . . •:• } • I 

FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

13:00 14:30 1.50 MIRU ND wellhead: hg to pull rods, rods very tight, rods parted (8 box at 200' ( 8 rods): 

14:30 15:00 0.50 Tbg in well is 2 3/8": BOP rigged for 2 7/8". send BOP in for refit: SDFN 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 
o.oo 
0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 2.00 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
11/1/2008 P. 2 of 8 

PULLED FROM 
WELL 

DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH | QTY 

25 8 

1-1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4'X7/8" ROD SUB 
1" FG RODS 
3/4" STEEL RODS 
1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4' PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

2-7/8" , J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 
1- 3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4" PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 

0 
0 
0 
0 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

S o u t h Pear t Queen # 3 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

s e c . 3 ; T20S; R35E 30-025-21772 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

L e a , New Mexico SPQ003 

Daily Completion Report 

• PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

REPORT DATE 

11/3/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

2 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5,040 
RIG CO A NUMBER 

Reeco #116 
PBTD 

5,026 

Page 3 of 8 WELLSTTE SUPERVISOR 

Michael L. Allred 

Formation Top (ft) Btm (ft) Csg Size Csg Type U-rm Top U-fTD Btm U-rm8lzo Port Top Pert Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4.5 4747 4748 

4935 4936 

4969 4970 

49a 1 4982 

OPERATION SUMMARY I 

PRESENT OPERATION - Pull Rods; and tubing DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST |AFE COSTS 

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

V « [ - . ' = . : ; • . ; • [ - ' i \ k - ^ . f i r .1 - DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY. •>,-, ,v-..»v 

FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (MrOO - 0«:00 hrs) 

7:00 13:00 6.00 NU BOP. oull 1 it 2 3/8" tbg: RIH w 8 rods, pud on rods: TOOH w 18 rods, rods parted, fish rods, pud 136 rods, rods parted 

13:00 17:00 4.00 Pull tbg, stand up good. LD down bad(hotes); recover 4421.97" (144 its) 2 3/8" j-55 tbg. Tbg parted 

0.00 Secure weiB. SDFN 

0.00 

0.00 Recovered 3850' rods 

0.00 Recovered 4422' tbg 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 10.00 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
11/3/2008 P. 4 Of 8 

RUN - PULL REPORT-*-.^?.-.SrP'-^K*'^^- • • A' .. .» . ' 

PULLED FROM 
WELL 

DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL 

LENGTH | QTY LENGTH | QTY 

25 154 

4422 144 

1- 1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4'X7/8" ROD SUB 
1" FG RODS 
3/4" STEEL RODS 
1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4' PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

2- 3/8" , J-55, TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 
1- 3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4' PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 

0 
0 
0 
0 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

S o u t h Pea r l Queen # 3 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

s e c . 3 ; T20S; R35E 30-025-21772 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

L e a , New Mexico S P Q 0 0 3 

3*.vraK-fl "̂ f̂  

Daily Completion Report 

REPORT DATE 

11/4/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

3 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5,040 
RIG CO & NUMBER 

Reeco #116 
PBTD 

0 

Page 5 of 8 WELLSTTE SUPERVISOR 

Michael L. Al l ied 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION „ 
Formation Top f t ) Btm (It) Csg Size Csg Typo U-rm Top U-rm Bull U-rm S t n Port Top Port Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 4.5 4747 4748 

4935 4936 

4969 4970 

4981 4982 

OPERATION SUMMARY] 

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS-

PRESENT OPERATION - Swab DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST | AFE COSTS 

PURPOSE & PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

| : * ' •DAILY C O M P L E T I O N S U M M A R Y - . . . . . . V ; , V t ' 

7:00 12:00 5.00 Pick ttiru tubing, replace 20 tubing collars. TIH w 113 jts 2 3/8" j-55 tbg. seat nipple (8} 3453' 

12:00 16:30 4.50 Swab, recover 44 bbl of water, no oil: initial fluid level @ 500'. final fluid level ffl 3300' 

16:30 17:00 0.50 SI well, secure location, SDFN 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
O.OO 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
TOTAL HOURS 10.00 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
11/4/2008 P. 6 of 8 

UN - PULL REPO RT-;. j ^ 

PULLED FROM 
WELL 

DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH QTY 

200 

1- 1/4" POLISHIED ROD 
4'X7/8" ROD SUB 
1" FG RODS 
3/4" STEEL RODS 
1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4' PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

2- 3/8", J-55, TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 
1- 3/4"X16" PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4' PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 

$ 3,453.00 $ 144.00 

0 
0 
0 
0 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Ofl and Gas Corp 

WELL NAME 

Sou th Pear l Queen # 3 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

s e c . 3 ; T20S; R35E 30-025-21772 

County, Stoto AFE NUMBER 

Lea , New Mex ico SPQ003 

•* f * K - i t * * La *-J uL-Mt U 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

REPORT DATE 

11/5/2008 

DAYS SINCE RKMJP 

4 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5,040 

Rta CO A NUMBER 

Reeco #116 

PBTD 

5,026 

Page 7 of8 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

M i c h a e l L. A l l i e d 

Formation Top (ft) Btm(f l) Csg Size Csg Type U-rni Top U-< i i i B t m U^mSize Pari Top Part Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen 45 4747 4748 

4935 4936 

4969 4970 

4981 4982 

PRESENT OPERATION -

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

OPERATION SUMMARY. 

Swab RDMO DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST |AFE COSTS 

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

| 1 i, . : -• [ fv .; JJ I*'- •».--,-; • j .DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY >, ' - .-•=.'>;•??.;•• - i * . • i. ••»>•• 

FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAJLY OPERATIONS (0r>:fJO . <K:00 hrs) 

7:00 9:00 2.00 Warm up swab, recover 3 bbl of water, no oil, initial fluid level 1900'; final fluid level 3300' 

0.00 RDMO windy 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 Recovered 47 bbl of water 

0.00 

0.00 Note ! Left junk in well; top of rods 3850', Top ot tubinq 4422' 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

O.OO 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 2.00 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
11/5/2008 P. 8 of 8 

' . :• i,:^%^-;?!:^^^^^^/v^^A^iRUN - PULL REPORT^0^ :'^^H^»S\^ 

PULLED FROM 
WELL 

DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL 

LENGTH | QTY LENGTH | QTY 

25 8 

1- 1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4"X7/8" ROD SUB 
1" FG RODS 
3/4" STEEL RO DS 
1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4' PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

2- 7/8" , J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 
1- 3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X A' PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 

0 
0 
0 
0 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office 

D i s t r i c t j Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

m i W ^ d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882.0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ ^ „ X T . . oncnc 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

Form C-103 
June 19, 2008 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office 

D i s t r i c t j Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

m i W ^ d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882.0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ ^ „ X T . . oncnc 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

WELL API NO. 
3002535894 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office 

D i s t r i c t j Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

m i W ^ d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882.0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ ^ „ X T . . oncnc 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE • FEE • 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 
Office 

D i s t r i c t j Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

m i W ^ d Ave., Artes.a, NM 882.0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ ^ „ X T . . oncnc 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [x] Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
SOUTH PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [x] Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 028 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter J 1330 feet from the S line and 1330 feet from the E line 
Section 4 Township 20S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) \ * • . ' r * " j . 
^ ' - " 3681 GR -.* *' v , ' .,.!, | 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.Q P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE E] 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 12/22/90 Rig Release Date: 1/5/91 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE ~7t-

Type or print name: Whitngy E. Boyd 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: 

TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE K M . n . Z/Yjfi 

E-mail address: wboyd@mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 

TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 

WELL NAME 

SOUTH PEARL QUEEN UNIT 028 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

1330FSL, 1330 FEL 3002535894 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico 

Rnrvort v 5b 

Daily Completion Report 

REPORT DATE 

10/15/2008 

DAYS SINCE RtG-UP 

TOUR SHEET NO. 

16322 

TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

RIG CO A NUMBER 

REECO WELL SERVICE 

PBTD 

N/A 

WELLSTTE SUPERVISOR 

Ace Armann 

•M*.-ik> * ^ i ^ * s . - , ? ,> .PRO.pyeT ION : OBJEGj r i !VE INFORMATION-.. ! . , - v v l ; ' A s s j.-'jV^-s -,*>.*<-••, ] 
Fonnation Top (tt) Btm(R) Csg Siz» Csg T y p . U-nnTop U-mi Btm U-rm Size Port Top Port Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

• • \ . ».^v">- .-•! :'"! i f * * " „ . OPERATION SUMMARY), «;»--{''_ •-('• 
PRESENT OPERATION -

OPERATTON NEXT 24 HOURS -

PUMP REPAIR DALY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST |AFE COSTS 

* 

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (« :00 - 06:00 hrs) 

8:00 17:00 9.00 MIRU. UNHUNG WELL. UNSEATED PUMP, TOOH W/ SUCKER RODS AND PUMP 

0.00 WO PUMP TO BE REPAIRED AND RETURNED. 

0.00 TIH WI PUMP AND RODS, SPACED WELL OUT. HANG fT ON. 

0.00 CHECK PUMP ACTION- OK 

0.00 RDMO 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 9.00 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
10/13/2008 

*.<•'- ' , RUN - PULL REPOI 

• - ,• \ ' - . 
PULLED FROM DESCRIPTION RUN IN 

WELL WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH | QTY 

22" 1 1-1/4" POLISHED ROD 22" 1 
2'-4'-8'x 7/8" RODS 

25' 66 7/8" STEEL RODS 25" 66 
25' 123 3/4" STEEL RODS 25' 123 
16' 1 2.5"X 1.5" X16' INSERT PUMP 16' 1 
6' 1 6'X1-1/4" GAS ANCHOR 6' 1 

0 
0 
0 
0 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District State o f N e w M e x i c o 

j ^ j r i c , j Errergy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

?30?w."orand Ave , Artes.a, NM 882.0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 
District III 1 ? ? 0 S m i t h St F r a n ™ D r 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 „ . r . . . . o o r n £ -

D i s t r i c t I V Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

^ Form C-103 
W June 19, 2008 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District State o f N e w M e x i c o 

j ^ j r i c , j Errergy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

?30?w."orand Ave , Artes.a, NM 882.0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 
District III 1 ? ? 0 S m i t h St F r a n ™ D r 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 „ . r . . . . o o r n £ -

D i s t r i c t I V Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

WELL API NO. 
3002503323 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District State o f N e w M e x i c o 

j ^ j r i c , j Errergy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

?30?w."orand Ave , Artes.a, NM 882.0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 
District III 1 ? ? 0 S m i t h St F r a n ™ D r 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 „ . r . . . . o o r n £ -

D i s t r i c t I V Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE • FEE • 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District State o f N e w M e x i c o 

j ^ j r i c , j Errergy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

?30?w."orand Ave , Artes.a, NM 882.0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 
District III 1 ? ? 0 S m i t h St F r a n ™ D r 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 „ . r . . . . o o r n £ -

D i s t r i c t I V Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLIC ATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 

1. TypeofWell: Oil Well M Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
SOUTH PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLIC ATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 

1. TypeofWell: Oil Well M Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 017 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
025482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter P 660 feet from the S line and 660 feet from the E line 
Section 4 Township 20S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

J 1 , , ' C 't^M 11 • Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) „ ,V ^ 
f « W » S i 3684 GR i l W W K K t 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER. • 

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
COMMENCE DRILLING O P N S U P AND A • 
CASING/CEMENT JOB • 

OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE £3 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. HOT OILED WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 12/22/90 Rig Release Date: 1/5/91 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

TITLE: Authorized Agent SIGNATURE J f r f L ^ c * ! * / / . / y - , ^ 

y > 
Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd 
For State Use Only 
APPROVED BY: 

JPATEhov-. " I . 2f i f>g, 

E-mail address: wboyd(a>.mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 

TITLE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 

DATE 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

SOUTH PEARL QUEEN UNIT 017 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

660FSL, 660 FEL 3002503323 

County, Stato AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico 

h • » . a 

« 1 ' 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

REPORT DATE 

10/13/2008 

DAYS SMCE RK5-UP 

TOUR SHEET NO. 

16319 

TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 
RIG CO A NUMBER 

REECO WELL SERVICE 
PBTD 

N/A 

WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Ace Aimann 

Formation Top (tt) Btm (Ifl) Csg Size Cas Typo U-rm Top U-nn Btm U-rm Size Part Top Port Btm CHARGE PHASMG SPF EJihancod 

1' 1.' < . • ' 1 ~ v - . » • • * « ' . ' .<. ., OPERATION SUMMARY | ' • 

OPERATION NEXT 14 HOURS -

PRESENT OPERATION- PULL PRODUCTION EQUIPMENT DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

i L . I * . • - . > , , . : :;'DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY . - - i - ^ <fr P.- j, . , 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
<hn» 

HOURS 
(hra) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS { M M - OS.-M hrs) 

5:00 18:00 13.00 CREW TRAVEL FROM HOBBS. NM 

0.00 RU, UNHANG WELL. TOOH W/ RODS, RODS ARE UNSCREWED ABOVE PLUNGER. 

0.00 TIH VW RODS, SCREWED BACK ON THE PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE, TOOH W/ RODS. PLUNGEL, STANDING VALVE 
0.00 

0.00 RU HOT OIL TRUCK. HOT OIL 50 BBLS DOWN CASING W/ PRODUCED WATER AND PARAFIN SURFACTOR. 
0.00 NU BOP. RELEASE ANCHOR CATCHER, TOOH W/ - 2-7/8" TUBING-
0.00 SDFN 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
TOTAL HOURS 13.00 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
10/13/2008 P. 2=o£* 

, • .'h*f:J~ • - « ; • • • R U N - PULL REPORT^ 

PULLED FROM DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH | QTY 

22" 1 1-1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4' 1 4'X7/8" ROD SUB 

1400 56 1" FG RODS 
2250 90 7/8" STEEL RODS 

5 1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
4' 1 1-3/4" X 4' PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

140 2-7/8" , J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
1 2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 

16" 1 1-3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
4' 1 2-3/8" X 4' PERFORATED SUB 

2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 

0 
0 
0 
0 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oi l and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

SOUTH PEARL QUEEN UNIT 017 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

660FSL , 660 FEL 3002503323 

Counly, stata AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico 

T °P <"> Btm (ft) Csg Stza 

Daily Completion Report 

•PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

Csq Type U-rm Top U-nw Btm U-rm Stza Pert Top 

REPORT DATE 

10/14/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

2 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 
RIG CO A NUMBER 

REECO WELL SERVICE 
PBTD 

RVALUE! 

WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Ace Armann 

. OPERATION SUMMARY] 

PRESENT OPERATION - RUNNING PRODUCTION EQUIPMENT DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS • 

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY 

DESCRIPTION OF DAJLY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 his) 

17:00 12.00 CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION FROM HOBBS. NM 

0.00 RU H YDROTESTETERS. TIH W/ MUD ANCHOR. PERF SUB, SN, TUBING. TUBING ANCHOR CATHER. 
0.00 FOUND ONE TBG COUPLING LEAKING 1 JOINT ABOVE TAC 
0.00 TESTED TUBING TO 6500 PSI, RD HYDROTESTERS. SET ANCHOR CATHER. ND BOP 
0.00 TIH VW PLUNGER AND RODS. PLUNGER WOULD NOT GO INTO PUMP BARREL, TOOH W/ RODS AND PLUNGER. CHANGE OOUT X-OVER BOX 
0.00 ONTOP OF PLUNGER. TIH W/ PLUNGER AND RODS. SPACED WELL OUT, HANG IT ON, PUMPED WELL UP, SHUT DOWN 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
TOTAL HOURS 12.00 



COMPLETION RIG REPORT 
10/14/2008 P. 4 of 6 

RUN - PULL REPORT 

PULLED FROM 
WELL 

DESCRIPTION RUN IN 
WELL 

LENGTH QTY LENGTH QTY 

1- 1/4" POLISHED ROD 
4'X7/8" ROD E;UB 
1" FG RODS 
7/8" STEEL RODS 
1" RODS ON BOTTOM 
1-3/4" X 4" PLUNGER AND STANDING VALVE 

2- 7/8" , J-55, 6.5# TUBING 
2X2-3/8" TUBING SUB 
1- 3/4"X16' PUMP BARREL 
2- 3/8" X 4' PERFORATED SUB 
2-3/8" MUD ANCHOR 
2'x7/8" ROD SUB 0 

0 
0 
0 

\ 
4' 

1400 
2250 

4" 

16' 
4' 

2' 

1 
1 

56 
90 
5 
1 

140 
1 
1 
1 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

oistrict i Ei(' ,.gy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

noTw.^rand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District m 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ , r XT1t-> n n c n c District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

Form C-103 
f^S June 19, 2008 

m ^ L API NO. 
30-025-30867 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

oistrict i Ei(' ,.gy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

noTw.^rand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District m 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ , r XT1t-> n n c n c District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE [ g FEE • 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

oistrict i Ei(' ,.gy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

noTw.^rand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District m 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ , r XT1t-> n n c n c District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081840005 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSA1LS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOrR. USE "APPUCAinON FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well 03 Gas Well • Other: 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSA1LS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOrR. USE "APPUCAinON FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well 03 Gas Well • Other: 8. WeU Number 192 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter J 11330 feet from the S line and 1330 feet from the E line 
Section 28 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

."-l"5? ~".k -••>" • "•" ? « 1 H . Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) ) f% £ z £ > j t^* *f* 
i^*^^y^S^^^-^JiX^\^2-'!;l 3710 GR * "f " ' * 3 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE S 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE ^ ^ J ^ ^ L ^ f f ' - - TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE A / t f / , /"V. s?s??<r9 

Type or print name: Wmtnev E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd@mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WEU. NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 1 9 2 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

County, Stata AFE NUMBER Daily Completion Report 

REPORT DATE 

10/29/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 
RIG CO A NUMBER PBTD 

N/A 

Page 1 of 2 WELLSTTE SUPERVISOR 

RODOTt v.Sb 

Y|t|:«d-' PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE.INFORMATION,. 
Formation Top (ft) Btm (It) Csg Size Csg Type IKrmTop U-, i I I Bun U-rm Size Pert Too Perf Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

' - ' 
. i f Jx If • », OPERATION .SUMMARy . -j - ~ f < x <.-.,,.] 

PRESENT OPERATION - Pressure test casing(packer) DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
OPERATION NEXT M HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION-

8 '/ •il V ,f <y--'%y- "».••• -DAILYiCOMPLETION .SUMMARY. \y 'S'^-y^ S.r^S^-?> -4r>y „ i.XU- - ; 
HOURS 

(hrs) 
TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

12:00 12:30 0.50 MIRU, Piate Trucking kin truck, pump Mo casing .5 bbl inhibitor and biocide, pump up to bleed off air, pressure test casing to 500 psi. test good 15 mirKO leak 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 0.50 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District State o f N e w M e x i c o 

District I E^Jj^y, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S t r a n d Ave , Artes-a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District rn 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 0 , r X T V J oncnc 

District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

Form C-103 
r'y\ June 19,2008 

WifcLL API NO. 
30-025-30861 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District State o f N e w M e x i c o 

District I E^Jj^y, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S t r a n d Ave , Artes-a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District rn 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 0 , r X T V J oncnc 

District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE |3 FEE • 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District State o f N e w M e x i c o 

District I E^Jj^y, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S t r a n d Ave , Artes-a, NM 882,0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District rn 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 0 , r X T V J oncnc 

District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081830004 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 

1. TypeofWell: Oil Well ^ Gas Well • Other: 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 

1. TypeofWell: Oil Well ^ Gas Well • Other: 8. Well Number 191 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter M : 1310 feetfromthe S line and 1310 feetfromthe W line 
Section 28 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

& t \ T ^ v ^ 1 1 • Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) - ^ Q s ^ 
T . O •••« > 3722 GR W A - V f ! - , W i ^ ^ ^ U ^ 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of storting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the infonnation above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE / ^ ^ G c ^ t f y s t f ^ " < . TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE A/?K, SrO^g 

Type or print name: Whittfev E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd@rnbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 

WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 191 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

R o o n r t v 5 »* •• ... 
;3h-.?-.-.:vs%a 

Daily Completion Report 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

RIG CO A NUMBER PBTD 

N/A 

Page 1 of 2 
WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

;! . ' I' f« < r- ,f {•..,* ̂  - s8 'i *:_._»: « ; ^-RRODUCTIPN OBJECTJYEUNF.ORMAT.ION 1 <•„ * } I ' • * 
Formation Top tR) Bunfir) Csg Size Csg Type U-rm Top U*m Btm IMmSbe Perf Top Perl Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

.'It'/" .- ... , OPERATION SUMMARY, . . . - % ft,-* • 

'» ; • > . * ' 
PRESENT OPERATION - DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

% 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS-

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

•^44\i.l,-si> ;< -s - ' ^<- , ,< 'DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY - *• ' * " " • " , i <• . "-' i . •. t' 

FROM 
Ihrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - M M hrs) 

12:30 13:00 0.50 MIRU. Pate Trucking rill truck, pump into casing 3.0 bbl mhfcrlor and biocide, pump up to bleed off air. pressure test casing to 500 psi. test good 20 min(0 le 

0.00 

O.OO 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 0.50 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

DLtfieti B ( i ^ y , Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

" " G r a n d A v e . , Artesia,NM88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District rn 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 f 1 . ^ x n l o l r n c 

D i s l r i c t ry Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

Form C-103 
(^|% June 19, 2008 

wmX API NO. 
30-025-22870 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

DLtfieti B ( i ^ y , Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

" " G r a n d A v e . , Artesia,NM88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District rn 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 f 1 . ^ x n l o l r n c 

D i s l r i c t ry Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE [X] FEE • 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

DLtfieti B ( i ^ y , Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

" " G r a n d A v e . , Artesia,NM88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District rn 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 f 1 . ^ x n l o l r n c 

D i s l r i c t ry Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081830004 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSAUS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [ g Gas Well • Other: 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSAUS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [ g Gas Well • Other: 8. Well Number 163 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter D 5 feet from the N line and 1315 feet from the W line 
Section 33 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

"SSC- • * 1 1 • Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) , • $$^jaf*3fcg& 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE M 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKO VER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNAnJRE^%^fe^ X*s^f*>^~ TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE M f f . /V 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd@.mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 

REPORT DATE DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 163 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER RIG CO * NUMBER PBTD 

N/A 

County, State AFE NUMBER Daily Completion Report Page 1 of 2 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Report v.5ti 

.? , .PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION ^.vy* - i , 

formation Top t i t) Btm(«E) Csg Size Csg Type U-cmTop U-rm Btm U-rm Size Pert Top Pert Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

.'.<.' ' •' 
OPERATION SUMMARY |i 

PRESENT OPERATION - DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

* 
AFE COSTS 

OPERATION NEXT 14 HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

1 |i i .V i - ' ' ' - ; . ^ s- - , I ; .: . : *>.-. : DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY u y - > > . > > ,v, • .* \, . . . j , 

FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

12:30 13:00 0.50 MIRU, Pate Trucking kill truck, pump into casing 3.5 bbl inhibitor and biocide. pump up to bleed off air, pressure test cashrq to 500 psi. test good 10 min(0 le: 

0.00 5.5" casing w 5"x2" swedge w valve. 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 050 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District 
Ofli&s* 
District I 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District 11 
1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District in 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

State ofNew Mexico 
EjSpry, Minerals and Natural Resources 

OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION 
1220 South St. Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe,NM 87505 

Form C-103 
June 19, 2008 

E L L API NO. 
30-025-03227 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE [ 3 FEE • 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081830004 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSAL TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPUCAHON FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil WeU • Gits Well • Other: Injection 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

8. Well Number 125 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter N 
Section 28 

(560 feet from the S 
Township 19S 

line and 1980 
Range 35E 

feet from the W 
NMPM LEA County 

line 

. ' - . ! * . . . - . • -^'V 11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
3715 GR 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATIJI^^^^^g^^^^ ' ^ J s ^ c TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE /t/^/ / V , 2~C&/$ 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd E-mail address: wboyd@.mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 

WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 125 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

County, State AFE NUMBER Daily Completion Report 

REPORT DATE 

10/29/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

RIG CO A NUMBER PBTD 

N/A 

Page 1 of 2 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

; 1 j ^ - ^ v * , , ; . i > a * if^,,;v;,PRODUCT:ION OBJECTIVE IN FORMATION.^ j j y "v.t* "' *• • * ' - ' 
Formation Top (ft) Btm (TT) Csq Size Csg Type U-rm Top U-rm Btm U-rni Size Perf Top Perf Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

•"4IVH?' :•„ • OPERATION SUMMARY A tM'-'-'ift- •, :A 

PRESENT OPERATION - Pressure test casing(packer) DAILY COST 

* 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

^ ' ^ • jC&f - i *^ : • f- PAILY;COMPLETION SUMMARY •..„-. ^ , ••.»$<.•. .v. 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(lus) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06.-00 hrs) 

10:00 11:30 1.50 MIRU. Pate Trucking kfl truck, pump into casing 3.5 bbl inhibitor and biocide. pump up to bleed off air. pressure test casing to 500 psi. test good 10 min(0 les 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0 .00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 1.50 



Submit i Copies To Appropriate District 
Office 
District b 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District 11 
1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District Ul 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

State ofNew Mexico 
Minerals and Natural Resources 

OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION 
1220 South St. Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe, NM 87505 

JM 
Form C-103 

June 19, 2008 

AiLL API NO. 
30-025-03229 
5. Indicate Type of Lease 

STATE g ] FEE • 
6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 

E081840005 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well • Gas Well • Other: Injection 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

8. Well Number 124 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

Well Location 
Unit Letter O 
Section 28 

660 feet from the _ S _ 
Township 19S 

line and _ 
Range 35E 

1980 feet from the E line 
NMPM LEA County 

11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
3717 GR 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE E3 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information abo ve is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE / ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ x ^ ^ ^ ^ TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE A/s t , Sf7s>7/? 

Type or print name: Wmf^eyE. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd(a),mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 1 2 4 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER RIG CO A NUMBER PBTD 

N/A 

County, Stats AFE NUMBER Daily Completion Report Page 1 of 2 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Roport v.Sb 

; PRODUCTJON OBJECTIVE INFORMATION:- • > / i ' - s i A 

• • | .- :' . Formation Top (TO Btm (ft) Csg Size Csg Type U-rm Top U-rm Btm U-rm Size Perf Top Pert Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

1 •' I; • i • "'<* ; -1;- r x r . • f . t , . ' OPERATION SUMMARY,,.,],. 

" ' * ;'•'••'!•' 
Sift. »• , \ -\f • • ••• " 

PRESENT OPERATION - DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS • 

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THtS OPERATION -

C - '- AM^IfV*^^**^-'--''" .DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY . , . • . . . V - \ j -•-
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCmPTION OF DAJLY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06.-00 hrs) 

12:30 13:00 0.50 MIRU, Pate Trucking kiP truck, pump into casing 3.5 bbl inhibitor and biocide, pump up to bleed off air, pressure test casing to 500 psi. test good 10 min(0 le: 

0.00 5.5" casing w 5"x2" swedge w valve. 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 0.50 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e \ V M e x i c o 

* District i l ^ ^ g y , Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

BoTw. l rand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ . r n o a c n c 

District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

Form C-103 
( i l l June 19, 2008 
WELL API NO. 
30-025-03228 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e \ V M e x i c o 

* District i l ^ ^ g y , Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

BoTw. l rand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ . r n o a c n c 

District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE [ 3 FEE • 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e \ V M e x i c o 

* District i l ^ ^ g y , Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

BoTw. l rand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd , Aztec, NM 87410 „ . r n o a c n c 

District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081840005 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well • Gas Well • Other: Injection 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well • Gas Well • Other: Injection 8. Well Number 122 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter J 1980 feetfromthe S line and 1980 feetfromthe E line 
Section 28 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

-; ''J 11- Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) * " " i " 

^ ^ ^ 0 X f t / S ^ ^ i - S 3719 GR " } ^ _ - Vr-M3ft£ 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR: /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKO VER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE /^y^f^uc^-^ U % ^ - ^ ^ — TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE /l/<?/. 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboydfgjmbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



9 © 

OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 

REPORT DATE 

10/29/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG4JP 

WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 122 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER RIG CO A NUMBER PBTD 

N/A 

County, Stabs AFE NUMBER Daily Completion Report Page 1 of 2 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Report v.5b 

M • . !•.:*••••• \r--
PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION - ; ~ - v . • -i 

Formation Top (tt) Btm(f l) Csg Size Csg Type U-rm Top U-rni Blm U-mShM Pert Top Pert Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

1 • • I k . - . OPERATION SUMMARY (• 

PRESENT OPERATION - Pressure test casing(pacta) DALY COST 

* 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
DALY COST 

* 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

- DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY . : . . . 

FROM 
(hra) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 . 06:00 t i n ) 

11:30 12.00 0.50 MIRU, F'ate Trucking kill truck, pump into casing . 2 bbl inhibitor and biocide. pump up to bleed off air. pressure test casinq to 500 psi. test good 10 min(0 lea 

0.00 No well head, 5.5" csg w cottar, 5 5"x2" swedge w 2" ball vah/e, no pressure on 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 0.50 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District 
Oftcc 
District I 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District II 
1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District UI 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

State ofNew Mexico 
•QJjrgy, Minerals and Natural Resources 

OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION 
1220 South St. Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe, NM 87505 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPUCATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well • Gas Well • Other: Injection 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPUCATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well • Gas Well • Other: Injection 8. Well Number 121 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OEL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRLD Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter K : 1980 feetfromthe S line and 1980 feetfromthe W line 
Section 28 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
3722 GR 

. f ' ^ J t a S j . ! ^ : . - ' - ! : '5"S.-:- V . - . ' W E H - ' ' J i j j i i 

5L 
Form C-103 

June 19, 2008 
WELL API NO. 
30-025-03225 

Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE 13 FEE • 

State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E081830004 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNSO P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE [3 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed wort:). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPADR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKO VER REPORTS FOR MORE DETABLS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE / ^ / ^ f c z f ^ ^ - ' y ^ - ^ / f ^ ^ ^ ̂ -^ TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE /^y< /</, J 7 ^ ' 

Type or print name: Whtmey E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd@mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric OU and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 121 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

County, Stats AFE NUMBER 

T°P w 

Daily Completion Report 

PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 
Btm (ft) Csg Size Csg Type U-on Top U-rm Btm U-rm S t o Perf Top Pert 

REPORT DATE 

10/29/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

RIG CO A NUMBER PBTD 

N/A 

Page 1 of 2 WELLSTTE SUPERVISOR 

OPERATION SUMMARY 
PRESENT OPERATION - Pressure test casinoXpadttir) DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST AFE COSTS 

* 
OPERATION NEXT l t HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

• .r • , t • k - --. M 1 . . DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY . , V * „- . • i i ' 
FROM TO HOURS TIME DESCRffTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 hrs) 
(hrs) (hrs) (hrs) CODE 

DESCRffTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (06:00 - 06:00 hrs) 

15:30 16:30 1.00 MIRU, F'ate Trucking kifl truck, purnp into casing 3.0 bbl jntabitor and biocide. pump up to bleed off air, pressure test casing to 500 psi. 

0.00 Test is tad. leaks off 100 psi in 1 min 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 1.00 



Submit ? Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

Districti l(Jpgy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S ^ G r a n d Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 „ , ~ , , , , „ - , „ . 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

Form C-103 
f A | June 19,2008 

wtl.L API NO. 
30-025-03240 

Submit ? Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

Districti l(Jpgy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S ^ G r a n d Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 „ , ~ , , , , „ - , „ . 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE [ 3 FEE • 

Submit ? Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e x i c o 

Districti l(Jpgy, Minerals and Natural Resources 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S ^ G r a n d Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District in 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 „ , ~ , , , , „ - , „ . 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E015870000 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well • Gas Well • Other: Injection 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well • Gas Well • Other: Injection 8. Well Number 119 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter I : 11980 feetfromthe S line and 660 feetfromthe E line 
Section 29 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

^ p U ^ J ^ « J ^ l j 11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) X - ^ ' & ^ & ^ g ^ 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING OPNS.D P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

• r ^ S ' ^ y * ^ TITLE: Authorized Agent ;DATE/^. / ^ SIGNATURE/U^4^^r^ ./O^T^C- TITLE: Authorized Agent .DATE /Vg'i'. / V <3cZi$ 

Type or print name: Wmtnev E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd@mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



0 

OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 

REPORT DATE 

10/29/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIGJJP 

WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 1 1 9 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER RIG CO A NUMBER PBTD 

N/A 

County, State AFE NUMBER Daily Completion Report Page 1 of 2 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

RaportvJH* 

•i; f • . j . - J , • •:• ? • •> • PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

Fonnation Top ttt) Btm(l( | Csg Size Csg Type O-rm Top U-fm Btm U-fmSixe Perf Top Perf Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

r ! ,-. •• 4 • * vi - »); ! . : • : OPERATION.SUMMARY ] 

PRESENT OPERATION - DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

$ 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

i ;•• i - j-l . I , . . . . . . -DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY • ' . . • . } I 

FROM 
(hr»l 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hts) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (OHIO - M:00 hrs) 

15:00 15:30 0.50 MIRU, Pate Trucking kH truck, pump Into casing 3.0 Dbl inhMtor and biocide. pump 141 to bleed off air, pressure test casing to 500 psi. 

0.00 Test is bad, leaks off 100 psi in 1 mkt 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 0.50 



Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e X l C O 

Distr̂ t I {\%&brgy, Minerals and Natural Resources ^ 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w ^ r a n d Ave., Artesia, NM 882!0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District ffl 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 ~ , ,-, on enc 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

^ Form C-103 
J P June 19, 2008 

WELL API NO. 
30-025-00398 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e X l C O 

Distr̂ t I {\%&brgy, Minerals and Natural Resources ^ 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w ^ r a n d Ave., Artesia, NM 882!0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District ffl 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 ~ , ,-, on enc 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE 13 FEE • 

Submit 3 Copies To Appropriate District S ta te o f N e w M e X l C O 

Distr̂ t I {\%&brgy, Minerals and Natural Resources ^ 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 

S T w ^ r a n d Ave., Artesia, NM 882!0 O I L C O N S E R V A T I O N D I V I S I O N 

District ffl 1220 South St. Francis Dr. 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd, Aztec, NM 87410 ~ , ,-, on enc 
District rv Santa Fe, NM 87505 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E064850001 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOS ALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [3 Gas WeU • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
MESA QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOS ALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well [3 Gas WeU • Other 8. Well Number 008 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRLD Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUITE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
MESA QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter G : 1980 feetfromthe N line and 1980 feetfromthe E line 
Section 16 Township 16S Range 32E NMPM LEA County 

W ^ m P ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ M 11 • Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) t ^ K ^ f ? ?. ^ ^ 2 ? 
J i v 4342 GR ^ ; c f • • ^ J ^ i ^ 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • COMMENCE DRILLING O P N S d P AND A • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • CASING/CEMENT JOB • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE M 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKO VER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: 09/08/1962 Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

SIGNATURE f ^ t C £ ^ Z ^ / V w ^ TITLE: Authorized Agent J D A T E / ^ / , / ^ , J ^ 0 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd . E-mail address: wboyd@mbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 
For State Use Only 

APPROVED BY: TITLE DATE 
Conditions of Approval (if any): 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
REPORT DATE 

11/5/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

WELL NAME 

Mesa Queen #8 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 

LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER RIG CO & NUMBER 

Pate Trucking 
PBTD 

N/A 

County, State 

L e a , New Mexico 

AFE NUMBER Daily Completion Report Page l of 4 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Lance Lopez 
Rooortv.Sb 

->:?, ^>j'--.PRODUCTION OBJECTIVES FORM ATION iV'4«i. 
Formation Top (It) Btm (I t) Csg Size Csg Type U-rm Top U-rm Btin U-rm Size Pert Top Pert Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

>]}> .fS. ' f '"V . O P E R A T I O N S U M M A R Y .). 

PRESENT OPERATION - Test Anchors.Clean Up Locatkm.Presure Test Tubing, Move Rig DALY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

% 
AFE COSTS 

% 
OPERATION NEXT24HOURS- Rig up and Pud Rods and Tubing, Check Pump 

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION-

K -• v | j lh . ;».- y r i » I - DAILY C O M P L E T I O N - S U M M A R Y • , y n v :.*»«. V . .*?•:»•. . ,» - > ,. . . - • „ . • 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DAILY OPERATIONS (MAO - 06:00 hrs) 

6:00 8:00 2.00 Rigged up Pate Trucking, KM Truck. Pre sure tested the tubing Started @ 500 PSI, leaked down to 440 PSI in 6 Min, Wiil not surface fluid to the 
0.00 Surtace 

8:00 10:00 2.00 Rigged up Hobbs Anchor, Tested anchors on location to 22500 Psi, AD good 

0.00 

10:00 11:00 1.00 RoustalXHits cleaned junk off of location 
0.00 

11:00 13:00 2.00 Moved cle ano ut tank on location. Also Moved workover rig on location, to windy to rig up 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 
0.00 

0 .00 

0.00 

0.00 

0 .00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 7.00 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

Mesa Queen #8 
LEOAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

Lea, Mew Mexico 

Daily Completion Report 

REPORT DATE 

11/6/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

2 
TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

N/A 
RIG CO A NUMBER 

Reeco 
PBTD 

RVALUE! 

Page 3 of 4 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Lance Lopez 

T°P TO Btm ffl) 

,>„<,,, ^-....PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE.IN FORMATION 

OPERATIONiSUMMARY , 

PRESENT OPERATION - Pull Rods and Tubing with pump DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

% 
AFE COSTS 

$ 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

Reinstall pump after testing or replacement 

• I'.'l :•:•»! " J 
••v DAILY, COMPLETION.SUMMARY 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (06.-00-0£:00hrs) 

7:00 9:30 2.50 •CT WARMED UP RIG, RIGGED UP 

9:30 11:00 1,50 13 PULLED OUT 111RODS WITH PUMP, LOTS OF PARRIFFIN IN THE HOLE. CALLED FOR A HOT OIL TRUCK TO FLUSH THE TUBING AND 
0.00 PRESURE TEST AFTER WE PUMP HOT WATER DOWN HOLE, CALLED OLEG ABOUT THE PUMP AND WE ARE HAVING EUNICE PUMP AND 
0.00 SUPPLY- HEAD THIS WAY WITH A STEEL PUMP WITH A CROME BARREL, IF THE TUBING TESTS GOOD THE DECISION TO RUN THE PUMP 
0,00 WILL HAPPEN THEN, IF TUBING TEST BAD WE WTTH HAVE THEM REBUILD THE OLD PUMP WHICH IS A COATED PUMP 

11:00 14:30 3.50 29 WATT C'N HOT OIL TRUCK 

14:30 16:00 1,50 35 RIGGED UP HOT OIL TRUCK. HEATED WATER TO 200 F.. PUMPED 55 BBLS OF HOT WATER WITH SOAP AND PARRIFFIN SOLVANT 
0.00 DROPFED THE STANDING VALVE AND FILLED THE TUBING UP WITH 20 BBLS OF WATER. RIGGED UP TO PRESSURE TEST AND TESTED 

0.00 TO 550 PSI, NO LEAK OFF IN 5 MIN, RIGGED DOWN HOT OIL TRUCK 

16:00 17:00 1.00 13 RAN IN THE HOLE NEW PUMP AND RODS, SET PUMP @ 2821' 

17:00 18:00 1.00 3 NIPPLE D UP AND SECURED WELLHEAD, SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT 
0.00 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 

0.00 
0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 11.00 



Minmit J copies l o Appropriate District 
Office • 
District 1 
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 
District II 
1301 W. Grand Ave., Artesia, NM 88210 
District HI 
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 
District IV 
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 
87505 

State ofNew Mexico 
v, 'Jargy, Minerals and Natural Resources 

OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION 
1220 South St. Francis Dr. 

Santa Fe, NM 87505 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well £3 Gas Well • Other 

7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name 
WEST PEARL QUEEN UNIT 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A 
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH 
PROPOSALS.) 
1. TypeofWell: Oil Well £3 Gas Well • Other 8. Well Number 154 

2. Name of Operator 
XERIC OIL AND GAS CORP 

9. OGRID Number 
25482 

3. Address of Operator 
14781 MEMORIAL DRIVE, SUTfE 1754 HOUSTON, TX 77079 

10. Pool name or Wildcat 
PEARL QUEEN 

4. Well Location 
Unit Letter F : 1980 feetfromthe N line and 2283 feetfromthe W line 
Section 31 Township 19S Range 35E NMPM LEA County 

11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 
3719 GR 

*_VH» V, *£~r- :u i 5. .''".'St iFWt 
. ' . ? «"iri^\;a!r ' i ? n ; +V vT-•1x*'-!-$SZ.&zl 

.1 
w*ELL API NO. 
30-025-03266 

Form C-103 
June 19, 2008 

5. Indicate Type of Lease 
STATE FEE • 

6. State Oil & Gas Lease No. 
E016380004 

12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice, Report or Other Data 

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: 
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK • PLUG AND ABANDON • 
TEMPORARILY ABANDON • CHANGE PLANS • 
PULL OR ALTER CASING • MULTIPLE COMPL • 
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE • 

OTHER: • 

SUBSEQUENT REPORT OF: 
REMEDIAL WORK • ALTERING CASING • 
COMMENCE DRILLING OPNSO P AND A • 
CASING/CEMENT JOB • 

OTHER: WELL REPAIR/ MAINTAINANCE 12 
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date 

of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 1103. For Multiple Completions: Attach wellbore diagram of proposed completion 
or recompletion. 

PERFORMED WELL REPAIR /MAINTAINANCE WORK ON THE SUBJECT WELL. SWAB TESTED WELL. 

SWAB RESULTS: 174 BBLS WATER, 96 BBLS OIL 
INITIAL FLUID LEVEL: 700' 
FINAL FLUID LEVEL: 2000' 

SEE ATTACHED DAILY WORKOVER REPORTS FOR MORE DETAILS. 

Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 

I hereby certify that the information ab ove is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief. 

TITLE: Authorized Agent 

Type or print name: Whitney E. Boyd 
For State Use Only 

.DATE 

^ E-mail address: wbovd@rnbakercorp.com PHONE: 307.763.0209 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 
WELL NAME 

West Peart Queen # 154 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

sec. 31-.T19S; R35E 30-025-03266 
County, State AFE NUMBER 

L e a , New Mexico WPQ154 
Daily Completion Report 

REPORT OATE 

10/30/2008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

1 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5,028 

RIG CO A NUMBER 

Reeco #116 

PBTD 

5,028 

Page 1 of 6 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Michae l L. A l l i ed 

' Ir I-- ••• 1 - PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION , f I- • - • 
Formation Top (tt) Btmnq Csg Size Csq Type U-miTop UwmBIm U-rm Size Perf Top Perf Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen Ol 5028 7 4S40 4645 

4581 5026 4.5 •net 4008 4806 

46S6 4688 

4920 4926 

<884 4986 

» . • |: \~ - * ,• . 
ir.-n- ' OPERATION SUMMARY | • ; .;. • 

PRESENT OPERATION- MIRU, pull rods and tubingi DAILY COST 

* 
CUMULATIVE COST AFE COSTS 

* 
DAILY COST 

* $ 
AFE COSTS 

* 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION-

DAILY COMPLETION SUMMARY 
FROM 
( lm ) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (06:00-06:00 hrs) 

12:00 13:00 1.00 MIRU, Reeco #116, open up casing to tank, well is flowing; recovered 9BO 

13:00 15:30 2.50 pull rod s: 47 1"x25", 36 7/8" x25" , 102 3/4" x 25" class D sucker rods, plus 4 pony rods and 1 22" x 1 1/4" polish rod and 2.5" x 16" rod pump. 

15:30 18:00 2.50 NU BOP: pull and standback 187 jts 2 7/8" J-35 tbg;secure wen SDFN 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

o.oo 
0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 6.00 



OPERATOR 

Xeric Oil and Gas Corp 

WELL NAME 

West Pearl Queen # 154 
LEGAL LOCATION API NUMBER 

sec. 31;T19S; R3SE 30-025-03266 

County, State AFE NUMBER 

Lea, New Mexico WPQ1S4 

i -r' i • • 1 ? i Ŵ-H • • .s .PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION 

Formation Top (tt) Btm (II) Csg Size Csg Type U-rm Top U-rm Btm U-rm Size Pert Top Perf Btm CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen Sl 5028 7 4640 4645 

4581 5028 4.5 •net 4808 4808 

4888 4688 

4920 4928 

4984 4986 

! : I; [ , ' f " f WH • JS" ' • \ i , OPERATION SUMMARY ' v «?; 

PRESENT OPERATION - Run Tbg and swab DAILY COST CUMULATIVE COST AFE COSTS 

$ t $ 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

-. ^ .M .«..'.'•..•. .. . 

Daily Completion Report 

REPORT DATE 

10/3172008 

DAYS SINCE RIG-UP 

2 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5,028 

RIG CO A NUMBER 

Reeco #116 

PBTD 

5,028 

Page 3 of 6 WELLSTTE SUPERVISOR 

Michael L. Allred 

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

? ; if. * 4 ; p . v b l w ' . * ^ ^ ..DAILY-COMPLETION SUMMARY;, »,*• - y ry_ . ;,„«i(|.... . 

FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (06:00 - OC.-00 hrs) 

7:00 12:00 5.00 Warm-up; TIH 20 stands of 2 7/8"; well kick and flowed 86BO to tank 

12:00 14:30 2.50 Swab arid recover 76 BOW, TIH w tbg to 4471'; 

14:30 16:00 1.50 Swab and recover 24 BOW, initial fluid level @> 1800'; final fluid level @ 2800' 

16:00 17:00 1.00 SI well, secure location. SDFN 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 10JM 



OPERATOR 

Xer ic Oi i a n d G a s C o r p 

REPORT DATE 

11/1/2008 

DAYS SINCE PJG-UP 

3 

WELL MAKE 

West Pearl Queen # 1 5 4 

TOUR SHEET NO. TOTAL DEPTH 

5,028 

LEGAL LOCATION 

sec. 31;T19S; R35E 

API NUMBER 

30-025-03266 
RIG CO A NUMBER 

Reeco #116 

PBTD 

5,028 

County, State 

Lea, New Mex ico 

AFE NUMBER 

WPQ154 
Daily Completion Report Page 5 of 6 WELLSITE SUPERVISOR 

Michael L. Allred 

Report v.5b 

'In, K- 4- . PRODUCTION OBJECTIVE INFORMATION . r - , v i - • • 

Fonnation Top (ft) Btm (f t) Csq Size Csg Typo U-rm Top U-rm Btm U-rm Size Pert Top Perf Bbn CHARGE PHASING SPF Enhanced 

Queen gi 5028 7 4640 4645 

4581 5028 4.5 fnei 4806 4808 

4586 4688 

4920 4928 

4964 4986 

-.. . '" '" i ' . jsvi ;; • O P E R A T I O N S U M M A R Y ;.j.* 

PRESENT OPERATION- S w a b . R D M O DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

* 
AFE COSTS 

* 
DAILY COST 

$ 
CUMULATIVE COST 

* 
AFE COSTS 

* 
OPERATION NEXT 24 HOURS -

PURPOSE A PLAN OF THIS OPERATION -

;,DAILY COMPLETION.SUMMARY 
FROM 
(hrs) 

TO 
(hrs) 

HOURS 
(hrs) 

TIME 
CODE 

- DESCRIPTION OF DALY OPERATIONS (06:00 - K:00 hrs) 

7:00 9:00 2.00 Pressure on tbg 30 #: swab initial fluid level 7O0'-final fluid level 2000' 

9:00 10:30 1.50 ND BOP, TOOH & LD 58 its. 2 7/8* j-55 tbd; secure wellhead, RDMO 

O.OO 

0.00 seating nipple set @ 2509" 

0.00 

0.00 Total fluid recovered = 270 bbl 

0.00 on recovered= 96 bbl 

0.00 Water recovered* 174 bbl 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

0.00 

TOTAL HOURS 3.50 


