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Efforts to obtain voluntary joinder 

Estate of Howard E Henderson 

Sent offer letter via certified mail December 2001. Talked with Mrs. Henderson 
December 20, 2001 regarding letter. She advised her husband had died and would take 
all paperwork to the attorney, who was out of the office until "after the holidays". 
December 21, 2001 sent letter explaining necessary title papers to have the correct 
entities executed an Oil and Gas Lease. In January 2001 spoke with Mrs. Henderson 
regarding pooling notice. She advised this correspondence was also being taken to the 
attorney. No response from Mrs. Henderson to follow-up telephone calls. 

Julia Cremean Satterly 

Sent offer letter via certified mail December 2001. Mail returned with notation "Not 
deliverable as addressed." Spoke with sister, Arnette Small in January 2002. She 
advised her sister moved frequently and the family did not know her current residence 
location. 

State Highway Department of New Mexico 

Sent offer letter via certified mail December 2001. Spoke with Bob Lopez in December 
2001 explaining the offer letter. At his request obtained from the San Juan County 
records an oil and gas lease the State Highway Department of New Mexico had granted 
to another company. Several telephone conversations in early and mid-January regarding 
the leasing of the minerals owned by the State Highway Department of New Mexico. No 
resolution on leasing minerals. 

First National Bank of Iowa City, Iowa, Trustee UTA dated 08/06/86 

Sent offer letter via certified mail December 2001. In January 2002 spoke with Lynn 
Jordan with First National Bank Trust Department. Explained the offer, including the 
after payout responsibility of all parries if force pooling order is established. The Bank 
will attempt to have an answer by the pooling hearing. Will default under terms of 
pooling. 

William A Hall 

Sent offer letter via certified mail December 2001. Spoke with Dr. Hall in December 
regarding the possibility of leasing his mineral interest. There was not a resolution to the 
leasing. 

Elizabeth L Fisk, Surviving Co-Trustee UTA dated 11/29/88 

Sent offer letter via certified mail December 2001. Attempted to contact by telephone in 
December 2001. Ms. Fisk is in a nursing home and was able to obtain the name and 
telephone number of another Co-Trustee, Jeff Fleming. Left telephone messages in 
December 2001 and January 2002, but received no response. 


