R.T. Hicks Consultants, Ltd. **Time by Job Detail**June 1, 2014 through March 21, 2017

Date	Name	Duration	Notes
07/14/2014	Hicks, Randall T.	0.50	Tuesday - site inspection of RR 2H
07/15/2014	Hicks, Randall T.	2.00	Tuesday - site inspection of RR 2H
08/04/2014	Hicks, Randall T.	1.75	Monday - netting issues and coordaination
08/26/2014	Stubblefield, Michael	5.00	Travel to location conduct liner inspection, install weekly log at drilling in a sealed container.
10/13/2014	Parker, Andrew	2.00	Roadrunner 2H: Reserve pit inspection
10/31/2014	Pope, Kristin	1.75	Pit inspection and sign inspection form; discuss w/RTH and pumper; update file
12/03/2014	Hicks, Randall T.	3.00	Wednesday - pit inspection
12/22/2014	Stubblefield, Michael	3.00	Travel to location, conducted inpaction on liner. Installed new inspection log.
02/09/2015	Pope, Kristin	1.00	Inspect fluid level; discuss w/RTH; photos
08/30/2016	Hicks, Randall T.	4.00	Tuesday - visit site too much water
01/04/2017	Pope, Kristin	0.25	Prepare sample jars, labels; closure sampling w/RTH
01/04/2017	Hicks, Randall T.	6.00	WEd-Thursday Travel and site visit for sampling
01/05/2017	Pope, Kristin	2.00	Prepare sample jars, labels; closure sampling w/RTH
01/05/2017	Hicks, Randall T.	3.00	WEd-Thursday Travel and site visit for sampling
01/11/2017	Hicks, Randall T.	0.25	Wed-look at lab data and send to KP for closure notice
01/13/2017	Pope, Kristin	2.00	Review file documents and lab results; Calculate stabilized cuttings concentrations; Draft closure
01/27/2017	Pope, Kristin	0.50	Review file; finalize closure notice w/RTH; discuss schedule w/contractor
01/30/2017	Pope, Kristin	0.75	Coordinate closure w/contractor; Email closure notice to OCD and BLM; Left voicemail for OCD; Print
01/31/2017	Pope, Kristin	0.25	Coordinate closure w/contractor; Email closure notice to OCD and BLM; Left voicemail for OCD; Print
02/06/2017	Pope, Kristin	2.00	Discuss work schedule w/contractor; site visit; perform paint filter test on stabilized cuttings; u
02/08/2017	Pope, Kristin	2.00	Discuss work schedule w/contractor; site visit; perform paint filter test on stabilized cuttings; u
02/14/2017	Pope, Kristin	1.75	Discuss progress and seed w/contractor; look up seed mix; draft closure report
02/21/2017	Pope, Kristin	0.50	Discuss plot plan w/A. Parker and revise; Order marker plate; Email BLM
02/22/2017	Source3 Computing LLC	1.75	Create closure map
03/03/2017	Pope, Kristin	1.75	Complete closure report; peer review and revisions; submit to client for review; discuss seeding w/
03/06/2017	Pope, Kristin	0.25	discuss marker plate requirements w/client; emailed specifications; Revise closure report and submi
03/09/2017	Pope, Kristin	0.50	discuss marker plate requirements w/client; emailed specifications; Revise closure report and submi