Form 3160-5 (June 2015)

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

OCD Artesia

FORM APPROVED OMB NO. 1004-0137

	Expires: Janua	ary 3
5. Lease S	erial No.	
NMNN	1113944	

SUNDRY NO	OTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS	
Do not use this:	form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an	
bandoned well.	Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals	

nana 2	7. If Unit or CA/Agree		
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2			
1. Type of Well ☑ Oil Well ☐ Gas Well ☐ Other			
Name of Operator Contact: BETTIE WATSON NEARBURG PRODUCING COMPANYE-Mail: bettie@watsonreg.com			
	10. Field and Pool or E WILDCAT	10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area WILDCAT	
	11. County or Parish, S	State	
	EDDY COUNTY	′, NM	
TE NATURE OI	F NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTH	IER DATA	
TYPE OF ACTION			
pen	☐ Production (Start/Resume)	☐ Water Shut-Off	
raulic Fracturing	☐ Reclamation	■ Well Integrity	
Construction	□ Recomplete	⊠ Other	
and Abandon	□ Temporarily Abandon	Drilling Operations	
, Back	☐ Water Disposal	•	
	NM OIL CONSERVA ARTESIÀ DISTRICT		
Z NMOCD	AUG 2 1 2017		
	RECEIVED		
OMPANY, sent to	the Carlsbad		
Title AGENT			
Date 07/23/20	017		
L OR STATE	OFFICE USE		
TitlePETROLE	UM ENGINEER	Date 08/17/2017	
Office Carlsbac	1		
	d by the BLM Wellompents, include a completion or recordurements, include a completion or recordurements, include a completion or recordurements. Title AGENT Title AGENT Title Carlsbace Office Carlsbace	(include area code) 9-0132 10. Field and Pool or I WILDCAT 11. County or Parish. SEDDY COUNTY TE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHE TYPE OF ACTION pen Production (Start/Resume)	

Tues., May 16, 2017 Activity Log

From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 11:00 05:00 PU & LD Drill Pipe, Changeout BHA P/u and M/u 17 1/2 surface assy.

11:00 19:30 08:30 Drill Rotating Drig f/ 52' to 274' 222' 26.7 FPH 500 GPM 85 RPM 18K SPP 500 Psi TQ 8K

19:30 20:00 00:30 Deviation Survey Survey @ 243' .30 Deg

20:00 00:30 04:30 Drill Rotating Drig f/ 274' to 420' 146' 32 FPH 500 GPM 85 RPM 18K SPP 500 Psi TQ 8K

00:30 01:00 00:30 Circ/Cond/Filter Pump 20 BBI Hi-Vis sweep. Circ hole clean.

01:00 02:00 01:00 Tripping Short trip to 20" conductor. Tih.

02:00 02:30 00:30 Condition Mud and Circulate Pump 40 bbl Hi-Vis sweep. Circ hole clean.

02:30 04:30 02:00 Tripping Drop Totco. Pooh and Stand back 3 stds collars. L/d 8" Tools. Survey @ 400' .50 Deg

04:30 05:00 00:30 Other Clean rig floor for casing crew.

05:00 06:00 01:00 Run Casing R/u Byrd Casing Crew

Wed., May 17, 2017 Activity Log

From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 08:00 02:00 Run Casing R/u Bird Casing Crews.

08:00 09:00 01:00 Run Casing M/u Texas shoe, 1 jt 13 3/8, Float Collar and 9 jts 13 3/8 54.5# J-55 BTC casing. Total of 414' w/ 3' stick up. Pipe set @ 411' Float collar @ 366'

09:00 10:30 01:30 Condition Mud and Circulate Circ and cond hole. R/d Byrd Casing Crew

10:30 12:00 01:30 Cement R/u Allied. Held PJSM. Test lines to 3000 psi. Pump 30 bbls water. Mix and pump 138 bbls (584

sks) Class C cement. 14.8 ppg,1.33 yeild, 6.32 Gps mix water. Displaced w/ 55 bbls fresh

water. Bumped plug wit 500 psi over. Held 5 min. Bled back 1/2 bbl. Floats held. Pressured up

to 500 psi. Shut well in. 57 bbls cmt to surface. Full returns throughout cmt job.

12:00 20:00 08:00 Wait on Cement Wait on cmt. Clean pits

20:00 01:00 05:00 Install/Remove Wellhead/Tree Cut 20" and 13 3/8" Casing. L/o same. Make final cut on 13 3/8" casing. Weld on Cactus MBU-

3T Wellhead.

01:00 02:00 01:00 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP Install Cactus Bop adapter.

02:00 06:00 04:00 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP Nipple up Bop's. Lock down Bop adapter

Thur., May 18, 2017 Activity Log

From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 10:30 04:30 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP Nipple up Bop's. Install kill and Hcr valves. Install Choke line. Install koflex lines. Install remote

kill line valve.

10:30 11:30 01:00 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP Modify flo-line.

11:30 15:00 03:30 Test BOPE M/u test plug. Test Bop's 5K Hi and 250 Low for 10 Min each test.

15:00 17:00 02:00 Third Party Repair Monahans Bop testing truck down. Trouble shoot same. Wait on chart recorder. Test casing to 1500 psi while waiting.

17:00 02:30 09:30 Test BOPE Test Bop's, choke manifold, upper and lower kelly cock valves 250 Low 5K Hi. Test TDS back

to pumps, stabbing valve, Ibop to 250 Low 5K Hi. Test annular to 250 Lo and 2500 Hi 10 Min

each test. Bump test chokes to 5K. Replaced section of mud line, rebuilt check valve, valve

stem on Hcr leaking flush and work valve and retest. Function and retest lower lbop. Performed

Accumulator Test.

02:30 03:00 00:30 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP Install wear bushing.

03:00 06:00 03:00 PU & LD Drill Pipe, Changeout BHA P/u and M/u 12 1/4 Bha. Tih same. Tagged 370' Break circ.

Frid., May 19, 2017 Activity Log

From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 06:30 00:30 Circ/Cond/Filter Break circ @ 370'

06:30 07:30 01:00 Drill Cement Drlg shoe trac f/ 370' to 420'

07:30 15:00 07:30 Drill Rotating Rotate drlg f/ 420' to 884' 464' 61.8 FPH 35K WOB, 700 GPM, 100 RPM, SPP 1450 Psi Diff 350 Psi Tq 7-10K

15:00 16:00 01:00 Circ/Cond/Filter Rotary torqued and stalled @ 12K. P/u and set back on bottom to drill. No torque, or differential pressure. No loss in SPP.

16:00 16:30 00:30 Circ/Cond/Filter Pump sweep. Circ hole clean.

16:30 18:30 02:00 Tripping Pooh f/ motor. Attempt to drain motor. Motor would not drain. Grinding noise in drive shaft. Break bit.

18:30 20:00 01:30 Tripping L/o motor. P/u new motor. M/u Bha. Tih w/ Bha. Break circ.

20:00 20:30 00:30 Routine Rig Maintenance Service rig.

20:30 05:30 09:00 Drill Rotating Rotate Drlg f/ 884' to 1406' 522' 58 FPH 35K WOB, 700 GPM, 55 RPM, SPP 1950 Psi Diff 300 Psi Tg 10K05:30 06:00 00:30 Deviation Survey Wireline survey @ 1403' 1.5 Deg

Cottonwood 28-33 Fed 2BS 1H Sundry - Subsequent Well Report

Sat., May 20, 2017 Activity Log

From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 08:30 02:30 Drill Rotating Rotate Drlg f/ 1406' to 1615' 209' 83.6 FPH 35K WOB, 700 GPM, 55 RPM, SPP 1950 Psi Diff 300 Psi Tq 10K

08:30 09:00 00:30 Condition Mud and Circulate Pump Sweep. Circ hole clean.

09:00 10:00 01:00 Tripping Pooh to 900' for short trip. No overpull. Tih

10:00 10:30 00:30 Condition Mud and Circulate Pump sweep. Circ hole clean.

10:30 14:00 03:30 Tripping Pooh f/ 9 5/8 casing run. No overpull. L/d 8" collars and tools.

14:00 14:30 00:30 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP Pull wear bushing.

14:30 16:00 01:30 Run Casing R/u Byrd Casing Crew. Held PJSM

16:00 19:00 03:00 Run Casing M/u Float shoe, 1 jt 9 5/8, Float Collar and 36 jts 9 5/8 36# J-55 LTC casing, and Hanger Jt.

Total of 1593' w/ 3' stick up. Pipe set @ 1590' Float collar @ 1544'

19:00 20:00 01:00 Run Casing R/d Byrd Casing Crew. R/u Allied Services. Held PJSM

20:00 22:30 02:30 Cement R/u Allied. Held PJSM. Test lines to 3000 psi. Break circ. Pump 30 bbls water. Mix and pump

Lead 146 bbls (328 sks) Class C cement. 12 ppg, 2.51 yield, 14.77 Gps mix water. Mix and

pump tail 23.7 bbls (100sks) 14.8 ppg, 1.33 yield, 6.33 gps mix water. Displaced w/ 120 bbls

fresh water. Bumped plug with 1200 psi. 500 psi over. Held 5 min. Bled back 3/4 bbl. Floats

held. 60 bbls cmt to surface. Full returns through out cmt job.

22:30 23:00 00:30 Cement R/d Allied Services

23:00 00:00 01:00 Install/Remove Wellhead/Tree P/u Washdown tool. Wash wellhead. Set pack-off for 9 5/8 casing. Tested to 5K for 15 Min. Pull

tested to 40K over. L/d tools.

00:00 00:30 00:30 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP WOC. Install wear bushing

00:30 01:30 01:00 Other WOC. R/d casing bails and elevators. Clear rig floor.

01:30 06:00 04:30 PU & LD Drill Pipe, Changeout BHA WOC. P/u and M/u 8 3/4 Bha. Stand back same.

Sun, May 21, 2017Activity Log

From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 06:30 00:30 Wait on Cement WOC

06:30 07:00 00:30 Routine Rig Maintenance Service rig.

07:00 07:30 00:30 Tripping Tih Tagged @ 1530'

07:30 08:30 01:00 Drill Cement Drlg shoe trac f/ 1530' to 1615'

08:30 10:00 01:30 Drill Rotating Rot Drlg f/ 1615' to 1699' 84' 56 FPH 50 GPM 70 RPM 1250 SPP DIFF 230

10:00 11:30 01:30 Tripping Attempt survey. Pressured up and blew nail. Trouble shoot surface equipment. Problem down hole. Pooh

11:30 13:00 01:30 PU & LD Drill Pipe, Changeout BHA L/o MWD and float sub. Motor parted 8' up from bit. Backed off in connection were stator

connect to drive shaft. B/o and L/o bit and motor.

13:00 14:30 01:30 PU & LD Drill Pipe, Changeout BHA P/u and M/u new motor. M/u bit. M/u bha. Shallow test. Tih same.

14:30 16:00 01:30 Tripping Tih

16:00 16:30 00:30 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP Install rotating bearing.

16:30 19:00 02:30 Drill Rotating Rot Drlg f/ 1699' to 1889' 190' 76 FPH 50 GPM 70 RPM 1250 SPP DIFF 230 Hole drifting last survey 1827' 4.68 deg

19:00 21:00 02:00 Directional Tool Failure Trouble shoot MWD. Unable to retrieve surveys.

21:00 01:00 04:00 Tripping Pooh f/ directional tools. B/o and

L/o bit, motor, and Mwd.

01:00 04:00 03:00 Wait on Services Wait on directional tools.

04:00 06:00 02:00 PU & LD Drill Pipe, Changeout BHA P/u and M/u directional tools. Dial down motor to 1.5 Scribe and shallow test same.

Fri., June 9, 2017 Activity Log

From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 10:00 04:00 Tripping TOOH - LD whipstock tools

10:00 15:00 05:00 Tripping PU BHA & TIH

15:00 02:00 11:00 Drill Sliding Drill slide through whipstock from 6193' to 6207' - Drill slide/rotate from 6207' to 6388' - bit wt 35-40, gpm 575

02:00 03:00 01:00 Condition Mud and Circulate Circulate btms up

03:00 06:00 03:00 Tripping TOOH to pick up Curve/Lateral PDC bit

Cottonwood 28-33 Fed 2BS 1H Sundry - Subsequent Well Report

Sun., June 25, 2017 Activity Log From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 07:30 01:30 Tripping Trip out of hole

07:30 08:30 01:00 PU & LD Drill Pipe, Changeout BHA LD BHA

08:30 09:00 00:30 Run Casing Pull wear bushing

09:00 04:00 19:00 Run Casing Held safety meeting - RU Casers & Run 13868' of 5.5" 17# P-110 CDC casing set @ 13858'

04:00 06:00 02:00 Condition Mud and Circulate Shear Float in collar & Circulate out air

Mon., June 26, 2017 Activity Log

From To Hrs Time Code Comments

06:00 09:00 03:00 Condition Mud and Circulate Drop dart for float in sub - circulate

09:00 13:30 04:30 Cement Safety meeting - RU cementers - Cement 5.5" with 468 bbls, 678 sks, 10.5 ppg, 3.88 yield,

24.68 gal/sk Allied Featherweight blend 2 followed by 398 bbls, 1944 sks, 15.8 ppg, 1.16 yield,

4.98 gal/sk Class H premium tail, Displaced W/ 308 bbls fresh water - bumped float w/ 700 over

final lift pressure - floats held - good returns entire job - 120 bbls cement to surface

13:30 00:30 11:00 Nipple Up/Nipple Down BOP Rig down cementers - Nipple down BOPE - Set casing slips W/ 130K

00:30 06:00 05:30 Rig Up and Rig Down Clean pits - Prep rig for Skid