Form 3160-4.

# UNITED STATES

FORM APPROVED

August 1999)			BIIDE	LIOF	AND	<i>Ι</i> Δ Ν Δ (	TERIOI GEMEN	T		`	ج. پکر					004-0137 aber 30, 2000
<u>.</u>	WELL C	COMPL	ETION	OR RI	ECOM	PLET	ION RI	EPORT	AND	LØGှ	≦}} 20∧	,		ase/Serial I		·
			_								<004	(				Tribo Nomo
la. Type of	f Well   Completion	Oil Well	⊠ Gas ew Well		Dry ork Over		Other Deepen	n Pli	ig Back	Di	ff. Res	Vr	6. II	indian, Alie	ottee or	Tribe Name
b. Type of	Completion	Othe					Бесреп	Π. <i>"</i>	Sol.	U Pi	- ;			nit or CA A		ent Name and No.
2. Name of CONO	Operator	S COMP	ANY		С	ontact:	DEBORA E-Mail: c	AH MAR deborah.	BERRY marberry	@cono	cophil	lips.co		ase Name : J 32-7 203		ell No.
3. Address	5525 HIGH FARMING				<u> </u>		3a.		Vo. (includ	577 C	L 1 70 1.	.V		PI Well No.		
4. Location	of Well (Rep	port locati	on clearly	and in ac	cordance	with F	l l			· · · · ·				rield and Po	ool, or	Exploratory
At surfa		870FSL	7W Mer N 925FEL	(IVIP									11. 5	Sec., T., R.,	M., or	Block and Survey
At top p	orod interval r	eported b	elow											Area Secounty or P		32N R7W Mer NMP
At total	•												S	AN JUAN		NM
14. Date S <sub>1</sub> 09/16/2				Date T.D 9/19/20	. Reache 03	d		l ⊓ D &	te Comple & A 16/2003	ted Ready	to Pro	d.	17. I		DF, KI 14 GL	3, RT, GL)*
18. Total L	Depth:	MD TVD	338	7	19. Pl	ug Back	T.D.:	MD TVD	3	172		0. Der	th Bri	dge Plug So		MD TVD
	lectric & Oth		nical Logs	Run (Su	bmit cop	y of eac	h)		<del></del> -			ll corec	? .	<b>№</b> No	□ Yes	(Submit analysis)
NÔNE												T run? onal Su	rvey?	⊠ No	T Yes	(Submit analysis) (Submit analysis)
23. Casing a	nd Liner Reco	ord (Repo	ort all strin			Detter		Comment	XI.	of Cl	. 1	C1	37-1	<u> </u>		T
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.	1 1	op (D)	Bottom (MD)		Cemente Depth		of Sks. a of Ceme	•	Slurry (BB		Cement '	Гор*	Amount Pulled
12.250	9.6	625 H40	32.	.0	0	2	56				200				0	
8.750	7.	.000 J55	20.	٩	0	31	72				511				0	<u> </u>
	<del>                                     </del>			+	-+		+		<del> </del>		$\dashv$	<del></del>				<u> </u>
				+-												
24. Tubing	·															
Size 2.375	Depth Set (M	4D) P 3297	acker Dept	h (MD)	Size	De	pth Set (	MD)	Packer De	epth (M	D)	Size	De	pth Set (M	D)	Packer Depth (MD)
	ng Intervals	0291	· _		<u> </u>	1	26. Perfor	ration Re	cord							
Fe	ormation	1	Тор		Botto	m	]	Perforate	d Interval		$\tau^-$	Size	T N	No. Holes		Perf. Status
A) FF	RUITLAND (	COAL		3172		3387			3172	TO 338	7				OPE	NHOLE
B)						$\perp$					$\mathbf{I}_{-}$				<u> </u>	
C)						$\dashv$					<b>↓</b> _		<del> </del>		<b>.</b>	····
D) 27. Acid, F	racture, Treat	tment. Cer	ment Squee	ze, Etc.			***				<u> </u>					
	Depth Interva	<del></del> _							Amount ar	nd Type	of Ma	terial	···-			
	31	72 TO 3	387 OPEN	HOLE	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,											
						-				·						
28. Product	ion - Interval	Α												<del></del>		
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Ga	<u> </u>	Water	Oil	Gravity	10	as		Product	ion Method		
Produced 10/24/2003	Date 10/14/2003	Tested 24	Production	BBL 0.	о <b>м</b> о	EF 2200.0	BBL 0.0		r. API		iravity			FLOV	VS FR	OM WELL
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Ga		Water BBL	Gas Rati		V	Vell Statu	ıs	*****			<del></del>
PITOT	SI	340.0		<b>&gt;</b>   BBL 0		2200	0	[ Rati	-		PG	W				
28a. Produc	ction - Interva	al B														
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Ga		Water BBL		Gravity r. API		ias iravity		Product	ion Method		,
	<u></u>			<u>&gt;</u>			$\perp$				-,		يُ .	W.C. P. DT	n e	or recor.
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Ga MC		Water BBL	Gas Rati		V	Vell Statu	ıs			- W ( )	

SI

(See Instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #26353 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM
\*\*\* BLM REVISED \*\*\*

28h Prod	action - Interv	al C			_						
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity	Gas	Production Method		
roduced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr. API	Gravity			
choke lize	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well Status			
28c. Prod	uction - Interv	al D					<u> </u>				
ate First roduced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method		
			24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well Status		h	
29. Dispo	sition of Gas	Sold, used f	or fuel, ven	ted, etc.)	<u>+</u>						
	nary of Porous	Zones (Inc.	lude Aquife	rs).				131	Formation (Log) Markers		
Show tests,	all important	zones of po	rosity and c	ontents there	eof: Cored ine tool open,	ntervals and , flowing and	all drill-stem I shut-in pressure				
Formation Top			Bottom		Descriptio	ns, Contents, etc		Name	Top Meas. Dep		
SAN JOSE 0 1001 NACIMIENTO 1001 2386 OJO ALAMO 2386 2503								NACIMIENTO OJO ALAMO KIRTLAND FRUITLAND PICTURED CLIFFS			
	<u>.</u>		,								
32. Addit This	ional remarks well is a sing	(include pl	ugging proc ng Basin Fi	edure): ruitland Co	al.						
<ul> <li>33. Circle enclosed attachments:</li> <li>1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.)</li> <li>2. Geologic Residual Standard Notice for plugging and cement verification</li> <li>6. Core Analysis</li> </ul>							-	3. DST 7 Other	•	Directional Survey	
34. There	by certify that		Elect	ronic Subm For CON	nission #263 NOCOPHII	353 Verified LLIPS COM	by the BLM W IPANY, sent to	ell Information the Farmington		instructions):	
	(please print)				1			UBMITTING C	` ′		
Name	• •						Date 12/23/2003				

#### ConocoPhillips

#### END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

CO110CO1 1	.p3		
	San Juan 32-7 # 203A		Spud: 16-Sep-2003
	30-045-31813		Release Dri Rig: 19-Sep-2003
Location	: 870' FSL & 925' FEL	Trash Cap	Move in Cav Rig 10-Oct-2003
	Sect 22 - T32N - R7W	7-1/16" 3M x 3-1/8" 3M Adapter	-
	San Juan County, NM	11" 3M x 7-1/16" 3M Tubing H	lead
Elevation	: 6614' GL (above MSL)	9-5/8" 8 RD x 11" 3M Casing I	Head
Drl Rig RKB	: 13' above Ground Level		
Datum	: Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL		Surface Cement
		X New	Date cmt'd: 16-Sep-03
Surface Casing	Date set: 16-Sep-03	Used	Lead : 200 sx Class G Cement
Size			+ 2% S001 Calcium Chloride
	t <u>256</u> ft # Jnts: 8		+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes
	. 32.3 ppf Grade H-40		1.16 cuft/sx, 232 cuft slurry at 15.8 ppg
	12 1/4 in Conn STC		Displacement: 17.7 bbls fresh wtr
	t 165 %		Bumped Plug at: 254 psi
	. SURFACE Csg Shoe	256 ft	Final Circ Press: 114 psi
1.0.0	TD of 12-1/4" hole		Returns during job: YES
	10 01 12-174 11016 _		CMT Returns to surface: 17 bbls
Mad	US-JDING become	. 1 1 1	Floats Held: No floats used
Not	tified BLM @hrs on		<del></del>
Notified	NMOCD @ hrs on	<del></del>	W.O.C. for 8.0 hrs (plug bump to csg pressure test)
Set a Wt Hole Size Excess Cm T.O.C		3172_ft	Date cmt'd: 19-Sep-03
Notified	NMOCD @ hrs on		+ 5 lb/sx D024 Gilsonite
		/     /	+ 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes
			+ 0.2% D046 Antifoam
			1.27 cuft/sx, 127 cuft slurry at 13.5 ppg
		( ) )	Displacement: 126 bbls
		\	Bumped Plug at: 1227 psi
We did not run	a liner in this well.		Final Circ Press: 728 psi
Nor did we cavi	tate it.	(   1   1	Returns during job: YES
We just drilled i	t out and ran tubing.	(     )	CMT Returns to surface: 40 bbls
•		)     /	Floats Held: X Yes No
		F	
		TD <u>3,387</u> ft	
		<u> </u>	
COMMENTS:			
Surface:	No float equipment was run. Ran a guide	shoe and an aluminum baffle plate 1 jt	above the guide shoe.
•	Displaced top wiper plug with water. Shu	t in casing head and WOC before backi	ng out landing jt.
Intermediate:			
Production:	We did not run a liner on this well. Nor di Ran F Nipple + 6 jts 3-1/2" 9.7# J-55 FL4		
	We retrieved the blank (plug) from the F N		
CENTRALIZER		The state of the s	
Surface:	CENTRALIZERS @ 240', 224', 194', & 16	35'	Total:4
Intermediate:	CENTRALIZERS @ 3151', 3128', 3045', 2	2962', 2879', 2796', & 247'.	Total: 7

## ConocoPhillips

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT FRUITLA 000203A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 FRUITLAND #203A UNIT

Event Name:

**Original Completion** 

Start:

Spud Date: 9/16/2003 End:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

10/10/2003 Rig Release:

Group:

Contractor Name:

Rig Name:		KEY FO		KINEKS		Rig Number: 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
10/11/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT
	07:00 - 07:30		СМ	С	80CMPL	HELD PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50		1	00MMIR	MOVED RIG AND RIGGED UP SAME, NIPPLE UP BOPS.
	19:00 - 06:00	11.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT
10/12/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	CM	1	80CMPL	SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
	07:00 - 16:00	9.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	HOOK UP BLOOIE LINES, PICK UP DC AND DP OUT OF BASKET AND STRAP. WELDER WORKING ON SEVERAL SAFETY ITEMS.
	16:00 - 18:30	2.50		8	80CMPL	PJSM AND JSA TEST 7" CSG & BLIND RAM'S 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 30 MIN'S STATE INTEGRITY TEST = CHARTED GOOD TEST
	18:30 - 06:00	11.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	SECURED WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
10/13/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	CM	1	80CMPL	SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	CM	С	80CMPL	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL
	07:30 - 08:30	1.00	CM		80CMPL	RIG INSPECTION AND MAKE CORRECTIONS
	08:30 - 10:00	1.50	CM	8	80CMPL	PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS, HCR VALVES,
						CASING VALVES AND ALL MANIFOLD VALVES. 300# LOW FOR 3
						MIN. AND 1800# HIGH FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK
	10:00 - 14:00	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	PICK UP REED BIT, BIT SUB AND F-NIPPLE AND GIH WITH DC AND DP TAG FLOAT COLLAR @
	14:00 - 15:30	1.50	СМ	8	80CMPL	PICK UP SWIVEL AND TEST AIR LINES 300# LOW AND 1800# HIGH.
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50			80CMPL	UNLOAD HOLE WITH AIR
	16:00 - 17:30	1.50	СМ	z	80CMPL	DRLG FLOAT COLLAR, AND 22 FT OF CEMENT TAG @ 3120'
						DRLG WITH AIR MIST, 10 BPH H2O, 1 GPH SOAP
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	СМ	z	80CMPL	CIRC HOLE CLEAN
	18:30 - 19:00		СМ	1	80CMPL	SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT
	19:00 - 06:00	11.00		1	80CMPL	SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT
10/14/2003	06:00 - 07:00		СМ	1	80CMPL	SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT
	07:00 - 07:30		СМ	c	80CMPL	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL
	07:30 - 08:30		СМ	z	50PRDR	ESTABLISH CIRCULATION WITH AIR MIST, 475PSI, 1850 CFM, 12
						BPH H2O, 1 GAL SOAP.
	08:30 - 15:00	6.50	DR	1	50PRDR	DRILLING WITH AIR MIST, 475PSI, 1850 CFM, 12 BPH H2O, 1 GAL SOAP. WITH 10 BBL SWEEPS ON CONNECTIONS.
	15:00 - 16:30	1.50	DR	5	50PRDR	CIRCULATE WITH AIR MIST, WORKING PIPE AND ROTATING.
						BASIN FRUITLAND COAL
						3192' - 3194' = 2' - NO GAS
						3202' - 3206' = 4' - 200 GAS UNITS
						3248' - 3260' = 12' - 255 GAS UNITS
						3278' - 3295' = 17' - 260 GAS UNITS
						3308' - 3309' = 1' - 200 GAS UNITS
						3323' - 3328' = 5' - 200 GAS UNITS
						3342' - 3344' = 2' - 200 GAS UNITS
						43' TOTAL COAL
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	DR	4	80CMPL	PULL UP INTO 7" CASING LAYING DOWN 7 JOINTS OF DP.
	17:00 - 18:00	1.00	СМ	u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
	i					INITIAL SHUT IN PRESSURE 24 # 1520 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 40 # = 1948 MCFD
						30 MINUTES - 38 # = 1917 MCFD
						45 MINUTES - 50 # = 2200 MCFD
						60 MINUTES - 50 # = 2200 MCFD
	18:00 - 20:30	2.50	СМ	t	50PRDR	SHUT IN TEST
						INITIAL SHUT IN PRESSURE 50 #
						15 MINUTES 310 #
						30 MINUTES 340 #
1	1	1			1	

### ConocoPhillips

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT FRUITLA 000203A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 FRUITLAND #203A UNIT

Original Completion

10/10/2003

Spud Date: 9/16/2003 End:

Event Name: Contractor Name:

**KEY FOUR CORNERS** 

Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig N	lumbe	r: 27
-------	-------	-------

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
10/14/2003	18:00 - 20:30	2.50	СМ	t	50PRDR	45 MINUTES 360 # 60 MINUTES 370 # 1 HR 15 MIN. 380 # 1 HR 30 MIN. 385 # 1 HR 45 MIN. 390 # 2 HR 395 #
	00.00.01.00	0.50	0.4			2 HR 15 MIN. 395 #
	20:30 - 21:00 21:00 - 21:30		CM CM	u 4	80CMPL 80CMPL	SLOWLY BLEED DOWN PRESSURE FROM WELL GIH PICKING UP SINGLE JOINTS OF DP WITH SWIVEL, TAG FILL @ 3352'
	21:30 - 22:30		СМ	z	80CMPL	CLEAN OUT 35' TO BOTTOM
	22:30 - 00:00 00:00 - 01:00	1.50	СМ	u	80CMPL 80CMPL	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN, PULL UP INTO CASING. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST
	00.00	1.00				INITIAL SHUT IN PRESSURE 24 # 1520 MCFD  15 MINUTES - 38 #  30 MINUTES - 35 #  45 MINUTES - 40 #  60 MINUTES - 45 #
	01:00 - 03:00	2.00	СМ	t	50PRDR	SHUT IN TEST INITIAL SHUT IN PRESSURE 50 # 15 MINUTES 280 # 30 MINUTES 330 # 45 MINUTES 375 # 60 MINUTES 375 # 1 HR 15 MIN. 380 # 1 HR 30 MIN. 390 # 1 HR 45 MIN. 395 #
	03:00 - 03:30	0.50	СМ	น	50PRDR	2 HR 395 # BLOW WELL DOWN SLOWLY
	03:30 - 04:00	0.50	СМ	1	50PRDR	GIH PICKING UP DP WITH POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3357
10/15/0000	04:00 - 06:00	2.00	l	1	50PRDR	CLEAN OUT TO 3387'
10/15/2003	06:00 - 08:00	2.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN, AND SAFETY MEETING WITH ALL PERSONEL
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PULL UP HOLE LAYING DOWN 7 JOINTS OF DP.
	08:30 - 09:30	1.00	СМ	u	50PREV	2" OPEN FLOW TEST INITIAL SHUT IN PRESSURE 20 # 1500 MCFD 15 MINUTES - 40 # = 1948 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 40 # = 1948 MCFD 45 MINUTES - 40 # = 1948 MCFD 60 MINUTES - 40 # = 1948 MCFD
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	СМ	t	50PREV	SHUT IN TEST INITIAL SHUT IN PRESSURE 40 # 15 MINUTES 310 # 30 MINUTES 350 # 45 MINUTES 370 # 60 MINUTES 400 #
	10:30 - 11:30	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SLOWLY BLOW WELL DOWN, CHANGE OUT STRIPPING RUBBER, TRIP IN HOLE, TAG @ 3385
	11:30 - 14:30	3.00	СМ	f	80CMPL	WASH 2' TO BOTTOM, CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN.
	14:30 - 15:00	0.50		4	80CMPL	PULL UP HOLE LAYING DOWN 7 JOINTS OF DP.
	15:00 - 00:00	9.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SHUT WELL IN. 1600 HRS - 400 #
<u></u>						

#### Page 3 of 3

### ConocoPhillips

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT FRUITLA 000203A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 FRUITLAND #203A UNIT

Event Name: Contractor Name: Original Completion

10/10/2003 Start:

Spud Date: 9/16/2003 End:

**KEY FOUR CORNERS** 

Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY ENERGY** 

Rig Number: 27

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
10/15/2003	15:00 - 00:00	9.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	1700 HRS - 420 #
						1800 HRS - 430 #
					ì	1900 HRS - 415 #
				1		2000 HRS - 410 #
						2100 HRS - 405 #
						2200 HRS - 400 #
						2300 HRS - 400 #
						0000 HRS - 400 #
	00:00 - 00:30	0.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	SLOWLY BLOW WELL DOWN
	00:30 - 01:00		СМ	4	80CMPL	RUN IN HOLE TAG @ 3382'
	01:00 - 05:30	4.50	1	f	80CMPL	WASH 5' TO BOTTOM CIRC HOLE CLEAN
	05:30 - 06:00		CM	4	80CMPL	PULL UP HOLE LAYING DOWN 7 JOINTS, HANG SWIVEL BACK, RIG
	05.50 - 00.00	0.50	Oil	7	OOOWII E	UP FLOOR TO LAY DOWN DP
10/16/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	z	80CMPL	RIG UP FLOOR TO LAY DOWN DP AND DC
10/10/2003	1	0.50		c		
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 09:30	1	CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL LAY DOWN DP AND DC
	09:30 - 10:30		CM	z 1	80CMPL	PJSM CHANGE BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS TO 3 1/2
		4.00		2	80CMPL	PICK UP TUBING
	10:30 - 14:30	4.00	CIVI	2	BUCIVIPL	
						F-NIPPLE 0.73
						6 JTS FLUSH JT. 160.10
						1 CHANGE OVER 0.50
					}	98 JTS 3 1/2 TBG 3125.37
						KB 11.00
*					,	BOTTOM OF TUBING @ 3297.70
			İ			LAND DONUT
	14:30 - 15:00		CM	1	80CMPL	RIG DOWN FLOOR
	15:00 - 16:30	1.50	СМ	е	80CMPL	NIPPLE DOWN BOPS AND NIPPLE UP UPPER TREE. PRESSURE
						TEST TO 3000# OK
	16:30 - 18:00	1.50	СМ	z	80CMPL	RIG UP WIRELINE UNIT AND RETRIEVE BLANK FROM F-NIPPLE.
						TAGGED F-NIPPLE @ 3297'
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	RIG DOWN, SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
	1				1	
		ļ			Ì	
		ļ				
			1		ĺ	
		-	-	1	1	
					}	
				1		
	1		(			
			Ì			
	1		Í			
			1			
			1			·
	1	1	1	1	1	