# New Mexico Energy Minerals and Natural Resources Department

Form C-139 Revised 06/99

District I - (505) 393-6161
1625 N. French Dr, Hobbs, NM 88240
District II - (505) 748-1283
1301 W. Grand Avenue, Artesia, NM 88210
District III - (505) 334-6178
1000 Rio Brazos Road, Aztec, NM 87410
District IV - (505) 476-3440

1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505

Oil Conservation Division 1220 South St. Francis Dr. Santa Fe, New Mexico 87505 (505) 476-3440

SUBMIT ORIGINAL PLUS 2 COPIES TO APPROPRIATE DISTRICT OFFICE

#### **APPLICATION FOR PRODUCTION RESTORATION PROJECT**

Operato	name addres	Burlingto		ces Oil and Gas gton, NM 8749		1		OGRID Numb	<sup>ber</sup> 014538			
Contact	Party	Leslie D	. White					Phone	505/326-9700			
Property Name RHODES T L B Well Number 1									3004511777			
UL	Section   Township   Range   Feet From The   Feet From The								County			
O 02 28 N 11 W 839 FSL 2013 FEL								SAN JUAN				
	s Producing P	ool(s) (If change i	in Pools):						3,56780			
Date P	oduction Rest	oration Started:		4/26/2003		Date Well Return	ed to Production:		5/6/2003 MAR 200 "			
Descrit	e the process	used to return the	well to producti	on (Attach additional infor	mation if ne	cessary):	See Attach	ned	E CALL			
IV.		Oct form C-11 OAVIT:  State ofI  County of LeslieI  1. I am 2. I have availa 3. To the curve	New Mexico San Juan D. White the Operato e made, or cook to be for this very and/or table	), being first du r, or authorized repraised to be made, Vell. knowledge, this ap	ss. ly sworn, resentativ a diligent	Upon oath state	DUCTION D.	e-referenced W rds reasonably				
	Signatu SUBSC		SWORN TO	White Ti before me this		of March	ate 3/5/L	<u> </u>				
	My Con	nmission expi	res: Sep	Hember 15, a	2004	Notary	Public Ta	matha W	inesatt			
v.	CER' This Divis Secre was o	FIFICATION Application is ion hereby ve	OF APPROS s hereby apprifies the department of t	USE ONLY: DVAL: Droved and the about a shows a positive Revenue Department	product nt of this	ion increase. B	copy hereof,	the Division n	otifies the			

HODES TLB 1	3004511777	71599	71629	71280
	REG DITE ON G	as prodeg	AS PROD GA	KSZPROD
	1-May-01	0		
	01-Jun-01	0		
	01-Jul-01	0		
	01-Aug-01	0		
	01-Sep-01	0		
	01-Oct-01	0		
	01-Nov-01	0		
	01-Dec-01	0		
	01-Jan-02	0		
	01-Feb-02	0		
	01-Mar-02	0		
	01-Apr-02	0		
	01-May-02	0		
	01-Jun-02	0		
	01-Jul-02	0		
	01-Aug-02	0		
	01-Sep-02	0		
	01-Oct-02	0		
	01-Nov-02	0		
	01-Dec-02	. 0		
	01-Jan-03	0		
	01-Feb-03	0		
	01-Mar-03	0		
	01-Apr-03	0		
	01-May-03		946	946
	01-Jun-03		6064	6064
	01-Jul-03		1024	1024
	01-Aug-03		1873	1873

### **BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS**

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

RHODES T L B #1

Common Well Name: RHODES T L B #1

Event Name:

**CAP WORKOVER** 

Start:

Spud Date: 04/26/2003

End:

05/06/2003

Contractor Name:

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

Rig Release: 05/06/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

**AZTEC** 

Rig Number: 485

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub	Phase	Description of Operations					
04/28/2003	10:00 - 10:30	n 50	MIMO	a	OBJECT	CREW TRAVEL.					
04/20/2000	10:30 - 10:45	1	SRIG	a	OBJECT	SERVICE & START RIG.					
	10:45 - 11:00	1	SAFE	a	OBJECT						
	11:00 - 12:00	1	MIMO	1	OBJECT	SAFETY MEETING, 4 AZTEC, 1 BR - TOPIC - FRAC SAFETY					
	12:00 - 13:00	1	PERF	a	1	MOVE IN BLUE JET, RIG UP. RIH W/ 3-1/8" HSC GUN W/ OWEN HSC-3125-302 10 GR .032" DIA					
	12.00 - 13.00	1.00	FERF	а	OBJECT						
	,					CHARGES @ 120 DEGREE PHAISING & PERF W/ 1 SPF 1,625' TO					
	13:00 - 15:00	2 00	мімо		OBJECT	1,635' (11 HOLES)					
	15:00 - 17:00	1	RURD	a	OBJECT	MOVE IN DOWELL.					
		1	1	1							
	17:00 - 18:00 1.00 FRAC a OBJECT FRAC PC W/ 241 BBLS 20# LINEAR GEL, 70% QUA										
	1			1		207,100 SCF N2 W/ 100,000# 20/40 ARIZONA SAND 1 PPG TO 4 PPG,					
	1				1	FLUSH W/ 25 BBLS 2% KCL MAX PRESS - 1,470 PSI, MIN PRESS -					
						1,365, AVRG PRESS - 1,415 PSI. MAX RATE - 35 BPM, MIN RATE - 3					
						BPM, AVRG RATE 35 BPM. INSTANT SHUT DOWN PRESS - 885 PSI.					
	18:00 - 18:15	0.25	CASE	_	OB IEST	266 FLUID BBLS TO RECOVER. SHUT IN.					
	i	1	CASE	а	OBJECT	RIH & SET FLOW THROUGH FRAC PLUG @ 1,582'.					
	18:15 - 18:45 18:45 - 19:30	1	TEST	a	OBJECT	TEST FRAC PLUG & CSG W/ 3,600 PSI.					
	10.45 - 19.50	0.75	PERF	а	OBJECT	IN TWO RUNS PERF FRUITLAND COAL W/ 2 SPF 1,572 - 1,354'. RIG					
	40.20 20.20	4.00	ED40		00 1505	DOWN BLUE JET.					
	19:30 - 20:30	1.00	FRAC	а	OBJECT	W/ DOWELL ATTEMPT TO BREAK DOWN FRUILAND COAL, HIT					
					1	MAX PRESS @ 3,600 PSI, WOULD NOT BREAK, FRAC -Y CAP					
			}	ļ		STARTED LEAKING, SHUT WELL IN, CHANGE O-RING IN CAP,					
						ATTEMPT BREAK DOWN, CAP STARTED LEAKING @ 3,200 PSI,					
	20.20 24.20	4.00		_	00.1505	FORMATION DID NOT BREAK.					
	20:30 - 21:30	1.00	NUND	а	OBJECT	NIPPLE DOWN DOWELL N2 LINE, NIPPLE UP FLOW BACK LINE,					
	24.20 00.00	0.50	E1 0144	_	000-	SECURE DOWELL EQUIP.					
	21:30 - 06:00	8.50	FLOW	а	OBJECT	FLOW BACK AS FOLLOWS:					
	]					TIME CHOKE PRESS FLUID SAND GAS					
				1	Ī	21:30 8/64" 1050 FOAM 0 N2					
						23:00 8/64" 500 FOAM 0 N2					
	1			1		00:00 8/64" 20 FOAM 0 N2					
				İ	1	02:00 10/64" 5 FOAM 0 N2					
0.410010000	00.00 00.00	04.00	E1 0) 1			06:00 48/64" 0 TRC FOAM 0 0					
04/29/2003	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	FLOW	a	OBJECT	FLOW BACK ON 2" OPEN LINE, FLOW TRACE OF FOAM & N2 @ 0					
04/00/0000	00.00 00.00	0.50				PSI.					
04/30/2003	06:00 - 06:30		MIMO	а	OBJECT	CREW TRAVEL.					
	06:30 - 06:45		SRIG	а	OBJECT	SERVICE & START RIG. SAFETY MEETING					
	06:45 - 07:15		NUND	a	OBJECT	NIPPLE DOWN FRAC VALVE, NIPPLE UP BOP.					
	07:15 - 07:30		TRIP	a	OBJECT	TRIP IN W/ 46 JT 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG, TAG SAND @ 1,439'.					
	07:30 - 08:30	1.00	COUT	а	OBJECT	NIPPLE UP TO CIRC CONVENTIONAL, BREAK CIRC W/ 2% KCL,					
	00.20 00.00	2 50	CDCT		OD 1505	CLEAN OUT SAND 1,439' TO 1,579'.					
	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	SPOT	а	OBJECT	SPOT 4 BBLS 15% HCL ACID ACROSS FRUITLAND PERFS. TRIP					
	00.00 40.00	4 00	A II			OUT W/ 51 JTS 2-3/8" TBG.					
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00	NUND	a	OBJECT	PICK UP PACKER, SET & 30', NIPPLE UP FRAC VALVE & FRAC -Y,					
	40.00 44.00					NIPPLE UP DOWELL.					
	10:00 - 11:30	1.50	FRAC	a	OBJECT	SAFETY MEETING, TEST LINES W/ 4,600 PSI, BREAK FRUITLAND					
						COAL @ 603 PSI, PUMP 8 BBLS 15% HCL ACID, FRAC FRUITLAND					
						COAL W/ 2461 BBLS 25# LINEAR GEL, 75% QUAILITY FOAM W/					
	l					627,600 SCF N2 W/ 80,000# 20/40 ARIZONA SAND .25 PPG TO 4					
		J				PPG, FLUSH W/ 8 BBLS 2% KCL W/ N2, MAX PRESS - 2,677 PSI, MIN					
		İ				PRESS - 1,251, AVRG PRESS - 2,470 PSI. MAX RATE - 50 BPM, MIN					
						RATE - 17 BPM, AVRG RATE 50 BPM. INSTANT SHUT DOWN					
		!				PRESS - 1483 PSI. 469 FLUID BBLS TO RECOVER. SHUT IN.					
ĺ		ĺ	1	' i							

#### Page 2 of 4

### **BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS**

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

RHODES T L B #1

Common Well Name: RHODES T L B #1

Event Name:

**CAP WORKOVER** 

Spud Date:

04/26/2003 Rig Release: 05/06/2003

End: Group: 05/06/2003

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**AZTEC WELL SERVICE** AZTEC

Rig Number: 485

Rig Name:		AZTEC				Rig	Number:	485				
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase			Descri	otion of (	Operatio	ons	
04/30/2003	11:30 - 12:30	1.00	RURD	а	OBJECT	RIG D	OWN DOW	ÆLL.				
	12:30 - 06:00	17.50	FLOW	а	OBJECT	FLOW	BACK AS	FOLLOWS:				
						TIME	CHOKE	PRESS	FLUID	SAND	GAS	12:30
						8/64"	1150	FOAM	0	N2		
						13:30	8/64"	1050	FOAM	0	N2	
			Ì		ŀ	14:30	8/64"	975	FOAM	0	N2	
						15:30	8/64"	950	FOAM	Ô	N2	
		]				ı	8/64"	800	FOAM	Ŏ	N2	
					1	1	8/64"	850	FOAM	Ŏ	N2	
		ŀ					10/64"	600	FOAM	Ô	N2	
	1				Į.		12/64"	500	FOAM	Ō	N2	
					ł		12/64"	275	FOAM	Ō	N2	
						1	18/64"	200	FOAM	Ō	N2	
						1	20/64"	125	FOAM	Ŏ	N2	
							24/64"	52	FOAM	Ŏ	N2	
05/01/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	SAFE	а	OBJECT			RV SAFETY		-	• • •	
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	MIMO	a	OBJECT	1	TRAV					
	07:30 - 07:45	0.25	SRIG	а	OBJECT	SERVICE & START RIG						
	07:45 - 08:45		NUND	а	OBJECT	NIPPLE DOWN FRAC VALVE, RELEASE & PULL PACKER, NIPPLE						
						UP STRIPPER HEAD & BLOOIE LINE.						
	08:45 - 09:15	0.50	TRIP	а	OBJECT	PICK UP 3-7/8" SUPER MILL, TRIP IN HOLE W/ 51 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7#						
				1		J-55 8rd EUE TBG. TAG FLOW THROUGH PLUG.						
	09:15 - 12:30	3.25	MILL	а	OBJECT	MILL OUT CIBP @ 1, 582' W 450 SCF/M AIR MIST @ 14 BPH						
	12:30 - 13:30	ľ	COUT	a	OBJECT	CLEAN OUT SAND FROM 1,610' TO PBTD @ 1,800' W/ 450 SCF/M						
	1.0.00					AIR MIST @ 10 BPH.						
	13:30 - 06:00	16.50	BLOW	a	OBJECT	BLOW W/ 450 SCF/M AIR W/ TBG @ 1,635'. INITIAL CELLED FRAC FLUID @ 7 BPH W/ HEAVY SAND, FINAL GELLED FRAC FLUID @ 3						
	10.00		52011	-	ODGEO.							
				1	1		// TRACE (		/ ((U), 1 II W	T OLLL	-011001	COID @ 3
05/02/2003	06:00 - 06:30	0.50	мімо	а	OBJECT	1		LOCATION.				
	06:30 - 06:45		SRIG	a	OBJECT		& START F					
	06:45 - 07:00		TRIP	a	OBJECT	TRIP IN, TAG 1 ' SAND.						
	07:00 - 10:30		FLOW	a	OBJECT	FLOW ON 2" OPEN LINE @ 3.5 BBLS FRAC FOAM, NO SAND.						
	10:30 - 11:15		TRIP	a	OBJECT	TRIP OUT W/ 56 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG. LAY DOWN 3-7/8"						
				1-		MILL.	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	0.02.00 4	. 1 # 0 -00 01	O LOL 11	JO. DAT D	OVVIV 3-770
	11:15 - 12:00	0.75	TRIP	а	OBJECT	· ·	N W/ 2-3/8"	SAW TOOT	H COLLA	R 2-3/8"	Y 1 78" ID	SEATING
				-	02020.			4' PUP JT &				
						NO FIL		- 1 O1 O1 G	00 010 E	0/0 4./#	U-00 014 L	OL IDO.
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50	FLOW	a	OBJECT			F FLOWING	4 RPH LI	NRROKE!	N GEL TO	ADED LIP
	12:30 - 13:15		BLOW	a	OBJECT	FLOW ON 2" LINE. FLOWING 4 BPH UNBROKEN GEL, LOADED UP. BLOW W/ 450 SCF/M AIR. UNLOADED 15 +/- BBLS GELLED FRAC						
		5 5		-		1	& FOAM.	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,		10 17- DE	LO OLLLL	DIIVO
	13:15 - 15:00	1.75	FLOW	а	OBJECT			BLOOIE LII	NF W/3 R	RI S FOA	M/GELL H	D
				-	00000			LINE. SWIT				
				1	1			E OF SAND.	טיובט טאי		OOIL LINE	L VV/ 20
	15:00 - 16:00	1 00	BLOW	а	OBJECT			F/M AIR. IN	TIAI EOA	MIGELL	@ C DDU 1	EINIAI
	10.00			<u> </u>	35550			BPH. NO SA		17# JELL (	eg ∪ DFH, I	HAVE
	16:00 - 06:00	14.00	FLOW	a	OBJECT			W & BLOW.		4 991		HNI OAD
		50		_	JUNEO!		BLS FOAM		I LOVVO 3	- 4 DDL	- OAW/HR,	CINCOAD
05/03/2003	06:00 - 06:15	0.25	MIMO	a .	OBJECT			LOCATION.				
	06:15 - 06:30		SRIG	a	OBJECT		& START F					
	06:30 - 06:45			a	OBJECT			(IG. G, 4 AZTEC,	1 ENEDO	V AID T	ODIC	
	06:45 - 07:15	-	TRIP	a	OBJECT		7 MEE 1139 N. TAG 1 ' S		, I ENERG	T AIR, I	OPIC -	
	07:15 - 07:30			a	OBJECT				ID CIDO	46±/ DD:	C FOAL!	-0
	07.10 = 07.00	0.23	DLOVY	d	OBJECT	SURFA		150 SCF/M A	irt, CIRC	IOT/- BBL	.o FUAM I	U
						SURPA	<b>.</b> ∪⊏.					
	ı	1		I .	l	1						

### **BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS**

### **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: RHODES T L B #1
Common Well Name: RHODES T L B #1

Event Name:

**CAP WORKOVER** 

**AZTEC WELL SERVICE** 

Start:

Spud Date: End: 04/26/2003

Group:

05/06/2003

**Contractor Name:** Rig Name:

**AZTEC** 

Rig Release: 05/06/2003

Rig Number: 485

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
05/03/2003	07:30 - 12:30	5.00	FLOW	а	OBJECT	RIG UP L & L OILFIELD SERV TEST UNIT, TEST PICTURED CLIFFS & FRUITLAND COAL. 3 HR TEST W/ 40 PSI BACK PRESSURE @ 200 MCF/D.
	12:30 - 13:15		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TRIP OUT W/ 58 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG.
	13:15 - 14:15		TRIP	а	OBJECT	PICK UP RBP & TRIP IN W/ 51 JTS 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG. SET RBP @ 1,580'. PULL UP TO 1,500'.
	14:15 - 18:00		TEST	а	OBJECT	TEST FRUITLAND COAL THROUGH TEST UNIT W/ 40 PSI BACK PRESSURE. TESTED @ 301 MCF/D.
	18:00 - 18:15		BLOW	a	OBJECT	CLEAN OFF RBP W/ 450 SCF/M AIR. RELEASE RBP.
	18:15 - 19:00		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TRIP OUT W/ 51 JTS 2-3/8" TBG. LAY DOWN BRIDGE PLUG.
	19:45 - 20:30		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TRIP IN W/ 58 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG.
	20:30 - 06:00		FLOW	a	OBJECT	FLOW THROUGH BLOOIE LINE, FLOWING 3.5 BBLS FOAM & WTR. FLOWING W/ 30' FLARE THROUGH BLOOIE LINE.
05/04/2003	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	FLOW	а	OBJECT	FLOW THROUGH BLOOIE LINE, FLOWING 3.5 BBLS FOAM & WTR. FLOWING W/ 30' FLARE THROUGH BLOOIE LINE. BLOW W/ AIR @
	1		1			09:00 HRS, UNLOADED 10+/- BBLS FOAM & WATER.
05/05/2003	06:00 - 06:00	24.00	FLOW	а	OBJECT	FLOW THROUGH BLOOIE LINE, FLOWING 1.5 BBLS FOAM & WTR. FLOWING W/ 30' FLARE THROUGH BLOOIE LINE. BLOW W/ AIR @ 08:00 HRS & 16:00 HRS, UNLOADED 8+/- BBLS FOAM & WATER.
05/06/2003	06:00 - 06:15	0.25	мімо	а	OBJECT	CREW TRAY TO LOCATION.
	06:15 - 06:30		SRIG	a	OBJECT	SERV & START RIG.
	06:30 - 06:45		SAFE	а	OBJECT	SAFETY MEETING, 4 AZTEC, 1 ENERGY AIR, TOPIC - PINCH POINTS
	06:45 - 07:00	0.25	TRIP	а	OBJECT	TAG 15' SAND.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	BLOW	а	OBJECT	COUT SAND W/ 450 SCF/M AIR, CIRC 15+/- BBLS FOAM TO SURFACE.
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	TRIP	a	OBJECT	TRIP OUT W/ 58 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG.
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	TRIP	a	OBJECT	PICK UP ARROW PACKER & TRIP IN HOLE W/ 51 JTS 2-3/8" 43.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG, SET PACKER @ 1,580'.
	08:30 - 09:00		WIRE	а	OBJECT	RIG UP COBRA SLICK LINE, RETREIVE BLANKING PLUG.
	09:00 - 15:00		FLOW	a	OBJECT	RIG UP L & L OILFIELD SERV TEST UNIT, TEST PICTURED CLIFFS @ 358 MCF/D W/ 40 PSI BACK PRESS.
	15:00 - 15:30		WIRE	а	OBJECT	RIG UP COBRA, SET TBG PLUG, RIG DOWN COBRA, RELEASE PACKER.
	15:30 - 16:00		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TRIP OUT W/ 51 JTS 2-3/8" TBG. LAY DOWN PACKER
	16:00 - 16:30		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TRIP IN W/ SAWTOOTH COLLAR, SEATNG NIPPLE, 2-3/8" X 4' 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE PUMP JT @ 60 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG.
	16:30 - 17:00		BLOW	а	OBJECT	BLOW W/ 450 SCF/M AIR MIST, CLEAN OUT 10' SAND, UNLOAD 15 +/- BBLS FOAM / WATER.
	17:00 - 17:15	0.25	TRIP	а	OBJECT	LAY DOWN 6 JTS TBG, LAND TBG AS FOLLOWS:  1 2-3/8" 8rd EUE EXPENDABLE CHECK @ 1,645.11'.  1 2-3/8" X 1.78" SEATING NIPPLE @ 1,643.75'
						1 2-3/8" X 1.78" SEATING NIPPLE @ 1,643.75'. 1 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG. 1 2-3/8" X 4' 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE PUP JT @ 1,608.10'.
						1
	17:15 - 18:30	1.25	NUND	а	OBJECT	RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN BLOOIE LINE & BOP, NIPPLE UP TREE.
	18:30 - 19:30	1.00	PUMP	а	OBJECT	COULD NOT PUMP OFF EXPENDABLE CHECK, PRESSURE TO 1,400 PSI W/ AIR PACKAGE SEVERAL TIMES, FILL TBG W/ 2% KCL AND PRESS W/ 2,300 PSI SEVERAL TIMES W/ RIG PUMP, NO SUCCESS, SHUT WELL IN, SECURE LOCATION, SHUT DOWN FOR
5/07/2003	06:00 - 06:15	0.25	мімо	а	OBJECT	NIGHT. CREW TRAV TO LOCATION.
	3.00 00.10	0.23		-	JUJEU1	ONLY HAV TO LOCATION.

### **BURLINGTON RESOURCES DIVISIONS**

Page 4 of 4

05/06/2003

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

RHODES T L B #1

Contractor Name:

Common Well Name: RHODES T L B #1

Event Name:

**CAP WORKOVER** 

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

Start:

Spud Date: 04/26/2003

End:

Rig Release: 05/06/2003 Group:

Rig	Num	ıber:	485
-----	-----	-------	-----

Contractor Rig Name:		AZTEC V AZTEC	WELL S	ERVIC	E	Rig Release: 05/06/2003 Group: Rig Number: 485
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
05/07/2003	06:15 - 06:30 06:30 - 06:45 06:45 - 07:00 07:00 - 07:15 07:15 - 08:00	0.25 0.25 0.25	SRIG SAFE FLOW NUND TRIP	a a a a	OBJECT OBJECT OBJECT OBJECT OBJECT	SERV & START RIG. SAFETY MEETING, 4 AZTEC, 1 ENERGY AIR, TOPIC - PINCH POINTS SHUT IN TBG - 0 PSI. SHUT IN CSG - 160 PSI, BLEED TO PIT. NIPPLE DOWN TREE, NIPPLE UP BOP, RIG UP FLOOR. ROUND TRIP TBG & CHANGE OUT EXPENDABLE CHECK. BLOW
	08:00 - 08:30 08:30 - 09:00 09:00 - 10:00	0.50 0.50	NUND BLOW RURD	a a	OBJECT OBJECT	BOTTMS UP W/ AIR. UNLOADED 15+/- BBLS FOAMWATER. RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN BOP, NIPPLE UP TREE, CIRC BOTTOMS UP W/ 450 SCF/M AIR. UNLOADED 15 +/- BBLS FOAMWATER. DROP BALL, PUMP OFF EXPENDABLE CHECK. RIG DOWN AZTEC RIG # 485. RELEASE RIG @ 10:00 HRS 05/06/2003.
						NOTE: TRANFERS 1 BR 400 BBL TANK TO GREER # 1, & 1 BR 400 BBL TANK TO GREER # 2, & 1 TANK TO YARD.
			:			TRANSFER 144 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 8rd EUE TBG TO BR STOCK.
						•
		i				

Printed: 03/03/2004 11:55:47 AM