4.8

LINITED STATES

FORM APPROVED

August 1999)	•		DEPAR BUREA	TMEN	NT OF					/					004-0137 ber 30, 2000
	WELL C	OMPL	ETION C	R RE	COM	IPLET	ION RI	EPOR	T AND I	LOG			ase Serial N IMSF07842		
la. Type of	Well \square	Oil Well	⊠ Gas	Well	□ D	ту П	Other					6. If	Indian, Allo	ttee or	Tribe Name
	Completion		lew Well	□ Wo			Deepen	□ Pl	ug Back	□ Diff.	Resvr.	7. U	nit or CA Aş	greeme	ent Name and No.
2. Name of CONO	Operator COPHILLIPS	S COMP	ANY		•	Contact:			EZ perez@c	onocophi)	lips:eom		ease Name a		
3. Address	HOUSTO	N, TX 7	7252				3a. Ph	Phone : 832.4	No. (includ 86:2329	~	1.	9. A	PI Well No.	30-03	9-27542-00-C1
4. Location At surface	of Well (Rep Sec 31	T29N F	ion clearly at 6W Mer NM L 2605FEL	ΛP				Ė	\$)** '> 10%	MAY	004	图		V / BA	SÎN DAKOTA
	rod interval r			00.07	57 (14)	Lui, 10 1.	.00001 4	(c)	7			[EE] 0	r Area Sec	31 T	Block and Survey 29N R6W Mer NMF
At total	-		117 8	. 45 15				<u> </u>		~~~~ <u>@</u>		F	County or Pa	4	13. State NM
14. Date Sp 03/17/2				ate T.D /25/20	04			16. Da	te Comple & A CA 03/2004	Ready to				7 GL	3, R1, GL)*
18. Total D		MD TVD	8135			Plug Back		MD TVD		133	20. De	•	dge Plug Se	•	MD TVD
	lectric & Oth OT GR CCL	er Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Sul	omit co	py of eac	h)			l Wa	s well core s DST run ectional S	?	No i	¬ Yes	(Submit analysis) (Submit analysis) (Submit analysis)
23. Casing ar	nd Liner Reco	ord (Repe	ort all string.	s set in	well)										
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD)						ter No. of Sks. & Slurry Type of Cement (BB			1 ('ement lon*		Amount Pulled	
12.250	9.6	25 H-40	32.0		0	2	38			1	50			0	
8.750		000 J-55	20.0		0	39	17			6	30			0	
6.250	4.5	00 N-80	12.0	<u> </u>	0	81	35			4	70			2890	
				-		···			_		<u> </u>				
							+				+				***
24. Tubing	Record		ł												
Size	Depth Set (M	ID) P	acker Depth	(MD)	Siz	e De	epth Set (MD)	Packer De	epth (MD)	Size	De	epth Set (MI	D)	Packer Depth (MD)
2.375		7891					7/ D-C								
25. Produci					D :		26. Perfo					٠,			D 6 6
	ormation	OTA	Тор	7890	Bot	8008		Pertorate	d Interval	TO 8008	Size	340	No. Holes	OPE	Perf. Status
A) B)	DAN	NOTA		7090		8008			7090	10 8008		340	70	OPE	N .
C)		-+													
D)				-				····				-			****
27. Acid, Fr	acture, Treat	ment, Ce	ment Squeez	e, Etc.					***						
	Depth Interva	ıl							Amount ar	nd Type of	Material				2.1
	78	90 TO 8	008 FRAC'E	W/SLI	CKWAT	ΓER@1.2	5 G/MG F	R; 40,00	0# 20/40 SI	UPER LC 8	4238 BBL	S. FLUI	D.		
28. Product	ion - Interval	A												_	
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	10	as	Water	Oil	Gravity	Gas		Product	ion Method		
Produced 05/03/2004	Date 04/30/2004	Tested 24	Production	BBL O.		ACF 2178.0	BBL 5.0		rr. API	Gra	vity	İ	EL OW	IS ERO	OM WELL
Choke	Tbg. Press	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil		Gas	Water		s:Oil	Wei	Status	<u> </u>	12011	7017	JIVI VV EEL
Size 1/2		Press. 600.0	Rate	BBL 1	N	ACF 2178	BBL	Rat	io						
	tion - Interva			11		2178	5			L	GSI				
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	To	ias	Water	Oil	Gravity	Gas		Product	ion Method		
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL		ICF	BBL		r. API	Gra	vity		4CCEP!	žo F	ur recon

Rate

Csg. Press.

Tbg. Press Flwg.

Produced

Choke Size

Gas MCF

Water BBL

MAY n 6 2004

Gas:Oil Ratio

Well Status

28b. Prod	uction - Interv	/al C									
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity	Gas		Production Method	
Produced	oduced Date Tested		Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr. API	Gravit	у		
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	Water	Gas:Oil	Well S	tatus	<u> </u>	
Size	Flwg. SI	Press.	Rate	BBL	MCF	BBL	Ratio	ļ.			
28c Prod	uction - Interv	/al D				.l. <u>.</u>	L.,			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Water	Oil Gravity	Gas	-	Production Method	
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL	Corr. API	Gravit	у		
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	Water	Gas:Oil	Well S	tatus	<u> </u>	
Size	Flwg. Si	Press.	Rate	BBL	MCF	BBL	Ratio				
29. Dispo	sition of Gas	Sold, used	for fuel, ven	ed. etc.)		<u> </u>	<u> </u>				
VENT			. y = . y								
	nary of Porous	,	•	•					31. For	mation (Log) Markers	
						intervals and a	all drill-stem shut-in pressure	06			
	coveries.	ui interva	testeu, cusiii	on useu, un	ie toor open	, nowing and	siiut-iii piessuit	CS			
									<u> </u>		
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Description	s, Contents, etc	. .		Name	Top Meas. Depth
SAN JOS	F		0	1507	+				NA	CIMIENTO	1422
NACIMIE	NTO		1507	2762					OJ	O ALAMO	2716
OJO ALA	MO		2762	2931						RTLAND CTURED CLIFFS	2906 3618
		ļ		ļ					[CH	IACRA	4608
]						ENEFEE DINT LOOKOUT	5488 5818
				1					GA	LLUP	7091
		- 1		ļ	- [REENHORN KOTA	7786 7997
										III II	1 ,33,
		l		l							
		- 1									
		ĺ									
		Į			ļ				į		
									Í		
		ļ									
32. Addit	ional remarks	(include) nhole co	plugging proc mminaled we	edure): ell producir	a from the	Blanco Mes	saverde and B	asin			
	ta. Attached						averae and B	aoni			
33. Circle	enclosed atta	chments:									
1. El	ectrical/Mech	anical Log	gs (1 full set re	eq'd.)		2. Geologic l	Report	3.	DST Re	port 4. Direct	ional Survey
5. Su	ndry Notice f	or pluggin	g and cement	verification	l	6. Core Anal	ysis		Other:		•
34. There	by certify that	the foreg	oing and attac	hed inform	ation is con	nplete and cor	rect as determin	ned from al	availabl	e records (see attached instruc	ctions):
	, ,	J				-	by the BLM W			•	
				For CON	ЮСОРНІІ	LLIPS COM	PANY, sent to	the Farmi	ington		
N T		_		AFNISS 10	r processii	Ig by ADKIE	NNE GARCIA		`	•	
name	(please print)	TULAN	DA PEREZ				Title S	K. KEGU	LATOR	Y ANALYST	-
		(E11				-	Date 05/06/2004				
Signa	ture	(Electro	nic Submiss	ion)			Date <u>0</u>	5/06/2004		<u> </u>	

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 29-6 UNIT 106M

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 29-6 UNIT 106M

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 1/27/2004 Rig Release: 3/25/2004 Spud Date: 3/17/2004 End:

Group:

5/3/2004

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 47

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
3/27/2004	-					HELD SAFETY MEETING.
	-					Installed csg valves and frac valve.
	-			i		RU Schlumberger. Pressured up on 4 1/2" csg to 2000 #. Ran CBL log
					1	from 8076' to 2650'. Top of cement @ 2890'. Ran TDT log from 8076' to
					1	2000'. Ran GR/CCL log from 8076' to surface. SWI. RD Schlumberger.
3/31/2004	09:00 - 09:30	0.50	EVALWB	SFTY	COMPZN	Held safety meeting
	09:30 - 12:00	2.50	EVALWB	PRTS	COMPZN	RU ISOLATION TOOL. PRESSURE TESTED 4 1/2" CSG TO 6700 #
						FOR 30 MIN. HELD OK.
4/15/2004	13:00 - 13:30	0.50	PERF	SFTY	COMPZN	Held safety meeting.
., , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	13:30 - 16:00		PERF	PERF	COMPZN	RU Blue Jet. Perforated the Dakota. RIH w/ 3 1/8" 120 degree select fire
	10.00	2.00			001111 211	perforating gun. Perforated from 7890' - 7920' w/ 2 spf, 8000' - 8008' w/ 2
						spf. A total of 76 holes w/ 0.34 dia.
4/16/2004	00.00 00.30	0.50	CTIM	CETY	COMPAN	· ·
4/16/2004	09:00 - 09:30		STIM	SFTY	COMPZN	Held safety meeting
	09:30 - 14:00	4.50	STIM	STIM	COMPZN	RU Isolation tool. RU Schlumberger. Frac'd the Dakota. Tested lines to
						7010 #. Set pop off @ 6020 #. Broke down formation @ 3 BPM @ 1581
			Ì			#. Pumped pre pad @ 41 BPM @ 2638 #. SDRT 30 BPM @ 2179 #.
		1				SDRT 20 BPM @ 1804 #. SDRT 11 BPM @ 1549#. ISIP 1500 #. 5 min
						1078 #. 10 min 947 #. 15 min 840 #. 20 min 751 #. 25 min 682 #.
						Frac'd the Dakota w/ Slickwater @ 1.25 g/mg FR. 40,000 # of 20/40
						Supper LC and 4238 bbls fluid. Avg rate 58 BPM. Avg psi 3527. Max
						psi 3613. Max sand cons .40 # per gal. ISIP 1809 #. Frac gradient .63.
	14:00 - 17:00	3.00	PERF	PERF	COMPZN	RU Blue Jet wireline. RIH w/ 4 1/2" composite plug. Set plug @ 5700'.
			-/	1		Tested plug to 4800 #. Held ok. Perforated the Mesaverde. RIH w/ 3 1/8"
						120 degree select fire perforating gun. Perforated from 5380' - 5384' w/
			ļ		1	1/2 spf, 5402' - 5418' w/ 1/2 spf, 5440' - 5450' w/ 1/2 spf, 5470' - 5480' w/
					-	i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i
			1			1/2 spf, 5793' - 5797' w/ 1/2 spf, 5810' - 5814' w/ 1/2 spf, 5822' - 5836' w/
4447/0004	00.00	0.50	07114	0577/	0011071	1/2 spf. A total of 38 holes w/ 0.34 dia. RD Blue Jet.
4/17/2004	08:00 - 08:30	!	STIM	SFTY	COMPZN	Held safety meeting.
	08:30 - 13:00	4.50	STIM	STIM	COMPZN	Frac the Mesaverde. Tested lines to 5420 #. Set pop off @ 4360 #. Brok
						down formation @ 4 BPM @ 2376 #. Pumped 1000 gals of 15 % HCL
	1					acid @ 5 BPM @ 1678 #. Pumped pre pad @ 35 BPM @ 1083 #.
						SDRT 30 BPM @ 459 #. SDRT 25 BPM @ 0 #. ISIP 0 #. Frac THE
						MV w/ 65 Q Slick Foam w/ 1.0 g/mg FR. 175,000 # of 20/40 Brady sand.
						Treated the last 15% of total proppant volume with propnet for proppant
	-					flowback control. 1785 bbls fluid. 2,366,200 SCF N2. Avg rate 50 BPM.
						Avg psi 2878. Max psi 3079. Max sand cons 1.5 # per gal. ISIP 1701 #.
	1					Frac gradient .44. SWI. RD Schlumberger.
4/26/2004	09:00 - 09:30	0.50	WELLPR	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM W/ CREW. DISCUSSED DAYS EVENTS AND WAYS TO
	12.00	0.00]	J 50	PREVENT INCIDENT. SICP=600# CHECK LOCATION FOR
	1					HAZZARDS. CHECK FOR LELS.
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	WELLPR	DIIDD	COMPZN	
		!	I	1		RIG INSPECTION, SPOT UNIT AND EQUIPMENT.
	10:30 - 12:00	1	RPEQPT	1	COMPZN	RU UNIT AND EQUIPMENT.
	12:00 - 14:00	2.00	RPEQPT	PKIS	COMPZN	KILL WELL W/ 20 BBL KCL. INSTALL HANGER W/ 2 WAY CHECK.
						RD FRAC VALVE, NU BOPE. RU WOOD GROUP AND TEST BLIND
						AND PIPE RAMS, 250# LOW FOR 5 MIN EA, AND 3000# HIGH FOR 15
						MIN EA. TEST WAS GOOD AND CHARTED. WITNESSED BY W.
	1					SHENEFIELD W/ MVCI. RD WOOD GROUP.
[14:00 - 15:30	1.50	RPEQPT	DNUN	COMPZN	RU BLOOIE LINES. PLACE CONCRETE BLOCKS ON PUMP, AIR AND
						FLOW LINES.BACK DRAG RUTS ON LOCATION.
	15:30 - 18:00	2.50	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	KILL WELL W/ 20 BBL KCL. REMOVE HANGER. MU AND TIH
		}				TALLYING AND PICKING UP FROM FLOAT W/ 3 7/8" 3 BLADED MILL.
		İ	1		1	BITSUB, STRING FLOAT AND 87 JTS 2 3/8" TBG. TO 2750'.
	18:00 - 18:15	0.25	RPCOME	OTHR	COMPZN	SECURE WELL SDFN.
		5.20	1			
,	1	1	1	1	1	I and the second

Printed: 5/6/2004 10:10:12 AM

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 29-6 UNIT 106M

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 29-6 UNIT 106M

Start: 1/27/2004 Spud Date: 3/17/2004

Event Name: Contractor Name: COMPLETION **KEY FOUR CORNERS**

Rig Release: 3/25/2004

End: 5/3/2004 Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Number: 47

From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
07:00 - 07:45	0.75	RPCOM	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM W/ CREW. DISCUSSED DAYS EVENTS AND WAYS TO PREVENT INCIDENT. SICP=520# BWD
07:45 - 08:45	1.00	RPCOME	CIRC	COMPZN	UNLOAD WELL @ 2750'.
08:45 - 09:45	1.00	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	CONTINUE TO TIH W/ 2 3/8" TBG. AND TAG FILL @ 5708'. (128' PERFS COVERED)
09:45 - 14:00	4.25	RPCOME	FCO	COMPZN	BREAK CIRCULATION W/ AIR. UNLOAD HOLE AND C/O FILL FROM 5708' TO 5936'. CIRCULATE TILL MINIMAL SAND PRODUCTION AND LIGHT MIST REALIZED.
14:00 - 14:15 14:15 - 16:30		I	TRIP	COMPZN COMPZN	PUH TO 5290°. OPEN WELL UP FLOWING UP CSG ON 1/2" CHOKE. FLOW TEST MV FOR 4 HRS AS FOLLOWS:
					MV PERFS- 5380' - 5836' 2 3/8" TBG SET @ 5290' W/ STING FLOAT. (UNABLE TO FLOW UP
					TBG.) TESTED ON 1/2" CHOKE FLOWING UP CSG. SITP- N/A
					FCP= 300#
					MV PROD= 1980 MCFPD 10 BWPD
					1/2 BOPD.
					NO SAND. TEST WITNESSED BY HUMBERTO FRIAS W/ KEY ENERGY SERVICES.
			1		SECURE WELL SDFN.
		I	i	1	CONTRACTOR BREAKFAST SAFETY MTG.
		I	t .	1	ROAD CREW TO LOC.
10:30 - 11:00	0.50	RPCOME	SFIY	COMPZN	PJSM W/ CREW AND AIR HAND. DISCUSSED DAYS EVENTS AND
11:00 - 11:45	0.75	RPCOM	TRIP	COMPZN	WAYS TO PREVENT INCIDENT. SICP=520#. BWD, TIH W/ 10 JTS TBG. AND TAG NO FILL. RU SWIVEL.
11:45 - 14:00	2.25	RPCOME	CIRC	COMPZN	BREAK CIRCULATION W/ AIR. UNLOAD HOLE. DRILL TOP OFF OF CBP @ 5950'. PUH AND LET PRESSURE EQUALIZE. (CIRC. PSI FROM 700# TO 1600#).
14:00 - 15:00	1.00	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	RD SWIVEL. TIH W/ 65 JTS 2 3/8" TBG. TAG FILL @ 7999'.
15:00 - 17:30	2.50	RPCOME	CIRC	COMPZN	RU SWIVEL. BREAK CIRCULATION W/ AIR AND UNLOAD HOLE. C/O FILL FROM 7999' TO 8052'. CIRCULATE CLEAN.
17:30 - 18:00			1	COMPZN	SD AIR. POOH W/ 10 JTS 2 3/8" TBG. SECURE WELL SDFN.
				COMPZN	PJSM. DISCUSSED DAYS EVENTS AND WAYS TO PREVENT INCIDENT.
07:30 - 08:30 08:30 - 15:00				COMPZN	SICP=850#. BWD, TIH W/ 10 JTS 2 3/8" TBG. RU SWIVEL. BREAK CIRCULATION W/ AIR MIST. UNLOAD HOLE. C/O FILL FROM
15:00 16:30	1 50	DDCCM	TOID	004074	8052' TO PBTD OF 8132'. CIRCULATE CLEAN REMAINDER OF DAY.
			1		POOH STANDING BACK W/ 200 JTS 2 3/8" TBG.
07:00 - 07:30			,	COMPZN	SECURE WELL SDFN. PJSM W/ CREW. DISCUSSED DAYS EVENTS AND WAYS TO PREVENT INCIDENT. SICP=780#.
07:30 - 09:00	1.50	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	BWD, TOOH W/ 56 JTS. KILLING WELL W/ 40 BBL KCL WHEN 30 JTS LEFT.
09:00 - 10:30	1.50	RPCOME	TRIP	COMPZN	MU AND TIH W/ SCHLUMBERGER 4.5" HD PKR , TBG. VALVE AND 246 JTS 2 3/8" TBG.
10:30 - 11:30	1.00	RPCOMP	CIRC	COMPZN	BREAK CIRCULATION W/ AIR UNLOAD HOLE. SET PKR @ 7769'. OPEN TBG. VALVE.
11:30 - 15:30	4.00	FLOWT		COMPZN	FLOW TEST DK FORMATION FOR 4 HRS AS FOLLOWS: DK PERFS-7890'-8008' 2 3/8" TBG W/PKR SET @ 7769'.
	16:30 - 16:45 06:00 - 09:00 11:00 - 11:45 11:45 - 14:00 14:00 - 11:45 11:45 - 14:00 14:00 - 15:00 15:00 - 17:30 17:30 - 09:00 07:30 - 08:30 08:30 - 15:00 15:00 - 16:30 16:30 - 16:30 16:30 - 16:30 16:30 - 17:00 07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:30 08:30 - 15:00 15:00 - 16:30 16:30 - 17:00 07:00 - 07:30	From - To Hours 07:00 - 07:45 0.75 07:45 - 08:45 1.00 08:45 - 09:45 1.00 09:45 - 14:00 4.25 14:00 - 14:15 0.25 14:15 - 16:30 2.25 16:30 - 16:45 0.25 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 09:00 - 10:30 1.50 10:30 - 11:45 0.75 11:45 - 14:00 2.25 14:00 - 15:00 1.00 15:00 - 17:30 0.50 07:30 - 18:00 0.50 07:30 - 08:30 1.50 07:30 - 08:30 1.50 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 07:00 - 07:30 0.50 07:30 - 09:00 1.50 09:00 - 10:30 1.50 09:00 - 10:30 1.50 10:30 - 11:30 1.00	From - To Hours Code 07:00 - 07:45 0.75 RPCOMF 07:45 - 08:45 1.00 RPCOMF 08:45 - 09:45 1.00 RPCOMF 09:45 - 14:00 4.25 RPCOMF 14:00 - 14:15 0.25 RPCOMF 14:15 - 16:30 2.25 RPCOMF 16:30 - 16:45 0.25 RPCOMF 09:00 - 10:30 1.50 MOVE 09:00 - 10:30 1.50 MOVE 11:00 - 11:45 0.75 RPCOMF 11:45 - 14:00 2.25 RPCOMF 14:00 - 15:00 1.00 RPCOMF 15:00 - 17:30 2.50 RPCOMF 17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RPCOMF 07:30 - 08:30 1.00 RPCOMF 15:00 - 16:30 1.50 RPCOMF 15:00 - 16:30 1.50 RPCOMF 16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RPCOMF 07:30 - 09:00 1.50 RPCOMF 10:30 - 11:30 1.50 RPCOMF	From - To Hours Code Code 07:00 - 07:45	From - To Hours Code Code Phase 07:00 - 07:45 0.75 RPCOMPSFTY COMPZN 07:45 - 08:45 1.00 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 09:45 - 14:00 4.25 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 14:00 - 14:15 0.25 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 14:15 - 16:30 2.25 FLOWT COMPZN 16:30 - 10:45 0.25 RPEQPT OTHR COMPZN COMPZN 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 WELLPR SFTY COMPZN COMPZN 10:30 - 11:00 0.50 RPCOMPSTY COMPZN 11:00 - 11:45 0.75 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 11:45 - 14:00 2.25 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 11:45 - 14:00 2.25 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 15:00 - 17:30 2.50 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 07:30 - 08:30 1.00 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 07:30 - 08:30 1.50 RPCOMPTRIP COMPZN 07:30 - 09:00

Page 3 of 3

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Start:

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 29-6 UNIT 106M

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 29-6 UNIT 106M

Spud Date: 3/17/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

End: 5/3/2004

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

1/27/2004 Rig Release: 3/25/2004

Rig Number: 47

Group:

-				
R	ia	N	lame):

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
4/30/2004	11:30 - 15:30	4.00	FLOWT		COMPZN	FLOW TESTED UP TBG ON 1/2" CHOKE. SICP= 600# FTP= 330# FTP= 930#
						DK PRODUCTION= 2178 MCFPD 5 BWPD
						1/2 BOPD
						NO SAND. TEST WITNESSED BY KEVIN GRIFFIN W/ SCHLUMBERGER TOOL SERVICE.
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50	RPCOMP	PACK	COMPZN	RELEASE PKR.
	16:00 - 17:30	1.50	RPCOMP	TRIP	COMPZN	POOH W/ 246 JTS 2 3/8" TBG. LD PKR AND VALVE.
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	RPCOMP	TRIP	COMPZN	MU AND TIH W/ EXP. CK, 1.81" FN AND 60 JTS 2 3/8" TBG.
						DRIFTING AS GOING IN HOLE.TBG. IS NOT DRIFTING.
						CONTACYED ENGINEERING. WILL LD 248 JTS. AND HAVE INSPECTED. WILL RUN YELLOW BAND TBG. FOR PRODUCTION
	18:30 - 18:45	0.25	RPCOMP	OTHE	COMPZN	STRING. SECURE WELL SDFN.
5/1/2004	07:00 - 07:30		WELLPR		COMPZN	PJSM. DISCUSSED DAYS EVENTS AND WAYS TO PREVENT
					C C	INCIDENT. SICP= 800#.
	07:30 - 09:15		RPCOMP		COMPZN	BWD. TIH W/ 188 JTS 2 3/8" TBG.
	09:15 - 12:00	2.75	RPCOMP	PULD	COMPZN	POOH DRIFTING. TBG. WILL NOT DRIFT @ PIN WHEN MADE UP.
						LD TBG. ON FLOAT. (CHECKED TORQUE W/ LINE PULL TORGUE GUAGE W/ MARTIN DECKER.(1000#) RIG HYDROLIC PRESSURE @
						900#, COMPUTES TO 1200# TONG TORQUE. TORQUE SPECS FOR
						2 3/8" TBG. IS 900# TO 1200#) COULD SET HYDROLIC PRESSURE
						@ 700# AND TBG WILL DRIFT.
	12:00 - 12:45	0.75	RPEQPT	RURD	COMPZN	MOVE FLOAT AND SWAP OUT W/ LOAD OF B CONDITION TBG. SECURE WELL SDFWE.
5/3/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	WELLPR	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM W/ CREWS DISCUSSED DAYS EVENTS. AND WAYS TO PREVENT INCIDENT.
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	RPCOMP	OTHR	COMPZN	SICP=850#. BWD. KILL CSG W/ 30 BBL 2% KCL.
	08:00 - 13:00	1	RPCOMP		COMPZN	MU AND TIH PICKING UP AND DRIFTING W/ APPROVED DRIFT W/
						2 3/8" MS EXP. CK, 1.81" FN AND 262 JTS 2 3/8" TBG. (DRIFTED
						EVERY JT PICKING UP FROM FLOAT. USING SAME 900# HYDROLIC
	13:00 - 14:30	1.50	RPCOME	FCO	COMPZN	PRESSURE FOR TONG TORQUE.) TAGGED FILL @ 8113'. (20' FILL) BREAK CIRCULATION W/ AIR MIST. UNLOAD WELL, CLEAN OUT
	11.00	1.00	111 001111		001111 211	FILL FROM 8113' TO PBTD OF 8132'. CIRCULATE CLEAN, CUT MIST
						AND DRY UP W/ AIR.
	14:30 - 15:45	1.25	RPEQPT	NUND	COMPZN	POOH AND LD 8 JTS. PUMP 5 BBL KCL. DROP BALL. NU HANGER.
						LAND TBG W/ 254 JTS. EOT @ 7891' KB. TOP OF FN @ 7889.35' KB.
	15:45 - 17:00	1.25	RPCOME	PRTS	COMPZN	ND BOPE, NU MASTER VALVE. PRESSURE UP W/ AIR TO 1000#. HELD FOR 10 MIN. TEST WAS
			55	•		GOOD. PRESSURE UP TO 1550# AND PUMP OUT CHECK, LET
						WELL FLOW UP TBG. AND CSG TO ENSURE CK GONE AND TO .
	17.00 10.00	4.00	DDEODE		001107::	PURGE AIR FROM SYSTEM.
	17:00 - 18:00	1.00	RPEQPT		COMPZN	RD EQUIPMENT AND UNIT. PREP TO MOVE OFF LOC. TURN OVER TO OPERATOR AND WILLIAMS FOR PRODUCTION. (
						FACILITIES NEED TO BE COMPLETED.) FINAL REPORT.

Printed: 5/6/2004 10:10:12 AM

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

ConocoPhillips

Well Name: SAN JUAN 29-6 # 106M API #: 30-039-27542	Spud: 17-Mar-2004 Release: 25-Mar-2004
11" 3M x 11"	ash Cap 3M Casing Spool 1" 3M Casing Head
Surface Casing Date set: 18-Mar-04 X New Size 9 5/8 in Used Set at 238 ft # Jnts: 5 Wt. 32.3 ppf Grade H-40 Hole Size 12 1/4 in Conn STC Wash Out 150 % Csg Shoe 238 ft Est. T.O.C. 0 ft TD of surface 239 ft Notified BLM @ hrs on hrs on hrs on	Surface Cmt Date cmt'd: 18-Mar-04 Lead: 150 sx 50/50 POZ:Standard + 2% Bentonite + 3% CaCl2 + 5 lb/sx Gilsonite + 0.25 lb/sx Cello-Flake + 0.2 CFR-3, Yield = 1.34 cuft/sx 201 cuft slurry mixed at 13.5 ppg Displacement: 15.0 bbls Fresh Wtr Bump Plug: 07:00 hrs w/ 150 psi Final Circ Pressure: 69 psi @ 2 bpm Returns during job: Yes CMT Returns to surface: 15 bbls Floats Held: No floats run W.O.C. for 9.75 hrs (plug bump to test casing)
New Size 7	Int. Cement Date cmt'd: 22-Mar-04 Lead: 400 sx Standard Cement + 3% Econolite + 10 lb/sx PhenoSeal 2.88 cuft/sx, 1152 cuft slurry at 11.5 ppg Tail: 230 sx 50/50 POZ:Standard Cement + 2% Bentonite + 6 lb/sx PhenoSeal 1.33 cuft/sx, 306.0 cuft slurry at 13.5 ppg Displacement: 156 bbls Fresh Wtr Bumped Plug at: 20:00 hrs w/ 2150 psi Final Circ Pressure: 1470 psi @ 2 bpm Returns during job: Yes CMT Returns to surface: 90 bbls
Production Casing Date set: 25-Mar-04 X New Used Wt. 11.6 ppf Grade: N-80 from 13 to 8135 ft Hole Size 6 1/4 in Conn LTC Wash Out: 50 % # Jnts: 189 Est. T.O.C. Marker Jt: 5192 - 5202' Marker Jt: 7781' - 7790' Marker Jt: Top of Float Collar 8133 ft Csg Shoe 8135 ft	Floats Held: X Yes No W.O.C. for 9 hrs (plug bump to test casing) Prod. Cmt Date cmt'd: 25-Mar-04 470 sx 50/50 POZ:Standard Cement + 3% Bentonite + 0.2 % CFR-3 + 0.1% HR-5 + 0.8% Halad-9 + 5 lb/sx PhenoSeal 1.45 cuft/ sx, 681 cuft slurry at 13.1 ppg Displacement: 126 bbls 2% KCL water Bumped Plug at: 05:30 hrs w/ 2150 psi Final Circ Pressure: 1390 psi @ 2 bpm Returns during job: No (None Planned) CMT Returns to surface: 8,135 ft Floats Held: Yes Mud Wt. @ TD AIR ppg
COMMENTS: Surface: Intermediate: Production: No float equipment run. Ran guide shoe and aluminum baffle plate 1 The 6-1/4" hole was air drilled and was filled with air when the prod csg was	
CENTRALIZERS: Surface: Centralizers @ 217', 193', 149', & 106'	Total: 4
Intermediate: Centralizers @ 3896', 3872', 3785', 3698', 3611', 3524', and 212'. Turbolizers @ 2928', 2885', 2842', 2799' & 2755'	Total: 7 Total: 5
Production: No centralizers run on production casing	Total: none