Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

			ETICKI DEDODE	ANDIO
WHII	COMPLETION	I OR RECOMPL	_ETION REPORT	AND LOG

	WELL C	OMPL	ETION O	R RE	COMI	PLETI	ON RE	EPOR	T A	AND L	OG	/	/ [ase Serial N MSF08006			
la. Type of	Well	Oil Well	☑ Gas V	Vell	☐ Dry	0	Other				 		-	6. If I	ndian, Allo	ttee or	Tribe Name	
b. Type of	Completion	⊠ ^N Othe		□ Woi	k Over		Deepen	□ P	lug I	Back	□ Diff	Res	ovr.	7. Un	it or CA A	greeme	ent Name and	No.
2. Name of	Operator				Co	ontact: L	EBOR/	AH MA	RB	RRY C	378	্র			ase Name a			
	COPHILLIPS									prberry@			/ '•\ I			30-5 L	JNIT 213A	
	PO BOX 2 HOUSTON	N, TX 77	252				Ph:	832.4	186.	(include 2326	area co	de)	~3		I Well No.		9-27252-00-	S1
4. Location		T30N R5	W Mer NMF	,				183	nts)*	KPR 3		. C	314	10. F B/	ield and Po ASIN FRU	ol, or I ITLAN	Exploratory ID COAL	
At surfa			760FEL 36.	83722	N Lat, 1	07.373	60 W Lo	on Selvan				Ö	5				Block and Sur ON R5W Mer	
	rod interval r	eported b	elow					160	ن _ې	Carried States	San Park		,3H	12. C	ounty or Pa	arish	13. State	
At total	-							7		(2		ويعور	97		O ARRIBA		NM	
14. Date Sp 01/25/2				ite T.D. /27/200	Reache 3	d.		16. D	ate (& A /11/	2003	Ready 4	o Pro	d.	17. E		DF, KI 13 GL	3, RT, GL)*	
18. Total D	epth:	MD TVD	3189		19. Plu	ig Back	T.D.:	MD TVD		318				h Brid	lge Plug Se		MD IVD	
21. Type E OTH	lectric & Oth	er Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Sub	mit copy	of each)				W	as DS	ell cored? ST run? onal Surv	ey?	⊽ No i	≒ Yes	(Submit analy (Submit analy (Submit analy	vsis)
23. Casing ar	nd Liner Reco	ord (Repo	ort all strings	set in v	vell)												1	
Hole Size	Size/Gi	rade	ade Wt. (#/ft.) Top Botto (MD) (MD				1 -	Cemen Depth	1 1 1					l Cement Ion		Amount Po	ulled	
12.250	9.6	25 H-40	32.0	32.0 0 221 135 0														
8.750	7.0	00 J-55	20.0	20.0 0 3027							4	20				0		
6.250	5.5	00 J-55	16.0	16.0 3009 3188								0		\neg				
									\neg									
												\Box						
24. Tubing	Record																	
Size	Depth Set (M		acker Depth	(MD)	Size	Dep	oth Set (MD)	Pa	cker Dep	th (MD)	Size	De	oth Set (MI	D)	Packer Depth	(MD)
2.375		3135												<u> </u>				
25. Produci							6. Perfor											
	ormation		Тор		Botto		Perforated Interval Size						No. Holes Perf. Status					
	RUITLAND C	OAL		3114		3188				3114 TO	O 3188	_	0.75	0	248	OPE	N	
B)														4			_	
C)												ــــ		 			····	
D)	racture, Treat	mont Co	mant Causage) Etc														
	Depth Interva		Them Squeez	o, Etc.					Δm	ount and	Tuma	f Mo	torio1					
			188 CAVITA	TED			-		AIII	iount and	Турс	1 IVIA	iciiai					
	31	14 10 3	100 OAVITA															
	v·		- 															
28. Product	ion - Interval	A													-			
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas		Water		il Grav		Ga		I	roducti	on Method			
Produced 03/19/2003	Date 03/09/2003	Tested	Production	BBL 0.0	МС	F 2780.0	BBL 0.0		от. А	PI	Gr	avity			EI OM	/S ED/	OM WELL	
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas		Water		as:Oil		w.	ell Stat	115		FLOV	יט רולנ	JIVI VV ELL	
Size	Flwg.	Press.	Rate	BBL	MC		BBL		atio		"			40	\rn==			
1/2	SI	485.0										PG		AU	LEPIED	FOR	RECORL	
	tion - Interva		In .	Lon	1.		Iw.	1.0	1.0		1.0			<u> </u>				1
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MC		Water BBL		il Grav		Ga Gr	s avity	l l	roducti	"APR (1 :	2003	
Choke	Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.	Oil	Gas	1	Water	G	as:Oil		w	ell Stat	us	FAI	MINGTO	N FIE	D UFFICE	
Size	Flwg. SI	Press.	Rate	BBL	МС		BBL	Ra	atio					ЭN	(9Ç		

(See Instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #20186 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM
** REVISED **

٩	•										
28b. Prod	uction - Inter	val C						***			· .
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Grav	ity	Production Method	****
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well	Status		
28c. Prod	uction - Inter	val D	<u> </u>		·	<u></u>	<u> </u>	L			
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Grav	Production Method		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well	Well Status		
29. Dispo	sition of Gas(Sold, used	for fuel, veni	ed, etc.)	<u> </u>	<u> </u>	<u>. I </u>	I			
	nary of Porous	. 7 (I	-1d- AC-						T 33 - W		
Show tests, i	all important	zones of po	orosity and c	ontents there	eof: Cored i e tool open,	ntervals and a flowing and	all drill-stem shut-in pressure	es	31. FOI	mation (Log) Markers	
	Formation Top Bottom Descript				Description	s, Contents, etc	2.		Name	Top Meas. Depth	
This v	NTO MO	ile Basin F	0 1398 2472 2472	1398 2472 2680 2680 edure): al well. Att	ached are	the daily sur	mmaries and		OJ KIF FR FR	CIMIENTO O ALAMO RTLAND UITLAND UITLAND COAL CTURED CLIFFS	1348 2478 2613 2948 3058 3188
1. Ele	enclosed atta ectrical/Mech ndry Notice fo	anical Logs				2. Geologic I 6. Core Anal	-		DST Rep	port 4. Direc	ctional Survey
			Electron Committed	ronic Subm For CON to AFMSS	ission #201 OCOPHIL	86 Verified b	ect as determin by the BLM W PANY, sent to enne Garcia or	ell Inforn	nation Sys		uctions):
Name	(please print)	DEBORA	H MARBEI	RRY			Title S	UBMITTI	NG CON	TACT	
Signat	ure	(Electron	ic Submissi	on)			Date <u>0</u>	4/01/2003	3		
Title 18 U	.S.C. Section	1001 and	Title 43 U.S.	C. Section 1	212, make	it a crime for	any person kno	wingly and	d willfully	to make to any department	or agency

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

ConocoPhillips

Well Name:	SAN JUAN 30-5 213A	Spud Date:	25-Jan-03	TD Date: 27-Jan-03
API#:	30-045-31208	Spud Time:	0100	Rig Release Date: 28-Jan-03
		11" 3M x 7	1/16" Tree Adar 1/16" 5M Tubing I x 11" 3M Casing	Head Head
	9 5/8 in 221 ft # Jnts: 5 32.3 ppf Grade H-40 12 1/4 in 100 % 14 ft Csg Shoe 2	X New Used Used ### ### ############################		SurfaceCement Date cmt'd: 25-Jan-03 Lead: 135sx 50/50/Poz w/2% Gel 5#/sx Gilsonite, 3% CaCl2, 1/2 #/sx Flocele 8.2% CFR-3 @ 13.5ppg & 1.32 cuft/sx Displacement vol. & fluid.: 14.25 FW Bumped Plug at: 1215 HRS Pressure Plug bumped: 250 Returns during job: YES CMT Returns to surface: 10 BBLS Floats Held: YesNo W.O.C. for8.25 hrs (plug bump to drlg cmt)
Not	7 in 3027 ft 74 jts 20 ppf Grade J-55 8 3/4 in	030 ft 003		Date cmt'd: 28-Jan-03
Production L Size Blank Wt Grade # Jnts Hole Size	e 5 1/2 in Connections: LTC 15.5 ppf J-55 5	X New Used		Returns during job: YES CMT Returns to surface: 6 BBLS Floats Held: X Yes No Liner Cement UNCEMENTED LINER
	Pl Liner S	BTD: 3187' (shoe: 3188'		
		TD	3,189 ft	
COMMENTS: Surface:	NO FLOAT EQUIPMENT RAN. WELL SHU	JT-IN WITH 250 P	SI.	
Intermediate:				
Production:	Top of hanger set @ 3009'. 18' of overlap	off 7" casing shoe		
CENTRALIZE Surface:	RS: 		- "	
Intermediate:	3017', 2942', 2860', 2407', 186'.			Total:
	TURBOLIZERS @ 2570', 2488'.			Total: 7

Page 1 of 8

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM CO

Operations Summary Report

Start:

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND CO 000213A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND #213A UNIT

Spud Date: 1/24/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

2/13/2003

End:

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name: KEY ENERGY

Rig Name:		KEY EN	ERGY			Rig Number: 18
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
2/20/2003	07:00 - 07:15		MV	С	70DMOB	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PESONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:15 - 10:00		MV	w	70DMOB	LOADING OUT EQUIPMENT ON FLOAT'S
	10:00 - 15:00		MV	t	00MMIR	MOVING RIG & EQUIPMENT TO LOCATION
	15:00 - 19:00	1	MV	6	00MMIR	MIRU KEY RIG # 18 & EQUIPMENT = S.D.O.N.
2/21/2003	07:00 - 07:15	1	MV	C	00MMIR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:15 - 12:00	4.75	MV	6	00MMIR	RU RIG & SUPPORT EQUIPMENT = WELD ON RIG & RIG FLOOR = RU GROUND LINE'S & BLOOIE LINES
	12:00 - 14:00	1	CM	е	50PRDR	NU BOP'S, HCR VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD & LINES
	14:00 - 15:15		СМ	1	50PRDR	FIRST START UP RIG INSPECTION
	15:15 - 16:00	0.75	СМ	9	50PRDR	TEST 7" CSG & BLIND RAM'S TO 200# 3 MIN'S & 650# FOR 30 MIN'S FOR STATE INTEGRITY TEST = GOOD TEST
	16:00 - 18:00	2.00	СМ	8	50PRDR	TEST 7" CSG, BLIND & PIPE RAM'S, HCR VALVE'S, CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200#3 MIN'S & 1800#10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	СМ	2	50PRDR	PU DP & DC'S OUT OF PIPE BASKET & PUT ON PIPE RACK = TALLY PIPE
2/22/2003	07:00 - 07:15	0.25	СМ	С	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:15 - 08:00		СМ	2	50PRDR	PU DC'S & DP OUT OF PIPE BASKET & PUT ON PIPE RACK = TALLY PIPE
	08:00 - 09:00	1.00	СМ	6	50PRDR	RU FLOOR TO PU PIPE
	09:00 - 11:30		СМ	2	50PRDR	GIH PU 6 1/4' BIT, BIT SUB, 8- 3 1/2" DC'S, 1-2 7/8" DP, 1-1.87 FN & DP TAG CMT @ 2940'
	11:30 - 13:30	2.00	СМ	6	50PRDR	PU & RU POWER SWIVEL & HOSE'S TO POWER PACK
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	СМ	8	50PRDR	TEST AIR MANIFOLD & LINE'S 200# 3 MIN'S & 1500# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00	СМ	5	50PRDR	BREAK CIRC W / AIR ASSIST
	15:00 - 17:30	2.50	СМ	1	50PRDR	DRILL OUT 7" FLOAT COLLAR @ 2986' & 7" SHOE @ 3027' W / AIR ASSIST
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	СМ	5	50PRDR	CIRC & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGER TO GET ON DEPTH
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	СМ	1	50PRDR	DRILLING AHEAD W / 6 1/4" BIT FROM 2986' TO 3000' W / AIR ASSIST
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	С	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:15 - 00:00	4.75		1	50PRDR	DRILLING AHEAD W / 6 1/4" BIT FROM 3000' TO COAL TD @ 3189' W / AIR ASSIST
1	00:00 - 01:00	1.00	СМ	5	50PRDR	CIRC & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGER = COAL INTERVAL AS FOLLOWS = 3037'-3039', 2 FT, NO GAS UNIT'S = 3047'-48', 1 FT,
			}			NO GAS UNITS = 3115'-19', 4 FT, 60 GAS UNITS = 3120'-21', 1 FT, 60 GAS UNITS = 3125'-26', 1 FT, 60 GAS UNITS = 3139'-66', 27 FT, 282 GAS UNITS = 3170'-87', 17 FT, 250 GAS UNITS = TOTAL NET COAL 53 FT
	01:00 - 06:00	5.00	СМ	1	50PRDR	R&R C/O FROM 3158' TO TD @ 3189' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NO WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
2/23/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3158' TO TD @ 3189' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NATURAL GAS & NO WATER GAIN = 2 DOWN TO 1 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:15 07:15 - 08:30	0.25 1.25		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W/ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O F/3158' TO TD @ 3189' W/1.6 MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINES W/NATURAL GAS & NO WATER GAIN = 2
	L					

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND CO 000213A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND #213A UNIT

Spud Date: 1/24/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

2/13/2003

End:

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release:

Start:

Group:

8

Rig Name:	KEY ENERGY	Rig Number:	18

Date 🤼	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
2/23/2003	07:15 - 08:30	1.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
1	08:30 - 09:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO TEST WELL
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00	СМ	u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE = 15 MIN'S-280 MCFD = 30 MIN'S-300 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-330 MCFD = 1 HR-330 MCFD
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPL	SHUT IN TEST = ISIP-15# = 15 MIN'S-80# = 30 MIN'S-150# = 45 MIN'S-200# = 1 HR-240#
	11:00 - 15:00	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 1 - # 2 - # 3 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PADS = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINES = BREAK OVER POINT @ 1100#
ŀ	15:00 - 15:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3175'
	15:30 - 18:30	3.00	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3175' TO TD @ 3189' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	-	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 4 - # 5 - # 6 - # 7 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINES
2/24/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00		1	80CMPL	SURGE WELL W / AIR ASSIST
į.	07:00 - 07:15	0.25		С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
Ì	07:15 - 07:45	0.50		4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3120'
	07:45 - 18:30	10.75	: :	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3120' TO TD @ 3189' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & NO WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 1 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	1	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	1	C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	CM	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 8 - # 9 - # 10 - # 11 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 10 BPH MIST, 1 GAL OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINES
2/25/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	FINISHED # 11 SURGE = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S
	07:00 - 07:15	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:15 - 07:45	0.50	CM	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3120'
	07:45 - 13:45	6.00		1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3120' TO TD @ 3189' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	13:45 - 14:15	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL W / AIR ASSIST
	14:15 - 19:00		СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 12 - # 13 - # 14 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
ŀ	19:00 - 19:15		CM	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:15 - 19:30		CM	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG TAG FILL @ 3045'
	19:30 - 22:30	3.00	СМ	z	80CMPL	WORKING TO UNPLUG BIT OR DRILL STRING = NO GOOD UNABLE TO UNPLUG DRILL STRING
L	1	1	<u> </u>	į .	<u> </u>	Printed: 4/1/2003 11:05:20 AM

Page 3 of 8

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Weil Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND CO 000213A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND #213A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

2/13/2003

Spud Date: 1/24/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

End: Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Rig Release:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
2/25/2003	22:30 - 23:30 23:30 - 06:00	1	CM CM	6 z	80CMPL 80CMPL	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL & INSTALL TIW VALVE IN DRILL PIPE STANDBY WAITING FOR DAYLIGHT CREW = ONLY HAVE 3 MAN
2/26/2003	06:00 - 06:15	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	CREW ON NIGHT SHIFT NOT ABLE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNELL ON LOCATION
2,20,2000	06:15 - 07:45	1	CM	4	80CMPL	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA
	07:45 - 08:15	0.50	1	z	80CMPL	C/O PLUGED BIT SUB & BIT
	08:15 - 09:30		СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH W / BHA, DC'S & DP TO 7" SHOE @ 3027'
	09:30 - 10:00		СМ	6	80CMPL	PU POWER SWIVEL & BREAK CIRC W / AIR ASSIST
	10:00 - 19:00	9.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/ 3035' TO TD @ 3189' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST,
						2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:15 - 19:45	0.50		4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL
	19:45 - 00:30	4.75		1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 15 - # 16 - # 17 @ 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 TO 6 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
	00:30 - 01:00	0.50	ſ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3050'
	01:00 - 06:00	5.00	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3150' TO TD @ 3189' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF
2/27/2003	06:00 - 06:15	0.25	CM	С	80CMPL	SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
2/2//2003	06:15 - 09:30	3.25	l	1	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL R&R, C/O F/3150' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2
	00.10	0.20	O.III		OCCIVII E	GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE MED COALS 7 FINE'S, NATURAL GAS & 1 BPH WATER
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	СМ	z	80CMPL	95% COAL & 5% SHALE CIRCULATE W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR TO DRY UP WELL FOR FLOW TEST
1	10:30 - 11:00	0.50	CM	4	80CMPL	POOH TO 7" SHOE W /' BHA & RIG UP TO TEST WELL
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00		u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE - 15 MIN = 250 MCFD - 30 MIN = 300 MCFD - 45 MIN = 330 MCFD - 1 HR = 330 MCFD
	12:00 - 13:00	1.00	СМ	f	80CMPL	SHUT IN TEST - ISIP = 10 PSI - 15 MIN = 80 PSI - 30 MIN = 140
	13:00 - 18:30	5.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	PSI - 45 MIN = 210 PSI - 1 HR = 240 PSI SURGE'S #18 - #19 - #20 @ 1200 PSI AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 BBLS WATER - FOAMER PAD'S = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINES
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" SHOE, TAG FILL AT 3155'
	19:00 - 19:15	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PESONNEL
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3155' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES, NATRAL GAS & 1 BPH GAIN 2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF OF SAMPLE CATCHER
2/28/2003	06:00 - 06:15	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	95% COAL, 5% SHALE
2.20,2000	06:15 - 12:00	5.75		1	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL R&R, C/O F/3155' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES W / NATURAL GAS
					ا عمرته وا	

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: Common Well Name:

SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND CO 000213A

SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND #213A UNIT

Spud Date: 1/24/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

2/13/2003

End:

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Start: Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
2/28/2003	06:15 - 12:00	5.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL, 5% SHALE RUNNING COAL'S
	12:00 - 18:30	6.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3155' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 3 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR INCREASED FOAMER TO HELP CLEAN UP RUNNING COALS RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES W / NATURAL GAS 2 BUCKETS PER HR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	CM	4	80CMPL	90% COAL, 10% SHALE POOH TO 7" SHOE W / BHA, PREPARE TO SURGE WELL
	19:00 - 19:15	0.30	I	C	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	19:15 - 00:00	4.75	l	1	80CMPL	SURGE #21 - #22 @ 1200 PSI AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 TO 6 BBLS WATER-FOAMER PADS, RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES
	00:00 - 00:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" SHOE, TAG FILL @ 3120'
	00:30 - 06:00	5.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3120' - T/3128' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 3 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS 1 BPH WATER GAIN 3 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
						95% COAL, 5% SHALE
3/1/2003	06:00 - 06:15	0.25		С	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	06:15 - 19:00	12.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3128' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS 3 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 90-95% COAL, 5-10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:15		CM	C	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	19:15 - 06:00	10.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3150' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL FINS W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS 3 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 90-95% COAL, 5-10% SHALE
3/2/2003	06:00 - 06:15	0.25	CM	С	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	06:15 - 14:30	8.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3120' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MEB COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS NO WATER GAIN, 8 DOWN TO 2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 90-95% COAL, 5-10% SHALE
	14:30 - 15:00	0.50	СМ	z	80CMPL	CIRCULATE W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR TO DRY UP HOLE FOR FLOW TEST
	15:00 - 15:30		СМ	4	80CMPL	POOH TO 7" SHOE W / BHA & RIG UP TO TEST WELL
	15:30 - 16:30		СМ	u f	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE - 15 MIN = 1065 MCFD, 30 MIN = 1236 MCFD, 45 MIN = 1236 MCFD, 1 HR = 1236 MCFD SHUT IN TEST, ISIP = 40 PSI, 15 MIN = 180 PSI, 30 MIN = 290 PSI,
	16:30 - 17:30	1.00	CIVI		OUCIVIPL	45 MIN = 360 PSI, 1 HR = 410 PSI
	17:30 - 23:30	6.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE #23 - #24 - #25 @ 1000 PSI AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR, W / 5 BBLS WATER - FOAMER PADS,

Page 5 of 8

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND CO 000213A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND #213A UNIT

Spud Date: 1/24/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

2/13/2003

End:

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Start: Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

ring rianic.		11-1-1	121101			raig radificer. 10
Date	From -1	o Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
3/2/2003	17:30 - 23:	6.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MED COAL AND FINES
				ľ	Ī	(HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL F/19:00 - T/19:15)
	23:30 - 00:		OCM	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" SHOE, TAG FILL AT 3130'
	00:00 - 06:0	00 6.00	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3130' - T/3157' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2
			ļ			GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR
						RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES W / NATURAL
		l			1	FORMATION GAS
						6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
						90-95% COAL, 5-10% SHALE
3/3/2003	06:00 - 06:		5 CM	С	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	06:15 - 18:	12.25	5 CM	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/5150' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2
						GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR
						RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES W /
					1	NATURAL FROMATION GAS
•		İ			1	F/6 DOWN T/2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
						90-95% COAL, 5-10% SHALE
	18:30 - 19:0	1	CM	4	80CMPL	POOH TO 7" SHOE W/BHA, PREPARE TO SURGE
	19:00 - 19:		5 CM	C	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	19:15 - 00:0	10 4.75	5 CM	1	80CMPL	SURGE #26 - #27 @ 1100 PSI AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S
	1		1			FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 BBL WATER - FOAMER PADS
	1		1			RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES
	00:00 - 00:3	-	ОСМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" SHOE, TAG FILL @ 3135'
	00:30 - 06:0	00 5.50	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3135' - T/3157' W / AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER
				1		& INHIBITOR
						RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES W / NATURAL
						FORMATION GAS
						6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
		_				90-95% COAL, 5-10% SHALE
3/4/2003	06:00 - 06:	1	CM	C	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	06:15 - 19:0	00 12.75	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3128' - T/3157' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2
						GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR
						RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES W / NATURAL
		ŀ				FORMATION GAS
						4 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
						90% COAL, 10 % SHALE
	40.00 40				000000	
	19:00 - 19:1		CM	C	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	19:15 - 06:0	U 10.75	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3157' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2
						GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR
						RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES W / NATURAL
						FORMATION GAS
						4 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
2/5/2002	00.00					90% COAL, 10% SHALE
3/5/2003	06:00 - 06:1		CM	C	80CMPL	HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL
	06:15 - 10:0	U 3./5	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R, C/O F/3157' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2
				1		GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR
						RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MED COAL AND FINES W/
						NATURAL FORMATION GAS
						6 DOWN TO 2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
	10:00 - 10:3	0 50	СМ	_	DOCME!	90% COAL, 10% SHALE
	10.00 - 10:3	0.50	CIVI	Z	80CMPL	CIRCULATE W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR TO DRY UP WELL FOR FLOW
	10:30 44:0	0 050	CM		000145	TEST
	10:30 - 11:0	0.50	CM	4	80CMPL	POOH TO 7" SHOE W / BHA, RIG UP TO FLOW TEST
					4 5 4 5	
		·				1

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND CO 000213A

Common Well Name:

SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND #213A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

Spud Date: 1/24/2003

2/13/2003

End:

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release:

Group:

KIa .	Name:	

KEY ENERGY

From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
11:00 - 12:00	1.00	СМ	u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE - 15 MIN = 970 MCFD, 30 MIN = 1374 MCFD, 45 MIN = 1644 MCFD, 1 HR = 1644 MCFD
12:00 - 13:00	1.00	СМ	f	80CMPL	SHUT IN TEST - ISIP = 50#, 15 MIN = 180#, 30 MIN = 280#, 45 MIN = 360#, 1 HR = 415#
13:00 - 17:00	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S #28, #29, #30 @ 1100 PSI AIR ASSIST W / 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 BBLS WATER - FOAMER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES
17:00 - 17:30 17:30 - 19:00			1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" SHOE, TAG FILL AT 3150' R&R, C/O F/3150' - T/3160' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS 5-6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER
19:00 - 19:15 19:15 - 06:00			c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	90% COAL, 10% SHALE HOLD SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL R&R, C/O F/3160' - T/3189' (TD) W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURNS TO SURFACE = HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS
					5-6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 90% COAL, 10% SHALE
06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 4 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
07:00 - 07:15 07:15 - 18:30		1	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
18:30 - 19:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL
19:00 - 00:00	5.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 31 - # 32 - # 33 @ 1100# AIR ASSIST W / 10 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINES
00:00 - 00:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3140'
00:30 - 06:00	5.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3140' T/3158' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 6 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3158' W/ 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
07:00 - 07:15 07:15 - 18:30			c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & INHIBITOR = 9 DOWN TO 1 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	11:00 - 12:00 12:00 - 13:00 13:00 - 17:00 17:00 - 17:30 17:30 - 19:00 19:00 - 19:15 19:15 - 06:00 06:00 - 07:00 07:00 - 07:15 07:15 - 18:30 18:30 - 19:00 19:00 - 00:00 00:00 - 00:30 00:30 - 06:00	12:00 - 13:00	11:00 - 12:00	11:00 - 12:00	11:00 - 12:00

Page 7 of 8

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND CO 000213A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND #213A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

2/13/2003

Spud Date: 1/24/2003

Contractor Name: **KEY FOUR CORNERS**

Rig Release:

End: Group:

Rig Name:

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
3/7/2003	18:30 - 19:00 19:00 - 00:00		CM CM	4	80CMPL 80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO SURGE WELL SURGE'S # 34 - # 35 - # 36 @ 1100# AIR ASSIST W / 10 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PADS
	00:00 - 00:30 00:30 - 06:00		CM CM	4	80CMPL 80CMPL	= RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINES RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3135' R&R C/O T/3158' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 2 BPH
3/8/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	CM	1	80CMPL	WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE R&R C/O T/3158' W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:15 07:15 - 19:00	0.25 11.75		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:15 19:15 - 06:00	0.25 10.75		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN =
3/9/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	90% COAL & 10% SHALE R&R C/O T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 DOWN TO 1 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER =
	07:00 - 07:15 07:15 - 08:00	0.25 0.75	1	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	90% COAL & 10% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 1 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER =
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	90% COAL & 10% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA & RU TO TEST WELL
	08:30 - 09:30	1.00		u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE = 15 MIN'S-2200 MCFD = 30 MIN'S-2550 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-2700 MCFD = 1 HR-2780 MCFD
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPL	SHUT IN TEST = ISIP-100# = 15 MIN'S-280# = 30 MIN'S-360# = 45 MIN'S-430# = 1 HR-485#
	10:30 - 11:00	0.50		4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3183'
	11:00 - 19:00	8.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE FOR LINER T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER, 1/2 GAL OF POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINES W / NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:15 19:15 - 02:30	0.25 7.25		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3189' TD W / 1.6 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S OF FOAMER, 1/2 GAL OF POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINES W /
	1			İ	Fig. 1	I .

Page 8 of 8

PHILLIPS PETROLEUM CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND CO 000213A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 FRUITLAND #213A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

Spud Date: 1/24/2003 End:

2/13/2003

Contractor Name:

KEY FOUR CORNERS

Rig Release:

Group:

Di~	Nam	·~·
NIU.	INGIL	┖.

KEY ENERGY

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
3/9/2003	19:15 - 02:30	7.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	NATURAL FORMATION GAS & 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKETS PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 90% COAL & 10% SHALE
	02:30 - 03:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA TO CHECK HOLE CONDITION'S
	03:00 - 03:45	0.75	1	1	80CMPL	FLOW WELL OUT BLOOIE LINE'S TO CHECK HOLE CONDITION'S
	03:45 - 04:15	0.50		4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3187' = HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION
	04:15 - 04:45	0.50		4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA
	04:45 - 05:00	0.25		6	80CMPL	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
	05:00 - 06:00	1.00	1	4	80CMPL	COOH W / 2 7/8" DP
3/10/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00		4	80CMPL	COOH W / 2 7/8" DP, 3 1/2" DC'S & BHA
	07:00 - 07:15	0.25		C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:15 - 08:15	1.00	ı	6	80CMPL	RU 5 1/2" RAM'S & EQUIPMENT
	08:15 - 08:45	0.50		8	80CMPL	TEST 5 1/2 RAM'S = 200# 3 MIN'S & 600# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	08:45 - 09:30	0.75	i	2	80CMPL	PU & MU 5 1/2" V-SHOE, 4 JT'S OF 5 1/2" CSG, 7" X 5 1/2" HANGER
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00	1	4	80CMPL	RIH W / BHA & DP T/3189' TD = GOOD CLEAN HOLE TO TD
	10:30 - 10:45	0.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	SET BAKER 7" X 5 1/2" HYFLO 3 HANGER W / STEEL SLEEVE &
						RELEASED OFF HANGER = LINER SET AS FOLLOWS, 5 1/2"
						V-SHOE SET @ 3188'.50", 4 JT'S OF 5 1/2", 15.50#, J-55 LT&C CSG
						SET @ 3187'.50", BOTTOM OF HANGER SET @ 3014'.03", TOP OF HANGER SET @ 3009'.23" = 18 FT OVERLAP OFF 7" CSG SHOE
	10:45 - 13:00	2.25	CM	2	80CMPL	COOH LAYING DOWN DP, DC'S & SETTING TOOL
	13:00 - 13:15	0.25	t .	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W/ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	13:15 - 13:45	0.50	1	6	80CMPL	RU BLUE JET PERF EQUIPMENT
	13:45 - 14:45	1.00		q	80CMPL	RIH & PERF 5 1/2" LINER W / 3 1/8" CSG GUN'S, 4 SPF, 0.75"
	10.40 - 14.40	1.00	OW	١٩	OOOMII E	HOLES, 90 DEGREE PHASING AS FOLLOWS = 3136' TO 3188', 52
						FT, 208 HOLE'S = 3120' TO 3126', 6 FT, 24 HOLES = 3114' TO 3118', 4 FT, 16 HOLES = TOTAL OF 62 FT & 248 HOLES
	14:45 - 15:00	0.25	CM	6	80CMPL	RD BLUE JET PERF EQUIPMENT
	15:00 - 16:15	1.25		6	80CMPL	RU 2 3/8" RAM'S & EQUIPMENT
	16:15 - 17:00	0.75		8	80CMPL	TEST 2 3/8" RAM'S = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD
						TEST
1	17:00 - 17:15	0.25	CM	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	17:15 - 18:45	1.50	СМ	2	80CMPL	GIH PU 2 3/8" PRODUCTION TUBING OFF PIPE RACK T3158'
1	18:45 - 19:00	0.25		1	80CMPL	SECURED WELL & S.D.O.N.
3/11/2003	07:00 - 07:15	0.25		С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:15 - 07:45	0.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	BLOW DOWN WELL HAD 550# ON CSG = START & WARM ENGINES
	07:45 - 08:15	0.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	LAND HANGER W / TUBING SET AS FOLLOWS = 2 3/8" EXP CHECK SET @ 3167'.97" = BOTTOM JT OF TUBING SET @ 3167'.22" = FN W / 1.81 PROFILE SET @ 3136'.02" = 101 JT'S OF TUBING SET @ 3135'.02" TO HANGER @ SURFACE = TOTAL OF 102 JT'S OF 2 3/8" EUE 8RD J-55 4.7# TUBING IN WELL
	08:15 - 10:15	2.00	СМ	е	80CMPL	ND BOP'S & NU WELLHEAD = TEST WELLHEAD SEAL TO 3000# = GOOD TEST
	10:15 - 10:45	0.50	СМ	5	80CMPL	PULL BPV OUT OF HANGER & PUMP-OFF EXP CHECK = FLOW WELL BACK TO PURGE AIR OUT OF TUBING & WELLBORE
	10:45 - 15:00	4.25	MV	6	70DMOB	RD & RELEASE RIG & EQUIPMENT ON 03 / 10 / 2003 @ 15:00 PM = JOB COMPLETE - DROP FROM REPORT