Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

	WELL C	OMPL	ETION C	R REC	OMPL	ETION F	REPOF	RTAN	D LOG				ase Serial N MSF07899			
la. Type o	_	Oil Well		_	Dry	Other:					•	6. If	Indian, Allo	ttee or	r Tribe Name	
b. Type of Completion New Well Work Over Deepen Other					Plug Back Diff. Resvr.				svr.	7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No. NMNM78423A						
2. Name of		COMP	A N IV		Cont	act: JUANI	TA FAR	RELL		Link			ease Name a			
	COPHILLIPS PO BOX 2	197 WL	3 6054			13	a. Phone	No. Gin	@conocor	.0	7/11/20		PI Well No.		JNIT 230A	
4 Logation	HOUSTOI n of Well (Rep	-		d in accor	rdonos ur		h: 505.	(A) 14. J	<u>8</u>	<u>, S</u>	§ 'F'	<u>)</u>	ield and Pa		45-31883-00-S Exploratory	1
4. Location	Sec 17	' T31N R	R7W Mer NN . 1695FEL	IP	dance w	illi rederai i	equirente		Ox ^A	20	Oa 1	.∑B	ASIN FRU	ITLA	ND COAL	,
	prod interval r							(<u>=</u>			j [H S	sec., T., R., r Area Sec	M., or : 17 T	Block and Surv 31N R7W Mer	ey NMP
At total		еропеа в	elow					(0)		``@		12/(County or Pa		13. State NM	
14. Date S	pudded			ate T.D. R	eached		16. D	ate Con	pleted		- C - S - S - S - S - S - S - S - S - S		Elevations (B, RT, GL)*	
06/28/2	2004		07.	/16/2004			□ ₀₇	& A \ 1/19/200	Ready	to Pro	d. William		649	2 GL		
18. Total I	Depth:	MD TVD	3265		9. Plug	Back T.D.:	MD TVI		3265	7	20. Dept	h Bri	dge Plug Se		MD TVD	
21. Type H	Electric & Oth	er Mecha	nical Logs R	un (Subm	it copy o	feach)					ell cored's		No I	Yes	(Submit analys	is)
MODE	OG										onal Surv	ey?	No i	Yes	S (Submit analys S (Submit analys	is)
23. Casing a	and Liner Reco	ord (Repo	ort all strings				ge Cemen	3	T - CC1	, I	C1	7-1			<u> </u>	
Hole Size	Size/G	rade	Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD)			Bottom Sta						V Vol. Cement Top*		Amount Pul	led	
12.250		25 H-40	32.0	*****	0	243				150				0		
8.750	7.0	000 J-55	20.0	<u></u>	0	3030				505				0		
				l	-											
24. Tubing	g Record		<u> </u>	<u> </u>	l	l		l					L		<u>l</u>	
Size	Depth Set (M	ID) P	acker Depth	(MD)	Size	Depth Set	(MD)	Packe	Depth (M	D)	Size	De	pth Set (MI	D)	Packer Depth (1	MD)
2.375	ing Intervals	3020				I 26. Perf	oration R	ecord				L				
	ormation		Тор		Bottom			ted Inter	val	7	Size	1	No. Holes		Perf. Status	
	RUITLAND (COAL		3035	326	35										
B)										<u> </u>		+-				
D)	····									+		+		-	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
27. Acid, F	racture, Treat		ment Squeeze	e, Etc.					. 1.5	C) /						
	Depth Interva						_	Amoun	t and Type	of Ma	iterial				<u> </u>	
			<u> </u>		_											
28. Produc	tion - Interval	Α	<u> </u>													
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL		il Gravity orr. API		Gas Gravity	F	roduct	ion Method			
07/19/2004		1		0.0	434		0.0						FLOW	/S FR	OM WELL	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	R	as:Oil atio		Well Stat						
2" PITOT	SI ction - Interva	2.0 l B		0	104	16	0			G	SI					
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL		il Gravity огт. API		Gas Gravity	T	T A	CEPTE	FO	R RECORD	ĺ
. roudceu	L	1 calcu	- Coduction	DDL	MCF	BDL	_	on. AFI		- avity					-	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL		as:Oil atio		Well Stat	us		SEP	14	2004	
(Sag Instru	sı tions and spa	gas for a	Idition of data		sa sid-1							 -	ANMINGT	ON M	ELD OFFICE	
	NIC SUBMI	SSÍON #		FIED BY	THE B	LM WELL D ** BI	INFOR	MATIO	N SYSTE	M RFVI	SED *		Y_ M REVI	SEX	<u></u>	

	luction - Inter													
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravit	ty	Production Method				
Choke	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well	Status	1				
28c. Prod	uction - Interv	al D	<u> </u>			1.	1							
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravi	y	Production Method				
hoke ize				Oil Gas BBL MCF		Water BBL	Gas:Oil Ratio	Well Status						
29. Dispo	sition of Gas(Sold, used	for fuel, veni	ed, etc.)	•	<u> </u>	·			····				
	nary of Porous	Zones (In	clude Aquife	rs):					1 31. For	mation (Log) Mar	kers			
tests,						intervals and a , flowing and	ll drill-stem shut-in pressure	s						
	Formation		Тор	Bottom Description			s, Contents, etc.			Name				
IACIMIENTO 777			0 777 2273	777 2273 2411	2273			NACIMIENTO OJO ALAMO KIRTLAND FRUITLAND PICTURED CLIFFS			805 1960 2060 2695 3195			
This the 6 case	.25" hole to s and frac it.	cavitated 9.5" from 3	. We drilled 3035' to 326 oducing fron	out below 7 55'. The pla	n is to con	with a 6.2" bit ne back to th Coal. Attache		d			gg.,			
1. El 5. Su	e enclosed atta ectrical/Mechandry Notice for	anical Logs or plugging	g and cement	verification		Geologic I Core Anal pplete and corr	ysis	7	DST Re Other:	port e records (see attac	Direction definition defi	•		
			Elect	ronic Subm For CON	ission #350 OCOPHII	684 Verified l LLIPS COMI	by the BLM W	ell Inform the Farm	ation Sy ington					
Name	c(please print)	JUANITA	A FARRELL		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		Title A	UTHORIZ	ZED REF	PRESENTATIVE				
	Signature (Electronic Submission)								Date 09/08/2004					

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC ConocoPhillips Well Name: San Juan 32-7 # 230A Soud: 28-Jun-2004 API#: 30-045-31883 Release Drl Rig: 1-Jul-2004 Location: 885' FSL & 1695' FEL Trash Cap Move In Cav Rig 12-Jul-2004 Sec. 17 - T31N - R7W 7-1/16" 3M x 2-1/16" 5M Adapter Flange Release Cav Rig 19-Jul-2004 11" 3M x 7 1/16" 3M Tubing Head San Juan County, NM Elevation: 6492' GL (above MSL) 9-5/8" 8 RD x 11" 3M Casing Head Drl Rig RKB: 13' above Ground Level Datum: Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL **SurfaceCement** X New Date cmt'd: 29-Jun-04 Used Lead: 150 sx Class G Cement Surface Casing Date set: 29-Jun-04 Size 9 5/8 + 2% BWOC S001 Calcium Chloride 243 # Jnts: + 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes Set at Wt. 32.3 ppf Grade H-40 1.16 cuft/sx, 174.0 cuft slurry at 15.8 ppg Hole Size __ _ in Conn STC Displacement: 15.0 bbls fresh wtr 12 1/4 Excess Cmt 125 Bumped Plug at: 15:15 hrs w/ 310 psi T.O.C. SURFACE Csg Shoe 243 ft Final Circ Press: 150 psi @ 2 bpm TD of 12-1/4" hole 243 ft Returns during job: YES 12 bbls CMT Returns to surface: 06:30 Floats Held: No floats used Notified BLM @ hrs on 27-Jun-04 W.O.C. for 6.00 hrs (plug bump to start NU BOP) Notified NMOCD @ 06:30 hrs on 27-Jun-04 W.O.C. for 9.00 hrs (plug bump to test csg) Intermediate Cement **Intermediate Casing** Date set: 1-Jul-04 70 Date cmt'd: Size in 1-Jul-04 Set at 3030 ft 0 pups Lead: 405 sx Class G Cement X New Wt. 20 Grade J-55 + 3% D079 Extender ppf + 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes Conn STC Hised Hole Size 8 3/4 in Top of Float Collar 2985 Excess Cmt 160 % + 0.2% D046 Antifoam E T.O.C. SURFACE Bottom of Casing Shoe 3030 TD of 8-3/4" Hole 3035 2.61cuft/sx, 1057.0 cuft slurry at 11.7 ppg Pup @ Tail: 100 sx 50/50 POZ: Class G cement Pup@ 08:05 + 2% D020 Bentonite __hrs on __30-Jun-04_ft Notified BLM @ Notified NMOCD @ 08:05 hrs on 30-Jun-04 + 2% S001 Calcium Chloride + 5 lb/sx D024 Gilsonite + 0.25 lb/sx D029 Cellophane Flakes + 0.2% D046 Antifoam 1.27 cuft/sx, 127 cuft slurry at 13.5 ppg Displacement: Bumped Plug at: 06:35 hrs w/ 1250 psi Final Circ Press: 860 psi @ 2 bpm Returns during job: __ YES This well was not cavitated CMT Returns to surface: 40 bbls Floats Held: X Yes No We drilled out below the 7" casing with a 6.25" bit Underreamed the 6.25" hole to 9.5" from 3035' to 3265' We changed our minds and decided to case and frac this well. Ran 2-3/8" tubing with an expendable check to 7" shoe. We did not blow the expendable check. We did not set a liner. The plan is to come back to this well and case and frac it. This well is not yet completed. Schematic prepared by: Steven O. Moore, Drilling Engineer TD__ 3,265 ft 7-Aug-2004

COMMENTS:	· rag 200							
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran a guide shoe and an aluminum baffle plate 1 jt above the guide shoe @ 203'.							
	Displaced top wiper plug with water. Shut in casing head and WOC before backing out landing jt.							
	CENTRALIZERS @ 223', 146', 102' & 59'.	Total:	4					
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/20 BBLS. FRESH WATER & 101 BBLS. 8.4 PPG SLIGHTLY POLYMERIZED DRILL WATER							
	CENTRALIZERS @ 3020', 2942', 2855', 2769', 2683', 2597', 212', 82' & 39'.	Total:	9					
	TURBOLIZERS @ 2069', 2026', & 1983'	Total:	3					
Tubing	Ran 2-3/8" OD EUE 8rd Expendable Check on bottom of tubing string							
	Ran 96 jts 2-7/8" 6.5 # J-55 EUE 8rd							
	EOT / bottom of Expendable Check at 3020'.							

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT 230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT 230A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Spud Date: 6/28/2004

Contractor Name:

Start: 7/12/2004 Rig Release:

End: Group:

Rig Name:

Rig Number:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/13/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	MOVE	SFTY	DEMOB	SAFETY MEETING
	07:30 - 09:00	1.50	MOVE	MOB	DEMOB	LOAD EQUIPMENT,
	09:00 - 12:00	3.00	MOVE	MOB	DEMOB	MOVE RIG TO NEW LOCATION.
1	12:00 - 15:00	3.00	MOVE	RURD	MIRU	SPOT IN EQUIPMENT & RIG.
	15:00 - 19:00	4.00	MOVE	RURD	MIRU	RIG UP RIG & EQUIPMENT.
7/14/2004	07:00 - 07:30		TREBOP	SFTY	MIRU	SAFTEY MEETING, START RIG.
i i	07:30 - 19:00		TREBOP		MIRU	RIG UP EQUIPMENT, NIPPLE UP BOP STACK, RIG UP BLOOIE
						LINES, FINISH RIGGING UP.
7/15/2004	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	WELLPR	SETY	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING.
	07:30 - 09:00		TREBOP		COMPZN	LOAD HOLE, RIG UP EQUIPMENT TO PRESSURE TEST.
	09:00 - 09:30	1	WELLPR		COMPZN	PRESSURE TEST CASING & BLINDS, 300 PSI FOR 3 MINUTES, 1800
	03.00 - 03.00	0.50	*******		OOM ZIV	PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.
	09:30 - 12:30	3 00	RPEQPT	חוום	COMPZN	TALLY DP & DCS, PICK UP RUN IN HOLE WITH 6 1/4" BIT ON
	09.30 - 12.30	3.00	RECEL	FULD	CONFZI	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
	10:20 10:20	4 00	TDEBOD	DDTE	COMPAN	BOTTOM TO 2900'
	12:30 - 13:30		TREBOP		COMPZN	PRESS TEST PIPE RAMS AS PER COPC REQUIREMENTS, HELD.
İ	13:30 - 15:00	1.50	RPEQPT	PULD	COMPZN	TAG CMT AT 2965', RIG UP SWIVEL. UNLOAD HOLE WITH 1600
						CFM AIR/MIST.
	15:00 - 17:00	2.00	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	DRILL OUT CMT, DRILL FLOAT COLLAR, CLEAN OUT TO 3020'
						CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN, SHUT DOWN, SECURE WELL.
7/16/2004	07:00 - 07:30		DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	SAFETY MEETING.
	07:30 - 09:00	1	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	RIG UP MUD LOGGERS.
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRILL OUT CMT & SHOE.
	10:00 - 17:00	7.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRILL OPEN HOLE WITH 800 CFM AIR/MIST, 6 BPH WATER, 1GAL
						FOAMER, 1/4 GAL INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS. PRESSURE 250 PSI.
						COAL INTERVALS AS FOLLOWS. 3079'-3087'=8', 3088'-3090'=2',
						3092'-3097'=5', 3133'-3136'=3', 3140'-3149'=9', 3154'-3155'=1',
						3167'-3179'=12', 3220'-3222'=2', 3224'-3225'=1'.
	17:00 - 18:30	1.50	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	TD 3265', CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
	18:30 - 19:30	I .	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	CUT WATER DRY UP HOLE, NO NOTICABLE WATER ENTRY HOLE
						DRYED UP WITH IN 1 HR AFTER WATER WAS SHUT OFF CREW
]	CHANGE, SAFETY MEETING,
	19:30 - 20:00	0.50	RPEQPT	PUI D	COMPZN	PULL BIT INTO 7" FOR FLOW TEST.
	20:00 - 21:00		FLOWT	1	COMPZN	FLOW TEST, 15/MIN-2 PSI=434 MCF, 30/MIN-2 PSI=434 MCF,
Í	20.00	1				45/MIN-2 PSI=434 MCF, 60/MIN-2 PSI=434 MCF. TEST WAS DRY, NO
				Ì		INDICATION OF WATER.
	21:00 - 23:00	2.00	EVALFM	SIPR	COMPZN	SHUT IN FOR PRESSURE BUILD UP ISIP=9 PSI, 15/MIN=80 PSI,
	21.00 - 25.00	2.00	LVALIN	011 0	COMI ZIV	30/MIN=150 PSI, 45/MIN=225 PSI, 60/MIN=260 PSI, 75/MIN=295 PSI,
						90/MIN=320 PSI, 105/MIN=250 PSI, 120/MIN=370 PSI.
	22.00 00.00	1.00	PDEODT	OWEE	COMPAN	,
	23:00 - 00:00		RPEQPT RPEQPT		COMPZN	SURGE OFF PRESSURE FROM BUILD UP.
	00:00 - 01:00				COMPZN	RIG DOWN SWIVEL.
	01:00 - 05:00		RPEQPT	1	COMPZN	POOH, BRAKE OFF BIT,
	05:00 - 06:00		RPEQPT	1	COMPZN	CHANGE OVER TO RUN UNDER REAMER.
7/17/2004	06:00 - 07:00		SURFEC		COMPZN	WAIT ON UNDER REAMER.
	07:00 - 07:30		RPEQPT		COMPZN	CREW CHANGE, SAFETY MEETING.
	07:30 - 08:30		RPEQPT	1	COMPZN	MAKE UP UNDER REAMER & SHOCK SUB ON FIRST DC.
	08:30 - 11:00	2.50	RPEQPT	PULD	COMPZN	TIH WITH UNDER REAMER TO SHOE AT 3030', OPEN REAMER AT
						3035'
	11:00 - 17:00	6.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	UNDER REAM OPEN HOLE FROM 3035' -3265', CIRCULATE HOLE
						WITH 1600 CFM AIR/MIST, 8 BPH WATER, 1GAL F-450 FOAMER, 1/4
					1	GAL INHIBITOR PER 10 BBLS. CIRCULATING PRESSURE 400 PSI.
	17:00 - 18:30	1.50	DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN,
	18:30 - 19:30		DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	CREW CHANGE, SAFTY MEETING, CUT WATER OFF, DRY UP
						HOLE, HOLE DRYED UP ,NO INDICATION OF WELL MAKING

CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

Operations Summary Report

Contractor Name:

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT 230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-7 UNIT 230A

Event Name:

Rig Name:

COMPLETION

Start:

7/12/2004

Spud Date: 6/28/2004

End: Group:

Rig Release: Rig Number:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
7/17/2004	18:30 - 19:30		DRILL	CIRC	COMPZN	WATER.
	19:30 - 20:00		RPEQPT		COMPZN	1
	20:00 - 21:00	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	FLOW TEST, 15/MIN-2 PSI=434 MCF, 30/MIN-2 PSI=434 MCF, 45/MIN-2 PSI=434 MCF, 45/MIN-2 PSI=434 MCF.
	21:00 - 23:00	2.00	EVALFM	SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN FOR BUILD UP. ISIP=8 PSI, 15/MIN=60 PSI, 30/MIN=160 PSI, 45/MIN=210 PSI, 60/MIN=235 PSI, 75/MIN=250 PSI, 90/MIN=280 PSI'
	23:00 - 03:30	4.50	RPEQPT	PULD	COMPZN	105/MIN=300 PSI' 120/MIN=330 PSI. BLEED OFF PRESSURE,POOH LAYING DOWNDP & DSC, LAY DOWN UNDER REAMER.
	03:30 - 06:00	2.50	SURFEQ	OTHR	COMPZN	CHSNGE OVER FOR 2 3/8" TBG, TEST BOPS AS PER COPC REQUIRMENTS.
7/18/2004	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	WELLPR	WOSP	COMPZN	WAITING ON TBG TO BE DELIVERED.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	WELLPR	SIPB	COMPZN	CREW CHANGE, SAFETY MEETING.
	07:30 - 09:30	2.00	WELLPR	WOSP	COMPZN	WAITING ON TBG TO BE DELIVERED.
	09:30 - 11:00	1.50	SURFEQ	PULD	COMPZN	UNLOAD 2 3/8" TBG ON PIPE RACKS. TALLY TBG
	11:00 - 14:00	1	RPCOME	1	COMPZN	PICK UP TBG, RUN IN HOLE WITH EXP CHECK ON BOTTOM.
	14:00 - 16:00	2.00	TREBOP	NUND	COMPZN	LAND 2 3/8" TBG AT 3020', NIPPLE DOWN BOPS, NIPPLE UP WELL HEAD.
	16:00 - 19:00	3 00	TREBOP	BUBD	COMPZN	RIGGING DOWN EQUIPMENT.
7/19/2004	07:00 - 07:30	1	SURFEC		DEMOB	SAFETY MEETING.
7713/2004	07:30 - 17:00	1	SURFEC		DEMOB	RIG DOWN EQUIPMENT, RIG DOWN RIG, READY TO MOVE.
	-		SURFEC			
:						
	}					
			-			