Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

# UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LANI MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED OMB No. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

	WELL (	OMPL	ETION O	R REC	OMPLE	TION	REPOR	T AND	LOG			ease Serial N IMSF07874		
la. Type o b. Type o	f Well   f Completion	Oil Well  No Othe	ew Well	Vell   Work C		Other Deepe		lug Back	□ <sup>Diff</sup>	Resvr.	7. U	,	greem	r Tribe Name ent Name and No.
2. Name of	Operator	COMPA	ANY		Contac	t: JUAN E-Ma	IITA FARF	RELL :farrell@	)conocoph	illips.con	8. L	ease Name a	and W	ell No. UNIT 216A
	P O BOX	2197 WL	6106		<u>-</u>	Т	-	No. (incl	ude area co	•		PI Well No.		39-27830-00-S1
4. Location	n of Well (Rep	ort locati		d in accord	lance with			100	15 17 18 73	200	10.	Field and Po	ol, or	Exploratory
At surfa			_ 1265FWL	ır				λ	Vou A		11. :	Sec., T., R.,	M., or	Block and Survey
• •	orod interval r	eported be	elow					Q.	2004	73.C4	12.	County or P	arish	30N R5W Mer NMP
At total	pudded		15. Da	ite T.D. Re	ached		(ා   160Da	ate Comp	이 (기) leted, 기	<u></u>	91 I	RIO ARRIB		NM B, RT, GL)*
10/03/2	2004		10/	25/2004			D D	& A //29/2004	leted. Readyiu	Prod	/	637	71 GL	
18. Total I	Depth:	MD TVD	3286 3286	19	Plug Ba	ck T.D.	: MĐ TVÌ	$\langle \mathcal{C} \rangle$	3285 3285ე ე	20. 1	Depth Bri	idge Plug Se	et:	MD TVD
MÜDL				·		each)			22: W	as well co as DST ru rectional	n?	No No No	∺ Ye	s (Submit analysis) s (Submit analysis) s (Submit analysis)
	nd Liner Rec			set in well Top	Botte	om St	age Cemen	ter No	o. of Sks. &	Slu	rry Vol.			
Hole Size	Size/G		Wt. (#/ft.)	(MD)	(MI		Depth	Тур	e of Cemer		BBL)	Cement		Amount Pulled
12.250 8.750		25 H-40 000 J-55	32.3 20.0		0 :	231 3067			150 450				0	
6.250	5.5	500 J-55	15.5	302	3025 3286		286			0				
												-		
24. Tubing	g Record			<u> </u>								<u> </u>		
Size 2.375	Depth Set (M	1D) Pa	acker Depth	(MD)	Size	Depth S	et (MD)	Packer 1	Depth (MD	) Siz	e D	epth Set (Mi	D)	Packer Depth (MD)
	ing Intervals	3239				26. Pe	rforation R	ecord			J			
	ormation	COAL	Тор	3076	3ottom 3196		Perforat	ed Interva	al 6 TO 3196	Siz	0.750	No. Holes	OPE	Perf. Status
B)														
C)													├-	
27. Acid, I	racture, Treat		nent Squeeze	, Etc.				Amount	and Trees a	£ Mataria				
	Depth Interve	11		<del></del> -				Amount	and Type o	i Materia	1			
*30 D														
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Wate		l Gravity	Ga		Produc	tion Method		
Produced 10/29/2004	Date 10/28/2004	Tested 1	Production	BBL 0.0	MCF 687.0	BBL	0.0	orr. API	Gri	avity		GAS	PUMP	ING UNIT
Choke Size 2" PITOT	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI ction - Interva	Csg. Press. 5.0	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL O	Gas MCF 16488	Wate BBL		as:Oil atio	We	Il Status GSI				
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	Oil	Gas	Wate		l Gravity	Ga		Produc	tion Method		
Produced	Date The Press	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF	BBL		orr. API		avity		ACC	PTE	D FOR RECORE
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Wate BBL		as:Oil atio	l <sup>w</sup>	ell Status				1 - 000-
(See Instruc ELECTRO	tions and spa NIC SUBMI ** BI	ces for ad SSION #5 LM RE\	ditional data 50932 VERI VISED **	on reverse FIED BY BLM RE	e side) THE BLI EVISED	M WEL	L INFORM M REVI	MATION SED **	SYSTEM BLM R	EVISE	D ** BI	LM REVI	∵⊕↓ Sed	1 7 2004 Ten field office sh's
								i ve ve	ocd					Victor and the second second

201- David	uction - Interv	a.C.										
Date First	Test	Hours	Test	loil	Gas ,	Water	Oil Gravity	Gas		Production Method		·
Produced	Date	Tested	Production	BBL	MCF		Corr. API	Gravi	ty	Troduction Method		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF		Gas:Oil Ratio	Well	Status			
28c. Prod	uction - Interv	al D	_ <del></del>	<del></del>	میں ا					<u></u>		
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF		Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravi	ty	Production Method		
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF		Gas:Oil Ratio	Well	Status	·		
29. Dispo SOLE	sition of Gas(S	Sold, used j	for fuel, ven	ted, etc.)				L	.314		,	
30. Sumn	nary of Porous	Zones (Inc	lude Aquife	rs):					31. For	mation (Log) Mar	kers	
tests,	all important a including dept ecoveries.	zones of po h interval t	prosity and c tested, cushi	ontents there	eof: Cored le tool open	intervals and all	l drill-stem hut-in pressure	es				
	Formation		Тор	Bottom		Descriptions	, Contents, etc	;.	1	Name		Top Meas. Depth
SAN JOSE         0         1277           NACIMIENTO         1277         2415           OJO ALAMO         2415         2598								OJ	CIMIENTO O ALAMO RTLAND UITLAND		1279 2501 2586 2954	
			, <u>-</u>									
This	ional remarks well is a singl oore Schema	e well pro	ducina fron	n the Basin	Fruitland	Coal. Attache	d is the					
	enclosed atta											
	ectrical/Mecha andry Notice fo	_	•	• /	I	<ol> <li>Geologic R</li> <li>Core Analy</li> </ol>	•		Other:	port	4. Directio	nal Survey
34. I here	by certify that	the forego	ing and attac	ched inform	ation is cor	nplete and corre	ect as determin	ned from a	l availabl	e records (see atta	ched instruct	ions):
	*		Elect	ronic Subn For CON	iission #50 IOCOPHI	932 Verified by LLIPS COMP	y the BLM W ANY, sent to	ell Inform the Farm	nation Sy iington			,
Name	(please print)				pi ocessin	5 vy ADKIENI			`	PRESENTATIVE		
Signa	ture	(Electron	ic Submiss	ion)			Date 1	1/12/200	4		·	
							<u> </u>					·
Title 18 ( of the Un	J.S.C. Section ited States any	1001 and false, fict	Title 43 U.S itious or frac	.C. Section lulent staten	1212, make nents or rep	it a crime for a presentations as	ny person kno to any matter	wingly an within its	d willfull jurisdictio	y to make to any don.	epartment or	agency

#### END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

CONCORTININ	<i>7</i> 3					
Well Name:	San Juan 30-5 #216A				Spuc	1: 3-Oct-04
API#:	30-039-27830				Release Dri Rig	g: 7-Oct-04
Location:	905' FNL & 1265' FWL		well is equipped with		Move In Cav Rig	: 22-Oct-04
	Sec. 20 - T30N - R5W	7- <sup>1</sup> / <sub>16</sub>	3" 3M x 2- <sup>3</sup> / <sub>8</sub> " EUE 8rd	Bonnet	Date TD Reached	1: 24-Oct-04
	Rio Arriba County, NM		BM x 7-1/16" 3M Tubir	•	Release Cav Rig	g: <u>28-Oct-04</u>
	6371' GL (above MSL)	9-5/8	" 8 RD x 11" 3M Casi	ng Head		
Drl Rig RKB:	13' above Ground Level					
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL			SurfaceCe		
					Date cmt'd:	4-Oct-04
Surface Casing	Date set: <u>4-Oct-04</u>	XNew		Balda Hertifit	50 sx Class A Cemer	nt
Size	<u>9 5/8</u> in	Used		+ 3% C	alcium Chloride	
Set at				SECTION -	b/sx Flocele	
Wt.				1.18 cu	ft/sx, 177 cuft slurry a	
	12 1/4 in Conn STC				Displacement: 15.	<del></del>
Excess Cmt				860FG	Bumped Plug at: 02	
T.O.C.		Shoe <u>231</u> ft		33063	Final Circ Press: 8	
	TD of 12-1/4"	hole <u>243</u> ft		Real	urns during job:	
				CMT Ret	urns to surface:	
	fied BLM @hrs on _			14.		No floats used
Notified	NMOCD @ 14:00 hrs on _	01-Oct-04		18.888	6.00 hrs (plug bu	
				W.O.C. fo	r <u>8.00</u> hrs (plug bu	imp to test csg)
		·				
Intermediate Ca		X New		Intermedi	ate Cement	
Size	<del></del>	jtsUsed			Date cmt'd:	6-Oct-04
Set at		pups		-	50 sx Class A Cemer	nt
Wt.					conolite	
Hole Size		0-H 0000 (t		<del></del>	b/sx Gilsonite	
Excess Cmt		Collar 3023 ft		<b>—</b>	b/sx Flocele	
	SURFACE Bottom of Casing		_	2.91cu	t/sx, 1018.5 cuft slurr	y at 11.5 ppg
	<del></del> _	Hole <u>3070</u> ft		Talle	100 50/50 DOZ - 0	dana A samant
	ft Sad PLACE through	0E Oct 04	1 1111		100 sx 50/50 POZ : C	lass A cement
	fied BLM @ 11:15 hrs on _	05-Oct-04 05-Oct-04	)		entonite	
Nounea	NMOCD @ 11:15 hrs on	00-001-04	_ / _ ]	, —	x Gilsonite lb/sx Flocele	
Production Line	er Date set: 26-Oct-04	X New	_	,	alcium Chloride	- ·
Size		Used		\	ft/sx, 133 cuft slurry a	at 13.5 nng
Nominal Wt			\	1.00 00	ivax, 100 cuit siurry t	10.5 ppg
Grade	<del></del> '''	LTC	) [ ] [ ] [ ]	<del></del>	Displacement:	123 bbls
# Jnts			/	)	Bumped Plug at: 07:	
	6.25 / 9.5 inches		(		Final Circ Press: 6	
	ed 6-1/4" hole to 9.5" from 3069' to	3286'	\	,	turns during job:	
Top of Liner			<i>)</i>   <b>=</b>	1	urns to surface:	20 bbls
PBTC	<del></del>		/	(	Floats Held: X	
Bottom of Lines	3286 ft		\	)	_	
			$\setminus$ $\mid \vee \mid$	}		
			)			
This well was NOT	cavitated.		(	UNCEME	NTED LINER	4
					atic prepared by:	
			TD 3,286		O. Moore, Drilling Er	ngineer
COMMENTS:				10-Nov	7-2004	
9-5/8" Surf:	No float equipment was run. Ran a	a guide shoe and an ale	uminum baffle plate 1	jt above the guide	shoe @ 184'.	
	Displaced top wiper plug with water	r. Shut in casing head	and WOC before bad	king out landing jt.		
	CENTRALIZERS @ 221', 144', 100	)', 57'.			т	otal: 4
7" Intermediate	DISPLACED W/ 123 BBLS. DRILL	WATER.				
	CENTRALIZERS @ 3056', 2980', 2	2894', 2808', 2722', 263	36', 214', 86', 43'.		Т	otal: 9
	TURBOLIZERS @ 2510', 2553', 2					otal: 3
5.5" Liner	Ran 6-1/16" bladed shoe w/ float v				o liner hanger).	
Perforations	Perforated 5-1/2" liner with guns of Perf. Intervals: 3076'-3082', 3099'				8'-3190', 3192'-3196'.	TOTAL SHOTS =
Tubing	176.	o Peolod Mud Anahar	with pight pack 0.05"	v O'' olota inot hala	v the unest	
Tubing	30.62' x 2-7/8" EUE 8rd box Orang 2-7/8" x 2-3/8" EUE 8rd crossover				v me upset,	
	102 jts 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUE 8rd tu	•	CHOCK, 2-3/0 OD (	יייי בייי ביייי אוליייי		
L	Bottom of Mud Anchor at 3259'. F	•	(B.			
Pump	12" long strainer attached below in			n top of pump	****	
&	128 ea 3/4" OD rods, spaced out w	• •			polished rod	
Rods	and with 2' pony rod on top of polis				•	

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A** 

Event Name:

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A

COMPLETION

Start:

10/22/2004

Spud Date: 10/3/2004 End:

10/28/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 10/28/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY** 

18:	引用机能	magar.		1,010	11/11/148	16/1/38
₩.		Lieni. 9	Carron.	1015 13	4 (148)	
97	divi [7:	Progres	*P\$\$ 8.7	dich ti	14373	no

From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	I		SFTY RURD	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. MOVE RIG AND SPOT EQUIPMENT, RIG UP, NIPPLE UP BOPS. MOVED TO THE SAN JUAN 30-5 #216A SEC 20 - T30N - R5W 905'FNL 1265'FWL NEAREST HELI PAD IS THE LOCATION 100 YARDS NORTH OF THIS ONE.  CALLED THE BLM HOTLINE PHONE FOR PRESSURE TEST @
					1100HRS, 10/22/2004  LEFT VOICE MAIL ON THE PHONE OF CHARLIE PERRIN WITH THE OCD @ 1105HRS ABOUT PRESSURE TEST. 10/22/2004
07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:30 08:30 - 09:00 09:00 - 12:00	1.00 0.50	DRILL DRILL	SFTY RURD SFTY SFEQ	COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. CHANGE RAMS IN #2 BOPS TO 2 7/8" PREPARE TO TEST BOPS. RIG INSPECTION AND REPAIR GIGS. PRESSURE TEST CASING AND BLIND RAMS 300# LOW FOR 10 MIN AND 1800# HIGH FOR 30 MIN. STATE INTEGRITY TEST. INSTALL TEST PLUG AND PRESSURE TEST BOTH SETS OF PIPE RAMS, HCR VALVES, AND ALL MANIFOLD VALVES. 300 # LOW
12:00 - 12:30	0.50	DRILL	PULD	COMPZN	FOR 10 MIN. AND 1800 # HIGH FOR 10 MIN. ALL OK GIH PU BHA 6 1/4" RERUN BIT, BIT SUB WITH DP FLOAT, 10 - 3 1/2" DC'S, 1JT OF 2 7/8" DP, 1-2 7/8" FN W / 1.87 PROFILE.
12:30 - 13:30 13:30 - 15:00	1	1	PULD PULD	COMPZN COMPZN	PULL DRILL PIPE OUT OF PIPE BASKET AND TALLY. GIH PICKING UP 2 7/8 DP TO 2961'
15:00 - 17:00	2.00	STIMOP	SFEQ	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL. PRESSURE TEST STAND PIPE, AIR MANIFOLD, TIW VALVE AND
17:00 - 18:00 07:00 - 08:00	1		PULD SFTY	COMPZN COMPZN	KELLY HOSE TO 1800PSI FOR 10 MIN AND 300PSI FOR 10 MIN. SECURE WELL, DRAIN UP AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT. PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
08:00 - 11:00	3.00	DRILL	OTHR	COMPZN	SERVICE AND WARM UP ALL EQUIPMENT. UNLOAD HOLE, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION, DRLG CEMENT FROM 2995' TO 3023' DRLG FLOAT COLLAR AND 46' OF CEMENT WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. TAG FLOAT @ 3023' CSG SHOE @ 3067' TD 8 3/4 HOLE @ 3070'
11:00 - 14:00	3.00	DRILL	DRLG	COMPZN	DRILLING FORMATION 3070' TO 3286' DRLG WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 330PSI ON STANDPIPE. 3076' - 3082' 6' 100 UNITS OF GAS 3099' - 3104' 5' 447 UNITS OF GAS 3106' - 3108' 2' 10 UNITS OF GAS 3133' - 3152' 19' 10 UNITS OF GAS 3153' - 3163' 10' 606 UNITS OF GAS 3186' - 3190' 4' 450 UNITS OF GAS
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00 07:30 - 08:30 07:30 - 08:30 08:30 - 09:00 09:00 - 12:00 12:00 - 12:30 12:30 - 13:30 13:30 - 15:00 15:00 - 17:00 17:00 - 18:00 07:00 - 08:00 08:00 - 11:00	07:00 - 07:30	07:00 - 07:30	07:00 - 07:30	07:00 - 07:30

## **Operations Summary Report**

**SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A** Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A

Spud Date: 10/3/2004

Event Name:

COMPLETION

Start: 10/22/2004 End: 10/28/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 10/28/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY** 

Nig Ivaille.	The second section and second	\L I	NATIONAL CONTRACTOR CONTRACTOR	- 18 1-000-0-19 11 11 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	ING NUMBER. 21
Date	From - To	Hours Co	de Sub Code		Description of Operations
0/25/2004	11:00 - 14:00	3.00 DRI	LL DRLG	COMPZN	3192' - 3194' 2' 450 UNITS OF GAS 3195' - 3196' 1' 250 UNITS OF GAS 792 UNITS (HIGH) TOTAL COAL 49'
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00 DRI	LL CIRC	COMPZN	BLOW HOLE CLEAN WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6 BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 330PSI ON STANDPIPE. WELL WAS MAKING 1 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL, DOWN TO
	15.00 15.00	0.50		00140711	1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OF COAL.
	15:00 - 15:30	0.50 DRI	LL CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND BLOW WELL DRY.  LIGHT MIST TO SURFACE WHEN BLOWING WELL DRY.
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50 DRI	LL PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN 8 JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00 FLC	WT PRDT	COMPZN	WITH POWER SWIVEL. 2" OPEN FLOW TEST
					INITIAL PRESSURE 3 # ON GAUGE 0.75 # 539 MCFD
					15 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD 30 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD
					45 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD
					60 MINUTES - 7 # ON GAUGE 1.75 # 801 MCFD
					NO WATER ON FLOW TEST.
	17:00 - 18:00	1.00 FLC	WT SIPB	COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST
					INSP 25 PSI
					15 MINUTES 85 PSI
					30 MINUTES 85 PSI
					45 MINUTES 85 PSI 60 MINUTES 85 PSI
			1		RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00 DRI	LL TRIP	COMPZN	
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50 DRI	I	COMPZN	
	19:30 - 21:30	2.00 DRI	LL TRIP	COMPZN	PICK UP SHOCK SUB AND UNDER REAMER AND TRIP IN HOLE.
	21:30 - 22:00	0.50 DRI	LL PULD	COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
					ESTABLISH CIRCULATION.
	22:00 - 02:30	4.50 DRI	LL UREM	COMPZN	
					WITH 1500 CFM AIR, 10 BPH MIST WITH 1/2 GAL CORROSION
			ļ		INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER. 610PSI ON STANDPIPE.
	02:30 - 03:30	1.00 DRI	LL CIRC	COMPZN	
	32.00	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,			GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450 FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS
					OF WATER.
					620PSI ON STANDPIPE.
	03:30 - 04:00	0.50 DRI	LL CIRC	COMPZN	TURN OFF MIST PUMP AND DRY UP HOLE.
	30.00 - 04.00	5.55		- COM 214	NO WATER TO SURFACE.
	04:00 - 04:45	0.75 STI	MOP PULD	COMPZN	
				1	WITH POWER SWIVEL.
	04:45 - 05:45	1.00 FLC	WT PRDT	COMPZN	
				1	INITIAL PRESSURE 4 # ON GAUGE 1.00 # 615 MCFD
					15 MINUTES - 9 # ON GAUGE 2.25 # 913 MCFD
					30 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A

Event Name:

COMPLETION

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Start:

Spud Date: 10/3/2004 End:

10/22/2004

10/28/2004

Rig Release: 10/28/2004

Group:

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

**KEY** 

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/25/2004	04:45 - 05:45	1.00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	45 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD
	05:45 - 06:00	0.05	2011	TDID	COMPAN	60 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD
10/26/2004	06:00 - 07:00		DRILL	TRIP	COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE. TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH UNDER REAMER.
10/20/2004	00.00 - 07.00	1.00	DRILL	IKIF	COMPZIN	LAY DOWN SHOCK SUB AND UNDER REAMER.
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	DRILL	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	07:30 - 08:30		STIMOP		COMPZN	PICK UP BIT AND BIT SUB, TRIP IN HOLE TO 3035'.
	08:30 - 09:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	PICK UP AND RIG UP POWER SWIVEL.
	09:00 - 10:30		STIMOP		COMPZN	SHUT IN TEST
						INSP 25 PSI
						15 MINUTES 85 PSI
						30 MINUTES 85 PSI
						45 MINUTES 85 PSI
						60 MINUTES 85 PSI
					-	RELEASE AS NATURAL SURGE #2, LET WELL BLOW DOWN.
	10:30 - 16:30	6.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	NATURAL SURGE,
						#3 85PSI 60MIN
						#4 85PSI 60MIN
						#5 85PSI 60MIN
						#6 85PSI 30MIN
						#7 85PSI 30MIN
	16:20 17:00	0.50	STIMOP	DITID	COMPZN	#8 85PSI 30MIN
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	STIMOP	POLD	COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL TAG @ 3286'.  TRIP OUT OF HOLE LAYING DOWN DRILL PIPE WITH POWER
						SWIVEL.
	17:00 - 18:00	1 00	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	2" OPEN FLOW TEST
	11.00 10.00	1.00	1.000	1101	COMIT ZIV	INITIAL PRESSURE 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD
						15 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD
					1	30 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD
						45 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD
					1	60 MINUTES - 10 # ON GAUGE 2.50 # 970 MCFD
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	ESTABLISH CIRCULATION AT CASING SHOE.
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	19:30 - 20:00	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	GIH PICKING UP DRILL PIPE WITH POWER SWIVEL
	20:00 - 04:00	8.00	STIMOP	CIRC	COMPZN	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE WITH 1100 CFM AIR, 5 TO 6
						BPH MIST WITH 1/4 GAL CORROSION INHIBITOR, 1 GAL 450
						FOAMER PER 10 BARRELS OF WATER.
	04:00 - 04:30	0.50	STIMOP	PULD	COMPZN	PULL UP INTO CASING LAYING DOWN DRILL PIPE WITH POWER
	04:00 00:00	4.50	OT1140D	TD10	00110711	SWIVEL, HANG SWIVEL IN DERRICK.
40/07/0004	04:30 - 06:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 5 1/2 LINER.
10/27/2004	06:00 - 07:30	1.50	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	RIG UP FLOOR TO RUN LINER. CHANGE #1 RAMS TO 5 1/2 AND
						MAKE HE HANGED ON JOINT OF DRIVE DIDE AND LAY DOWN
						MAKE UP HANGER ON JOINT OF DRILL PIPE AND LAY DOWN SAME.
						OTHE.
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA FOR RUNNING LINER AND TRIPPING IN THE HOLE
						WITH DRILL PIPE WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION.
	08:00 - 10:30	2.50	CASING	PUTB	COMPZN	GIH W/ 5-1/2" 15.5 PPF J-55 LT&C CASING / LINER AS FOLLOWS:
						6-1/16" OD BLADED SHOE W/ FLOAT VALVE
		1.				1.00'
						G ITO 5 4/07 CACINIC
						6- JTS 5-1/2" CASING -
	1	1		1	1	

## **Operations Summary Report**

**SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A** 

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A

**Event Name:** 

COMPLETION

Start:

10/22/2004

End:

Spud Date: 10/3/2004 10/28/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Rig Release: 10/28/2004

Group:

Rig Name:

**KEY** 

Rig Name:		KEY				Rig Number: 27
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/27/2004	08:00 - 10:30	2.50	CASING	PUTB	COMPZN	258.17'
					}	6-1/8" TIW "H" ROTATING SET COLLAR -
			1			2.40' TOTAL LINER ASSEMBLY -
						261.57'
						GIH W/ TOTAL OF 87 JTS 2-7/8" DRILLPIPE T/2983'KB.
						PICK UP SINGLE JOINTS OF DP-
						GIH W/ 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/2983' & TAG UP @
						3286'KB,3285'PBTD.
						SET 5-1/2" LINER ASSEMBLY F/ 3286-3025'KB EOL-
						W/ PBTD @ 3285'KB- RELEASE OFF OF LINER ASSEMBLY TOL @ 3025'KB.
					ļ	RELEASE OF TOP EINER ASSEMBLY TOE & 3023 RB.
	10:30 - 14:30	4.00	CASING	PULD	COMPZN	LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, TRIP IN HOLE WITH DRILL COLLARS AND
						LAY DOWN SAME.
	14:30 - 16:00	1 50	STIMOP	ОТИВ	COMPZN	RIG DOWN AND LOAD OUT POWER SWIVEL
	14.30 - 10.00	1.50	STINIOF	OTHK	COMPZIN	UNLOAD TUBING FROM TRAILER THAT WAS LEFT ON LOCATION THIS MORNING.
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00	STIMOP	OTHR	COMPZN	SECURE WELL LOCK UP EQUIPMENT, SHUT DOWN FOR THE
						NIGHT.
10/28/2004	06:00 - 08:00	2.00	STIMOP	SFTY	COMPZN	MONTHLY CONOCO/PHILLIPS SAFETY MEETING AT
						CONOCO/PHILLIPS OFFICE.
	08:00 - 10:00		STIMOP		COMPZN	TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
	10:00 - 10:30 10:30 - 12:30		PERFOR	1	COMPZN	PJSM AND JSA WITH ALL PERSONEL ON LOCATION. RIG UP BLUE JET AND TEST LUBRICATOR TO 85PSI.
	10.30 - 12.30	2.00	STINIOF	FER	COMPZIN	PERFORATE AT FOLLOWING INTERVALS.
						3192' - 3196' = 4' 16 SHOTS
						3188' - 3190' = 2' 8 SHOTS
						3154' - 3163' = 9' 36 SHOTS
						3142' - 3152' = 10' 40 SHOTS
						3132' - 3138' = 6' 24 SHOTS
	i					3106' - 3108' = 2' 8 SHOTS
						3099' - 3104' = 5' 20 SHOTS  3076' - 3082' = 6' 24 SHOTS
						3070 - 3002 - 0 24 3HO13
						4 SHOTS PER FOOT, 176 TOTAL SHOTS.
						3 WIRELINE RUNS.
	12:30 - 14:00	1.50	FLOWT	PRDT	COMPZN	BLOW WELL DOWN AND FLOW TEST.
						2" OPEN FLOW TEST SIBU 85PSI 60 MINUTES - 5 # ON GAUGE 1.25 # 687 MCFD
	14:00 - 16:00	2 00	STIMOP	RCST	COMPZN	GIH W/ 30.62' X 2-7/8" 8RD EUE BOX ORANGE PEELED MUD
					00 2	ANCHOR W/ 8-(1/4" X 8") SLOTS, 2-7/8" X 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X-O
						COLLAR (0.45"), W/ 0.72" x 2-3/8" EXPENDABLE CHECK W/ 0.78" x
			1			2-3/8" OD X 1.78" ID "F" NIPPLE.
						W/ 102 JTS 2-3/8" EUE 8RD 4.7 PPF J-55 TBG MEASURING
						(3214.06')-
						LAND TBG W/ 2-3/8" EUE 8RD X 7-1/16" TBG HGR CONTAINING A BPV
			Į.			EOT / MUD ANCHOR @ 3259'KB
				1		1.78" FN @ 3227'KB.
	40.00 40.00		0711:07		001/27:	Die Double Good Allen de Double Good Good Good Good Good Good Good Goo
	16:00 - 18:00	2.00	STIMOP	NUND	COMPZN	RIG DOWN FLOOR, NIPPLE DOWN AND LOAD OUT BOPS.
	1	T.	1	t	1	I and the second

#### Page 5 of 5

#### CONOCOPHILLIPS CO

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name:

**SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A** 

Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 30-5 UNIT 216A

**Event Name:** 

COMPLETION

Start:

10/22/2004

End:

Spud Date: 10/3/2004

Contractor Name:

**KEY ENERGY SVCS** 

Group:

10/28/2004

Rig Name:

**KEY** 

Rig Release: 10/28/2004

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/28/2004	16:00 - 18:00	2.00	STIMOP	NUND	COMPZN	NIPPLE UP RADAGAN AND RIG UP TO RUN RODS. SECURE WELL AND SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT.
10/29/2004	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:00		STIMOP STIMOP		COMPZN COMPZN	PJSM WITH ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION. BLOW WELL DOWN, 95PSI
:	08:00 - 09:00	1.00	STIMOP	SLKL	COMPZN	DROP BALL AND PUMP OUT EXPENDABLE PLUG.
	09:00 - 11:30	2.50	STIMOP	ALFI	COMPZN	RU TO RUN RODS- FUNCTION TEST INSERT PUMP (OK)-
						GIH W/ 12" STRAINER ATTACHED BELOW 2" X 1 1/4" X 12' RHAC-ZDV INSERT PUMP SN: (CP195) W/ 4' PONY ROD AND 128
						3/4" NORRIS, TYPE 78, API GRADE "D" RODS & SPACE OUT W/ 2', 8', PONY RODS, RUN 1 1/4" X 22' POLISHED ROD W/ 2' PONY ROD
						ON TOP.
						RIG UP ABOVE 2-3/8" COLLAR 1-1/4" ROD RATAGAN, 2-3/8" PUMPING TEE W/ 2" & 1" OUTLETS W/ BALL VALVES, STUFFING
						BOX. PUMP SEATED @ 3227'KB,FN.
						LOAD TBG W/ 12 BBLS CLEAN PRODUCED Kfc WATER-
						PT STANDING VALVE, TBG, STUFFING BOX T/ 500 PSIG (OK)- STROKE PUMP T/500 PSIG & CHECK TRAVELING VALVE (OK).
	11:30 - 19:00	7.50	STIMOP	RURD	COMPZN	HANG OFF PUMP. RIG DOWN AND PREPARE TO MOVE RIG.
						RIG RELEASED @ 1900 HRS TO THE SAN JUAN 30-5 #210A
						·
						·