New Mexico Energy Minerals and Natural Resources Department

Form C-140 Revised 06/99

District I - (505) 393-6161
1625 N. French Dr, Hobbs, NM 88240
District II - (505) 748-1283
1301 W. Grand Avenue, Artesia, NM 88210
District III - (505) 334-6178
1000 Rio Brazos Road, Aztec, NM 87410
District IV - (505) 476-3440
1320 S. St. Fernancia Dr. Santa Re. NM 87505

Oil Conservation Division 1220 South St. Francis Dr. Santa Fe, New Mexico 87505 (505) 476-3440

SUBMIT ORIGINAL
PLUS 2 COPIES
PLO APPROPRIATE
DIȘTRICT OFFICE

APPLICATION FOR WELL WORKOVER PROJE

1220	o. ol. Francis	Dr., Santa Pe, Niv	187505		<u>WI</u>	ELL WORKOVER PRO	JEQT', Way	the Contract of	
I.	Operato	r and Well							
Opera	tor name add	Burningt		ces Oil and Ga gton, NM 874			OGRID Pumper	014538	
Conta	ct Party	Leslie I	D. White	·			Phone 50	05/326-9700	
Prop	erty Name				Well Nur	mber	API Number		
	HANCOCI	ΚB			5		3004513065		
UL	Section	Township	Range	Feet From The		Feet From The	County		
м	31	28 N	9 W	830	FSL	950 FWL	SAN JUAN		
II.	Worko	ver				·			
Date \	Norkover Com	mence	10/21/2003		Producing Poo	ol(s) (Prior to Workover):			
Date \	Norkover Com	pleted:	10/29/2003						
		Lesti 1. La 2. Li avi 3. To cui nature	nave made, or allable for this the best of more and/or tab r this Well are	, being first for, or authorized r caused to be mad Well. y knowledge, this	representat de, a dilige application curate.	n, upon oath states: iive of the Operator, of the about search of the production remains and the data used to prepare Accountant Date 6/1 y of Time, 200	ecords reasonably e the production	eli.	
				• bolo.0 IIIc (1110 _		Notary Public	 ;		
Ŀ	My (Commission e	· 🔺 .	Ember 1.	5,200	•	rcy Olts	nanno	
.17	7. CE Th Di Sec wa	ERTIFICATION is Application vision hereby	ON OF APPR is hereby appropriate the distribution and the control of the control	proved and the ab ata shows a positi	ve product	nced well is designated a Witton increase. By copy hereds Approval and certifies that	ell Workover Proje	ect and the	
V	II. DA	TE OF NOTI	FICATION 1	TO THE SECRET	CARY OF	THE TAXATION AND RE	VENUE DEPART	MENT:	

HANCOCK B 5	3004513065	71599	82329
	REG_DTL_DT	GAS_PROD	GAS PROD
	01-Oct-02	1986	
	01-Nov-02	1984	
	01-Dec-02	1553	
	01-Jan-03	1439	
	01-Feb-03	2049	
	01-Mar-03	3021	
	01-Apr-03	2705	
	01-May-03	2345	
	01-Jun-03	1523	
	01-Jul-03	729	
	01-Aug-03	898	
	01-Sep-03	410	
	01-Oct-03	255	
4	01-Nov-03	1746	1747
	01-Dec-03	3781	3781
	01-Jan-04	3060	3060

BURLINGTON RESOURCES O&G CO

Page 1 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

HANCOCK B #5

Common Well Name: HANCOCK B #5

Event Name:

CAP WORKOVER

Start:

10/21/2003

Spud Date: 04/30/1962 End:

Contractor Name:

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

Rig Release: 10/29/2003 Rig Number: 449

Group:

10/29/2003

Rig Name:

AZTEC

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/22/2003	10:00 - 13:30	3.50	мімо	а	MIRU	ROAD RIG FROM REID COM # 706 TO HANCOCK B #5 , WATER TRUCK GOT HUNG UP ON HILL ON WAY TO LOC IN FRONT OF RIG
	13:30 - 14:30 14:30 - 16:00	3	RURD RURD	a a	MIRU MIRU	SPOT IN RIG RAMP, PUT RIG ON RAMP, STAND UP DERRICK. SPOT IN & RU REST OF EQUIP, LAY FLOWLINES. CSG HAD 130
	16:00 - 18:00	2.00	NUND	а	MIRU	PSI, TBG HAD 80 PSI, BH WAS DEAD. CHANGE OUT 3 LOCKDOWN PINS & CSG VALVES, ND TREE, NU BOP. SDFD.
10/23/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	SAFE	a	OBJECT	TRAV TO LOC, START RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON WEARING PPE, RIG CREW, AIR HANDS, CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT.
	07:00 - 11:00	4.00	TRIP	а	OBJECT	TOOH W/ TBG , TALLY SAME .
	11:00 - 13:00	l	TRIP	a	OBJECT	TIH W/ 4 1/2" RBP & SET @ 4520'.
	13:00 - 13:30		PUMP	a	OBJECT	LOAD HOLE & CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN .
	13:30 - 15:30		TRIP	a	OBJECT	TOOH W/ RETRIEVING HEAD.
	15:30 - 17:00		CASE	a	OBJECT	RU WIRELINE, RIH W/ GR/CCL/CBL, LOG FROM 4500' TO 2000', POOH, RD WL.
	17:00 - 19:00	2.00	TRIP	a	OBJECT	TIH W/ RH , LATCH & UNSET RBP .
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	SHDN	а	OBJECT	SHUT & LOCK PIPE RAMS, MU & SHUT TIW, PU TOOLS & LOC, DRAIN UP EQUIP, SDFD.
10/24/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	SAFE	a	ОВЈЕСТ	NOTE: SENT LOGS TO OFFICE. TRAV TO LOC, START RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON TESTING CSG, RIG CREW, AIR HAND, PKR HAND, WIRELINE HANDS,
	07.00 00.00					CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT.
	07:00 - 09:00		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TOOH W/ RBP .
	09:00 - 09:30		CASE	а	OBJECT	RU WIRELINE , RIH & SET 4 1/2" CIBP @ 3640'.
	09:30 - 11:00		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TIH W/ 4 1/2" PKR .
	11:00 - 13:00		PRES	a	OBJECT	SET PKR @ 2859', TRY TO TEST CSG , NO TEST , SET PKR @ 3600', TEST CSG & CIBP TO 3000 PSI , TESTED GOOD , SET PKR @ 2889', TEST CSG , NO TEST , SET PKR @ 2919', TEST CSG , NO TEST , INJ RATE OF .5 BPM @ 1500 PSI , ISIP OF 500 PSI , SET PKR @ 2500', TEST ANNULUS TO 500 PSI , TESTED GOOD .
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	TRIP	a	OBJECT	TOOH W/ PKR .
	14:00 - 14:30	0.50	PERF	а	OBJECT	RIH W/ 3 1/8" HSC CSG GUN LOADED W/ OWEN 302 10 GM CHARGES, PERF CHACRA FOM 3588' TO 3038', W/ 1 SPF, FOR A TOTAL OF 25 HOLES, POOH, RD WIRELINE.
	14:30 - 16:30	2.00	ŢŖIP	а	OBJECT	RIH W 4 1/2" TENSION PKR & 2 7/8" FRAC STRING , SET PKR @ 2950', MU FRAC MANDREL , FRAC VALVE & FRAC - Y . PUT 500 PSI ON ANNULUS .
	16:30 - 17:45	1.25	RURD	a	OBJECT	SPOT IN FRAC EQUIP & PUMPLINE , HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON FRACING , FRAC CREW , RIG CREW , PKR HAND , FRAC CONSULTANT , CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT , PRESS TEST
	17:45 - 19:00	1.25	FRAC	a	OBJECT	LINES TO 7500 PSI, TESTED GOOD. FOAM FRAC CHACRA W/ 20# LINEAR GEL 75% N2 FOAM, FORMATION BREAKDOWN @1537 PSI @ 4 BPM, EST INJ RATE OF 8 BPM @ 1778 PSI, ISIP 480 PSI, BULLHEAD 750 GALS OF 15% HCL
	19:00 - 20:00	1 00	RURD	2	OBJECT	IN FRONT OF FRAC , FRAC LOAD 603 BBLS , 6 BBLS OF FLUSH , TOTAL LOAD OF 609 BBLS , TOTAL N2 1,139,500 SCF, MAX PSI 6020, MIN 3377 , AVG PSI 5037 , MAX RATE 45 BPM , MIN 35 , AVG RATE 43 BPM , 200,000# 20/40 ARIZONA SAND , ISIP 1240 PSI .
	10.00 - 20.00	1.00	NUKU	а	OBJECT	RD FRAC LINE , RU FLOWLINE & PRESS TEST LINE W/ WELL

BURLINGTON RESOURCES 0&G CO

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

HANCOCK B #5

Common Well Name: HANCOCK B #5

CAP WORKOVER

Start:

10/21/2003

Spud Date: 04/30/1962 End:

10/29/2003

Page 2 of 4

Event Name: Contractor Name:

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

Rig Release: 10/29/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

AZTEC

Rig Number: 449

Sub Hours Phase Date From - To Code **Description of Operations** Code 10/24/2003 19:00 - 20:00 1.00 RURD **OBJECT** PRESS, TESTED GOOD. 20:00 - 06:00 10.00 FLOW CLEAN FLOW FRAC BACK THRU CHOKE MANIFOLD. 16/64" CHOKE, MAKING HEAVY MIST, LIGHT SAND @ 1100 PSI. 21:00 10/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , LIGHT SAND @ 1100 PSI. 23:00 ,12/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , NO SAND @ 1050 PSI . 01:00 , 14/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , NO SAND @ 1050 PSI 03:00 , 16/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , NO SAND @ 1000 PSI 05:00 , 18/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , NO SAND @ 1000 PSI 06:00 , 20/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , NO SAND @ 950 PSI . 10/25/2003 24.00 FLOW 06:00 - 06:00 CLEAN FLOW FRAC BACK THRU CHOKE MANIFOLD ON 20/64" CHOKE MAKING HEAVY MIST, LIGHT SAND @ 700 PSI 09:00 , 22/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , LIGHT SAND @ 500 12:00 , 24/64" CHOKE , MAKING HEAVY MIST , LIGHT SAND @ 325 PSI. 15:00, 32/64" CHOKE, MAKING HEAVY TO MODERATE MIST, LIGHT SAND @ 325 PSI . 18:00, 48/64" CHOKE, MAKING MODERATE MIST, LIGHT SAND @ 130 psi . 22:00 , FULL 2" , MAKING LIGHT MIST , NO SAND @ 50 PSI . 10/26/2003 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 SAFE **OBJECT** TRAV TO LOC, START RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN TBG , RIG CREW , AIR HAND , CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT. 07:00 - 09:00 2.00 TRIP **OBJECT** KILL WELL W/ 20 BBLS OF 2%, ND FRAC VALVE & FRAC MANDERAL, UNSET PKR, POOH W/ FRAC STRING & PKR 09:00 - 10:00 1.00 TRIP **OBJECT** TIH W/ 3 7/8" JUNK MILL , TAG UP @ 3540', CIBP & 3640', HAD 100' 10:00 - 11:00 1.00 COUT CLEAN CO TO TOP OF CIBP W/ AIR MIST. 11:00 - 06:00 19.00 BLOW CLEAN BLOW W/ AIR MIST, MAKING 8 TO 12 BPH OF H2O, 1 TO 3 CUPS OF SAND 10/27/2003 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 FLOW **CLEAN** FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 8 BPH OF H2O , 1 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND 08:00 - 10:00 BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 8 TO 10 BPH OF H2O , 1 TO 2 2.00 BLOW CLEAN CUPS OF SAND 10:00 - 14:00 4.00 FLOW CLEAN FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O, 1 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND. 14:00 - 16:00 2.00 BLOW CLEAN BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 6 TO 10 BPH OF H2O , 1 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND. 16:00 - 20:00 4.00 FLOW **CLEAN** FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O . 1 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND. 20:00 - 22:00 2.00 BLOW **CLEAN** BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O , 1 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND 22:00 - 02:00 4.00 FLOW CLEAN FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O , 1 CUP OF SAND 02:00 - 04:00 2.00 BLOW **CLEAN** BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O , 1 CUP OF SAND 04:00 - 06:00 2.00 FLOW FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 6 TO 8 BPH OF H2O , 1 CUP OF **CLEAN** 10/28/2003 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 SAFE **OBJECT** TRAV TO LOC , START RIG , HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON STAYING

BURLINGTON RESOURCES 0&G CO

Page 3 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

HANCOCK B #5

Common Well Name: HANCOCK B #5

CAP WORKOVER

Start:

Spud Date: 04/30/1962

Event Name:

10/21/2003

End: 10/29/2003

Contractor Name:

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

Rig Release: 10/29/2003

Group:

Rig Name:

AZTEC

Rig Number: 449

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
10/28/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	SAFE	a .	OBJECT	AWAY FROM AIR LINES WHILE CO , RIG CREW , AIR HAND , CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT .
	07:00 - 07:15	0.25	TRIP	a	OBJECT	SHORT TIH , TAG UP @ 3600', CIBP @ 3640', HAD 40' OF FILL .
	07:15 - 11:00	3.75	BLOW	а	CLEAN	CO TO TOP OF CIBP W/ AIR MIST , MAKING 3 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 TO
		ļ				3 CUPS OF SAND.
	11:00 - 14:00	3.00	FLOW	а	CLEAN	PULL UP FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O, 1 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND.
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00	BLOW	а	CLEAN	CHECK FILL, TAG UP @ 3630', HAD 10' OF FILL, CO W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST, MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF H2O, 1/2 CUP OF SAND.
	15:00 - 18:00		FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 TO 2 CUPS OF SAND .
	18:00 - 19:00		BLOW	a	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 CUP OF SAND .
	19:00 - 01:00		FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL , MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 TO 1 CUP OF SAND .
	01:00 - 02:00		BLOW	a	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 3 TO 4 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 CUP OF SAND .
	02:00 - 06:00		FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 4 TO 6 BPH OF H2O, 1/2 TO 1 CUP OF SAND, HAVE 25 FLAME.
10/29/2003	06:00 - 07:00		SAFE	а	OBJECT	TRAV TO LOC, START RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON PINCH POINTS, RIG CREW, AIR HAND, CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT.
	07:00 - 07:15		TRIP	а	OBJECT	SHORT TIH , TAG UP @ 3638', CIBP @ 3640', HAD 2' OF FILL .
	07:15 - 08:00		MILL	а	CLEAN	CO TO TOP OF CIBP W/ AIR MIST EST 14 BPH MIST RATE , MILL OUT CIBP .
	08:00 - 09:00		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TIH W/ MILL , CHASE JUNK TO PBTD @ 6954'.
	09:00 - 11:00		TRIP	а	OBJECT	TOOH W/ MILL .
	11:00 - 13:00		TRIP	a	OBJECT	TIH W/ EXC , TAG UP @ 6944', HAD 10' OF FILL .
	13:00 - 15:00		BLOW	a	CLEAN	CO TO PBTD W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST , MAKING 3 BPH OF H2O , 1/2 TO 1/4 CUP OF SAND .
	15:00 - 18:00		FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 5 TO 6 BPH OF H2O, 1/2 TO 1/4 CUP OF SAND.
	18:00 - 19:00		BLOW	a	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST, MAKING 3 BPH OF H2O, 1/8 TO 1/4 CUP OF SAND.
	19:00 - 00:00 00:00 - 01:00		FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 5 TO 6 BPH OF H2O, 1/8 TO 1/4 CUP OF SAND.
	01:00 - 06:00		BLOW	а	CLEAN	BLOW W/ 1 TO 1 AIR MIST, MAKING 3 BPH OF H2O, 1/8 TO 1/4 CUP OF SAND.
0/30/2003	06:00 - 07:00		FLOW	а	CLEAN	FLOW WELL NATURAL, MAKING 3 TO 5 BPH OF H2O, 2 TABLESPOONS TO 1/8 CUP OF SAND.
0/30/2003	07:00 - 07:15		SAFE	а	OBJECT	TRAV TO LOC, START RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING ON RD RIG & EQUIP, RIG CREW, AIR HAND, CONSULTANT WERE PRESENT.
	07:15 - 08:00			a	OBJECT CLEAN	SHORT TIH , TAG UP @ 6950', HAD 4' OF FILL .
	00.00	0.75	DECOV	d	CLEAN	CO TO PBTD W/ AIR MIST , MAKING 2 BPH OF H2O , TRACE OF SAND .
	08:00 - 08:30	0.50	BRCH	а	OBJECT	BROACH TBG TO SEAT NIPPLE .
	08:30 - 09:00			а	OBJECT	LAND TBG @ 6921.61' W/ 224 JTS OF 2.375" , 4.7# , J-55 , EUE , 8 RD TBG W/ 1.78" ID SEAT NIPPLE SET @ 6890.59', W/ KB INCLUDED , ND BOP , NU TREE .
	09:00 - 10:00	1.00	PRES	а	OBJECT	PRESS TEST TBG TO 500 PSI , TESTED GOOD , PUMP OFF EXC @ 800 PSI , REV UP TBG .
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	RURD	а	RDMO	RD RIG & EQUIP, MOL TO ZACHRY # 29 . NOTE TRY TO TAKE PITOT , TSTM .
						SUMMARY, MOL, RU RIG & EQUIP, TOOH W/TBG, TIH W/RBP,
	<u> </u>			<u> </u>		

BURLINGTON RESOURCES 0&G CO

Page 4 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

HANCOCK B #5

Common Well Name: HANCOCK B #5

Event Name:

CAP WORKOVER

Start:

10/21/2003

Spud Date: 04/30/1962

End: 10/29/2003

Contractor Name:

AZTEC WELL SERVICE

Rig Release: 10/29/2003

Group:

Date	From - To	Hours (Code	Sub Code	Phase	Description of Operations
0/30/2003	10:00 - 11:00	1.00 R	URD a		RDMO	LOG CHACRA, TIH W/ PKR TEST CSG, TOOH W/ PKR, TOOH W/ RBP, RIH SET CIBP, RIH PERF CHACRA, RIH W/ FRAC STRING & PKR, FOAM FRAC CHACRA, FLOW FRAC BACK, POOH W/ FS & PKR, TIH W/ MILL, CO CHACRA, MO CIBP, CO TO PBTD, TOOH, TIH W/ EXC, BROACH & LAND TBG, ND BOP, NU TREE, PUMP OFF EXC, REV UP TBG, RD RIG & EQUIP, MOL. NOTE SENT 2 7/8" FRAC STRING BACK TO TUBOSCOPE ON M&R TRUCKING.
				٠		
		·				