Form 3160-4 (August 1999)

# UNITED STATES

CIVILED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB NO. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000
Expires: November 30, 2000

	WELL	COM	PLE.	TION	OR R	ECOMPL	ETI	ON RE	PORT	AND	LOG	ZIV	/FI			se Serial No. F 079341	
la. Type	of Well   of Completion	Oil W				Dry O Work Over		Deenen	□ Pí	û∂ Bāćk	o <b>□</b> ∠	∠Diff	Restr, t		6. If Ir	idian, Allotte	e or Tribe Name
			Other						<del></del>				·		7. Uni	t or CA Agre	ement Name and no.
	of Operator	I IPS (	70						Ü	/U Εε	umir	igic	on, Ni	$A \vdash$	8. Lea	se Name and	Well Nø.
3. Addre		LII 5						Т	3.a Phon	e No. (I	nclude	area	code)	•		<u>JUAN 32 F</u>	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
		WL3	4061	HOU	STON	TX 77252				2)486-2				- 1		Well No.	
4. Locat	ion of Well (F	eport lo	cation	clearly	and in	accordance w	ith F	ederal re	equiremen	ts)4	13 D	ZZ	3			<u>5-31613</u>	
	rface SENW								\$	( 10 m		<u>_</u>	(2)				or Exploratory AND COAL
					23 1 1	· L				· .	SEP	2009		- A	1. Sec	T R M	on Block and
At top	prod. interva	I reporte	d belo	w						2 <sup>56</sup> 1 ·			)				F 22 32N 9W
At tot	al depth									Noverie :	•		ev.			inty or Parish IUAN	13. State NEW MEXICO
14. Date 5	Spudded	Date T	ched		ī	6. Date C	omplete	<u>d</u>	· 😅	A	459			RKB, RT, GL)*			
05/29	/2003			06/01	/2003			ı	□ Ď: 07/11/			eady 1	o Prod.		6871 (	GL	
	Depth: MD	3829	<del></del>		·	Plug Back T.D	.: I	MD 37		2003		Depi	h Bridge			MD	
	TVD	3829						TVD 37			1				7	TVD	
21. Type NONE		Other Me	chani	cal Logs	s Run (S	Submit copy of	eac	h)			22.		well core		_	Yes (Sub	bmit analysis)
	-												DST run		No [		mit analysis) (Submit copy)
23. Casin	g and Liner R	cord(Re	port a	ıll string	s set in	well)			<del> </del>			Dito	cuonar 5	nvey:		0 103	(Заоны сору)
Hole Size	Size/Grade	Wt (	#/ft.)	Ton	(MD)	Bottom (M	<b>D</b> )		Cementer		of Sks.			Vol.	Cem	ent Top*	Amount Pulled
12.25	9.625 H40		,,,,,,	0	(1.12)	219		De	pth	130	of Cen	nent	(BE	SL)	0		
7.875	5.5 J55	17		0		3825	$\dashv$			725					0	<del></del>	
7.07.5	0.0 .00	1								<del></del>							
		<u> </u>				-	_			ļ							
24. Tubin	g Record	.L		L		<u> </u>	1			1					L	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
Size	Depth Se	et (MD)	Pack	er Dept	h (MD)	Size		Depth S	Set (MD)	Packer	Depth	(MD)	5	Size	De	pth Set (MD)	Packer Depth (MD)
2.375	3727																
25. Produc	ing Intervals					_		26. I	Perforation	Record	l						
A) BASII	Formation N FRUITL	AND	36	<u>Top</u>		Bottom 3652	+		erforated   - 3652	nterval		.75	Size	No. 3	Holes	OPEN	Perf. Status
	N FRUITL		_	65		3502			- 3502			.75		32		OPEN	
<u>C)</u>																	
D)							•						****				
	racture, Treat Depth Interva		ement	Sqeeze,	Etc.				Δ,	mount a	nd Tur	of N	Astorial				
3614 -		· . •	F	RAC	W/25#	DELTA FI	RAC	C 140 V						1 RRI	S FLI	ПD	
3365 -						DELTA FI											
28. Produ Date First	ction - Interva	l A ours	Test	To	oil BL	Gas MCF	Wat BBI	ter	Oil Grav	ity	Ga	s	Pro	duction	Method	<del></del>	
Produced	Date 16	stea	Produc	_		- I .			Corr. AP	ľ	Gra	s avity					
	07/09/032 Tbg. Press. C	$\longrightarrow$	24 Hr.		il BL	600 Gas	12 wa		Gas : Oil		We	ell Stat		LOWI	NG		
Choice Size	Flwg.	sg. ress.	Rate	B	BL	Gas MCF	BBI	L	Ratio								
1/2	SI 0 4						L		<u></u>		Pi	ROD	UCING				
Date First	Test Ho	ours	Test	. [0	oil BL	Gas MCF	Wat	ter	Oil Grav Corr. AP	ity	Ga	s avity	Pro	ACC	EPIE Method	D FOR RE	CUKL
Produced	Date T	ested	Produc	ction B	BL	MCF	BBI	<b>L</b>	Corr. AP	1	Gra	avity				1 0 000	•
Choke Size	Tbg. Press C	sg. ress.	24 Hr. Rate	0	oil BL	Gas MCF	Wat	ter	Gas : Oil		We	ell Stat	L	1	<u> </u>	1 8 200	3
Size	Flwg.	ress.	Rate	_   B	BL	MCF	BE	BL	Ratio						Mingt	UM FIELD U	FFICE
(See Instruc	tions and space.	for addir	ional d	ata on re	verse sid	[e)			MHEIODO	17		1= 1		alA.	به حا	94	
, 2001111	ama apace,	. jur maatt	11	011 16		-,			MMOC								

	<del></del>									5				
	ction - Inter	·	T	Lou	Ta.	Turn	Tona :		10 1 2 2 2 1					
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method					
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas : Oil Ratio	Well Status						
	ction - Inter	T		Γ										
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method					
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas : Oil Ratio	Well Status	Well Status					
29. Disp		as (Sold,	used for fuel	vented, e	etc.)	<del></del>								
30. Sumn	nary of Poro	us Zones	(Include Aqu	ifers):			<del> </del>	31. Form	ation (Log) Markers					
tests,							and all drill-stem ; and shut-in pressure	es						
Formation Top Bottom					Desc	riptions, Con	tents etc		Name	Тор				
			Dottom						ranc	Meas. Depth				
	]							NACIAM	IENTO	891				
	į							OJO ALA	AMO	2171				
								KIRTLA	ND	2191				
								FRUITLA	AND	3291				
									E CLIFFS	3666				
										3000				
				·										
		<del></del>												
			plugging producing f		Basin Fri	uitland Coa	al Attached are	the daily sur	nmaries and current	wellbore schematic.				
THIS WOLL	is a sing.	o won p	. coulding .		Dusin'i I	muna co	ii. Tittuched urc	are during sur	initialities and current	wendore schematic.				
33. Circle	enclosed att	achments	:											
I. Ele	ctrical/Mech	nanical Lo	gs (1 full set	req'd.)	2. (	Geological Re	port 3. DST Re	eport 4.	Directional Survey					
5. Su	ndry Notice	for plugg	ing and ceme	ent verific	ation 6. (	Core Analysis	7. Other							
34. I hereb	y certify tha	t the fore	going and att	ached inf	ormation is	complete and	correct as determine	d from all avai	lable records (see attache	d instructions)*				
Name	(please prin	i) DEBO	ORAH MA	RBER	RY		Title_REGU	ULATORY	ANALYST					
	N	) 1	1.	<b>/</b> //	h 1.									
Signat	ure	DU	orde	- //	ujil	MX	Date <u>09/</u>	09/2003						
Title 18 U	S.C. Section	n 101 and	Title 43 U.S	.C. Section	on 1212. mal	ce it/a rime i	for any person knowi	ingly and willfu	ally to make to any denor	tment or agency of the United				
States and	false, fictiti	ous or fra	dulent staten	ents or re	presentation	s as to any m	atter within its jurisc	diction.	,	or agoney or the United				

A COLUMN TO THE SECOND

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED COM 22 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 22 # 2A FRUITLAND COM

Event Name:

Rig Name:

**Original Completion** 

Start:

05/19/2003

Spud Date: End:

Group:

05/19/2003

Contractor Name:

Rig Release:

Rig Number:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
06/20/2003	06:30 - 07:00	0.50	СМ		80CMPL	Safety meeting
	07:00 - 08:00	1.00	СМ	q	80CMPL	Perforated the lower Fruitland coal w/ 3 1/8" 120 deg select fire. perforated
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00	CM		OOCMD!	from 3614/=3652*w/4 spf. 48*holes.*
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00	СМ	S	80CMPL	Frac the lower Fruitland Coal. Tested lines to 5000 #. Set pop off @ 4380 #. pumped pre pad w/ 10 # Polymer @ 15 BPM @ 2829 #. SDRT 10
	Ì		İ	ļ		BPM @ 2717 #. SDRT 5 BPM @ 2543 #. ISIP 2310 #. 5 min 1179 #.
	İ		!			10 min 968 #. 15 min 748 #. 20 min 622 #. 25 min 527 #. 30 min 456 #.
						Pumped 1000 gals of 10% Formic acid @ 6 BPM @ 2355 #. Frac the
		}				lower Fruitland Coal w/ 25 # Delta frac 140 w/ WC SW. 75,000 # 12/20 Brady sand & 1094 bbls fluid. Avg rate 20 BPM. Avg pressure 2828 #.
						Max pressure 3891 #. Max sand cons 5 # per gal. ISIP 3126 #. Frac
						gradient 1.1. Ran three Isotopes. Ran Antimony in pad. Ran Scadium in
						1# ,2# & 3# sand. Ran Irridum in 4# & 5# sand.
	10:00 - 11:30	1.50	СМ	q	80CMPL	RIH w/ 5 1/2" composite plug. Set plug @ 3525'. Tested plug to 4800 #:
						Held ok. Perforated the Upper Fruitland Coal. RIH w/ 3 1/8" 120 degree select fire perforating gun. perforated from 3865" - 3367' w/ 2 spf, 3458' -
		ł				3461' w/ 2 spf, 3481' - 3484' w/ 2 spf, 3494' - 3502' w/ 2 spf. A total of 32
		-		ļ		holes.
	11:30 - 14:30	3.00	СМ	s	80CMPL	Frac the Upper Fruitland Coal. Tested lines to 5000 #. Set pop off @
						4360 #. Pumped pre pad w/ 10 # Polymer @ 35 BPM @ 2636 #. SDRT
	İ					30 BPM @ 2548 #. SDRT 26 BPM @ 2483 #. SDRT 21 BPM @ 2372 #. 5 min 1638 #. 10 min 1431 #. 15 min 1251 #. 20 min 1112 #. 25 min
					:	1025 #. 30 min 949 #. Pumped 1000 gal of 10% Formic acid @ 6 BPM
			1			@ 2404 #. Frac the Upper Fruitland Coal w/ 20 # Delta frac 140 w/ WC
						SW. Screaned out on 3 # sand. Pumped 45,000 # 12/20 Brady sand.
						Put 60% of frac in formation. 713 bbls fluid. Avg rate 35 BPM. Avg
		ļ				pressure 3911 #. Max pressure 4200 #. Max sand cons 3 # per gal. ISIP 4200 #. Frac gradient 1. Ran three Isotopes. Ran Antimony in pad. Ran
						Scadium in 1#, 2#, & 3#. SWI. RD Halliburton.
07/04/2003	07:00 - 07:15	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	HELD DAILY SAFETY MTG, DISCUSSED JSA (RU, NU. PT BOPE, PU
	07.45 00.45	4.00		_	0001451	TBG)
	07:15 - 08:15	1.00	MV	n	80CMPL	ROAD RIG TO NEW DRILL FRUITLAND COAL LOCATION. P-BH = 0#, P-CSG = 300#.
	08:15 - 09:45	1.50	RM	m	80CMPL	CHANGE OUT RIG'S KELLY HOSE.
	09:45 - 11:00	1.25	MV	6	80CMPL	RU KEY RIG #63 & AUXILLIARY RIG EQUIPMENT (PUMP, BOPE, RIG
		}	İ		į	PIT & TANK, PIPE BASKET)
	11:00 - 11:30	0.50	СМ	6	80CMPL	NU FLOW-BACK LINE FROM TUBING HEAD TO RESERVE PIT &
						BLED PRESSURE TO PIT, RECOVERING UNBROKEN GEL IN SLUGS.
	11:30 - 11:45	0.25	СМ	е	80CMPL	LAND TBG HANGER W/ BULL-PLUG IN TBG HEAD & RUN-IN
						LOCK-DOWN PINS.
	11:45 - 12:00	0.25	1	е	80CMPL	ND TWO 6" FRAC VALVES.
	12:00 - 12:45	0.75		6	80CMPL	CHANGE OUT BOP & KILL SPOOL. NU SAME.
	12:45 - 13:15 13:15 - 14:00	0.50 0.75		e g	80CMPL 80CMPL	NU MUD CROSS & STRIPPING RUBBER. PT BLIND RAMS TO 200# FOR 3-MINS & 2500# FOR 10-MINS, HELD
	13.15 - 14.00	0.75	J.W.	ا ا	COUNTE	OK. PU 2-3/8" TBG SUB & PT 2-3/8" PIPE RAMS TO 200# FOR
		1				3-MINS & 2500# FOR 10-MINS, HELD OK.
	14:00 - 15:15	1.25		6	80CMPL	RU 6" BLOOIE LINE & MUFFLER.
	15:15 - 15:30	0.25		6	80CMPL	RU RIG FLOOR.
	15:30 - 15:45 15:45 - 16:30	0.25 0.75		e 4	80CMPL 80CMPL	BACK-OUT LOCK-DOWN PINS & PULL TBG HANGER. MU 4-3/4" BIT & BIT-SUB W/ STRING FLOAT & TIH PICKING UP
	10.00	0.75	J.W		COONIFE	32-JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 EUE 8RD NEW TBG TO 1005", INCOMPLETE.
	16:30 - 16:45	0.25	СМ	е	80CMPL	INSTALL TIW VAVLE, CLOSE/LOCK PIPE RAMS.
	•			1	1	

#### ConocoPhillips

## **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED COM 22 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 22 # 2A FRUITLAND COM

Spud Date:

**Event Name:** 

**Original Completion** 

05/19/2003

End:

05/19/2003

Contractor Name:

Start: Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name:

Rig Number:

Date	From -: T	Hours	Code	Subcc	Phase	Description of Operations
07/04/2003	16:45 - 17:0	0.25	СМ	С	80CMPL	SECURE LOCATION & SWI FOR HOLIDAY WEEKEND.
07/08/2003	07:00 - 07:3		СМ	c	80CMPL	HELD SAFETY MEETING W/ CREW. SICP 300#
	07:30 - 09:0		СМ	2	80CMPL	BLOW WELL TO PIT. FINISH PU 2 3/8" TBG. TAG SAND @ 2588'.
						BROKE CRIC. W/ AIR MIST
	09:00 - 14:0	5.00	CM	1	80CMPL	C/O TO 3525' R AND R PIPE FOR 3 HRS. WELL APPEARS TO BE
	ĺ	1				CLEANED UP.
	14:00 - 14:1		CM	4	80CMPL	PUH TO 3300' TESTED UPPER FC. THUR 1/2" CHOKE
	14:15 - 14:3		СМ	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG 80#
	14:30 - 15:0		СМ	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI #0 CSG 50#
	15:00 - 15:3		CM	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI #0 CSG 30#
	15:30 - 16:0		CM	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG 20#
	16:00 - 16:3		CM	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG 20#
	16:30 - 17:0		CM	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG 20#
07/00/2002	17:00 - 17:3		CM	u	80CMPL	SWI SDFN.
07/09/2003	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:30		CM CM	С 4	80CMPL	HELD SAFETY MEETING W/ CREW. SICP 350#
	07.30 - 06.3	, 1.00	CIVI	4	80CMPL	BLOW WELL TO PIT. RIH W/ 3 STANDS TBG. TAGGED @ 3525'
					1	(CBP). NO FILL OVERNIGHT. BROKE CRIC W/ AIR MIST. UNLOADED APPROX. 30 BBLS FLUID. TO PIT.
	08:30 - 09:0	0.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	D/O CBP SET @ 3525'B.
	09:00 - 09:30	I	CM	1	80CMPL	PU AND RIH W/ 4 JT 2 3/8" TBG. TAGGED SAND @ 3642'. BROKE
	00.00	0.50	J 5,,,,	1	000 2	CRIC W/ AIR MIST.
	09:30 - 12:0	2.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	C/O SAND TO 3778' R AND R PIPE FOR 2.5 HRS. WELL SEEMS TO
						BE CLEANED UP. CUT MIST. TO ACHIEVE WTR TEST. WTR RATE
						APPROX. 9.5 BPH.
	12:00 - 13:4	5 1.75	CM	1	80CMPL	CONT' TO DRY UP HOLE. WELL STILL RETURNING APPROX. 5.5
				}		BPH.
	13:45 - 14:00	0.25	СМ	4	80CMPL	PUH TO 3300' TEST FC PERFS FROM 3652' TO 3365' THUR 1/2" CHOKE.
	14:00 - 14:30		CM	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG PSI 100#
	14:30 - 15:0		СМ	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG PSI 95#
	15:00 - 15:30	0.50	СМ	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG PSI 70#
	15:30 - 16:00		СМ	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG PSI 60#
	16:00 - 16:30	1	CM	ս	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG PSI 50#
	16:30 - 17:00		СМ	u	80CMPL	TBG. PSI 0# CSG PSI 45#
	17:00 - 17:30		CM	u		TBG: PSI 0# CSG PSI 45#
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	СМ	u	80CMPL	SWI SDFN: FINAL TEST AS FOLLOWS. 600 MCF/D GAS, 120 BW/D
07/40/2002	07:00 07:24		CN4		0001101	AND NO OIL.
07/10/2003	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 08:30		CM CM	С 4	80CMPL	HELD SAFETY MEETING W/ CREW. SICP 900#.
	08:30 - 09:30		CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	BLOW WELL TO PIT THUR 1/2" CHOKE, BROKE CRIC, W/ AIR.
	00.30 - 09.30	, 1.00	CIVI	1	BOCIVIPE	UNLOADED APPROX. 5 BBLS FLUID TO PIT. CONT' CRIC. HOLE W/
				ł	i	AIR NO MIST. WELL RETURNING APPROX. 12 BBLS WTR PER HR. AND NO SAND.
	09:30 - 10:30	1 100	СМ	4	80CMPL	TOOH W/ 119 JT 2 3/8" TBG AND 4 3/4" BIT.
	10:30 - 11:00		wo	r	80CMPL	WO PROTECH-NICS TO ARRIVE TO LOC.
1	11:00 - 12:00		CM	z	80CMPL	RU PROTECHNICS AND H AND H SLICKLINE
	12:00 - 13:30	1	CM	z	80CMPL	PU AND RIH W/ TRACER LOGGING TOOLS, LOG FC PERFS FROM
				-		3652' TO 3365'
	13:30 - 15:30	2.00	СМ	4	80CMPL	RD H AND H SLICKLINE AND PROTECHNICS. PU AND RIH W/ HF
						PURGE VALVE, 1 JT 2 3/8" TBG, 6' PERFORATED SUB, 1.78"
					4:2	E-NIPPLE, AND 118 JTS 2 3/8" TBG, LAND TBG, F-NIPPLE @ 3690.55
					15,800	EOT @ 3727 18' ND BOP'S. NU PUMPING TEE.
	15:30 - 16:30	1.00	СМ	z		PREP LOC. TO RUN RODS. RD BOOLEY LINE.
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	SWI SDFN
	L	1	ı	1	1	<u> </u>

#### ConocoPhillips

Page 3 of 3

# **Operations Summary Report**

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED COM 22 #2 000002A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32 FED 22 # 2A FRUITLAND COM

Event Name: **Original Completion** 

05/19/2003 Start:

Spud Date:

End: Group: 05/19/2003

Contractor Name:

Rig Name:

Rig Release:

Rig Number:

rig ivallie.						rig rumber.
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
07/11/2003	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 11:00 11:00 - 13:00	0.50 3.50 2.00	СМ	c 2	80CMPL 80CMPL	HELD SAFETY MEETING W/ CREW. SITP 610# SICP 920# BLOW TBG TO PIT. PU AND RIH W/ 2" X 1 1/4" X 8' RHAC INSERT PUMP W/ 1' STRIANER. MAX STROKE 83". PUMP # CP 015, 4' X 3/4" PONY ROD. 147 3/4" SUCKER ROD 1 - 4' X 3/4" PONY ROD AND 22' CENTER SPRAYED ??? METAL POLISH ROD. SEATED AND SPACED OUT PUMP. LOADED HOLE AND PSI TEST TBG TO 500#. HELD OK. BLED OFF PSI. LONG STROKE PUMP. PSI UP TO 500# IN 12 STROKES. HELD OK. BLED DOWN PSI. PU LOC. RDMO FINAL REPORT

#### END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

ConocoPhillips

ConocoPhillips

Well Name:	SAN JUAN 32 FED 22 #2A	Spud Date:	29-May-03	TD C	Date :	1-Jun-03
API # :	30-045-31613	Spud Time:	0200 HRS	Rig Release D	Date:	3-Jun-03
Surface Casing Size Set at Wt. Hole Size Wash Out Est. T.O.C.	Date set: 05/29/03  9 5/8 in  219 ft # Jnts: 7  32.3 ppf Grade H-40  12 1/4 in  100 %	11" 3M x 7 9-5/8" 8 RD X New Used	<del></del>	Spool Head  SurfaceCement Date cmt'd: Lead: 130 sx Class G Ne 1/4 pps D029 mixed @ 1 cuft/sx. Displacement vol. & fluid.: Bumped Plug at: Pressure Plug bumped: Returns during job: CMT Returns to surface:	5/29/2 eat w/2% S 15.8 ppg & 15.3 1418 200 Y 8 B Yes	2003 001 and 1.16 BBLS 3 HRS 0 PSI ES BLS.
Production Casin Size Wt.	5 1/2 in	X New Used 12 to 3825 ff				
Hole Size Wash Out:	7 7/8 in # Jnts: _ {	36 2	1 1	<del></del>	6/2/2003	-
wasii Out.		<u> </u>		Lead: 540 sx Class G C		
				0.2% D046, 5 pps		
Fet TOC	SURFACE			0.25 pps D029. Mi	xea @ 11.	ppg
Marker Jnt @	<del></del>			and 2.61 cuft/sx	/5.0	5004
Marker Jnt @				Tail: _185 sx 50/50/G/Pc		
Ported Collar @				2.5 pps Phenoseal		<del></del>
i orice conar @				2% S001, 0.25 pps		
Notif	fied BLM @ 1423 hrs			D046. Mixed @ 13		
14001	on 6/1/2003	FC 3778 ft		Displacement vol. & fluid.:		
Notified	NMOCD @ 1420 hrs	10 3770 1		Bumped Plug at:		HOURS
110411104		Shoe <u>3825</u> ft		Pressure Plug bumped:		0 PSI
	<u> </u>	3023 II		Returns during job: _ CMT Returns to surface: _		
		Tr	3,829 ft			
Mud	Wt. @ TD <u>9.1</u> ppg		- <u>- 3,023</u> It	Floats Held: _	<u>^</u> res _	_NO
COMMENTS:		- <del></del>	<del></del>			·
Surface:	NO FLOAT EQUIPMENT RAN. SHUT-IN	WITH 85 PSI O	N CASING.			
Production:	OPENHOLE LOGS WERE RUN. BAKEF	R PORTED COLL	AR SHOP TESTE	ED W/2500 POUNDS.		
CENTRALIZERS:	<del></del>				·	
Surface:	CENTRALZERS @ 209', 160', 102' & 43				Total:	4
Production:	CENTRALZERS @ 3815', 3734', 3645',	3557', 34 <mark>69', 3</mark> 38	1' & 215'			
	TURBOLIZERS @ 2201', 2157' & 2113'			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Total:	10