UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED OMB NO. 1004-0137 Expires: November 30, 2000

	WEL	L COM	IPLE	TION	OR R	ECOMPL	ETI	ON F	REPOR	T A	AND L	OG.		7日1			se Serial No 079353).		
1a. Type o	of Well E	Oil W				Dry (Work Over	Other	Deepe	en 🗆	Plu	g Back	— Д,	Diff.	Resvr,.		6. If Ir	idian, Allot			
			Other									Ald s)C.F	L7 1 	(i) 7·	7: Uni	t or CA Agr	reement	Name and	d no.
	of Operator								•		0	70	Fari	ningt	an K		NNM 7			
CON 3. Addre	OCOPHI	LLIPS	co.						2 - DL		No. (In				1		TUAN 32)Δ
•• ••		7 WI 3	4061	HOU	STON	TX 7725	2 .		1)486-2:		area	coae)			Well No.	<u> </u>	<u> </u>	<i>//</i> 1
						accordance v		ederal									5-31661	<u> </u>	·	
		-		_							-,						d and Pool,	_	-	
At Su	rface SWSI	3 8201	FSL &	2 1620	r fel												<u>N FRUIT</u> ., T., R., M.			
At top	prod. interv	al reporte	ed belov	W												Sur	vey or Area	O 28 3	2N 8W	
At tota	al depth								· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·								inty or Paris IUAN		3. State IEW M	EXICO
14. Date 5	pudded		15.	Date T	D. Rea	ched					mpleted				1	7. Ele	vations (DI			
07/09	/2003			07/13	/2003			Į			&À [∑ 2003	N K	eady to	o Prod.		6763 (GL			
18. Total	Depth: MIC				19.1	Plug Back T.I			734			20.	Dept	h Bridge	Plug Se		/ID			
		D 3743		! [. D (S	Submit copy o		VD 3	734			22.			177		TVD		·	
NONE	or electric &	Other M	iecnam	cat rog	s Run (3	опони сору с	n cac	u)				44.	Was	well cor DST rur ctional S		No E		bmit ana	llysis)	
23. Casing	g and Liner I	Record(R	eport a	ll strinj	zs set in	well)												- (0-0112	- usp _{1/}	
Hole Size	Size/Grad	e Wt.	(#/ft.)	Тор	(MD)	Bottom (N	(D)		e Cemente Depth	ar	No. of Type o				y Vol. BL)	Cem	ent Top*	Ап	ount Pull	ed
12.25	9.625 H			0		233				\Box	155 C					0				
8.75	7 J55	20		0		3458				_	540 C	LG				0				
6.25	5.5 J55	15.5)	3379		3735				\dashv	0					NA				
		+				 				\dashv			\dashv							
									**											
24. Tubin		D. (14D)	In C		L (2/12)	C:		D4	L C O. (1		D. 1		(1 dT)	T	~ :	1-2				
Size		Set (MD)	Pack	er Depi	h (MD)	Size		рери	h Set (MI	"	Packer L	epun	(MID)		Size	1 De	pth Set (MI)) Pac	ker Deptl	n (MD)
2.375 25. Produc	3689 ing Intervals		<u> </u>			<u> </u>		26	Perforat	ion	Record			Щ.						
	Formation			Tor		Bottom	\exists		Perforate	d In				Size	No.	Holes	T	Perf. S	atus	
A)BASII	Y FRUITI	AND	34	71		3675		347	1 - 3675	5			.75		172		OPEN			
<u>B)</u>															-					
<u>C)</u>															 		ļ	 -		
D) 27. Acid. I	racture, Tre	atment. C	Cement	Saeeze	Etc.								L				L			
	Depth Interv									Απ	nount an	d Typ	e of N	laterial						
3471 -	3675			AVIT	ATE								·							
																				
Date First	ction - Inter	val A Hours	Test	10	Dil .	Gas MCF	Wai BBI	er	Oil G	ravit	v	Ga	s	Pr	oduction	Method				
Produced	Date 1	l'ested	Produc	ction I	BBL			-	Corr.	API		Gra	avity	- 1						
U9/11/U3 Choice	08/21/03/ Tbg. Press.	Csg.	24 Hr.) Dil	2039 Gas	0 w	iter	Gas:	Oil		We	Il Statu		LOWI	NG				
Size	Flwg.	Press. 420	Rate	→	ŠBL	Gas MCF	BBi	-	Ratio					 UCINO	3	ACCE	PTED FO	OR RE	CORL	
	ction - Inter																			
Date First Produced	Test Date	lours Tested	Test Produc	ction	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Wat BBI		Oil G Corr.	ravit API	У	Ga Gr	s avity	Pı	oduction		OCT n 1		í	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press Flwg.	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	1	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Wat BE		Gas : Ratio	Oil		We	ll Statu	ıs	1	FARA RY_	UNGTON F	IELD ()	FFICE	
(See Instru	SI tions and space	es for add	itional d	ata on r	everse sid	le)	<u> </u>			N	IMO		·····							

							· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			*
	ction - Inter		T	Lon	Ta	Tav	loza :	1-		
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Con: API	Gas Gravity	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas : Oil Ratio	Well Status		
	ction - Inter									
Date First Produced	Test Date	Hours Tested	Test Production	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Oil Gravity Corr. API	Gas Gravity	Production Method	
Choke Size	Tbg. Press. Flwg. SI	Csg. Press.	24 Hr. Rate	Oil BBL	Gas MCF	Water BBL	Gas : Oil Ratio	Well Status		-1 .
29. Disp		as (Sold,	used for fuel	vented, et	c.)			1		
30. Sumn	nary of Poro	us Zones	(Include Aqu	uifers):				31 Form	ation (Log) Markers	
Show tests,	all importar	nt zones o	r porsity and	contents ti			nd all drill-stem and shut-in pressures		aton (Eog) Makes	
Forms	ntion	Тор	Bottom		Descr	iptions, Cont	ents, etc.		Name	Top Meas. Depth
								NACIAM	MENTO	901
	ļ			ł				OJO ALA	AMO .	2376
				İ				KIRTLA	ND	2436
	1		·					FRUITL		3241
1 1 1 1									E CLIFFS	3696
	t							FICTOR	e CLIFFS	3090
			1					j		
	ł		i							
	1									
	-] .		
32. Additio	onal remarks	s (include	plugging pro	cedure):						
					d Coal. A	attached is	a current wellbore	e schemati	c and daily summaries	
		•								<u> </u>
					. ~					
33. Circle	enclosed atta	achments:							44	
			gs (1 full set ng and ceme			eological Rep ore Analysis	oort 3. DST Report. 7. Other	ort 4.	Directional Survey	
34. I hereb	y certify tha	t the foreg	going and att	ached info	rmation is co	omplete and	correct as determined	from all avai	lable records (see attached instr	uctions)*
Name (please frin) DEBO	ORAH MA	ARBERR	Y		Title <u>REGUI</u>	<u>LATO</u> RY	ANALYST	
	$\nu()$	1	, D.	m.	a lin	11	-			
Signatu	ILO A		-	# 110	mul	ry)	Date09/22	2/2003		
Title 18 U. States and	S.C. Section false, fictition	101 and ous or frac	Title 43 U.S lulent staten	.C. Section ents or rep	1212, make resentations	e it a crime for as to any ma	or any person knowing	gly and willfu	illy to make to any department	or agency of the United
					- = = =		<u> </u>			

god na om de e en Notado homa a en

Operations Summary Report

Contractor Name:

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #230A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

06/11/2003

Spud Date: 07/09/2003

Rig Release:

End:

Group:

Rig Name:	Name.					Rig Number:
rag rame.	₽ KUTYKA GMARBARANSA	I twissospik Gistosk	Paga (100 30 600)	1 02/02/02/03	resobre receives	
Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/10/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	м∨	С	70DMOB	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 09:00	1.50	MV	1	70DMOB	LOAD OUT EQUIPMENT ON FLOAT'S
	09:00 - 16:30	7.50	MV	n	00MMIR	MIRU KEY RIG # 18 & EQUIPMENT
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	MV	1	00MMIR	SECURED LOCATION & S.D.O.N.
08/11/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	ΜV	С	00MMIR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 14:30	7.00	M∨	6	00MMIR	NU & RU BOP'S, HCR VALVE'S, BLOOIE LINE'S, CHOKE MANIFOLD & LINE'S, ALL GROUND LINE'S
	14:30 - 15:15	0.75	СМ	9	50PRDR	TEST 7" CSG & BLIND RAM'S 200# 3 MIN'S & 750# 30 MIN'S FOR STATE INTEGRITY TEST = CHARTED GOOD TEST
	15:15 - 17:00	1.75	СМ	8	50PRDR	TEST STACK, PIPE RAMS', HCR VALVE'S, CHOKE MANIFOLD = 200# 3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
08/12/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	c	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 14:00	6.50	СМ	6	50PRDR	RU RIG FLOOR & EQUIPMENT, WELD CIRCLE GROUND SYSTEM
	44.00 40.00				SARRER	ON ALL EQUIPMENT
	14:00 - 16:00	2.00		C	50PRDR	RIG & EQUIPMENT INSPECTION BY COPC SAFETY REP.
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00	СМ	2	50PRDR	PU PIPE OUT OF PIPE BASKET & PUT ON PIPE RACK = TALLY PIPE
	17:00 - 18:30	1.50	СМ	2	50PRDR	GIH PU 6 1/4" BIT EHP 51H SR C/3035, BIT SUB, 12-3 1/2" DC'S, 1-2 7/8" DP, 1.81 FN & DP
	10.20 10.00	0.50	CNA	1	50PRDR	i '
08/13/2003	18:30 - 19:00 07:00 - 07:30	1	CM	1	50PRDR	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N. SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
06/13/2003			CM	6	50PRDR	PU & RU POWER SWIVEL
	07:30 - 08:30		CM	5	50PRDR	
	08:30 - 10:00			1		UNLOAD HOLE W / AIR ASSIST
	10:00 - 11:30	L .	CM	h	50PRDR	DRILL OUT CMT, 7" F.C. @ 3411', 7" SHOE @ 3458' TO 7" TD @ 3461'
	11:30 - 12:00		CM	5	50PRDR	CIRC BOTTOM'S UP & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGERS
	12:00 - 19:00	1	CM	1	50PRDR	DRILLING COAL INTERVAL W / 6 1/4" BIT T/3645'
	19:00 - 19:30	1	СМ	C	50PRDR	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 22:00	!	CM	1	50PRDR	DRILLING COAL INTERVAL T/3743' TD W / AIR ASSIST
	22:00 - 22:30	0.50	CM	5	50PRDR	CIRC & CORRELATE W / MUD LOGGERS = COAL INTERVAL AS FOLLOWS
						3464'-65' = 1 FT = 25 GAS UNITS
						3467'-68' = 1 FT = 50 TO 140 GAS UNITS
		-				3471'-80' = 9 FT = 464 GAS UNITS
		1				3481'-83' = 2 FT = 385 GAS UNITS
		,				3488'-94' = 6 FT = 330 GAS UNITS
						3545'-57' = 12 FT = 340 GAS UNITS
						3558'-63' = 5 FT = 340 GAS UNITS
	1	İ				3593'-95' = 2 FT = 340 GAS UNITS
			1			3604'-05' = 1 FT = 340 GAS UNITS
						3659'-61' = 2 FT = 370 GAS UNITS
1						3662'-66' = 4 FT = 370 GAS UNITS
	}					3671'-74' = 3 FT = 378 GAS UNITS
						TOTAL NET COAL 48 FT = RAT HOLE 69 FT
	22:30 - 22:45	0.25	СМ	2	80CMPL	LAID DOWN 2 JT'S OF DP TO GET OUT OF RAT HOLE
	22:45 - 06:00	1	CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER
	22.43 - 00.00	7.23	Civi		BOCIVIFE	& INHIBITOR = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL &
	,		ŀ			FINES W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1 BUCKETS PER HOUR
00/14/2002	06:00 07:00	4.00	CM	4	OUCK4D!	OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
08/14/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W /
	1					NO WATER GAIN = 1 TO 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE
1	1	1		1		CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
1						
			L		l	

Page 2 of 8

ConocoPhillips

Operations Summary Report

Contractor Name:

Rig Name:

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #230A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

Spud Date: 07/09/2003

End: 06/11/2003 Group:

08/14/2003 07:00 - 07:20 0.50 CM 0.50 CM 4 80CMPL	Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08:30 - 08:30 0.50 CM 4 80CMPL PUH INSIDE 7* CSG W / BHA 08:30 - 09:30 1.00 CM U 80CMPL COPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE = 15 MIN'S-425 MCFD = 30 MIN'S-475 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-500 MCFD = 1 HIR-500 MCFD MIN'S-475 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-500 MCFD = 1 HIR-500 MCFD MIN'S-475 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-500 MCFD = 1 HIR-500 MCFD MIN'S-475 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-500 MCFD = 1 HIR-500 MCFD MIN'S-358# = 1 HIR-400# 08/14/2003	1				1	R&R C/O T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE	
08:30 - 09:30		08:00 - 08:30	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPI	
09:30 - 10:30		T .	1		1		2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE = 15 MIN'S-425 MCFD = 30
MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S = BREAKOVER POINT @ 1075# BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S = BREAKOVER POINT @ 1075# BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BREAKOVER POINT @ 1075# BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER POAMER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER POAMER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER POAMER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER POAMER PADS = RETURNS TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE BBL WATER POAMER BBL WATER POAMER BBL WATER POAMER BBL WATER POAMER BBL WATER POAMER BB			İ				MIN'S-335# = 1 HR-400#
19:00 - 19:30							MMCFD AIR, 10 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 BBL WATER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S = BREAKOVER POINT @ 1075#
19:30 - 06:00			1		1 '	1	
8 NHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVT TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & S% SHALE		1		ł	1		
08/15/2003 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CM		19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	& INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S PER
07:30 - 12:30	08/15/2003	06:00 - 07:00			1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3559' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 1 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
12:30 - 13:00		07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	
13:00 - 19:00					1	80CMPL	& INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S					1	1	
19:30 - 20:00					С		MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
20:00 - 06:00		l .	1	ì			
8 NHIBITOR RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL & 5% SHALE R&R C/O T/3590' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL & 5% SHALE CATCHER 95% COAL & 5% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3682 W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN 7 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL & 5% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA SURGE # 9 @ 500# NATURAL FORMATION GAS PRESSURE RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN 5 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL & 5% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA SURGE # 9 @ 500# NATURAL FORMATION GAS PRESSURE RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN 5 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL & 5% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA SURGE # 9 @ 500# NATURAL FORMATION GAS PRESSURE RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN 5 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER 95% COAL & 5% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA SURGE # 9 @ 500# NATURAL FORMATION GAS PRESSURE RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S			1		1		
08/16/2003 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CM 1 80CMPL R&R C/O T/3590' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3682 W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 7 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA SURGE # 9 @ 500# NATURAL FORMATION GAS PRESSURE = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S		20:00 - 06:00	10.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	& INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE
07:00 - 07:30	08/16/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3590' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE
07:30 - 16:00		07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
16:30 - 16:30		07:30 - 16:00	8.50	СМ			R&R C/O T/3682 W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 7 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER
RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S					1		
19:00 - 19:30 0.50 CM C 80CMPL SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION							RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S
		19:00 - 19:30	0.50	CM	C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #230A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

06/11/2003

Spud Date: 07/09/2003

End: Group:

Contractor Name:

Rig Name:

Date	From + To	Hours	Code	Subce	Phase	Description of Operations
08/16/2003	19:30 - 21:30	2.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE # 10 @ 500# NATURAL FORMATION GAS PRESSURE = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S
	21:30 - 01:30	4.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 11 - # 12 - # 13 @ 1100# TO 1200# W / BREAKOVER POINT @ 1050# = W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
	01:30 - 02:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3475'
	02:00 - 06:00		CM	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3497' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
08/17/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3497' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3559' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / NO WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
08/18/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 1 GAL FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 1 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & BLOW WELL DRY FOR TEST @ 3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 1 BPH WATER GAIN = 1/2 BUCKET PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
-	08:00 - 08:30		CM	4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA
	08:30 - 09:30		СМ	u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE = 15 MIN'S-1000 MCFD = 30 MIN'S-1100 MCFD = 45 MIN'S-1200 MCFD = 1 HR-1200 MCFD
	09:30 - 10:30		СМ	t	80CMPL	SHUT IN TEST = ISIP-45# = 15 MIN'S-200# = 30 MIN'S-280# = 45 MIN'S-360# = 1 HR-400#
	10:30 - 16:30		СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 14 - # 15 - # 16 - # 17 @ 1100# TO 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S ≈ RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S
	16:30 - 17:00 17:00 - 19:00		CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3480' R&R C/O T/3497' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / 10 BPH WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5%
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	1	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3622' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL & FINE'S W / 12 TO 14 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 4
L						

Page 4 of 8

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #230A UNIT

Spud Date: 07/09/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start: 06/11/2003 End:

Contractor Name:

Rig Release: Rig Number:

Group:

-:-	A1	
≺lQ:	Name:	

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subcc	Phase	Description of Operations
08/18/2003	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & FINE'S W / 5% SHALE
08/19/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3622' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 10 BPH WATER GAIN = 1.5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & FINE'S W / 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 15:00		CM CM	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O F/3622'-T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 7 BPH WATER GAIN = 6 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & FINE'S W / 5% SHALE
	15:00 - 15:30 15:30 - 19:00		CM CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA SURGE'S # 18 - # 19 - # 20 @ 1150# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 TO 7 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 22:00	0.50 2.50		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION SURGE'S # 21- # 22 @ 1150# TO 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 TO 7 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE
	22:00 - 22:30 22:30 - 06:00	0.50 7.50		1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3475' R&R C/O F/3475'-T/3559' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 5 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & FINE'S W / 5% SHALE
08/20/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3559' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL& FINE'S W / 4 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & FINE'S W / 5% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 10:00	0.50 2.50		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3559' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S W / 3 TO 4 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE
	10:00 - 10:30 10:30 - 19:00	0.50 8.50		c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	BOP DRILL W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O F/3559'-T/3622' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 3 BPH WATER GAIN = 10 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & FINE'S W / 5% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	0.50 10.50		с 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	R&R C/O F/3622'-T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 2 TO 3 BPH WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & FINE'S W / 5% SHALE
08/21/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL & FINE'S W / 2 BPH WATER GAIN - 4 DOWN TO 2 BUCKET'S PER

Operations Summary Report

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #230A UNIT

Event Name:

Rig Name:

Original Completion

Start:

06/11/2003

Spud Date: 07/09/2003

End: Group:

Contractor Name:

Rig Release:

Rig Number:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/21/2003	06:00 - 07:00 07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 11:30	1.00 0.50 4.00	СМ	1 c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL 80CMPL	HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 95% COAL & 5% SHALE SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50	СМ	4	80CMPL	COAL & FINE'S W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 3 DOWN TO 1/2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 98% COAL & 2% SHALE PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA
	12:00 - 13:00	1.00	1	u	80CMPL	2" OPEN FLOW TEST WIPPTOT TUBE 15 MIN'S = 35# MANIFOLD PRESSURE = 10# PITOT = 1948 MCFD = DRY 30 MIN'S = 38# MANIFOLD PRESSURE = 11# PITOT = 2039 MCFD
						= WET 45 MIN'S = 38# MANIFOLD PRESSURE = 11# PITOT = 2039 MCFD = WET 1 HR = 38# MANIFOLD PRESSURE = 11# PITOT = 2039 MCFD
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	СМ	t	80CMPL	= WET SHUT IN TEST ISIP = 48#
						30 MIN'S = 300# 45 MIN'S = 385#
	14:00 - 19:00	5.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	SURGE'S # 23 & # 24 @ 450# NATURAL FORMATION GAS PRESSURE = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT COAL & FINE'S
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 22:30	0.50 3.00	CM CM	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION SURGE'S # 25 - # 26 @ 1100# TO 1200# AIR ASSIST W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR W / 5 TO 7 BBL WATER-FOAMER PAD'S = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, LIGHT TO MED COAL & FINE'S = WELLBORE BRIDGED OFF W / COAL
	22:30 - 23:00 23:00 - 06:00	1	CM CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RIH FROM 7" CSG & TAG FILL @ 3468' R&R C/O F/3468'-T/3497' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INTERPRETATION = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED
						COAL & FINE'S W / 1 TO 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 12 DOWN TO 5 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 98% COAL & 2% SHALE
08/22/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3497' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO HEAVY COAL, FINE'S & SHALE, 4 UP TO 7 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% TO 90% COAL & FINE'S W / 10% TO 15% SHALE = 1 TO 2 BPH WATER GAIN
	07:00 - 07:30 07:30 - 19:00	0.50 11.50	CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3497' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 TO 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE = 7 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & FINE'S W / 15% SHALE = 1/2 TO 2 BPH WATER GAIN
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 06:00	i	CM CM	c 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O T/3497' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL, FINE'S & SHALE = 5 DOWN TO 2 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & FINE'S W / 15% SHALE = 1 TO 2 BPH WATER GAIN

Printed: 09/10/2003 8:35:53 AM

Page 6 of 8

Operations Summary Report

SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #230A UNIT

06/11/2003

Spud Date: 07/09/2003

Event Name:

Original Completion

End:

Group:

Contractor Name: Rig Name:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/23/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3497' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 2 UP TO 9 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & FINE'S W / 15% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	c	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O T/3497 W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 2 GAL'S FOAMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, HEAVY TO MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 2 BPH WATER GAIN = 9 DOWN TO 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & FINE'S W / 15% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	19:30 - 06:00	10.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3559' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 4 GAL'S FOAMER, 2 TO 3 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 TO 6 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE
08/24/2003	06:00 - 07:00	1.00	СМ	1	80CMPL	CATCHER = 85% COAL & FINE'S W / 15% SHALE R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3559' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 12 BPH MIST, 4 GAL'S FOAMER, 4 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 1 BPH WATERG GAIN = 4 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE = 85% COAL & FINE'S W / 15% SHALE
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 19:00	11.50	СМ	1	80CMPL	R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3682' W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 6 GAL'S FOAMER, 6 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 5 DOWN TO 3 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & FINE'S W / 15% SHALE
	19:00 - 19:30 19:30 - 03:00	0.50 7.50	-	C 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION R&R C/O & CONDITION HOLE T/3743' TD W / 1.5 MMCFD AIR, 14 BPH MIST, 6 GAL'S FOAMER, 6 GAL'S POLYMER & INHIBITOR = RETURN'S TO SURFACE, MED TO LIGHT COAL, FINE'S & SHALE W / 1.5 BPH WATER GAIN = 4 DOWN TO 1 BUCKET'S PER HOUR OFF SAMPLE CATCHER = 85% COAL & FINE'S W / 15% SHALE
	03:00 - 03:30	0.50		4	80CMPL	PUH INSIDE 7" CSG W / BHA
	03:30 - 03:45 03:45 - 04:00	0.25 0.25		6	80CMPL 80CMPL	HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
08/25/2003	06:00 - 06:30	0.25		6	80CMPL	COOH W / DP, DC'S & BHA RU 5 1/2" EQUIPMENT
00/20/2000	06:30 - 07:00	0.50		u	80CMPL	FINAL WELL FLOW GAGE ON 2" OPEN FLOW TEST W / PITOT TUBE 3000 MCFD
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50		С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
:	07:30 - 08:30	1.00		6	80CMPL	RU 5 1/2" RAM'S & EQUIPMENT
	08:30 - 09:00 09:00 - 10:30	0.50 1.50	CM	8	80CMPL 80CMPL	TEST 5 1/2" RAM'S TO 525# WELLBORE PRESSURE = GOOD TEST PU & MU 6 1/4" BIT, BIT SUB, 8 JT'S STL FLUSH JT CSG, X/O & HANGER
	10:30 - 11:30	1.00		4	80CMPL	GIH W / BHA & DP TO 3682'
	11:30 - 11:45 11:45 - 12:15	0.25 0.50		6 1	80CMPL 80CMPL	RU POWER SWIVEL WORKING LINER DOWN TO 3735' = DP PRESSURED UP TO 950# = SHUT DOWN AIR ASSIST
	12:15 - 15:00	2.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	SET 5 1/2" LINER AS FOLLOW'S 6 1/4" BIT SET @ 3735' 5 1/2" BIT SUB SET @ 3734'

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #230A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Start:

Spud Date: 07/09/2003

End: 06/11/2003 Group:

Contractor Name:

Rig Name:

Date	From - Ta	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/25/2003	12:15 - 15:00	2.75	СМ	1	80CMPL	8 JT'S 5 1/2" J-55 15.50# STL FJ CSG SET @ 3733'
						1 JT 3 FT X/O = STL X LT&C SET @ 3386'
			1		İ	7" X 5 1/2" BAKER SLPR HYDRA HANGER W/ STEEL SLEEVE @
		1				3383'
						TOP OF HANGER SET @ 3379'
		İ				OVERLAP OF 7" CSG SHOE = 79 FT
						ATTENTION = HAD TROUBLE RELEASING OFF HANGER = USED
						BALL TO SET HANGER, USED 1ST DART TO PRESSURE, USED
	15:00 15:30	0.50	СМ		DOCKAD!	2ND DART TO GET OFF HANGER
	15:00 - 15:30 15:30 - 16:00		CM	1	80CMPL 80CMPL	PUH W / DP TO CLEAR TOP OF HANGER
08/26/2003	07:00 - 07:30	t	CM	c	80CMPL	SECURED WELL & S.D.O.N. SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
00/20/2003	07:30 - 08:00		CM	g	80CMPL	BLOW DOWN WELL = HAD 520# ON CSG
	08:00 - 08:15	1	CM	6	80CMPL	RD POWER SWIVEL
	08:15 - 11:00	1	СМ	2	80CMPL	COOH LAYING DOWN DP, DC'S & SETTING TOOL
	11:00 - 11:15	i .	СМ	C	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	11:15 - 11:30	i	СМ	6	80CMPL	RU BLUE JET PERFORATING EQUIPMENT
	11:30 - 11:45	0.25	СМ	8	80CMPL	TEST PERFORATING LUBICATOR TO WELLBORE PRESSURE 520#
						= GOOD TEST
	11:45 - 13:00	1.25	CM	q	80CMPL	RIH W / 3 1/8" CSG GUN'S, 4 SPF, 075" DIA HOLE'S, 120 DEGREE
		}				PHASING, 302'S CHARGE AS FOLLOW'S
	ļ	:		1		3671 75' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S
				1		3659'-66' = 7 FT = 28 HOLE'S
				İ		3595'-97' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
						3558'-63' = 5 FT = 20 HOLE'S
					1	3551'-56' = 5 FT = 20 HOLE'S 3546'-50' = 4 FT = 16 HOLE'S
						3489'-94' = 5 FT = 20 HOLE'S
						3483'-85' = 2 FT = 8 HOLE'S
						3478'-81' = 3 FT = 12 HOLE'S
1						3478 6 FT = 24 HOLE'S
						TOTAL 43 FT & 172 HOLE'S
	13:00 - 13:15	1	СМ	6	80CMPL	RD BLUE JET PERFORATING EQUIPMENT
	13:15 - 14:30		СМ	6	80CMPL	RU 2 3/8" RAMS' & EQUIPMENT
	14:30 - 15:15		СМ	8	80CMPL	TEST PIPE RAMS' = 200#3 MIN'S & 1800# 10 MIN'S = GOOD TEST
	15:15 - 16:30		CM	2	80CMPL	GIH PU BHA & 2 3/8" TUBING OFF PIPE RACK
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	CM	1	80CMPL	SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N. = BAD LIGHTNING STORM
08/27/2003	07:00 - 07:30	0.50	СМ	С	80CMPL	SAFETY MEETING W / ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION
	07:30 - 08:30	1.00	СМ	g	80CMPL	BLOW DOWN WELL = HAD 515# ON CSG
	08:30 - 10:15	1.75	СМ	2	80CMPL	GIH PU 2 3/8" EUE 8RD J-55 4.7# TUBING
	10:15 - 10:30	0.25	СМ	1	80CMPL	LAND TUBING HANGER W / PRODUCTION STRING SET AS
						FOLLOW'S
						2 3/8" BOTTOM JT MUD ANCHOR W/ ORANGED PEEL SET @
		[3727'.93"
						2 3/8" 4' PERF. SUB SET @ 3695'.30"
						2 3/8" EXP CHECK W / 1.78" PROFILE SET @ 3691'.15"
						2 3/8" 1.78" FN SET @ 3690'.44" 2 3/8" 117 JT'S EUE 8RD J-55 4.7#禪姆BING:SET:@:3689:59" FO
						TUBING HANGER @ SURFACE
			-			2 3/8" SUB'S UNDER TOP JT TUBING = 1-10', 1-8' & 1-2'
				: -		TOTAL TUBING IN WELL 118 JT'S COUNTING MUD ANCHOR
	10:30 - 12:30	2.00	СМ	е	80CMPL	ND BOP'S, HCR VALVE'S & NU PUMPING WELLHEAD
				1		, San in the free in the

Page 8 of 8

Operations Summary Report

Contractor Name:

Legal Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 UNIT FRUITLA 000230A Common Well Name: SAN JUAN 32-8 FRUITLAND #230A UNIT

Event Name:

Original Completion

Spud Date: 07/09/2003

06/11/2003 End: Rig Release:

Group:

Rig Name:

Rig Number:

Date	From - To	Hours	Code	Subco	Phase	Description of Operations
08/27/2003	12:30 - 13:00 13:00 - 15:00 15:00 - 15:45	0.50 2.00 0.75	СМ	6 2 n	80CMPL 80CMPL 80CMPL	RU 3/4" ROD EQUIPMENT GIH PU INSERT PUMP & 3/4" ROD'S SPACE OUT & HANG OFF ROD'S = ROD STRING AS FOLLOW'S INSERT PUMP = H.F. 2" X 1 1/4" X 8' X 8'3" X 12'3" RHAC-Z PUMP NO = # CP028 1-2' 3/4" PONY ON TOP OF PUMP 146 3/4" PLAIN ROD'S 1-8' 3/4" PONY ROD 1-6' 3/4" PONY ROD 2-4" 3/4" PONY ROD
08/28/2003	15:45 - 16:30 16:30 - 17:00 06:00 - 08:30 08:30 - 09:45	0.75 0.50 2.50 1.25	CM CM	9 1 c	80CMPL 80CMPL 80CMPL 80CMPL	1-1 1/4" 22' POLISH ROD TEST TUBING & PUMP TO 600# FOR 15 MIN'S = GOOD TEST RELEASED PRESSURE, PUMPED UP PUMP W / RIG BLOCK'S TO 500# FOR 15 MIN'S = GOOD TEST & PUMP ACTION SECURED WELL & LOCATION = S.D.O.N. SAFETY MEETING IN TOWN W / ALL KEY & COPC PERSONNEL TRAVEL TIME TO LOCATION
	09:45 - 10:00 10:00 - 15:30 15:30 - 16:00	0.25 5.50 0.50	MV MV	c 6 1	70DMOB 70DMOB 70DMOB	SAFETY MEETING ON LOCATION W / ALL PERSONNEL RD & RELEASED RIG & EQUIPMENT ON 08 / 27 / 2003 @ 16:00 PM SECURED WELL & LOCATION = JOB COMPLETE - DROP FROM REPORT = RELEASED WELL TO PRODUCTION DEPT. = MOVING RIG & EQUIPMENT OFF LOCATION ON 08 / 28 / 2003
			÷			

Printed: 09/10/2003 8:35:53 AM

END OF WELL SCHEMATIC

Well Name:	San Juan 32-8 # 230A						Spud: _	9-Jul-0)3
	30-045-31661						lelease Drl Rig:	13-Jul-	
Location:	820' FSL & 1620' FEL				vith rods & pump		love In Cav Rig	9-Aug-	
	Sect 28 - T32N - R8W		7- ¹ / ₁₆ " 3M x 2-			R	elease Cav Rig _	27-Aug	-03
	6763 GL (above MSL)		11" 3M x 7 1/1						
_	13' above Ground Level		9-5/8" 8 RD x 1	11" 3M C	asing Head				
Datum:	Drl Rig RKB = 13' above GL								
Surface Casing Size Set at Wt. Hole Size Excess Cmt T.O.C.	Date set: 10-Jul-03 9 5/8 in 233 ft # Jnts: 5 32.3 ppf Grade H-40 12 1/4 in 120 % SURFACE Csg \$	Shoe <u>233</u> ft hole <u>234</u> ft	New Used		Lea + 2 + 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	d: 155 sx C 2% S001 Cal 0.25 lb/sx D0 16 cuft/sx, 17 Displa Bumped Final Cir Returns du Returns to	mt'd: 10 lass G Cement loium Chloride 129 Cellophane F 19.8 cuft slurry at cement: 15.0 b I Plug at: rc Press: 110p ring job: surface: tts Held: No	lakes 15.8 ppg bls fresh 300 psi si @ 0.5 t YES 15 bbls floats use	opm ed
Notif	7 in 83 3458 ft 0 20 ppf Grade J-55 8 3/4 in 150 % Csg 3 SURFACE TD of 8-3/4*	jts pups Shoe 3458 ft Hole 3461 ft 11-Jul-03	New Used		Inters	Date c d: 440 sx C 3% D079 Ext 0.25 lb/sx D0 0.2% D046 A 0.05 gal/sx D 61cuft/sx, 11 aii: 100 sx 5 2% D020 Be 2% S001 Ca 5 lb/sx D024	emt'd: 13 class G Cement tender 129 Cellophane F 1047 Antifoam 1047 Antifoam 48 cuft slurry at 1 10/50 POZ : Class 110nite 11cium Chloride	i-Jul-03 lakes 1.7 ppg s G ceme	
Production Line Size Blank Wt. Grade # Jnts: Hole Size Btm of Liner	5 1/2 in 15.5 ppf J-55 Connections: 8 6 1/4 in 3735 ft		New Used		1.3	Displa Bumped Final Ci Returns du Returns to	27 cuft slurry at 1 acement: 136 b d Plug at: 00:30 rc Press: 850 ring job:	bls Fresh hrs w/ 146 psi @ 2 b YES 18 bbls	60 psi
Top of Liner	r <u>3379</u> ft		/.						
	PBTD / 1 Bottom of Liner / Bottom	Fop of Bit Sub n of 6-1/4" Bit:	3734 3735 TD	3,743	unc	EMENTED L	INER		
COMMENTS:									
Surface:	No float equipment was run. Ran	a guide shoe an	d an aluminum	n baffle pl	late 1 jt above tl	ne guide sho	e.		
	Displaced top wiper plug with water								
Intermediate:									
Production:	Ran a bit, float sub & float on btm	of 5.5" liner & ra	n a hydraulic li	ner hang	er. Plugged up	& stopped a	it 3735' (ie 8' off b	otm)	
	Perforated 5-1/2" liner. Ran 2-3/8	", 4.7#, J-55 EU	E 8rd, tubing (l	EOT at 37	728' RKB)				
	Ran pump and rods. Set pump in	F Nipple (FN) a	t 3690' MD RK	В.					
CENTRALIZER									
Surface:	CENTRALIZERS @ 223', 145', 10	ונ', & 58'.					Total	:4	<u> </u>
Intermediate:	CENTRALIZERS @ 3448', 3366', TURBOLIZERS @ 2451', 2406', 2		21', 3032', & 2	00'.			Total		