Submit I Copy To Appropriate District Office State of New Mexico	Form C-103
District I - (575) 393-6161 Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources	Revised August 1, 2011
1625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 District II ~ (575) 748-1283	WELL API NO. 30-059-20533
811 S. First St., Artesia, NM 88210 OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION	5. Indicate Type of Lease
District III - (505) 334-6178 1220 South St. Francis Dr.	STATE FEE
<u>District IV</u> - (505) 476-3460 Santa Fe, NM 8/505	6. State Oil & Gas Lease No.
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505	
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS	7. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name
(DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSALS TO DRILL OR TO DEEPEN OR PLUG BACK TO A	0 0 0/123
DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-101) FOR SUCH PROPOSALS.)	Board Dome 2433
1. Type of Well: Oil Well Gas Well Other	8. Well Number 281
2. Name of Operator OKA USA TINC	9. OGRID Number 16696
3. Address of Operator	10. Pool name or Wildcat
DO BOX 4294, Houston 12.77210	Bravo Dome 640
Unit Letter G : 2327 feet from the NORTH line and a	2166 feet from the EAST line
Section 28 Township 24N Range 33E	NMPM County UNION
11. Elevation (Show whether DR, RKB, RT, GR, etc.	
Professional Confession Confessio	1994 3340 351 CS (CS CATTACATA) on release with Large of the process place of the CS (CS CATTACATA).
12. Check Appropriate Box to Indicate Nature of Notice,	Report or Other Data
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO: SUB	SEQUENT REPORT OF:
PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK PLUG AND ABANDON REMEDIAL WOR	
TEMPORARILY ABANDON	LLING OPNS. 🕱 PANDA 🗆 🗆
PULL OR ALTER CASING MULTIPLE COMPL CASING/CEMEN	rjob 🤼
DOWNHOLE COMMINGLE	
OTHER: OTHER:	
13. Describe proposed or completed operations. (Clearly state all pertinent details, and	d give pertinent dates, including estimated date
of starting any proposed work). SEE RULE 19.15.7.14 NMAC. For Multiple Corproposed completion or recompletion.	npletions: Attach wellbore diagram of
proposed completion of recompletion.	
Soo Attached	
5601	
	· .
·	
	1
Spud Date: Rig Release Date: 9.15	3/11
Spud Date: 8 23 11 Rig Release Date: 8 3	\$111
0 0/11	SIII
Spud Date: Rig Release Date: R	and belief.
I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge	and belief.
0 0/11	and belief. St DATE 3/28/12
I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge SIGNATURE L. Kiki Lockett E-mail address: Kiki-locket	ST DATE 3/28/12 +@0Ky.cmPHONE: 113-215-7643
I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge SIGNATURE Log Lockett TITLE Reg. analy	St DATE 3/28/12
I hereby certify that the information above is true and complete to the best of my knowledge SIGNATURE L. Kiki Lockett E-mail address: Kiki-locket	St DATE 3/28/12

OXY USA INC

Operation Summary Report

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2433 281G

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site: BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT Start Date: 8/23/2011

		End Date:	8/28/2011	Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208
	Time Start-End	Hrs Op Details		
7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7	06:00 - 07:00	1.00 CONT RD, MISC BACI	K YARD PU. TRUCK	S TURNING AROUND & POSITIONING FOR LOAD OUT. FOR
	07:00 - 07:30	0.50 SAFETY MEETING: RI		TRUCKING, DOUBLE T TRUCKING, RM, BOTH DSM'S. IONKING, SECURE LOADS, COMMUNICATIONS, AIR
	07:30 - 12:00	AMBULANCE, MUDDY		WANCE FOR MUD N NEW LOCATION. DIGGING DITCHES, HOOKING UP
	07.50 - 12.00	HOUSES. DERRICK S	TANDING 11:00	RKLIFT ASSIST ON ALL LOADS.
	12:00 - 16:00		5/8" SURFACE CASI	NG, STRAP BHA #1, DIG DITCHES, SMOOTH LOCATION, MI
				MAGINARY FENCE, KUDOS ON THE EXTRA EFFORTS TO
	W. 17		AND LYNN CLAY V	ISITED LOCATION. EXPRESSED APPRECIATION FOR THE
	16:00 - 20:00	4.00 DRILL 12.25" SURFAC	E HOLE FROM GL 1	O 190' CUT 190 ' AVG 47' FPH RVE, 75 RPM, 25K WOB, 435 GPM. 700 PSI PUMP PRES. MW
				N & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	00.00 00.00	BHA #1 3 EA 8" DC, 1	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
	20:00 - 00:00	1		TO 282' CUT 92 ' AVG 23' FPH 5 GPM, 750 PSI PUMP PRES, MW 8.6 VIS 39
•		DROP SOAP STICKS	EVERY CONNECTION	N & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	<u> </u>			MOVING EQUIPMENT, GOOD HOUSE KEEPING
2 06/24/2011	00:00 - 02:30	RET TO RESERVE, 75	5 RPM, 20K WOB, 43	TO 404' CUT 122' AVG 49' FPH 5 GPM. 750 PSI PUMP PRES. MW 8.9 VIS 39 ON & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
				MOVING EQUIPMENT, GOOD HOUSE KEEPING
* .	02:30 - 03:30	*	SAND OUT OF SUME	PUMP. HOLE WASHING OUT. UNABLE TO DETECT SOUR
,	03:30 - 07:30		PM, 20K WOB, 435 C	TO 578' CUT 174' AVG 44' FPH PM. 750 PSI PUMP PRES. RVEY AT 400' DEV .5 DEG
		DROP SOAP STICKS	EVERY CONNECTION	ON & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	07:30 - 11:30	CIRC RESERVE, 70 R	PM, 35K WOB, 435 C	TO 695' CUT 117' AVG 29' FPH PM. 750 PSI PUMP PRES.
		MW 8.9 VIS 39 700' ENCOUNTERED LOST POWER 11:30 F	HARD, ERATIC DRIL	LING, BIT BOUNCING, HAD TO BACK OFF WT N OFFICE GEN
			MENDATIONS FOR	N & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD. TEAM EFFORTS. MAINTAINING MOMENTUM, KEEPING
	11:30 - 15:30			TO 790' CUT 95' AVG 24' FPH PM. 750 PSI PUMP PRES.
			MENDATIONS FOR	
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50 PUMP HI VIS SWEEP,	, CIRC HOLE CLEAN	
,	16:00 - 17:30	•		•
		HOLE WAS FREE NO	•	E WAY TO SURFACE.
		LAST SURVEY @ 790	INC ⁰ DEG	

OXY USA INC

Operation Summary Report

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2433 281G

Project: BRAVO DOME BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT Event Name: DEV DRILLING Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Start Date: 8/23/2011

Site:	BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT		8/23/2011	
W.11 W.W.		End Date:	8/28/2011	Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208
	Date Time Start-End			
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50 RIG UP CASING RUN 1	ΓΟΟΙ	
		SAFETY BREAK: JSA PACE.	RUNNING CASIN	G. SAFETY AS PRIORITY ONE. KEEPING SMOOTH STEADY
LANKY ,	18:00 - 19:30	1.50 RUN 8 5/8", J-55, STC;	24# SURFACE CA	ASING
ę				SETTING DEPTH
		TEX PATTERN SHOE SHOE JT		773' 772'
		INSERT FLOAT		772 729'
		17 JTS CASING		686'
Margaret S		CASING WENT TO BO	and the second of the second	
	19:30 - 20:00	SIMOP: HALLIBURTON 0.50 FINSH RU HALLIBURT		
	10.00 20.00		•	
				PRESS LINES, PINCH PTS.
1	20:00 - 21:00	1.00 CEMENT 8 5/8" CASING THRU JOB, CIRC 208 S		REM PLUS, 2% CACL, 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE. FULL RETURNS
*		1111(O JOB, O11(O 200 C	рх (30 DDL3) CLIV	MENT TO SORT MOE.
				S OVER DISPLACEMENT, PUMPED (47.2) BBLS TOTAL, FLOAT
		HELD, GOT BACK 5 BI TO CARRY ON WITH C		ICK. NOTIFIED FIELD SUPERINTENDENT, DECISION WAS MADE CEMENT JOB COMPLETE @ 21:00 HRS.
	21:00 - 00:00			CLEAN & GRADE BIT, STRAP & CALIPER BHA.
3.0	8/25/2011 00:00 - 01:00			N RIG, CLEAN & GRADE BIT, STRAP & CALIPER BHA.
•	01:00 - 06:00	SAFTY BREAK: JSA NU		G PIPE T. INSTALL WELL HEAD. NU BOPE
	06:00 - 06:30			ST BOP TO 250 PSI LO, 1000 PSI HI
٠,		GOOD TEST	CASING 31. IEC	31 BOF 1,0 230 F31 E0, 1000 F31 III
	06:30 - 08:30	2.00 MAKE UP 7 7/8" PROD	UCTION ASSEME	BLY AND TRIP IN THE HOLE TO TOP OF CEMENT @ 727'
•	08:30 - 09:00	0.50 SERVICE RIG.		
	09:00 - 09:30	0.50 TEST CASING TO 1000		
	09:30 - 10:30	1.00 DRILL OUT CEMENT W	VITH REDUCED P	PARAMETERS, 15K WOB, 50 RPM
		SAFETY BREAK: COM	MUNCIATIONS, A	ND TEAM WORK
	10:30 - 11:00	0.50 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HO	LE F 790' TO 811'	, CUT 21', AVG 42 FPH,
		25K WOB, 70 RPM, 340 MW 8.6 VIS 38	GPM, 1000 PSI P	PUMP PRES. CIRC RESERVE.
		IVIVV 0.0 VIO 30		
				TION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	11:00 - 12:00		NG WAS LEAKING	G ON THE MUD PUMP. PULLED BACK INTO CASING AND MADE
	12:00 - 16:00	PUMP REPAIRS. 4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HO	LE F 811' TO 1034	4' CUT 223' AVG 56 FPH
	12.00	25K WOB, 70 RPM, 340	GPM, 1000 PSI P	PUMP PRES. CIRC RESERVE.
		MW 8.6 VIS 38		
		DROP SOAP STICKS E	VERY CONNECT	TION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	16:00 - 20:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HO	LE F 1034' TO 128	83', CUT 249', AVG 62.25' FPH,
٠		28K WOB, 85 RPM, 340 MW 8.6 VIS 38	GPM, 1080 PSI P	PUMP PRES. CIRC RESERVE.
	ns.	WINN O'D A12 20		
		SURVEY @ 1276 = 0.75	5	
		DROP SOAP STICKS F	VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	20:00 - 00:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HO		
		28K WOB, 85 RPM, 340		PUMP PRES. CIRC STEEL PITS @ 1300'.
		MW 9.0 VIS 60		•
		DROP SOAP STICKS E	VERY CONNECT	TION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
4 0	8/26/2011 00:00 - 04:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HO	LE F 1483' TO 170	09', CUT 226', AVG 56.5' FPH,
				PUMP PRES. CIRC STEEL PITS
	e de la companya della companya della companya de la companya della companya dell	MW 9.0 VIS 60	And the state of the state of	
		DROP SOAP STICKS E	VERY CONNECT	TION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.

7/10/2012 8:50:19AM

OXY USA INC

Operation Summary Report

BRAVO DOME UNIT 2433 281G Well:

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

Site:	BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT	Start Date: End Date:	8/23/2011 8/28/2011	Pig Name: TDINIDAD 200
#	Date Time		UIZUIZUI I	Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208
	Start-End 04:00 - 06:00		F F 1700' TO 170	2)' CIIT 83' AVG 41' FPH
	04.00 - 00.00			UMP PRES. CIRC STEEL PITS
			VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	06:00 - 09:30	3.50 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HO		
				SI PUMP PRES. CIRC STEEL PITS
	09:30 - 10:00	DROP SOAP STICKS E 0.50 SERVICE RIG.	VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	10:00 - 14:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HOI	LE F 1940' TO 205	50', CUT 110', AVG 28' FPH,
				SI PUMP PRÉS. CIRC RESERVE PIT STARTING AT 2,000' MW
		DROP SOAP STICKS E	VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
				ZONES AROUND PIPE WRANGLER.
	14:00 - 18:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HOI 35/40K WOB, 70 RPM, 3		36', CUT 136', AVG 34' FPH, SI PUMP PRES. CIRC RESERVE PIT MW 8.9 VIS 36
	Er .			ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	18:00 - 22:00		340 GPM, 1035 PS	20', CUT 134', AVG 33.5' FPH, BI PUMP PRES. CIRC RESERVE PIT
		MW 8.9 VIS 38		
		SURVEY @ 2277 = 1.5		
		DROP SOAP STICKS E	VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	22:00 - 00:00			21', CUT 101', AVG 50.5' FPH, SI PUMP PRES. CIRC STEEL PIT MW 8.9 VIS 36
, ,	3.25" 5.00	DROP SOAP STICKS E	VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
5 0	8/27/2011 00:00 - 04:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HOI	E F 2421' TO 259	96', CUT 175', AVG 43.75' FPH, SI PUMP PRES. CIRC STEEL PIT
		***		ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	04:00 - 06:00	2.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HOI 35/40K WOB, 70 RPM, 3 MW 9.2 VIS 35		io', CUT 54', AVG 27' FPH, BI PUMP PRES. CIRC STEEL PIT
٠.		CIMARRON IDENTIFIE	D FROM 2617' - 2	634'
			The state of the s	
			AS DECIDED AF	ENT ABOUT THE CIMARRON COMING IN LATER THAN FER SPEEKING TO RESERVOIR ENGINEER THAT WE WOULD 884'
	•	DROP SOAP STICKS F	VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	06:00 - 10:00	4.00 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HOI	E F 2650' TO 279	
		DROP SOAP STICKS E	VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
		SAFETY BREAK: DISCU		
·	10:00 - 12:30	2.50 DRILL 7 7/8" PROD HOL 35/40K WOB, 70 RPM, 3 MW 9.2 VIS 35	· ·	14', CUT 89', AVG 36' FPH, SI PUMP PRES. CIRC STEEL PIT
			VERY CONNECT	ION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	12:30 - 13:00	0.50 CIRCULATE HOLE CLE		
	13:00 - 15:30	2.50 WIPER TRIP UP INTO (CASING TO 790'	AND BACK IN BEFORE TRIPPING OUT FOR LOGS.

7/10/2012 8:50:19AM

OXY USA IN

Operation Summary Report

	Alexandra Landon	Operation Summary Report
Nell:	BRAVO DOME UNIT 24	33 281G Event Name: DEV DRILLING
roject:	BRAVO DOME	Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT
Site:	BRAVO DOME C02 UN	T Start Date: 8/23/2011
		End Date: 8/28/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208
# 	Date Time Start-End	Hrs Op Details
	15:30 - 18:00	2.50 TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE TO RUN LOGS.
	18:00 - 19:00	1.00 PJSM AND RU WEATHERFORD LOGGING. SAFETY BREAK: JSA LOGGING OPS, RIG CREW JSA WORKING ON PUMP.
	19:00 - 00:00	5.00 LOGS WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO PROBLEMS. LOGGERS DEPTH 2882'
		CIMARRON CONFIRMED @ 2617 - 2634
		LOG RUN #1
		LATEROLOG / SPECTRAL GR
		LOG RUN #2
6 00	/20/2044 *00:00 : 04:20	DENSITY / NEUTRON / GR / CCL
6 08	/28/2011 00:00 - 01:30	1.50 FINISH LOGGING WELLS AND RIG DOWN WEATHERFORD
	01:30 - 05:30	4.00 RIG UP AND RUN 5.5", 15.5#, J-55, LTC & 5.4# 8RD FIBERGLASS PROD CASING RUN PIPE BOOM JAWS WITH 800-850 PSI HYD PRESS. (700 TO 1000 PSI ALLOWABLE)
		NOW FIFE BOOM DAWS WITH 600-650 FSITHD FRESS. (700 TO 1000 FSIALLOWABLE)
		SET DEPTH SET DEPTH
		GUIDE SHOE2862' INSERT FLOAT2851'
	, , ,	SHOE JT2861' 86 JTS CASING2851'
3.5	05:30 - 08:00	2.50 CIRCULATE 2X BOTTOMS UP AND PJSM WITH HALLIBURTON AND RIG CREW
	91 1 4	RIG UP HALLIBURTON AND CEMENT AS FOLLOWS:
		RIG OF MALLIBORTOIN AND CEMENT AS FOLLOWS.
•	,	PUMPED CEMENT JOB AS FOLLOWS
	1.1	20 BBL FRESH WATER SPACER AT 5.5 BBL/MIN @ 150 PSI
		510 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL, LEAD CEMENT
		- 11.1 PPG
	• • •	- YIELD = 3.25 CU FT/SACK
		25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE 150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL
	•	- 13.2 PPG
		- YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK
		- 25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE
	•	
		DROP PLUG, PUMP 62.7 BBL. DISPLACEMENT, FINAL LIFT WAS 643 PSI, BUMPED PLUG @ 07:42,
		PRESSURED UP TO 1,010 PSI. RELEASED PSI FLOATS HELD AND GOT BACK .5 BBL. TO TRUCK. WE
	** 4	CIRCULATED 368 SX = 213 BBL TO SURFACE.
		RIG DOWN CEMENTERS.
	08:00 - 12:00	4.00 WAIT ON CEMENT, CLEAN PITS, AND RIG DOWN THE SAME.
	12:00 - 15:00	3.00 BACK OUT AND LAYDOWN LANDING JOINT. FINISH NIPPLE DOWN PROCESS AND RELEASE RIG TO THE BDU 1935-362K.

7/10/2012 8:50:19AM 4

State of New Mexico Energy, Minerals & Natural Resources

Form C-104 Revised August 1, 2011

Oil Conservation Division

Submit one copy to appropriate District Office

EPORT
V
ate

er mess
Į
1.
e
1

State of New Mexico ive Copies July 17, 2008 Energy, Minerals and Natural Resources District I 625 N. French Dr., Hobbs, NM 88240 1. WELL API NO. district IL. 301 W. Grand Avenue, Artesia, NM 88210 30-059-20533 OIL CONSERVATION DIVISION istrict III 2. Type Of Lease 000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 1220 South St. Francis Dr. District IV Santa Fe, NM 87505 220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505 State Oil & Gas Lease No. L06193 WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG Reason for filing: 5. Lease Name or Unit Agreement Name COMPLETION REPORT (Fill in boxes #1 through #31 for State and Fee wells only) Bravo Dome Carbon Dioxide Gas 2433 6. Well Number C-144 CLOSURE ATTACHMENT (Fill in boxes #1 through #9, #15 Date Rig Released and #32 and/or 33, attach this and the plat to the C-144 closure report in accordance with 19.15.17:13 K NMAC) 281 Type of Completion NEW WELL WORKOVER DEEPENING DELUGBACK DIFFERENT RESERVOIR OTHER 9. OGRID Number Name of Operator OXY USA Inc 16696 Address of Operator 11. Pool name or Wildcat P.O. Box 4294 Houston, TX 77210-4294 Bravo Dome Carbon Dioxide Gas 640 Feet from the E/W Line County 2. Location Unit Letter N/S Line Section Township Range Feet from the Lot urface: G 24N 2327 2166 Ε 28 33E N Union H: 14. Date T.D. Reached Date Spudded 15. Date Rig Released 16. Date Completed (Ready to Produce) 17. Elevations (DF & RKB, RT, GR, etc.) 5193.4 GR 81231 U 812711 98 Total Measured Depth of Well 19. Plug Back Measured Depth 20. Was Directional Survey Made 21. Type Electric and Other Logs Run 2851 2884 **ACR** No 2. Producing Interval(s), of this completion - Top, Bottom, Name 2640-2680' - Tubb CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well) CASING SIZE WEIGHT LB./FT HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED DEPTH SET 8-5/8" 24# 750 ' 12-1/4" 400 SX N/A 5-1/2" 5.5#FG/15.5# 2550' 2800'6/11 7-7/8" 650 SX/11 N/A TUBING RECORD LINER RECORD 25. TOP SACKS CEMENT DEPTH SET PACKER SET **BOTTOM SCREEN** SIZE 6. Perforation record (interval, size, and number) 27. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT, SQEEZE, ETC AMOUNT AND KIND MATERIAL USED DEPTH INTERVAL 2640-2680' @ 4 SPF (124 Total Holes) 2640-2680 13941g CO2 60TON frac w/556 sx snc **PRODUCTION** ate First Production Production Method . (Flowing, gas lift, pumping - Size and type pump) Well Status (Prod. or Shut-in) 1/30/12 FLOWING Shut-In ate of Test Gas - Oil Ratio Hours Tested Choke Size Prod'n For Oil - Bbl. Gas - MCF Water - Bbl Test Period 2/9/12 24 50 - ORF 0 0 ow Tubing Casing Pressure Calculated 24-Water - Bbl. Oil Gravity - API -(Corr.) Gas - MCF Oil - Bbl. Hour Rate 0 0 Disposition of Gas (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) 30. Test Witnessed By Sold AUTOMATION List Attachments Deviation Svy, Log (1 set) . If a temporary pit was used at the well, attach a plat with the location of the temporary pit. . If an on-site burial was used at the well, report the exact location of the on-site burial: Longitude NAD: 1927 1983 hereby certify that the information shown on both sides of this form is true and complete to the best of my knowledge and belief gnature Printed of Kockets 3/20/12 Reg Analyst KIKI LOCKETT. Date KIKI LOCKETT@OXY.COM^{Name} Title mail address

INSTRUCTIONS

This form is to be filed with the appropriate District Office of the Division not later than 20 days after the completion of any newly-drilled or deepened well and not later than 60 days after completion of closure. When submitted as a completion report, this shall be accompanied by one copy of all electrical and radio-activity logs run on the well and a summary of all special tests conducted, including drill stem tests. All depths eported shall be measured depths. In the case of directionally drilled wells, true vertical depths shall also be reported. For multiple completions, items 11, 12 and 26-31 shall be reported for each zone.

INDICATE FORMATION TOPS IN CONFORMANCE WITH GEOGRAPHICAL SECTION OF STATE

South	neastern l	New Mexico	Northwestern	New Mexico
Γ. Anhy		T. Canyon	T. Ojo Alamo	T. Penn "A"
Γ. Salt		T. Strawn	T. Kirtland	T. Penn. "B"
3. Salt		T. Atoka	T. Fruitland	T. Penn. "C"
Yates		T. Miss	T. Pictured Cliffs	T. Penn. "D"
7 Rivers		T. Devonian	T. Cliff House	T. Leadville
Oueen	•	T. Silurian	T. Menefee	T. Madison
Grayburg		T. Montoya	T. Point Lookout	T. Elbert
. San Andres	1929	T. Simpson	T. Mancos	T. McCracken
C. Glorieta	2132	T. McKee	T. Gallup	T. Ignacio Otzte
. Paddock		T. Ellenburger	Base Greenhorn	T. Granite
Blinebry		T. Gr. Wash	T. Dakota	
Tubb	2616	T. Delaware Sand	T. Morrison	
. Drinkard [†]		T. Bone Springs	T. Todilto	
. Abo		T. Santa Rosa 1621	T. Entrada	
. Wolfcamp		T. Yeso 2231	T. Wingate	
. Penn		T. Cimarron 2601	T. Chinle	
. Cisco (Bough C)		Τ.	T. Permain	
1				OIL OR GAS

		•	SANDS OR ZONES
No. 1, from	to	No. 3, from	to
No. 2, from	to	No. 4, from	to
		WATER SANDS	
nclude data on rate of water in	flow and elevation to which water ro	se in hole.	
Vo! 1, from	to	feet	
	to		
No 3. from	to	feet	
	ITHOLOGY BECORD	(Attach additional sheet i	f nacassamu)

From	To	Thickness in Feet	Lithology	From	То	Thickness in Feet	Lithology
	709	709	redbed				
ე9	3024	2315	sandstone/shale				
			·				
					•		
							·
1						}	
	:		e en				
	<u> </u>						