		<u> </u>	OXYUSAINC
Well: BRAVO D	OOME UNIT 1935 332	2J Event Name:	DEV DRILLING
Project: BRAVO D	OME	Prim. Reason:	ORIG DRILL VERT
Site: BRAVO D	OME C02 UNIT	Start Date:	9/5/2011
		End Date:	9/9/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208
# Date:	Start-End	irs Op Details	
1 09/05/2011	08:30 - 00:00 1	FINISHED RIGGING DOWN	MOVES ON PUBLIC ROADS ON HOLIDAYS. AT 15:00
2 - 09/06/2011	00:00 - 07:30	7.50 WAIT ON TRUCKS	
	07:30 - 08:00 08:00 - 10:00	MPH ON LOCATION, 30' BL	D DRIVERS: STOP WORK AUTHORITY, TAG LINES, FALL PROTECTION, 5 IFFER WHILE LOADING/UNLOADING, PPE, STAYING HYDRATED IS5-332J, NO HIGH LINES IN OUR PATH
			@ 10:00 AM. EVERYTHING WAS OFF LOCATION BY 10:00
		•	AK: DISCUSSED REFRESHER ON SAFETY REQUIREMENTS FOR DRIVERS ED TRUCERS TO USE SPOTTERS WHILE BACKING
	10:00 - 14:00	4.00 MOVE IN AND RIG UP. DEF	
		NOTE: INFORMED ED MAR HOURS	TIN WITH NOMED OF OUR FUTURE SPUD AND CASING RUN @ 13:30
		MIX SPUD MUD, MAKE UP	BIT, AND STRAP BHA.
		12:00 HOURS RIG 100% Of	LOCATION
		ACCEPTED RIG @ 13:00 H	OURS
		14:00 HOURS SAFETY BRE WHILE MIXING MUD	AK: DISCUSSED HYDRATION, RIGGING UP, AND WEARING PROPER PPE
	14 00 - 18:00	CIRC STEEL PITS TO 150', 8.5 VIS 38	LE FROM GL TO 360', CUT 360' AVG 90' FPH RET TO RESERVE, 75 RPM, 25K WOB, 340 GPM, 850 PSI PUMP PRES, MW
<u> </u>	18:00 - 22:00		LY CONNECTION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	10.00 - 22.00	CIRC RESERVE, 75 RPM, 2	ILE FROM 360' TO 583', CUT 223'.AVG 56' FPH 5K WOB, 340 GPM. 850 PSI PUMP PRES. MW 8.5 VIS 38
	00.00 00.00		LY CONNECTION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	22:00 - 00:00		ILE FROM 583, TO 727', CUT 144' AVG 72' FPH 5K WOB, 340 GPM, 850 PSI PUMP PRES. MW 8.5 VIS 38
	<u> </u>	DROP SOAP STICKS EVER	Y CONNECTION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
3 09/07/2011	00:00 - 00:30		ILE FROM 727' TO 753', CUT 26' AVG 52' FPH ISK WOB, 340 GPM. 850 PSI PUMP PRES. MW 8.9 VIS 38
	00:30 04:00	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Y CONNECTION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	00:30 - 01:30	SUCTION WHILE MIXING A	PICKED.UP OFF BTM AND DUMPED DRILLING PAPER AND CEDAR FIBER AT 40 BBL 10 PPG LCM PILL, GOT RETURNS BACK AND RESUMED DRILLING
	01:30 - 02:00		DLE FROM 753' TO 778', CUT 25' AVG 50' FPH DSK WOB, 340 GPM. 850 PSI PUMP PRES. MW 9.1 VIS 41
		DROP SOAP STICKS EVER	Y CONNECTION & PUMP SWEEP AND SWEEP STICK EVERY THIRD.
	02:00 - 02:30	0.50 PUMP A SWEEP AND CIRC	CULATE 2X BTM UP TO CONDITION HOLE FOR 8.625" CSG
	02:30 - 04:00	1.50 DROP TOTCO AND TOH FO	DR 8.625" SURFACE CSG
	04:00 - 04:30	0.50 RIG UP CRT FOR CASING	RUN AND ROLL PIPE
	04:30 - 07:00	2.50 PJSM - RIG UP & RUN 18 J	TS. 8 5/8", 24#, J-55, ST & C, SURFACE CASING:
		1 - 8 5/8" TEXAS PATTERN 1 - SHOE JOINT 1 - INSERT FLOAT	SHOE50'
	07:00 - 07:30		UP LANDING JOINT AND LAND CASING @ 771.79
	07:30 - 08:00	0.50 RIG HALLIBURTON, AND C	IRC. 2X BOTTOMS UP.
		PJSM WITH HALLIBURTON	AND RIG CREW.

OXY USA INC

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 1935 332J

Event Name: DEV DRILLING

Project:	BRAVO D	OME		Prim. Reason:	ORIG DRILL VERT		
Site:	BRAVO D	OME C02 UNIT		Start Date:	9/5/2011		
				End Date:	9/9/2011	Rig Name:	TRINIDAD 208
#	Date	Time	Hrs Op Details				
		Start-End					A STATE OF THE STA
		08:00 - 09:30	1.50 PUMP SUF	RFACE CEMENT	AS FOLLOWS.	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	
			DUMD A 20	A BBL EDECLIA	ATEO CRACER		
!) BBL FRESH W/ RATE = 5 BBL/MI			
			- 1 01411 1	OTTE - 5 DDEIWI	14		
			PUMPED 1	120 BBLS (500 SA	ACKS) OF 14.8 PPG PRI	EMIUM PLUS CEMENT	
Ì			- 2% (
				lbm/sk Poly-E-Fla			
ĺ				.D: 1.35 CUFT/S#			
ĺ				IP RATE = 6 BBL SSURE = 200 PS			
	•		-1110	330KL - 200 F3) i		
			DISPLACE	D WITH 46 BBLS	OF FRESH WATER		
				IP RATE = 5.5 BE			
İ				SSURE = 300 PS			
			- FINA	AL @ 2BPM = 300) PSI		
			RUMPED	ല ലഭ <i>ര</i> ം വംഹാ മ	ND PRESSURED UP TO	590 PSI HELD FOR 5 MIN.	COT BACK 5 BBI TO
				OATS HELD.	ND FRESSORED OF TO	390 FOI HELD FOR 3 WIRK.	GOT BACK 3 BBL TO
				URNS THROUGH			
					S) TO SURFACE.		
		09:30 - 13:00			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	ND CLEAN PITS. MIX MUD	IN PREMIX FOR MUD UP.
		13:00 - 16:30			UG TO 5.5" CASING JT.		. 4.1
	<u> </u>	16:30 - 17:00				ES EACH. GOOD TEST.	
	 :	17:00 - 18:30			ALL STRIPPING RUBBE		
<u>:</u>		18:30 - 19:30				NUTES. TEST GOOD: DR	
ł		19:30 - 23:00				980', CUT 202', AVG 58' FPI	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
			CIRC STE	EL PITS, 75 RPM	i, 35K WOB, 340 GPM. 1	015 PSI PUMP PRES. MW	8.5 VIS 40
			DROP SW	EEP STICKS 3RI	DEVERY CONNECTION	& PUMP SWEEP AS NEED	DED
		23:00 - 00:00				068, CUT 88', AVG 88' FPI	
1.					and the second s	015 PSI PUMP PRES. MW	
, 							
l						& PUMP SWEEP AS NEED	
4 09	/08/2011	00:00 - 04:00				1236, CUT 168', AVG 42 F	
			CIRC STE	EL PITS, 75 KPIVI	I, 30K WOB, 340 GPM. 1	054 PSI PUMP PRES. MW	9.0 VIS 47
			DROP SW	EEP STICKS 3RI	DEVERY CONNECTION	& PUMP SWEEP AS NEED	DED
		04:00 - 08:00	4.00 DRILL 7.87	5" PRODUCTION	N HOLE FROM 1236' TO	1400', CUT 164', AVG 41 F	PH .
			CIRC STE	EL PITS, 75 RPM	, 30K WOB, 340 GPM. 1	71 PSI PUMP PRES. MW	9.0 VIS 47
4							
	ta to di					& PUMP SWEEP AS NEED	
		08:00 - 12:00			N HOLE FROM 1400' TO 30K WOB, 340 GPM. 107	1635', CUT 235', AVG 59 F	PH
			CINC RESI	ERVE, 73 RFIVI, 3	30K WOB, 340 GPW. 107	I POI PUIVIP PRES.	
			DROP SW	EEP STICKS 3RI	DEVERY CONNECTION	& PUMP SWEEP AS NEED	DED
					k.		
					IICATIONS. CAUTION A		
	42	12:00 - 16:00				1912', CUT 277', AVG 70 F	
			KEI 10 S	IEEL PIIS AI 16	OU , 75 RPIVI, 30K WOB,	340 GPM. 1100 PSI PUMP	PRES.
	tu. Linguage		DROP SW	EEP STICKS 3RI	DEVERY CONNECTION	& PUMP SWEEP AS NEEL	DED Y
		State of the second			DLING BHA, MIXING CH	EMICALS, SERVICING SU	MP PUMP, LOTO
		16:00 - 16:30	0.50 SERVICE		10110A		
		16:30 - 20:30	1 13		and the second s	2105', CUT 193.', AVG 48'	FPH AND TO THE TOTAL
ļ		2 14	CIRC RES	ERVE, 75 RPM, 3	30K WOB, 340 GPM. 120	0 PSI PUMP PRES:	
{	1. 4 July 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1. 1.	e garage ka	DBOD CW	EED CTICKS 101) EVEDY COMPLETION	O DUMO CIMEEDIAC NEEL	DED.
}	n en		DROP SW	LEF STICKS 3KI	2 EAEKT COMMECTION	& PUMP SWEEP AS NEE!	경기 사람들이 가지 않는데 하지 않는다.
}	*.		CIMARRO	N 2020' TO 2039'			
} .							
		<u> </u>	SAFETY B	REAK: JSÁ HAN	DLING TUBULARS, LAY	ING DOWN PIPE,	
				-			

10/1/2012

OXY USA INC

Operation Summary Report

Well: BRAVO DOME UNIT 1935 332J

DEV DRILLING Event Name:

Project: BRAVO DOME

Prim. Reason: ORIG DRILL VERT

BRAVO DOME C02 UNIT Site:

Start Date: 9/5/2011

End!

Date: 9/9/2011 Rig Name: TRINIDAD 208	 010/0044	B' N ···	TOULDAD OOG
	9/9/2011		

# Date Time Start-End	Hrs Op Details
20:30 - 23:00	2.50 DRILL 7.875" PRODUCTION HOLE FROM 2105" TO 2224', CUT, 119 ', AVG 48' FPH
	CIRC RESERVE, 75 RPM, 30K WOB, 340 GPM, 1250 PSI PUMP PRES.
22:00 22:20	DROP SWEEP STICKS 3RD EVERY CONNECTION & PUMP SWEEP AS NEEDED
23:00 - 23:30	0.50 PUMP HI VIS SWEEP, CIRCULATÉ HOLE CLEAN.
	SAFETY BREAK: JSA PROPER PPE, TRIPPING PIPE
23:30 - 00:00	0.50 TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE PULLED CLEAN, TAKING PROPER FILL
5 09/09/2011 00:00 - 02:00	2.00 TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE PULLED CLEAN, TAKING PROPER FILL
02:00 - 03:00	1.00 RU CRT, REMOVE ROTATING RUBBER
	SAFETY BREAK: JSA RUNNING CASING, ROLLING PIPE
03:00 - 05:00	2.00 RUN 5.5", 15.5#, J-55, LTC PROD CASING
V	SET DEPTH SET DEPTH
	GUIDE SHOE2215' INSERT FLOAT2204'
	SHOE JT2214' 52 JTS CASING2204'
05:00 - 06:00	1.00 DROP BALL, CIRC & COND HOLE. SIMOP: RU HALLIBURTON SAFETY BREAK: PJSM WITH HALLIBURON, RIG CREW, RM & DSM JSA CEMENTING.
06:00 - 07:00	1.00 CEMENT AS FOLLOWS:
00.00 - 07.00	20 BBL FRESH WATER SPACER
	350 SACKS OF PREMIUM W2% CACL, LEAD CEMENT
	- 11.1 PPG - YIELD = 3.25 CU FT/SACK
	25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE
	150 SACKS OF PREMIUM W/2% CACL
	- 13.2 PPG - YIELD = 1.85 CU FT/SACK
	25 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE
	BUMPED PLUG @ 06:42, CIRCULATED 232 SX, 134 BBLS TO SURFACE.
07:00 - 07:30	0.50 RD HALLIBURTON
07:30 - 10:00	2.50 WAIT ON CEMENT, CLEAN PITS, BEGIN RIG DOWN
	BACK OUT AND LD LANDING JOINT. ND.
	RELEASED RIG AT 10:00 HOURS TO BDU 1935-312J NOTIFIED ED MARTIN, NMOCD, 11:00 HOURS, SUCCESSFUL COMPLETION OF BDU 1935-332J AND INTENT TO MOVE, SPUD AND CEMENT SURFACE ON BDU 1935-312L

10/1/2012 6:18:09PM