Office A	State of New M Energy, Minerals and Nat			Form C-103 May 27, 2004
District 1 1625 N. French D. Hobbs, NM 87240	Elicigy, willicials and Ival	idiai Resources	WELL API NO.	Way 27, 2004
District II 1301 W. Grand Aye, Artesia, NM 88210	OIL CONSERVATION	ON DIVISION	30.015.219	
District III	1220 South St. F		5. Indicate Type of Lea	
1000 Rio Brazos Rd., Aztec, NM 87410 District IV	Santa Fe, NM	87505	STATE X	FEE
1220 S. St. Francis Dr., Santa Fe, NM 87505			6. State Oil & Gas Lea	se No.
SUNDRY NOTICES (DO NOT USE THIS FORM FOR PROPOSA DIFFERENT RESERVOIR. USE "APPLICAT PROPOSALS.)	S AND REPORTS ON WALS TO DRILL OR TO DEFER TION FOR PERMIT" (FORM C-	Ñ OR PLUG BÀ ČĽ TO A	7. Lease Name or Unit Empire Abo Unit "F	
1. Type of Well: Oil Well 🗷 Gas Well	Other (%)	Des 55	8. Well Number	
2. Name of Operator	Other	\(\frac{\partial}{\partial}\tau\tau\tau\tau\tau\tau\tau\tau\tau\tau	9. OGRID Number	
BP America Production Compan	ıy \\	20, 27	000778	
3. Address of Operator	C.	Water St. Co.	10. Pool name or Wild	cat
P.O. Box 1089 Euroice NM 882 4. Well Location	231	219191818V	Empire Abo	
Unit Letter <u>E</u> : 25	feet from the	N line and	150 feet from the	e W line
Section 34	Township 178	Range 28E	NMPM C	ounty Eddy
	11. Elevation (Show whether		tc.)	
Pit or Below-grade Tank Application O	r Closure			
Pit type Depth to Groundwater	Distance from nearest fr	resh water well Dis	stance from nearest surface w	ater
Pit Liner Thickness: mil	Below-Grade Tank: Volum	nebbls; Constructi	on Material	
12 Check An	propriate Box to Indica	te Nature of Notice	Report or Other Da	to
NOTICE OF INTEN	NTION TO:	SUB	SEQUENT REPOR	
NOTICE OF INTEN	NTION TO:	SUB	SEQUENT REPOR	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND
NOTICE OF INTENPERFORM REMEDIAL WORK FREMPORARILY ABANDON PULL OR ALTER CASING	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON —	SUB REMEDIAL WORK	SEQUENT REPOR	RT OF: LTERING CASING —
NOTICE OF INTENPERFORM REMEDIAL WORK FREMPORARILY ABANDON PULL OR ALTER CASING	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE	SUB REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB	SEQUENT REPOR	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTEN	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION perations. (Clearly state all p	REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to	SEQUENT REPOR AI ING OPNS. PA A O Production re pertinent dates, including	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTEN PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION perations. (Clearly state all p	REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to	SEQUENT REPOR AI ING OPNS. PA A O Production re pertinent dates, including	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTEN PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION Perations. (Clearly state all plane in the peration of the pera	REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to pertinent details, and give ple Completions: Attach	SSEQUENT REPORT AND	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTENPERFORM REMEDIAL WORK FOR TEMPORARILY ABANDON FOULL OR ALTER CASING FOULL OR ALTER CASING FOULL OR ALTER CASING FOULL OR ALTER CASING FOUND OF Starting any proposed work). Significant of Starting any proposed work). Significant of Starting any proposed work). The Gaso' Perfs: 5822'-593 Add perfs 5822'-40', 5852'-6	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION Perations. (Clearly state all plane in the peration of the pera	REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to pertinent details, and give ple Completions: Attach	SSEQUENT REPORT AND	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTEN PERFORM REMEDIAL WORK	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION perations. (Clearly state all perations.) THE RULE 1103. For Multiple 1103. For Mu	REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to pertinent details, and giv ple Completions: Attach	SSEQUENT REPORT AND	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTENPERFORM REMEDIAL WORK FOR TEMPORARILY ABANDON FOR TEMPORARILY ABANDON FOR TEMPORARILY ABANDON FOR ALTER CASING FOR TEMPORARILY ABANDON	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION Perations. (Clearly state all p EE RULE 1103. For Multip 34' CIBP: 6192' 68', and 5890'-5934', a mary Report. - 0 bbls. oil, 172 bb. ve is true and complete to the	REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to pertinent details, and give ple Completions: Attach	ING OPNS. PA O Production re pertinent dates, including the wellbore diagram of production eturn well to product s. e and belief. I further certification	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTENPERFORM REMEDIAL WORK FOR TEMPORARILY ABANDON FOR TEMPORARILY A	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION Perations. (Clearly state all perations. (Clearly state all perations.) The completion of the complete to the control of the complete to the control of	SUB REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to pertinent details, and give ple Completions: Attach	SEQUENT REPORT AND	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTENPERFORM REMEDIAL WORK FOR TEMPORARILY ABANDON FOR TEMPORARILY A	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION Perations. (Clearly state all perations. (Clearly state all perations.) The completion of the complete to the	SUB REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to pertinent details, and giv ple Completions: Attach	ING OPNS. PA O Production re pertinent dates, including the wellbore diagram of product eturn well to product s. e and belief. I further certif or an (attached) alternative Assistant owensyl2@bp.com	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT
NOTICE OF INTENPERFORM REMEDIAL WORK FOR TEMPORARILY ABANDON FOR TEMPORARILY A	NTION TO: PLUG AND ABANDON CHANGE PLANS MULTIPLE COMPLETION Perations. (Clearly state all perations. (Clearly state all perations.) The completion of the complete to the	SUB REMEDIAL WORK COMMENCE DRILL CASING TEST AND CEMENT JOB OTHER: Return to pertinent details, and giv ple Completions: Attach and recomplete to re ls. water, 1 mcf gas ne best of my knowledge ines, a general permit ITLEAdministrat	ING OPNS. PA O Production re pertinent dates, including the wellbore diagram of product eturn well to product s. e and belief. I further certif or an (attached) alternative Assistant owensyl2@bp.com	RT OF: LTERING CASING LUG AND BANDONMENT IX Ig estimated date posed completion Cion, Ty that any pit or below- we OCD-approved plan TE 12/20/06

Conditions of Approval, if any:

BP AMERICA

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: EMPIRE ABO UNIT F #332 Common Well Name: EMPIRE ABO UNIT F #332

Start:

ેંગા લા જ\^{દો} Spud Date: 12/18/1976 11/10/2006 End:

Rage 1 of 2

Event Name:

WELL SERVICING

Rig Release:

Contractor Name: Ria Name:

Rig Number:

Rig Name:	lame: Rig Number:						
Date	From - To	Hours	Task	Code	NPT	Phase	Description of Operations
11/10/2006	08:30 - 12:30	4.00		Р		LOWER1	FIELDMOVE PU & SURFACE EQUIPMENT & SET IN
	12:30 - 13:30	1.00		P		LOWER1	RIGUP KEY PU # 336
	13:30 - 14:30	1.00		Р		LOWER1	N/D WH N/U BOP
	14:30 - 15:30	1.00		P		LOWER1	PUMP 71 BBL TO LOAD CSG TEST TO 500 PSI FOR 15 MIN
1							ОК
[15:30 - 16:30	1.00		P		LOWER1	TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/13/2006	05:30 - 06:30	1.00		P		LOWER1	TRAVEL TO EAU OFFICE
1	06:30 - 07:00	0.50		P		LOWER1	SAFETY MEETING & JSA'S
	07:00 - 08:00	1.00		Р	ŀ	LOWER1	PUMP 1/2 BBL TO LOAD TEST TO 500 PSI FOR 30 MIN OK
	08:00 - 10:00	2.00		P		LOWER1	UNLOAD, RACK & STRAP NEW TBG
	10:00 - 13:30	3.50		P		LOWER1	TIH W/ BIT & SCRAPER PICKING UP NEW TBG TAG @ 6189'
	13:30 - 15:00	1.50		P		LOWER1	SWAB 30 BBL PKR FLUID
	15:00 - 16:30	1.50		P		LOWER1	тон
	16:30 - 17:30	1.00		P	1	LOWER1	TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/14/2006	05:30 - 06:30	1.00		P	ļ	LOWER1	TRAVEL TO EAU OFFICE
	06:30 - 07:00	0.50		P		LOWER1	SAFETY MEETING & JSA'S
1	07:00 - 12:00	5.00		Р	Į	LOWER1	RIGUP GRAY WIRELINE & PERF AS FOLLOWS: 5822' -40',
							5852' -68', & 5890' - 5934' , 2 JSPF FOR TOTAL OF 162
					1		HOLES (SHOT OFF OF SCHLUMBERGER PERF DEPTH
							CONTROL LOG FROM 1/14/77 RIGDOWN WIRELINE
							TRUCK
	12:00 - 14:30	2.50		P		LOWER1	TIH W/ PKR & RBP W/ BALL CATCHER SET RBP @ 5992'
	Ì						PICKUP TO 5698' LEAVE PKR SWINGING
}	14:30 - 15:30	1.00		N		LOWER1	WAIT ON ACID
	15:30 - 16:30	1.00		P		LOWER1	TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/15/2006	05:30 - 06:30	1.00		P		LOWER1	TRAVEL TO EAU OFFICE
	06:30 - 07:00	0.50		P		LOWER1	SAFETY MEETING & JSA'S
	07:00 - 08:00	1.00		P		LOWER1	SET PKR LOAD & TEST TO 500PSI OK
	08:00 - 12:00	4.00		N	WAIT	LOWER1	WAIT ON ACID TRUCKS
	12:00 - 14:00	2.00		P	}	LOWER1	RIGUP ACID TRUCKS PUMP 3000 GAL 15% HCL @ 5BPM &
				l			3100 PSI MAX PRES DROPING 243 BALL SEALERS HAD
		[GOOD BALL ACTION - DID NOT BALL OUT- ISIP 0,
	4.00 45.00			_			RIGDOWN ACID TRUCKS
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00		P		LOWER1	SHUT WELL IN WATCH FOR PRES CHG
	15:00 - 16:00 16:00 - 17:00	1.00		P		LOWER1	SWAB 10 BBL IN 1 HR FLUID LEVEL @ 4600'
11/16/2006	05:30 - 06:30	1.00 1.00		P P		LOWER1	TRAVEL FROM LOC TRAVEL TO EAU OFFICE
11/10/2000	06:30 - 07:00	0.50		P	ŀ	LOWER1	SAFETY MEETING & JSA'S
	07:00 - 16:00	9.00		P		LOWER1	TBG 150 PSI SWAB TEST - STARTING FLUID LEVEL 4500'
	07.00 - 10.00	3.00		-		LOWER	SWAB 50BBL IN 9 HR ENDING FLUID LEVEL 5000
	16:00 - 17:00	1.00		P		LOWER1	TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/17/2006	05:30 - 06:30	1.00		P		LOWER1	TRAVEL TO EAU OFFICE
	06:30 - 07:00	0.50		P		LOWER1	SAFETY MEETING & JSA'S
	07:00 - 09:00	2.00		P		LOWER1	TBG 30 PSI SWAB 10 BBL IN 1 1/2 HR STARTING FLUID
		-:-5		[LEVEL 4700' ENDING LEVEL 4700'
	09:00 - 11:30	2.50		P		LOWER1	RELEASE PKR RUN IN CATCH RBP RELEASE PLUG TOH
				[W/BOTH
	11:30 - 13:00	1.50		P		LOWER1	TIH W/ PROD TBG
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00		P		LOWER1	N/D BOP N/U WH
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00		P		LOWER1	PREP TO RUN RODS
	15:00 - 16:00	1.00		P		LOWER1	TRAVEL FROM LOC
11/20/2006	05:30 - 06:30	1.00		Р		LOWER1	TRAVEL TO EAU OFFICE

Printed: 11/28/2006 5:33:02 PM

Page 2 of 2

BP AMERICA

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: EMPIRE ABO UNIT F #332 Common Well Name: EMPIRE ABO UNIT F #332

WELL SERVICING

11/10/2006 Start:

Spud Date: 12/18/1976

End:

Event Name: Contractor Name:

Rig Release:

Rig Name:				Rig Number:			
Date	From - To	Hours	Task	Code	NPT	Phase	Description of Operations
11/20/2006 11/21/2006	06:30 - 07:00 07:00 - 14:00 14:00 - 15:00 15:00 - 16:00 16:00 - 17:00 05:30 - 06:30 06:30 - 07:00 07:00 - 09:00	0.50 7.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00 0.50 2.00		P P P P P P		LOWER1 LOWER1 LOWER1 LOWER1	SAFETY MEETING & JSA'S UNLOAD, RACK, & PICKUP NEW PUMP & RODS LOAD & TEST TO 500 PSI OK WAIT FOR ELE. TO TEST PUMP ACTION TRAVEL FROM LOC TRAVEL TO EAU OFFICE SAFETY MEETING & JSA'S RIGDOWN CLEAN LOC RTP
							TO BUSINESS OF SERVICE STATES OF SERVICE SERVI

Printed: 11/28/2006 5:33:02 PM