
. PB Energy 
| Storage 
'Services, Inc. CN 

O 

=Project No. 
Operator: 

50795A Date: 6-1-2012 
MALJAMAR AGI#1 

Report No.: 77 

FORMATION 
Reported By: | Jimmy Don Morris 
10% DOLOMITE, 90% LS, 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 
Depth: 8602' Ft. Cut: 79' Tops of Formation ABO-7600' 
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING FORMATION @ 8602' RKB: 15 

Time Log 
From To 

Elapsed 
Time 

Details of Operation 

0600 1130 5.5 POOH LOOKING FOR WASH OUT, COLLAR #6 WASHED OUT 
1130 1430 3.0 L/D 2 - D/C & P/U 2- D/C, C/O SHOCK SUB, L/D TELEDRIFT & STABILIZERS, OFF LOAD 

M/MTR, CALIBRATE SAME 
1430 2030 6.0 P/U & M/U M/MTR ( 6.5 M1XP/LS SLICK,STRAIGHT, ULTRA X-TREME LS), SURFACE 

TEST SAME (GOOD TEST), M/U BIT #18, P/U & M/U SHOCK SUB, TIH 
2030 2130 1.0 CERC. SET PARAMETERS 
2130 2200 RIG SERVICE 
2200 0600 8.0 DRILLED F/8523' T/ 8602' 79' @ 10 FPH 

BIT # 17, SECURITY, TYPE- M88F, SER#- 723427 
HOURS = 7.5, FOOTAGE = 50' WOB = 30-35, RPM = 65 
IN @ 8473' OUT @ 8523 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 18 Wt 9.1 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 8.0 Size 7 

5/8.JET 
S7-
10'S 

Vis 33 BIT,M/MTR. 
,S/SUB 

37.04 8324 

SPM 113 Cond/Circ 1.0 Mfg SMITH WL 30.0 21 D/C 637.42 8408 

GPM 417 Tripping 14.5 Type MSi71 
3 

Gels 3/4/5 19 

Press OFF 
BTTM 

1800 Survey .5 Out Oil HWT/DP 91.99 

ON 
BTTM 

2000 Logging In 8523 Solid 2.1 JAR 33.30 

Wash& 
Ream 
Misc 
Fishing 
Run Csg 

Ftg 

Hrs 
Bit Wt 
RPM 

79 

8.0 

pH 

Chi 

11.0 

53000 

18 

18-20 
143 

HWT/DP 

TOTAL 

553.48 

1353.23 

iR RECORD ONLY 



f^^^- PB Energy 
§= ^= Storage 
= Services, Inc. 

=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-2-2012 Report No.: 78 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 

Contractor : UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 8913' Ft. Cut: 311' Tops of Formation ABO-7600' 

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING FORMATION @ 8913' RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation 
From To Time 

Details of Operation 

0600 0630 .5 RIG SERVICE 

0630 0600 23.5 DRILLED F/8602'T/8913' 311'@ 13.3 FPH 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 18 Wt 9.1 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 23.5 Size 7 

5/8,JET 
S7-
10'S 

Vis 31 3 BIT,M/MTR. 
,S/SUB 

37.04 8324 .5 

SPM 115 Cond/Circ Mfg SMITH WL 17.0 21 D/C 637.42 8408 .5 
GPM 425 Tripping Type MSi71 

3.PDC 
Gels 2/3/4 19 

Press OFF 
BTTM 

1800 Survey Out Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 

ON 
BTTM 

2000 Logging In 8523 Solid 1.1 1 JAR 33.30 

Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 390 pH 11.0 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc .5 Hrs 31.5 Chi 68000 

Fishing Bit Wt 18-20 

Run Csg RPM 145 TOTAL 1353.23 

\ 



£i^=- PB Energy 
H == Storage 
= Services, Inc. 

=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-3-2012 Report No.: 79 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 ; FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 9260' Ft. Cut: 347' / Tops of Formation ABO-7600' 

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING FORMATION @ 9260' RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 0700 1.0 RIG SERVICE, GREASE CROWN 

0700 0600 23.0 DRILLED F/ 8913' T/ 9260' 347' @ 15.1 FPH 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 18 Wt 9.05 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 23.0 Size 7 

5/8.JET 
S7-
10'S 

Vis 29 3 BIT.M/MTR. 
,S/SUB 

37.04 8324 .5 

SPM 115 Cond/Circ Mfg SMITH WL 23.0 21 D/C 637.42 8408 .5 
GPM 425 Tripping Type MSi71 

3,PDC 
Gels 1/1/1 19 

Press OFF 
BTTM 

1800 Survey Out Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 

ON 
BTTM 

2050 Logging In 8523 Solid 1.8 1 JAR 33.30 

Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 737 PH 10.5 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc 1.0 firs 54.5 Chi 52000 

Fishing BitWt 18-20 

Run Csg RPM 145 TOTAL 1353.23 



I 

PB Energy 
|= =§= Storage 
= Services, Inc. 

=PrqjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-4-2012 Report No.: 80 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI#1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 9532' Ft. Cut: 272 Tops of Formation Leonard-9132 

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING FORMATION @ 9532' RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 0630 .5 RIG SERVICE 

0630 0600 23.5 DRILLED F/ 9260' 119532' 272' @ 11.6 FPH 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 18 Wt 9.05 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 23.5 Size 7 

5/8.JET 
S7-
10'S 

Vis 31 3 BIT,M/MTR. 
,S/SUB 

37.04 8324 .5 

SPM 115 Cond/Circ Mfg SMITH WL 18.0 21 D/C 637.42 8408 .5 
GPM 425 Tripping Type MSi71 

3.PDC 
Gels 2/4/5 19 

Press OFF 
BTTM 

1800 Survey Out Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 

ON 
BTTM 

2050 Logging In 8523 Solid 1.7 1 JAR 33.30 

Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 1009 pH 11.0 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc .5 Hrs 78.0 Chi 53000 
Fishing Bit Wt 18-20 

Run Csg RPM 145 TOTAL 1353.23 

\ 



M^^PB Energy 
= Storage 
= = • Services, Inc. 

=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-5-2012 Report No.: 81 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 9675' Ft. Cut: 143' Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING FORMATION @ 9675' RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed Details of Operation 
From To Time 

Details of Operation 

0600 0630 .5 RIG SERVICE 

0630 1230 6.0 DRILLED F/9532'T/9587' 55' @ 9.2 FPH 

1230 1800 5.5 POOH F/ BIT #19, L/D M/MTR, BIT, DROP TOTCO .75 DEGREE 
1800 0130 7.5 P/U & M/U BIT #19, M/MTR, SURFACE TEST SAME, GOOD TEST, TIH 
0130 0600 4.5 DRILLED F/ 9587' T/ 9675' 88' @ 19.5 FPH 

BIT #19, SMITH, MSi713, JD3007, 7-10'S IN @ 9675, 88' HOURS = 4.5 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 18 Wt 9.05 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 

Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 10.5 Size 7 
5/8.JET 

S7-
10'S 

Vis 29 3 BIT.M/MTR. 
,S/SUB 

37.04 9577 .75 

SPM 115 Cond/Circ Mfg SMITH WL 19.0 21 D/C 637.42 

GPM 425 Tripping 13.0 Type MSi71 
3.PDC 

Gels 1/2/3 19 

Press OFF 
BTTM 

1950 Survey Out 9587 Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 

ON 
BTTM 

2100 Logging In 8523 Solid 1.8 1 JAR 33.30 

Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 1064 PH 11.0 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc .5 Hrs 84.0 Chi 52000 

Fishing Bit Wt 18-20 

Run Csg RPM 145 TOTAL 1353.23 



^^=- PB Energy 
= == Storage 
=, = Services, Inc. 

=PrqjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-6-2012 Report No.: 82 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE, TR CHERT & SHALE 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 9696' Ft. Cut: 21' Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING FORMATION @ 9696' RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 0630 .5 RIG SERVICE 

0630 0700 .5 DRILLED F/ 9675' 119683' 8' @ 16 FPH 

0700 0900 2.0 LOST DIFFERENTIAL PSI, TRYING TO SORT OUT PROBLEM WITH M/MTR, NO GO 
0900 1500 6.0 DROP TOTCO, POOH TO C/O M/MTR. .6 DRGREE @ 9670', SURFACE TEST BAKER 

M/MTR, NO GO, SEALS MUST BE RUPTURED 
1500 1600 1.0 L/D BAKER M/MTR. & X/O 

1600 1700 1.0 P/U COUGAR M/MTR. (6.5, 7/8 LOBE, 2.9 STAGE SLOW), BIT #19RR, SURFACE TEST 
M/MTR, GOOD TEST, TIH W/BHA 

1700 1930 2.5 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE (1800') 
1930 0100 5.5 TEH 

0100 0330 2.5 ATTEMPTING TO SET PARAMETERS 
0330 0600 2.5 DRILLED F/ 9683' 119696' 13' @ 5.2 FPH 

Total 24 

Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 
Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# RR19 Wt 9.05 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 3.0 Size 7 

5/8,JET 
S7-
10'S 

Vis 30 3 BIT,M/MTR. 
,S/SUB 

43.58 9577 .75 

SPM 117 Cond/Circ Mfg SMITH, WL 18.0 21 D/C 637.42 9670 .6 
GPM 432 Tripping 13.5 Type MSi71 

3,PDC 
Gels 2/3/4 19 

Press OFF 
BTTM 

2150 Survey Out Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 

ON 
BTTM 

2300 Logging In 9587 Solid 1.8 1 JAR 33.30 

Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 109 pH 11.0 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc 7.5 Hrs 7.5 Chi 52000 
Fishing Bit Wt 15-40 
Run Csg RPM 130 TOTAL 1359.77 

\ 
\ 
) 

\ 
I 

I 



^p^H^PB Energy 
= Storage 
= Services, Inc. 

=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-7-2012 ! Report No.: 83 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 
Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 
Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 
Depth: 9820' Ft. Cut: 124' Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING FORMATION @ 9696' RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 0800 2.0 DRILLED F/ 9696' T/ 9699' 3' @ 1.5 FPH, PDC NO GO IN CHERT 
0800 1500 7.0 POOH F/ BIT #20, L/D M/MTR, BIT #19RR 
1500 2100 6.0 P/U & M/U BIT #20, BIT SUB, TEH 
2100 0600 9.0 DRILLED F/9699'T/9820' 121' @ 13.4 FPH 

BIT #20, SECURITY, TYPE-M88F, SER#-723019, IN @ 9699' FTG= 121' HOURS= 9.0,BIT WT. 
= 25K -35K, RPM=65 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# RR19 Wt 9.00 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 11.0 Size 7 

5/8,JET 
S7-
10'S 

Vis 29 3 BIT,BIT 
SUB,S/SUB 

17.87 9577 .75 

SPM 105 Cond/Circ Mfg SMITH WL 24.0 21 D/C 637.42 9670 .6 
GPM 388 Tripping 13.0 Type MSi71 

3,PDC 
Gels 1/2/3 19 

Press 2225 Survey Out 9699 Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 
Logging In 9587 Solid 1.3 1 JAR 33.30 
Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 112 pH 10.5 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc Hrs 9.5 Chi 53000 
Fishing Bit Wt 15-40 
Run Csg RPM 130 TOTAL • 1334.06 

\ 

) 



==HkPB Energy 
= == Storage 
•= S3=? Services, Inc. 

=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-8-2012 Report No.: 84 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 10110' Ft. Cut: 290' Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING FORMATION @ 10110' RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 0600 24.0 DRILLED F/ 9820' T/ 10110 290' @ 12.1 FPH 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 20 Wt 9.10 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 24.0 Size 7 

5/8,JET 
S3-
12'S 

Vis 30 3 BIT.BIT 
SUB,S/SUB 

17.87 

SPM 105 Cond/Circ Mfg SECU 
RITY 

WL 28.0 21 D/C 637.42 

GPM 388 Tripping Type M88F Gels 1/2/3 19 
Press 2250 Survey Out Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 

Logging In 9699 Solid 0.7 1 JAR 33.30 
Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 411 PH 11.0 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc Hrs 33.0 Chi 74000 
Fishing BitWt 30-35 

Run Csg RPM 65 TOTAL 1334.06 



=-==-. PB Energy 
f§ ^= Storage 

'Services, Inc. 

=Project No.: 50795A Date: 6-9-2012 Report No.: 85 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 
Operator: MALJAMAR AGI#1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 
Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 
Depth: 10183' Ft. Cut: 73' Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 
Activity at Report Time: LOGGING W/ BAKER RKB: 15 

Time Log 
From To 

Elapsed 
Time 

Details of Operation 

DRILLED F/ 10110' T/10183' 73' @ 8.6 FPH, TOTAL DEPTH @ 10183' 0600 1430 8.5 
1430 1630 2.0 COND. & CIRC. @ 10183', PUMP HI-VIS SWEEP SURF/SURF, HOLE CLEAN 
1630 1830 2.0 WIPER TRIP (25 STANDS), F/10183' BACK T/ 7800', BACK T/10183' 
1830 2030 2.0 COND. & CIRC. @ 10183', PUMP HI-VIS SWEEP SURF/SURF, HOLE CLEAN 
2030 0300 6.5 POOH TO LOG, LD SHOCK SUB & BIT 

0300 0500 2.0 WAIT ON BAKER (LOGGING UNIT HAD FLAT TIRE) 
0500 0600 1.0 R/U BAKER LOGGERS 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 20 Wt 9.10 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling 8.5 Size 7 

5/8,JEF 
S3-
12'S 

Vis 29 3 BIT,BIT 
SUB,S/SUB 

17.87 10179 0.7 

« 

7 
5/8,JEF 
S3-
12'S 

SPM 105 Cond/Circ Mfg SECU 
RITY 

WL 14.0 21 D/C 637.42 

GPM 388 Tripping 8.5 Type M88F Gels 1/2/3 19 
Press 2250 Survey Out 10183 Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 

Logging 1.0 In 9699 Solid 2.0 1 JAR 33.30 
Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 484 PH 11.0 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc 6.0 Hrs 41.5 Chi 55000 
Fishing Bit Wt 35-40 
Run Csg RPM 65 TOTAL 1334.06 

I 



===• PB Energy 
= ^= Storage 
~=L Services, Inc. 

=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-10-2012 Report No.: 86 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 
Operator: MALJAMAR AGI#1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 
Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 
Depth: 10183' Ft. Cut: Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 
Activity at Report Time: LOGGING W/ BAKER RKB: 15 

Time Log 
From To 

Elapsed 
Time 

Details of Operation 

0600 0600 24.0 LOGGING W/ BAKER, LOGGERS DEPTH =10185', RUN NEUTRON DENSITY 
(GR,DLL,MLL), X-MAC, STAR/CBIL, RCOR, SBT, WHILE WE WERE GETTING SIDE WALL 
CORES AFTER 7 SOMETHING JAMMED GUN UP, HAD TO COME OUT OF HOLE TO 
CLEAR TOOL, BACK ON BTTM @ 04:45, CORING NOW WITH CORE #14 OF 27 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 20 Wt 9.10 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling Size 7 

5/8,JEI 
S3-
12'S 

Vis 30 3 BIT,BIT 
SUB,S/SUB 

17.87 10179 0.7 7 
5/8,JEI 
S3-
12'S 

SPM Cond/Circ Mfg SECU 
RITY 

WL 19.0 21 D/C 637.42 

GPM Tripping Type M88F Gels 1/2/3 19 
Press Survey Out 10183 Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 

Logging 24.0 In 9699 Solid 1.6 1 JAR 33.30 
Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 484 pH 11.3 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc Hrs 41.5 Chi 49000 

Fishing Bit Wt 35-40 

Run Csg RPM 65 TOTAL 1334.06 



^===- PB Energy 
f§ ^= Storage 
= Services, Inc. 

=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-11-2012 Report No.: 87 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 10183' Ft. Cut: Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 

Activity at Report Time: LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 1700 11 LOGGING W/ BAKER, LOGGERS DEPTH = 10185', RUN NEUTRON DENSITY 
(GR,DLL,MLL), X-MAC, STAR/CBEL, RCOR, SBT, 

1700 2300 6.0 
TIH TO CONDITION MUD FOR CASING RUN, CERC. BBTMS UP @ 8 5/8" SHOE (4230') & 
BREAK CIRC. @ 7500' 

2300 0200 3.0 PUMP 2- 40 BBL. SWEEPS SURF. TO SURF. (HOLE CLEAN, SPOT 100 BBL HI-VIS. PILL ON 
BTTM. 

0200 0530 3.5 POOH F/10183' BACK T/ 4200' (62 STD.) 
0530 0600 .5 R/U ALLENS L/D MACHINE 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit# 20 Wt 9.0 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling Size 7 

5/8.JET 
S3-
12'S 

Vis 30 3 BIT.BIT 
SUB,S/SUB 

17.87 10179 0.7 

SPM 105 Cond/Circ 3.0 Mfg SECU 
RITY 

WL 10.0 21 D/C 637.42 

GPM 388 Tripping 9.5 rype M88F Gels 1/2/3 19 

Press 2100 Survey Out 10183 Oil 3 HWT/DP 91.99 
Logging 11.0 In 9699 Solid 1.6 1 JAR 33.30 
Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg 484 pH 10.5 18 HWT/DP 553.48 

Misc .5 Hrs 41.5 Chi 50000 

Fishing Bit Wt 35-40 

Run Csg RPM 65 TOTAL 1334.06 
I 
I 

! 



==-=-- PB Energy 
M === Storage 
= Services, Inc. 

=Project No.: 50795A Date: 6-12-2012 Report No.: 88 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 | FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 \ Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 10183' Ft. Cut: j Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 

Activity at Report Time: CIRC. 5 'A" CASING @ 10183' RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
' Details of Operation 

i From To Time 
' Details of Operation 

i 

0600 1200 6.0 L/D D/P & BHA 

1200 1330 1.5 TIH WITH PIPE OUT OF DERRICK 

1330 1600 2.5 L/D D/P ! 
1600 1730 1.5 TIH WITH PIPE OUT OF DERRICK 
1730 1800 .5 P/U & SOFT BREAK KELLY 

i 
1800 1900 1.0 CONTINUE TO L/D D/P 

1900 2130 2.5 PREPARE TO RUN 5 V2" PRODUCTION CASING, MOVE ALL FLOAT EQUIP. & 
CENTRILIZERS TO FLOOR, TURN L/D MACHINE BUCKET TOWARD DRILLERS SIDE OF 
CATWALK, R/U CASING EQUIPMENT 

2130 0600 8.5 PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING, P/U & M/U 5 '/2" 17# L-80 CASING, M/U SHOE JT.( SHOE, 1-
JT. 5.5" 17# L-80, FLOAT COLLAR) LENGTH= 46.18', TIH, BREAK CIRC. EVERY 40 JTS, 
TOP OF 1 s t DvjTOOL @ 9753', TOP OF MKR. JT. @ 9518', TOP OF CRA TOOL @ 9474, TOP 
OF 2 n d DV TOOL @ 9344',TOTAL OF 73 CENTRILIZERS, LAND CASING @ 10183', TOTAL 
OF 242 JOINTS 

i 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No. 1 No. 2 HrsRU Bit# Wt 9.05 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St 6.5/9 6.5/9 Drilling Size Vis 30 

SPM Cond/Circ Mfg WL 12.0 

GPM Tripping 12.5 Fype Gels 1/2/3 

Press Survey Out Oil 
Logging In Solid 2.1 
Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg PH 10.3 

Misc .5 Hrs Chi 48000 
Fishing Bit Wt 

Run Csg 11.0 RPM TOTAL 

\ 



===-. PB Energy 
= ^= Storage 
= Services, Inc. 

=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-13-2012 Report No.: 89 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 
Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 
Contractor: UNITED Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 
Depth: 10183' Ft. Cut: Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 
Activity at Report Time: PREPARING TO PUMP STAGE 2 THERMALOCK CMT RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 1400 8.0 CIRC. 5 'A" CASING WHILE WAITING ON HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS 
1400 1730 3.5 R/U HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS 
1730 2000 2.5 PJSM, TEST LINES 114K, CEMENT W/ HALLIBURTON, RECIPE AS FOLLOWS, 20 BBL. 

MUD FLUSH WT. = 8.4 PPG, MIX & PUMP 175 SKS. CORROSACEM ™ WT. = 14.8 PPG, 
YIELD 1.15, MIXING FLUID 4.84 GAL, TOC @ 8800', FCP = 360 PSI, BUMP PLUG WITH 
520 PSI OVER = 880 PSI. @ 18:45 PM, HOLD FOR 5 MIN, RELEASE PSI. GOT 1 BBL. BACK, 
DROP BOMB WAIT 50 MEN. FOR SAME TO FALL TO DV TOOL, PRESSURE UP TO 660 PSI, 
DV TOOL OPEN 

2000 0600 10.0 CIRC THRU DV TOOL W/ RIG PUMP 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump No, 1 No. 2 Hrs RU Bit* Wt 9.05 No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St Drilling Size Vis 30 
SPM 63 Cond/Circ 18.0 Mfg WL 12.0 
GPM Tripping Iype Gels 1/2/3 
Press Survey Out Oil 

Logging In Solid 2.1 
Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg pH 10.3 

CEMENT 6.0 Hrs Chi 48000 
Fishing Bit Wt 
Run Csg RPM TOTAL 



"I 

===• PB Energy 
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=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-14-2012 Report No.: 90 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 

Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 

Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 

Depth: 10183' Ft. Cut: Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 

Activity at Report Time: NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 0700 1.0 CIRCULATE THRU DV TOOL W/ RIG PUMP 

0700 0930 2.5 PJSM, TEST LINES 114K, CEMENT W/ HALLIBURTON, STAGE 2 RECIPE AS FOLLOWS, 
25 BBL. MUD FLUSH WT. = 12.0 PPG, MIX & PUMP 246 SKS. THERMALOCK, WT. = 15.5 
PPG, YIELD 0.87, MIXING FLUID 3.33 GAL, TOC @ 8350*, FCP = 520 PSI, BUMP PLUG 
WITH 1500 PSI OVER = 1920 PSI. @ 08:45 AM, HOLD FOR 5 M I N , RELEASE PSI. GOT 1 'A 
BBL. BACK, DROP BOMB WAIT 45 MIN. FOR SAME TO FALL TO DV TOOL, PRESSURE 
UP TO 780 PSI, DV TOOL OPEN 

0930 2200 12.5 CIRCULATE THRU DV TOOL W/ RIG PUMP 
2200 0100 3.0 PJSM, TEST LINES 114K, CEMENT W/ HALLIBURTON, STAGE 3 RECIPE AS FOLLOWS, 20 

BBL. WATER SPACER 8.3 PPG, LEAD CEMENT, 1150 SKS OF ECONOCEM, WT. = 12.7 
PPG, YEBLD = 1.86, MIXING FLUID = 10.11 GAL, TAIL CEMENT, 200 SKS OF HALCEM, 
WT. = 15.8 PPG, YIELD = 1.16, MIXING FLUID = 5.15 GAL, 217 BBL. DISPLACEMENT, 
BUMP PLUG @ 00:45 AM WITH FCP = 2850 PSI, BUMP PLUG WITH 1500 PSI OVER = 4350 
PSI, HOLD FOR 5 MIN. GOT 3 BBLS. BACK, FLOATS HELD, GOT 25 BBLS. CEMENT BACK 
TO SURFACE, FULL RETURNS THRU OUT JOB, CEMENT IN PLACE @ 00:45 AM 

0100 0200 1.0 RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS 

0200 0400 2.0 P/U BOP'S, SET 5 'A" CASING SLIPS WITH 50K, MAKE ROUGH CUT ON 5 'A" CSG, L/D 
SAME 

0400 0600 2.0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump Hrs RU Bit# Wt No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St Drilling Size Vis 

SPM Cond/Circ 13.5 Mfg WL 

GPM Tripping Type Gels 

Press Survey Out Oil 

Logging In Solid 

Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg pH 

CEMENT 5.5 Hrs Chi 

Fishing Bit Wt 

MISC. 5.0 RPM TOTAL 
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=ProjectNo.: 50795A Date: 6-15-2012 Report No.: 91 Reported By: Jimmy Don Morris 
Operator: MALJAMAR AGI #1 FORMATION 100% LIMESTONE 
Contractor: UNITED RIG #41 Rig No. 41 County LEA State: NM 
Depth: 10183' Ft. Cut: Tops of Formation WOLF CAMP 9544' 
Activity at Report Time: PREPARE TO MOVE RIG RKB: 15 

Time Log Elapsed 
Details of Operation 

From To Time 
Details of Operation 

0600 0830 2.5 MAKE FINAL CUT, INSTALL TBG. HEAD, TEST SAME T/ 5K PSI, INSTALL CAPPING 
FLANGE 

0830 1500 6.5 FINISH N/D BOP'S, CLEAN PITS 
1500 0600 15.0 PREPARE TO MOVE RIG OFF OF LOCATION 

RELEASE RIG @ 15:00 PM 6/15/2012 

FINAL REPORT 

Total 24 
Pump Record Our Record Bits Mud Drilling Assembly Deviation 

Pump Hrs RU Bit# Wt No. Description Length Depth Dev. 
Lin/St Drilling Size Vis 

SPM Cond/Circ Mfg WL 
GPM Tripping Type Gels 
Press Survey Out Oil 

Logging [n Solid 
Wash& 
Ream 

Ftg PH 

CEMENT Hrs Chi 
Fishing Bit Wt 
MISC. 24.0 RPM TOTAL 
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